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Linda Williams 0 2’009 - 1TC

To: Paula Isler
Subject: RE: TG611
ok.

————— Original Message-----

From: Paula Isler

Sent: Tuesday, February 05, 2002 1:42 PM
To: Linda Williams

Subject: RE: TG611

It is OK to open a docket to voluntarily cancel M and L Enterprises' certificate effective
12/31/01.

————— Original Message-----

From: Linda Williams

Sent: Tuesday, February 05, 2002 12:53 PM

To: Paula Isler
Subject: TG611

Paula, I thought I'd let you know that we received the deposit information from FISCAL on-
the $16.50 penalties and interest payment for 1999 RAFS from M and L Enterprises.
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