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CCA Official Filing:

Linda Williams

To: Paula Isler
Cc: Kay Flynn
Subject: RE: TF098
Thank you.

————— Original Message-----

From: Paula Isler

Sent: Thursday, March 07, 2002 1:44 PM
To: Linda Williams

Subject: RE: TF098

Yes. Paid in full through 2001.

————— Original Message-----

From: Linda Williams

Sent: Thursday, March 07, 2002 1:04 PM
To: Paula Isler

Subject: TF098

Hi Paula. We got a letter requesting cancelation of Cert 3750.

Are they paid up?
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