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COMMISSIONERS:

LiLA A. JABER, CHAIRMAN
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MICHAEL A. PALECKI
RUDOLPH “RUDY” BRADLEY

D1vISION OF THE COMMISSION CLERK &
ADMINISTRATIVE SERVICES

BLANCA S. BAYO

DIRECTOR

(850) 413-6770 (CLERK)

(850) 413-6330 (ADMIN)

JHublic Serpice Conunission

March 25, 2002

Steven M. Saffer

Easycoin Payphones of Florida L.L.C.
22 South Madison Avenue

Spring Valley, New York 10977

Docket No. 020264-TC
Dear Mr. Saffer:

This will acknowledge receipt of a request for cancellation of Pay Telephone
Certificate No. 7122 by EasyCoin Payphones of Florida L.L.C., effective 3/25/02, which
was filed in this office on March 25, 2002, and assigned the above-referenced docket
number. Appropriate staff members will be advised.

Mediation may be available to resolve any dispute in this docket. If mediation is
conducted, it does not affect a substantially interested person’s right to an administrative
hearing. For more information, contact the Office of General Counsel at (850) 413-6248
or FAX (850) 413-7180.

Division of the Commission Clerk and Administrative Services
Florida Public Service Commission
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An Affirmative Action/Equal Opportunity Employer
PSC Website: http://www.floridapsc.com Internet E-mail: contact@psc.state.fl.us




CCA Official Filing:
3/25[02****** 2:11 pM********Linda Wi"iams***********l

Linda Williams

To: Paula Isler
Subject: RE:
0Ok thanks.

~~~~~ Original Message-----

From: Paula Isler

Sent: Monday, March 25, 2002 2:09 PM
To: Linda Williams

Subject: FW:

Linda, based on this e-mail, it is OK to open a docket to cancel effective (today?) the
date you received the request for cancellation. Thanks, Paula.

————— Original Message-----

From: Jackie Knight

Sent: Monday, March 25, 2002 2:06 PM
To: Paula Isler

Subject: RE:

————— Original Message-----

From: Paula Isler

Sent: Monday, March 25, 2002 2:05 PM
To: Jackie Knight

Subject: RE:

$56 for 2001? So it will be paid up?

————— Original Message-----

From: Jackie Knight

Sent: Monday, March 25, 2002 2:02 PM
To: Paula Isler

Subject: RE:

Ok. I will transfer $50 for 2001 and for 2002.

----- Original Message-----

From: Paula Isler

Sent: Monday, March 25, 2002 2:01 PM
To: Jackie Knight

Subject: RE:

No. There are no remarks in RAF System.

————— Original Message-----

From: Jackie Knight

Sent: Monday, March 25, 2002 1:45 PM
To: Paula Isler

Subject: RE:

Do you know why they sent in $380.88 in 2000? A mistake?
1



CCA Official Filing:
3/25/02%***x*  2:11 PM***kxxxxx| inda Williams*****¥xk*x%D

————— Original Message-----

From: Paula Isler

Sent: Monday, March 25, 2002 11:42 AM
To: Jackie Knight

Subject: FW:

Hi Jackie. This company (TG587) shows an overpayment in the amount of $401.18 for the RAF
year 2000. The company has now requested cancellation of its certificate. I was
wondering if you could transfer payment from the credit to the 2001 and 2002 RAFs,
including any P&I owed, so that RAF System will show they are paid in full? Please let me
know so that I can advise Linda. Thanks.

————— Original Message-----

From: Linda Williams

Sent: Monday, March 25, 2002 11:36 AM
To: Paula Isler

Subject:

Hi Paula. I have a letter from Easycoin Payphones of Florida LLC saying they are no
longer in business. Are they paid up? Can we open a docket?
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CCA Official Filing:
| 4/15/02%FFkkkkkk%%2:43 PM¥ ¥ ¥ ¥ *kkkkkx* Matilda Sanders** ¥ kkxkxkkk*kkq

Matilda Sanders 6516 - FQF
From: LaSandra Givens ~

Sent: Monday, April 15, 2002 2:41 PM

To: CCA - Orders / Notices

Subject: Order / Notice Submitted

Date and Time: 4/15/02 2:39:00 PM

Order Type: Cancel PAT / Current Yr

DOCKET NUMBER FILE NAME

020264-TC 020264 .KMP

020278-TC 020278.KMP

ORDER CANCELING PAY TELEPHONE CERTIFICATE




