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4. Suggested Docket Title __Cancellation by Florida Public Service Commission of Interexchange
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F.A.C., Requlatory Assessment Fees; Telecommunications Companies
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COMPANY IDENTIFICATION
Printed on 08/06/2001 at 09:07:13 by PJI

Complete Name: WorkNet Communications Inc.

Mailing Name: WorkNet Communications Inc.
Company Code: TJ392 FEID Number:

RAF ACCOUNT FOR THE PERIOD 01/01/2000 THROUGH 12/31/2000

Reg. Date: 09/12/2000 Inactive Date:

Service: IXC - Interexchange Telephone

Received: No RAF Form

Status: Pending

Amended: No Extension: No

Frozen: No Comments: No

Payment Count: 0 Payments Made to Date

Operating Rev: $0.00 Interstate Rev: $0.00

RAF Rate: Net RAF Due: $0.00

Assessment Due Paid Owe

RAF $0.00 $0.00 $0.00
Penalty $0.00 50.00 $0.00
Interest $0.00 $0.00 $0.00
Extension Fee $0.00 $0.00 $0.00
Total $0.00 $0¢.00 $0.00

Last modification was made on Tuesday, December 5, 2000 at 10:24 AM by Jackie Knight

Period covered: 01/01/2000 through 12/31/2000 RAF rate:
Operating revenue: $0.00 Interstate ravenue: 50.00
Documents: Delinguent letter mailed on 02/21/2001

RAF form mailed on 12/05/2000
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Public Service Commission

" March 28, 2001

Mr. J. Mark Klamer, Counsel
c/o Bryan Cave

211 N. Broadway

St. Louis, MO 63102

Re: WorkNet Communications Inc.

Dear Mr. Klamer:
70; l\Tar;;h 22, 2001, the Commission received a letter from Mr. Joshua Avigad, Assistant
General Counsel, requesting cancellation of WorkNet’s interexchange carrier and alternative local

exchange carrier certificates in Florida. Mr. Avigad requested that we contact you with any
concerns.

There are two kinds of cancellations. The first is voluntary, which is normally granted if the
company is in good standing with the Commission and does not have a past due balance of the
regulatory assessment fee (RAF), including statutory penalty and interest charges. The other is
involuntary. If a company is not in good standing and has an outstanding balance of the RAF, the
Commission normally cancels the certificate on its own motion for a rule violation. Any balance
owed is forwarded to the Comptroller’s Office for collection.

The regulatory assessment fee is assessed if a certificate is active for any one day during a
calendar year. The RAF is due by January 30 of each year, unless the 30th falls on a weekend, then
the fee is due by the next working day, for the previous year. If payment for the RAF is mailed after
the due date, then statutory penalty and interest charges are applicable,

According to Commission records, WorkNet has not paid the 2000 RAFs for either certificate.
Depending upon when your check is postmarked, penalty and interest charges could continue to
accrue. For example, if the company owes the minimum, and if payment is postmarked by April 30,
the amount due for each certificate is $59.00 ($50.00 fee, $7.50 penalty, and $1.50 interest), or a
total of $118.00 for the 2000 RAFs.

The effective date of a voluntary cancellation is the date that the Commission received a
company’s request for cancellation. In this case, the Commission did not receive your request until
March 22, 2001, therefore, the company will owe the 2001 RAF, even if the company is no longer
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Mr. J. Mark Klamer, Counsel
Page 2
March 28, 2001

in business or, in fact, never went into business. Rules 25-24.474 and 25-24.820, Florida
Administrative Code, provides that a company requesting voluntary cancellation must either pay the
2001 RAF or provide a date certain that it will be paid. For example, within 30 days after the
Commission Oider is issued granting the voluntary cancellation. The company may want to go
ahead and pay the 2001 fees when the past due amount is paid. If the company needs the 2001 RAF
return forms for both certificates, please let me know.

Therefore, based on the above information, I cannot recommend a voluntary cancellation of
your certificate unless the past due balance is paid. Please respond in writing within 15 days from
the date of this letter and let me know how you wish to proceed. In the meantime, if you have any
questions, just let me know. I can be reached at (850) 413-6502-voice, (850) 413-6503-fax, by
internet e-mail at pisler@psc.state.fl.us, or at the above address.

Sincerely,

Do Ty ol

Paula J. Isler, Research Assistant
Bureau of Service Evaluation & Compliance

Enclosures (Rules 25-24.474 and 25-24.820, F. A.C.)
cc:  Mr. Cayce Hinton
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Linda Williams

To: Paula Isler
Subject: RE:

No check. 1I'll forward you a copy. Thanks.

----- Original Message-----
From: Paula Isler

Sent: Thursday, March 22,
To: Linda Williams
Subject: RE:

2001 2:27 PM

Only if they sent a check with their letter. Neither certificate has paid the 2000 RAFs.

————— Original Message-----
From: Linda Williams

Sent: Thursday, March 22,
To: Paula Isler

Subject:

2001 2:25 PM

Hi Paula. We have a letter from WorkNet Communications to cancel IXC and ALEC certs. Are

they paid up?
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WorkNET 7777 Bonhomme Avenue 314727 7950

314 212 5401 fax

Si tours, Missoun 63105 www worknet net

March 16, 2001

Ms. Pam Johnson

Public Service Commission

Division of Records and Reporting

Shumard Oak Boulevard

Tallahassee, F1 32299-0850 - -
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Re:  Cancellation of WorkNet Communication’s Certificate of Authority to
Provide Facilities-based and Resold Local Exchange and Intrastate
Interexchange Telecommunications Services in the State of Florida

Dear Ms. Johnson:

By this letter, WorkNet Communications requests that the ALEC certificate of authority
No. 7560 granted by your state enabling WorkNet Communications Inc. to provide
intrastate local exchange and interexchange telecommunications services be rescinded.

Currently, WorkNet does not have any customers in Florida.

Please forward any concerns regarding this cancellation request to our counsel J. Mark

Klamer c/o Bryan Cave, 211 N Broadway, St. Louis MO 63102.

Sincerely yours,

/.4';’//.4 < . S ,/ v3

Joshua Avigad
Assistant General Counsel
WorkNet Communications Inc.

he——

DOCUMENT KI'MBER -DATE

03679 HAR225

FPST

ro-
-

SRS /ETEQRTING

I-CIANHOIH



