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REQUEST TO ESTABLISH DOCKET 
(PLEASE TYPE ) 

Date 6/18/02 

1. 

2. 

3. 

4. 

Div is ion  Name/Staff Name i 0 ' v j s i m  of Competitive Markets and Enforcement/McCoy 

OPR Toni McCoy/CMP 

W 

V 
OCR Lega 1 

Suggested Docket T i t l e  Request f o r  cancel la t ion o f  Pay Telephone Services C e r t i f i c a t e  No. 5008 by 

Payphones , I nc. , e f f e c t i v e  6/7/02. 

5. Suggested Docket Ma i l ing  L i s t  (attach separate sheet i f  necessary) 

A. Provide NAMES OR ACRONYMS ONLY i f  a regulated company. 

B. Provide COMPLETE NAME AND ADDRESS f o r  a l l  others. (Match representatives t o  companies.) 

1 .  Part ies and t h e i r  representatives ( i f  any): 

2. Interested persons and t h e i r  representatives ( i f  any): 

t 

6. Check one: 
XX Documentation i s  attached. 

Documentation w i  11 be provided wi th  recommendation. 
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FROM 

77-907 

To: Commission Clerk 

Company: FL Public Service Commission 

FAX number: 

Business phone: 

From: Tom Bridges 

FAX number: (941) 283-6497 

Business phone: (941) 283-6497 

Home phone: (941) 283-4802 

E-Mail: t.v. bridges@worldnet.att.net 

Date: 6/52002 

Pages including cover: 1 

Subject : Discontinue our Payphone Certificate number: 5008 

Please cancet our Payphone certificate because we have gone  out of business. Enclosed is a 
check for $50.00 to pay our Regulatory Assessment fee for 2002. 

Thomas 0. Bridges 
President 



COMPANY IDENTIFICATION 
Printed on 06/18/2002 at 11:35:50 by TJM 

Complete Name: Payphones, Inc. 

Mailing Name: Payphones, Inc. 
Company Code: TF907 FEID Number: 65-0708579 

COMPANY INFORMATION 

Address Line 1: 3001 Bounty Lane 
Address Line 2: 
City : St. James C i t y  

R e g .  Date: 12/25/1996 
Transfered To: 

Trans. From: 
Certificate 1: 5 0 0 8  

Corporate Type: 

Service 1: PAT - P a y  Telephone 
Service 2: 
Service 3: 
Service 4: 
Class (WAW): 
Phone Count: 98 
County 1: 
County 3 :  
Bankruptcy: N o  

State: FL Zip Code: 33956-2381 
Inactive Date: 

Certificate 2: 

County 2: 
County 4: 
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COMPANY IDENTIFICATION 
Printed on 06/18/2002 at 11:35:47 by TJM 

Complete Name: Payphones, Inc. 

Mailing Name: Payphones, Inc. 
Company Code: TF907 FEID Number: 65-0708579 

MAILING INFORMATION 

Attention: 
Address Line 1: 3001 Bounty Lane 
Address Line 2: 
City: St. James C i t y  

E-mail Address: 
Web Address: 

Liaison 1:Thomas Bridges 
Title : President/Owner 
Phone : (941) 283-6497 
E-mail: 

F a x  1: (941) 283-6497 

County: 

State: FL Zip Code: 33956-2381 

Liaison 2 :  

T i t l e :  

Phone : (941) 283-4802 (Home) 
E-mail: 

Fax 2: 
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COMPANY IDENTI F I  CAT1 ON 
Printed on 06/18/2002 at 12:32:30 by T3M 

Assessment Due 

RAF $50.00 

Penalty $0.00 

Interest $0 00 

Extension Fee $0.00 

Total $50.00 

Complete Name: Payphones, Inc. 

Paid Owe 

$ 5 0 . 0 0  $0.00 

$0.00 $0.00 

$0.00 $0.00 

$0.00 $0.00 

$ 5 0  . O O  $0.00 

Mailing Name: Payphones, Inc. 
Company Code: TF907 FEID Number: 65-0708579 

RAF ACCOUNT FOR THE PERIOD 01/01/2002 THROUGH 12/31/2002 

Reg. Date: 
Service : 
Received: 
Status: 
Amended : 
Frozen: 
Payment Count: 
Operating Rev: 
RAF Rate: 

12/25/1996 Inactive Date: 
PAT - Pay Telephone 
No RAF Form 
Sat i s  f ied 
NO Extension: No 
No Comments : No 
1 Payment Made to D a t e  

$0.00 Interstate Rev: $0.00 
0.0015 Net RAF Due: $50.00 

I ! I I I 
Last modification was made on Wednesday, June 12, 2002 at 11:05 AM by Jackie Knight 
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Voluntary cancellation, 

COMPANY NAME: Payphones, Inc . CO. CODE: TF907 

COMPANY LIAISON: 

DOCKET NO.: CERTIFICATE NO.: EFFECTIVE: 

Effective 0 6 / 0 7 / 0 2  
I 

RAF RETURN NOTICE: 

DELINQUENT NOTICE: 

OTHER RETURNED MAIL: 

CCA’S RETUFWED MAIL: 

YEAR(s) RAFs NOT PAID: 

YEAR(s) PENALTIES & INTEREST NOT PAID: 

REVENUES/YEAR: 

DATE LOTUS CHECKED FOR PAYMENT: 

OTHER INFORMATION 

06/07/02 - From company (Thomas 0. Bridqes, President) - Memo dated 06/05/02 

requesting cancellation of its certificate and enclosinq payment 

f o r  the 2002 RAF. 

06/11/02 - Forwarded letter to Jackie Gilchrist (company’s RAFs are paid up) 

for handlins. 
I T 


