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(Please Type) 

D a t e  July 12, 2002 Docket No. I 

1. Division Name/Staff Name: I 
2. OPR:CMP/Pruitt 

3. 0CR:GCL 

4. Suggested Docket Tit1e:Request for approval of name change on IXC Certificate No. 7760 from Global Crest 

Communications, Inc. to Global Crest Communications, Inc. d/b/a Dimensions. 

5. Suggested Docket M a i h g  List (attach separate shee t  if necessary) 

A. 

B. 

Provide NAMES OR ACRONYMS ONLY if a regulated company. 

Provide COMPLETE NAME AND ADDRESS for all others. {Match representatives to companies.) 

1. Parties and their representatives (if any): 

Global Crest Communications, Inc. 

~~ 

2. Interested persons and their representatives (if any): 

I 

6. Checkone: 
X Documentation is attached. 

Documentation will be provided with recommendation. 

PSC\CCAOlO-C (Rev 10/01) 



Lance J.M. Steinhart, P.C. 
Attorney At Law 

6455 East Johns Crossing 
Suite 285 

Duluth, Georgia 30097 

Also Admitted in New York 
and Maryland 

January 12,2002 
VIA OVERNIGHT DFJJVERY 

Florida Public Service Commission 
Divisioii of the Commission Clerk & Administrative Services 
2540 Shumard Oak Blvd. 
Gunt er B ldg . 
Tallahassee, Florida 3 2399-085 0 

Re: Global Crest Communications, Inc. d/b/a Dimensions 
Docket No. 001 570-TI 

Telephone: (770) 232-9200 
Facsimile: (770) 232-9208 

c3 N 

Dear SirMadam: 

I am writing this letter in order to notify the Commission that Global Crest 
Communications, Inc. intends to use the fictitious name of Dinlensions in the State of Florida, in 
addition to its corporate name. The company was issued a Certificate of Public Convenience and 
Necessity in the above-referenced docket, and added the additional name for marketing reasons. 

This fictitious name has been registered with the Florida Department of State and evidence 
of such is attached hereto. Upon Commission approval of the fictitious name, the company will file 
rev i sed t ari ff 1 ab el s . 

Please return a stamped copy of the extra copy of this letter in the enclosed preaddressed 
prepaid envelope. 

If you have any questions regarding the foregoing, please do not hesitate to call me. Thank 
you for your attention to this matter. 

Sincerely, I 

Charlotte Lacey 
Legal Assistant to Lance J.M. Steinhart, Esq. 
Attorney for Global Crest Communications, Inc. 
d/b/a Dimensions 

Enclosures 
cc: FrankPizzo 



Nancv Pruitt 

To: 
Subject: 

Paula Mer 
RE: TJ473 - Global Crest Communications, Inc. 

Many thanks 

- - - -  -Original Message----- 
From: Paula Isler 
Sent: Monday, June 24, 2002 11:29 AM 
To: Nancy Pruitt 
Subject: TJ473 - Global Crest Communications, Inc. 

This is the company where you received a request to add a fictitious name back in January 
and you checked (a million times) but they had not paid RAFs. 
2001 RAF, including P & I ,  on 6/18 (deposited 6/20). So, it is OK to go forward with your 
name change. 

The Commission received the 
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6/13/02 

Re: Global Crest, TJ473 

Paula, attached is a copy of the request dated 1/12/02 from 
Global Crest Communications, Inc. for a name change. This was 
not  docketed because RAFs had not been paid. Steinhart‘s office . 
was contacted and told about the RAFs. Also attached are my e- 
mails for 2 / 7 ,  2/18, 2/27, 3 / 8 ,  3/15, and 4 1 2 .  All during this 
time I was calling Steinhart’s office, asking f o r  up-dates on the 
mFs and was told they were working on it. 

During the 4/2 call I informed Steinhart’s office that I wanted 
to contact the company directly but the telephone number listed 
for them in MCD was not  working. I was told the contact person at 
Global Crest had changed to Sheila Vick and was given a new 
telephone number df 305-891-5668. 
However, I was told to speak with Kelly Hall on t h e  RAFs. 

This i n f o  was s e n t  t o  Nonnye. 

I did speak with Kelly and on May 10 1 mailed h e r  a RAF form. 
or near May 23 I called Kelly again because we had not  received 
the RAF. She said she did not g e t  t h e  form. I told her I would 
fax her the form and who to call if she had any problems on the 
P & I .  On May 23 I faxed h e r  t h e  RAF f o r m .  

On 

Since it appears that I am not getting any assistance from the 
attorney’s office on collecting the RAF and since the company has 
not responded 1 don’t know of anything else  I can do in 
Certification. 



Nancv Pruitt 

From: 
Sent: 
To: 
Subject: 

Paula lsler 
Monday, February 18,2002 10:50 AM 
Nancy Pruitt 
RE: RAFs 

T 3 0 9 0 ' s  check  for 2 0 0 1  ( $ 5 0 . 0 0 )  was pos tmarked  1 / 2 9 / 0 2 .  No o t h e r  payment.  N o  payment a t  
a l l  f o r  TJ473. 

----- Original Message----- 
From: Nancy Pruitt 
S e n t :  Monday, F e b r u a r y  1 8 ,  2 0 0 2 ' 1 0 : 3 7  AM 
T o :  P a u l a  Isler 
S u b j e c t :  RE: RAFs 

Hi. S i n c e  this i s  now 11 days l a t e r  c o u l d  you c h e c k  a g a i n  on TJ473 f o r  2 0 0 1  RAFs and 
TJ090 f o r  2 0 0 1  and  2 0 0 2 .  T h a n k  you .  I 

_---- Original Message----- 
From: Pau la  Isler 
Sent: Thursday ,  F e b r u a r y  0 7 ,  2002  1 : 3 9  PM 
T o :  Nancy Pruitt 
S u b j e c t :  RE: N F s  

RAF Systems shows that 2 0 0 1  h a s  not been p a i d  f o r  e i t h e r  company code. The 2002 h a s  not 
been p a i d  f o r  TJ090. O r  r a t h e r ,  payment has  not been p o s t e d .  I f  e i t h e r  company n e e d s  t h e  
form(s), l e t  m e  know and I'll p r i n t  them f o r  y o u .  

----- O r i g i n a l  Message----- 
From: Nancy Pruitt 
S e n t :  Thursday ,  F e b r u a r y  07, 2002  1 :37  PM 
T o :  P a u l a  Isler 
S u b j e c t :  RAFs 

Are they up to d a t e :  
TJ473, Global C r e s t  

- TJ090, S a t e l l i n k  a l s o  2002 f o r  this one 



Nancy Pruitt 

From: 
Sent: 
To: 
Subject: 

Paula lsler 
Wednesday, February 27,2002 4 1:OZ AM 
Nancy Pruitt 
RE: global crest TJ473 

Accord ing  t o  the RAF system payment h a s  not been received, but I see where an e x t e n s i o n  t o  
file the RaF was g r a n t e d  but it does not give the date. You w i l l  need  t o  c o n t a c t  Jackie 
Knight f o r  f u r t h e r  i n f o .  

__--- O r i g i n a l  Message----- 
From: Nancy P r u i t t  
S e n t :  Wednesday, F e b r u a r y  2 7 ,  2002  1 0 : 5 2  AM 
To: P a u l a  Isler 
Subject: global crest TJ473 

Have they paid 2 0 0 1  RAFs y e t ?  Thanks.  

1 



Nancy Pruitt 

From: 
Sent: 
To: 
Subject: 

No. 

Paula Isler 
Friday, March 08, 2002 10:47 AM 
Nancy Pruitt 
RE: RAFs 

----- Original Message----- 
. From: Nancy P r u i t t  

S e n t :  Fr iday ,  March 0 8 ,  2002  10:.46 AM 
To: P a u l a  Isler 
Subject: RAFs 

Has TJ473, Global C r e s t ,  pa id  yet? Thank you.  

1 



Nancy Pruitt 

From: 
Sent: 
To: 
Subject: 

No. 

Jackie Knight 
Monday, March 18, 2002 926 AM 
Nancy Pruitt 
RE: RAFs 

__---  O r i g i n a l  Message----- 
From: Nancy P r u i t t  
S e n t :  F r i d a y ,  March 15, 2002  2:44 PM 
T o :  J a c k i e  Kn igh t  
Subject: RAFs 

Has TJ473, Global Crest Communications, Inc. p a i d  their 2 0 0 1  RAFs? Thank you .  



From: 
Sent: 
To: 
S u bj ect: 

No. Not yet. 

Jackie Knight 
Tuesday, April 02, 2002 12:lO PM 
Nancy Pruitt 
RE: RAFs 

_---- Original Message----- 

Sent: T u e s d a y ,  April 02, 2002 12 :07  PM 
To: J a c k i e  Knight 
S u b j e c t :  RAFs 

. From: Nancy Pruitt 

Did T J 4 7 3 ,  Global Crest Communications, ever p a y  their RAFs f o r  2001?  T h a n k  you .  

1 



Nancv Pruitt 

To: 
Subject: 

nonnye grant 
tj473 

T J 4 7 3 ,  Global Crest 
Gregory V i c k ,  the company liaison, is dead .  The new liaison is S h e l i a  V i c k .  H i s  old 
telephone number is no longer in service. The new n u m b e r  for Shelia is 305-891-5668. 
Also need to c h a n g e  t h e  address to: 12550 Biscayne Blvd.#703 
Thank you.  

I los- 
35- 9 



May 23,2002 I 

2540 SHUMARD OAK BOULEVARD 
TALLAHASSEE, FL 32399-0850 

STATE OF FLORIDA TO: 

Nancy Pruitt 
Certification Section 

Fax: (850) 413-6128 

Voice: (850) 413-6127 

~- 

Kelly Hall 
Global Crest Coinmunications, Inc. 

Fax: (305) 895-1 159 
Voice: (305) 891-5668 

RE: 

Past due 200 1 Regulatory Assessment 
Fee (RAF) and request to add fictitious 
name to certificate. 

FAX IS 3 PAGES, INCLUDING COVER. 

We received a request to add the fictitious name, Dimensions, to your long distance 
certificate. However because your company has not paid its 2001 RAF we have not amended 
your certificated name. Attached is a RAF form for 2001. Please be sure your company’s 
address at the top is correct. Please return the form with your check to the PSC at the above 
address. 

Because your RAF is late you owe a penalty and interest, items 10 & 11 on the form. 
Instructions for calculating the P&J are on page 2 of the fonn. Please let me know if your have 
any questions. 

Thank you, 
Nancy Pruitt 



i 
I TRANSMISSION VERIFICATION REPORT 

TIME : 05/23/2882 16:32 
NAME : 
FAX : 
TEL : 

DATE, TIME 05/23 10% 
FAX NO. /NAME 613058951159 
DURATIClN 00: el : 25 
PAGE(S) 03 
RESULT OK 
MODE STANDARD 

ECM 
I 



12i’11/2081 11: 23 3056951159 GLOEAL CREST PAGE 03 

1 certify from the records of this office that DIMENSIONS .is a Fi 
registered with the DepartmenWf State on November 7, 2001. 

The Registration Number of this Fictitious Name is GO1 31 190~041. 

I further certify that said Fictitious Name Registration is active. 

titio JS Name 

1 further certify that this office began filing Fictitious Name Registrations on 
January 1,  1991, pursuant to Section 865.09, Florida Statutes, 

. 

..... .. - -  _ .  - 

CR2E022 (1 -99) 

Given under my hand and the 
Great Seal of the State of Florrda 

at Tallahassee, the Capital, this the  
Seventh day of November, 2001 


