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To: Paula Isler
Subject: RE: TC822

okay. Thanks.

————— Original Message-----
From: Paula Isler

Sent: Thursday, January 16, 2003 3:35 PM
To: Ruth Nettles
Subject: RE: TC822

Yes, it is OK to open a docket. Make the effective date 12/31/02. Thanks.

————— Original Message-----
From: Ruth Nettles

Sent: Thursday, January 16, 2003 3:17 PM
To: Paula Isler
Subject: TC822

Paula, I have received a fifty dollar RAF payment from company and they are requesting
cancellation of cert. Please advice if we should open cancellation docket. thanks.
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