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Ruth Nettles 0 R I G E NAL_

To: Paula Isler
Subject: RE:TF015 Ceqrt 3465

Okay. We'll open a docket today. Thanks, again Paula. -
630068 TC

————— Original Message----- -

From: Paula Isler

Sent: Wednesday, January 22, 2003 8:06 AM

To: Ruth Nettles

Cc: Jackie Gilchrist

Subject: RE: TF015

Hi Ruth. I was out yesterday. Yes, it is OK to open a docket since they included
payment. Make effective date 12/31/02. Thanks.

————— Original Message-----

From: Ruth Nettles

Sent: Tuesday, January 21, 2003 2:41 PM
To: Paula Isler

Subject: TF015

Importance: High

Paula, this person is wanting to cancel certificate, they wrote on the fax that you sent
to them "cancel" I'm assuming that's what they meant? I'll place under undocketed until
you can let me know to proceed with cancellation dkt. They enclosed fifty dollar payment.
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