REQUEST TO ESTABLISH DOCKET
(PLEASE TYPE)

[)A0AR 2l
Date 3/3/03 Docket No. )/L) = [.'7’2
1. Division NamesStaff Name__ Division of Competitive Markets & Enforcement/McCoy
N, v
2. OPR__CMP/McCoy ;\—'” |

3. OCR__Legal Services

4. Suggested Docket Title Request for Cancellation of Pay Telephone Certificate No. 7928

YHK, Inc., effective 12/31/02.

5. Suggested Docket Mailing List (attach separate sheet if necessary)

A. Provide NAMES ONLY for regulated companies or ACRONYMS ONLY regulated industries,
as shown in Rule 25-22.104, F.A.C.
B. Provide COMPLETE name and address for all others. (Match representatives to clients.)

1. Parties and their representatives (if any)

2. Interested Persons and their representatives (if any)

6. Check one:
XX _ Documentation is attached.

Documentation will be provided with recommendation.

I:\PSC\RAR\WP\ESTDKT.

PSC/RAR 10 (Revised 01/96)

DOCUMENT WEMOER-DATE
02093 HAR-3 &

FPSC-COMMISSION CLERK



COMPANY INFORMATION
AS OF 03/03/2003

YHK, Inc. (TG841)

Location address

YHK, Inc.
812 Magnolia Creek Circle
Orlando, FL 32828-8371

Regulation date
10/12/2001

Certificate(s)
7928

Services provided
PAT




COMPANY IDENTIFICATION
Printed on 03/03/2003 at 11:03:06 by TJM

Complete Name: YHK, Inc.

Mailing Name: YHK, Inc.
Company Code: TGB41 FEID Number: 59-3723878

RAF ACCOUNT FOR THE PERIOD 01/01/2002 THROUGHE 12/31/2002

Reg. Date: 10/12/2001 Inactive Date:

Service: PAT - Pay Telephone

Received: Actual RAF Form

Status: Satisfied

Amended: No Extension: No

Frozen: No Comments: No

Payment Count: 1 Payment Made to Date

Operating Rev: $0.00 Interstate Rev: $0.00

RAF Rate: 0.0015 Net RAF Due: $50.00

Asgsessment Due Paid Owe

RAF $50.00 $50.00 $0.00
Penalty $0.00 $0.00 $U.00
Interest $0.00 $0.00 $0.00
Extension Fee $0.00 $0.00 $0.00
Total $50.00 $50.00 $0.00

Last modification was made on Friday, January 10, 2003 at 5:10 PM by Jackie Knight



JIA
1//3)¢%

COMPANY NAME: YHK, Inc. CO. CODE:_TGB41
COMPANY LTAISON: Tae “Ted” 8. Kim, Vicg_President
DOCKET NO. : CERTIFICATE NO.:_7928 EFFECTIVE:_10/12/01

RAF RETURN NOTICE:

DELINQUENT NOTICE:

OTHER RETURNED MAIL:

CCA’'S RETURNED MAIL:

YEAR(s) RAFs NOT PAID: 2002

YEAR(s8) PENALTIES & INTEREST NOT PAID:

REVENUES/YEAR:

DATE LOTUS CHECKED FOR PAYMENT:

OTHER INFORMATION

01/03/03 - E-mail from J. Gilchrist asking if I had received a request for

cancellation from this company.

01/06/03 - Responded via e-mail that T had not.
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FISCAL SERVICES CHECK RECONCILIATION SYSTEM: Batch Report
Batch 01/08/2003 09:04:20 AM Entered by DMARTIN on 01/08/2003  Audited by MCOGGINS on 01/09/2003

Company / Payer Code Notes Deposit No. Deposit Date Check No. Amount

Gulf Power Company <nones> copy of rule supplement D288 01/13/2003 1189 1.05
NevCom Communications, Inc. TA408 «none> D287 01/10/2003 1816 50.00
M & M Petrocleum, Inc. TG337 <none:s D287 01/10/2003 3725 50.00
YHK, Inc. TG841 <none: D287 01/10/2003 1032 50.00
Genaro's Liquors, Inc. d/b/a TE273 <none: D287 01/10/2003 1489 50.00
Pulham Communications TG018 <none> D287 01/10/2003 1317 50.00
Coral Telecom, Inc. TX451 <ncne:> D287 01/10/2003 10259 50.00
Coral Telecom, Inc. TJ407 <none> D287 01/10/20023 10260 50.00
Myatel Corporation TJE667 Ck amt $100.00 - See TX6€61 D287 01/10/2003 0095 50.00
Myatel Corp. TX661 Ck amt $100.00 - See TJ667 D287 01/10/2003 0095 50.00
Number of checks in Batch: 10 Batch Total Sum: 451.05
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Flerida Public Service Commission oA -
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Commission Clerk Office % <
2540 Shumard Oak Blvd.
Tallahassee, FL 32399-0850
Re: Pay telephone service provider license cancellation for YHK, Inc.
Dear Florida Public Service Commission:
The purpose of this letter is to notify you of our intent to cancel the licenusc as a pay telephone service
provider. Please rccord this cancellation for YHK, Inc.
If you need to contact us, please call 407-340-8090.
Thank you. )
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Paula Isler

From: Paula isler

Sent: Monday, January 06, 2003 7:59 AM
To: Jackie Gilchrist

Subject: RE: YHK, Inc.

No, I have not received anything from this company.

————— Original Message-----

From: Jackie Gilchrist

Sent: Friday, January 03, 2003 3:15 PM
To: Paula Isler

Subject: YHK, Inc.

Importance: High

I received a call from Ted Kim advising me that he sent in a request for
cancellation around October and he called to find out the status of his

request. I don't recall this coming through my shop. Are you aware of this
request?



