REQUEST TO ESTABLISH DOCKET
(PLEASE TYPE)

2 2
Date_ 3/3/03 pocket No. 0 )Dtg | = \C/

1. Division Name/Staff Name__Division of Competitive Markets. & Enfgrcement/McCoy
N4

2. OPR__CMP/McCoy~. An/\

VN

3. OCR___Legal Services

4. Suggested Docket Title Request for Cancetlation of Pay Telephone Certificate No. 2343

Ardan Communications, effective 12/31/01.

5. Suggested Docket Mailing List (attach separate sheet if necessary)

A. Provide NAMES ONLY for regulated companies or ACRONYMS ONLY regulated industries,
as shown in Rule 25-22.104, F.A.C.
B. Provide COMPLETE name and address for all others. (Match representatives to clients.)

1. Parties and their representatives {if any)

2. Interested Persons and their representatives (if any)

6. Check one:
XX _ Documentation is attached.

Documentation will be provided with recommendation.

[ :\PSC\RAR\WPAESTDKT.

PSC/RAR 10 (Revised 01/96)

DOCUMINT NUMary -DATE
02094 MAR-3 &

FPSC-COMMISSICN CLERK



COMPANY INFORMATION
AS OF 03/03/2003

Ardan Communications (TE104)

Location address

Ardan Communications
223 Cypress Trace
Tarpon Springs, FL 34689-9493

Requlation date

08/08/1989

Certificate(s)
2343

Corporate type
Not Available

Services provided

PAT




COMPANY

IDENTIFICATION

Printed on 03/03/2003 at 10:58:53 by TJM

Complete Name: Ardan Communications

Mailing Name: Ardan Communications

Company Code: TE104

FEID Number:

59-2967863

RAF ACCOUNT FOR THE PERIOD 01/01/2002 THROUGH 12/31/2002

Reg. Date: 08/08/1989

Service: PAT - Pay Telephone
Received: Actual RAF Form
Status: Satisfied

Amended: No

Frozen: No

Payment Count: 1 Payment Made to Date

Inactive Date:

Extension: No
Comments: No

Operating Rev: $0.00 Interstate Rev: $0.00
RAF Rate: 0.0015 Net RAF Due: $50.00
Agsessment Due paid Qwe

RAF $50.00 $50.00 $0.00
Penalty $0.00 $0.00 $0.00
Interegt $0.00 $0.00 $0.00
Extension Fee $0.00 $0.00 $0.00
Total $50.00 $50.00 $0.00

Lagst modification was made on Tuesday,

January 14, 2003 at 8:54 AM by

Jackie Knight




COMPANY NAME: Ardan Communicationsg CO. CODE:_TE104

COMPANY LIAISON:

DOCKET NO.: CERTIFICATE NO.: :y% EFFECTIVE:

RAF RETURN NOTICE:

DELINQUENT NOTICE:

OTHER RETURNED MAIL:

CCA’S RETURNED MAIL:

YEAR (8) RAFs NOT PAID:

YEAR (s8) PENALTIES & INTEREST NOT PAID:

REVENUES/YEAR:

DATE LOTUS CHECKED FOR PAYMENT:

OTHER INFORMATION

01/13/03 - The Commiggion received the company’s 2002 RAF, along with a

letter requesting cancellation of the certificate. I advised

CCA (Nettles) that a docket can be establlshed

1y \oa S ded yule 40 @,Oé@fﬁag Q)mhm%ng
\/M&wg (’MWM@M}, % )Z//ﬁ)//ﬂz,




Paula Isler

From: Ruth Nettles

Sent: Monday, January 13, 2003 12:06 PM
To: Paula Isler

Subject: RE: TE104; Ardan Communications

Okay, thank you.

————— Original Message-----

From: Paula Isler

Sent: Monday, January 13, 2003 12:06 PM
To: Ruth Nettles

Subject: TE104; Ardan Communications

Hi Ruth. Della put proof of payment and the company's request for
cancellation in my box this morning for the above company (see Document 00341-
03). It is CK to open a docket, effective 12/31/02. Thanks.



- L £, G l N A L
10 AVOID PENALTY AND INTLREST CBARGLS, TIE REGULATORY ASSESSMENT FEE RETURN MUST BE FILED ON OR BEFORE 01/30/2003 O R |

Pay Telephone Service Provider Regulatory Assessment Fee Return

/"/

Florida Public Service Commission

FOR PSC USE ONLY
STATUS: {Scr Fiding lnxirnctions on Bach of Form) Checd, g
—__ Acal RetunM TE104-02-0-R 1 22.00 s
isl:::::l‘:: l]::l'u“'r: Ardan Communications $ P
223 Cypress Trace 0603002

T i L 3468919 h 004011
PERIOD COVERED: amﬂgﬁw’f E S /8 /013
Postmark Date
01/01/2002 TO 12/31/2002 D2 88E I3 2003 - omm-Lm—a

Please Complete Below If Official Mailing Address Has Changed i - ' -
(Name of Company) (Adkdress) {City/State) = . W . Zp) -
LINE '
NO. ACCOUNT CLASSIFICATION AMOUNT
1. Gross Operating Revenue (Florida) AUS $ "0 -
2. Gross Intrastate Revenue ga? e ~0) -~
3, LESS: Amounts Paid to Other Telecommunications Companies* com____ ( D )
(see "2, Fees" on back) CTR ..
ECR ____
4.  TOTAL REVENUES for Regulatory Assessment Fee Calculation 3‘3& — %
(Line 2 less Line 3) -—
MMS _—
5. Regulatory Assessment Fee Due — (Multiply Line 4 by 0.0015) gl-;"-ﬁ mL ,_@ -
6. Penalty for Late Payment (see "3. Failure to File by Due Date" on back) — @ —
7. Interest for Late Payment (see "3. Failure to File by Due Date” on back) —~ O—
8.  TOTAL AMOUNT DUE $.C0.00
AS PROVIDED IN SECTION 364.336 FLORIDA STATUTES, THE MINIMUM ANNUALFEEIS 550 - N
1 'uﬂ 2 4 W NN s LY
THIS FORM MUST BE COMPLETED AND RETURNED REGARDLESS OF THE AMOUNT OF REV;:NUES KEPORTED
9. Number of pay telephones in operation at close of period covered = Z ]

by this Return

* These amounts must be intrasiate gnly and must be verifiable,

1, the undersigned owner/officer of the above-named company, have read the foregoing and declare that 1o the best of miy knowledge and belief the above information isa
true and correct stalement. 1 am aware that pursuant to Section 8§37.06, Florida Statutes, whoever knowingly makes a false statement in writing with the intent to mislead a
public servant in the performance of bis 07;!21 duty shall be guilty of a misderneanor of the second degree.

Ol /a7 P—31-02
VA4 (Signature of y 0ﬂ'lcml) (Tite} (Date)
4 J)AAJ Telephone Numbe(zz a‘ 2 zj 7~ Q 23 Fax Number ()
(Preparer of Form’- Please Print Name) - -

FE.A No.

DOCUMENT M™MPTR-DATE
0034 Janios
FPSC-COMMISSION CLERK

PSC/CMU-26 (Ren 1 1/1159)



ARDAN COMMUNICATIONS
223 Cypress Trace Tarpon Springs, FL 34689 (727) 787-6173

January 6, 2003

Ms. Toni McCoy e T
Florida Public Service Commission

2540 Shumard QOak Boulevard

Tallahassee, Florida 32399-0876

Dear Ms. McCoy:

As you requested in our telephone conversation of today, | would like to cancel
my pay telephone service provider certificate TE104 under the name of Ardan
Communications, as | am no longer in business and do not need this certificate.
I would like this cancellation to be effective as of December 31, 2002.

Also, | am enclosing a check in the amount of $50.00 for the minimum fee to
cover the year 2002,

Thank you very much for helping me in this matter.

Lofr

Sincerely,

Aron Kedan

¢1:6 W OV NI €0
REIVER NolLNEI8LSIT



Della Fordham

From: Msanders@psc.state.fl.us

Sent: Monday, January 13, 2003 9:35 AM

To: DFORDHAM@psc.state. fl.us; SHOWARD@psc. state.fl.us; CCRAIG@psc.state.fl.us;
LGIVENS@psc.state.fl.us

Subject: New filing in undocketed matter

DOCUMENT DESCRIPTION = CCA/Fiscal - Payment record from Ardan Communications (TE104} for
2002 RAFs,

Deposit D288 dated 1/13/02; with attached letter from Aron Kedan requesting

cancellation of certificate effective 12/31/02.

DOCUMENT PATH =
file://L:\PSC\LIBRARY\FILINGS\03\00341-03

Document ID = 00341-03
Document Filed 01/10/03

The filing described above is now available in PDF format, and may also be available in
WordPerfect or cther formats.

To access it, c¢lick on the DOCUMENT PATH link. This will pop up a Windows Explorer window.
You will see the PDF (Adobe Acrobat) version; you will also see other versions if they
exist. Double-click on the preferred version and the document will open.

If you need to cut/paste/search in the document and find you can't, try later when the
reformatted version is available. (For more information, see PDF Tips on the How To menu.)

You can also go to the docket in CMS by triple-clicking on the DOCKET NUMBER, typing ctrl-
C to copy, and using the paste icon to paste the docket number into the query line in CMS.

This is an automatically generated e-mail; no response/reply is necessary.



