
p.  Q( 
J lC 

3‘ 

P ANDREW 0. ISAR 

Via Expedited Delivevv 

May 9,2003 

REGULATORY C 0 NSU LTANTS 

Office of Fiscal Services 
Florida Public Service Commission 
2540 Shurnard Oak Boulevard 
Tallahassee, Florida 32399 

7901 SKANSIEAVENUE, 
SUITE 240 - .  

GIG HARBOR, WA 98335 
TELEPHONE: 253.851.6700 
FACSIMILE: 253.851.6474 

W T P ’ / W . M I L L E R I S A R  COM 

/- I A 9 9 5  

RE: Fox Communications Corporation, Payment of Penalty in Docket No. 910132, 
1990 and 1991 Regulatory Assessment Fee, and Related Interest , 

Dear Sir or Madam: 

Enclosed for remittance to the Florida Public Service Commission (Tomission”) on behalf of 
our client, Fox Communications Corporation, are two checks: Check No. 053212 in the amount 
of $1,000.00, and Check No. 053213 in the amount of $268.50. Check No. 053212 applies to the 
payment of a penalty assessed by the Commission on March 5, 1991 in Docket No. 910132 for 
failure to file a 1990 Annual report. A copy of the associated Commission “Vote Sheet” is 
attached for your reference. Check No. 053213 applies to the payment of the Commission’s 1990 
and 1991 Regulatory assessment fees and associated penalty and interest payments, as reflected in 
the Staff memorandum, also attached. 

Thank you for your attention to this matter. Questions may be directed to the undersigned. 

Sincerely , 
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MILLER ISAR, INC. AUS 
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Andred 0. Isar 

cc: Nancy Pruitt, Robert Benson 
SEC -1- 
OTH 



Martha Coaains 

From: 
Sent: 
To: 

. Subject: 

Nancy Pruitt- 
Wednesday, May 14,2003 3:18 PM 
Martha Coggins 
RE: TI945 Fox Communications Corporation 

Sorry the Docket Number is910132-TI not 010132-TI. 

- - - -  -Original Message----- 
From: Nancy Pruitt 
Sent: Wednesday, May 14, 2003 3:16 PM 
To: Martha Coggins 
Subject: TI945 Fox Communications Corporation 

.. 

It is OK to deposit the  RAFs and Fine. The RAFs are for  1990 and 1991. The fine is f o r  
010132-TI. Thank you. 

h 
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Nancy Pruitt 

To: 
Subject: 

Paula Ister - 
RE: TI945 Fox Communications 

Thank you 

--.--- Original Measage----- 
From: Paula Isler 
sent:  Monday, April 21, 2003 12:24 PM 
To: Nancy P r u i t t  
S u b j e c t :  RE: TI945 Fox C m " n i c a t i o n s  

1990 - $137.50 ($50.00 RAF, $12.50 Penalty, $ 7 5 . 0 0  Interes t ) .  

1991 - $131.00 ( $ 5 0 . 0 0  RAF, $12.50 Penalty, $ 6 8 . 5 0  Interest). 

These are goad t h ru  4 / 3 0 / 0 3 .  
5 / 3 O / O 3 .  

Add 50 cents i n t e r e s t  to each for poetmarks between 51'1 thru 

-----Original Message-----  
From: Nancy P r u i r t  
sent: Monday, April 21, 2003 7:48 AM 
To; Paula Isler 
Subject: TI945 Fox Communications 

How much does Fox owe for 1990 and 1991 RAFs? Please use the $ 5 0  m i n i m u m .  Thank you. 
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