
CCA Official Filing ORIGINAL 

To: 
Subject: 

Paula lsler 
RE: Striker's Family Sprots Center II, Inc. (TG825) 

Good morning, Paula. I'll open a docket today.  

Thank you. 

- - - -  -Original Message----- 
From: Paula Isler 
Sent: Tuesday, May 27, 2 0 0 3  8 : 0 7  AM 
To: Ruth Nettles 
Subject: RE: Striker's Family Sprots Center 11, Inc. (TG825) 

Good morning, Ruth. 1 was out Friday. Yes, open a docket since they've now paid the 2003 
RAF. Please put this latest correspondence with the previous (Document #04302-03) and 
make the effective date 5/14/03. Thanks. 

- - - -  -Original Message----- 
From: Ruth Nettles 
Sent: Friday, May 23, 2003 11:12 AM 
To: Paula Isler 
Subject: Striker's Family Sprots Center 11, Inc. (TG825) 

Good morning. I have received payment of $50 from company; they have attached your 
correspondence dated 5/15/03. Would you like for me to open a docket to process 
cancellation request? 
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