REQUEST TO ESTABLISH DOCKET
(PLEASE TYPE)

_/\
Date_ 7/14/03 bocket No. (DBODD "\C'

1. Division Name/Staff Name Division of Competitive Markets & Enforcement/McCoy

2. OPR___CMP/McCoy L \\

3. OCR___Legal Services

4. Suggested Docket Title Reguest for Cancellation of Pay Telephone Certificate No. 8205

Thomas E. Cantrell, effective 6/23/03.

5. Suggested Docket Mailing List (attach separate sheet if necessary)

A. Provide NAMES ONLY for regulated companies or ACRONYMS ONLY regulated industries,
as shown in Rule 25-22.104, F.A.C.
B. Provide COMPLETE name and address for all otners. {(Matcn represeniziives to clients.)

1. Parties and their representatives (if any)

2. Interested Persons and their representatives (if any)

6. Check one:
XX_ Documentation is attached.

Documentation will be provided with recommendation.

1:\PSC\RAR\WP\ESTDKT.

PSC/RAR 10 (Revised 01/96)
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Complete Name:

Mailing Name:
Company Code:

COMPANY IDENTIFICATION
Printed on 07/15/2003 at 14:50:09 by TJM

Thomas E. Cantrell

Thomas E. Cantrell
TG919

FEID Number:

RAF ACCOUNT FOR THE PERIOD 01/01/2003 THROUGH 12/31/2003

Reg. Date: 10/01/2002 Inactive Date:

Service: PAT - Pay Telephone

Received: Actual RAF Forxm

Status: Satisfied

Amended: No Extension: No

Frozen: No Comments: No

Payment Count: 1 Payment Made to Date

Operating Rev: $0.00 Interstate Rev: $0.00

RAF Rate: 0.0015 Net RAF Due: $50.00

Assessment Due Paid Owe

RAF $50.00 $50.00 $0.00
Penalty $0.00 $0.00 $0.00
Interest $0.00 $0.00 $0.00
Extension Fee $0.00 $0.00 $0.00
Total $50.00 $50.00 $0.00

Last modification was made on Monday, July 14,

2003 at 10:09 AM by Valorie Moore
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COMPANY NAME: Thomas E. Cantrell CO. CODE: TG919
COMPANY LIAISON: Same, Owner
DOCKET NO. : CERTIFICATE NO.: 8205 EFFECTIVE: 10/01/02

RAF RETURN NOTICE:

DELINQUENT NOTICE:

OTHER RETURNED MAIL:

CCA’S RETURNED MAIL:

YEAR (s) RAFs NOT PAID: 2003

YEAR (s) PENALTIES & INTEREST NOT PAID:

Amount Year Paid
REVENUES/YEAR:

DATE LOTUS CHECKED FOR PAYMENT:

OTHER INFORMATION

06/23/03 - From company - Letter dated 06/16/03 requesting cancellation of

certificate.

06/24/03 - Wrote company and advised it needed to pay 2003 RAF or provide

date certain it would pay. Follow up 07/11/03.
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Paula Isler

_ -
From: Paula Isler
Sent: Wednesday, July 09, 2003 4:13 PM
To: Jackie Gilchrist
Subject: FW: Thomas E. Cantrell (TG919)
Jackie -- disregard the e-mail below. I jumped to the wrong conclusion. 1In

reviewing the complete file, I noted the company had requested cancellation of
his certificate previously and that it was the 2003 RAF return that he had
sent back and paid. This will be a voluntary cancellation and I'll be putting
it in your box as I normally do. Sorry for the confusion. In my opinion, I
don't believe there is any need to check up on the possibility of a name
change since he wants to cancel the certificate anyway, but that will be your
call.

----- Original Message-----

From: Paula Isler

Sent: Wednesday, July 09, 2003 4:04 PM
To: Jackie Gilchrist

Subject: Thomas E. Cantrell (TG919)

Hi Jackie. Just wanted to let you know that I'm going to put a copy of a file
on the above company. Mr. Cantrell returned his 2002 RAF return and had
written on the form that the company name was "San Martin Group." There is no
docket pending to change the name from his personal name to San Martin Group
and CCA asked that we contact the company and provide procedures for changing
the name on a payphone certificate. Thanks.



Paulalsler

From: Rnettles@psc.state.fl.us

Sent: Wednesday, July 09, 2003 10:19 AM

To: DFORDHAM@psc.state.fl.us; SHOWARD@psc.state.fl.us;
CCRAIG@psc.state.fl.us; LGIVENS@psc.state.fl.us

Subject: New filing in undocketed matter

DOCUMENT DESCRIPTION = CCA/Fiscal - Payment record from Thomas E. Cantrell
{TG919) for 2003 RAFs;
Deposit D363 dated 7/11/03.

DOCUMENT PATH =
file://L:\PSC\LIBRARY\FILINGS\03\06026-03

Document ID = 06026-03
Document Filed 07/08/03

The filing described above is now available in PDF format, and may also be
available in WordPerfect or other formats.

To access it, click on the DOCUMENT PATH link. This will pop up a Windows
Explorer window. You will see the PDF (Adobe Acrobat) version; you will also
see other versions if they exist. Double-click on the preferred version and
the document will open.

If you need to cut/paste/search in the document and find you can't, try later
when the reformatted version is available. (For more information, see PDF Tips
on the How To menu.)

You can alsoc go to the docket in CMS by triple-clicking on the DOCKET NUMBER,

typing ctrl-C to copy, and using the paste icon to paste the docket number
into the guery line in CMS.

This is an automatically generated e-mail; no response/reply is necessary.



“TO AVOID PENALTY AND INTEREST CHARGES, THE REGULATORY ASSESSMENT FEE RETURN MUST BE FILED ON OR BEFORE 01/30/2004

Pay Telephone Service Provider Regulatory Assessment Fee Return

Florida Pobi RIGINAL,

@

STATUS:
Actual Return

Estimated Return
Amended Return

PERIOD COVERED:
01/01/2003 TO 12/31/2003

S oo avi e Crovp

i

(See Filing Instroctians o Back of Foum)

1) 1“““’!. SR
TG919-03-0-R
Thomas E. Cantrell
10440 San Martin BLVQ.B 63

St. Petersburg, FL 33702-1462

ce. P Tsler

DATE
JUL L1 2003

030000~ P4

Please Complete Below 1f Official Mailing Address Has Changed

[oNdd San Wartie Blud

FORPSCUSEONLY -
¥

{ Check# 4.
A@m 0603002
003001
H . P
S " 0603002
004011
S I
-
Postmark Date 7[.‘7 zdﬁ
Initials of Preparer‘ - @9_ ”

(City/Rlate) *+ -+ "%l (Zip)

(Name of Compatly) {Address)
Dy
LINE e
NO. ACTOUNT CLASSIFICATION Aj\nm TNT .
1. Gross Operating Revenue (Florida) g Feriiue
2, Gross Intrastate Revenue
3. LESS: Amounts Paid to Other Telecommunications Companies* é‘;{;s_- —_— " )
(see "2. Fees" on back) - e '
COM
4, TOTAL REVENUES for Regulatory Assessment Fee Calculation CTR -
(Line 2 less Line 3) ECR
GCL
5. Regulatory Assessment Fee Due — (Multiply Line 4 by 0.0015) Oﬁ;‘m %
. N
6. Penalty for Late Payment (see "3. Failure to File by Due Date” on back) %ﬁﬁ N m' rl\(.
7. Interest for Late Payment (see "3. Failure to File by Due Date"” on back) Hong - eciGh “"’0
8.  TOTAL AMOUNT DUE S 3{ o
AS PROVIDED IN SECTION 364.336 FLORIDA STATUTES, THE MINIMUM ANNUAL FEE IS 550
THIS FORM MUST BE COMPLETED AND RETURNED REGARDLESS OF THE AMOUNT OF REVENUES Rl;l:pn’fjﬂn '
9. Number of pay telephones in operation at close of period covered (t‘)

by this Return

* These amounts must be jntrastate only and must be verifiable.

I, the undersigned owner/officer of the above-named company, have read the forcgoing and declare that 1o the best of my knowledge and belief the above information is a
true and correct statement. 1 am aware that pursuant to Section 837.06, Florida Satutes, whoever knowingly makes a false statement in writing with the intent lo mislead a
public servant in the performance of his official duty shall be gmlly of a misdemeanor of the second degree.

. PR
L'fj;,lm aa Z &j/lp.o‘eu 44,07
(Signature of Company Official) (Title) . (Date),.
Py . - A N
/ / Telephone Number (.5_ -"b Fa Number, 3 s
(Preparér of Form - Please Print Name
F.E.L No.

PSC/CMU-26 (Rev. £1/11/39)

DOCUMINT NUMOTR-OATE
06026 JL-B8

FPSC-CGrit

11SS10N CLERK



. STATE OF FLORIDA
‘COMMISSIONERS:

LiLA A. JABER, CHAIRMAN Division OF CCOMPETITIVE MARKETS &

J. TERRY DEASON ENFORCEMEN'T
BRAULIO L. BAEZ BETHW. SALAK
RUDOLPH “RUDY” BRADLEY DIRECTOR

CHARLES M. DAVIDSON (850)413-6600

JFublic Serfrice Qommission

June 24, 2003

Mr. Thomas E. Cantrell (TG919)
Treasurer San Martin Group
10440 Sap Martin Blvd.

St. Petersburg, FL 33702-1462

Dear Mr. Cantrell:

On June 23", the Commission received your letter dated June 16, 2003, req uestingcancellation
of your pay telephone certificate. Before staff can recommend a voluntary cancellation, acompany
must either pay the current year’s Regulatory Assessment Fee or provide a date certain the fee will
be paid in compliance with our cancellation rule. The 2003 return form is enclosed.

As soon as the return and payment are received, a docket will be established to grant you a
voluntary cancellation. Please use the enclosed blue envelope, which will ensure prompt processing
of your payment. In the meantime, if you have any questions, just let me know. I canbe reached
at (850) 413-6502-voice, (850) 413-6503-fax, by internet e-mail at pisler@psc.state.flus, or at the
address below.

Sincerely,

Pada Q. dplen

Paula J. Isler, Research Assistant
Bureau of Service Quality

Enclosures

CAPITAL CIRCLE OFFICE CENTER ¢ 2540 SHUMARD OAK BOULEVARD ¢ TALLAHASSEE, FL 32399-0850
An Affirmative Action/Equal Opportunity Employer
PSC Website: htip://www.floridapsc.com Internet E-1mail: contaci@psc.state.fl.us




0 AVOID PENALTY AND INTEREST CHARGES, THE REGULATORY ASSESSMENT FEE RETURN MUST BE FILED ON OR BEFORE 01/30/2004

Pay Telephone Service Provider Regulatory Assessment Fee Return

Florida Public Service Commission FORPSC USE ONLY
STATUS: (See Filing Instructions on Back of Form) Checlt
Actual Return TG919-03-0-R 3 0603002
i?;ﬁ:ﬁ RR::;':: Thomas E. Cantrell $ p !
10440 San Martin BLvd. Oggig(l’f
St. Petersburg, FL 33702-1462 s 1
PERIOD COVERED:
01/01/2003 TO 12/31/2003 . Postmark Date
Q C . P . I.S ) er Initials of Preparer
Please Complete Below 1f Official Mailing Address Has Changed .
{Name of Company) (Address) (City/State) — (Zip)
INE
NO.* . ACCOUNT CLASSIFICATION __ANMOUNT
1. Gross Operating Revenue (Florida) $ ‘
2. Gross Intrastate Revenue
3. LESS: Amounts Paid to Other Telecommunications Companies* ( )
(see "2. Fees" on back)
4. TOTAL REVENUES for Regulatory Assessment Fee Calculation $
(Line 2 less Line 3)
5. Regulatory Assessment Fee Due — (Multiply Line 4 by 0.0015)
6. Penalty for Late Payment (see "3. Failure to File by Due Date" on back)
7. Interest for Late Payment (see "3. Failure to File by Due Date" on back)
8. TOTAL AMOUNT DUE $
AS PROVIDED IN SECTION 364.336 FLORIDA STATUTES, THE MINIMUM ANNUAL FEE IS §50
THIS FORM MUST BE COMPLETED AND RETURNED REGARDLESS OF THE AMOUNT OF REVENUES REPORTED
9. Number of pay telephones in operation at close of period covered

by this Return

‘These amounts must be intrastate onty and must be verifiable.

1, the undersigned owner/officer of the above-named company, have read the foregoing and declare that to the best of my knowledge and belief the above information is a
-ue and correct statement. | am aware that pursuant to Section 837.06, Florida Statutes, whoever knowingly makes a false statement in writing with the intent to mislead a
ublic servant in the performance of his official duty shall be guilty of a misdemeanor of the second degree.

(Signature of Company Cfficial) (Title)

Telephone Number ( )

(Date)

Fax Number ( )

(Preparer of Form - Please Print Name)

F.E.I. No




Della Fordham

From: Rnettles@psc.state.fl.us

Sent: Monday, June 23, 2003 4:22 PM

To: DFORDHAM@psc.state.fl.us; SHOWARD@psc.state.fl.us; CCRAIG@psc.state.fl.us;
LGIVENS @psc.state.fl.us

Subject: New filing in undocketed matter

DOCUMENT DESCRIPTION = Thomas Cantrell - Letter dated 6/16/03 of cancellation for
certificate issued.
[CCA note: Advice requested from CMP/Isler on cancellation request.)

DOCUMENT PATH =
file://L:\PSC\LIBRARY\FILINGS\03\05564-03

Document ID = 05564-03
Document Filed 06/23/03

The filing described above is now available in PDF format, and may also be available in
WordPerfect or other formats.

To access it, c¢lick on the DOCUMENT PATH link. This will pop up a Windows Explorer window.
You will see the PDF {Adope Acrobat) version; you will also see other versions if they
exist. Double-click on the preferred version and the document will open.

If you need to cut/paste/search in the document and find you can't, try later when the
reformatted version is available. (For more information, see PDF Tips on the How To menu.)}

You can also go to the docket in CMS by triple-clicking on the DOCKET NUMBER, typing ctrl-
C to copy, and using the paste icon to paste the docket number into the query line in CMS.

This is an automatically generated e-mail; no response/reply is necessary.
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TO: CLERK OF PUBLIC SERVICE COMM.
CAPITAL CIRCLE OFFICE CENTER
2540 SHUMARD OAK BLVD.

TALLAHASSEE, FL 32399-0850

1

eV
THOMAS E. CANTRELL 02 S 5
TREASURER SAN MARTDR! GROUP =z F
10440 SAN MARTIN BLVD. 2 e o

ST. PETERSBURG, FL 33702-1462

THIS IS A LETTER OF CANCELLATION FOR THE CERTIFICATE
THAT WAS ISSUED TO ME FOR THE EXPRESS USE OF INSTALLING
AND OPERATING A PAYPHONE IN OUR GROUPS BUILDING TO
OFFSET THE COST OF A PAYPHONE. IT HAS BEEN PROVEN TO BE
FAR MORE COSTLY THAN ORIGINALLY THOUGHT AND OUR
GROUP CANNOT SUPPORT THE COST AT THIS TIME. THANK YOU

AND YOUR OFFICE FOR ALL THE HELP THAT YOU HAVE GIVEN ME
TO OBTAIN THE CERTIFICATE.

SINCERELY

THOMAS E. CANTRELL
AUS TREASURER SAN MARTIN GROUP
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Ruth Nettleg **** ¥ Official Filing 6/23/2003 11:49 AM

Ruth Nettles
To: Paula Isler
Subject: RE: TG919

No mention of any payments. I'li place in undocketed.for now.

————— Original Message-----

From: Paula Isler

Sent: Monday, June 23, 2003 10:19 AM
To: Ruth Nettles

Subject: RE: TG919

Did he include payment for the 2003 RAF or state when it would be paid? If not, do not
open a docket. If yes, you can open a docket.

————— Original Mesgane--—--

From: Ruth Nettles

Sent: Monday, June 23, 2003 10:05 AM
To: Paula Isler

Subject: TG91%

Good morning.

I have a letter from Mr. Cantrell requesting cancellation of certiifcate. Can we open a
cancellation docket. FYI, no payment was included.



