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9/8/2003 

PSC 
2540 Shumard Oaks Blvd 
Tallahassee, FL 32399 

Dear Sirs, 

PanAmerican Telecom has been dissolved by the state of Florida and we would like to 
request that our ALECKLEC certificate be cancelled. 

Please refer to the enclosed corporate dissolution and ALEC certificate. 

Thank. you, 

PanAmerican Telecom 

3741 N.E. 163d Street #276 
N. Miami Beach, Fl 331604104 

www. panamericanws 





CR2EQ22 (2-03) 

Given under my hand and the 
Great Seal of the State of Florida 

at Tallahassee, the Capitol, this the 
Sevmtb day of August, 2003 
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authorize them indlvidual3y t o  prcv:,de ALEC services throughout the 
S,tate cf Florida. 

WTX"S NAME 

Intertoll Communications Network 
Corporation 

CERTIFICATE NO b 

8075 

Pan American Teiecom, 1nccrporat:ed 8076 
, . . . ~ _ _ _  . ..-.--. 

If this Order becomes final and e f fec t ive ,  it will serve as 
each entity's certificate. Each e n t i t y  should,  t he re fme ,  r e t a i n  
this Order as procf of c e r t i f i c a t i o n .  We are  vested with 
jurisdiction on this matter pursuant to Sections 364,. 335 and 
364.337, Florida Statutes. 

FLEC providers are subjec t  to Chapter 25-24, F l o r i d a  
Administrative Code, Part XV, Rules Governing Telecomunica t ions  
Service Provided by Alternative Local Exchange Companies ALEC 
providers are a l s o  required t:o comply with a l l  applicable 
provisions of Chapter 364, F l o r i d a  Statutes, and Chapter 25-4, 
Florida Administrative Code. . ,  

Pursuant to Section 3 6 4  - 3 3 7  (21, Florida S t a t u t e s ,  basic 
teleccm~nunications service provided by an ALEC "... must include 
access to operator  services, ''911"' services, and r e l a y  services €cr 
the hearing impaired," Further, Section 364.337(2), requires t h a t  
an ALEC's '911" service "... sha l l  be provided at a level 
equivalent to t h a t  providc:d by the local exchange 
telecommunications conpany serving t he  same area .'I 

In additioa, under  S e c t i o r  364.336, Florida S t a t u t e s ,  
certificate holders must pay a mir i i raum annual Regulatory Assessment 
Fee (RAFs) of $50 if the certificate was active during any portion 
of the calendar year .  A RAFs Return  notice will be mailed each 
December to each of. the  entitier listed above for payment by 
January 30th. Neither the c a n c e l l a t i o n  of its certificate nor the 
failure t o  receive a RkFs Retu rn  nGtice shall relieve any o f  these 
entities from its obligation to pay RAFs. 

- .. -. 

Based on the foregoing, it is 

ORDERED by the Flo r ida  PE:=:lic Service Commission that we 
hereby grar,t,  to the entities listed herein, certi-ficates to 
provide Alternative Local Exchange Telecommunications services, 



Ruth Nettles ************ Official Filing 911 112003 1053 AM 

Ruth Nettles 

To: 
cc: 
Subject: 

Paula lsler 
Jackie Gilchrist 
RE: TJ6411TX646 

Thanks, Paula. I see no mention of payment, and I'll f a x  you a copy of the filing in a few 
minutes. Thanks.again. 

----- Original Message----- 
From: Paula Isler 
Sent: Thursday, September 11, 2003 10:52 AM 
To: Ruth Nettles 
C c :  Jackie Gilchrist 
Subject: RE: TJ641/TX646 

They owe 2003 RAFs on b o t h .  Did they mention payment? If n o t ,  do not open a docket .  
Either f a x  o r  provide me t h e  document number. Thanks! 

----- Original Message----- 
From: Ruth Nettles 
Sent: Thursday, September 11, 2003 1 0 : 3 9  AM 
To: Jackie Gilchrist 
Cc: Paula Isler 
Subject: TJ641/TX646 
Importance: High 

Good morning. I have a request from Pan American Telecom f o r  cancellation of certificates. 
Please  let me know how to proceed. Attached to letter is Articles of Corporate  
Dissolution. I'll await your response,  and w i l l  place it in undocketed until I hear from 
you. 

Thank you. 

Ruth 
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