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REQUEST TO ESTABLISH DOCKET 

(please Type) 

Date IOcotber 28, 2003 Docket No. I 
1. Division Name/Staff Name: I Competitive Markets & Enforcement/McCoy 

2. OPR: McCoy h7 
3. OCR: Legal 

'-" c... 
4. Suggested Docket Title: I Request for Cancellation of Pay Telephone Certificate No. 4947 

Eric J. Blake d/b/a ACI Communications, effective 9/25/03. 

5. Suggested Docket Mailing List (attach separate sheet if necessary) 

A. Provide NAMES OR ACRONYMS ONLY if a regulated company. 

B. Provide COMPLETE NAME AND ADDRESS for all others. (Match representatives to companies.) 

1. Parties and their representatives (if any): 

2. Interested persons and their representatives (if any): 

6. Check one: 

Yes Documentation is attached. 

Documentation will be provided with recommendation. 

PSC\CCAOI0-C (Rev 02/02) 
-

- ;­~ C" ~ L~' :- I I ­

T o 

FPsc -cm": ~ ,j3 10 CLCh ' 



Eric J. B l a k e  d / b / a  

COMPANY NAME: ACI Communications CO. CODE: - T F 8 4 7  

COMPANY L I A I S O N :  Same, Owner 

DOCKET NO.: CERTIFICATE NO. : 4947 EFFECTIVE:  10/15/96.  

RAF RETURN NOTICE:  

DELINQUENT NOTICE:  

OTHER RETURNED MAIL: 

CCA'S RETURNED MAIL: 

YEAR ( s )  

YEAR(s) 

RAFs NOT PAID: 2003 

PENALTIES & INTEREST NOT PAID: 2001 

Amount Year Paid 
REVENUEWYEAR: 

DATE LOTUS CHECKED FOR PAYMENT: 

O T m R  INFORMATION 

0 9 / 2 5 / 0 3  - From companv - L e t t e r  r e q u e s t i n q  cancellation. 

1 0 / 0 2 / 0 3  - Wrote comDany ( faxed)  and advised it needed t o  Dav $3.00 P&I from 

1 1  
I, 

L !  



3R0 GI NAL 

Eric Blake 
ACI Communications 
4298 River B k h  Dr. 
Spring Hill Fl. 3461 1 

i13 SEP 25 AH 9: 40 

Florida Public Service Commission, 
Div. Commission Clerk 
Administration Services 

To whom it may concern, 

I would like to cancel my certificate ## 4947 for payphones. If you need any 
M e r  idormation please contact me. 

Thank You .1 &W-- Eric Blake 

352-597-8284 
9%52/3 



Ruth Nettles ************ Official Filing 9f2512003 10:30 AM 

Ruth Nettles I 

To: 
Subject: 

Paula Isler 
R E  ACI CommunicationslErTc Blake 

Okay. No payment was received, The phone listed on-the request is 352-597-8284. It will 
be place in undocketed f i l i n g s .  Thank you f o r  your he lp .  

----- Orig ina l  Message----- 
From: Paula Isler 
Sent: Thursday, September 25, 2003 10:30 AM - 
.To: Ruth Nettles 
Subject: RE: ACI Comunica t ions /Er i c  Blake  

If he sent in $53 with h i s  request. Otherwise, no. Send to me and I'll write him. 
Thanks. 

----- Original  Message----- 
From: Ruth Nettles 
Sent: Thursday, September 25, 2003 10:28 AM 
To: Paula Isler 
Subject :  A C I  Communications/Eric B l a k e  
Importance: High  

Good morning. I have a request to cancel Cert No. 4947. Is it okay to open a docket? 

1 



Company Code: 
Complete Name: 
Mailing Name: 
Certificate No@): 
Status: 
Regulation Date: 

Title: 
Mailing Address: 

BCeg;Eaison #I: 

Physical Location: 

Phone: 
Fm: 

Related Dockets: 

MCD Company Information for TF847 

Printed on 10/02/2003 at-O8:43:46 by PJI 

TF847 
Eric J. Blake d/b/a ACI Communications 
ACI Communications 
4947 
Active 
10/15/1996 
No 
Eric J. Blake 
Owner 
P. 0. Box 6136 

S rin Hill, FL 3461 1-6136 
4398 k ver Birch Drive 

Hill, FL 34607-25 13 

960908-TC Application for certificate to provide gay telephone service by 
Eric J. Blake d/b/a ACI Communications. 



Eric J Blake 
ACI Communications TF847 
4298 River Birch Dr. 
Spring Hill FI. 34607 

Florida Public Service Commission 
2540 Shumard Oak Blvd. 
Tallahassee F1. 32399-0850 

10/11/2003 

To Whom It May Concern: 

Please accept my 2003 regulatory assessment return and fee payment. Enclosed is the $50 
fee and three doIlars for the 2001 past due penalty and interest. Please notify me if there 
is anything else you need. 

Thank You 

Eric Blake 



COMPANY IDENTIFICATION 
Printed on 10/27/2003 at 15:44:57 by TJM 

Complete Name: Eric J. Blake d/b/a ACI Communications 

Mailing Name: ACI C o m m u n i c a t i o n s  

Company Code: TF847 FEID Number: - 

COMPANY INFORMATION 

Address Line 1:4298 River Birch D r i v e  

Address Line 2 :  

C i t y :  Spring Hill State: FL Z i p  Code: 34607-2513 
R e g .  Date: 10/15/1996 Inactive Date: 
Transfered To: 
Trans. From: 
Certificate 1: 4947 Certificate 2: 
Corporate Type: 

Service 1: PAT - Pay Telephone 
Service 2: 
Service 3: 
Service 4: 
Class (WAW): 
Phone Count: 3 
County 1: 
county 3: 
B a n k r u p t c y :  NO 

County 2 :  

County 4 :  

I 



COMPANY IDENTIFICATION 
Printed on 10/27/2003 at 15:44:52 by TJM 

Complete Name:  Eric 3. Blake d/b/a ACI Communications 

Mailing Name:  ACI Communications 
Company Code: TF847 FEID Number: - 

MAILING INFORMATION 

Attention: 
Address Line l : P .  0. Box 6136 
Address Line 2: 
city : Spring Hill State: FL Z i p  Code: 34611-6136 
E-mail Address: 
Web Address: 

Liaison 1 : E r i c  J. Blake  
Title: Owner 
Phone : (352) 597-8284 
E-mail: 

Liaison 2: 
Title: 
Phone : 
E-mail: 

F a x  1: (352) 597-5495 Fax 2: 

County : 

1 



COMPANY IDENTIFICATION 
Printed on 10/27/2003 at 15:47:18 by TJM 

A s s e s s m e n t  

RAF 

Penalty 

Interest 

Extension F e e  

Total 

Complete Name: Eric J. Blake d/b/a ACI Communications 

D u e  Paid Owe 

$50.00 $50 .00  $0.00 

$0.00 $0.00 $0.00 

$0.00 $0.00 $0.00 

$0.00 $0.00 $0.00 

$50.00 $50.00 $0.00 

Mailing Name: ACI Cormnunications 
Company Code: TF847 FEID Number: - 

RAE'ACCOUNT FOR THE PERIOD 01/01/2003 THROUGH 12/31/2003 

Reg. Date: 10/15/1996 Inact ive  Date : 
Service : PAT - Pay Telephone 
Received: A c t u a l  RAF Form 
Status: - S a t i s f i e d  
Amended: NO Extension : 
Frozen: No Comments : 

No 
No 

Payment Count: f Payment Made t o  D a t e  

RAF Rate: 0 .0015 Net RAF Due: $50.00 
Operating Rev: $518.61 In ters ta te  Rev: $ 0 . 0 0  

1 
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TRBNSMISSION VERIFICATION REPOPT 

TIME : 18c82/2003 65:85 
NAME : P5C 
FAX : 4127077 
TEL : 4137077 

I -1 



STATE OF FLORIDA 
COMMISSIONERS: 
LILA A. JABER, CHAIRMAN 
J .  TERRY DEASON 
BRAULIO L. BAEZ 
RUDOLPH ‘‘RUDY” BRADLEY 
CHARLES M. DAVIDSON 

DIVISION OF COMPETITIVE MARKETS & 
ENFORCEMENT 
BETH W. Sam 
DIRECTOR 
(850) 4 13-6600 

October 2,2003 

Mr. Eric J. Blake 
ACI Communications (TF847) 
4298 River Birch Drive 
Spring Hill, FL 34607-25 13 

Dear Mr. Blake: 

On September 25,2003, the Commission received your letter requesting cancellation of your 
pay telephone certificate. Before staff can recommend a voluntary cancellation, all Regulatory 
Assessment Fees, including statutory penalty and interest charges, must be paid. 

In this case, ACI Communications has a $3.00 past due penalty and interest balance for late 
payment of the 200 1 Regulatory Assessment Fee. ACI also owes the 2003 Regulatory Assessment 
Fee. Copies of the 2003 Regulatory Assessment Fee return form and a breakdown of the 2001 
balance are attached. Once the form and payment of $53.00 is received, a docket will be established 
to grant you a voluntary cancellation. 

Please let me know if you have any questions. 

Sincerely, 

Paula J. Isler, Research Assistant 
Bureau of Service Quality 

Enclosures 

CAPITAL CIRCLE OFFICE CENTER 2540 SHUMARD OAK BOULEVARD TALLAHASSEE, FL 32399-0850 
An Afiirmative ActioalEqual Opportunity Employer 

PSC Website: htlp:l/www.llnridapsc.com Internet E-mail: contact@psc.state.fl.us 



10  VOID PEN:',LTY AN3 INTEREST CHARGES. THE REGULATORY ASSESSMENT FEE RETURN MUST BE FILED ON OR BEFORE 01/30/2004 

Pay Telephone Service Provider Regulatory Assessment Fee Return 

STATUS: 

Actual Return 
Estimated Return 
Amended Return 

PERIOD COVERED: 
0 1 /O I /2003 TO I2/3 1 /2003 

Florida Public Service Commission 
(See Filing Instructions on l ack  of Form) 

TF847-03-0-R 
ACI Communications 
P. 0. Box 6136 
Spring Hill, FL 346 1 1-6 136 

Please Complete Below If Official Mailing Address Has Changed 

FOR PSC USE ONLY 
Check# 

$ .  0603002 
003001 

$ P 
0603002 
00401 1 

Postmark Date 
Initials of Preparer- - 

(Name 6f Company) (Address) (C ity/State) (Zip) 

LINE 
NO. 

1. 

2. 

3. 

4. 

5 .  

6. 

7. 

8. 

9. 

ACCOUNT CLASSIFICATION AMOUNT 

Gross Operating Revenue (Florida) $ 

Gross Intrastate Revenue 

LESS: Amounts Paid to Other Telecommunications Companies* 
(see "2. Fees" on back) 

TOTAL REVENUES for Regulatory Assessment Fee Calculation 
(Line 2 less Line 3) 

Regulatory Assessment Fee Due - (Multiply Line 4 by 0.001 5) 

Penalty for Late Payment (see "3. Failure to File by Due Date" on back) 

Interest for Late Payment (see "3. Failure to File by Due Date" on back) 

TOTAL AMOUNT DUE $ 

AS PROVIDED IN SECTION 364.336 FLORIDA STATUTES, THE MINIMUM ANNUAL FEE IS $50 

THIS FORM MUST BE COMPLETED AND RETURNED REGARDLESS OF THE AMOUNT OF REVENUES REPORTED 

Number of pay telephones in operation at close of period covered 
by this Return 

* These amounts must be intrastate only and must be verifiable. 

I, the undersigned owner/officer of the above-named company, have read the foregoing and declare that to the best of my knowledge and belief the above information is a 
true and correct statement. I am aware that pursuant to Section 837.06, Florida Statutes, whoever knowingly makes a false statement in writing with the intent to mislead a 
public servant in the performance of his official duty shall be guilty of a misdemeanor of the second degree. 

(Signature of Company Official) (Title) (Date) 

Telephone Number 1 ) FaxNumber! ) 

F.E.I. No. 
(Preparer of Form - Please Print Name) 

PSUCMU-26 (RCV 1111 1/99) 



COMPANY IDENTIFICATION 
Printed on 10/02/2003 at 08:51:38 by P J I  

Assessment 

Complete Name: E r i c  J. Blake d/b/a ACI  Coxuurunications 

Due P a i d  Owe 
1 

Mailing Name: ACI Communications 
Company Code: TF847 FEID Number: - 

T o t a l  $53.00 $50.00 I 

RAF ACCOUNT FOR THE PERIOD Q1/01/2001 THROUGH 12/31/2001 

$3.00 

Reg. Date: 
Service: 
Received: 
status : 

Amended: , 

Frozen: 
Payment Count: 
Operating Rev: 
RAF Rate: 

10/15/1996 
PAT - Pay Telephone 
Actual RAF Form 
Pending 
NO 
No 
1 Payment Made to Date 

$1,098.17 
0.0015 

Inactive D a t e :  

Extension: No 
Comments : No 

Interstate Rev: 
N e t  RAF Due: 

$ 0 . 0 0  

$SO. 00 

$50.00 I $50.00 I $0.00  I 
1 Penalty $2.50 I $0 007- $2.50 I 
1 Interest $0.50  I $0.00 I $0.50 I 
I Extension Fee I $0 .00  I $0.00 I $0.00 

Period covered: 01/01/2001 through 12/31/2001 RAF rate: 0.0015 

Documents: Actual RAF form rece ived  on 02/01/2002 

Check Amount Postmarked Trans Date Date Posted-By Dep # Check #I 
02/01/2002 02/08/2002 02/11/2002-JIK HH172 6102 $SO. 00 

Operating rev: $1,098.17 Gross intrastate rev: $0.00 

RAF form mailed on 12/06/2001 

RAF paid HH172 $ 5 0 . 0 0  

1 



Della Fordham 

From: 
Sent: 
To: 

Subject: 

Rnettles@pscstate.fl. us 
Thursday, September 25,2003 12:47 PM 
SHOWARD@psc.state.fl.us; DFORDHAM@psc.state.fl.us; CCRAIG@psc.,state.fl.us; 
LGtVENS@psc.state.fl.us 
New filing in undocketed matter 

DOCUMENT DESCRIPTION = ACI Communications (Blake) - Letter dated 9/22/03 requesting 
cancellation of 
PATS Certificate No. 4947. [CCA note: Advice requested from CMP/Isler.] 

DOCUMENT PATH = 
file://L:\PSC\LI3FWRY\FILINGS\O3\0918O-03 

Document ID = 09180-03 
Document Filed 09/25/03 

The filing described above is now available in PDF format, and may also be available in 
Wordperfect or other formats. 

To access it, c l i c k  on the DOCUMENT PATH link. This will pop up a Windows Explorer window. 
You will see the PDF (Adobe Acrobat) version; you will also see other versions if they 
exist. Double-click on the preferred version and the document will open. 

If you need to cut/paste/search in the document and find you can't, try later when the 
reformatted version is available. (For more information, see PDF Tips on the How To menu.) 

You can also go to the docket in CMS by triple-clicking on the DOCKET NUM3ER, typing ctrl- 
C to copy, and using the paste icon to paste the docket number into the query line in CMS. 

This is an automatically generated e-mail; no response/reply is necessary. 

1 




