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Raquel Tully

From: Paula Isler

Sent: Wednesday, April 27, 2005 10:43 AM
To: Raquel Tully

Subject: RE:

The settlement payment should be deposited in the General Revenue Fund as defined in PAA Order PSC-05-
0103-PAA-TI, issued in Docket No. 040062-T1.

From: Raquel Tully

Sent: Wednesday, April 27, 2005 10:38 AM
To: Paula Isler

Subject:

I just received a check for $5000.00 from New Century Telecom, on the check they have written Settlement. How
should this be deposited.

Thanks for your help
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Raquel Tully

From: Paulalsler
Sent: Thursday, April 28, 2005 8:27 AM

To: Raquel Tully
Subject: RE:
Yes

From: Raquel Tully

Sent: Thursday, April 28, 2005 8:27 AM
To: Paula Isler

Subject:

| received another check from New century for $5000.00, is this also all going to fines?
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