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(Please Type) 

8/3/2005 Docket No.: 04 052b - T I  
1. Division Name/Staff Name: Division Of Competitive Markets & EnforcemenUlsler 

2. OPR: 

3. OCR: 

5. Suggested Docket Mailing List (attach separate sheet if necessary) 

A. 

B. 

Provide NAMES OR ACRONYMS ONLY if a regulated company. 

Provide COMPLETE NAME AND ADDRESS for all others. (Match representatives to  companies.) 

Division Of Competitive Markets & Enforcement 

Office Of The General Counsel 

1. Parties and their representatives (if any): 

4. Suggested Docket Title: 

2. interested persons and their representatives (if any): 

Acknowledgment of cancellation of IXC Registration No. TJ230 by Radiant Telecom, Inc., 

5. Check one: 

Documentation is attached. 

Documentation wil l be provided with recommendation. 
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Paula lsler 

From: Paula lsler 

Sent: 

To : 'JCruzBustillo@aol.com' 

cc: 
Subject: RE: Netel and Radiant Telecom cancellation of IXC certificates 

Tuesday, August 02,2005 4:49 PM 

PTurner@ n tera hold ings .corn 

Dear Ms. Cruz-Bustillo: 

Yes, I received the letters and will open a docket to cancel NETEL, Inc.'s IXC certificate (TJ721) and Radiant 
Telecom, Inc.'s IXC certificate (TJ230). 

In addition, I've received the letter from Mr. Turner requesting cancellation of NTERA's CLEC certificate (TX579). 
However, payment of the past due CLEC balance ($12.50) was not received. Also, we did not receive NTERA's 
payment of the $7.00 IXC balance nor the IXC's 2004 RAF plus late payment charges. The docket for NTERA 
will not be opened at this time until payment is received. 

Let me know if you have any questions 

Paula lsler 
Florida Public Service Commission 
2540 Shumard Oak Blvd. 
Tallahassee, FL 32399-0850 
(850) 413-6502-Phone 
(850) 413-6503-Fax 
Plsler@psc.state fl.us 

From: JCruzBustillo@aol.com [mailto:JCruzBustillo@aol.com] 
Sent: Tuesday, August 02, 2005 4:22 PM 
To: Paula Isler 
Cc: PTurner@nteraholdings.com 
Subject: Netel and Radiant Telecom cancellation of I X C  certificates 

Paula, 

In following up with the cancellation of the above referenced entities certificate with the Florida PSC, please 
confirm if you have received the original signed letters requesting the cancellation of their IXC certificates. 

Furthermore, should you require any additional information please let me know. You can reach me at 305-467- 
551 9. 

Sincerely, 
Jacqueline Cruz- Bus t ill0 

8/2/2005 



July 28, 2005 

PUBLIC SERVICE COMMISSION 
Ms. Paula lsler 
2540 Shumard Oak Boulevard 
Tallahassee, Florida 32399-0850 

Ref: Radiant Telecom, Inc. 
TJ230 

Dear Ms. Mer: 

As Radiant Telecom, Inc. is winding down, please cancel its IXC certificate with 
the Florida Public Service Commission. In addition, we have already remitted the 
2004 and 2005 regulatory assessment fee returns with payments as required to 
cancel the certificate. 

Should you have any additional questions please feel free to contact Jacqueline 
Cruz-Bustillo at 305-467-5519. 

Sin cere I y , 

'P res id e n t 

1020 NM' 1 GrC Drive Miami, FL. 33 169 



Paula lsler 

From: 
Sent: 
To: 
Subject: 

Paula isler 
Thursday, July 28, 2005 8:28 AM 
'JCruzBustillo@aol.com' 
Radiant Telecom, Inc. - TJ230 

Good morning again. 

I just came across this one also where we received payment of the 2004 and 2005 Regulatory 
Assessment Fees but again, there was no letter enclosed requesting cancellation. 1'11 
open a docket as soon as a letter requesting cancellation is received. Thanks for a l l  
your help. 

Paula Isler 
Florida Public Service Commission 
2540 Shumard Oak Blvd. 
Tallahassee, FL 32399-0850 
( 85 0 ) 4 1 3  - 65  02 -Phone 
( 850) 4 13 - 65 0 3  -Fax 
PIsler@psc.state.fl.us 

1 



COMPANY IDENTI FI CAT1 ON 
Printed cn 07/27/2005 at 14:22:55 by P J I  

Assessment 

RAF 

Penalty 

Interest 

Extension Fee 

Total 

Complete N m e :  Radiant Telecom, Inc. 

Due Paid Owe 

$50 .00  $50.00 $0.00 

$0.00 $0 .00  $0.00 

$0.00 $0.00 $0.00 

$0.00 $0.00 $0.00 

$50.00 $50.00 $0.00 

Mailing Name: Radiant Telecom, Inc. 
Compsny Code: TJ230 FEID Number: 65-0798535 

RAF ACCOUNT FOR T H E  P E R I O D  0 1 / 0 1 / 2 0 0 5  THROUGH 1 2 / 3 1 / 2 0 0 5  

Reg. Date: 
Service : 
Received: 
Status : 
Amended : 
Frozen: 
Payment Count: 
Operating Rev: 
RAF Rate: 

05/26/1995 Inactive Date: 
IXC - Interexchange Telephone 
Actual RAF Form 

Satisfied 

No Extension: No 
No Comments : Yes 
1 Payment Made to Date 

$0.00 Interstate Rev: $0.00 

0.0020 Net RAF Due: $50.00 

1 I I I I 

Last modification was made on Tuesday, June 2S, 2005 at 9:25 AM by David Brown 

FL2DI?iNT TELECOM, INC. ( I I J Z 3 C :  

induct ry: Telecommunications, Service provided: IXC 
Company type: Interexchanoe Telephone Companies 
Eeguiation date: 05/26/1595, Inactive date: 
Certificate number: N/A. County: 
Company liaison: Kenneth Jacobi, Vice President, Regulatory Affairs 
Maiiing address: Location address: 
1020 N.W. 163rd Drive 1020 N.W. 163rd Drive 
Niami, FL 33165-5816 Miami, FL 33160-5818 
E-meii address: KenJ@Radiantteiecom.com 
K &  site: http://www.radiaritteiecom.com 
Phone number: ( 3 0 5 )  914-3364 
 ax number: (954) 453-3435 
Period covered: 0 1 / 0 1 / 2 0 0 5  throilgh 12/31/2005 
Operating rev: SO.00 Interstate rev: 
Documents: Actual IUiF form received on 06/24/2005 
Postmarked Trans Date Date Posted-Ey Dep g Check g 

!?6!24/2005 06/28/2005 06/28/2005-DBR KL567 573 

RriF paid KL567 

RAF rate: 0.0020 
$0.00 

Check Amount 
$50.00 

$50.00 

1 



COMPANY IDENTIFICATION 
Printed on 07/27/2005 at 14:23:36 by FJI 

Complete Name: Radiant Telecom, Inc. 

Mailing Name: Radiant Telecom, Inc. 
Company Code: TJ230 FEID Number: 65-0798535 

RAF ACCOUNT FOR THE PERIOD 01/01/2004 THROUGH 12/31/2004 

Reg. Date: 
Service: 
Received : 
Status : 
Amended : 
Frozen: 
Payment Count: 
Operating Rev: 
RAF Rate: 

05/26/1999 Inactive Date: 
IXC - Interexchange Telephone 
Actual RAF Form 
Pending 
No 
No 
1 Payment Made to Date 

$0.00 
0.0015 

Extension: 
Comen t s : 

No 
Yes 

Interstate Rev: 
Net RAF Due: 

$ 0 . 0 0  

$ 5 0 . 0 0  

RADIANT TELECOM, INC. (TJ230) 
Industry: Telecommunications, Service provided: IXC 
Company type: Interexchange Telephone Companies 
Regulation date: 05/26/1999, Inactive date: 
Certificate number: Nlk ,  County: 
Company liaison: Kenneth Jacobi, Vice President, Regulatory Affairs 
Mailing address: Location address: 
1020 N.W. 163rd Drive 1020 N.W. 163rd Drive 
Miami, FL 33169-5818 Miami, FL 33169-5818 
E-mail address: KenJORadianttelecom.com 
Web site: http://www.radianttelecom.com 
Phone number: (305) 914-3364 
Fax number: (954) 453-3435 
Period covered: 01/01/2004 through 12/31/2004 
Operating rev: $ 0 . 0 0  Interstate rev: 
Documents: Actual RW form received on 06/24/2005 

Delinquent letter mailed on 02/16/2005 
RAF form mailed on 12/01/2004 

Postmarked Trans Date Date Posted-By Dep # Check 8 
06/24/2005 06/28/2005 06/28/2005-DBR KL567 556 

RAF paic KL565 
penalty p s i d  KL567 
Interest paic KL56 7 

PAF rate: 0.0015 
$ 0 . 0 0  

Check Amount 
$6;. 0 6  

$5C . 0 C  

$iC 0C 

$ 2 .  oc 



Paula lsler 

From: 
Sent: 
To: 
Subject: 

Attachments: 

Paula lsler 
Thursday, June 02,2005 423  PM 
'jcruzbustillo@aol.com' 
RAF Form 

RAF-TJ230-05-0-R.pdf 

RAF-TJ230-05- 
0-R.pdf (28 KB) 

This e-mail w a s  sent from The Florida Public Service Commission's Regulatory 
Assessment Fee (RAF) System. 

Attached document type: Adobe Portable Document Format (PDF) 



TO ACOID PEkfi-1 4\D lh l  tREST Crl4RCES T H E  REGLLSTOR‘ ASSESq\IE\T FEE RETERN MUST BE FILED ON OR BEFORE 01 3U ?OOC 

Interexchange Company Regulatory Assessment Fee Return 

STATUS: 
Actual Returz 
Estimated Return 
Amended Returr. 

- 

PERIOD COVERED: 
01/01/2005 TO 12/31/2005 

Florida Public Service Commission 
ISrr Filinr In~trutrions un Bark uf Furm; 

TJ230-05-0-R 
Radiant Telecom, Inc. 
1020 N.W. 163rd Drive 
Miami, FL 33 169-581 8 

I I 
Please Complete Below I f  Official Mailing Address Has Changed 

Check f 

06-03-001 
00300 1 

s P 

s 1 

06-03-00 1 
00401 1 

Postmark Datc 
Initials of Prcparcr 

(Namc of Company) ( Addrcss) (City/Statc) (Zip) 
-~ 

LINE 
NO. ACCOUNT CLASSIFICATION 

1 .  Long Distancc Services 
2. Acccss Scrviccs 
3. Private Linc Scrviccs 
4. 
5. Misccllancous Scrviccs 

6. TOTAL Telephone Services 

7. 

8. 

Lcascd Facilities & Circuits Services 

LESS: Amounts Paid to Tclccommunications Companics”’ 

TOTAL REVENUES For Regulatory Asscssmcnt FCC Calculation 

9. 
IO. 
1 I .  
12. 

13. 

Rcgulatory Asscssmcnt Fee Due (Multiply Linc 8 by 0.0020) 
Penalty for Latc Payment (see “3. Failure to Filc by Duc Datc” on back) 
lntcrcst for Latc Payment (see “3. Failure to Filc by Duc Datc” on back) 
Extcnsion Pay icn t  Fee (scc “4. Extension” on back) 

TOTAL AMOUNT DUE (SSO MINIMUM) 

FLORIDA GROSS 
OPERATING REVENUE INTRASTATE REVENUE 

s $ 

s s 

( I (  1 
$ 

12) s 

( I )  Thcsc amounts must bc intrastate onlv and must bc vcnfiablc (sec “2. Fccs” on back) 
(2) Rcgardlcss of thc gross opcrating rcvcnuc of a company, a minimum annual replatory assessment fce of $50 shall be imposed as providcd in 

Section 364 336. Flonda Statutes 

CURRENT COMPANY STATUS 

( ) Facilitics-Bascd Canicr ( ) Rcscllcr ( ) Call Aggrcgator 
( ) Alternate-Operator Scrvicc ( ) Rcbillcr ( ) Othcr: 

BILLING INFORMATION 

Complctc bclow if billing agent is othcr than yourself. 
0 

(N aiur 1 (Address: CitylStatelZip) (Telephonc) 
What is the total amount of customcr deposits collected? What is thc total amount ofbond hcld (if applicable)? 

Amount: S for 20 Amount: S Expircs: 

COMPANY INFORMATION 

Do you lcase tcl~cornmunications‘ facilitics? ( ) YES ( ) NO 
If YES, who do you lcasc thcsc facilities from? Namc: 

Addrcss: 
~ ~~ 

I, the undcrsigncd owncriofficcr Of the abovc-namcd company, havc read the foregoing and declarc that to the bcst of my knowlcdgc and belief thc abovc 
information is a truc and corrcct statemcnt. I am awarc that pursuant to Scction 837.06, Flonda Statutcs. whocvcr knowingly makes a false stawment in wnting with 
thc tntcnt to mislead a pubric scrvant in  thc pcrformancc of hislhcr duty shall bc guilty of a misdemeanor of thc sccond dcgrcc. 

(Signature of Company Official) (Title) (Date) 

TeiephoneNumber ( ) Fax Number ( ) 

(Preparer of Form - Please Print  Name) 
F.E.I. No. 

PSC/CMP 153 i R C \  0 ’  i’ 



Paula lsler 

From: 
Sent: 
To: 
Subject: 

h u l a  lsler 
Thursday, June C2, 2005 4:23 PM 
'jcruzbustillo@aol.com' 
RAF Form 

Attachments : RAF-TJ230-04-0-R.pdf 

RAF-TJ230-04- 
0-R.pdf (28 KB) 

This e-mail was sent from The Florida Public Service Commission's Regiilatory 
Assessment Fee (RAF) System. 

Attached document t y p e :  Adobe Portable Document Format (PDF) 



STATUS: 

Actual Return 
Estimated Retuni 
A mended R etli m 

- 
- 
- 

PERIOD COVERED: 
01/01!2004 TO 32/31/2004 

Florida Public S e r v i c e  C o n i m i s s i o n  

R a d i a n t  Telecom. h c .  
1020 N.W. 163rd Drive 
Miami, FL 33169-581 8 

Please Complete Below If Official Mailing Address Has Changed 

FOR PSC USE O N L l  

-heck f .~ 

06-03-00 I 
00300 1 

______ 

b P 

06-03-00 I 
00401 1 

s 1 

Postmark IJate 
Initials of Preparer 

(Zip) (Name of Company) (Address) (CityiStatc I 

LJNE 
NO. ACCOUNT CLASSlFlCATlON 

I Long Distance Services 
2 Access Services 
1 Private Line Services 
4 Leased Facilities & Circuits Services 

Miscellaneous Services 

FLORlDA GROSS 
OPERATJNG REVENUE INTRASTATE REVENUE 

6. TOTAL Telephone Services $ 5 

I LESS: Amounts Paid to 7elecommunications Companies”’ ( ) I  1 

8.  TOTAL REVENUES For Regulatory Assessment Fee Calculation 5 

9 
I 0  
I 1  
I ?  

Regulatory Assessment Fee Due (Multiply Line 8 by 0 0020) 
Penalty for Late Payment (see “3 Failure to File by Due Date” on bach) 
lnterest for Late Payment (see “3 Failure to File by Due Date” on back) 
Extension Payment Fee (see “4 Extension” on back) 

, ? I  13. TOTAL AMOUNT DUE ($50 R1lNIMUM) 5 

( 1 )  These ainounts must be intrastate onlv and must be verifiable (see “ 2 .  Fees” o n  back). 
(2) Regardless of the gross operating revenue of a company, a minimuiii annual regulatory assessment fee of $50 shall be imposed as provided in 

Section 364.336, Flonda Statutes 

CURRENT COMPAh’Y STATUS 
( ) Facilities-Based Carrier ( ) Reseller ( ) Call Aggregator 
( ) Alternate-Operator Service ( ) Rebiller ( 1 Other: 

BILLING INFORMATION 
Complete below if billing agent is other than yourself. 

0 
(Name) (Addre::: CityiStatelZip) (Telephone) 

N’hat is the total amount ofcustomer deposits collected? What is the total amount of bond held (if applicable)? 
Amount: $ for 20 Amount: $ Expires: 

COMPANY I \ tORMATION 

Do you lease telecommunications’ facilities? j ) YES ( ) NO 
If YES Rho do you lease these facilitie- from7 haine 

Address: 
~~~~ 

1. the undersigned owneriofficer of the above-named company, have read the foregoing and declare that to the best of m? hnowledge and belief the above 
I ani  aware that pursuant to Section 877 Oh. Florida Statutes. whoever knowingly maker a false statement in writing with information is a true and correct stateinen1 

ihe intent to mislead a public servant in the performance of hisiher duty shall be guilt! of a misdemeanor of the second degree. 

(Signature of Company Official) (Title) (Date) 

Telephone Number ( ) Fax h u v b e r  ( ) 
(Preparer of Form - Please Print Lame)  


