
P.O. Box 701028 
D a k ,  TX 75370-1028 

October 14,2005 

BY CERTIFIED MAIL, RETURN RECEIPT REQUESTED - 
- .-- 
_ ’  J 

Division of the Commission Clerk and Adminisb-ative Services 

Capital Circle office Center 

Tallahassee, Florida 32399-0850 

RE: 

f- 

‘ i  Attention: Fiscal Services a .  --. 
Florida Public Service Commission cz ;... , 

2540 Shumard Oak Boulevard r--- Q F y  

Compliance Investigation of T-Netix Telecommunications Services, Inc. PATS Certificate No. 51 02, 
T-Netix Telecommunications Services, Inc., IXC Registration No. TJ804; and T-Netix, Inc., 
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c2 $15,000.00 Voluntary Contribution; Docket No. 050379-TP 
4 - * L 

IXC Registration No. TI1 58 (collectively ‘IT-Netif) for apparent violation of Rule 25-22.032(6)(b), F.A.C., 
Customer Complaints; Section 364.02, F.S., Definitions; and Section 364.04, F.S. Billing Practtces. 

Attention: Fiscal Services c)JIp- 
COM- In accordance with the settlement approved by the Commission in the referenced Docket, T-Netix hereby 

submits its voluntary contribution of $15,000.00 . The company’s contribution is made by check payable to the 
F l o r i d a  Public Service Commission and identifies the Docket number and company’s name as required.’ T- 

Netids makes this contribution timely, prior to the stipulated deadline of October 27,2005. 

If there are any questions on this voluntary contribution, please contact me at 972-277-031 9. 

ECR 

GcL P 

RCA 

SCR P u l f i s  Hopfinger . -  
Director - Legal and Regulatory Affairs SGA 

CC: K. Curry (Florida PSC) 
=- I 
OTH 

’ Florida Public Service Commission’s “Notice of Proposed Agency Action Order Approving Settlement Offer to 
Resobe Apparent Violations of Rule 25-22.032(6)(b), F.A.C., Sections 364.02 and 364.604,F.S.” issued 
September 19,2005. 
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Raquel Tully 

From: Ray Kennedy 

Sent: 

To: Paula lsler 

cc: Raquel Tully; Kiwanis Curry 

Subject: RE: 

- _I_ I_ 

Thursday, October 20, 2005 8:13 AM 

It is a settlement, but I believe for your purposes it is a fine. It goes to the General Revenue Fund. 

From: Paula Isler 
Sent: Wednesday, October 19, 2005 12:Ol PM 
To: Ray Kennedy 
Cc: Raquel Tully 
Subject: W: 

Ray, will you respond to Raquel? Thanks. 

From: Raquel Tully 
Sent: Wednesday, October 19, 2005 12:OO PM 
To: Paula Isler 
Subject: 

1 received a check for $1 5,000.00 for Docket #050379-TP for T-Netix is this a fine ? 


