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TO AVOID PENALTY AND INTEREST CHARGES. THE REGULATORY ASSESSMENT FEE RETURN MUST BE FILED ON OR BEFORE 0 1/3 1/2005 

Pay Telephone Service Provider Regulatory Assessment Fee Return 

STATUS: 

Actual Return 
, Estimated Return 
Amended Return 

Florida Public Service Commission 
(See Filing Insrructions OR Back of Form) 
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TG863 -04-0-R 
Conversant Technologies, Inc. 
P. 0. Box 865081 
Plana TX 75086-508 1 
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(see "2. Feed' on back) 

TOTAL =VENUES for Regulatory Assessment Fee CalculationaC - $ o(---I 
(Line 2 less Line 3) 

Regulatory Assessment Fee Due - (Multiply Line 4 by 0.0015) !R- - 5 G  
Penalty for Late Payment (see "3. Failure to File by Due Date" on back$CR II__ 17 50 
Interest for Late Payment (see "3. Failure to File by Due Date'' on back* - 5- 5 0  
TOTAL AMOUNT DUE =I $ tO%.ix) 

AS PROVIDED IN SECTION 364.336 FLORIDA STATUTES, THE M I N I M " 4 W M d B E  IS $50 

THIS FORM MUST BE COMPLETED AND RETURNED REGARDLESS OF THE AMOUNT OF REVENUES REPORTED 

Number of pay telephones in operation at close of period covered 
by this Return \ 

59 

These amounts must be intrastate only and must be verifiable. 

I ,  the underslgned owner/offcer of the above-named company, have read the foregoing and declare that LO the best of my knowledge and belief the above information is a true and 
tion 837.06, Florida Statutes, whoever knowingly makes a false statement in writing with the intent to mislead a public servant in (lie 
a misdemeanor ofthe second degree. 
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Raquel Tully 

From: Paula lsler 

Sent: 
To: Raquel Tully 

Subject: RE: 

Friday, December 09, 2005 8:03 AM 

The $68 for RAF, P&I can be  deposited as you normally would. All of the $100 settlement goes to the PSC Trust 
Fund (none to General Revenue). Thanks. 

From: Raquel Tully 
Sent: Thursday, December 08, 2005 3:30 PM 
To: Paula Isler 
Subject: 

We received a check from TG 863 Docket Number 050821-TC for $68.00 for Raf and P&l. and a $100.00 for a 
proposed fine. can I deposit this and does the whole $1 00.00 go to General Revenue? 

12/9/2005 


