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TALLAHASSEE, FLORIDA 32301

McClosky

FAX: (850) 412-1307
KATHRYN.COWDERY@RUDEN.COM

215 SOUTH MONROE STREET
l u en SUITE 815

oo .

February 2, 2006 50F
SO s B
oo <o [y
O t e
. . . r—TE o e

Blanca S. Bayo, Director Via hand-delivery me

Division of Commission Clerk and =w
Administrative Services = .

Florida Public Service Commission — @
2540 Shumard Oak Boulevard w L
Tallahassee, Florida 32399-0850

Re:  Docket No. 020640-SU: Apphcatlon for wastewater certificate in Lee County by
Gistro, Inc.

Dear Ms. Bayo:

Attached for filing in this docket are copies of documentation of expenses incurred for
the two lift stations for the Gistro, Inc. wastewater system, as well as documentation of
organizational expenses for the certification of this utility.

Please let me know if you have any questions.

CMP

COM

CTR Enclosures

ECR ___ . (hand-delivery):  Pat Brady (w/enc.)

GCL Roseanne Gervasi, Esq. (w/o enc.)

Richard Redemann (w/enc.)

S Patti Daniel (w/o enc.)
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' RUDEN, McCLOSKY, SMITH, SCHUSTER & RUSSELL, P.A.

CARACAS ™ FT. LAUDERDALE  MIAML » NAPLES » ORLANDO = PORT ST. LUCIE = SARASOTA = ST. PETERSBURG # TALIAHASSEE = TAMPFpg/Egr.@m\qm‘;@S W CLERE




MAINTENANCE 2005

Direct by bank TO BARNEY’S PUMP $ 3380.00
3-1705 R.F.GRIDLEY panel work 900.00
7-10 «“ 89.32
3-20 GREGOR ST. JOHN, lift station 900.00
4-04 “ 400.00
4-20 ' “ 400.00
4-20 ANY TIME SEPTIC 175.00
8-12 ANY TIME SEPTIC 940.00
8-12 GREGOR ST. JOHN 1600.00
8-12 BARNEY’S PUMP 3380.61
8-23 MARK GRANT lift station electric 1417.50
8-25 PRECISION LIFT STATION 1665.06
10-25 *? 1403.00
10-24 J.C.DRAINFIELD 300.00
11-02 DEPARTMENT OF REVENUE 200.00
12-09 PRECISION LIFT STATIONS 6835.00
12-20 « 410.10
12-20 STAY RIGHT lift station service 300.00
12-25 PRECISION LIFT STATONS
Rebuild lift station #1 4500.00
$29,195.59
MANAGEMENT 12 MONTH 3,600.00
$ 32,795.59
FrL JA17.7)

F3¢o0l3.30
P e



LIFT STATION ON RED HIBISCUS IN THE FOREST MERE
DEVELOPMENT IN BONITA SPRINGSFL 2003 4+ 200¥

SNYDER SEPTIC 11003 1.100.00 7/
SNYDER SEPTIC 4 28 03 1.10000 /
—GRAINGER— —i2-102— B VA sy ]
THE ELECTRIC CONNECTION 1,08 .~ 54793 /
GATOR SEPTIC TANK 2,22 685.00 /
-GRAINGER— 12162 1204 /
GRAINGER # 524 1 303 24103 /
ACE HARDWARE 204 03 8.16 /
THOMPSON PUMP 228 03 1.171.48 /
BOB LEE ELECTRIC 123,03 50.00 /
G.S.PHILLIPS 3.10,03 2495 /
CREWS # 349 22103 1.000.00 /
CREWS # 552 4 28,03 2.051.25 /
BOB DEAN # 586 937.00 /
GRALEY MEDHANICAL # 591 306.00 / |
GRAINGER 2 06. - 140.38 / f
GRALEY 52 03 33700 7
GRAINGER 11 20 02 229.00 /
GARLEY MECHANICAL 2 24,03 4.400.00 /
GRAINGER 2 06 229.08 /
GRAINGER 1211 .03 100.65 /
CREWS 12 23,02 465.00 /
BOB DEAN # 532 127,03 1.855.77 /
MR. ROOTER # 527 49.00 /
MADER ELECTRIC #611 2504 126738 /
GRALEY MCH. #622 4 31,04 30000 /
GRIDLEY # 623 600.00 /
MADER ELECTRIC #628 1.972.30 /
RF.GRIDLEY # 632 142040 /
MADER ELECTRIC #642 44944 /
43 FEET MAIN PIPE REPLACED AFTER 5PM 3.500.00 /
TILL AFTER FRIDAY MIDNIGHT
CLEAN UP SEWAGE 50000 /
MANAGEMENT 15 MONTH 5.000.00
‘ $.32.610.21
ATTORNEYS COST ? @!o /@0/& /'0{ bosd c% §28,7)
RS
All bills are available. - 29 839 [ 6
o
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FPL ELECTRIC BILLS

2003

JAN. $ 83.04

FEB 77.51
MAR 67.08
APRIL 61.35
MAY 54.83
JUNE 62.83
JULY 75.81

AUGUST 8545
SEPT. 128.01

OCT. 112.01
NOV. 96.01
DEC. 75.85

'$ 979.78

2004

$ 74.23
64.95
98.31
78.68
64.68
52.66
59.26
91.55
208.93
92.33
150.68

$1036.26

2005
$ -

171.32
185.11
95.33
57.54

112.13
111.29
103.04
96.29
130.26
155.40

$1217.71

TOT.$3233.75



FPL ELECTRIC BILLS

2003

JAN. $ 83.04
FEB 717.51
MAR 67.08
APRIL 61.35
MAY 54.83
JUNE 62.83
JULY 75.81
AUGUST 85.45
SEPT. 128.01
OCT. 112.01
NOV. 96.01
DEC. 75.85

$ 979.78

2004

$ 7423
64.95
98.31
78.68
64.68
52.66
59.26
91.55
208.93
92.33
150.68

$1036.26

2005
$ -

171.32

185.11
95.33
57.54

112.13
111.29
103.04
96.29
130.26
155.40

$1217.71

TOT.$3233.75



GRALEY MECHANICAL INC.

$
$
$
$
$
$
$
$

LR - IR L g g

o5

4,000.-

337

200.-
200.-
200.-
306.-
200.-
200.-

200.-
200.-
300.-
200.-
200.-
200.-
200.-
200.-
200.-
200.-
200.-

200.-

check # 546

559

570
575
587
591
602
603

609
614
622
629
638
644
656
660
669
677
680

687

paid 4-07-03

5- 02
7-25

9-06
10-06
11-19
12-12
1227

1-20-04
2-20
3-15
4-26
5-31
8-02
9-02
10-02
11-02
12-04
12-20

1-22-05

total 2003 $6,041.00

total 2004

$ 2,300.00



Grale

Ph: 339-236-9477 ¢ Fax: 239-226-0478

1681 Benchmark Ave., Suite F * Fort Myers, FL. 33905
Certified Underground CU-COB4014 * Registered Electrical Contractaor ERO0165348

February 2, 2005

Mr. Fritz Helzberg
Gistro, Inc.

P.O. Box 110131
Naples FL 34108

Labor to pull pump and de-rag $200.00 X 2 trips

TOTAL $400.00

%MW&W&WMW’J‘W

INVOICE

M132-2



Graley
X » .

AL Mechanical

"=F Tnc.

Ph: R39-226-9477 * Fax: 239-226-9478
1681 Benchmark Ave., Suite F * Fort Myers, FL. 33905

Certified Underground CU-CO64814 - Registered Electrical Contractor ER0015348

INVOICE

January 3, 2005 M132-1

Mr. Fritz Helzberg
Gistro, Inc.

P.O. Box 110131
Naples FL. 34108

Pump Station Monthly Maintenance agreement due by the 20" of this month

Please reference invoice number

TOTAL $200.00

(91

%M/ﬁ 2 to condinating bese waf/ayow /t 2‘11 0(




. Graley
« Nlechanical

Ph: 239-326-9477 » Fax: 39-226-0478

1681 Benchmark Ave., Suite F « Fort Myers, FL. 33905
Certified Underground CU-CO54814 * Registered Elactrical Contractor ERO018348

INVOICE

December 2, 2004 M132-12

Mr. Fritz Helzberg
Gistro, Inc.

P.O. Box 110131
Naples FL 34108

Pump Station Monthly Maintenance agreement due by the 20™ of this month

Please reference invoice number

TOTAL $200.00 A =

H L0 L4 0¢ A= v

%/oﬁé,} d lo ""',dm&mw&%w



f> Graley
;MJ Mechanical

=" Inc.

Ph: 839-826-9477 * Fax: 239-226-9478
1681 Benchmark Ave., Suite F ¢ Fort Myers, FL. 33905

Certified Underground CU-C054814 * Registered Electrical Contractor ER0015348

INVOICE

November 2, 2004 M132-11

Mr. Fritz Helzberg
Gistro, Inc.

P.O. Box 110131
Naples FL. 34108

Pump Station Monthly Maintenance agreement due by the 20" of this month
Please reference invoice number

4 617
[).2.0. ol

TOTAL $200.00

%MIZ d to conts, 'Z/ ; weﬂiyou



6 ZP A Graley BAYES
« Nlechanical

Ph: 239-226-9477 ¢ Fax: R39-326-9478
1681 Benchmark Ave., Suite F * Fort Myers, FL. 33905

Certified Underground CU-C084914 + Registered Rlectrical Contractor ER00158348

INVOICE

October 1, 2004 M132-10

M. Fritz Helzberg
Gistro, Inc.

P.O. Box 110131
Naples FL. 34108

Pump Station Monthly Maintenance agreement due by the 20™ of this month

Please reference invoice number

TOTAL $200.00

4 b6
W 2-0Y

%M}f d lo conlincing e weﬂyaa




RAVEN

Graley
> Pg .

Gét 4 Mechanical

raF Inc.

Ph: 239-226-9477 ¢ Fax: 839-226-2478
1681 Benchmark Ave., Suite F * Fort Myers, FL. 33905

Certified Underground CU-C0B84914 « Registered Electrical Contractor ER0Q15348

INVOICE

September 1, 2004 M132

Mr. Fritz Helzberg
Gistro, Inc.

P.O. Box 110131
Naples FL 34108

Pump Station Monthly Maintenance agreement due by the 20" of this month

TOTAL $200.00

#F600 (02 0y

%MW@WWWW



e, 4% Graley
'V Nechanical
"*I Inc.

Ph: 239-226-9477 * Fax: 339-226-9478
1681 Benchmark Ave., Suite F' ¢ Fort Myers, FL. 33905

Certified Underground CU-C054914 * Registered Electrical Contractor ER0015348

INVOICE

August 1, 2004 M132

Mr. Fritz Helzberg
Gistro, Inc.

P.O. Box 110131
Naples FL 34108

Pump Station Monthly Maintenance agreement due by the 20® of this month

TOTAL $200.00 # @S\é
g 3, DYy




Ci » ) Graley
Vi Mechanical
"« Inc.

Ph: 239-2R26-9477 * Fax: 239-226-9478
1681 Benchmark Ave., Suite F * Fort Myers, FL. 33905

Certified Underground CU-CO54814  Registered Electrical Contractor ERO015348

INVOICE

June 1, 2004 M132

Mr. Fritz Helzberg
Gistro, Inc.

P.0. Box 110131
Naples FI. 34108

Pump Station Monthly Maintenance agreement due by the 20" of this month

gl
TOTAL $200.00

4

'%Mﬁ & to conts; '7/‘ y wtﬁi;wm/




«f . ) Graley
YIVE Mechanical
"*T Inc.

Ph: 239-226-9477 ¢ Fax: 239-326-9478
1681 Benchmark Ave., Suite F ¢ Fort Myers, FL. 33908

Certifled Underground CU-C054814 * Reglistered Electrical Contractor ER0015348

INVOICE

May 4, 2004 M132

Mr. Fritz Helzberg
Gistro, Inc.

P.O. Box 110131
Naples FL. 34108

Pump Station Monthly Maintenance agreement due by the 20™ of this month

TOTAL $200.00

# 633
33/, 04

‘;’)%4,04// o o contenecng buse MW



Graley
- P g .
G';'(, Mechanical

"= Inc.

Ph: 239-226-9477 » Fax: 239-226-9478
1681 Benchmark Ave., Suite F * Fort Myers, FL. 33905

Certifted Underground CU-CO54814 » Registered Electrical Contractor ER0015348

INVOICE

March 16, 2004

Mr. Fritz Helzburg
Gistro Inc..

P.O. Box 110131
Naples F1. 34108

Re: Reserve Lift Station
Provide and install 2 start capacitors and 2 run capacitors

Tota}%b() Q00—
# 622
7,31 0Y

Ve look foreward to continuing business cwilh you



[ECHANICAL, INC.

1681 Benchmark Avenue
Suite F

Fort Myers FL 33905
Phone: 941-226-9477
Fax: 941-226-9478
CU-CO54914

December 5, 2003

Mr, Fritz Helzberg
Gistro, Inc.

P.O. Box 110131
Naples FL 34108

Lift Stations- New and Rehabs
Service Contracts
Raven Lining Systems

INVOICE

M132

Pump Station Monthly Maintenance agreement due by the 20™ of this month

Vi tok

TOTAL $200.00
I+ 602
12,27, 2003
o o corntinee; wilh you



CHANICAL, INC.

1681 Benchmark Avenue
Suite F

Fort Myers FL 33905
Phone: 941-226-9477
Fax: 941.226-9478
CU-CO54914

October 25, 2003

Mr. Fritz Helzberg
“Gistro, Inc.

P.0. Box 110131
Naples FL. 34108

Starter for station at rear
4 man crew to remove pump in front
4 man crew to replace pump in front

Make check payable to Roy Graley

Lift Stations- New and Rehabs
Service Contracts
Raven Lining Systems

INVOICE

M132

$106.00
$100.00
$100.00

$306.00

Pad

jl, 19, 2095



ICAL, INC.

1681 I‘S:enchmurk Avenue © CERTIFIED RAVEN LINING APPLICATOR

Fort Myers FL 33905
Ph: 239-226-9477
Fax: 239-226-2478

Cerfified Underground CL-CO54914
Registered Elecirical Confractor ER0015348

INVOICE

October 5,2003 M132

M. Fritz Helzberg
Gistro, Inc.

P.0. Box 110131
Naples FL 34108

Pump Station Monthly Maintenance agreement due by the 20™ of this month

TOTAL $200.00

Wi look fomoard b contimsing basinass with yous




1681 Benchmark Avenue
Svite F

Fort Myers FL 33905

Ph: 239-226-9477

Fax: 239-226-2478
Certified Underground CU-CO54914
Registered Electrical Corfractor ER0G15348

April 15, 2003

Mr. Fritz Helzburg
Gistro Inc..

P.O. Box 110131
Naples FL. 34108

Re: Reserve Lift Station

3 service calls at $100.00 ea.
Start relay 37.00

CHANICAL, INC.

CERTIFIED RAVEN LINING APPLICATOR

INVOICE

0828

Total $337.00

Remember the service contract

Pt
5.30°%
$ 59

%MW@MW?WMW



CHANICAL, INC.

1681 Benchmark Avenue o CERTIFIED RAVEN LINING APPLICATOR

Suite F
Forf Myers FL 33905
Ph: 239-226-9477

Fax: 239-226-2478 ' | IN V O I CE

Certified Underground CU-CO54914
Registered Elecirical Coniractor ERO015348

DATE: February 24, 2003
BILL TO: Mr. Fritz Holzburg
GISTRO INC.
P.0. Box 110131
‘Naples, F1 34108
OUR INVOICE: #0841
RE: The Preserve

By-passed, 2 new pump stands, 2 new downpipes, new 4000 Ib. Floor, £ new upper guides
All labor

TOTAL $4400.00

' Sl
Aprd 1o
of Uhwo

Terms: net 30 days

%éﬂté}.’ ot condinciing busé wéﬂ?oa



Snyder Septic Service

[ ]
2040 Beacon Manor Drive IﬂVOl ce
Fort Myers, Florida 33907 DATE INVOICE NO.
11/10/02 11649
BILL TO
Gistro, Inc.
PO Box 110 131
Naples, FL. 34108
TERMS
Due on receipt
ITEM DESCRIPTION QTyYy AMOUNT
T Liftstation Pumping **Sunday 1 1,100,00

**SEE ENCLOSURE

Thenks for your business! Please pay from this invoice to address above. No statement will be sent. -

Total

$1,100.00




Snyder Septic Service

]
2040 Beacon Manor Drive Invoice
Fort Myers, Florida 33907
’ DATE INVOICE NO.
11/10/02 11725
BILL TO
Gistro, Inc.
POBox 110131
Naples, FL 34108
TERMS
Due on receipt
TEM DESCRIPTION aTy AMOUNT
Liftstation Liftstation Pumping **Sunday 1 1,100.00

**SEE ENCLOSURE

Thanks for your business! Please pay from this invoice to address above. No statement will be sent. -

Total

Y

$1,100.00




—_— - N T . STATEMENT

e SO

BOB LEE ELecmlp mc ”

P.0. Box 189 f o
 FORT MYERS, FLORIDA 33902; " oare _12/12/2002

1

Gistro Inc., . o
P.0. Box 366762

Bonita Springs, Florida 34136

e —— -..——-.*_; o

|
|
| i |
mom 7 Invoice #27711°1

TR

BOB LEE ELECTRIC, INC, %«E% ...#.‘“'cm::*
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KENIAL INVYUICH

Invoice No. Invoice Date

30615 228103

Billing Questions

ExperiENCE INNOVATION Call 1-800-767-7310 Ext. 4124

Thompson Pump & Manufacuring Co., Inc.
P.O. Box 291370, Port Orange Florida, 32119-1370
Phone: (800)767-7310 Fax:(386)761-0362

GISTRO INC s 0000004273
ATTN: o PRESERVE LIFT STATION
PO BOX 366-762 B SOUTHERN PINE DRIVE
BONITA SPRINGS, FL 34136 : BONITA SPRINGS, FL
-
o
“DATE SHIPPED | PURCHASE DRDER NO. — SHIPVIA F.OB. TERMS
21403 FRITZ HOLBERG THOMPSON TRUCK OUR SHOP NET 30 DAYS
BUYER ORDER DATE LOCATION SALESPERSON TERRITORY
2/28/03 FSC BERNIE DATTOLO FLLEE
Guantiy ltemkey Description T
shapDEd . SR geem TR L AL Q )
1 8V-DDRT-4-913 THOMPSON 8" VACUUM-ASSISTED MULT! PUMP BV-094 T
1 \W69-1702-004 HOSE, SUCTION 4" X 20 RUBBER T
1 |wes-1702-008 HOSE, SUCTION 6” X 30° RUBBER T
1 \W69-2906-000 STRAINER, 8" TRASH T
1 3V-DDRT-4-913 THOMPSON 8" VACUUM-ASSISTED MULTI PUMP BV—BSS T
* [14.DAYS RENTAL: 5 FEB THRU 18 FEB 03 C/";‘A
DELIVERY 2/14 & PICK UP2/119 @ $2{) 00 PER TR:;vpn
\ 5\ & \9“
FL6F
SubTotal Tax Freight 311?7?}48
$1,058.00 63.48 $50.00 '

! Invoice No. 30615 '




Yoyl s

_BALANCE SUMMARY ) ACCOUNT INFORMATION E

A N AR . 4184126000853024
P-m:ous Ralance & $2,125.51 Statement Closing Date 02/17/03 SR S
. Fymants snd Credils $25.00 Days in Biiling Cycie 3t Pwmm Dus Date 02/14/03 ’
Cash Advances $6.00 New Balance $3.361.27 MIRINMUN Pa'mm DUk $134.09
+. PurchesasfAflustmenis $1,370.48 Cradit Line $4.060.00 o —— - ——
+ FINARCE CHARGES ~ ___349.28 Avallable Cradit $638.73 '
= New Balance $3,381.27 Aaliable Cash Advance™ $139.48 CALL 1-368-§22-7587 TO MAKE YOUR
PAYMENT OVER THE PHONE!
I TRANSACTION DETAIL l
Posting Transaction  Raferance Transactions Charget &
Dats Dete Number Cradits ¢
Purchascs
02703 02/01 001350438904 USPS 1 :mmw BONITA SPRING FL .20
) 04 ) - UMP AND MFG CO PORT ORANGE FL 1,282.28
i redits e xs
APS CHECKS R5.00py
Miscaifansous
sy L2 ©00000000017 TELEPHONE CHECK PYMT FEE 10.00

[ IMPORTANT IFORMATION ! ‘gb/"o 0

The intraductery APR for your spacial convanianca checks iz 3.8% until your July 2003 cycle. If the balance

is not paid ia full by your July 2003 cycle, then your reguiar variabie APR wiil apply to your ramairing b l
spacisl convanlence check belance. 3

Du your taxes In 30 minutes and gat yeur refund in 10 days with IRS o-fite from www_ez¥sxReturn.com. FREE to
try, pay whasn you fite. Just 324,05 with Coupon Code CCP3SY.

| FINANCE CHARGE SUMMARY k : - -

Aversge Monthly gpnesponding Periadic ANNUAL VISIT GUR
_ Dally Periodic - Annual -~ - FINANCE PERCENTAGE WEBSITE AY
* Salance  Rate ™+ - Pgrcentage Rate CHARGE RATE WIWW.FRARE.COM
:qdum; $1, 5&: zm {3':322 33633 s | SEE REVERSE BIDE FOR e
urchases 8 - - 1.8500% ~ 4§ . PR, R E.

Cash Advances C §1.5¢  1.6500% 19.80%  MINJMUM $0.50 HEPORTANT INFORMATION -

Purchasas D . . S )
Cash Advences E $1,103.59 C.A250% . Fixed 3.90% $3.58

s PERIODIC RATE MAY VARY FROM MONTH TQ MONTH

First North Amsrican Matioas! Bank

B ARBREVIATIONS: hy” m Payrvane, 51" = Cradl. = . : T/ P.O. BOX 100045
For 24 hour suiomated information cell 1-868-522-7587-. . B K GA 30158
FHAND Curtamer Service Reprosentatives are sveliehie Monday - Friday 10am - 9pm ET See fornt on side.

Tonnnpwcmnudmnrmunumnnnywlmm)nte-duz
For T.D.D. {Télephire Devica for the mem fon ], catf (800} 8231784
L] 4104130000853624 e

gﬁg‘,‘

MAIL. BILLING AND DTHER INQUIRIES TO'




i
£

- THANK YOU FOR SHOPPING AT
" GUNSHINE ACE HARDWARE - BONITA
(941) 932-0169

2/04/03 4:38 MARILYN 609 SALE

16371 1 £A 2.69 EA
SIGN OSHA KEEP OQUT10X14" 2.69
RENTAL i EA .

v 00 EA
EQUIPMENT RENTAL 5,00

SUB-TOTAL: .69 _ TAXs AT
BC ANT
BK CARDE: XXXYXXXXXXXXBO43
====)) JRNLE YOR149 {{====
CUST # 5

THANK YOU R JAKOB F HOLZBE
FOR YOUR PATRONAGE




"cE;Hardware

FA f%fll

Mon

Tue | Wed

Thy

Fri .

Date And Time Rented Out Date And Timie Due Back in Without Additional Charges
3 ; ‘Sat-|

Amount OF Déposii

..Dis¢ ...

77

Rental Charges Do Not include Supphes To Be Used Wlth Too!s (Example — Sandpaper, Staples. Etc.)
Total Merchandise And/Or Supplies o Be Paid For At The Cash Register

¢ 'ow!edge Receipt In Good Order Of The ftem{s) Rented And That I Have Head And A

Rental Contract. Iund rstﬂgd

ully the operation of tha. described equipment and the pi
jent Is Not Hespousihle F Accidents Or lnjunes ‘

Ret

Less

ltem's. Returned

. Date And Time Returned.

Fl" In Onl If leferent

Deposit

= | Balance Or
‘| Refund Due

Actual Hental
Ti

’ F!’ial Rental

Carge

Merchandise And/Or Supplies
d/Refund - Add To D it

FinaICharges

" IF EQUIPMENT DOES NOT
FUNCTION PROPERLY,
NOTIFY US IMMEDIATELY

CUSTOMER’S PAID RECEIPT

A CLEANING CHARGE
WILL BE MADE ON
ITEMS RETURNED UNCLEAN



O TATEMENT

By ENVIRONMENTAL ’
IDERTIAL O el docs- iz COMMERCIAL STATEMENT DATE: Feb 28, 2003
P. 0. Box 27 - Ft. Myers, FL. 33902-0027
vo3a1) 3321986, 5, Fax, (941) 3327654 GUSTOMER ACCOUNT ID: GTSTRO
Fax: ’ 235-332-7654
CACCOUNTOF: . - ... . -

GISTRO-INK
P.0. BOX 366762
BONITA SPRINGS, FL 34136

AMOUNT
PLEASE DETACH AND RETURN THIS PORTION WITH YOUR PAYMENT. ENCLOSED: $

.. .BALANCE .

You may have forgotten this bill. Thanks for your attention.



e T R G PR TR

Invoice
] . . Invoice Number:
RESIGENTIAL -t ool dows-dl. COMMERCIAL 024661
o e e i e | o moceome
1 Dec 23, 2002
Page:
1

Sold Tq: Service Address:
GISTRO-INK BONITA PRESERVE

P.O. BOX 366762
BONITA SPRINGS, FL 34136

Customer ID

Description

Subfotal 465. 00

' Sales Tax
Total invoice Amount 465.00

oheck e Payment Received
TOTAL 465. 00

Overdue invoices are subject to service charges.



LA TG 5 T20 Lac.
s .0 Box SBGICZ
/gamz/f S,Z’ﬂuué« SY/376

* RECEIVED BY




A Gator Septic Service, Inc.

Invoice

7990 Mainline Pkwy. DATE INVOICE#
Ft Myers, FL 33912
041-267-4541 I 12/22/2002 36015
BILL TO
Gistro, Inc.
P.O. Box 366762
Bonita Springs, FL 34136
P.O. NO. TERMS PROJECT
495-8089 Net 30
QUANTITY DESCRIPTION RATE AMOUNT
1 | Lift Station Pump Preserve 620.00 620.00
1 { After Hours Charge 65.00 65.00
pumped 4,000 gal
ordered by Fritz Holzberg
/1 %2003
. !
{ Total $685.00
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MAIN QFFICE GLADES BRANGH i
2624 HANSON STREET HIGHWAY aap “ ﬁw
FT. MYERS, FLORIDA 33501 RT. 1. BOX 212 i @ﬁ%@w@ e,
_ ae 332-11%1 CLEWISTON, FLORIDA 2440 s
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REMIT TO: 2624 HANSON STREET
FORT MYERS, FLORIDA 33901-7488
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JICES UNPAID AFTER 30 DAYS SUBJECT TOQ ﬁ.wa\m LATE NET Emwﬂxkzgmlm’m.@ﬂbm
RGE. BOB DEAN SUPPLY RESERVES THE ‘RIGHT TQ |SPECIAL CHARGE: ~ ]
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4270 PROGRESS AVE., UNIT 23
NAPLES, FL 34104

261-6061 3890508
5979010  435-1424 FAX

e

SHIQTARASED ANDVY

LIC: # CF-C051654 DATE: g
P L U M B .1l N : X ; :
OB ADDR Bil ADDR DIFFER = ORDER
CUSTOMER NAME; X GUSTOMER NAME:
- Rt N oo\n ?W N
ADDRESS: -~ 2 : o
== y’ y S6E576 2 | |
e L—L!L 5 ) s{j TZIP,7 408 PHONE cITY JST l 7P OTHER PHONE SERVICE &
%4 D7y < Yize SIS PREVMAINT [
ERAT @ 7 e TEGANICIANS) . TONTACT =
: o o CPP MEMBER
1 CREDIT - - - EXP AUTH
L] oasH [ghCheCK [ ] BILLED D] GARD # T S5 ). . DATE CODE 0 wsonmway | OPPORTUNITY CALL [ {-
SERVICE AUTHORIZATION | AGREE THAT INITIAL PRICE QUOTED PRIORTO-'START OFWORKDGES NOT INCLUDE ANY ADDITIONAL OR UNFORESEEN TASKS, 3 CAMERA OWNER é
NOR MATERIALS WHICH MAY BE FOUND TO BE NECESSARY TO COMPLETE REPAIRS:OR REPLACEMENTS. | ALSO 'AGREE TO-HOLD MR. ROOTER OR ITS ASSIGNS HARM- | [ pire LOCATOR
LESS FOR PARTS DEEMED CORRODED, UNUSABLE OR UNRELIABLE FOR COMPLETION OF STATED WORK: & DONE..EHEREBY-AUTHORIZE MR. ROOTER TO PERFORM | [ CABLE MACHINE TENANT —
PROPOSED WORK AND AGREE TO ALL AGREEMENT CONDITIONS AS DISPLAYED ONIHE FACE AND REV, SIDES Q IS DOCUMENT AND FURTHER ACKNOWLEDGE | [ BACKHOE 3
THAT THIS INVOICE tS DUE UPON RECEIPT. S - ) o : = : %@mpmgss RESIDENTIAL =
An Independently Owned and Operated Franchise [ VAG A R C A $ OTHER COMMERCIAL [
DIAGNOSIS
 Tce
-
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YA =]
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A0 J
. otAL FNAZEEN K B
RECO DATIO omer Protection PIa ombe ave mone cPP [ $
L . , [0 APPROVED [ DECLINED B TOTAL B
T [J APPROVED [JDECLINED|  TAX $ ol
‘ | ‘_ ‘ e J [ Q Yl
s, ‘_ - (] APPROVED [} DECLINED $. - /
ACLEPTANCE OF WORK PERFORMED: | FIND THE SERVICE AND MATERIALS PERFORMED AND INSTALLED HAVE BEEN COMPLETED IN ACGORDANCE WITH THIS AGREEMENT, | ) ] — N
Agg‘es TO,PAY REASONABLE ATTORNEY FEES, GOLLECTION FEES AND GOUAT COSTS IN THE EVENT OF LEGAL 'ACTION PURSUANT TO COLLEGTION DF AMOUNT DUE. CUSTOMER SIGNATURE
ﬂLﬂO HEREBY S'I;ATE‘ THAT THE ABOVE WORK HAS BEEN DONE IN A WORKMANLIKE MANNER AND TO APPLIGABLE CODES. TECHNICIAN SIGNATURE ..
MR331 Type 2-without notice of cancellation
Rev. 4/02 e

24 Hours a Day » 7 Days a Weék... Never An Overtime Charge!

www.mrrooter.com
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PO Box 189 | 5 | |
FORT MYERS FLOR!DA 33902 : © oae _12/1272002 /]
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P.0. Box 3667:6-2 3 ; ' - A ‘

Bonlta Springs, Florlda 34136

Invoice #27711"

! BOB LEE ELECTRIC, INC,

..



SOLD TO ACCOUNT 0DB60781508 ] ORDER DATE AND TIME EMPLOYEE PAGE NOD
GISTRO INC 11/20/2002 14:18 PBJIRC |1 ofl
26510 SOUTHERN PINES D L 2
BOHITA SPRIN ¥, 341 35-6 15 DBT/CRD CODE { SALES ORDER NUMBER DELIVERY NUMBER

NISh 1072402663 6091328703

CALLER REQUISITIONER BRANCH ADDRESS
FITZ HOLZBERG 12431 METRO PARKWA

TELEPHONE NUMBER PROJECT/JOB NUMBER FT MYERS . FL 33912-1316
9414958089 941-768-5999 , )

3 0 RELEASE NUMBER CHECK NUMBER ICHECK AMOUNT | CASH REC'D/PAID §

INVOICE WILL FOLLOW
SALES TERMS AND CONDITIONS ON REVERSE SIDE

THANK YCOU FOR YOUR ORDER
# of BOXES | FAEIGH] TERMS | DATE SHIPPED/PICKED ur |

| PPA
SHIP OTY BACKORDER MESSAGE ___{TAX] _ UNIT PRICE TOTAL

11.37 34 171

ITEM NUMBER

} certify that i | am purchasing the material(s) as

Upon the rewsrm for credit and/or replacement of the above
fisted Grainger productis), customer warrants and represents ~materials of trade” as defined in the Hazardous
that no property damage or p 1 injury has resutred from Materials Regulations in Titie 48 of the Code of T2 12.97
use of returned productis) and customer further agrees that Federat Regutations. [ intend to uss the material(s) TOTAL 229 0 8
w not Mmd ;ny ciaim againstpziv.w. ‘(r%raimg:.!r‘;t Inc., #ts in direct support of Z‘xd principat bumnsss‘m {which is -
adiarias ivisions or its suppliers in any su N not Transportation), 1 do not intend to resell the

involving the above listed productis). DIV of W.W.GRAINGER, INC.  materiat, or transport them in a vehicie other than

SAP DELIVERY ™™

6091328703

O Visit our web site @ www.grainger.com



INVOICE

Electrical Equipment Sales ® Service ® D¥ 1gn \\’Q§ N 0‘- 118
F.
P.O. Box 6024 o .
Lakeland, FI. 33807-6024 DATE OF ORDER
1/23/03:
ORDER NO.

STARTING DATE

VERBAL FRI_TX HOLZBERG

BILL TO

GISTRO,INC. v
P.0. BOX 110131 1=
NAPLES,FL 34108

(0 CONTRACT

JOB NAME AND LOCATION

PARTS ORDER

‘DESCRIPTION OF WORK
QTY 1 24VCM CONTROL MODULE

UPS RED

REF DELIVERY VTICKET 0010 5,“0( 003

TERMS NET DUE

THANK YOQU

DATE COMPLETED WORK ORDERED BY
TOTAL AMOUNT s

1. 31 o3l FRITX HOLZBERS 181.95

I hereby acknowledge the satisfactory completion

of tn{ve(:escribed work

Signature OFFICE (863) 644-2807

Please Pay From This Statement




NEON STREET
FTY MYERS, FLORIDA 33901
(239) 332-7 134

i
i
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| CUSTOMER INVOICE paTE
[ S e R )
I - ¥
[ NVOICE DATE |
j ;
f
f
ot §! T ey i
|
i
.“ : i i Iy J
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MAIN OFFICE GLADES BRANCH

TNy onIonou
. . 2624 HANSON STREET 1310 EVERGANE ROAD b
FT. MYERS, FLORIDA 33801 CLEWISTON, FLORIDA 33440 an {
(239) 332-1131 (863) 983-6131

UPPLY, INC DU N- 5 03226695
’ . B

REMIT TO: 2624 HANSON STREET

] A ‘ ' ¢P\S\_\§\§ N FORT MYERS, FLORIDA 239017488

s TATIN
¥ CUSTOMER INV
PITa GRRINGS .
. - . ; - [ / INVOICE DATE
Lo 0 L6/06708 | fo—06-03
B4 -5481 ENEREL
asoF ) Hue Date: 11705703 ( pacE )
i ,
TERMS SHIPPED VIA SPECIAL INSTRUCTIONS
1L000% 1% Davs, Helt 30 CPU~MOTOREDHOP , RAD MONSTHURS ¥4
QUANTITY ITEM WAREHOUSE
ORDERED | SHIPPED B.O. NUMBER DESCRIPTION UNIT PRICE AMOUNT Locamon | oG
4 1 ; L0000 EA 00 T
EN i w‘ R
, s cad
; 3 45 L5
_. ' _x, 0
) ) CO0
; : . A,
CASH DISCOUNT: INVOICES UMPAID AFTER 30 DAYS SUBJECT TO 1%% LATE NET MERCHANDISE TOTAL e Ty :
Sh e 00 CHARGE. BOB DEAN SUPPLY RESERVES THE RIGHT TO |SPECIAL CHARGE L2 PICKED BY
PR YRS ul A . .
IF PAYMENT 1S MADE TITLE AND POSSESSION TOjALL ITEMS INVOICED UNTIL |TAX o4
WITHIN OUR TERMS
¢.38 {DEDUCT INVOICE TOTAL DATE

o,
s



MADER ELECTRIC MOTORS
JOHN MADER ENT., INC.

18161 N. Tamiami Trail
N. Ft. Myers, FL 33903
(239) 731-5455
Fax (239) 731-8165

Caatey Machomeoal Seevices
1681 Benchunark Ave
St F

Fr Pyers, £ 31905

Hvdrmeatic 3 TP o, Modsd
tpatier, Ser # 542923

i Stator rewand, dip, & bake
3 isaflons ml

$esi pan.

myEmANe S

Aot e e e i i

PO. NUMBER -

-

DESCRIPTION ,
# SAWIH0M24, 230 volt, 67

i

W.0. NUMBER -~

Labar v diseszemble, rebuild a0 neadsd, install sew pats, arcaroblie. ang

L4z

611, DY

INVOICE

£ Mg AN

" OB LOCATION

Meat 30 Davs

_ AMOUNT °

SUB TOTAL w0
6.0%) SEEE

TAX _
TOTAL

PAST DUE INVOICES ARE SUBJECT TO |- ;
1.5% PER MONTH FINANCE CHARGE. "




R. F. Gridley Co., Inc. Invoice

Industrial Motor Control _
2304 Bruner Lane, Unit #2 Date Invoice #

Fort Myers, FI 33912
Phone: 239 267-0309 Fax 239 267-9797 4/26/2004 |  04-1445

Bill To Ship to
GISTRO, Inc. 11580 Red Hibicus
P O Box 110131 Bonita Springs, FL

Naples, FL 34108

P.O. No. Terms

Due on receipt

Qty Description Rate Amount
2 | New motor starters 445,00 890.00T
6 | Taxable Electrical Labor: 75.00 450.00T

Graley Mechanical could not get the pumps to work.
Mark had to return the next day to work with him and
check out the system. This was not included in toe
original quote, as we were told that hoth of the existing
motors were in working order.

Please remit to the above address. Thank you.

F 632
53,04

We appreciate your business Subtotal $1,340.00
Sales Tax (6.0%) $80.40
Total $1,420.40
Payments/Credits $0.00
Balance Due $1,420.40







CVAVLE 1M INVUVIVE run Tvun BGUANRANICE ’\} /'}-L ! /jf" H . )
B To SEE BINDING TERMS ON REVERSE Jot T EER e 5.%@{%38
o — Rote-Pootar nd A
TEB PO Box 101892« LOCATION
n Cana Coral FL 32004 ' 00
L bLUMBING & ; 38-1767 4 Myars g LAdD
{239} 542-32300 Caps Cural —
DRAIN SERVICE {541) 754-8988 Port Charlotis sewer aDRAN']. . pLuvena [ pumene ]
{(238) 253-1173 Naples INDUSTRIAY excavarion [ orantie[]
CUSTOMERNAME 7 .~ = 7 CUSTOMER NO. - CUSTOMER CLASS
{ D5/ 572 ., ESIDENTIAL |:| COMMERCIAL
BILLING ADDRESS e . "APT. NUMBER ! FEDERAL1.D. #
f; ‘5/ £ ) w,/, /7;9/” L/ / TG ;ﬁ% . 65-CU52811

SS(IF DIFH:F[ENT THAN JBILLING ADDRESS)

ciTty L ;t = HOVINCE ZIP. {;}r CUSTQ:FBC/?“ONEQ N P.O. NUMBER/AUTHORIZATION
s sl ‘M’ *

LA SRy, PR R FILELT

JOB A ™ L CIrY F AT 7

ISTATE/PF{OVINCE ZIP/POSTAL

(SIGNATURE}

WORK ORDER AUTHORIZATION | authorize the services below and agree to pay the amounts indicated. | have read and agree to the terms on the reverse side, including the
limits on Roto-Rooter’s responsibility specified in those terms.

_ (PRINT NAME)
REPAIR CODE |ESTIMATE AND DESCRIPTION OF WORK TO BE PERFORMED (The approximate starting date 1s , and the approximate
completion date is Neither date is guaranteed. Unexpected condltl NS or pro!ems could cause delays.)

_ . ' ] ;"f/a &
t’ Wmm oAl i«'?’f(p?? FERA fvi s,

STV 4

KN IRAL LA L R e,
7 )
i\
: \
T ) ' - W o
ADJUSTMENTS/CHANGES IN WORK TO BE PERFORMED (UseAdditional invoice if needed to describe changes) ¢} <V A

PR P O o, 1 \ - aN
Q—f‘//b@/;&/ - *CﬁC‘)""}’(U“’[J(WFF/ '7’;’(.?(/‘?,,0997‘ ~ ki

TARFE RS
/'l m \ Q l/
RESIDENTIAL GUARANTEE | COMMERCIAL GUARANTEE PAYMENT O
LABOR LABOR . D CASH “w\/ LABOQ@)I %? //
MairvBranchLines (16 months| MainBranch Uines (130 days : ¥ 15C. SUPPLIES § S
Toilet Auger ’ DT days | Toilet Auger [ J24 hours D CHECK NO: < @\ : PARTS $ ; @"
Plumbing Repair [J6 months| Plumbing Repair [To0 days D CREDIT CARD F&/"‘ PROgUCTS $
Plumbing Replacement [ 1year | Plumbing Replacement [Jo0days | [ ] NET 10 DAYS : THER y/
Extended Guarantee  [_]1 year OVER 30 DAYS = LATE CHARGE OF 1 1/2% PER MONTH TAX S
* In the event check Is returned, the COMPANY will charge | _ -
REASON FOR NO GUARANTEE the CUSTOMER A mm . ing Tee. INVOICE TOTAL $ & z. (‘
machey S il G S“%&ya%ev.%zf:a%m*egagms:;'ﬂsg::
compw acknowledge comp}etlon of the above described work which has been done t “my compl’etelsaf’ sfyction . /;
s o “‘ 7 1/’ -J{/I,' \" . > : ;J, / I ;, f’«. o
{SIGNATURE) L {PRINT NAME) Z~ T
m M/u)\/(w(«o
PLEASE PAY FROM THIS INVOICE | A’U\/‘&
. SUGGESTIONS FORAEPAIR/REPLACEMENT | [ T — —
ITEM LOCATION |  FSTMATED Ygg;@fs 0 From”flx-ufs to plumbing emergencies,
pp—— , call the experts at Roto-Rooter:
DISPOSER
o 1-800-GET-ROTO
TOILET
BATHTUB Check our Web site at www.rotorooter.com for| | ¢
SHOWER . N
— discount coupons, helpful hints,
UCET . .
r— fun trivia about plumbing and more!
THER
° Newl!
Complete your Customer Survey on-line!
(Service Technician's Signature) A




MADER ELECTRIC MOTORS |
- JOHN MADER ENT., INC. INVOICE

18161 N. Tamiami Trail . .
N. Ft. Myers, FL 33903
(239) 731-5455 . "
Fax (239) 731-8165 . _ 20412004 12242

.

Fritz
4935-808%
Ve ) L
g P.O. NUMBER W.0. NUMBER TERMS JOB LOCATION
5 - - 45776 Due on Receipt ”
QUANTITY " DESCRIPTION

e Hydromatic Sub. Pump, #84N300M2-4
' zer. 54293, 3hp, 1ph, 175mm, 230volt
Stator rewind, dip, and bake

Ball beanags

Pumip seals e
Feet 10/4 slectric cord

Cord comnector

Epoxy kit

Gallons o1l

Machine work to valuteimapelier for wear-ning
Labor to disassemble, consplete repaic as needed,
mztall new parts. assenihle, and test nm

wwwwm%ﬁ@ﬁ“ﬁw

3 SUB TOTAL
N {6.0%) §71.74
AX

9 Leil T
I Ag 7 S R
Signai M[M,,j/fim»/ R TOTAL

PAST DUE INVOICES ARE SUBJECT TO
1.5% PER MONTH FINANCE CHARGE.

\ o - ]
| \{r—:)/cz; DI \/\;4(7/ ACY TR 1 $119564




' MADER ELECTRIC MOTORS
"~ JOHN MADER ENT., INC. INVOICE

18161 N. Tamiami Trail

N R Ay, FL 33903

(239) 731-5455
Fax (239) 731-8165 4127300 12540

Graley Machanical Services
1681 Benchmark Ave.
Suite F

Ft. Myers, F1 33905

P.O. NUMBER W.O. NUMBER TERMS " JOB LOCATION

s SDiscrion e
Hydromatic 3 HP. punp, Model # S4W300M2-4, 230 volt, 6.7”
wnpeller, Ser, # 54293 ’
1 | Stator rewind, dip. & bake
2 | Gallons ol
Labor to disassemble, rebuild a5 needed, instell new parts, assemble, and
test run
3 ;y{
4
| 34,00
L N s P S SUB TOTAL § e
W ' | 5.0% 25.44
/ %\ .\ i}} o (00%) x| W
b . b ~ ' ‘ - L4 ]
Signature ﬁ ) 7")4\ ,;%(/ - TOTAL $449.44
PAST DUE INVOICES ARE SUBJSECT TO“' ( /,/’/I
1.5% PER MONTH FINANCE CHARGE. — o




MADER ELECTRIC MOTORS
JOHN MADER ENT,, INC.

18161 N. Tamiami Trail
N. Ft. Myers, FL 33903
(239) 731-5455
Fax (239) 731-8165

Graley Mechancal Sej"y‘ic:; )
1681 Benthmark Ave

Suste ¥

Ft. Myers, Pl 33903

. QUANTITY

1 | Stator rewnnd, dip, and bake
2 | Ball besnngs

2 | Pomip seals

40 - | Feet 10/4 power cable

Cord connector

i
1 | Epoxvint
1

DESCRIPTION

Hydromatic Sub. Pump, #54N300M24, ser. 54294
3bp. 1ph, 1750rpm, 230volt, 17ams, 6. Tumg:.

P.O. NUMBER W.0. NUMBER
-

Labor to disesserble, complete repair 55 needad,
~thstall new parts. sssemble, and test run

INVOICE

472072004 12580

JOB LOCATION

Net 30 Dﬁgﬁ

AMOUNT ° .

PAST DUE INVOICES ARE SUBJECT TO
1.5% PER MONTH FINANCE CHARGE.

,{AF" {3 /
s
y / sug ToTAL| 3197230
! - iy -
£ ans s (0.0%)  7ax $0.00
i/'{f,jf /}L/ e $# P
Signature {/ Y ) TOTAL %‘" 230
v 7



R. F. Gridley Co., Inc. Invoice
Industrial Motor Control _
2304 Bruner Lane, Unit #2 Date Invoice #
Fort Myers, FI 33912
Phone: 239 267-0309 Fax 239 267-9797 3/15/2004 |  04-1416
Bill To Ship to
GISTRO 11580 Red Hibiscus
P.O. Box 110131 Bonita Springs, FL
Naples, FL. 34108 Lift Station at East Terry St.
P.O. No. Terms
Vbl Fritz
Qty Description Rate Amount
Hours for {abor - NonTax Electrician ' 75.00 600.00
3/15/04 Control panel found to be in dire need of
replacement. Capacitors are shorted out and wiring is a
shambles. Mark rigged the temp. motor that was there
to run with float switch control only. Fritz requested a
quote on re-wiring the control panel.
3/16/04 Fritz called to report that the temp. motor
would not continue running. Mark found the overloads
on the existing motor starters to be defective, and the
complete motor starters need to be replaced during the
rebuild. Mark returned to the shop, got a loaner motor
starter, returned to the lift station and installed the
loaner to run the pump.
Please remit to the address above. Thank you.
I 6273
“.<) OY
We appreciate your business
Sales Tax (6.0%) $0.00
Total $600.00
Payments/Credits $0.00
Balance Due $600.00




R. F. Gridley Co., Inc.

Invoice
{ndustrial Motor Control _
2304 Bruner Lane, Unit #2 Date Invoice #
Fort Myers, FI 33912
Phone: 239 267-0309 Fax 239 267-9797 1/7/2005 | 051718
Bill To Ship to
GISTRO
PoBar 103)
Najples, SL 3YpF
Project Location P.O. No. Terms
Lift Station Due on receipt
Qty Description Rate Amount
Panel Blew up Leaking bad 01/06/05 Mark talked to him and is going there
01/07/05 @ 8:30 AM
Fritz Holtsberg cell 405-3383  office 495-8089
1/7/05 Arrived ti find Grayley Co. already removing pumps. it appeared that
one pump had failed and took out the run capacitor and circuit breaker during
the failure. Rpelaced both for pump #2. Pump #1 seemed to be working
properly. Circuit Breaker had to be will-called.
3.5| TECH 5 All Service 100.00 350.00T
1145 MFD 440V Capacitor 30.56 30.56T
1} Circuit Breaker QO 30 AMP #1D307 48.19 48.197
[v 220,08
We appreciate your business and prompt payments.
Subtotal $428.75
Sales Tax (6.0%) $25.73
Total $454 .48
Payments/Credits $0.00
Balance Due $454.48




BLENRE T 1I:3an B, 00l
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R. F. Gridley Co., Inc. — "~ Invoice
industnial Motor Control “‘i’é /pg’ g . ‘
’ 47 / )
2304 Bruner Lane, Uit #2 // g /fyf ;} ? Ot v, / Date Invoice #
Fort Myers, FI 33912 -
L _ P - S -~ /212005 05-1742
Phone: 239 267-0309 Fax 239 267-9797 | er
Biil To Ship to
GISTRO
11580 Red Hibiscus
Bonila Springs, FL
Project Location L P.C. No Terms
Lift Station | Verbal
ity Description Rate Amount
Lift station will not ogerate.
2/1/05 By the tme 1 got there the pumip crew had lafi | iound one pump
operaling and saw a blown start capacitor on the other pump. Had 10 will call
one at Grainger. [ installed that and got the pump running only te find the run
capacitor was also defective. Localed one of those, will called and installed it.
Most of the time involved was driving time to get parts. Frit2 claims that rags
were found In the pumps. This would cause high amperages and take out the
caAPUCHors.
TECH 5 All Service 100.00 600.007
MFO Capacitor {Start) #183-227 sy oo 24.30 24.307
Capacitor 45 MFD 370 V S Ve 26.00 26.00T
VP oaw t T
- A - { IOO
/'f/" - ; y el e [ ;Ii ; ?./"%E’Hﬁ"{%.’? Lol Lals & W -t Y .'-f,
IS N e .
£ A8 A o) oA A g
S £ P e ~ -
2090 Y
w280, |
Al O Cdlede 7o Ve ~ ; ~,~,L V ‘ _
T ;" LI (2 PO ok pn Ll et T e
We appreciate your bu';mess
g | Subtotal $650.30
- //4 4}»’1 "/ ' y
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R. E. Gridley Co., Inc. Inveice
Industral Metor Control
2304 Bruner Lane, Unit #2 !“ Datg invoice #
Fort Myers, FI 33912 ! 2/2!,00" 1 051742
Phone. 239 267-0209 Fax 239 2679797 1, <ovY o
gilt To Ship to
GISTRO T
11580 Red Hibiscus
Bonita Springs, FL
i - [ P o v b aitmd
S ! b
Project Location : P.C No. Terms
Lift Station Verbal
Qty Description Rate Smount
Lift station will not ope{a!ew.‘ ) k
2/1/05 By the time | got there the pumyp crew had left | found one purmp
operating and saw a blown start capasiter on the other gump Had to wilt cait
ane at Graitger. | instailed that and 5ot the pump runming only to find the run
capacitor was aiso defective Located one of those, will catled ang instatied d.
Most of the ime involved was driving time to get pars. Fritz ciagims that rags
were found in the pumps. This would cause high amperages and take out the
capacitors
61 TECH § Ali Service 100.00 €00.00T
11 MFD Capactor (Stat) #183-227 24.30 24 307
1 |Capaciter 45 MFD 370V 26.00 26007
Doy i 1’:’ &
) B
P { (\
¥ L,L, - , —” )
L L4 et D S e AOSY
We appresiale your business o o - i
P L Subtotal $650 30
B /,f./«}_{;l '1,»‘ Py L",];;",/ o _

Sales Tax (56.0%})

$39.02

Totai 5639 32
Payments/Credits $-600 00

- . U -
389 32

Balance Due

i
B J




R. F. Gridley Co., Inc. Invoice
Industrial Motor Control :
2304 Bruner Lane, Unit #2 Date Invoice #
Fort Myers, Fl 33912 758
Phone: 239 267-0309 Fax 239 267-9797 21102005 | 05
Bill To Ship to
GISTRO )
11580 Red Hibiscus
Bonita Spﬁngs! FL
Project Location P.O. No. Terms
Due on receipt
aty _ Description | Rate Amount
1 Pump Down thinks its something electrical Mark called will be going to
Gistro. 02/04/05
* jAurived to find pump burned out. Fritz will advise if further service is needed. T o
2| EMERGENCY SERVICE CALL BILLED AT 1.5 NORMAL RATE. 150.001. 300.00
We appreciate your business!
Subtotal $300.00
~ Sales Tax (6.0%) $0.00
Total $300.00
, Payments/Credits $0.00
Balance Due $300.00




Precision Lift Stations, Inc. Invoice
P.O. Box 520811 Dat Invoice #
Longwood, FL 32752 ae g
Phone: 888-831-1199 11/11/2005 5174
Fax: 407-831-1195
Sold to:
Gistro Inc.
Fritz Holzberg
P. O. Box 366762
Bonita Springs, FL. 34736
P.O. No. Terms Completion Date Project
Fritz Holzberg Due upon receipt 11/11/2005 Spring Lakes Front LS
Quantity Description Price Each Amount
1 Install new pumps and control panel at the subject 4,500.00 4,500.00
lift station
P ol
GLETRO
=I0Sk
2257, o
Sales Tax (6.0%) $0.00
Total $4,500.00




gBEMcClosky

GISTRO, INC.

P. O. Box 366762
Bonita Springs, FL 34136

FOR PROFESSIONAL SERVICES RENDERED

PSC Wastewater Certificate Application

03/08/04

03/09/04

03/18/04

03/23/04

03/25/04

03/29/04

K. Cowdery

K. Cowdery

K. Cowdery

K. Cowdery

K. Cowdery

K. Cowdery

DISBURSEMENTS

Copies

1.3 273.00
4.1 861.00
0.6 126.00
2.0 420.00
0.8 168.00
20 420.00

HOURS

TOTAL FOR SERVICES

Long Distance Telephane

Postage

TOTAL FOR DISBURSEMENTS

AMOUNT DUE
LESS CREDITS
AMOUNT DUE THIS INVOICE

FEDERAL |D# 59-1307357

200 EAST BROWARD BOULEVARD
FORT LAUDERDALE, FLORIDA 3330t

POST OFFICE BOX 1900
FORT LAUDERDALE, FLORIDA 33302

TEL (954) 764-6660
FAX (954) 764-4996

April 9, 2004
Invoice No. 768861
File No. 50079-0001

Read documents filed with PSC re application
docket.

Read documents filed with PSC in application
docket; telephone conference with R. Gervasi,
PSC legal; prepare initial memo to client; lengthy
telephone conference with F. Holzberg re docket
and application deficiencies.

Telephone conference with F. Holzberg re
wastewater treatment plant land ownership issues.
Conference call with F. Holzberg and R. Burandt
re litigation and utility issues; prepare legal memo
to client re status of application for certification
pending at PSC.

Lengthy telephone conference with F. Hoizberg;
prepare memo to client re PSC cerificate
application status; telephone conference with P.
Daniel, PSC re application; telephone conference
with F. Holzberg re his contact with Bob Nixon.
Finalize and mail legal opinion to J. F. Holzberg re
status of Gistro, Inc.'s Application for wastewater
certificate pending at the Florida Public Service
Commission,

10.8
$2,268.00

2.00
0.38
0.83

$3.21
$2.271.21

(1,000.00)
$1,271.21

THIS LAW FIRM HAS A LATE CHARGE POLICY SIMILAR TO MOST COMMERCIAL ESTABLISHMENTS. YOU MAY AVOID
IMPOSITION OF THIS LATE CHARGE BY PAYING YOUR INVOICE WITHIN 30 DAYS. THE LATE CHARGE IS 1% OF THE UNPAID
BALANCE PER MONTH.



GISTRO, INC.

Page 2
Invoice No. 768861 April 9, 2004
ATTORNEY SUMMARY
Billed Per Hours
Title Hour Worked Bill Amount
K. Cowdery Of Counsel 210.00 10.80 2,268.00

Total All Attorneys 10.80 $2,268.00



(B McClosky

GISTRO, INC.
P. O. Box 366762
Bonita Springs, FL 34136

FOR PROFESSIONAL SERVICES RENDERED

PSC Wastewater Certificate Application

FEDERAL ID# §9-1307367

200 EAST BROWARD BOULEVARD
FORT LAUDERDALE, FLORIDA 33301

POST OFFICE BOX 1800
FORT LAUDERDALE, FLORIDA 33302

TEL (954) 764-6660
FAX (954) 764-4996

May 19, 2004
Invoice No. 776472
File No. 50079-0001

04/20/04 K. Cowdery 0.8 168.00 Receipt, review, April 12 letter from J. F. Holzberg;
prepare letter to J. F. Holzberg re same.
04/21/04 K. Cowdery 0.4 84.00 Finalize and send response letter to J.F. Holzberg
re status of application.
HOURS 1.2
TOTAL FOR SERVICES $252.00
DISBURSEMENTS
Copies 8.00
Long Distance Telephone 24.32
Postage 1.06
TOTAL FOR DISBURSEMENTS $33.28
AMOUNT DUE THIS INVOICE $285.38
ATTORNEY SUMMARY
Billed Per Hours
Title Hour Worked Bill Amount
K. Cowdery Of Counsel 210.00 1.20 252.00
Total All Attorneys 1.20 $252.00

THIS LAW FIRM HAS A LATE CHARGE POLICY SIMILAR TO MOST COMMERCIAL ESTABLISHMENTS. YOU MAY AVOID
IMPOSITION OF THIS LATE CHARGE BY PAYING YOUR INVOICE WITHIN 30 DAYS. THE LATE CHARGE IS 1% OF THE UNPAID

BALANCE PER MONTH.



FEDERAL ID# 59-1307357
200 EAST BROWARD BOULEVARD
FORT LAUDERDALE, FLORIDA 33301

POST OFFICE BOX 1900

C OS y FORT LAUDERDALE, FLORIDA 33302

TEL (954) 764-6660
FAX (954) 764-4996

GISTRO, INC. July 8, 2004
P. O. Box 366762 Invoice No. 786203
Bonita Springs, FL 34136 File No. 50079-0001

FOR PROFESSIONAL SERVICES RENDERED

PSC Wastewater Certificate Application

06/02/04 K. Cowdery 0.7 147.00 Telephone conference with R. Gervasi, PSC 5/28
re B. Sundstrom request for PSC to intervene in
Forest Mere, Bonita Springs Utilities litigation;
telephone conference with R. Gervasi re PSC
decision to not intervene; telephone conference
with J. F. Holzberg re same; telephone conference
with R. Burandt re same.

06/04/04 K. Cowdery 0.3 63.00 Prepare [etter to F. Holzberg re PSC
developments concerning Forest Mere/BSU
litigation.

06/21/04 K. Cowdery 0.6 126.00 Receipt, read letter from F. Holzberg; telephone
conference with F. Holzberg.

HOURS 1.6
TOTAL FOR SERVICES $336.00

DISBURSEMENTS
Postage 0.74
TOTAL FOR DISBURSEMENTS $0.74
AMOUNT DUE THIS INVOICE $336.74
ATTORNEY SUMMARY
Billed Per Hours

Title Hour Worked Bill Amount
K. Cowdery Of Counsel 210.00 1.60 336.00
Total All Attorneys 1.60 $336.00

THIS LAW FIRM HAS A LATE CHARGE POLICY SIMILAR TO MOST COMMERCIAL ESTABLISHMENTS. YOU MAY AVOID
IMPOSITION OF THIS LATE CHARGE BY PAYING YOUR INVOICE WITHIN 30 DAYS. THE LATE CHARGE IS 1% OF THE UNPAID
BALANCE PER MONTH.



FEDERAL ID# 59-1307357

200 EAST BROWARD BOULEVARD
FORT LAUDERDALE, FLORIDA 33301

POST OFFICE BOX 1800
F C OS y FORT LAUDERDALE, FLORIDA 33302

TEL (954) 764-6660
FAX (954) 764-4996

GISTRO, INC. August 11, 2004
P. O. Box 366762 Invoice No. 792746
Bonita Springs, FL 34136 File No. 50079-0001

FOR PROFESSIONAL SERVICES RENDERED

PSC Wastewater Certificate Application

HOURS 0.0
TOTAL FOR SERVICES $0.00
DISBURSEMENTS
Long Distance Telephone 22.97
TOTAL FOR DISBURSEMENTS $22.97
AMOUNT DUE THIS INVOICE $22.97

THIS LAW FIRM HAS A LATE CHARGE POLICY SIMILAR TO MOST COMMERCIAL ESTABLISHMENTS. YOU MAY AVOID
IMPOSITION OF THIS LATE CHARGE BY PAYING YOUR INVOICE WITHIN 30 DAYS. THE LATE CHARGE IS 1% OF THE UNPAID
BALANCE PER MONTH.



FEDERAL ID# 59-1307357
: 200 EAST BROWARD BOULEVARD
FORT LAUDERDALE, FLOR!DA 33301

POST OFFICE BOX 1900

C OS y FORT LAUDERDALE, FLORIDA 33302

TEL (954) 764-6660
FAX (954) 764-4996

GISTRO, INC. September 14, 2004
P. ©. Box 366762 invoice No. 798600
Bonita Springs, FL 34136 Fite No. 50079-0001

FOR PROFESSIONAL SERVICES RENDERED

PSC Wastewater Certificate Application

08/26/04 K. Cowdery 0.9 189.00 Telephone conference with F. Holzberg re PSC
status and related litigation.
HOURS 0.9
TOTAL FOR SERVICES $189.00
DISBURSEMENTS
TOTAL FOR DISBURSEMENTS $0.00
AMOUNT DUE THIS INVOICE $189.00
ATTORNEY SUMMARY
Billed Per Hours
Title Hour Worked Bill Amount
K. Cowdery Of Counsel 210.00 0.90 189.00
Total All Attorneys 0.90 $189.00

THIS LAW FIRM HAS A LATE CHARGE POLICY SIMILAR TO MOST COMMERCIAL ESTABLISHMENTS. YOU MAY AVOID

IMPOSITION OF THIS LATE CHARGE BY PAYING YOUR INVOICE WITHIN 30 DAYS. THE LATE CHARGE IS 1% OF THE UNPAID
BALANCE PER MONTH.



FEDERAL [D# 59-1307357
200 EAST BROWARD BOULEVARD

: FORT LAUDERDALE, FLORIDA 33301
POST OFFICE BOX 1900
- C OS y FORT LAUDERDALE, FLORIDA 33302

TEL (954) 764-6660
FAX (954) 764-4996

GISTRO, INC. October 13, 2004
P. O. Box 366762 Invoice No. 805472
Bonita Springs, FL 34136 File No. 50079-0001

FOR PROFESSIONAL SERVICES RENDERED

PSC Wastewater Cettificate Application

09/14/04 K. Cowdery 0.2 42.00 Comrespondence with PSC Staff re status of
application; review staffs prior request for
information to complete application.

09/15/04 K. Cowdery 1.0 210.00 Prepare draft response letter to PSC; telephone
conference with F. Holzberg re same;
correspondence with R. Burandt re same.

09/17/04 K. Cowdery 0.4 84.00 Prepare letter to client transmitting draft response
letter to PSC Staff for review and comment.
09/20/04 K. Cowdery 0.3 63.00 Telephone conference with F. Holzberg re letter

responding to PSC information request; revise
letter to PSC re same.

09/23/04 K. Cowdery 0.1 21.00 Correspondence to R. Burandt re his input to
response to PSC request for status update.
09/28/04 K. Cowdery 0.1 21.00 Correspondence P. Brady, PSC, re status update

request response; correspondence to R. Burandt
re status of litigation response.

09/29/04 K. Cowdery 0.8 168.00 Receipt, review, letter from client; prepare
response.
09/30/04 K. Cowdery 0.4 84.00 Finalize letter to client in response to letter of Sept.
28, 2004.
HOURS 33
TOTAL FOR SERVICES $693.00
DISBURSEMENTS
Copies 10.50
Postage 0.74
TOTAL FOR DISBURSEMENTS $11.24
AMOUNT DUE THIS INVOICE $704.24

THIS LAW FIRM HAS A LATE CHARGE POLICY SIMILAR TO MOST COMMERCIAL ESTABLISHMENTS. YOU MAY AVOID
IMPOSITION OF THIS LATE CHARGE BY PAYING YOUR INVOICE WITHIN 30 DAYS. THE LATE CHARGE IS 1% OF THE UNPAID
BALANCE PER MONTH.



GISTRO, INC.

Page 2
Invoice No. 805472

October 13, 2004

ATTORNEY SUMMARY
Billed Per Hours
Title Hour Worked Bill Amount
K. Cowdery Of Counsel 210.00 3.30 693.00
Total All Aftorneys 3.30 $693.00



FEDERAL {D# 59-1307357

200 EAST BROWARD BOULEVARD
FORT LAUDERDALE, FLORIDA 33301

POST OFFICE BOX 1900
C OS y FORT LAUDERDALE, FLORIDA 33302

TEL (954) 764-6660
FAX (954) 764-4996

GISTRO, INC. November 5, 2004
P. O. Box 366762 Invoice No. 810638
Bonita Springs, FL 34136 File No. 50079-0001

FOR PROFESSIONAL SERVICES RENDERED
PSC Wastewater Certificate Application
10/05/04 K. Cowdery 0.3 63.00 Correspondence to R, Burandt re status of

litigation for PSC information request response;
correspondence with P. Brady, PSC, re same.

10/06/04 K. Cowdery 0.6 126.00 Finalize and file letter responding to Staff update
request; correspondence with PSC Staff re same.
10/08/04 K. Cowdery 3.2 672.00 Telephone conferences with F. Holzberg re

completing application; telephone conference with
R. Gervasi, PSC legal, re same; telephone
conference with R. Burandt re litigation status.

10/12/04 C. Kalyvas 0.5 65.00 Telephone conference with attorney regarding title
searches for lift station properties. Research tax
information.

10/12/04 K. Cowdery 3.7 777.00 Telephone conference with P. Brady, PSC, re

additional information needed for cettification
application; telephone conference with F. Holzberg
re information needed for certification application;
telephone conference with C. Kalyvas re title
report for lift station; correspondence with C.
Kalyvas re same; correspondence R. Burandt re
same, letter to F. Holzberg re information needed
for application.

10/13/04 C. Kalyvas 0.3 39.00 Order Ownership & Encumbrance Report on lift
station property.
10/13/04 K. Cowdery 1.0 210.00 Correspondence to P. Brady re noticing etc. of

application; correspondence with R. Burandt re
litigation relative  to PSC application;
correspondence  with R. Gervase, PSC, re
Sheriffs deed question; correspondence with R.
Burandt re same; correspondence with F.
Holzberg re same.

10/18/04 C. Kalyvas 0.4 52.00 Telephone conference with title examiner and
attorney regarding search.
10/18/04 K. Cowdery 0.4 84.00 Telephone conference with C. Kalyvas and title

search person re title commitment for lift station
real property.
10/19/04 C. Kalyvas 0.2 26.00 Conference with attorney and title examiner

THIS LAW FIRM HAS A LATE CHARGE POLICY SIMILAR TO MOST COMMERCIAL ESTABLISHMENTS. YOU MAY AVOID
IMPOSITION OF THIS LATE CHARGE BY PAYING YOUR INVOICE WITHIN 30 DAYS. THE LATE CHARGE IS 1% OF THE UNPAID
BALANCE PER MONTH.



GISTRO, INC.
Invoice No. 810638

10/19/04 K. Cowdery

Page 2
November 5, 2004

regarding titte commitment.

1.7 357.00 Telephone conference with F. Holzberg re status
and titte commitment for - lift station;
correspondence with C. Kalyvas re ordering same.

10/26/04 C. Kalyvas

10/26/04 K. Cowdery

DISBURSEMENTS
Copies
Postage

C. Kalyvas
K. Cowdery
Total All Attorneys

0.2 26.00 Conference with title company regarding status of
commitment.
0.3 63.00 Correspondence with C. Kalyvas re title

commitment on lift station; letter to F. Holzberg re
unjust enrichment and status.

HOURS 136
TOTAL FOR SERVICES $2,728.00
2.50
217
TOTAL FOR DISBURSEMENTS $4.67
AMOUNT DUE THIS INVOICE $2,732.67

ATTORNEY SUMMARY
Billed Per Hours

Title Hour Worked Bill Amount
Paralegal 130.00 1.60 208.00
Of Counsel 210.00 12.00 2,520.00
13.60 $2,728.00

Minu ¢ l}ig«xo wo i
not fer Diet 620640 S o.g k800
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FEDERAL ID# 63-1307357

200 EAST BROWARD BOULEVARD
FORT LAUDERDALE, FLORIDA 33301

POST OFFICE BOX 1300
FORT LAUDERDALE, FLORIDA 33302

TEL (954) 764-6660
FAX (954) 764-4996

GISTRO, INC. December 10, 2004
P. O. Box 366762 Invoice No. 816540
Bonita Springs, FL 34136 File No. 50079-0001

FOR PROFESSIONAL SERVICES RENDERED

PSC Wastewater Certificate Application

11/03/04 K. Cowdery 0.2 42.00 Receipt, read letter from F. Holzberg.

11/04/04 K. Cowdery 1.2 252.00 Receipt, review circuit court documents from
client; review collection system Sherrif's' deed and
surveys for collection system; letter to client re
application and information needed.

HOURS 1.4

TOTAL FOR SERVICES $294.00
DISBURSEMENTS
Copies 1.25
Long Distance Telephone 117.62
Postage 0.74
TOTAL FOR DISBURSEMENTS $119.61
AMOUNT DUE THIS INVOICE $413.61
ATTORNEY SUMMARY
Billed Per Hours

Title Hour Worked Bill Amount
K. Cowdery Of Counsel 210.00 1.40 294.00
Total All Attorneys 1.40 $294.00

THIS LAW FIRM HAS A LATE CHARGE POLICY SIMILAR TO MOST COMMERCIAL ESTABLISHMENTS. YOU MAY AVOID

IMPOSITION OF THIS LATE CHARGE BY PAYING YOUR INVOICE WITHIN 30 DAYS. THE LATE CHARGE IS 1% OF THE UNPAID
BALANCE PER MONTH.



McClosky

GISTRO, INC.

P. O. Box 366762
Bonita Springs, FL 34136

FOR PROFESSIONAL SERVICES RENDERED

PSC Wastewater Certificate Application

FEDERAL 1D# §9-1307357

200 EAST BROWARD BOULEVARD
FORT LAUDERDALE, FLORIDA 33301

POST OFFICE BOX 1900
FORT LAURERDALE, FLORIDA 33302

TEL (954) 764-6660
FAX (954) 764-4996

January 14, 2005
Invoice No. 822490
File No. 50079-0001

12/03/04 C. Kalyvas 0.9 117.00 Review and revise commitment. Conference with
title company regarding revisions, missing copies
and copy of exception not listed on the
commitment.

12/08/04 C. Kalyvas 0.3 39.00 Review revised commitment. Conference with
attorney regarding commitment.

12/09/04 C. Kalyvas 0.3 39.00 Review requirements in commitment.

12/10/04 K. Cowdery 0.8 168.00 Receipt,review title commitment for lift station;
prepare letter to client re same and re information
needed for application.

12/13/04 C. Kalyvas 0.2 26.00 Review Schedule B-l items. Conference with
underwriting counsel.

12/13/04 K. Cowdery 0.2 42.00 Receipt, review lift station titte commitment;
correspondence to client re same.

12/14/04 K. Cowdery 1.7 357.00 Receiptreview, letter and documents from F.
Holzberg; prepare letter to F. Holzberg re
information he sent and information PSC
requested.

HOURS 4.4
TOTAL FOR SERVICES $788.00
DISBURSEMENTS
Copies 33.75
Long Distance Telephone 0.37
Postage 1.75
12/15/04 Check Disbursement - Chicago Title Ins. Co./Plain Search & Exam Fee 250.00
TOTAL FOR DISBURSEMENTS $285.87
AMGOUNT DUE THIS INVOICE $1,073.87

THIS LAW FIRM HAS A LATE CHARGE POLICY SIMILAR TO MOST COMMERCIAL ESTABLISHMENTS. YOU MAY AVOID

IMPOSITION OF THIS LATE CHARGE BY PAYING YOUR INVCICE WITHIN 30 DAYS. THE LATE CHARGE IS 1% OF THE UNPAID
BALANCE PER MONTH.



GISTRO, INC.
Invoice No. 822490

C. Kalyvas
K. Cowdery
Totatl All Attorneys

ATTORNEY SUMMARY
Billed Per
Title Hour
Paralegal 130.00
Of Counsel 210.00

Page 2
January 14, 2005

Hours
Worked Bill Amount
1.70 221.00
2.70 567.00
4.40 $788.00



(il McClosky

GISTRO, INC.
P. O. Box 366762
Bonita Springs, FL 34136

FOR PROFESSIONAL SERVICES RENDERED

PSC Wastewater Certificate Application

01/03/05 K. Cowdery 0.1
{o same.
01/04/05 K. Cowdery 0.6
of litigation/
HOURS
TOTAL FOR SERVICES
DISBURSEMENTS
Fax Charges
Long Distance Telephone
TOTAL FOR DISBURSEMENTS
AMOUNT DUE THIS INVOICE
ATTORNEY SUMMARY
Billed Per
Title Hour
K. Cowdery Of Counsel 225.00

Total All Attorneys

FEDERAL (D# 69-1307357

200 EAST BROWARD BOULEVARD
FORT LAUDERDALE, FLORIDA 33301

POST OFFICE BOX 1900
FORT LAUDERDALE, FLORIDA 33302

TEL (954) 764-6660
FAX (954) 764-4996

February 9, 2005
Invoice No. 828000
File No. 50079-0001

22.50 Receipt, review letters from F. Holzberg; respond

135.00 Telephone conference with F. Holzberg re status

0.7
$157.50
10.00
9.96
$19.96
$177.46

Hours

Worked Bill Amount
0.70 157.50
0.70 $157.50

THIS LAW FIRM HAS A LATE CHARGE POLICY SIMILAR TO MOST COMMERCIAL ESTABLISHMENTS. YOU MAY AVOID
IMPOSITION OF THIS LATE CHARGE BY PAYING YOUR INVOICE WITHIN 30 DAYS. THE LATE CHARGE IS 1% OF THE UNPAID
BALANCE PER MONTH.



FEDERAL 1D# §9-1307357

200 EAST BROWARD BOULEVARD
FORT LAUDERDALE, FLORIDA 33301

POST OFFICE BOX 1900
FORT LAUDERDALE, FLORIDA 33302

TEL (954) 764-6660
FAX (954) 764-4996

GISTRO, INC. April 14, 2005
P. O. Box 366762 Invoice No. 840527
Bonita Springs, FL 34136 File No. 50079-0001

FOR PROFESSIONAL SERVICES RENDERED
PSC Wastewater Certificate Application

03/01/05 K. Cowdery 2.0 450.00 Prepare letter to client re noticing requirements
and Staff requested information; prepare letter to
PSC responding to some information requests and
requesting 60 day noticing list; prepare draft
customer notice and transmit to client.

03/03/05 K. Cowdery 0.6 135.00 Telephone conference with F. Holzberg re PSC
application for certification; telephone conference
with R. Gervasi re court order on ownership of
facilities.

03/07/05 K. Cowdery 1.1 247.50 Telephone conference with F. Holzberg re
finalizing application for certificate and legal
description for noticing; receipt, review legal
description for customer notice.

03/09/05 K. Cowdery 1.5 337.50 Telephone conference with F. Holzberg re
application for certificate; telephone conference
with P. Daniel re same and re rates; telephone
conference with R. Gervasi re status and noticing;
prepare letter to client.

03/10/05 K. Cowdery 0.7 157.50 Telephone conference with F. Holzberg re
application for cettification.

03/11/05 K. Cowdery 0.7 157.50 Telephone conference with F. Holzberg re PSC
application for certification.

03/14/05 K. Cowdery 0.8 180.00 Telephone conference with F. Holzberg re hiring

rate consultant and re rates and certificate
application issues.

03/15/05 K. Cowdery 0.4 90.00 Telephone conference with F. Holzberg re setting
rates; fax rate schedules and document to same.
03/22/05 K. Cowdery 1.2 270.00 Receipt recorded legal description from court and

prepare customer notice; correspondence to R.
Redemann et. al. at PSC with copy of proposed
customer notice; telephone conference with R.
Redemann re questions concerning legal
description; receipt and review maps from PSC re
same; correspandence to F. Holzberg re same.
03/23/05 K. Cowdery 0.4 80.00 Receipt, review, letter from F. Holzberg; prepare
and send response letter re information needed

THIS LAW FIRM HAS A LATE CHARGE POLICY SIMILAR TO MOST COMMERCIAL ESTABLISHMENTS. YOU MAY AVOID
IMPOSITION OF THIS LATE CHARGE BY PAYING YOUR INVOICE WITHIN 30 DAYS. THE LATE CHARGE IS 1% OF THE UNPAID
BALANCE PER MONTH.



GISTRO, INC.
Invoice No. 840527

Page 2
April 14, 2005

and re questions re legal description for territory
served.

03/24/05 K. Cowdery 2.2 495.00 Telephone conferences with F. Holzberg re
certificate application, rates, and legal description
for territory for notice of application; prepare draft
letter to PSC re same.

03/28/05 K. Cowdery 1.7 382.50 Prepare letter to PSC re notice of application etc;
telephone conference with R. Redemann re legal
description.

03/29/05 K. Cowdery 42 945.00 Telephone conference with R. Redemann, PSC,
re legal description for customer notice; telephone
conference with R. Gervasi re Sheriffs deed;
Review ownership deeds re ownership of
collection system and lift stations; prepare draft
letter to PSC; prepare letter to client re status of
application and issues.

03/30/05 K. Cowdery 35 787.50 Review PSC filings and prepare letter to client re
status of case.

21.0
TOTAL FOR SERVICES $4,725.00
DISBURSEMENTS
Copies 15.50
Fax Charges 36.25
Long Distance Telephone 29.50
Messenger Delivery 11.67
Postage 2.20
03/16/05 Check Disbursement - Clerk of Court, Lee County 2.00
03/31/05 Check Disbursement - City Blue Reprographics 7.10
TOTAL FOR DISBURSEMENTS $104 22
AMOUNT DUE THIS INVOICE $4,829.22
ATTORNEY SUMMARY
Billed Per Hours
Title Hour Worked Bill Amount
K. Cowdery Of Counsel 225.00 21.00 4,725.00
Total All Attorneys 21.00 $4,725.00

| |



FEDERAL ID# §9-1307357

200 EAST BROWARD BOULEVARD
FORT LAUDERDALE, FLORIDA 33301

POST OFFICE BOX 1800
FORT LAUDERDALE, FLORIDA 33302

TEL (954) 764-6660
FAX (954) 764-4996

GISTRO, INC. May 6, 2005
P. O. Box 366762 Invoice No. 846673
Bonita Springs, FL 34136 File No. 50079-0001
FOR PROFESSIONAL SERVICES RENDERED
PSC Wastewater Certificate Application
04/01/05 K. Cowdery 0.4 90.00 Correspondence to PSC requesting approval of

attached proposed notice of application; telephone
conference with R. Redemann approving notice of
application; Prepare- letter to F. Holzberg re
customer noticing and legal description.

04/06/05 K. Cowdery 0.9 202.50 Receipt, review letter from F. Holzberg; review
court documents re ownership issues.

04/11/05 K. Cowdery 0.1 22.50 Review PSC website re new time schedule.

04/19/05 K. Cowdery 0.6 135.00 Telephone conference with F. Holzberg re
certification case.

04/20/05 K. Cowdery 1.1 247.50 Transmittal of Sheriff deed documents to F.

Holzberg; finalize and send letter to client re
issues in case and with draft letter to R. Gervasi to
review re rates.

04/25/05 K. Cowdery 23 517.50 Prepare letter to F. Holzberg re ownership issues.
04/26/05 K. Cowdery 1.0 225.00 Research and prepare letter to F. Holzberg re
ownership issues.
04/27/05 K. Cowdery 0.8 180.00 Finalize letter to F. Holzberg re ownership issues.
04/28/05 K. Cowdery 0.2 45.00 Telephone conference with F. Holzberg re
customer noticing.
HOURS 7.4
TOTAL FOR SERVICES $1,665.00
DISBURSEMENTS
Copies 5.50
Fax Charges 30.00
Messenger Delivery 10.05
Postage 1.20
TOTAL FOR DISBURSEMENTS $46.75
AMOUNT DUE THIS INVOICE $1,711.75

THIS LAW FIRM HAS A LATE CHARGE POLICY SIMILAR TO MOST COMMERCIAL ESTABLISHMENTS. YOU MAY AVOID

IMPOSITION OF THIS LATE CHARGE BY PAYING YOUR INVOICE WITHIN 30 DAYS. THE LATE CHARGE IS 1% OF THE UNPAID
BALANCE PER MONTH. ‘



GISTRO, INC.
Invoice No. 846673

K. Cowdery
Total All Attorneys

ATTORNEY SUMMARY
Billed Per
Title Hour
Of Counsel 225.00

Page 2
May 6, 2005

Hours
Worked Bill Amount
7.40 1,665.00
7.40 $1,665.00



FEDERAL ID# 69-1307357

200 EAST BROWARD BOULEVARD
FORT LAUDERDALE, FLORIDA 33301

POST OFFICE BOX 1900
FORT LAUDERDALE, FLORIDA 33302
TEL (954) 764-6660
FAX (954) 764-4996
GISTRO, INC. June 13, 2005
P. O. Box 366762 Invoice No. 853985
Bonita Springs, FL 34136 File No. 50079-0001
FOR PROFESSIONAL SERVICES RENDERED
PSC Wastewater Certificate Application
05/05/05 K. Cowdery 0.2 4500 Correspondence with PSC Staff re changing

agenda date to Aug. 30; correspondence with F.
Holzberg re same.

05/12/05 K. Cowdery 0.2 4500 Telephone conference with F. Holzberg re status
of certification docket.

05/19/05 K. Cowdery 0.7 157.50 Telephone conference with F. Holzberg re status
of certificate application.

05/20/05 K. Cowdery 0.3 67.50 Receipt, review, respond to F. Holzberg letter of
5/19/05.

05/24/05 K. Cowdery 0.5 112.50 Telephone conferences with F. Holzberg re
application for certificate for Gistro, Inc.

05/25/05 K. Cowdery 0.3 67.50 Receipt, read, correspondence from F. Holzberg;

finalize and file letter to R. Gervasi, and utility
tariffs; finalize and sent to F. Holzberg letter re
ownership issues.

05/26/05 K. Cowdery 0.2 45.00 Telephone conference with R. Gervasi, PSC, re
noticing; prepare and send letter to R. Redemann,
PSC, requesting updated 60 day noticing list
{governmental entities and utilities).

HOURS 2.4
TOTAL FOR SERVICES $540.00
DISBURSEMENTS
Copies 135.50
Fax Charges 5.00
Long Distance Telephone 6.19
Messenger Delivery 11.65
Postage , 2.72
TOTAL FOR DISBURSEMENTS $161.06
AMOUNT DUE THIS INVOICE $701.06

THIS LAW FIRM HAS A LATE CHARGE POLICY SIMILAR TO MOST COMMERCIAL ESTABLISHMENTS. YOU MAY AVOID
IMPOSITION OF THIS LATE CHARGE BY PAYING YOUR INVOICE WITHIN 30 DAYS. THE LATE CHARGE 1S 1% OF THE UNPAID
BALANCE PER MONTH.



GISTRO, INC. Page 2

Invoice No. 853985 June 13, 2005
ATTORNEY SUMMARY
Billed Per Hours
Title Hour Worked Bill Amount
K. Cowdery Of Counsel 225.00 2.40 540.00

Total All Attorneys 2.40 $640.00



FEDERAL ID# §9-1307357

200 EAST BROWARD BOULEVARD
FORT LAUDERDALE, FLORIDA 33301

POST OFFICE BOX 1900
FORT LAUDERDALE, FLORIDA 33302

TEL (954) 764-6660

FAX (954) 764-4996
GISTRO, INC. July 12, 2005
P. O. Box 366762 invoice No, 859848
Bonita Springs, FL 34136 File No. 50079-0001

FOR PROFESSIONAL SERVICES RENDERED

PSC Wastewater Certificate Application

06/07/05 K. Cowdery _ Telephone conferehce with F. Holzberg re noticing
0.l 22.500f certificate application

06/21/05 K. Cowdery

Oen H5.00 prepare letter to F. Holzberg re letter of May 31

and customer list for noticing.
06/22/05 K. Cowdery 0.4 90.00 Receipt, review June 21, 2005 letter from F.
Holzberg and attachments; telephone conference
with F. Holzberg re list of multifamily customers for

noticing
HOURS oS 3
TOTAL FOR SERVICES d §157,50 sa8780
DISBURSEMENTS

Copies 0.25
Fax Charges 2.50
Long Distance Telephone 3241
Postage 0.37

TOTAL FOR DISBURSEMENTS $35.53

AMOUNT DUE THIS INVOICE ~§$373:63—

£193.03
OL,WCUM urnelatrel

to ui{f,«%iaﬁuvn a{ﬂk(/'

THIS LAW FIRM HAS A LATE CHARGE POLICY SIMILAR TO MOST COMMERCIAL ESTABLISHMENTS. YOU MAY AVOID

IMPOSITION OF THIS LATE CHARGE BY PAYING YOUR INVOICE WITHIN 30 DAYS. THE LATE CHARGE IS 1% OF THE UNPAID
BALANCE PER MONTH.



GISTRO, INC.
Invoice No. 850848

K. Cowdery
Total All Attorneys

Page 2
July 12, 2005
ATTORNEY SUMMARY
Billed Per Hours
Title Hour Worked Bill Amount
Of Counsel 225.00 1.50

o-.‘7 15 | 93.0

3



GISTRO, INC.

P. O. Box 366762
Bonita Springs, FL 34136

FOR PROFESSIONAL SERVICES RENDERED

PSC Wastewater Certificate Application

07/07/05
07/18/05

07/19/05

07/20/05

07/25/05

07/26/05

07/27/05

07/28/05

07/29/05

07/29/05

K. Cowdery
K. Cowdery

K. Cowdery

K. Cowdery

K. Cowdery

K. Cowdery

K. Cowdery

K. Cowdery

K. Cowdery

C. Breiner

0.2

0.4

1.3

0.4

0.7

0.2

0.2

2.5

1.1

1.0

45.00

90.00

292.50

90.00

167.50

45.00

45.00

562.50

247.50

200.00

FEDERAL ID# 5§9-1307357

200 EAST BROWARD BOULEVARD
FORT LAUDERDALE, FLORIDA 33301

POST OFFICE BOX 1900
FORT LAUDERDALE, FLORIDA 33302

TEL (954) 764-6660
FAX (954) 764-4996

August 17, 2005
Invoice No. 867887
File No. 50079-0001

Prepare and send letter to F. Holzberg re noticing
list.

Receipt, review customer noticing list from F.
Holzberg; prepare letters to same re same.
Receipt, review letter from F. Holzberg; telephone
conference with F. Holzberg re same; Prepare
letter to F. Holzberg re same; receipt, review, copy
of letter from Robert Burandt to County Attorney
forwarded from FPSC; telephone conference with
P. Brady, PSC, re same and concerning status of
docket, and noticing.

Prepare affidavit of noticing customers and county
agencies and utilities and file with PSC.

Telephone conference with P. Daniel, PSC, re
noticing and customer questions/ objections;
telephone conferences with peaple receiving
notice: Tamiami Utilities; Pine Cove in Lee County.
Telephone conference with K. Kessinger,
customer, re notice of application.

Telephone conference with customer (S. Dipas)
who received notice of application; telephone
conference with M. Fredman, Esq., re Bonita
Springs Utility no abjection

Correspondence from CP. Brady, PSC, requesting
response to letter from S. de Paz; prepare draft
respanse letter to S. de Paz; transmittal to client re
same.

Telephone conferences with F. Holzberg re
response letter to Mr. de Paz letter to PSC;
telephone conference with C. Breiner, Esq., re real
property/ftitle questions; receipt, review, file
affidavit of publication of notice of application.
Review letter regarding ownership of utility
system; conference call regarding issues.

8.0

THIS LAW FIRM HAS A LATE CHARGE POLICY SIMILAR TO MOST COMMERCIAL ESTABLISHMENTS. YOU MAY AVOID
IMPOSITION OF THIS LATE CHARGE BY PAYING YOUR INVOICE WITHIN 30 DAYS. THE LATE CHARGE IS 1% OF THE UNPAID
BALANCE PER MONTH.



GISTRO, INC.
Invoice No. 867887

TOTAL FOR SERVICES

DISBURSEMENTS
' Messenger Delivery
Postage

07/21/05 FedEX FedEx Airbill #:790091973620 Rcvd. on:07/21/2005 Shipped To:Gladys

Vanderbeck Signed By:J.BADER
07/29/05 Check Disbursement - News-Press

TOTAL FOR DISBURSEMENTS

AMOUNT DUE THIS INVOICE

C. Breiner
K. Cowdery
Total All Attorneys

ATTORNEY SUMMARY
Billed Per
Title Hour
Partner 200.00
Of Counsel 225.00

Page 2

August 17, 2005

$1,775.00
11.67
79.55
6.46
47.82
$145.50
$1,920.50

Hours
Worked Bill Amount
1.00 200.00
7.00 1,575.00
8.00 $1,775.00

| |



(88 McClosky

GISTRO, INC.
P. O. Box 366762
Bonita Springs, FL 34136

FOR PROFESSIONAL SERVICES RENDERED
PSC Wastewater Certificate Application

08/08/05 K. Cowdery 04 90.00

08/12/05 K. Cowdery 0.2 45.00
08/15/05 K. Cowdery 0.2 45.00
08/23/05 K. Cowdery 0.8 180.00

FEDERAL ID# §9-1307357

200 EAST BROWARD BOULEVARD
FORT LAUDERDALE, FLORIDA 33301

POST OFFICE BOX 1800
FORT LAUDERDALE, FLORIDA 33302

TEL (954) 764-6660
FAX (954) 764-4996

September 12, 2005
Invoice No. 872936
File No. 50079-0001

Read three letters of objection from proposed
customers and transmit same to F. Holzberg; re-
notice to Southwest Regional Planning Office;
telephone conference with E. Schaefer re notice of
application.

Receipt, review, transmit to client letters of
objection to certificate application.

Receipt, review, letter of objection to certification
from S. Fritze; prepare transmittal letter of same to
F. Holzberg; telephone conference with R.
Gervasi, PSC, re objection letters.

Receipt, review two page letter re Aug. , 2005
incidents from F. Holzberg; telephone conference
with F. Holzberg re same; telephone conference
with R. Gervasi re status of customer objections.

HOURS 1.6
TOTAL FOR SERVICES $360.00
DISBURSEMENTS
Copies 101.00
Fax Charges 17.50
Long Distance Telephone 21.94
Messenger Delivery 11.67
Postage 2.63
TOTAL FOR DISBURSEMENTS $154.74
AMOUNT DUE THIS INVOICE $514.74

THIS LAW FIRM HAS A LATE CHARGE POLICY SIMILAR TO MOST COMMERCIAL ESTABLISHMENTS. YOU MAY AVOID
IMPOSITION OF THIS LATE CHARGE BY PAYING YOUR INVOICE WITHIN 30 DAYS. THE LATE CHARGE IS 1% OF THE UNPAID

BALANCE PER MONTH.



GISTRO, INC.
Invoice No. 872936

Page 2
September 12, 2005

ATTORNEY SUMMARY
Bitled Per
Title Hour
K. Cowdery Of Counsel 225.00

Total All Attorneys

Hours
Worked Bilt Amount
1.60 360.00

1.60 - $360.00



(liMcClosky

GISTRO, INC.

P. O. Box 366762
Bonita Springs, FL 34136

FOR PROFESSIONAL SERVICES RENDERED

PSC Wastewater Certificate Application

09/16/05

09/19/05

09/21/05

09/22/05

09/28/05

K. Cowdery

K. Cowdery

K. Cowdery

K. Cowdery

K. Cowdery

DISBURSEMENTS

K. Cowdery

Copies

Fax Charges

Long Distance Telephone

Postage

Total All Attorneys

FEDERAL ID# 59-1307357

200 EAST BROWARD BOULEVARD
FORT LAUDERDALE, FLORIDA 333

POST OFFICE BOX 1900
FORT LAUDERDALE, FLORIDA 33302

TEL (954) 764-6660
FAX (954) 764-4996

October 10, 2005
invoice No. 879528
File No. 50079-0001

0.1 22.50 Telephone conference with F. Holzberg re status
of case.

0.2 45.00 Receipt, review ten letters sent by PSC to
certificate objectors; prepare transmittal letter to F.
Holzberg re same.

0.2 45.00 Telephone conference with F. Holzberg re status
of case and license tag issue.

0.2 45.00 Receipt, review letter from P. Hubert and PSC re
objection to application; transmittal letter to F.
Holzberg re same and re response to S. Fritze
letter.

0.8 180.00 Receipt, review letter from F. Holzberg re issues in
case; prepare and transmit response letter re
same.

HOURS 1.5
TOTAL FOR SERVICES $337.50
8.00
11.25
39.47
2.63
TOTAL FOR DISBURSEMENTS $61.35
AMOUNT DUE THIS INVOICE $398.85

ATTORNEY SUMMARY
Billed Per Hours

Title Hour Worked Bill Amount
Of Counsel 225.00 1.50 337.50
1.50 $337.50

THIS LAW FIRM HAS A LATE CHARGE POLICY SIMILAR TO MOST COMMERCIAL ESTABLISHMENTS. YOU MAY AVOID
IMPOSITION OF THIS LATE CHARGE BY PAYING YOUR INVOICE WITHIN 30 DAYS. THE LATE CHARGE IS 1% OF THE UNPAID
BALANCE PER MONTH.

| 1



(il McClosky

GISTRO, INC.
P. O. Box 366762
Bonita Springs, FL 34136

FOR PROFESSIONAL SERVICES RENDERED

PSC Wastewater Certificate Application

FEDERAL ID#59-1307357

200 EAST BROWARD BOULEVARD
FORT LAUDERDALE, FLORIDA 33301

POST OFFICE BOX 1800
FORT LAUDERDALE, FLORIDA 33302

TEL {954) 764-6660
FAX (954} 764-4996

November 9, 2005
Invoice No. 885491
File No. 50079-0001

10/03/05 K. Cowdery 0.1 22.50 Receipt, review, transmittal letter to F. Holzberg re
letter from PSC to customer objection ietter.
10/13/05 K. Cowdery 0.3 67.50 Receipt, review, letter from F. Holzberg re
certificate docket issues; prepare response letter
to F. Holzberg re same.
HOURS 0.4
TOTAL FOR SERVICES $90.00
DISBURSEMENTS
Copies 1.00
Postage 0.74
TOTAL FOR DISBURSEMENTS $1.74
AMOUNT DUE THIS INVOICE $91.74
ATTORNEY SUMMARY
Billed Per Hours
Title Hour Worked Bill Amount
K. Cowdery Of Counsel 225.00 0.40 90.00
Total All Attorneys 0.40 $90.00

THIS LAW FIRM HAS A LATE CHARGE POLICY SIMILAR TO MOST COMMERCIAL ESTABLISHMENTS. YOU MAY AVOID
IMPOSITION OF THIS LATE CHARGE BY PAYING YOUR INVOICE WITHIN 30 DAYS. THE LATE CHARGE IS 1% OF THE UNPAID

BALANCE PER MONTH.



FEDERAL ID# 59-1307357

200 EAST BROWARD BOULEVARD
FORT LAUDERDALE, FLORIDA 33301

POST OFFICE BOX 1900

C OS y FORT LAUDERDALE, FLORIDA 33302
TEL (954) 764-6660

FAX (954) 764-4996

GISTRO, INC. December 8, 2005
P. O. Box 366762 Invoice No. 891185
Bonita Springs, FL 34136 File No. 50079-0001

FOR PROFESSIONAL SERVICES RENDERED

PSC Wastewater Certificate Application

11/01/05 K. Cowdery 0.2 45.00 Telephone conference with R. Gervasi, PSC, re
setting docket for hearing.

11/02/05 K. Cowdery 0.6 135.00 Review file in re telephone conference with R.
Gervasi and customer hearing request.

11/03/05 K. Cowdery 0.4 90.00 Legal research re settlement agreement.

11/07/05 K. Cowdery 1.9 427.50 Telephone conference with F. Holzberg re status

of case; cormrespondence to R. Burandt re
documents; correspondence to F. Holzberg re
status of case.

11/14/05 K. Cowdery 0.8 180.00 Receipt, review, letter from R. Gervasi, PSC to T.
and D. Equitz re formal hearing telephone call;
legal research; prepare letter to R. Gervasi re
same; prepare transmittal letter to F. Holzberg re
same.

11/22/05 K. Cowdery 0.2 45.00 Telephone conference with R. Gervasi re status of
determining whether a hearing has been
requested by Equitzes.

11/28/05 K. Cowdery 0.3 67.50 Receipt, review, transmittal letter to client re Order
Establishing Procedure.

HOURS 4.4
TOTAL FOR SERVICES $990.00
DISBURSEMENTS
Copies 3.00
Long Distance Telephone 2.16
Postage 1.71
TOTAL FOR DISBURSEMENTS $6.87
AMOUNT DUE THIS INVOICE $996.87

THIS LAW FIRM HAS A LATE CHARGE POLICY SIMILAR TO MOST COMMERCIAL ESTABLISHMENTS. YOU MAY AVOID
IMPOSITION OF THIS LATE CHARGE BY PAYING YOUR INVOICE WITHIN 30 DAYS. THE LATE CHARGE 1S 1% OF THE UNPAID
BALANCE PER MONTH.



GISTRO, INC.
Invoice No. 891185

K. Cowdery
Total All Attorneys

ATTORNEY SUMMARY
Billed Per
Title Hour
Of Counsel 225.00

Page 2
December 8, 2005

Hours
Worked Bill Amount
4.40 990.00

4.40 $990.00

| |



FEDERAL ID# §9-1307357

200 EAST BROWARD BOULEVARD
FORT LAUDERDALE, FLORIDA 33301

POST OFFICE BOX 1900
FORT LAUDERDALE, FLORIDA 33302

TEL (954) 764-6660
FAX (954) 764-4996

GISTRO, INC. January 10, 2006
P. O. Box 366762 Invoice No. 897558
Bonita Springs, FL 34136 File No. 50079-0001

FOR PROFESSIONAL SERVICES RENDERED

PSC Wastewater Certificate Application

12/06/05 K. Cowdery 0.3 67.50 Telephone conference with F. Holzberg re status
of docket.
12/08/05 K. Cowdery 0.2 45.00 Telephone conference with R. Gervasi re status of

Equitz possible hearing and re Staff request for

conference call with F. Holzberg in January.

12/13/05 K. Cowdery 0.2 45.00 Receipt, review, correspondence from R. Gervasi
re withdrawal of hearing request by customer;
correspondence to F. Holzberg re same and re
previous telephone conference with R. Gervasi
conceming settlement agreement,

12/15/05 K. Cowdery 0.2 45.00 Cormrespondence with F. Holzberg re docket
status; telephone conference with M. Friedman,
BSU attorney, re BSU not participating in hearing
and cancellation of hearing.

12/28/05 K. Cowdery 04 90.00 Receipt, review, letter from client; review revised
case assignment scheduling record and prepare
response letter.

'HOURS 1.3

TOTAL FOR SERVICES $292.50
DISBURSEMENTS

Copies 2.25
Long Distance Telephone 17.06
Postage 0.37
TOTAL FOR DISBURSEMENTS $19.68
AMOUNT DUE THIS INVOICE $312.18

THIS LAW FIRM HAS A LATE CHARGE POLICY SIMILAR TO MOST COMMERCIAL ESTABLISHMENTS. YOU MAY AVOID
IMPOSITION OF THIS LATE CHARGE BY PAYING YOUR INVOICE WITHIN 30 DAYS. THE LATE CHARGE IS 1% OF THE UNPAID
BALANCE PER MONTH.



GISTRO, INC.
Invoice No. 897558

K. Cowdery
Total All Attorneys

ATTORNEY SUMMARY
Billed Per
Title Hour
Of Counsel 225.00

Page 2
January 10, 2006

Hours
Worked Bill Amount
1.30 292.50
1.30 $292.50



