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@R‘G‘MAL REFGEIT PATE

Raquel Tully 627 FEB 157006
From: Paulalsler o 13
Sent:  Tuesday, February 14, 2006 2:50 PM . ey (.:Z
G my o
To: Raquel Tully C“}E“‘ <o 1
Subject: RE: 050620-Tl and 050621-TI ; = o 5
B o
Both checks should be deposited in the PSC Trust Fund for collection costs. Thanks. XE = ~
» R e
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o ()

From: Raquel Tully

Sent: Tuesday, February 14, 2006 2:37 PM
To: Paula Isler

Subject:

We received two checks for $100.00 on Dockets 050620 and 050621. Please tell me how you would like me to
deposit these checks
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2/14/2006 FPSE-COMMISSION CLERK



