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From: Paula Mer 
Sent: 

To: Raquel Tulty 

Subject: RE: 

Friday, February 24, 2006 2:21 PM 

It is TX750, Docket No. 050628-TX, and is a $1 00 settlement. The $ 4  00 should be deposited in the PSC Trust Fund for collection 
costs. Please provide Records proof of payment for the docket file. Thanks. H 

From: Raquel Tully 
Sent: Friday, February 24, 2006 2:16 PM 
To: Paula Isler 
Subject: RE: 

The name on the check is Smart Network Solutions Communications Corp, I do not have a docket number.. 

From: Paula Isler 
Sent: Friday, February 24, 2006 2:14 PM 
To: Raquel Tully 
Subject: RE: 

30 you have a docket number or company name? I don’t know what to look up just by that number 

From: Raquel TuNy 
Sent: Friday, February 24, 2006 2:07 PM 
To: Paula Mer  
5ubject: 

iNe received a check for $100.00 on Order No. PSC-0101-AS-TX, can I accept this check and if so. How should I break it up? 
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