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Raquel Tully B L Q;RIG’NAQL ASONY3-TT

From: Paulalsler
Sent: Monday, April 10, 2006 3:57 PM

To: Raquel Tully
Subject: RE:

Each are settlements and should be deposited in the PSC Trust Fund for collection costs.

From: Raquel Tully o ¥ ATE CK W\ 052

Sent: Monday, April 10, 2006 3:28 PM , .

To: Paula Isler 643 APRL 1 200r

Subject: Cry \oo. .00
¢ 7-06

Good Afternoon,

| received the following checks, please tell me how you want me to deposit them (ZT’

Docket 050787-TJ927, $100.00

Docket 050782-MLC Telcorp $100.00

Docket 050794 United Telecmu $100.00
Docket 050786 CCD Communications $100.00
Docket 050743 System Tech  $100.00 %
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