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Raquel Tully QR!G’NAL (575'(@55@
From: Paula Isler Q)(—_‘;\r (QOS L%

Sent:  Tuesday, July 25, 2006 3:04 PM e i ] » 00572'
To:  Raguel Tuly 664 UL 250l 20000 27,
Subject: RE: o \ BOO Cefle
A Ane
This is for TK005. $65.50 is for 2005 ($50.00 RAF, $12.50 penalty, and $3.00 interest) - Please deposit as you normally would.
Please deposit $200 in PSC Trust Fund for collection costs and $300 in the General Revenue Fund. 7-&) C/— Ole
—
Please provide Records proof of payment for Docket No. 060466-TI. Thanks. /2 /

From: Raquel Tully

Sent: Tuesday, July 25, 2006 2:36 PM
To: Paula Isler

Subject:

We received a check for $565.50 for worldwide Telecommunications d/b/a WTI Telecom. Please let me know the breakdown
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