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Raquel Tully 

From: Paula lsler 

Sent: 

To: Raquel Tully 

Cc: Dale Buys; Ray Kennedy 

Subject: RE: 

Tuesday, September 05,2006 1 :58 PM 

Please deposit all $1,000 in the General Revenue Fund and provide Records proof of payment for Docket 050838-TI. Thanks. 

From: Raquel Tully 
Sent: Tuesday, September 05, 2006 1:12 PM 
To: Paula Isler 
Subject: 

We received a $1000.00 check for Primo Communications./ 
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