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- ,  --____-- 
From: Paula lsler 

Sent: 

To: Raquel Tully 

Subject: RE: Payment of RAF fine 

Tuesday, September 05,2006 9:32 AM 

Good morning. TJ923 is Dollar Phone Corp. d/b/a DPC. Please deposit $200 in the PSC Trust Fund for collection costs and $300 
in the General Revenue Fund. Please provide Records proof of payment for Docket No. 060466-TI. Thanks. 

From: Raquel Tully 
Sent: Tuesday, September 05, 2006 9:09 AM 
To: Paula Isler 
Subject: 

We received a ck Friday, from Dollar Phone Corp for $500.00. Please let me know the breakdown. 

Thanks 

__s_ 
CM? 

9/5/2006 


