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Raquel Tully

From: Paulalsler
Sent:  Friday, January 05, 2007 2:56 PM

To: Raquel Tully
Cc: Dale Buys
Subject: RE:

This is a settlement and all $3,500 should be deposited in the General Revenue Fund. Please provide Records proof of payment
for Docket No. 060502-Tl. Thanks.

From: Raquel Tully

Sent: Friday, January 05, 2007 2:49 PM
To: Paula Isler

Subject:

We Received a check for $3500.00 from World-Link Solutions, Inc Docket 060502-T| Please let me know the breakdown.
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