
REQUEST TO ESTABLISH DOCKET 
(Please Type) 

Date: 3/23/2007 Docket No.: 0727Iri7 -. 

I 

1. Division NamelStaff Name: Division Of Competitive Markets & Enforcementllsler 

2. OPR: 

3. OCR: 

5. Suggested Docket Mailing List (attach separate sheet i f  necessary) 

A. 

B. 

Provide NAMES OR ACRONYMS ONLY if a regulated company. 

Provide COMPLETE NAME AND ADDRESS for all others. (Match representatives to companies.) 

Division Of The Commission Clerk And Administrative Services 

Office Of The General Counsel 

1. Parties and their representatives (if any): 

4. Suggested Docket Title: 

~~ ~~ 

2. Interested persons and their representatives (if any): 

Request for cancellation of CLEC Certificate No. 7910 by VGM International, Inc., effective 

~ 

6. Check one: 

[XI Documentation is attached. 

0 Documentation will be provided with recommendation. 



COMPANY IDENTIFICATION 
Printed on 03/23/2007 at 08:38:30 by PJI 

$50.00 RAF 

Complete Name: VGM International, Inc. 

$51.00 $-1.00 

Mailing Name: VGM International, Inc. 
Company Code: TX596 FEID Number: 65-0612783 

Penalty 

Interest 

RAF ACCOUNT FOR THE PERIOD 01/01/2006 THROUGH 12/31/2006 
Reg. Date: 09/24/2001 Inactive Date: 

Service : CLX - Competitive Local Exchange 
Received: Actual RAF Form 
Status : Satisfied 
Amended : No Extension: No 
Frozen: No Comments : No 
Payment Count: 1 Payment Made to Date 

RAF Rate: 0.0020 Net RAF Due: $50.00 
Operating Rev: $0.00 Interstate Rev: $0.00 

$2.50 $2.50 $0.00 

$0.50 $0.50 $0.00 

I A s  s es sment I 

Extension Fee 

Total 

Due I Paid I Owe I 

$0.00 $0.00 $0.00 

$53.00 $54.00 $-1.00 

1 



Paula M e r  
_̂ --- 

From: Ray Kennedy 

Sent: Monday, January 08,2007 2:03 PM 
To: Paula Mer 

Subject: RE: VGM International, Inc. (TX596) 

h i l i n k  was cancelled in a compliance docket (060620). But, if you can get him to pay RAF, that will be a plus. No need to open a 
:ancellation docket for Carilink. 

would wait until the RAF process is complete. If the system works as I think it does, he will get a certified notice for VGM that 2006 
W F  has not been paid and he will not get a certified notice for Carifink as the certificate is already cancelled. Is this what you 
Anderstand?? 

From: Paula Isler 
Sent: Monday, January 08, 2007 11:41 AM 
To: Ray Kennedy 
Subject: FW: VGM International, Inc. (lX596) 

Based on the e-mail from Hany Ayoub, it appears he wants to cancel his two IXC registrations (VGM and CariLink), although I am not 
100% sure that is what he meant in his January 3rd e-mail ("please clx certificate"). He never responded to me after I asked him if 
he needed the RAF returns. 

Should I go ahead and open dockets to cancel both certificates or wait until he pays RAFs for both? 

From: Paula Isler 
Sent: Wednesday, January 03, 2007 1:32 PM 
To: 'hany@vgmtel.com' 
Subject: RE: VGM International, Inc. (lX596) 

OK. If you want to cancel CariLink's certificate, you will need to complete the 2006 Regulatory Assessment Fee return and pay the 
fee for that one too. Do you need the return forms? If you do, I can attach copies to an e-mail. Just let me know. Thanks. 

Paula lsler 

From: hany@vgmtel.com [mailto: hany@vgmtel.com] 
Sent: Wednesday, January 03, 2007 12:45 PM 
To: Paula Isler 
Subject: Re: VGM International, Inc. (lX596) 

Hi Ms Isler 

no problem we will send in the check for the minimum right away. 

as for carilink int please cxl certificate. 

thank you 

>----- Original Message----- 
>From: Paula Mer [mailto:PIsler@PSC.STATE.FL.US] 
>Sent: Tuesday, January 2,2007 11 :29 AM 
>To: hany@vgmtel.com 
>Subject: VGM International, Inc. (TX596) 

1 I812007 



.Dear Mr. Ayoub: 

,The Commission received VGM's 2006 Regulatory Assessment Fee return form 
>with a note "Account closed in early 2006." Unfortunately, the company 
-still owes the 2006 fee because the minimum fee is owed if a certificate 
4s active for any day during a calendar year. If the fee is paid by the 
>due date of January 30th, I will open a docket to cancel the certificate 
>with an effective date of December 3 1 , 2006. That way, VGM will not owe 
>the 2007 fee. Just as information, the 2007 minimum fee is increasing 
>from $50 to $600, so you requested cancellation at the right time to 
>avoid having to pay the higher minimum fee. 

>What about CariLink International, 1nc.k CLEC certificate (TX595)? Are 
>you going to keep that certificate active? 

> 

> 

>Please let me know how you wish to proceed and let me know if you have 
'any questions. Thanks. 

>Paula Isler 
>Florida Public Service Commission 
>2540 Shumard Oak Blvd. 
>Tallahassee, FL 32399-0850 
>(850) 413-6502-Phone 
>(850) 413-6503-Fax 
>PIsler@psc. state. fl.us 

> 
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. w\ _ _  -_____..-... .Illll.Y.l. I r L I W 1 ~ ~ ~ ~ . ~ ~ ~ .  O G ~ L L I ~ U V L I U K D ~ ~ J ~ ~ :  uIiauiLwi 

Competitive Local Exchange Company Regulatory Assessment ee e rn 

STATUS: 
Actual Return 

- Estimated Return - Amended Return 

PERIOD COVERED: 

- 
VGM International, Inc. 
1 1 1 1 Kane Concourse, Suite 5 18 

01/01/2006 TO 12/31/2006 

(Address) 

.;7u3p- 
(Name of Company) 

LINE 
NO. 

1. 
2. 
3. 
4. 
5. 
6. . 

7. 
8. 

- 

.< 

ACCOUNT CLASSIFICATION 

Basic Local Services 
Long Distance Services (IntraLATA only)'') 
Access Services 
Private Line Services 

es & Circuits Services 

INTRASTATE REVENUE 

, 

$ "  

NET IhTWTATE OPERATING =VENUE for .. ~ .$. 

(3) $ 

9. 
10. 
11. 
12. 
13. 

14. 

Extension Payment Fee (see "4. Extension " on back) 

TOTAL AMOUNT DUE ($50 MINIMUM) 

(I)  Other long distance revenue must be listed 
( 2 )  These amounts must be intrastate only and 
(3) Regardless of the gross operating revenue fee of $50 shall be imposed as provided in 

Section 364.336, Florida Statutes. 
~ ~ ~~~~~ ~ 

COMPANY STATUS 
( ) Facilities-Based Provider 

BILLING INFORMATION 
Complete below if billing agent is other than yourse 

Do you lease telecommunications' facili 
If YES, who do you lease these facilities 

.~ I -, - ~~~ ~~ 

e read the foregoing and declare that to the best of my knowledge-and belief the above 
ectia 837.06, Florida Statutes, whoever knowingly makes a false statement in writing with 

performance of his official duty shall be guilty of a misTli3"enor of the Second degree. --. - . . - 
~. 

. .  
(Signature o&ompany Official) 

e, 
(Title) (Date) 

Telephone Number ( ) Fax Number ( ) 
(Preparer of Form - Please Print Name) 

PSC/CMP 007 (Rev. Olios) 

F.E.I. No. 

C:\DOCUME-l\dbrown\LOCALS-I \Temp\foxmerge30550966Luxmergefom.d~~ 



Company Code: 
Complete Name: 
Mailing Name: 
Certificate No(s): 

\ I  

Status: 
Rermlation Date: 

Titlet 
Mailing Address: 

Physical Location: 

Phone: 
Fax: 

Related Dockets: 

010930-TX 

MCD Company Information for TX596 

Printed on 01/05/2007 at 16:05:11 by PJI 

TX596 
VGM International, Inc. 
VGM International, Inc. 
7910 
Active 
09/24/2001 
No 
Hany Ayoub 
Director of Operation 
11 11 Kane Concourse, Suite 5 18 

Ba Harbor Island, FL 33 154-2043 
11 rl Kane Concourse, Suite 5 18 

Ba Harbor Island, FL 33 154-2043 
(3dh865-4950 
(305) 867-1637 

Application for certificate to rovide alternative local exchange 
telecommunications service E y VGM International, Inc. 

Compliance investi ation of VGM International, Inc., CLEC 
Certificate No. 791 , for apparent violation of Rule 25-4.0161, 
F.A.C., Regulatory Assessment Fees; Telecommunications Companies. 

t 05062 1 -TX 
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