
Raquel Tully 

From: Paula lsler 

Sent: Tuesday, August 21,2007 8:21 AM 

To : Raquel Tully 

Subject: RE: Southeast Payphones - TF721 

--- - -- 11- -_^--- _ -  -__- - ~ - __ 

Good morning. 
I I  

The company was right, the check really was in the mail (since you said it was postmarked on July 30th). Deposit $200 in the PSC 
Trust Fund for collection costs and the balance of $300 in the General Revenue Fund. Please provide the Clerk's Office with proof 
of payment of the $500 fine for documenting in Docket No. 070383-TC. Thanks. 

From: Raquel Tully 
Sent: Tuesday, August 21, 2007 8:06 AM 
To: Paula Isler 
Subject: 

Good Morning 

Concerning the $500.00 Check for TF721, Please let me know how you would like to deposit it 

812 1l2007 




