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Raquel Tully _\’V\ \3 \

From: Paula lsler

C"
Sent:  Tuesday, September 02, 2008 8:53 AM Q/L-ﬁ EC}D’

To: Raquel Tully oy | = 200. O (E&Cﬂﬂs

Subject: RE: TK131 o N , St
867 . St 022003 SC000

Good morning. %}.:QLO Jo & m

Lyca Tel, LLC (TK131) - $331 shouid be deposited as you normally would and applied toward the 2007 RAF and late payment
charges as follows: $700 RAF, $175 Penalty, $56 Interest.

The $500 balance is a fine. Please deposit $200 in the Public Service Commission Regulatory Trust Fund for collection costs and

the balance of $300 in the General Revenue Fund. Please provide the Clerk's Office with proof of payment for documentation in
Docket No. 080404-T1.

From: Raquel Tully

Sent: Friday, August 25, 2008 3:52 PM
To: Paula Isler

Subject: TK131

| received a check from Lycatel ink, for $1,431.00. Please let me know the breakdown.
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