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RE: Docket No. 070693-WS; Lake Utility Services, Inc.’s Application for Water andﬁast@ate@
Rate Increase in Lake County, Florida

Qur File No.: 30057.148

Dear Ms. Cole:

Pursuant to Staff’s request, please find enclosed for filing in the above-referenced docket an
original and twelve (12) copies of the Utility’s supplemental response to Item No, 10 in Staff’s First

bata Request, dated June 4, 2008.

Should you have any questions or concerns regarding this filing, please do not hesitate to

Opcgive me a call.
RCP _ Very truly yours
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Enclosures z O F
. D
cc: Mr. Bart Fletcher, Division of Economic Regulation (w/o enclosures) (via hand delivery):- g ©
Mr. Richard Wright, Division of Economic Regulation (w/o enclosures) (via hand delivex@) - 2
Keino Young, Esq., Office of General Counsel (w/o enclosures) (via hand delivery) S e
Patricia Christensen, Esq., Office of Public Counsel (w/enclosures) (via hand deliveryy’

John P. Hoy, Chief Regulatory Officer (w/enclosures) (via U.S. Mail)
Patrick C. Flynn, Regional Director (w/enclosures) (via U.S. Mail)
Ms. Deborah Swain (w/enclosures) (via U.S. Mail)

Mr. Frank Seidman (w/enclosures) (via 1.S. Mail)
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In re: Application of =

LAKE UTILITY SERVICES, INC. DOCKET NO.%S?SJ&S Ao

for Increase in Water and Wastewater -%3:& o3 'S-,

Rates in Lake County, Florida , g % O
NOTICE OF FILING

Applicant, LAKE UTILITY SERVICES, INC., by and through its undersigned attorneys,
hereby gives notice of filing in the above-referenced docket the Utility’s supplemental
response to Item No. 10 in Staff’s First Data Request, dated June 4, 2008.

Respectfully submitted on this 247 day of
October, 2008.

ROSE, SUNDSTROM & BENTLEY, LLP
Sanlando Center

2180 W. State Road 434

Suite 2118

Longwood, Florida 32779

PHONE: (407) 830-6331

FAX: (407) 830-8522
mfriedman@rsbattorneys.com

By:@s,t@«i *LOS@I../FL

MARTIN S.A#RIEDMAN
For the Fi
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CERTIFICATE OF SERVICE
DOCKET NO. 070693-WS

1 HEREBY CERTIFY that a true and correct copy of the foregoing has been furnished
by hand delivery this 24™ day of October, 2008, to:

Mr, Bart Fletcher Mr. Richard Wright

Division of Economic Regulation Division of Economic Regulation
Florida Public Service Commission Florida Public Service Commission
2540 Shumard Oak Blvd. 2540 Shumard Oak Boulevard
Tallahassee, FL 32399-0850 Tallahassee, FL 32399

Keino Young, Esquire Patricia Christensen, Esquire

Office of General Counsel Office of Public Counsel

Florida Public Service Commission 111 West Madison Street, Room 812

2540 Shumard Oak Boulevard, Room 301D Tallahassee, FL 32399-1400
Tallahassee, FL 32399-0850

and by U.S. Mail this 24" day of October, 2008, to:

John P. Hoy, Chief Regulatory Officer Patrick C. Flynn, Regional Director
Utilities, Inc. Utilities, Inc. of Florida

2335 Sanders Road 200 Weathersfield Avenue
Northbrook, IL 60062 Altamonte Springs, FL 32714-4099
Ms. Deborah Swain Mr. Frank Seidman

Milian, Swain & Associates, Inc. Management and Regulatory

2025 S.W. 32" Avenue Consultants, Inc.

Miami, FL 33145 8130 Mahan Drive

Tallahassee, FL 32309

MARTIN S. FKIEDMAN
For the Firm
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Aralysis of Rate Case Expense Florida Public Service Commission

Company: Lake Utility Services., Inc. Schedule: B-10
Page 10f1

Docket No: 070633-WS
Test Year Ended: 06/30/07 Preparer; Michells Rochow

Explanation: Provide the total amount of rata case expense requested in tha application. State whathaer the total includes the simount up to proposed agency action ar through a hearing before the Commission. Provida a fist of sach fism providing service
] ] 3 L] ] {6} (6a) {6b) 4] 8] {5 (10}
Estimate of
Actual  Actual Hours Estimate to Charges to
Counsel, Hourly Total Estimate Hours  Warked from  Total Actual Actual Complate Completa
Consultant or Rate Per Estimated of Charges by  Worked as  08.01.08- Hours as of Charges Through Through
Line # Firm or Vendor Name Witness Person Hours Firm of 07.31.08 10.17.08 10.17.08 Incurmed PAA FPAA Type of Servite Randered
7
1 Milian, Swain & Assoriates Deborah Swain 180 13000 23400 10250 323 107.75 18,450 223 4,005 Assist wiMFRs, data requests, sudit faciiitation
2 Milian, Swain & Associztes Cymihia Yapp 140 6000 3,400 $0.00 - 6000 8400 200 - Assistw/MFRs, data requests, audit facilitation
3 Milian, Swain & Assaciates Maria Brave 140 1,245.00 174 300 984,50 76.50 1.061.00 137 830 260.50 36470 Assist wiMFRs, data requests, audit facilitation
4 CPH Engineers Various nfa nfa 10,000 nfa - - 10,428 oeo 2000 Assist w/MFRE, data requests, audit facilitation
5 Rose, Sundstrem & Bentley, LLP ‘Martin Friedman 290 26190 75951 2190 42.50 134.40 56,060 3690 10,701 Legal Fees, also Includes Filing Fee
6 M&R Consulants. Frank Seidman i35 120.00 16,350 7272 - - 10,062 &60.00 7,050 USUAnalysts, Assistw/ MFRs, data requests, audit failitation
7 Bublic Service Commission nfa na 4,000 nfa - - - 0.00 - Filing Fee
B Water Service Corp, Jahn Hoy 86 80.00 7.680 28.00 5.00 33.00 3218 52.00 5542 Assist wiMFRs, data requests. audit {aciiitation
9 Water Service Corp. Kirsten Weeks 46 300.00 13,800 179.00 1200 191.00 £786 12100 5566 Assisl wiMFRs, data requests, audit facilitation
10 Water Service Corp. Patrick Flynn 55 15000 8,250 5825 830 66.75 2,264 10.9¢ 550 Assist wMFRs, data requests, audit fadilitation
11 Water Service Corp. Michelte Rochow 34 350.60 11,900 26.50 1600 34250 11629 2350 776 Assist wMFRs, data requests, audit faciktation
12 Water Service Cofp. Erini Povich 2 450.00 13.950 32250 16.50 33900 10509 127.50 3,953 Assist wiMFRs, data requests, audit facilitaton
13 Water Service Corp. Scotty Haws 3392 5000 1696 100 - 100 3 000 - Asgsict wiMFRs, data requests, audit facilitation
14 Water Service Comp. Durnam, Rick 9649 5000 4825 as50 6.00 950 :1h 0eo . Assist wiMFRs, data requests, audit facilitation
15 Water S~rvice Corp, Susan DiFasquale 33.92 50.00 1,696 &00 - - 204 0.00 - pssist wMFRS, data requests, audit fachitation
16 Water Service Corp. Bryan Gongre 3392 50.00 1696 1300 200 16.00 543 10.00 339 Assist w/MFRs, data requests, audit facilitation
17 Water Service Cofp. John Williams 33462 0.00 16596 - 12.00 12400 07 20.00 678 AssistwiMFRs, data requests, audit facilitation
18 Water Service Corp. Peggy Hanks B2 10.00 339 - - - - 10.00 330 Assist wiMFRs, data requests, audit facititation
19 Water Service Corp. Marzouk, Michelle 14 40.00 560 28.00 850 36.50 520 350 53 Assist wiMFRs, data requests, audit facilitation
20 Water Service Corp. Valrie, LaWanda 14 13000 1.820 120.02 2000 140,02 2540 9.96 40 Assist wiMFRs, data requests, audit facilitat.on
21 Water Service Corp. Shrake, Brian 27 100.00 2,700 2100 - 2.00 54 0.00 - Assist wiMFRs, data requests, audit faciitation
22 Water Senvice Corp. nfa nia 1800 nfa 1573 nfa 1,000 Customer natices, postage
23 Water Service Carp. nia nfa 228 n/a 2 nfa 200 Customer nobices, stock
24 Water Service Corp. a nia 1,200 nfa - nfa 1,200 Travet, Airfare
25 Water Service Corp. n/a nfa 1,600 nfa - na 1,500 Travel, HoteltAccommodation
26 Water Service Comp. nfa fnfa 400 nfa - nfa 400 Travel, Rental Car
27 Water Service Cotp. nfa nfa 12,000 nfa 6,870 na 12,000 Fed Ex. copies & othel misc., ingludes Office Team
28 Estimate Through 3 402537 i 291639 5 94431
29 [x] PAA

30 [ ] Commission Hearing

31 Amortization Period 4 Years
32 Explanation if different from Section 367.0816, Flerida

33 Amortization of Rate Case Expense:

&) (B} <€)

Water Wastewater Total
34 Prior unamoriized rate case expenses o - s -
35 Cutrent raie case expense 150,289 141.350.11 291,639
36 Total projected rate case expense 150,289 141,350 11 291,639
37 Annual Amertization 3 37,672 35337 53 [} 72810
38 Method of allocation between systems:
38 Customers (based on ERC Counts 06/30/07) 11184 105160 21687
40 Percentage of average customers 52% 48% 100%
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Account Description

Name Hourly Rate Date Co L—Iours Caplime Amount}
Durham, Rick J 9545 9/15/2008 251 6.00 578.94
Durharmn, Rick J 98.49 7/31/2008 257 1.00 96.49
Durham, Rick J Total 7.00

Flynn, Patrick C 3392 9A52008 251 250 84.80
Flynn, Patrick C 33.92 9/15/2008 251 1.00 3392
Fiynn, Patrick C 33.52  9/15/2008 251 1.00 33.92
Flynn, Patrick C 33.92 9M15/2008 251 1.00 33.92
Flynn, Patrick C 33.92 9/15/2008 251 1.00 3392
Fiynn, Patrick C 3392 8/31/2008 251 1.00 33.92
Flynn, Patrick C 3392 8/31/2008 251 0.50 16.98
Fiynn, Patrick C 3392 8/31/2008 251 0.25 848
Flynn, Patrick C 3392 8/31/2008 251 0.25 8.48
Flynn, Patrick C 3392 7/31/2008 251 1.00 33.92
Fiynn, Patrick G 3392 7152008 251 2.00 67.84
Flynn, Patrick C 33.92 TH5/2008 251 1.00 33.92
Fiynn, Patrick C 3392 715/2008 251 1.00 33.92
Flynn, Patrick C 3392 715/2008 251 0.50 16.96
Flynn, Patrick G 33.92 7H5/2008 251 1.00 3392
Flynn, Patrick C 3392 T7M5/2008 251 0.50 16.96
Fiynn, Patrick C Total 15.50

Gongre, Bryan Keith 3392 7NM5/2008 2561 1.00 33.82
Gongre, Bryan Keith 33.92 7/15/2008 251 1.00 3392
Gongre, Bryan Keith 3392 9/15/2008 251 3.00 101.76
Gongre, Bryan Keith Total 5.00

Hoy, John Patrick 106 873172008 2581 1.00 106.00
Hay, John Patrick 106 8/31/2008 251 1.00 106.00
Hoy, John Patrick 106 8/31/2008 251 1.00 106.00
Hoy, John Pabrick 106  8/15/2008 251 $.00 106.00
Hoy, John Patrick 106 8/15/2008 251 1.00 106.00
Hoy, John Patrick 06  7/31/2008 25% 1.00 96.00
Hoy, John Patrick g6  7/31/2008 251 1.00 96.00
Hoy, John Patrick 98  715/2008 251 1.00 96.00
Hoy, John Patrick 96  7/15/2008 251 1.00 95.00
Hoy, John Patrick Total 9.00

Marzauk, Michelle 15 9/23/2008 251 1.00 15.00
Marzouk, Michelle 15 9/9/2008 251 3.00 45.00
Marzouk, Michelle 15 9/9/2008 251 4.50 87.50
Marzouk, Michetle 14 7/29/2008 251 0.50 7.00
Marzouk, Micheile 14 7/99/2008 251 1.25 17.50
Marzouk, Michelle 14 7M5/2008 251 3.50 49.00
Marzouk, Michelle 14 7/15/2008 251 5.50 77.00
Marzouk, Michelle 14 7172008 251 1.00 14.00
Marzouk, Michelle 14 7/1/2008 251 5.00 70.00
Marzouk, Michalie 14 7172008 254 5.00 70.00
Marzouk, Michelle Total 30.25

Povich, Erin Patricia 31 8/31/2008 251 3.00 93.00
Povich, Erin Patricia 31 8/31/2008 251 1.00 31.00




Account Description

Name lHouﬂy Rate Date Hours Caplime Amount
Povich, Erin Patricia 31  8/31/2008 251 1.00 31.00
Povich, Erin Patricia 31 8/31/2008 251 2.00 ' 82.00
Povich, Erin Patricia 31 8/31/2008 251 3.00 93.00
Povich, Erin Patricia 31 &/31/2008 251 2.00 62.00
Povich, Erin Patricia 31 8/15/2008 251 1.00 31.00
Povich, Erin Patricla 31 8/15/2008 251 3.50 108.60
Povich, Erin Patricia 31 7/3172008 251 6.00 186.00
Povich, Erin Patricia 31 7/31/2008 251 1.00 31.00
Povich, Erin Patricla 31 7115/2008 251 9,00 279.00
Povich, Erin Patricla 31 7M5/2008 251 8.00 248.00
Povich, Erin Palricia 31 71572008 251 250 77.60
Povich, Ernn Patricia 31 77145/2008 251 4.00 124.00
Povich, Erin Pafricia 31 7152008 251 4,00 124.00
Povich, Erin Patricia 31  7M5/2008 251 4.00 124.00
Povich, Erin Patricia Total £5.00

Rochow, Michelie Menotli 33  8/31/2008 251 4.00 132.00
Rochow, Michelle Menoiti 33 8/31/2008 251 300 99.00
Rochow, Michelle Menotti 33 8/31/2008 251 9.00 297.00
Rochow, Michelle Menotti 34 7/31/2008 251 11.00 374.00
Rochow, Michelle Menotti 34 7/31/2008 251 7.50 255,00
Rochow, Michealle Menotti 34 77312008 251 6.00 204.00
Rochow, Michelle Menottl 34 7131/2008 251 8.60 289,00
Rochow, Michelle Menott 34 7/31/2008 251 1.00 34.00
Rochow, Michelle Manotti 34 7/31/2008 251 2.00 68.00
Rochow, Michelle Menotti 34 7/31/2008 251 9.50 323.00
Rochow, Michelle Menctti 34 73172008 251 2.50 85.00
Rochow, Michelle Menotti 34 7he/2008 251 5.00 170.00
Rochow, Michelle Menotti 34 7M15/2008 251 4.00 136.00
Rochow, Michelle Menotti 34 T7N5/2008 251 7.00 238.00
Rachow, Michelle Menotti 34 7152008 251 6.50 221.00
Rochow, Michelle Menotti 34  7/15/2008 251 5.00 170.00
Rochow, Michelle Menotti 34 7/15/2008 251 5.00 170.00
Rochow, Michelle Menotti 34 7/15/2008 251 7.00 238.00
Rochow, Michelle Menotti 34 7M5/2008 251 5.00 170.00
Rochow, Michelle Menotti Total 108.50

Valrie, LaWanda N 43.01  9/23/2008 251 1.50 64.52
Valrig, LaWanda N 43.01 9/23/2008 251 2.00 86.02
Vairie, LaWanda N 43.01  9/23/2008 251 4.00 172.04
Valrie, LaWanda N 43.01 9/9/2008 251 3.00 129.03
Valrie, LaWanda N 43.01 9/9/2008 251 6.00 258.06
Valrie, LaWanda N 43.01 919/2008 2561 1.50 64.52
Valrie, LaWanda N 43.01 9/9/2008 251 2.00 86.02
Valrie, LaWanda N 43.00  7/29/2008 251 B.00 344.08
Valrig, LaWanda N 4301 7/29/2008 251 8.00 344.08
Valrig, LaWarcia N 43.01  7/29/2008 251 4.00 172.04
Valrie, LaWanda N 43.01 7/28/2008 251 4.00 172,04
Valtle, Lawanda N 43.01  7/29/2008 251 4.00 172,04
Valrie, LaWanda N 43.01 7292008 251 1.50 64.52




Account Description

Name Hously Rate Date Co Hours Caplime Amount
Velrie, LaWanda N 43.01  7/15/2008 251 6.50 279.57
Valrie, LaWanda N 43.0t  7M5/2008 261 6.50 279.57
Valie, LaWanda N 43.01 71172008 251 2.00 86.02
Valrie, LaWanda N 43.01 71/2008 251 450 193.55
Valrie, LaWanda N 43.01 7H/2008 251 6.00 258.06
Valrie, LaWanda N Total 75.00

Weeks, Kirsten Elise 48  815/2008 251 3.00 138.00
Weeks, Kirsten Elise 45 9ABI2008 251 3.00 138.00
Woeeks, Kirsten Elise 46  9/15/2008 251 3.00 138.00
Woeeks, Kirsten Elise 46  9/15/2008 251 3.00 138.00
Weoks, Kirsten Elise Total 12.00

Wiliiams NI, John B 33.92 9NMS5/2008 251 4,00 135.68
Willlams (f(, Johnt D 3392 BM5/2008 251 4.00 135.68
Williams i, John D 3392  8/31/2008 251 2.00 67.84
Wilams ), John D 3382 8/31/2008 251 2.00 87.84
Williams fll, John D Total 12.00

Grand Total

329.25




Milian, Swain & Associates, Inc.
2025 8. W. 32™ Avenue
Miami, Florida 33145

Tel.: 305-441-0123 Fax: 305-441-0688

INVOICE
Invoice No.27275
Invoice Date: September 12, 2007
Page [, Billing # 1

Kirsten Weeks
Manager, Regulatory Accounting
Utilities, Inc.
2335 Sanders Road

Northbrook, IL 60062-6196

For Professional services rendered through August 31, 2007 in connection with
Application for Increased Rates and Charges for Lake Utility Services, Inc.

Hours Rate Amount
Senior Staff Accountant:
Deborah Swain 325 180.00 585.00
Cynthia Yapp .50 140.00 70.00
Maria Bravo 101.50 140.00 14,210.00
Total Due for invoice 27275 $14,865.00

Please make check payable to Milian Swain & Associates, Inc.




Milian, Swain & Associates, Inc.
2025 S. W. 32" Avenue
Miami, Florida 33145

Tel: 305-441-0123 Fax: 305-441-0638

INVOICE
Invoice No.27309
Invoice Date: October 3, 2007
_ Page 1, Billing #2
‘ Kirsten Weeks
i Manager, Regulatory Accounting
Utilities, Inc.
2335 Sanders Road

| Northbrook, IL. 60062-6196

For Professional services rendered through September 28, 2007 in connection with
Application for Increased Rates and Charges for Lake Utility Services, Inc.

’ Hours Rate Amount
Senior Staff Accountant:
Deborah Swain 3.00 180.00 540.00
Maria Bravo 101.75 140.00 14,245.00
Total Due for invoice 27309 $14,785.00 |

Please make check payable to Milian Swain & Associates, Inc,




Kirsten Weeks

Milian, Swain & Associates, Inc.
2025 5. W. 32 Avenue
Miami, Florida 33145
Tel: 305-441-0123 Fax: 305-441-0688

INVOICE

Invoice No.27358
Invoice Date: October 30, 2007
Page 1, Billing # 3

Manager, Regulatory Accounting

Utllities, Inc.
2335 Sanders Road

Northbrook, IL 60062-6196

For Professional services rendered through October 26, 2007 in connection with
Application for Increased Rates and Charges for Lake Utility Services, Inc.

Hours Rate Amount
Senior Siaff Accountant:
Deborah Swain 225 180.00 405.00
Maria Bravo 112.75 140.00 15,785.00-
Total Due for invoice 27358 $16,190.00

Please make check payable to Milian Swain & Associates, Inc.




Milian, Swain & Associates, Inc,
2025 S. W. 32" Avenue
Miami, Florida 33145
el: 305-441-0]23 Fax: 305-441-

INVOICE

Invoice No.27406
Invoice Date: December 5, 2007
Page 1, Billing #4

Kirsten Weeks

Manager, Regulatory Accounting
Utilities, Inc.

2335 Sanders Road

Northbrook, IL 60062-6196

For Professional services rendered through November 30, 2007 in connection with
Application for Increased Rates and Charges for Lake Utility Services, Inc.

Hours Rate Amount
Senior Staff Accountant:
Deborah Swain 5.00 180.00 900.00
Maria Bravo 116,25 140.00 16,275.00
Total Due for invoice 27406 $17,175.00

Please make check payable to Milian Swain & Assoctates, inc.




Milian, Swain & Associates, Inc.
2025 S. W. 32™ Avenue
Miami, Floride 33145

Tel.: 305-441-0123 Fax: 305-441-0638

INVOICE

Invoice No.27437
Invoice Date: January 4, 2008
Page 1, Billing #3

Kirsten Weeks

Manager, Regulatory Accounting
Utilities, Inc.

2335 Sanders Road

Northbrook, IL 60062-6196

For Professional services rendered through December 28, 2007 in connection with
Application for Increased Rates and Charges for Lake Utility Services, Inc.

Hours Rate Amount
Senior Staff Accountant: ’
Deborah Swain 4.25 180.00 765.00
Maria Bravo 102.75 140.00 14,385.00
Total Due for involce 27437 $15,150.00

Please make check payable to Milian Swain & Associates, Inc.




Milian, Swain & Associates, Inc.
2025 5. W. 32 Avenne
Miami, Florida 33145

Tel: 305-441-0123 Fax: 305-441-0688
- INVOICE

Invoice No.28103
Invoice Date: January 28, 2008
Page i, Billing # 6

Kirsten Weeks

Manager, Regulatory Accounting
Utilities, Inc.

2335 Sanders Road

Northbrook, IL 60062-6196

For Professional services rendered through January 25, 2008 in connection with
Application for Increased Rates and Charges for Lake Utility Services, Inc.

Hours Rate Amount
Senior Staff Accountant:
Deborah Swain 12.25 180.00 2,205.00
Maria Bravo 145.25 140.00 20,335.00
Cynthia Yapp 18.75 140.00 2,625.00
Total Due for invoice 28103 $25,165.00

Please make check payable to Milian Swain & Assoclates, Inc,




Milian, Swain & Associates, Inc.
2025 S. W. 32" Avenue
Miami, Florida 33145
Tel: 3 0123 Fax; 305-441

INVOICE
Invoice No.28136
Invoice Date: March 4, 2008
Page 1, Billing # 7
John Hoy
Chief Regulatory Officer
Utilities, Inc.
2335 Sanders Road

Northbrook, 1. 60062-6196

For Professional services rendered through February 29, 2008 in connection with
Application for Increased Rates and Charges for Lake Utility Services, Inc.

Hours Rate Amount
Senior Staff Accountant:
Deborah Swain 67.25 180.00 12,105.00
Maria Bravo 227.25 140.00 31,815.00
Cynthia Yapp 40.25 140.00 5,635.00
Total Due for involce 28136 $49,555.00

Please make check payable to Miliar Swain & Associates, Inc.




Milian, Swain & Associates, Inc.
2025 S. W. 32 Avenue
Miami, Florida 33145

Tel: 305-441-0123 Fax: 305-441-0688

INVOICE

Invoice No.28166
Invoice Date: April 1, 2008
Page 1, Billing # 8

John Hey

Chief Regulatory Officer
Utilities, Inc.

2335 Sanders Road
Northbrook, IL 60062-6196

For Professional services rendered through March 28, 2008 in connection with
Application for Increased Rates and Charges for Lake Utility Services, Inc.

Deficiencies Errors Hours Rate Amount

Senior Staff Accountant:
Deborah Swain 3.00 180.00 540.00
Maria Bravo 6.00 140.00 £40.00
Cynthia Yapp 16.75 140.00 ' 2,345.00

Total Due for invoice 28166 $3,725.00

Please make check payable to Milian Swain & Associates, Inc.




Milian, Swain & Associates, Inc,
2025 5. W. 32™ Avenue
Miami, Florida 33145
Tel.: 305-441-01 ax: 441-0488

INVOICE

Invoice No.28208
April 29, 2008
Page 1, Billing #9

John Hoy

Chief Regulatory Officer

Utitities, Inc.

2335 Sanders Road

Northbrook, IL 60062-6196 \

For Professional services rendered through April 25, 2008 in connection with
Application for Increased Rates and Charges for Lake Utility Services, Inc.

Hours Rate Amount
Senior Staff Accountant:
Deborah Swain 1.50 130.00 270.00
Maria Bravo 42,00 140.00 5,880.00
Cynthia Yapp .50 140.00 70.00
Total Due for invoice 28208 $6,220.00

Please make check payable to Millan Swain & Associates, Inc.




Milian, Swain & Associates, Inc.
2025 8. W. 32™ Avenue
Miami, Florida 33145

Tel.: 305-441-0123 Fax: 305-441-0688

INVOICE
nvoice No.28249
June 3, 2008
Page 1, Billing # 10
John Hoy
Chief Regulatory Officer
Utilities, Inc.
2335 Sanders Road

Northbrook, IL 60062-6196

For Professional services rendered through May 30, 2008 in connection with
Application for Increased Rates and Charges for Lake Utility Services, Inc.

Hours Rate Amount

Senior Staff Accountant:

Maria Bravo 15 14000 105.00
Deficiencies errors

Deborah Swain 5.00 180.00 900.00

Maria Bravo 7.00 140.00 980.00
Total Due for invoice 28249 $1,985.00
Aged Receivables:

Invoice #28166- $3,725.00
Iovoice #28208- $6,220.00

Total Amount Due $11,930.60

Please make check payable 1o Milian Swain & Associates, Inc.




Milian, Swain & Associates, Inc.
2025 5. W. 32™ Avenue
Miami, Florida 33145

Tel.: 305-442-D : 305-44]1-0688
INVOICE
Invoice No 28287
July 1, 2008
Page 1, Billing # 11
John Hoy
Chief Regulatory Officer
Utilities, Inc.
2335 Sanders Road

Northbrook, IL 60062-6196

For Professional services rendered through June 27, 2008 in connection with
Application for Increased Rates and Charges for Lake Utility Services, Inc.

Hours Rate Amount

Principal
i Deborah Swain 1.75 180.00 315.00
: Senior Staff Accountant:
Maria Bravo 2475 140.00 3,465.00
Deficiencies errors
Deborah Swain
Maria Bravo
Total Due for involce 28287 $3,780.00

Aged Receivables:
Invoice #28249. $1,985.00

Total Amount Due $5,765.00

Please make check payable to Milian Swain & Associates, Inc.




Mifian, Swain & Associates, Inc.
2025 8. W. 32™ Avenue
Miand, Florida 33145
Tel.: 305-441-0123 Fax: 305-441-0688

INVOICE

Invoice No.28234
July 30, 2008
Page 1, Billing # 12

John Hoy : -
Chief Regulatory Officer

Utilities, Inc.

2335 Sanders Road

Northbrook, IL 60062-619¢

For Professional services rendered through July 25, 2008 in connection with
Application for Increased Rates and Charges for Lake Utility Services, Inc.

Hours Rate Amount

Principal
Deborah Swain 2.00 180.00 360.00
Senior Staff Accountant:
Maria Bravo 9.50 140.00 1,330.00
Deficiencies errors
Deborah Swain
Maria Bravo
Total Due for inveice 28234 $1,690.00

Aged Recejvables:
Invoice #28287- $3,780.00

Total Amount Duae $5,470.00

Please make check payable to Milian Swain & Associates, Inc.




Mitian, Swain & Associates, Inc.
2025 S. W. 32™ Avenue
Miami, Florida 33145

Tel: 305-441-0123 Fax: 305-441-0658
INYOICE

Invoice No.28262
September 3, 2008
Page 1, Billing # 13

John Hoy
Chief Regulatory Officey
! Utilities, Inc,
: 2335 Sanders Road
: Northbrook, IL. 60062-6196

For Professional services rendered through August 29, 2008 in connection with
Application for Increased Rates and Charges for Lake Utility Services, Inc.

Hours Rate Amount

Principal

Deborah Swain 1.00 180.00 180.00
Senior Staff Accountant:

Maria Bravo 6.00 140.00 840.00
AFPI/Service Availability

Deborah Swain 2.00 180.00 360.00

Maria Bravo
Total Due for invoice 28262 $1,330.00
Aged Receivables:
Invoice #28234A- $1,690.00

Total Amount Due $3,010.00

Piease make check payable to Millan Swain & Associates, Inc.




Milian, Swain & Associates, Inc.
2025 8. W. 312™ Avenue
Miami, Florida 33145

Tel.: 305-441-0123 Fax: 305-441-0688

INVOICE
Invoice No.28401
October 2, 2008
Page 1, Billing # 14
John Hoy
Chief Regulatory Officer
Utilities, Inc.
2335 Sanders Road

Northbrook, IL 60062-6196

For Professional services rendered through September 26, 2008 in connection with
Application for Increased Rates and Charges for Lake Utility Services, Inc.

Hours ) Rate Amount

Principal

Deborah Swain 225 180.00 405.00
Senior Staff Accountant:

Mariz Bravo 22.00 140.00 3,080.00
AFPL/Service Availability

Maria Bravo 46.50 140.00 6,510.00
Total Due for involce 28401 $9,995.00

Total Amount Due $9.995.00

Please make check payable to Milian Swain & Associates, Inc.




SO

Litilities, Ine,

At Acoounts Payable
2335 Sanders Roed
Northbrook, IL 80082

2001807

Utiilties Services Miscallaneous Consuting Services.

e £.J, 10N

Howrs
Sr. Projoct Manager 4.00
4.00
Total Labor
Billings to Date
Current Prior
Labor $60.00 41,157.75
Conguliant 0.00 2,989.00
Expense Q.00 2,528.06
Unit 0.00 208,82
Totals £60.00 47,563.73

Powsr Consumption analysis for Lake Groves

CPH Enginears, Inc.

CPH Engineers, Inc.
P.0. Box 2308
Sanford, FL 31773-2808
Phone: M7,022.6841
§ax: 407.330.0639

cph

Ap) 7, 2008
Froject MNo: Uo708.03
invoice No: 62324 ’

b KEEOY
mﬁ,;_? Afl3 .

850.00
580.00

Rate
140.00

Total this Invoics $560.00

,C,u)
Total

41,717.78

2.999.00

2,528.06

808.92
48,983.73




etoc te case
Hours Description
3.4 Unbilled time through date of filing.

12.0 Respond to formal interrogatories from Staff and OPC and informal requests

for information from Staff and OPC.




2.0 Review Staff recommendation; conference with client and consultants

regarding recommendation; conference with Staff regarding

recommendation,

15.0 Prepare for and attend Agenda conference, discuss Agenda with client and

Staff,

2.0 Review PAA Order; conference with client and consultants regarding PAA




2.5 Prepare revised tariff sheets, obtain Staff approval of tariffs; Draft and revise

customer notice, obtain Staff approval; Coordinate mailing of customer

notices and implementation of tariffs.

36.9 @ $290/hour= $10,701




Management & Regulatory C_cnsuitants, Inc.
Summary of Rate Case Expense from tnvoices through June, 2008
Lake Utllity Services, inc. - Dockef No. 070893-WS

BILLED EXPENSE

Assistw/ &
Repaond to
Prepare Data Ret. Comections
MFRs & New Info. to MFR

Frank Seidman . -Fours 69.60 0,43
Bifing Rate: $1364¢ Amount $9,423.00 $0.00  $56.25

o st

PROJECTED REMAINING EXPENSE

Assist w/ &

Repondto Prepare for
Data Req. and Attend
& New [nfo. -Agends

Frank Seldman Hours 60.00 8.00
Bifing Rate; $135/hr  Amount $0.00  %6,000.00 $3800.00

Cumulative Total, Billed and Remaining

$244.50 $9,724.

, {est. Totals
50.00 60.00
$250.00 $7,050.00

318,774.15




P.O. Box 13427
Tallahassee, FL 32317-3427
Phone or Fax (850) 877-0673

e-mail; frankden@nettally.com

Management & Regulatory Consultants, Inc.

ACCOUNTS PAYABLE
UTILITIES, INC.
2335 SANDERS ROAD

NORTHBROOK, IL 60062 09/10/07
3 20026.10

CONSULTING - LUSY - U&U - HTY 2006/7
WEDGEFIELD - U&U -~ HTY 2006/7
LONGWQOD - U&U HTY - 2006/7
MILES GRANT - U&U - HTY 2006/7

PREVIOUS BALANCE 3 0.900
Week of: HOURS
08/13/07 FS CONSULTING - ALL CASES -
COMMUNICATIONS W/MSA. 0.50 £€7.50

08/20/07 FS CONSULTING - ALL CASES - RESEARCH RE
PREVIOUS CASES & Ars; ESTABLISH BASE
DATA. COMMUNICATE W/MSA & UI. 11.00 1485.490

08/27/07 FS CONSULTING - ALL CASES - CONFERENCE
CALL W/UI & MSA RE STRATEGY FOR ALL

CASES. . . 202,50
FOR CURRENT SERVICES RENDERED 13.00 &% 1755.00
EXPENSES
PAYMENTS AND CREDITS
09/10/07 PAYMENT, as of - 0.00
BALANCE DUE $ 1755.00

Note; Allocation for “All Cases™ - LUSI - 60%; Wedgefield - 20%; Longwood - 20%




P.O. Box 13427
Tallahassee, FL 32317-3427
Phone or Fax (850) 877-0673

e-mail: frankden@netially.com

Management & Regulatory Consuitants, Inc.

ACCOUNTS PAYABLE
UTILITIES. INC.

2335 SANDERS ROAD
NORTHBROOK, IL 60082

CONSULTING - LUSI - U&U - HTY 2006/7

Week of:

09/03/07
08/03/67
09/03/07
05/03/07

069/24/07

10/01/07

-106/08/07

10/08/07

10/22/07

Fs

Fs

FS

FS

FS

FS

FS

FS

WEDGEFIELD - U&U - HTY 2006/7
LONGWOOD - UsU HTY - 2006/7
MILES GRANT - UsU - HTY 2006/7

PREVIOUS BALANCE

CONSULTING - ON-SITE INSPECTION
LUSI SYSTEM.

CONSULTING - CN-SITE INSPECTION

LONGWOOD, WEDGEFIELD, MILES GRANT.

CONSULTING - MEET W/CLIENT RE
ALL CASES.

CONSULTING - ON-SITE INSPECTION
TRAVEL, ALL CASES.

CONSULTING - ALL CASES - DEVELOP
HISTORICAL FLOW,CUSTOMER AND
SYSTEM DATA.

CONSULTING - ALL CASES - DEVELOP
HISTORICAL FLOW,CUSTOMER AND
SYSTEM DATA.

CONSULTING - ALL CASES - DEVELOP
HISTORICAL FLOW,CUSTOMER AND
SYSTEM DATA.

CONSULTING - ALL CASES - DEVELQP
HISTORICAL FLOW,CUSTOMER AND
SYSTEM DATA.

CONSULTING - ALL CASES - DEVELOP
HISTORICAL FPLOW,CUSTOMER AND
SYSTEM DATA & "F" SCHEDULES.

11/01/07

20026.10
$ 1755.00

HOURS

§.00 1080.00
10.090 1350.00
2.00 270.00
11.00 1485.00
8.00 1080.00
£.00 810.00
4.00 540.00
10.00 1350.60
6.00 8l0.00




(11/01/07 Invoice) - cont.

10/22/07 FS CONSULTING - LUSI - DEVELOP

10/22/07

10/22/07

10/22/07

EXPENSES
09/06/07

09/06/07
09/05/07
09/05/07

PAYMENTS
11/01/07

FS

rs

FS

HISTORICAL FLOW,CUSTOMER AND
SYSTEM DATA & "F" SCHEDULES.

CONSULTING - WEDGEFIELD -
DEVELOP "F" SCHEDULES.

CONSULTING - LONGWOCD -
DEVELOP "F" SCHEDULES.

CONSULTING - MILES GRANT -
DEVELOP "F" SCHEDULES.
FOR CURRENT SERVICES RENDERED

TALL/CLERMONT /ALTAMONTE/TALL
548 MILES @ $0.45/MILE
TOLLS

LODGING

MEALS

AND CREDITS
FAYMENT, as of

BALANCE DUE

2.00

675.00

270.00

270.00

270.00

76.00

$10260.00

246.60
6.25
108.%0
46.42
$408.17

=

$12423.17

Note: Allocation for “All Cases” - LUST - 60%, Wedgefield, Longwood & Miles Grant - 13.33% each.
Allocation for Wedgefield, Longwood & Miles Grant, only - 33.33% each.




P.O. Box 13427
Tallahassee, FL 32317-3427
Phone or Fax (850) 877-0673
e-mail: frankden@neltaily.com

Management 8& Regulatory Consultants, Inc.

ACCOUNTS PAYABLE
UTILITIES, INC.
2335 SANDERS ROAD
NORTHBROOK, IL €0062 12/27/07
20026.10
CONSULTING - LUSI - U&U - HTY 2006/7
WEDGEFIELD - U&U - HTY 2006/7
MILES GRANT - U&U - HTY 2006/7

PREVIOUS BALANCE §12423.17
Week of: HOURS
11/01/07 PS CONSULTING - WEDGEFIELD-
PREPARE U&U ANALYSIS. 3.00 405.00
11/05/07 FS CONSULTING - WEDGEFIELD-
PREPARFE U&lU ANALYSIS. 3.00 405.00
11/05/07 F8 CONSULTING - MILES GRANT
DRAFT "¥F" SCHEDULES. 7.00 945.00
11/05/07 FS CONSULTING - ALL CASES
PREPARE U&U ANALYSIS. 2.0¢ 270.00
11/12/07 FS CONSULTING - WEDGEFIELD-
DRAFT "F" SCHEDULES. 5.00 675.00
11/12/07 F8 CONSULTING ~ LUSI
PREPARE U&U ANALYSIS. 5.00 675.00
12/10/07 FS CONSULTING - LUSI
PREPARE U&U ANALYSIS. 1.00 135.00
FOR CURRENT SERVICES RENDERED 26.00 § 3510.00
EXPENSES
PAYMENTS AND CREDITS
11/05/07 PAYMENT {(Check no. 643032) - 1785.00

BALANCE DUE $14178.17

it

Note: Allocation for “All Cases”™ - LUSI - 60%; Wedgefield - 20%; Miles Grant - 20% IREE

Note: LUSI is Lake Utility Services, Inc.




P.O. Box 13427
Tallahassee, FL 32317-3427

Phone or Fax {850) 877-0673
e-mail: frankden@nettally.com

Management & Regulatory Consultants, Inc.
CORRECTED Credit & Balance Due - 02/22/08

ACCOUNTS PAYABLE
UTILITIES, INC.
2335 SANDERS ROAD
NORTHBRQOK, IL 60062 02/14/08
20026.10
CONSULTING - LUSI - UsU - HTY 2006/7
WEDGEFIELD - UsU - HTY 2006/7
MILES GRANT - U&U - HTY 2006/7

PREVIQUS BALANCE $14178.17
Week Qf: - HOURS
01/07/08 F§ CONSULTING - LUSI - DISCUSSION
& REVISION "F" SCHEDULES. 4.00 540.00

01/14/08 FS CONSULTING - WEDGEFIELD & LUSI
REVISED "F" SCHEDULES TO MSA. 2.50 337.50

01/14/08 FS CONSULTING - ALL CASES
PREPARE RC EXPENSE INPUT FOR MFR. 1.00 135.00

01/21/08 FS CONSULTING - ALL CASES
RECONCILE FP-9 & F-10 TO RECORDS. 8.00 1080.00

01/28/08 F& CONSULTING - LUSI
REVISE F-3 SCHEDULE RE PEAK DAY. 0.50 67.50

01/28/08 T8 CONSULTING - ALL CASES
PREPARE & FORWARD FINAL "F" SCHEDULES

ALONG W/CORRECTED VERSIONS. 3.25 438,75
FOR CURRENT SERVICES RENDERED 19.25 § 2598.75
EXPENSES
PAYMENTS AND CREDITS
01/03/08 PAYMENT {(Check no. 703746} -10260.00
BALANCE DUE S 6516.92
NOTE: Bal. Due = current $2,598.75 + $3,510.00 from 12/27/07 invoice + $408.17 expenses from
1/07 inveice. ' -
11/01/07 invoic {7“ 202 .y (23’— LoD Y
. . -‘-——‘q-“'——‘-\__
Note Allocatlon for “A.“ Cases:’ - LUSI - 609/0, Wedgeﬁeld - 20%, MlIeS Gl'ant - 20‘%) \ 1 . ci.*L —
Note: LUSI is Lake Utility Services, Inc, Bl
¥ TR |
= Nod. g Wie)e

2 ¥q¢ T 2h by
VT T *
auu‘) . ";'J\




P.Q. Box 13427
Tallahassee, FL 32317-3427
Phone or Fax (850) 877-0673

e-mail: frankden@nettally.com

Management & Regulatory Consultants, Inc.

ACCOUNTS PAYABLE
UTILITIES, INC.
2335 SANDERS ROAD
NORTHBROOK, IL 60062 03/64/08
20026.10
CONSULTING -~ LUSI - Us&U - HTY 2006/7
WEDGEFIELD - UsU - HTY 2006/7
MILES GRANT - U&U - HTY 2006/7

PREVIOUS BALANCE $ 6516.962
Week of: HOURS
02/11/08 FS CONSULTING - LUSI -
UPDATE "“P" SCHEDULES. 0.50 67.50
02/25/08 F8 CONSULTING - MILES GRANT -
UPDATE "F" SCHEDULES. 0.590 67,00
FOR CURRENT SERVICES RENDERED 1.00 & 135.00
EXPENSES
PAYMENTS AND CREDITS
03/04/08 PAYMENT, as of - 0.00
BALANCE DUE § 6651.92

Note: Allocation for “All Cases” - LUSI - 60%; Wedgefield - 20%; Miles Grant - 20%
Note: LUSI is Lake Utility Services, Inc.
S .

Rel T




P.Q. Box 13427
Tallahassee, FL 32317-3427
Phone or Fax (850) 877-0673

e-mail: frankden@netially.com

Management & Regulatory Consultants, Inc.

ACCQUNTS PAYABLE
UTILITIES, INC.
2335 SANDERS ROAD
NORTHBRQOK, IL 60062 05/07/708
20026.10
CONSULTING - LUSI - U&sU - HTY 2006/7
WEDGEFIELD - U&U - HTY 2006/7
MILES GRANT - U&U - HTY 2006/7

PREVIOUS BALANCE $ 6516.92
Week of: HOURS
03/17/08 FS CONSULTING - WEDGEFIELD
TEL.CONF, W/M. BRAVO RE PROFORMA EXP, 0.50 67.50

03/17/08 FS CONSULTING - LUSI
DEFICIENCY LETTER REVIEW. 0.25% 33.75

03/24/08 F& CONSULTING - WEDGEFIELD
DISCUSSION RE STRATEGY FOR WW; REVISE

MFSs FOR WW CIAC. 2,25 303.75
03/24/08 FS CONSULTING - LUSI -
CONF. CALL RE DEFICIENCIES. 0.50 67.50
04/14/08 FS§ CONSULTING - LUSI -
CONF. CALL RE ALL 3 CASES. 0.5¢ 67.50
FOR CURRENT SERVICES RENDERED 1.00 §$ 540.00
EXPENSES
PAYMENTS AND CREDITS
02/28/08 PAYMENT - 3510.00
03/19/08 PAYMENT - 2598.75
04/15/08 PAYMENT - 135.00
BALANCE DUE S 813.17

Note: Allocation for “All Cases” - LUSI - 60%; Wedgefield - 20%; Miles Grant - 20%
Note: LUSI is Lake Utitity Services, Inc.




S B

P.O. Box 13427

' Tallahassee, FL 32317-3427
| Phone or Fax (850) 877-0873 such_ P25

e-mall; frankden@nettally.com
Management & Reguiatory Consultants, Ing. ?fﬁ 3 _3

ACCOUNTS PAYABLE 34zﬂﬂﬁﬁﬁz“
UTILITIES, INC.

2335 SANDERS ROAD

NORTHBROOK, IL 60062 07/21/08
20026.10

CONSULTING - LUSI - UsU - HTY 2006/7
WEDGEFIELD - URU - HTY 2006/7
MILES GRANT - U&U - HTY 2006/7

PREVIOUS BALANCE : $ 813.17
:i Week of: HOURS
; 06/02/08 FS CONSULTING - MILES GRANT - @
; ASSIST W/RESPONSE TO STAFF REQUEST. 6.50 67.50

8 06/09/08 FS CONSULTING - MILES GRANT - .
ASSIST W/RESPONSE TO STAFF REQUEST. "~ 0.50 67.50

06/09/08 F5 CONSULTING - LUSI -

CONF. CALL; ASSIST W/RESPCONSE TO (ED
STAFF REQUEST. 1,258 ___ 168,75
FOR CURRENT SERVICES RENDERED 2.25 8§ 303.75

EXPENSES

PAYMENTS AND CREDITS
07/21/08 PAYMENT, as of 0.00

CmITIXAMIM IS

BALANCE DUE $1116.92
| Note: Allocation for “All Cases” - LUSI - 60%; Wedgefield - 20%; Miles Grant - 20% pogu
: Note: LUSI is Lake Utility Services, Inc.




P.O. Box 13427
Tallahassee, F|. 32317-3427
Phone or Fax (850) 877-06873

e-mail: frankden@nettafly.com

20 BEF~ W

Management & Regulatory Consultants, Inc.

CORRECTED 7/23/08

ACCOUNTS PAYABLE
UTILITIES, INC.

2335 SANDERS ROAD
NORTHBROOK, IL 60062

CONSULTING - LUSI - U&U - HTY 2006/7
WEDGEFIELD - U&U - HTY 2006/7
MILES GRANT - U&sU - HTY z006/7

PREVIOUS BALANCE

.

HWeek of: '
06/02/08 FS CONSULTING - MILES GRANT -
ASSIST W/RESPONSE TO STAFF REQUEST.

06/09/08 FS CONSULTING - MILES GRANT -
ASSIST W/RESPONSE TO STAFF REQUEST.

06/09/08 FS CONSULTING - LUSI -
CONF. CALL; ASSIST W/RESPONSE TO
STAPP REQUEST.
FOR CURRENT SERVICES RENDERED
EXPENSES

PAYMENTS AND CREDITS
06/20/08 PAYMENT (corrected 7/23/08)

BALANCE DUE

Fatuil

L 0C
07/21/08
20026.10

$ 813.17

HOURS

0.50 67.50

0.50 67.50

.25 168,75
2.25 § 303.75

813.17

=D

Note: Allocation for “Alt Cases™ LUSI 60%, Wedgeﬁdd 20%; Miles Grant - 20%

Note: LUSI is Lake Utility Sexrvices, Inc.

----- 7 00 9. 7410. 0090| 135,00
3 .;-'z@ﬁﬁo@.-zﬁ o001 108 IS

¢ 20275




e

¢ 3L HB P.O. Box 13427 W“’&&?:"'

: Taliahassee, FL 32317-3427
Y Phone or Fax (850) 877-0673 Jﬂfg
3 o 00?? g_ e-mail: frankdengdnetlally.com Doc ,
Management & Regulatory Consultants, inc.

CORRECTED 7/23/08
RESENT 08/25/08 - PAST DUE

ACCOUNTS PAYABLE ‘
UTILITIES, INC.
2335 SANDERS ROAD
NORTHBROOK, IL 60062 07/21/08
, 20026.10
CONSULTING - LUSI - UgU - HTY 2006/7
WEDGEFIELD - U&U - HTY 2006/7
MILES GRANT - U&U - HTY 2006/7

PREVIOUS BALANCE $ B13.17
Veek of: HOURS
06/02/08 FS CONSULTING - MILES GRANT ~
ASSIST W/RESPONSE TO STAFF REQUEST. 0.50 67.50

06/09/08 PS CONSULTING - MILES GRANT -
ASSIST W/RESPONSE TO STAFF REQUEST. 0.50 67.50

06/09/08 FS CONSULTING - LUSI -
CONF. CALL; ASSIST W/RESPONSE TO

STAFF REQUEST. 1.25 __ 168.73
FOR CURRENT SERVICES RENDERED 2.29 8 303.75
EXPENSES
PAYMENTS AND CREDITS
06/20/08 PAYMENT (corrected 7/23/08) SEP < 8 2008 - 813.17
-+ -1 % | |
BALANCE DUE § 303.751}")

Note: Allocation for “All Cases” - LUSI - 60%,; Wedgefield - 20%; Miles Grant - 20%
Note: LUSI is Lake Utility Services, Inc.




FedEx_370¢7

Tnvoice Number [ Tnvoice Date \[ AccountNumber *  Page
2-937-57866 1 Oct 01,2008 4072-8604-9 Tofd
FedEx Tggihy?1-0427007 4 io ocf
[ 4
s | St 03218
UTILITIES INC § UTILITIES, INC-REGULATORY Doc
ATTN: ACCTS PAYABLE - 2335 SANDERS RD Isvolcs Questions?
2335 SANDERS fiD NORTHBROOK iL 60062-6108 Coutact FedEx Revenus Services
NORTHBROOK IL 60062-5108" ' / Phone; (800} 622-1147 M-Sa 7-6 {CST)
6(6:\!3 Fax: (800} 548-3020
Invoice Summary Oct 01, 2008 . Internet  www.fedex.com
FodEx Express Services FedEx Nows!
Transportation Charges 47105  Effective January 5, 2009, FedEx Express package and
Base Discount 2426 freight rates will increase an average of 6.9% for U.S.
Special Handling Charges 16034  and U.S. export services. The rate increase will be
Total Charges ush $607.13  partially offset by adjusting the fuel price at which the
fuel surcharge begins, reducing the fuef surcharge by 2
TOTAL THIS INVOICE UsD $607.13 percentage points. FedEx Ground and FedEx Home
. Delivery® rates wilt also increase. For detailed
You saved $24.281n diecaunts this period! information about rate, surcharge, fee and other
Other discounts may apply. important changas, go to fedex.com/2009rates.
ocT 1 3 2008
L apirberebrmn’ rommpeio ek oL o Invoice Number Account Number | Amount Due
(3 Fur change of ackess, check here and completa form or reverss side. 2-937-57866 4072-8604-9 I USD $607.13
Remittance Advice
Your payment is due by Oct 15, 2008
40728L042937578LL0A0000BL07L3S2
0 OO0 0 N NN OO OO TN
UTILITIES INC FedEx
ATTN: ACCTS PAYABLE P.0. Box 94515
2335 SANDERS RD PALATINE IL 60098-4515
NORTHBROOK It 80062.6108
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m Invoice Number ™\ _lnvoice”ﬁate N\ | AccosntNumber ™ Page
% 2-937-57866 Oct 01, 2008 4072-8604-9 20f4
- Adjustment Request: &
Fax to {800) 548-3020

| Use this form to fax requgsts for ad;ustments due to the reasons indicated below. Requests for adjustments
‘due to other reasons, including service failures, should be submitted by going to www fedex.com or calling

800.622.1147. Please use mutuple fnrms for addmonal requests.

RO s
| Datel L Jy 4 Jr L}

I 0 2 O T O A

D'fes. 1want to update account contact with lhu above hfonatuon

L

A
ovs QOversize Surclmgs

ADR- Addmscomutmn INW -Incorrect Weight For all Seevice fallures or other
DVE - Beclared Value INS - Incomroct Service  RSU - Residential Delivery surcharges plesse use ow web
IAN - Invalid Acct# OCF - Grd Pick-up Fee PND - Pwrshp Not Delivered site www.lodex.com or call
0CS - Exp Pick-up Fae SDR - Saturday Delivery (800) 622-1147
Rerate information only {round to nearest inch)
Tracking Number Code $ Amount LBS L w H
NN s N (NN (mE.
N Y Y N N N Y I A Y T T T T AN U0 [ A | A ) { S ) ¢
N N YO 2 I T T T T e 2 T T o 4 O ¢ o
Y I T O 1 T 1 T T o T A N N TN N 4 O 4 I I O
O N T 1 e O 0 T e T T T T O ¢ I ¢ A I I
Glm:lﬂlltlmtapplr EffectiveDate | | |, | J/L 1§
[Jshipping Address (Physical Address) [IBilling Address Only [ )Billing Same As Shipplng Address
Mlcompamy LL 1 0 1 1t 0t 40t 14| b (Compamy LI AN LML I VIEIELL)
Biagress (L1 L 1 110 11 101 | E ) [ ) (mdbeess L L 0 1 F 0 ¢ 8 1 F 0§ L 11|
pdress L 1| 4 1 & 1 L 1 0 101 {0 | | ) [Addross L E 1 0 8 00 8P4 [ 4 31 L1
ot LI L E L F 1L 0P P00 b ] 1) [paee LB L L 10 104 LELE 4R 4]
Aor L L1 1 1] povsues L1 L | b ) jrer L L L I {1} ppusuner LI 1 1 1)
."CﬂylIIIlI'IIIllIliI!II{:ity|IIIS!IIIIIIIIIIII
sae Ll |  Zpcode LL L L 1 I-1L 1 1 1] [swe L1 ZoCodo L4 1 0 1 -1 0 11
PhanaLi...J._l-iilf—l'l'll NS N I N Y 1 O O N I O I |
PN I N O S 2 Y I O I Fax;IIII-IiI_I-IIIJI




Invoice Number "\

Invoice Date_\ [ Accoant Number ™\

2-937-57866

4072-3604-9

Oct 01, 2008

i

FedEx Express Shipment Detail By Payor Type {Originat)

* Fuel$ [ “Vil; shipment

= Dislancg Based Pricing, Zona b

Autom ation INET Sender Reciplent

Tracking ID 792110817505 Rodney Simmons Attn: Browyn Rovell

Servica Typa FedEx First Ovarnight Urilities, Inc. Rosa, Sundstrom & Baetley -Tal

Package Type Fad®x Envelope 2335 Sanders Rd 2548 BLAIRSTONE PINES DR

Zone 05 NORTHBROOK IL 60062 US TALLAHASSEE FL 32301 US

Packages 1 -

RatadWeight  N/A

Delivarsd Sep 23, 2000 07:5%

Svc Area A2 Transportation Charge 46.45
Signed by B.REVELL Fual Surchasge 16.0
FedEx Use 000000000/0000006/_ Tatal Chary uso 36248

-'fﬁe ixf;:hs ¢ -
+ DBistanca Based Pricing, Zong §

Autmmation INET Sender Bacipient

Tracking 1B T92110832 148 Rodnay Simmons Christian Maccalfi

Service Type FadEx 20ay Uhilitiag, Inc, flose, Sundsirom & Bentloy

Package Type fedEx Box 2335 Sanders Rd 2130 W STATE ROAD 434 STE 2118

Zone 123 NORTHBROOK IL 60062 US LONGWODD FL 32779 US

Packages 1

Raiad Waigit 1.0bbs, 05 kgs

Delivared Sep 24, 2008 14:13 Transportation Charge 1140

Svc Araa A2 Fue) Surcharge 285

Signud by LCOLLINS Discount 285

FadEx Use DO0000NOG/D00604G/ . Total Charge usp $1150

7 =

¢+ Fuel Surchargs - FedEx has spplisd o fusl surcharga of 34.50% to his shipment

s Distance Bazad Pricing, Zone 5

Automgtion INET Sender Baciplent

Tracking 1D NN Rodney Simmons Attn; Bromwyn Reved

Service Type FadEx Firgt Ovarnign Utilities, Ing. Rose, Sundstrom & Bentley -Tal

Packags Type Customer Packaging 2335 Sandars Rd 2543 BEAJRSTONE PINES DR

Zone 05 NORTHBROOK iL 60062 US TALLAHASSEE FI. 32301 US

Packages 1

Rated Waight 21.01s, 95 kgs

Deliverod Sep 23, 2006 07:51

Sve Area Az Transportation Charge 12200

Signed by B.REVELL Fuet Surcharge 4209
DAGADO000/0000042f usp $16402

FedEx Use Total Charge

«" Fuoi Surcharge - FodEx has epplied 2 fugl surcharga of 3450% to thig shipment
¢ Distancq Based Pricing, Zone 5

Automation INET Sander
Tracking 10 792111051104 Rodney Simmons
Service Typa FedEx First Gvarnight Utiliias, Inc.
Package Typa Customear Packaging 7335 Sandars Rd
Zone 05 NORTHBROOK IL 60062 US
Packages 1
Ratod Waeight 11.01bs, 5.0 kgs
Gelivered Sep 23, 2008 0751
. Svc Area A2 Transportation Charge
Continued on next page

flecipient

Attiy: Bronwyn Revell

Rose, Sundstrom & Bentloy -Tal
2548 BLAIRSTONE PINES DR
TALLAHASSEE FL 32301 US

U715

734 113




mﬁ Invoice Number _\ [ invoice Date \ [ AccountNumber Y Page

2-937-57866 Oct 01, 2008 4072-8604-9 4of 4
Tracking 1D 792111051104 continued
Signed by B.REVELL Fual Surcharge
FedEx Uss 000000000/0000012/_ Total Chavge _ usp

42
Fuel Surcharge - fe s appl

= Distance Based Pricing, Zone 5

SR DR 3
a i mrcha;gn of 3450

Automstion INET Seader

Tracking 1D 799378766562 Rodney Simmons Atin: Bromwyn Revall

Service Type FadEx First Ovarnight Uikties, Inc. Rose, Sundstrom & Bantey -Tal

Package Type Customar Packaging 2335 Sanders Rd 7548 BLAIRSTGONE PINES OR

Zone 05 NORTHBROOK IL 60062 US TALLAHASSEEFL 32001 US

Packages 1

Rated Waeight 16.01bs, 73kgs

Dalivered Sep 23, 2008 07:61

Svc Area Transportation Charge 110.60

Signed by Fual Surcharge 3
Total Charge usp 31890

FedEx Use

R LT LL L

Fu Y
= Distance Basad Pricing, Zong 5
« FadEx has sutlitad this shipment for correctpackages, weight, and gervice. Any changes mads are roffacted in the invoice amount,
« Package Deftverad so Reciplont Addrass - Relonse Authorized
+ The packags waight exceeds the maximumn for tha packaging typs, tharefore, FedEx Pak was reted as Customar Packaging.

Automation USAB Sender Recipiant

: Tracking 1D 866345159574 ERIN POVICH INTESAR TERKAW!

! Sarvice Type FodEx Standard Dvernight UTILITIES INC FL PSG

: Package Type Customer Packaging 2335 SANDERS RD 679 BLENHEIM LODP
Zone o NCRTHBROOK IL 60062-6108 US WINTER SPRINGS FL 32708 US
Packages 1
Rated Weight 6.01bs, 2.7 kgs Transportation Charge 4.2
Dalivered Sep 24, 2008 11:38 : Rasidential Delivery . 230
Sve Araa A? {liscount - 1115
Signed by 9999999293959 Fuel Suttharge 1223

FodEx Usa Totsi Charge

s -
Distance Basad Pricing, Zone $

fadExhas sudited this shipment far correct packages, waight, and servige. Any changes mads are reflacted I the invoice amount.
Packsge Daliared to ReciplentAddress - Release Authorized

The packsge woight exceeds the maximum for the packaging typa, thergfore, FedEx Pak was retsd as Customer Packaging.

Automation usap Seadet Bacipieat

Tracking 1D 865345159585 ERIN POVICH INTESAR TERKAWI

Service Typo FadEx Standard Qvarnight UTILITIES INC FLPSC

Package Type Customer Packaging 2335 SANDERS RD 579 BLENHEIM LODP

Zone 05 NGRTHBROOK IL 60062-6108 US WINTER SPRINGS FL 32708 US

Packages 1 .
Ratod Weight 5.01bs, 2.3kgs Transportation Charge 4145
Delivered Sep 24, 2008 11:38 Discount -10.36
Svec Avea A2 Fuet Surcharge 11.52
Signed by 9339990989990 Ragidential Delivery 2.3
fadEx Use 0267164410001349/02 Totai Charge vsp SUN

Third Party Subtotal UsSb $602.13

Total FedEx Express uso $607.13




: —Inveice Number ™ [ Tavoice Dats count t Page

2-776-63509 Jun 25, 2008 4072-8504-9 Toid

Fodtx Tox gpitr? 0 P43 G

BlagMins TN g
UTHITIES INE . 5008 NILITIES, INC.-REGULATORY Doc 7 5-4 5
ATTN: ACCTS PAYABLE iUl ~Z 70 ;
2315 SANDERS RD } HbRTHBROOKIL 60062-6108 s o Bovenme Sorvices
NORTHBROOK IL. 60052-6108 - Phone; {300} 622-1147 M-S 7-{CST)
T Fax: {800) 548-3020
.BOOOO é 7 Internet  www.fedex.com
invoice Summary Jun 25, 2008
FuiEx Express Soevices
Transportation Charges 48.20
Base Discount -1205
Spaciel Handling Charges 10.12
: Total Charges usD $46.27
! Fedix Greund Servises
_ Transportation Chargas 530
; Other Handling Chargas 0.0
' Total Charges usp 510,10
TOTAL THIS INVOICE UsD 5637
You saved $12.05 in discounts this pariod]
Other discounts may apply.
JUL 15 2008

o per o poan ey s oo il s s P Tnvoice Number Accoust Number Amount Dy
[N For change of dklnes, chack hosa s corpletz foan on eversa s 2-776-63509 4072-8604-9 USD $56.37
Remittance Advice |
Your payment is deee by Jul 19, 2008

WO?286042776635025000805L37YY

Bl baanllinadelasebuabibandodbuansllaledusonblslofabhueid

UTILTTIES ING FadEx
ATTN: ACETS PAYABLE P.0. Box 94515
2335 SANDERS RO PALATINE IL 60094-4515

WORTHBRODKL e0oct- 6100 AR [T TRER AR N R KA N

LT o
20T5T 0050199 R




Mx ' Tnvelce Nambor \ [ Tavoice Date \ [ Account Nmmber %F’;

2-776-63508 Jun25,2008 ||  4072-8604-9

FedEx Gromnd Shipment Summary By Payor Type
FedEx Grooed Shipments (( .

Ground-Bill Third Party

Total This laveice usp $56.37

HEBNEWI IR

- rmvmerasases o nes - e e ver 4 bmnas ma At panam m——— i e e mmme e e A Akl dn - Semsemmme o A RAERL NI ARES IL RN R oy mn s mmem o




Page

IMX- Invoice Nomber Invoice Date \ Amnmiumyu N

2-776-63509 Jun 25, 2008 4072-8604-9

FedEx Expross Shipment Detail By Payor Type (Original)

* Fusd Surcharge - FadEx hws appied & fusl surchargs of 2800% to this stipment,
* Distance Qesed Priclng. Zong 5

&0f

Automation INET Sepder Baciplent

TFracking D 751088385720 Erln Pavich Martin Frindman

Service Type FadEx Standard Ovamight UtlliGes, Inc. Tesa, Sendstrom & Bantley

Package Typa  FedExBox 2135 Sandors Rd 2180'W STATE ADAD 434 STE 2118

Zeona 05 NORTHBROOK L 60062 US LONGWEOD FL 32779 US

Packages 1

Ratod Walght 101hs, 05kps

Dokvarad Jun 15, 2008 1400 - Transpurtation Charge 8%
SvcArea A2 Fusl Savcharge L)
Signad by DAYDOLPH Biscount : —1H
FodBx Use 0o0B000eybmYT580L, Tatal Chiarge usD F77 5

. haxappied s el wirchargeof
s Distance Besod Pricing, Zoas §

Autamation INET Semler Becigioat

Tracking I 18109074403 Sum Lingeman Kathyy Lowell

Bervice Type FedEx Sandard Cvemight Ustisos, Inc. Funton & Wilsms LLP

Pachage Type FsttEx Envelope 2335 Sandars R 421 FAYETTEVILLE ST STE 1400

Zone 05 NORTHBROOK IL 6062 US RALEIGH NC 2760% LS

Packages 1

Rated Weight N/A

Dalvered Jun 23, 2008 1243 Transportation Charge 198

Svc Mrea FH Tiscount -481

Signas by TWILLAMS Fus) Suscharga 1M

Fadbx e O0MDCICRO0DTZI_ Toel Charge s 3T
Third Party Subtotal usD $46.27
Total FedEx Expross ush $4627

FedEx Ground Bill Third Party Dotail (Original)

Seader Becipipnt Transportation Charge
Bill 3rd Party, Do UTILITIES INC Division 0f Economi: Rogulaie Fusl 9
05 2335 SANDERS AD Rorida Pubilic: Setvice Commiss Tatal Charge Ush
1 NORTHBROOK IL. 60052-8708 2540 Shumard Gak Bivd

" ITABIONTEA Becipiext
Bl 3rd Party, Dom UTILTIES INC Division Ot Economic Rugulatic  Fuel Srcharge 040
i SANDERS RD Flosida Public Service Commtias Fotel Chmege usD <508
1 NORTHBROOK IL 60062-3100 2540 Shumacd Oak Bivd
1hs TALLAMASSEE FL 32399-0950
Jun 20, 2008

Bill Third Party Subtatal UsDh $10.10
Total FedEx Groumd usp $10.10

s ‘l,‘.




Mx- Tavolce lillb(sDrG\? Invmca£ N\ [ Account Number ™ Page

2-800-76862 L Jul 09, 2008 4072-8604-9
CCRERET FadEx g L2100
B 17255 0 ShipplogAddess %3
UTILITIES INC kj UTILITIES, INC-REGULATORY Dt %
ATTN: ACCTS PANABLE 2335 SANDERS RD ice Questions?
2335 SANDERS RO~ NORTHBROOK }L. 60062-6108 vaic e e Services
NORTHBROOKIL 60062-6108 Fhone: (800} 6221147 }-Sa 7-6(CST)
fax: {800} Mf : 20
lmm SIlllIiII"Jlll m'm Internet VAW .lenax.Com
FeddEx Express Seryices
Trensportation Charges 4645
Special Handling Charges 1301
Total Charges usD $59.46
FedEx Groumd Sorvices .
Transportation Charges 9.30
Other Handling Charges 0.80
; Tota! Charges uso $10.10
;. TOTALTHIS INVOICE uso $69.56
' Other discounts may apply.
-
JuL 19 2008
=
—
B=
=
—
]
[
=
&%Mﬂﬂﬂ&ﬂ“&“”m Tnvoice Number | Account Number Amount Dve N
{1 for ehiange of auions, chevk hera ad complets Jorn o8 evers it 2-800-76862 4072-8604-9 USD $63.56
Remittance Advice
Your paymtent is dus by Jul 24, 2008

Yo72ab04280076L9628100000695675

II “ll“ lll“tll'llIIIIIIIllltll'l’llll“lil'lll‘l“lll'l“ll!l

UTILITIES INC FedEx
ATTN: ACCTS PAYABLE P0. Box 94515
ﬁfﬁs‘:ggffw-m PALATHNE IL 60534-4515
el daadtih ol o TR Db fc bk d o da ool 1)

9S0000N2043




Mx’ Tavoice Number N\ [ Invoice Date \| Account Number \  Page
2-800-76962 Jul D9, 2008 4072-8604-9 Bat4

FedEx Groand Shipment Summary By Payor Type
{Original

Eroumd-Bill Third Party

06/25 ) 2 S 030 1016
Ground-Sill Thied Suhtotal $10.10

Tatal Thig Invoice vsD . $69.56

[ —1
p——
e
—
-
—
—
——
iS5
-




Inwoice Rumber \ [ Invoice Date \ [ Account Nsmber \ . ‘g%' -

2-600-76362 Jul 09, 2008 407786049
FodEx Express Shipment Detail By Payor Type {Original)

Fusl Surcharge - FedExhas appliod o fus! surchargs of 20.00% i this shipnant
= Dismncs Basad Pricing Zome 5
¢ statemptJul @2, 208 «1 8724 AM,

* Packans Deiiysrad o Recipiant Address - Release Authoried

Autometion INET Somdor Beciplent

Tracking ID 9T 225 Erin Povich Martin Friadman

Service Type FedEx First Ovarnight Unitas, Inc. Ruse, Sundstrom & Bantiey

Package Typs  FedEx Ewvalope 0% Seadersfd - 2180 W STATE RGAD &34 STE 2110

Zone & NORTHERGOK L 00052 US LONGWORD FL 32779 US

Packages 1

Ratzd Woight /A

Delivared Jul02, 2009 08:28

Svc Area A2 Transportation Eharge :ﬁaﬁ

Signed by M5 Fual Surcharge

FedEx Usg CONI0ONIGIE0NENORAT: Tatel Chavge ) F Y]
Third Party Subtotal usp $50.35
Total FedEx Express uUsp $59.06

Ground Bill Third Party Detail {Original)

003 7310011823 e Bativiant . Testrsportation Charge 455
Service Type  Bill 3nd Party, Dom UTILIMES ING- Division OF Economic Regelatio Fusl Surchargo 048
Zone & 2335 SANDERS RD Florida Pubic Ssrvice Commiss  Teéal Coarge UsD %55
Packages 1 NCATHBROOK IL 60062-8108 7548 Shurnsrd Dak B
Actel Weight  621hs TALLAHASSEE AL 32393-0850

Rated Wolght  tbe
Dedtvered Jun 30, 2008

Tracking 1D Fander Beciplent Transparistion Charge 485
Sarvica Type Bl 3nd Parly, Dom UTHITIES INC Division of Economic Regulatio Fuel Surcha 040
Zene s 2335 SANDERS R Florida Public Sarvice Commiss ~ Tatal Charge [T~ T
Pathages 1 NORTHBROLK It 500626103 2540 Shuemesd Oak Blvd

AcwmalWalght 02Mbs TALLAHASSEE AL 32399-0850

Ratad Weight  1ibs
Deliverad Jun 30, 2008

Bil! Third Party Subtotal ~~ USD ___$i610
Total FedEx Groand usp $10.10




Fe&x, .900&067 Invoice Number \‘ Invoice Date '\ [ Accownt Number \ o

T en 2-§38-03114 Jul 30, 2008 0606-2634-0 1of10
- Tl S22
Billing Address: Shipping Address;
UTILITIES INC UTILITIES ING Doc SP760
ATTN: ACCTS PAYABLE 2335 SANDERS RD Imeoice QesBorsF "
2335 SANDERS RD NORTHBROOK IL 60062-6108 Contact Fadix Rewenus Services
NDRTHBRODK If, 60052-8108 ‘ Phone: (300} 622-1147 M-Sa 7-5{CST)
Fax: {800} 548-3020
laveice S Jul 30, 2008 i_ﬁ‘g:_:cf"':“ 23 g*E"\ internet.  www.edex.com
FedEx Express Sevvicas E;\: R “ ' '
Transportation Charges g . FU0 -7 00 ¢ 81500
Base Discount x T -2319
r_ Special HandEng Charges L O et 305.03
, Totsl Charges usp $916.34
: .
: Transportation Charges 542
: Other Handling Charges - 1249
Performence Pricing Discount £9.22
Total Charges usD 31768
TOTAL THIS INVDICE Usb $934.03

You taved $200.01 in discounts this period]

Other discounts may apply.

AUG 0 5 2008

LT

oo el e ks ot e [ Jryolco Nuwber | Account Nuwher | Amount De
7 d supeor fold, P make chack paysble o Fedbx
0 o o i o bt e 2REA || O06%3A0 | USDSAm |

Remittance Advice
Your payment iz dug by Aug 14, 2008 _ :

0L0L2L342435033140700009340345

EthalluWanblindnlileshsblssndldiluasstllodithsed

WTILITIESINCG FadEx
ATTN: ACCTS PAYABLE £.0. Box 34515
253 SANDERS R PALATINE iL 60034-4515

NORTHBROOK IL 50052-6103 “IIllll"“l'II"Illllil“lt"l"lIII“IIIIl]Iu“ll"l"lllll"lll‘ll"

|RRAAT ~ -

h




. nveice or |

2-838-03114

" Accouat Number

0606-2634-0

FedEx Express Shipment Summary By Relerence

NG REFERENCE INFORMATION 7 1510 77400
2B5105-2009507 1 2145
LARRY 1 980

1 10 875

S TOVER

FedEx Grownd Shigment Summary By Roferonce

29156
573

233

P
Cine

13
1288
as9

Total This Iavoice

U sk P 1T




Feix- | invoice unbg N\ | Isvoice Date Account Nember \  Page
2-838-03114 Jul 30, 2008 0606-2634-0 4ot 10

FedEx Express Shipmeat Detail By Reference {Original)
E et g o

stircharge ol udﬁmom.
» [istance Based Pricing, 2oas &

» FedExhas sudiied fikt shipment for correct packages, weight, and sarvice, Any chengws made sra refloctad i the lvolcs srtount.
* Wa osloulated your charges based ona dimensionnl weight of 2101bs,, 20" 220" x 17", dividod by 19

Anomation INET Souder Easiplont

Tracking TI236453486% Rodiey Simmons Tom Koys

Servica Type FadEx 2Day Uiikties, tag. 144 LEDBLIRY DR

Package Type Customer Packaging 2336 Sanders R LOWNGWOOD FL 3277 US

Zone 05 ROCRTHBRODK L 60062 US

Pachages t -

Acturl Weight 1500s, 85kgs

Ratad Weight 2300, 10.5kgs Transportetion Change d
Daclorod Vaive  USD 80000 * Fuul Surgharge 1054
Dafivared Jul7Z, 008 1216 Declarad Valoa Charge 250
Sve Avea Az Direct Signature o
Signed by E.ROBERTS Discount -11.23

FadEx Use 0BP0O0000/I0BO4G,_ Total Chawge (0]

<" Fuel Surchargn - FEX huz applod & el surcharge of 22808 ta this shigr ent.
s Distance Bessd Pricieg, Zom 3
* Packsge sent from: 60045 3ig cods

Automation USAB . Jondar Eaciplent

Tracking 0 0345557715560 SEAN PWILSON MR JERRY QAN

Sarvica Typa FedEx Express Saver UTIUTIES INC {EPA

Package Type FadEx Eovelope 2335 SANCERS RD 1021 NORTH CRAND AVE €

Zuyns ] NMORTHBROON I S000Z-6108 US SPRINGFIELD IL 82784 US

Packrges | .

Estod Weight  N/A

Gefvored Jul 22, 2008 03:49 ‘Franyporution Charge 950
Sve Arsa AA - Fusl Surcharge b1
Signed by AHORN Discount %

FedExtisa 02001 34093/000083Y. Total Churge usp

v rus&wmm-naan'm-wmhuudemmm
¢ Distwmos Basod Priving, Zane 5

Atomation NET Seler Bexlpien

Tiacking 1D 79005572157 Rodmay Smmoes Angela Burroughe

Sarvice Type FedEx Starfard Overnight Utiites, e, Caroliza Water Service bnc. SC

Package Type Customer Packaging 2935 Sandars R4 - 110 Qussn Parkway

Zove [ HORTHBROOK 1L 60062 US WEST COLUMBIA $C 20969 S

Packagos | I :

Had Woight 10.0Ds, 45 kgs Transpostation Charge s
DeciargdValue  USD 230008 Fual Surcharge .25
Defverad Jul 72, 2008 1208 Deciarod Value Charge LG
Sve Aren Al Dirsct Signature 000
Signed by ACOLPEPPER Qiscount -M.51

FadEx Use FO0D000NCD00 1349/ Tetal Clange usD e




Invoice Nember \ [ invgice Date \ [ AccoustMumber \  rag
2-838-03114 Jul 30, 2008 0606-2634-6 Sott

< Diswace Based Peicing, Zone S

Autometion (NET

Trucking I 796382001847
Service Type FedEx Standard Dvernigint
Package Typw Customor Packaging
ZTone (]

Packages 1

Ratad Weight 1t01bs, 50kgs
Bectared Value  LISD 2.200.00
Oelivesed Jul 12, AGE 1328
Sve Amoa A2

Sigmed by Lol

FedixUse

s

CaDE00000/D08H 348/

= Distance dased Pricing, Zone &

* FusiSurcharga - FecExhas eppied & et sutcherye of 22 5% lo this shipment

Tots] Change

» Fusl Surchargd - FedEx hag applied a fuel surcharpe of X250% t thie etipeent.

Sanday Becipien

Rodney Simmons Kris Thompson

Utiktias, Inc. Loiisiana Wate Sarvice -

2335 Sandors R 201 Holiday Bhd

NORTHBROOKIL 80082 US COVINGTON LA 70433 US

Tranaportaion Charpe B158

Fael Surcharge - 150

Glsconnt -39

Diracy Signatire um

Doclared Value Cherge _____ _B29
"] ms

» FodBxhas audited this shipmant for sarrect packapss, weight, snd sarvice. Aty changes ngde are enfpcted b the Involoe amount.
¢ Wacakylamd your charges tased on a dimensionsi weight of 1.0 ks, 38 X 13k &, divided by 154,

Mstomstion INET

Tracking 1 TO058867871G:
Sarvice Typo FodEx Stsndard Overnight
Package Typa Guswoner Packaging
Zoow o

Packages )

AcmalWaight 100108, 45 kg
Retmd Yaight 10 Ibs, 6O kg
Duclarad Value  USD 2, 20000
Daliverad Jut 23 2008 13:42
Sve Area AM

Sigred by RSTANDIFER

FadEx Use

DUODOOUNA001327

* Distance Based Pricing, Zone 2

+ Fusl Surchorge - FadExhas npolied a fued surchargs of 32 50K, i this shipment

* Paokage Dolvacud 1o Racipisnt Address - Releans Authoroet)

Aulamation INEY

Tracking ID TISEE5 102 1T

Servies Type Fadtx Sandard Ovoraight
Patkage Typa Cussomer Packaging
Zosip - - —gF v SN
Packages 1

Ratad Waight S.0ibs, 2.3 kqa

Deciarad Valwe  USD ¥50.00

Defivoreg il 23, 2008 11:51

Sve Atea AM

Signed by 9959999593399
FadExUse 00000000001 29302

. Delvary Ares-Resi

Sopder Racigiert -

Rodney Sksmons Bryan Sandefur

Utikties, Inc. Water Service Corp-of KY - WK

139 Sandors fd 122 £ Combetiant Ave

ROWTHBROOK 1L s0052 US MIDLESBORO KY 40865 US

Transporricn Chargs 5540

Fuel Surcharge 1B =8

Delvary Area Surcharge-Conmercia! 1w =

Dizcount -1385 E

Divect Signature ! 000 5=

Declared Yaluse Charge 1320 g

Yotal Chusys uso MR on
E
=
]
=
=

Soidnr Bacipient

-Hodney Simiaons Tim Brandt

Uiities, inc, Galeua Temmory Utilites, la

- 2335 Sanders Rd % Moraine wey
" NORTABROOK 1L 60067 US GALENAIL 61086 US

Transportation Charge
Discount

Resiiential Dolivory
Declaced Yalio Charge
Fusl Surckarge

Totel Chasyo




tnwoice Date

\ [Acceust Number ™\

Jul 30, 2008

reharge - FedEx has applied 8 fusl surcharge of 52.59% 1 this shipmanc,
* Digiance Basad Pricing, Zoas 6

0606-2634-0

¢ FadEches sadind e ahipment fpr correct paciages, weight, snd carvice. Any changes mode are reflscted i fhe invoice smount

= Wecalculatod your charges based on a dimenzionsl weaight of 209 lhs, 22°x21°x 17, dvided by 154,

Tracking 0 Feosase IR Redney Simmons aAnn

Service Typs FaiEx Pricsity Overmight Liktes, inc. " Utilitlex, Inc of Horida

PackagaTyps  Custemer Packaging 2335 Sandars Rd 200Wagthorsfickd Ave

Zone L NORTHEBRADOK 1. 80062 US ALTAMONTE SPRINGS FL 32704 U5

Packapss t

Actugl Weight 2000 21 kg5

Ratad Waighit 2500, 13.2kgs .

Dolivered Jul 24, 2008 0Rc28 Tranapoctation Charge HIR
Svc Arsa A Fuol Surcharge mE
Signed by SIPASQUALE Discount -22A3
FedExiea Toial thone [T I

DOmNO00BNAB1552/_

« Fosl Surchergs - FedEx hag applied « fusl surcharg® of 71.50% 10 s shipmant,
¢ Dishince Buset Pricing, Zone 4

Autowwation INET Sowmder Beclhyiand

Tracking 10 TI0549602428 Rodney Simmons Eryan Sandofur

Sorvica Tyne FedEx Etandard Cvernight Usiies, inc. ‘Water Servica Dorp of KY - Mid

Package Type Custear Packaging 2535 Sanders Rd 1321 E Cambariand Ave

lone 0 NOATHERGOK L 80062 U5 MCDLESBORO KY 40065 US

Fackages 1

Bated Weight 205, 08kgs Transportation Charge DAL

Datvared Jul 28, 2006 1059 Dizcount 1%

$vu Arwa AM Fucl Surchaege bl

Saned by RMCINTYRE Defivesy Asaa Surcharge-Commercial 150
0U0000UI0/0001 327/, Tots! Churge () 8E

FodEx Use

Fuol Surchargs - FadEx has spplied s fual surcharga of 2250% 1o Bhis shlpment
+ Distance Based Priciag, Zone §

= FadBohas audited this i:wmfwcméipaclqu.mluht And swviea. Any chitiges made are reflactedin the fwoice smoyrt

Tracking 1 791932800424 Rodney Simmons Genle Buckner
Senvice Typs FodEx Stendard Gvemight ttitdes, Ing. Carobng Watar Ssvice . 8C
Package Type Fustomer Packaging 1395 Sandors Ad 110 owen Pasknsy -
Zons 1] NORTHERODK K. #0062 U'S WEST COLAMBIA SC 70188 US
PaCkages 1 R

- Mqu ........ m"’xl‘m‘ P “T’lm‘mma“ PTG bt 8 ErrErme—————— R . mm
Declaced Value  USD %60.06 Beclared Vaive Charga 360
Delivered Jol 24, 20090 1213 Fuel Surcharge 1.0t
Svi: Arasa Diract Signates 000
Signed by Digeount -1755
FodEx Uso Total Charge uss

ﬂlﬂ&lﬁlﬁ-ﬁﬂ:ﬁlh-llwlpﬁl' : damlwidﬂpm bl "
= Distance Besad Pricing. Zone 5

+ FudEx has sudited thig shipment for comect packager. waight, snd servics. Any chanyes made are raflected in the irvoics snount.

Agtomation INET Sendey
Tracking 1D 791532804435 Redney Simmons
Sewvice Type FadEx Standard Dvarmight Utilities, lne.
Package Type Customor Packaying 2338 Sanders Rd
Zone 5 NGRTHBROOK K. 60062 US
Packages 1
Rated Weight 7701y, 123kps Fronsportation Charge
Daclarad Yalue Ush Buoe Diract Signaturs
Continued on next page

L " N,

Becipiont

Gonie Buckrer

Carolina Water Sarvice lnc. SC
110 Oueen Parkway

YWEST COLUMEIA SE 70388 1S




Invoice Number N\ [ Tnveice Date \ [ Account Nmmber \ P%—
. 2-838-03114 Jul 30, 2008 0606-2634-0 Fof}
Tracking ID; 791932004435 continigd
Dofwered Jul 24, 2008 12:13 Daclered Value Charge 140
Svc Arap Al Fuel Swrcharge ni
Signed by R.5CHWIEZ {iscount o 2579
Q0000N0ONOCU 1343, Total Chargs [T

b4

. Fualﬁam ~FadExhs appéad » fuel surcharge 57 32.50% 1 Sux shipment.

« Distence Bazad Pricing, Zone 4
Aardomation INET Somler Bagicient
Tracking ID 732930812 Rodney Sanans Boom 1540455
Sorvica Type FodEx Stundard Ovemight ttllives, Inc. Fad EX Lock Box 360853
Packago Type Custowaer Packaging 2335 Sandess Re 500 Rocs swest
Zona o NORTHBROOK L 60082 US PITTSBURGH PA 15262 US
Packages 1
Aated Woight 1.5 [bs, 6.5 kgs
Dalivered Jut M, 2008 015 Transponation Chasga b R
;I'l: Area Al Fuef Surchergs .::
L TRESSUEAECTION Discount
gned by - -

FadEx Usa

000000000A0001327,

»" Fe) Surchargs - Faux has spplied a fsl coroharge of SL50K 0 thi shypment

+ Olstancs Hesed Priciog, Zone 4

Automation INET Semdey Betiplent

Tracking WY 793355804069 Rodnay Simsnons Jamus Ksaper and Miki Di0onate

Service Typa FedEx Standerd Dvernight tNifies, Ing. Colchester Publlic Service Corp

Package Typa Customer Packaging 2338 Sanders Bd 10009 Grsen Swwat

Zom o NORTHEROQOK (L 80082 US LORTON VA 22039 US

fackagos 1 ’

Rated Walgnt 180 hs, 82003 Tramportation Charge 7365
Declwred Valao  USD 5,00000 Discount -1848
Doliverad Jul 24, 208 1158 Diwect Signature - 000
Svi Area A Duciared Valus Charge 3000
Signad by JKASPER fuel Sorchamge — 1800
FedEx Use 0ECO0DOOGNBTT I Tatel Chasrgye use s

+ Fual Sarchacge - FodEx has sppéied o el surchengs of 50K to biis shipment.
* Distance Bessd Pricing, Zono 4
* Packags Deliverad to Reciplent Addresy - Refease Avthorizad

Automstion usag Soniee Excipient

Tracking 0 863FINIGITI6 L STONE J STOVER GSOWELL -

Service Typa Fedfx Standacd Quarsight UTIUMES INC -

Package Tyipe FadEx Envelope 2335 SANDERS R 2920 MILFDRD CTS SW

Zoae o NORTHERUOK 1L 600626108 US MARIETTASA 30000 US

FPackngss 1

ErdWeight WA Transportation Charge 1835
Dalhvared Jul 24, 2008 12:48 Besidemt Dolivery 23
SV Aroa N Discouat -:g
Sianed by 8999599999899 Fuel Swcharge —_— .23
FadExUse G20509054/00002%400 Toul Charge #sD s

U R




Invoice Number  \

= Fael Surcharge - Fedix has apphed o Waf surcharge of S2 1% o this ship

+ Qistance Bacad Prigig, Zona B
Automation usAB

Tracking tb E65423390762

Shrvice Type FedEx Priority Overmight

PackspaType  FadEx Envelops

Zone s

Phd'ums 1

Rued Waight N/ :

Dolvared .l 20, 2008 0

Sve Assa ] ‘

Signad by S.DIPASQUALE
Q20519054R000215/,_

FadEx Uss

= Fual Surcherge - Fedex e sppied  fusd surcharys

* Distance Bases Pricing, Zors §
Automation usAB

Tracking ID 8554230013
Sonvice Type FodiEx Priority Overnight
Package Type FodEx Envalope
Zooo 05
Pickiges 1
Ruwd Vraight NA
Sifverad Ju) 25, 2008 02:58
Sve Ao Al
Signad by L GEDDINS
2206177 1600082 197_

FedEx Ve

* Distmue Besed Pricing, Zona 5

2-838-03114

Invoice Date \ | Account Number '\ Page
Jui 30, 2008 8 -

* Fuel Surcharpe - Fasgxhas apphd 5 sl sureharge of 2 50% 1o thi

Sagiler Basiplest

TOM FEDERILCD SUE DIPASQUALE

UTILITIES INC UTILITIES INC

2335 SANDERS RD 200 WEATHERAELD AV

NORTHBROK It 500826108 US ALTAMONTE SPRINGSFL 32TH8 US

Transportation Chargs 2145
Discomnt 5.3
Fuel Surcharga s
Totel Chiavpn [17-1] [

Sondey Reciplent

TON1 FEDERICO TRISH

UNLIMES INC SOMITROL SECURITY SYSTEMS

2335 SANGERS R 855 TILE DR

HORTHAROOK AL S0062-5100 US CHARLESTON SC 29465 US

Transportation Charge nas
Fuel Syrcharga 523
ixcount 5.9
Total Charge ) e

v Tachege Delvarad is Reciplant Addrass - Rolaass Authorized

Auomaton  USAB

Tracking i 05423390784
Sarvieo Type FodEx Priority Dvemight
Piackage Type FadEx Envelops

Zone 05

Pbckages 1

RamdWeight /A

Defvored Jut 25, 3008 1028

Swc Ares A2

Signed by 929999999999

FedEx Usa 020813131A0000213202

* Distantd Basad Prizing, Zore §

Automation usas

Tracking 10 865473391129

Sarvice Type FadEx Priarity Overnight
PhckageType  FedEx Envelops

Zoze o5

Pickages 1

Rited Welghe NA

Dallverad Jul 75, 2008 10048

Sve Area AT i

Continued on next pag

¢ Fuol Surchargs - FedEx has applisd 8 fwel surcharge of 52.50X

fsofer

TONI FEDERICO
UTILITIES NG
2335 SANDERS RD
NORTHEROONK 1L 80062-6100 US

Yransportation Charge
Diseount

Sandey Beciplant

SAM GOMEZ DECKS UNLIMITED

UTILITIES INC 143 BEAXCREEK CRT

2375 SANDERS RD BLYTHEWDOD 5C 29015 US

NORTHBROGX AL BO0GZ-€103 US

Transportation Chacge Fi¥ 3

Delivery Arog-Resi .30
.. Rusldanta Dalivery - - . 2

Discount 538

Fus! Surcharge sn

Yotel Charge (5] 27

Hegiplost

SCEEG :

220 OPERATION WAY DEFT 23

CAYCE 5C 23033 Us
N45
536




FE(!)(, livoice Number ™\ invoice Date [ Account Number ", Page

c T e 2-838-03114 Jul 30, 2008 0606-2634-0 SoftD
Trecking (0: 865423391 129 continusd
by W.RERZ Fuel Surch, tye . 52
gﬁ:w OB T7FIB0000214/_ T:ilch;e ¢® %

NO REFERENCE INFORMAT|ON Reference Subtotal usp 7245

* Funl Surchangs - FodEx has mppiied & Axel surgharge of
* Distance Baswd Pricing, Zone §

Teacking 12 65423381200 o ROCHOSEN JOCELYN STEPHENS
Service Type FedEx Pricrity Dvernight UTWINES INC . RPSC
Package Type FedEx Envoiope 2335 SANDERS RD 4350w KENNEDY BLVD STE 310
Zane 3 HORTHBROOK It. 80062-6108 US TAMPA FL 33000 U5
- Packagez t

Ratad Waight NA :
Dalivered Jul 23, 2009 0852 Transportation Chasge 245
Sve Arca &4 Bisconm, ; 536

- Signed by D.BOONE Fuol Surchargas 523
Fadfe Uss G2041879300062 Y9 Totul Charge [T [~<F -]

206100-2009507 Referance Sulitotal uso 2

e -Foellx has apphod » hisl suroharde ol 32 50% 1 s shipersnt.

Tha dellvafy commiiment for FodEx 2Way to reskdences Gncluding hamg ofices)is ¥ P.M. the vacond business day for A1, 42, AR, AY, AL A5, ABAM, PM, and RM sarvics sress.

-
-
*

Distance Based Priving, Zone 2 ==
* Package Deliversd to Racipiont Address - Raleasy Autharized g
Mgomasion USAB Sawdnr Heciplunt E
Tracking 10 085423380670 AARAY SCHUMAGHER JULIE NELSON =
Service Type FedEx 20y UDIUTIES INC . -
Package Type  FadFx Envelops 2335 SANDERS HD 1724 PRINCETON GATE o=
Zona 0z HORTHRAGOK 1, SO061-Y08 1S CARMEL IN 96032 US ;ﬁ;
Packages 1 o
RewdWeigt  NA Transpastation Charga o B2
Dolversd Juk 24, 2008 1210 Fuel Surcharge - 18 o=
Svc Araa Az Residontial Dolvery ) %
Signad by o Discount e 24
FadEx Use 020N 19783/0001 108/07 Total Chupe uso $i2as
LARRY Reforence Subtotal Uso $1288

* Fuyl Surcharge - FadEx bas apphed 2 & Wi
+ [Distance Based Pricing, Zens s

Autnantion USAB Baciglent

Vracking 18 BESAZI39060 1 JOHN STOVER BAARIA CAMACHD

Sorvics Type FedEx Express Saver UTILMES INC NORRS MCLAUGHLIN & MARCUS PA

Package Type Fodfx Pak ) 2375 SANDEHS RD 721 ROUTE 202.206

Zons [/ NORTHBROCK IL €0062-6108 US BRIDGEWATER N 08807 US

Packages !

Rawed Waight 101y, 05 kga

Debvered Jut 23, 2008 00:40 Transportason Chargy 875

Sw; Ares A2 Discoum <2A%

Sknedby 931 Fusl Surcharge 13

FodFx Use CHO3TRES40007173/_ Tom! Cheege ush [>T
S TOVER Relerence Snhtotal usp 965

Tatal FedEx Express usp 91639




Mx. Tnveice Number Tavoice Date \ MM,_%,

2-838-03112 Jul 30, 2008 0606-2634-0

UTILTIES INC nuk i fuel Surcharga

Zona 2375 SANUERS RO Utiliias Ing Of Florida Porfomancefricing ~ _ -4m
Packzges 1 NORTHBRODX K, 500626108 200 Weathorfiald avg, Total e Ush k.1
AvasiWlgin  25hs ) Algnonte spring FL 32714-8027 .
Ratad Waight 3ibs
Delivered Jul 23, 2008

NO REFERENCE INFORMATION Reforonce Subtotal usb $5.69

FedEx Ground Miscellancous Charges USD $1208
{se0 summary section)

Total FodEx Ground ushD $17.60

|
i
i
H




} Fﬂ Jiivoice Namber ™ [ Tavoice Date. \ | Account Number >, Page
.« 7 2-898-94300 Sep 03, 2008 4072-8604-9 Tof4
FedEx Tax 1D: 71-0427007

- 3000067
Billing Address: Shipping Addcess:
mTf{s: gscmv L UTILITIES, INC.-REGULATORY
: ABLE 2335 SANDERS RD
2335 SANDERS RD NORTHBROOK L 60052-6108 ey uattons? = Services .
NORTHBROQK i1 80062-5108 Phona; {800) 622-1147 M-Sa 7-6{CST}
: Fax: 18D0) 548-3020
Inwice S wry Sen 03, 2008 Internet:  wwyrfedax.com
FodEx Exprase Serviees '
Transportation Charges 40870 ' 5
Base Discount 8778 Barch I 6/573
- Special Handling Charges 1o ? :
Total Charges usD $431.65 555 3
TOTAL THIS INVOICE uso $13165 Doc
You saved $87.76 bn discounts Yis period)
Gther discounts may apply.
b~
=S
. =
~ENE =]
. =
SEP 08 2008 =
| =
e B
Sgp 0 9 2008 =

Sosmoms g el e o s oncn it r et o op Nubier Account Number Amownt Dae
13 For changa oF addess, chietk hore end compiate form 0. scecsa Sida, 2-898-94300 4072-8504-9 UsD $43165
Remitance Advice

Your paywwont is dae by Sap 18, 2008

40724b04289894300290000431L508

l%“ll"Illuillllllulll II'Il|l,llllﬂllIllll!ll“l‘l’llllll’
UTLITIESING . FedEx

AVTN: ACCYS PAYABLE P.0. Box 34515
TSRO0k Eoca108 PALATINE IL 00044515
LB LG it i D Ll

T —

| 1




) 2-898-94300

Invoice Number \ [ Invoice Date_\ [ Account Number Pege
Sep 03, 2008 4072-8604-9 3o0f4

FedEx Exprass Shipment Detaif By Payor Type (Original)

o e B
Fusl Sure FodEx has eppliad & foel sunchargs
* Distange Basad Priving, Zone &

Automation INET Seniy

Tracking THTA23390F Erin Povich Manin Friedwman

Sanvice Type FadEx Standard Overaigivt Utilttias, ne. Rave, Sucdsxam & Bentlay

Package Typo FedEx Bux, 233% Sandace Z160'W STATE ROAD 234 STE 211t

Zene » NORTHBROODK IL 60062 US LOMEWOOD FL 327178 US

Packsgas i .

Batod Woeight 208, 3.3kys

Doilversd Aug 27, 2008 09:31 Transportation Charge 8775
Sve Ares A2 B count 2154
Signed by MPARKS Fuel Sutcharga an
FadEx Use Towmi Charge usp E 151

000D0000N/DA0345_.

) Burciarge - FadEx has appliad & fusl surchirgs of S4,50% 3
+ Oistmce Baced Pricing Zona §

Aurtomation INET Sander Becipinat

Tracking ID 43121897 Erin Povich Mardin Frigdman

Servica Type FedEx Sandard Overnight nittdes, Inc. Rose, Sodswom & Bentey

Packege Type FadEx Box 2335 Sandurs Rd 218G STATE ROAD 434 STE 2118

Zome 5 NORTHBROOK 1L 60062 US 1ONGWOOR FL, 22778 US

Packages 1

Rated Weight 20, 9.0 kys

Daiiversd Aug 7, 20080201 Transpwtation Charge nx

Svg Aroa A2 Fuq! Sarcherge 2n ==

Signed by M.PARKS Discomt N =

FedEx Uise 0000000034, Totel tharge ol — |
g
==

; X E— ]

= Fuel Surcharge - FadEx hat appliad a fuel swretarge of 31.50% to this stipmsnt: E

* Oietance Pased Pricing, Zene 5 —

« FadExhas sudfied fhis shipmant for carract packeges, waight, snd sawvice. Any changes @uds are raffectsd in the kruoice smoum. E

Atomztion INET Suler Becipiant —

Tracking 10 7900420052 Erin Povich Maria Frisdnan 5

Sorvica Typs FedEx Standard Ovemight Linties, ne. Ros, Sundsirom 3 Baney

Package Type Cusiomor Packaging 23%5 Sanders Ad ZIE0W STATE ROAD A4 STE 7118

Zsha as NORTHRROOK IL 60082 US LONGWIOD AL 32179 US

Packegez 1

cooRadWelght RO kg e . — .

Debvared Aug 77, 2008 033 Trentportation Chacge 1

Sve Aren ::P ” Discownt 25

Sagmed by AR fuel Surcharge hr 1]

FedEx Usa 0OODOGOUE,/ DN 49/ Tetel Charge UsD ]

rge
* Distance Based Pricing, Zone 5

* FadExhas sudtied Ssis shipment for correct pachges, wight, aod servize Ary changat made are reflacted in the imvolet amoumt,

Avtomstion INET Feader

Teacking iD 798001423132 Exin Povich

Sarvice Type FedEx Standard Ovemight Uiilities, Ine.

Packaga Type Customar Packaging 2305 Sanders Rd

Zone a5 HORTHBROOK It. 60062 uUS
Packages i :

Rated Weight 200 s, 9.1 ks

Continued on next page

Becipiest

Martin Friedman

Ruse, Sundstroin & Bentlay

2180 W STATE ROAD £ STE 2118
LONGWOOD FL 32773 US




{ Fﬁ, [ Taveics Mumbier [ Tavoice Date \[ AccousiWumber \ _bags _

2-898-84300 Sep 03, 2008 A072-8604-8
Tracking [D: 798001423132 continued
Balvarad Aug 27, 2008 0931 Transportation Chargs 8775
x :;l:' A2 Discount '-Z!‘;.-;;
WLPARKS Fuet Surcharge i
f FodEx Uise 0000000000138/ Tosd Charge Wb 851

sircharge of SL80% t ths shipment

. weharge [
* Distance Head Pricing, Zone §
* Istaitompt Aug 26, 2008 ot 0B 14 A,
+ Package Dalivarad 1o Recipisnt Addneas - Releese Authorized
Avstomation INEY Saniec Beclginnt
Tracking ID 799067497559 Etin Povich Martin Friedaan
Sarvice Type FedEx First Overnght tlides, Inc. Rase, Sundetrom S Gartlay
Packaga Typs  FodExBox 2335 Sanders Rd 2190W STATE ROAD 438 STE 118
i Zone L] NORTHBROOK L 60062 US LONGWOOD FL 32T US
. Packages 1
Ratod Weight 1.0, 0.5 kgs
Cafvered Auy 28, 2008 08;17
Sve Araa A2 Transpertation Charge S7.70
Sigmed by TS5 Fuef Surcharge ) 1))
fedEx Use $00000C0NR000G) 2702 Tatel Chacys 50 i
Third Party Subtotal usp $431.65

Total FedEx Express ush YIS




Invoice | _Accownt Number %e
e A S TN 2-920-91961 Sep17,2008 ||  4072-8604-9 Tory
SEP 22 2433 ‘J FedEx Tax ID: 710427007 |
. LS N san__ 2649
UTILTIES INC UTILITIES, INC -REGULATORY 7
ATIN: ACCTS PAYABLE 2335 SANOERS A0 laveice ’ 99‘?
2335 SANDERS RD NORTHBROOK iL 60062-6108 mm%mm___
: NORTHBRDOK IL 60082-6103 Phone: {900 622-1147 M-Sa 7-B {EST)
' Fax: (800} 54?;3020
Invoice &mmsep 17, 2008 Intemet  wwwfsdex.com
FdEx Express Services
Transportation Charges 18390
Base Discount -34.36
- Special Handling Charges £3.90
Total Chargas USo $21352
TOTAL THIS JNVOICE usp $21352
You savad §38.33 in discounts this pariod|
Other discounts may apply. ﬂm 0 1 2008
=
=
QCT O 1 2008 —
=
-
=
=
g —
4
T Tommomm o o o e | Invoice Number }l Aceountﬂmﬁérﬂ Amount Dve_ )
Plibse S not atgple oF fokd. Planss heck payubla 1D FedEx,
o lbid::iﬂ;dum:mﬂwlmmu eversa side. 2-320-91961 4072-8604-9 USD §21352
Remittance Advice
Yan: paymont s dus by Oct 02, 2008

4072860429204 9%h16300002135203

,r 'I“ll"ul“ Ill‘l‘lll'll’l'llltllillll“lll'lllu“lll'lnllll

UTILITIES INC ' FedEx
ATTN: ACCTS PAYARLE P.0. Box 9451%
2335 SANDERS RD PALATINE 1L 60094-¥515

NORTBROOK 1. 00e2-6108 HabeboeH ool AR e Lo L e

T

T8 itk




Fm._— : [ Vavoice Ne er lnvoice Date \\ [ AccountNumber N\  Page. _

: ‘ 2-920-91961 Sep 17, 2608 4072-3604-8 305
FedEx Express Shipment Uetail By Payor Type {Original)

. Fual Surchargy - FadEx hirs applied a fue) sarcharge of S4E0K 1o fhie gipm

. l'htdaliarvcmmnmhrﬁmzmmmidsncesmmumﬂuﬂicu}h!?ﬂ.ﬂnumdmhmdwhrm.llmﬁ.ﬂ.&ilﬁ.MPl!MMMlm
+ Distares Basod Pricing, Zone §

* Prckage Dalivarad to Reciploat Addrats - fiplease Authotizgd

Autoqiatisn UsagR Sander Becipiynt

Tracking 1D GR35 10014 ERIN POVICH INTESAR TER KAWY

Swvice Typo FodEx 20ay UTILITIES ING FLPSE

PackagaType  FedfxBm 2255 SANDERS KD £7% BLEHER LOOP

Zone ) 1 RORTHBRDOK IL. £0082-6108 US WINTER SPRINGE AL 32708 US

Packages 1

FrtodWeight  8.01s, 38 kgs Transportation Charge 2236

Dafivarad Sep 1, 2008 14:35 Discount 558
. Svc Area ) Residontal Dobvery i

Signad by 9393909599909 Fued Surcharge 658

FadEx Use 0253 TAG7AP0G046/2 Total Chuige . [T =T

s

Fuel Surchatge - FedExhas appliad 2 el sure \ shipmsnt.

* The detvery commiiment for FadEx 2Day 15 rhsidences finckibg hoase olfices) i TPM. the secund businass day far AT, AL AR, AZ A€, A5, A5, AN, PIK, ard W4 sarvicn anbs.
+ Distance Based Pricing, Zao 5

» Fackaga Dolvered i Reciplsnt Address - Helsase Authorized

Awination USAB Semdor Enciploxt

Tracking iy BBE345 160185 ERIN POVICH ANTESAR TERKAW!

Service Type FadEx 202y UTILITIES 16 FLPSC

PackagaTyrs  FedfxBox 2335 SANDERS RO 679 BLENHEIM RO

Zone % NOATHBROOK IL 80062-5108 US WINTER SPRINGS FL 32108 US =

Packages 1 =

Rated Weight 401y, 18 kgs Transporwion Charge 1555 §

Defivored Sep 11, 2008 14:15 Biscaunt 3 =

Sec Arsa e Residoniial Dowary e =

Signod by 999589050959 Fusl Surcharga _ =

FadEx Usa 0253 140740005M46/07 Total Chacge [T 5 E

: =
; e ]
appled a fual surcharge of M.50% 1o this shipmeat.
> The deiivery comeimunt for FadEx 2ay 1o resklancos Snctuding homa oMicest 7 P.M. the secung businese day for &1, A2, AA, AY, A4, A5, A5, AV, PIA sod S sarvice aress =

* Dstance Basad Pricing Zone §
+ Packega Dakvernd & Rociplant Addross - Release Authorizsd

Aimomaton usag Samies . Bacigian

i Tracking ID S03U5100108 ERIN POVICH INTESAR TERKAW

{1 S Mk.m,._.h..ﬁﬂ&m -FIITIES NG - - TSNS <19 . s NN NS LA LR 4 s B o Bt et
PuckageVype  FuedExBox 2335 SANDERS RD B79 BLENHEIM LOOP
Zome 05 NORTHBRODK AL 60062-6108 S VWINTER SPRINGS L 32708 US
Packagas 1
Rated Waight %0y 234kgs Transportation Charge 125
Defiverad Sep 11, 2008 14:15 Dizcount 43
Svt Area Az Besidential Delfvery g
Sigaad by 9239995395909 Fusl Surcharge )
FadEx Use 075314074/0008046/02 Totol Chargo (] g1




. N
= Fusl Surcherga - FedEx fian eppillod o fue) srchonge of 36 0% 1o i hpraant
* The dalivery commiimant for FedCx
= Disisnce Besed Prigieg, Zone 5

* Packege Detvarad tn Raciplent Address - Kelwase Autiarizpd

luvoice Number _IMa_te N[ Account Number ™\ p%‘
2-920-31961 Sep 17, 2008 A4072-8604-3 *

sy 1o mesidances fmcluding home ofces)is T P4, I sacond buginazs day for AT, A2, AR, AS, A4, AF, AB, AM. PM, and M sorvice avesi.

Autoemation USAB Bewdler Becipiont

Tracking 1D BOMTIRNTT ERIN POVICH IMTESAR TERKAWA

Senvice Type FedEx May UTILITIES INC A.PS5C

Packags Typa FodEx Box 2335 SANDFRS RO 579 BLENHEIM (.00F

Zone 05 NORTHERCOK )L $0062-5103 1S WINTER SPRINGS FIL 32708 US

Packages 1

Hawd Weight 5.0%s, 23kgs Trsnaportation Charge 1725
Dolivesad Sop 11, 2008 74:85 Fuel Surcharge 538
Svc Aces 8 Bosidential Delivery 23¢
Signad by 9993099009950 Discount 431
Fadfx Use B253W4THAN006096/02 Total Charge 5D *A

o Fuel Surchargs - FadEx has spplied a fysd surcharge oF 34.50% o this dipmsnt,

« Uisiance Besed Pricing, Zona §

Automation USAB Sandior Beciplent

Tracking I0 S5 180100 ERIN POVICH KATHY WWEICH

Service Typo  FodEx20ay UTILTIES ING FLPSC

Package Type  FadEx Box 2235 SANDERS RO 3675 NW 52N0 AVE STE 400

Zoow 05 NOHTHERODK I 600625108 US MIAMS FL 37108 US

Packages i

Rated Weight 6.0, 23kgs

Dolivarad Sep 12,2008 §1:53 Transpoxtation Chaege 245
Sve Avea A2 Diacount J;:l
Signed by GAURIA Fust Surcharge 1
FedEx 30 0254720172/0002000,_ Total Chneye [ 1] [>T

=" Fuel Sarcharga - FedEx hes sppled s bial peroharge of s o i S
« Dlatsnco Basad Pricing, Zone B

* FadExhas suditad this shipment for eorrect packagas, waight, snd swivica, Any changes mada sva rafactzd i th bvolco smount.
* Thepackage waight encesds the eaximum for the packaging type, therafors, FedEx Pak was ratnd a5 Customer Packagiig.

Recipient

KATHT WELCH

FLPsSC

3675 NW 82ND AVE STE ADD

MIAMIFL 33106 US
245

581

551

Automaton UsaB Sowlar
Tracking D 686345160111 ERWN PORICH
Servica Type FadEx 20ay UTIIMES INC
Packzga Typs Customer Packagisg 2335 SANDERS RO
Zone £ NORTHBROOK IL 50062-4108 US
Packagas 1
Dofvured $Sep 12, 2008 11:53 Transportation Charge
Svc Aren A Fuel Syrcharge
Signed by LSAWAIA Discount
0254201730008068]__ ‘Totwl Charge

FedEx Use

= Fuel Surcharpe - FedExhias applind & fust surchenge of 34.67% tothic cipeant,
« Diastence Based Pricing, Zome 6

L) Fmbasaumtudmhﬂnmfkcmtpnnnmmmurﬂwﬂum hanges mada are

floctad In tha nwaice amount.

The package waight suceads the maximun for tha packaging wpe, Derelore, FedEx Paicwas rated as Customer Packaging.

Airlomation USAB Sendor

Tsacking 1B ¥56345160122 ERIN PORICH

Sorvice Typs FedEx 2Day UTILITIES INC

Package Typs Customar Packaging 2235 SANDERS RD

Zone 06 NOAYHBROOK L. 60062-6108 US
Packeges 1

Rated Waight 4008, 18 kge

Dollvorad Sep 12,2008 1753 Tremapovistion Charge

Contmued on next page

Rocigiont

KATHY WELCH
FLPSC _
3625 NWBZND AVE STE4U
MIAMIFL 33166 US




Tnvoice Number \ [ invoice Data \ | Account Number ™\ ng:'
. 2-920-91961 Sep 17, 2008 4072-8604-9 5 ok
Tracking ). 866345160122 continugd ‘
Sve Argo Ar Discount aby
Signediy SRURIA Fusl Su o _21
Fedbx Vas 254201 730006068/ Totl Charge T ] St

o Fuel Surchargs - FadEx has sp
« Disance Busad Pricihg, Yone 5

* Packags Ueiivervd oo Reciplent Addeess - Releats Authorizad

Aurtomstion INET Sender Bacipiant

Tracking 1D T0N32262739%6 Etin Povich Chrisitien Maroeti

Sarvics Type FodEx First vemight Utiliting, Inc. Resa, Sundstram & Bentigy

Package Typa FedEx Envelope 2735 Sandura Rd 2180W STATE RDAD 434 STE 2918

Zome 05 NORTHBRDOK It. 0082 US LONGWOOD FL 32713 US

Packages 1

Ratnd Waight A

Dafivered Sep 12, M08 07-25

Sve Area A2 Transportation Charge L L]
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. 3000700

@w%ﬂlﬁmﬁgm mpnorthbrook@sboglobial net Invoice
aonuum: b 1n -.; J
s JUE 1500 44
1928 Raymond D: ! ij .
Northbrook, IL 60882— % il 1215
8474121370  Fax# 847412-13N
Buch 8 7/0
Bill To
Utilities, Inc.
Dt oo 777/ 7
Northbrook, IL 60062
P.0O. No. Termms
Net 30
Quantity Desciiption Amocunt
1,300 | Miles Geant notice 2pex. 2.0 990 7 136.50
3,100 { Lake Utility Serviows notice Spgs. 29y 957 =7 1,620.00
JuL - ¢ 2008
Total $1,756.50




BEFORE THE PUBLIC SERVICE COMMISSION
INITIAL CUSTOMER NOTICE

TO THE CUSTOMERS OF
LAKE UTILITY SERVICES, INC.
AND
ALL OTHER INTERESTED PERSONS

RE:‘ DOCKET NOQ. 070693-WS; APPLICATION FOR INCREASE IN WASTEWATER
RATES IN LAKE COUNTY BY LAKE UTILITY SERVICES, INC.

JUNE 16, 2008

BACKGROUND

Lake Utility Services, Inc. (the “Utility”) is a water and wastewater utility whose
corporate offices ave located at 200 Weathersfield Avenue, Altamonte Springs, Florida.
The Utility’s water and wastewater facilities are located in Lake County, Florida,

The Utility filed an application with the Florida Public Service Coramission (the
“Commission”) for increased water and wastewater rates for its customers on February
18, 2008. The application was assigned Docket No. 070693-WS, and May 7, 2008, was
established as the official date of filing.

As reported in its Minimum Filing Requirements (“MFRs”) filed with its
application to the Commission, the Utility's revenues per books are $2,890,389, with
operating expenses per books of $2,826,448, for its water system, and. Tevenues petr
books of $870,816, with operating expenses per books of $448,875, for its wastewater -
system, resulting in a net operating income of $63,941 for its water system, and net
operating income of $421,941 for its wastewater system, per books, before adjustments.
The rate increase application has been filed by the Utility because of inadequate
earnings.

Copies of the MFRs will be available for inspection at the following locations:

Cooper Memorial Library Lake Utility Services, Inc.

821 W._Mianecla Avenue 200 Weathersfield Avenue

Clermont, FL 34711 Altamonts Springs, FL 32714

Hours of Operation: Ofiice Hours:

Monday to Thursday 10:00 a.m. 1o 7:00 p.m. Monday through Friday 8:00 a.m. to 4:30 p.m.

Friday 10:00 a.m, to 5:00 p.m.
Saturday 10:00 a.m. to 2:00 p.m.




A "Rate Case Synopsis” will also be available, along with the application and MFRs. The
test period for setting rates is the projected average thirteen-month period ended June

30, 2000.

The current and proposed rates and charges follow. These rates are subject to
change based on information gathered at the eustomer meeting, further Staff review,
and the final decision by the Commissioners.

WATER SERVICE

jlity's lmlgx‘_g Comynission
Residential and Geeral RetesPriorto | Requested | Reguested Final Approved
) vt
BIMONTHLY
Base Facility Charge:
Meter Size
5/8" $12.64 $17.08 $ 22.00 $13.24
1 $31.60 $42.69 $ 55.00 $33.10
14%" $53.18 $85.36 $ 110.00 $66.18
2" $101.06 $136.54 $ 176.00 $105.86
3" $189.50 $256.03 $352.00 $1938.47
4" $315.34 $426.73 $550.00 $330.81
6" $734.38 $992.90 $1,100.00 $769.70
Gallonags Charge $0.73 $0.99 $0.76
{per 1,000 galicns)
0 to 10,000 gallons $1.30
Qver 10,000 gallons $2.00




e e s e

ility’ Uiility’s Commjssion
Residential and General Rates Priorto | Requegted | Requested Final Approved
Servige Filing Interim Rates Rates torim Rates
(Former Lake Groves {In effect as of
system) - MONTHLY May 5, 2008)
Base Facility Charge:
Meter Size
5/8" % 3/3" $12.73 $ 17.20 '$ 1100 $13.33
1" $31.83 $ 43.00 $ 27.50 $33.33
1% $63.65 3 86.00 $ 55.00 $66.67
2" $101.84 $137.60 $ 28.00 $106.66
3" $203.66 $275.17 $176.00 $213.31
4" $318.23 $429.96 $275.00 $333.31
Over 4" General Service $318.23 $429.96 $550.00 $333.31
Gellonage Charge $1.27 $1.72 $133
{per 1,000 gallons)
0 to 10,000 gallong $1.30
Over 10,000 gallons - $2.00
WASTEWATER SERVICE
' nility” ility's Commissi
MONTHLY Filing Interim Rates | FinalRates | Interim Rates
{In effect as of
May 5, 2008)
Base Facility Charge:
Meter Size
All Sizes Residential 31599 $36.49 $45.00 $22.79
Gallonage Charge
(per 1,000 gallons) $1.10 $2.51 $2.60 $1.57
{Maximum 10,000 gallons
per month)




. lity’s tility's Commissiof
General Rates Priorto | Requested Requested Approved
MONTHLY Filing [nterim Rates | Final Rates | Jnterim Rates
(In effect as of
May 5, 2008)
Base Facility Charge:
Meter Size
5/8" x 3/4" $ 1599 $ 36.49 $ 45.00 $22.7%
" $ 40.00 $ 9128 $112.50 $57.02
1%" $ 7997 $182.50 $225.00 $114.01
2 $12795 $291.99 $360.00 $18241
3 $255.91 ' $584.01 $ 720,00 $364.82
4 $399.88 $912.57 $1,125.00 $570.06
Over 4” General Service $399.98 $912.57 $2,250.00 $570.06
o 1000 e 5138 $3.15 $3.50 $197
Reclaimed Water
Base Facility Charge $3.65
Gallonage Charge .60
(per 1,000 galtons)
SERVICE AVAILABILY E

The Utility is not requesting any changes to its service availability charges. Even though
not requested io do so, the Commission may review and adjust service availability charges.




MISCELLANEOUS SERVICE CHARGES

The Utility is requesting the following changes to its miscellaneous service charges.

Water
Type of Charge Present Charge - .Requested Charge
During After Business During After Business
Business Hours - Business Hours
Hours - Hours
Initial Connection $15.00 N/A $21.00 $42.00
Normal $15.00 N/A $21.00 $42.00
Reconnection
Violation
Reconnection $15.00 NA|  actusl Cost| Actual Cost
Premisges Visit
(in lien of
disconnection) $10.00 N/A $21.00 $42.00
Wastewater
Type of Charge Present Charge Requested Charge
During Afier Business During After Business
Business Hours Business Hours
Hours Hours
Initial Connection $15.00 N/A $21.00 $42.00
Normal £15.00 N/A $21.00 $42.00
Reconnection
Violation
Reconnection Actual Cost N/A Actual Cost Actual Cost
Premises Visit
(inliewof
disconnection) $10.00 N/A $21.00 $42.00




BEFORE THE PUBLIC SERVICE COMMISSION
" NOTICE OF CUSTOMER MEETING

TO THE CUSTOMERS OF
MILES GRANT WATER AND SEWER COMPANY
AND
ALL OTHER INTERESTED PERSONS

Re: Docket No. 070695-WS; Application For Increases In Water and Wastewater Rates
In Martin County By Miles Grant Water And Sewer Company .. _

NOTICE is hereby given that the Staff of the Florida Public Service Commission
will conduct a customer meeting to discuss Miles Grant Water and Sewer Company’s
Application for a rate increase. The meeting will be held at the following time and place:

6:00 p.m,, Tuesday, July B, 2008
County Commission Chambers
Martin County Administrative Center
2401 S.E. Monterey Road
Stuart, Florida 34996

All persons who wish to comment are urged to be present at the beginning of the
meeting, since the meeting may be adjourned early if no customers are present. One or
more of the Commissioners of the Florida Public Service Commission may attend and
participate in this meeting, The meeting will begin as scheduled and will continue until
all of the customers have been heard.

The purpose of this meeting is to give customers and other interested persons an
opportunity to offer comments to Commission Staff regarding the quality of service the
Utility provides and to ask questions, and comment on the rates included in this Notice
as well as other issues. Commission Staff will be available to address and coordinate
customers’ comments and to assist members of the public. A representative from the
Utility may also be in attendance. At the beginning of the meeting, procedures will be
established for the order of comments. Commission Staff will have sign-up sheets, and
customers will be called in the order that they sign up to speak.

In addition to the customer meeting to be held on July 8, 2008, at 6:00 pm.,
Commission Staff will be available that afternoon from 2:00 p.m. to 4:00 p.m., to meet
with representatives of customer groups, homeowners’ associations, and developers
who desire a more in-depth discussion of the issues. Appointments may be made for the
meeting with Commission Staff by contacting Mr, Jared Deason at (850) 413-6844
before Monday, July 7, 2008. All representatives who wish to participate in individual
meetings are urged to make an appointment, since the individual meetings may be
canceled if no appointments are made. -

Pursuant to provisions of the Americans With Disabilities Act, eny person
requiring special accommodations to participate in this meeting because of & physical




impairment should call the Office of Commission Clerk at (850) 413-6770 at least 48
hours prior to the meeting. Any persor who is hearing or speech impaired should
contact the Florida Public Service Commission by using the Florida Relay Service, which
can be reached at 1-800-955-8771 (TDD) or 1-800-955-8770 (Voice).

If a named storm or other disaster requires cancellation of the meeting,
Commission staff will attempt to give timely direct notice to the parties. Notice of
cancellation of the meeting will also be provided on the Commission's website
(bttp://www.psc.state fl.us/) under the Hot Topics link found at the bottom of the home
page. Cancellation can also be confirmed by calling the Office of the General Counsel at

850-413-6199.

Any person who wishes to comment or provide information to Commission Staff
may do so at the meetings, either orally or in writing. Other written comments regarding
the Uhility and the proposed rates, or requests to be placed on the mailing list for this
case, may be directed to this address:

Office of the Commission Clerk
Florida Public Service Commission
2540 Shumard Oak Boulevard
Tallahassee, FL 32399-0850

All correspondence should refer to “Docket No. 070695-WS, Miles Grant Water
and Sewer Company.” Your letter will placed in the correspondence file of this docket.
You may also submit comments through the Florida Public Service Commission’s toll-
free facsimile line at 1-800-511-0809.

If you wish to contact the Florida Public Service Commission regarding
complaints about service, you may call the Commission’s Division of Regulatory
Compliance and Consumer Assistance at the following toll-free number 1-800-342-
3552. You may also submit a complaint through the Commission’s website at:

This notice was prepared by the Utility and approved by Commission Staff for
distribution by the Utility to its customers. '
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F.EA# 59-2783536

UTILITIES, INC

ATIN: JOHN STOVER
2335 BANDERS RD
NORTHBROOK, IL &0062

LAW OFFICES

ROSE, SUNDSTROM & BENTLEY, LLP

P.O. BOX 1567

TALLAHASSEE, FLORIDA 32202-1567

(850) B77-6555

PLEASE TO INVOI ER
WHEN RED;IEﬁ?NG CE NuMB

SEPTEMBER 13, 2007
INVQICE # 16196

PILE # 30057-00148

PAGE 1
MATTER: LARE UTLIITY SERVICES, INC
2007 RATE CASE

8/21/07 REVIEW CURRESPONDENCE REGARDING DATE RATE BASE .30
WAS LAST ESTABLISHED AND REVIEW PRIOR DPSC ORDERS;
LETTER TO MR. LUBERTCZZI

8/27/07 TELEPBONE CONFERENCE WITH CLIENTS AND CONSULTANT. .70
REGARDING UPCOMING RATE FILING :

B/28/07 MONITOR AQUA PSC PROCEBDING:; LETTER TO AND 1.80
TELEFHONE CONFERENCE WITH MR, LUBERTOZZI
REGARDING SAME

8/28/07 REVIEW DOCUMENTS PROM FREVIOUS DOCKETS FOR .40
INFORMATION REQUIRED BY RULE 25-30-430 REGARDING
TEST YEAR LETTERS.

8/29/07 DRAFT TEST YEAR LETTER PURSUANT TO RULE 25-30.430 .50
OF THE FLORIDA ADMINISTRATIVE CODE.

8/30/07 DRAFT APPLICATION FOR RATE INCREASE PURSUANT TO .80
RULE 25-30.436, FAC; LEGAL RESEARCH AND REVIEW OF
ANNUAL REPORT INFORMATION REQUIRED BY RULE
25-30.436.
TOTAL HOURS 4.50 u/{

FROFPESSIONAL FEES $ 1,152.50
TOTAL COSTS ANVANCED $ .00

TOTAL STATEMENT $ 1,152.50




LAW OFFICES

CE:
ROSE, SUNDSTROM & BENTLEY, LLP

P.O. BOX 1567
TALLAHASSEE, FLORIDA 32302-1567
L& 50- g PLEASE REFER TO INVOICE RUMB
F.E ) # 50-2783528 (850) 877-6555 PLEAS EEM'T"NBO OICE ER

UTILITIES, INC

Invoice §: 36196 PAGE 2




LAW OFFICES

ROSE, SUNDSTROM & BENTLEY, LLP
P.0, BOX 1667
TALLAHASSEE, FLORIDA 32302-1567
F.E.1# 50-27635636 (850) 877-6555 PLEASE REEER TO INVOICE NUMBER

UTILITIES, INC

ATTN: JOHN STOVER

2335 SANDERS RD SEPTEMBER 13, 2007

NORTHBROOK, IL 60062 INVOICE # 36196
FILE # 30057-00148

MATTER: LAKE UTLIITY SERVICES, INC
2007 RATE CASE

CURREBNT INVOICE SUMMARY

SUMMARY OF CHARGES RENDERED ON THIS INVOICE:

CURRENT FEES: $ 1,152.50
CURRENT COSTS: $ .00
TOTAY, CHARGES FCR TEIS INVOICE: % 1,152.50
OUTSTANDING ACCOUNTS RECEIVAELE: § .00

TOTAL AMOUNT DUE THIS MATTER: % 1,152.50

=ramEascoo===o




LAW OFFICES

ROSE, SUNDSTROM & BENTLEY, LLP

P.0O. BOX 1567
TALLAHASSEES, FLORIDA 32202-1557
.E. REFER TQ INVOI
F.E.4#59-2783526 (850) 877-6555 W‘Eﬁﬁeumm ¢ CE NUMBER
UTILITIES, IKC
ATTN: JCHN STOVER
2335 SANDERS RD OCTOBER 10, 2007
NORTHBROOK, IL 60062 INVOICE # 36261
FILE # 30057-00148
PAGE 1
MATTER: LAKE UTLIITY SERVICES, INC
2007 RATE CASE
8/07/07 REVIEW CORRESPONDENCE FROM KIRSTEN WEEKS .30

REGARDING RATE CASE ENTRY ON STATUS REPORT; DRAFT
CORRESPONDENCE RESPONDING TG INQUIRY.

9/13/07 TRAVEL TO TALLAHASSEE FOR MEETING WITH PSC STAFF 2.20
REGARDING UPCOMING RATE CASE AND CONFERENCES WITH
MR. HOY AND MR, FLYNN EN ROUTE.

TOTAL HOQURS . 2.60 /
FROFESSIONAL FEES $§ 700.00
TELEQCPIER 1.50
TOTAL COSTS ADVANCED $ 1.50

TOTAL STATEMENT $ 701.50




LAW OFFICES
ROSE, SUNDSTROM & BENTLEY, LLP
P.0. BOX 1587

.0 BOX 1
TALLAHASSEE, FLORIDA 32302-1567
F.E.|.# 59-278353% B50) 67 PLEﬁﬁE REFER TO INVOICE NUMBER
(850 6775585 WHE| REMI'E%\IG

UTILITIES, INC

ATTN: JOHN STOVER

2335 SANDERS RD OCTOBER 10, 2007

NORTHBROCK, IL 60062 INVOICE # 36261
FILE # 30057-00148

MATTER: LAKE UTLIITY SERVICES, INC
2007 RATE CASE

CUORRENT INVOICE SUMMARY

SUMMARY OF CHARGES RENDERED CON THIS INVOICE:

CURRENT FEES: § 700.00
CURRENT COSTS: $ 1.50
TOTAL CHARGES POR THIS INVOICE: $ 701.50
OUTSTANDING ACCOUNTS RECEIVABLE: $ .00

TOTAL AMOUNT DUE THIS MATTER: $ 701.50




LAW OFFICES
ROSE, SUNDSTROM & BENTLEY, LLP
P.C. BOX 1567
TALLAHASSEE, FLORIDA 32302-1567

F.E.\¥ 59-2783536 PLEASE REFER TO INVOIC
(850) 8776088 WHEN REMITTING & NUMBER

UTILITIES, INC
ATTN: JOHN STOVER

2335 SANDERS RD NOVEMBER 2, 2007

NORTHBROOK, IL 60062 INVOICE # 36533
PILE # 30057-00143
PAGE 1

MATTER: LAKE UTLIITY SERVICES, INC
2007 RATE CASE

10/03/07 REVIEW CORRESPONDENCE REGARDING PRO FORMA PLANT .40
ITEMS; REVIEW AND REVISE DRAFT OF TEST YEAR
LETTER WITH RESPECT TO PRO FORMA ITEMS AND
DETAILS OF LAST RATE REVIEW; DRAFT CORRESPONDENCE
TO CLIENT REGARDING NEED FOR INFORMATION ON
UPGRADES TCQ PLANT AND CHANGES IN OPERATING
PROCEDURES SINCE LAST RATE REVIEW.
1i0/11/07 REVIEW AND REVISE DRAFT OF TEST YEAR LETTER; ’ .20
CONFERENCE WITH MARTY FRIEDMAN REGARDING CONTENT
OF TEST YEAR LETTER.
10/17/07 REVIEW CORRESPONDENCE FROM MARIA BRAVO REGARDING .40
TEST YEAR LETTER CORRECTIONS; REVIEW AND REVISE
TEST YEAR LETTER ACCORDINGLY; DRAFI' PARAGRAPH
REGARDING PRC FORMA EXPENSES.

? TOTAL HOURS 1.00 /

PROFESSIONAL FEES § 225.00

TOTAL COSTS ADVANCED $ .co

TOTAL STATEMENT $ 225.00




LAW OFFICES

ROSE, SUNDSTROM & BENTLEY, LLP
P.0. BOX 1567
TALLAHASSEE, FLORIDA 32302-1567

F.E4# 59-278: 877-6555 PLEASE REFER TO INVOICE NUMBER
3538 (850} WHEN REMITTING

DTILITIES, INC

ATTN: JOHN STOVER

2335 SANDERS RD NOVEMBER 9, 2007

NORTHBROOK, IL £0062 INVOICE # 36533
PILE # 30057-00148

MATTER: LAKE UTLIITY SERVICES, INC
2007 RATE CASE

CURRENT INVOICE SUMMARY

SUMMARY OF CHARGES RENDERED ON THIS INVOICE:

CURRENT FEES: $ 225.00
CURRENT COSTS: S .00
TOTAL CHARGES FOR THIS INVOICE: $ 225.00
OUTSTANDING ACCOUNTS RECEIVABLE: % .00

TOTAL AMOUNT DUE THIS MATTER: $ 225.00




LAW OFFICES

ROSE, SUNDSTROM & BENTLEY, LLP
0. BOX

PO, 1567
TALLAHASSEE, FLORIDA 323021567
F.EL# 59-2783536 8776555 PL| REFER T/ CE NUMBER
0 CHERRETRALS "

OTILITIES, INC
ATTN: JOHN STOVER

2335 SANDERS RD DECEMBER 12, 2007
NORTHBROOK, IL 60062 INVOICE # 3687173
K FILE # 30057-00148

PAGE 1

MATTER: LAKE UTLIITY SERVICES, INC
2007 RATE CASE

11/95/07 REVIEW CORRESPONDENCE FRCM FPATRICK FLYNN 40
REGARDING MAJOR CHANGES TO THE WATER AND
WASTEWATER SYSTEMS SINCE THE LAST RATE
PROCEEDING; REVIEW AND REVISE TEST YEAR LETTER TO
INCORPORATION SAID MAJOR CHANGES; DRAFT
CORRESPONDENCE TO CLIENT REZARDING TEST YEAR
LETTER, REQUESTING COMMENTS AND ADVISING OF
INTENDED FILING DATE.

11/06/07 REVIEW CORRESPONDENCE FROM MARIA BRAVO REGARDING .20
TEST YEAR LETTER; REVIEW TEST YEAR LETTER IN
LIGHT OF MARIA'S COMMENTS.

11/97/07 REVIEW CORRESPONDENCE FROM PATRICK FLYNN .50
REGARDING TEST YEAR LETTER; REVIEW UPDATED DRAFT
OF TEST YEAR LETTER; REVISE UPDATED DRAFT OF TEST
YEAR LETTER.

TOTAL HOURS 1.10 \/

PROFESSIONAL FEES $ 247.50
FEDERAL EXPRESS 5.56
TOTAL COSTS ADVANCED $ 5,56

TOTAL STATEMENT $ 253.06




LAW OFFICES

ROSE, SUNDSTROM & BENTLEY, LLP

P.0O. BOX 16567
TALLAHASSEE, FLORIDA 32302-1567

F.E) 783536 PLEASE R TO INVOICE NUMBER
E1#55-2 {850) B77-6555 R A

UTILITIES, INC

Invoice #: 36773 PAGE 2




LAW OFFICES

ROSE, SUNDSTROM & BENTLEY, LLP

0. BOX
TALLAHASEEE, FUDRIPA 32302-1567
f.E.L¥# 58-27835385 850 PLI
(850) B77-6555 PLEASE REFER YO INVOIGE NUMBER

UTILITIES, INC

ATTN: JOHN STOVER

2335 SANDERS RD DECEMBER 12, 2007

NORTHBROOK, IL 60062 - INVOICE # 36773

FILE # 30057-00148

MATTER: LAKE UTLIITY SERVICES, INC
2007 RATE CASE

CURRENT INVOICE SUMMARY

SUMMARY OF CHARGES RENDERED ON THIS INVQICE:

CURRENT FEES: $ 247.50
CURRENT COSTS: $ 5.56
TOTAL CHARGES FOR THIS INVOICE: $ 253.06
OUTSTANDING ACCOUNTS RECEIVABLE: $ .00

TOTAL AMOUNT DUE THIS MATTER: $ 253.086




LAW OFFICE3

ROSE, SUNDSTROM & BENTLEY, LLP

£.0. BOX 1567
TALLAHA.SSEE._FLQ@A A23G2-1567
F.E.L# 59-2783536 B850) 877-6555 PLEASE REFER TO
{850) “mENREMW"NGINWmCENUMBER
UTILITIES, INC
ATTH: JOHN STOVER
) 2335 SANDERS RD JANUARY 14, 2008
j NORTHBROOK, IL. 60062 INVOICE # 36823
: FILE # 30057-00148
i PAGE 1
MATTER: LAKE UTLIITY SERVICES, INC
2007 RATE CASE
12/05/07 REVIEW CORRESPONDENCE FROM PSC APPROVING TEST .30
YEAR LETTER; DRAFT CORRESBONDENCE TO CLIENT AND
RATE CASE CONSULTANTS REGARDING APPROVAL OF TEST
YEAR AND REQUIREMENTS CONTAINED IN THE PSC'S
LETTER.
TOTAL HOURS .30 \//
PROFESSIONAL FEES $ 67.50
TOTAL COSTS ADVANCED s .00

TOTAL STATEMENT 5 67.50C




LAW OFFICES
ROSE, SUNDSTROM & BENTLEY, L.LP
P.0. BOX 1567
TALLAHASSEE, FLORIDA 32302-1567
F.E.L# 59-2783536 (B52) BT7-6555 PLEASE REFER TO INVOICE NUMBER

UTILITIES, INC

ATTN: JOHN STOVER

2335 SANDERS RD JANUARY 14, 2008

NORTHBROOK, IL 60062 INVOICE # 3eBg23
FILE # 30057-00148

MATTER: LAKE UTLIITY SERVICES, INC
2007 RATE CASE

CURRENT INVOICE SUMMARY

SUMMARY OF CHARGES RENDERED ON TEIS INVOICE:

CURRENT FEES: $ $7.50
CURRENT COSTS: $ .00
TOTAL CHARGES FOR THIS INVOICE: $§ 67.50
OUTSTANDING ACCOUNTS RECEIVABLE: $ .00

TOTAL AMOUNT DUE THIS MATTER: $ 67.50




F.E.L# 59-2783538

LAW OFFICES

ROSE, SUNDSTROM & BENTLEY, LLP

P.O. BOX 1567
TALLAHABSEE, FLORIDA 32302.1567

(B50) 877-6555

UTILITIES, INC

WHETRE

R TO RNYO|
R K.E NUMBER

ATTN: JOHN STOVER
2335 SANDERS RD FEBRUARY 10, 2008
NORTHBROOK, IL 60062 INVOICE # 37021
FILE # 30057-00148
PAGE 1
MATTER: LAKE UTLIITY SERVICES, INC
2007 RATE CASE
1/15/08 TELEPHONE CONFERENCE WITH CLIENT REGARDING .20
APPROPRIATE FILING FEE FOR RATE CASE; LEGAL
RESEARCH REGARDING CALCULATION OF FILING FEES;
REVIEW CCORRESPONDENCE REGARDING SIZE AND ERCS
SERVED BY UTILITY; DRAFT CORRESPONDENCE TO CLIENT
REGARDING APPROPRIATE FILING FEE.
1/30/08 REVIEW CORRESPONDENCE FROM FRANK SEIDMAN .50
REGARDING USED & USEFUL SCHEDULES; REVIEW
SCHEDULES SUBMITTED BY MR. SEIDMAN FOR
CONSISTENCY; REVIEW CORRESPONDENCE FROM CLIENT
REGARDING SCHEDULES.
1/31/908 REVIEW AND COMMENT UPON *F" SCHEDULES .40
TOTAL HOURS 1.10 V/
PROFESSTONAI, FEES $ 308.50
TOTAL COSTS ADVANCED $ .00
TOTAL STATEMENT % 308.50




LAW OFFICES

ROSE, SUNDSTROM & BENTLEY, LLP

P.O. BOX 1867 -
TALLAHASSEE, FLORIDA 32302-3567
F.E.lL -2783536 76556 LEASE REFER TO INVOICE NUMBER
#59 @S0 87 R RE NG

UTILITIES, INC

ATTN: JOHN STOVER

2335 SANDERS RD FEBRUARY 10, 2008

NORTHBROOK, IL 60062 INVOICE # 37021

FILE # 30057-001438

MATTER: LAKE UTLIITY SERVICES, INC
2007 RATE CASE

CURRERT INVOICE SUMMARY

SUMMARY OF CHARGES RENDERED ON THIS INVOICE:

CURRENT FEES: $§ 308,50
CURRENT COSTS: s .00
TOTAL CHARGES FOR THIS INVOICE: % 208.50
QUTSTANDING ACCOUNTS RECEIVABLE: $ .00

TOTAL AMOUNT DUE THIS MATTER: § 308.50




F.E.L# 59-2783536

UTILITIES,

ATTN:

LAW OFFICES

ROSE, SUNDSTROM & BENTLEY, LLP

P.O. BOX 168
TALLAHASSEE, FLORIDA 323021567
{850} 877-6355

INC
JOHN STOVER
2335 SANDERS RD

NORTHBRQOK, IL 60062 ) INVOICE #

LE&? Rg&Frﬁ_R TO INVOICE NUMBER

MARCH 11, 2008

37171

FILE # 30057-00148

PAGE

1

2/04/08

2/05/08

2/01/08

2/08/08

2/08/08

2/08/08

2/11/08
27/12/08

2/15/08

MATTER: LAKE UTLIITY SERVICES, INC
2007 RATE CASE

TELEPHCNE CONFERENCE WITH MR. WILLIAMS WHO
TELEPHONED TO DISCUSS UPCOMING FILING; TELEPHONE
CONFERENCE WITK MS. SWAIN CONCERNING SAME.

LRAFT APPLICATION FOR RATE INCREASYL; REVIEW
STATUTORY REQUIREMENTS; REVIEW ANNUAL REPORT AND
CORRESPONDENCE FROM CLIENT FOR INFORMATION
PERTINENT TO APPLICATION; REVIEW TARIFF SHEETS;
DRAFT PROPOSED INTERIM WATER TARIFF SHEETS; DRAFT
PROPOSED INTERIM WASTEWATER TARIFF SMEETS: DRAFT
PROPOSED PINAL WATER TARIFF SHEETS; DRAFT
PROPOSED FINAL WASTEWATER SHEETS.

LEGAL RESEARCH REGARDING FILING REQUIREMENTS FOR
ADDITIONAL ENGINEERING INFORMATION; REVIEW
DOCUMENTS FROM PATRICK FLYNN IN CONNECTICN WITH
ADDITIONAL ENGINEERING INFOQRMATION REQUIRED
PURSUANT TO RULE 25-30.440, FLORIDA

ADMINISTRATIVE CCDE; CORRESPONDENCE WITH CLIENT
REGARDING OUTSTANDING ITEMS.

REVIEW AND RESPOND TO CORRESPONDENCE FROM MS.
POVICH REGARDING VEHICLES AND WITH MS. WBEKS.
REVIEW CHEMICAL USAGE SCHEDULES AND GENERAL
PREPARATION

REVIEW LIST OF AUTCMOBILES REQUIRED BY RULE
25-30.440; LEGAL RESEARCH REGARDING DETAILE OF
VEHICLE REQUIRED BY SAID RULE.

REVIEW USED AND USEFUL SCHEDULES FROM FRANK
SEIDMAN; PREPARE ECHEDULES FOR FILING INCLUDING
REVIEW OF VARIOUS DRAFTS OF SCHEDULES.
MISCELLANEQUS TELEFPHONE CCNFERENCES AND REVIEW OF
CORRESPONDENCE IN PREPARATION FOR FILING

DRAFT REVISED TARIFF SHEETS; MISCELLANEOUS
PREPARATION

MISCELLANEODS PREPARATICN

.60

l.1¢

1.10

.30

.60

1.90




; LAW OFFICES
ROSE, SUNDSTROM & BENTLEY, LLP

P.0. BOX 1567
i TALLAHASSEE, FLORIDA 32302-1567
i F.E.|# 592783536 850) 877-8555 PLEAS T £
i (850) 877 PReAS EREIEF INGO INVOICE NUMBER
i
F
UTILITIES, INC
Invoice &: 37171 PAGE 2
2/16/08 REVIEW FINAIL, MFRS; REDRAFT TARIFF SHERTS; 2.80
TELEPHCNE CONFERENCE WITH MS. SWAIN; FINAL
CCMPILATION
z2/21/08 REVIEW, RESEARCH AND COMMENT UPON CORRESPONDENCE .30

FRCM MS. SWAIN

TOTAL HOURS 16.10 M

PROFESSIONAL FEES 5 4,582.00

FILING FEE g,000.00
COURIER SERVICE 1.000.00
PHOTOCOPIES 379.75
TOTAL COSTS ADVANCED $ 9,373,775

TOTAL STATEMENT $ 13,961.75
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F.E.L#58-2783536

UTILITIES, INC

ATTN: JOHN STOVER
23135 SANDERS RD
NORTHBROOK, IL, 60062

LAW OFFICES

ROSE, SUNDSTROM & BENTLEY, LLP

P.O. BOX 1567
TALLAHASSEE, FLORIDA 32302-1567

8778555 PLEASE REFER TO MNVOICE NUMB
@0 WHEN REMITTING "R

MARCE 11, 2008
INVOICE # 37171
FILE # 30057-00148

MATTER: LAXE UTLIITY SERVICES, INC

2007 RATE CASE

CURRENT INVOICE SUMMARY

SUMMARY OF CHARGES RENDERED ON THIS INVOICE:

CURRENT FEES: $ 4,5B2.00
CORRENT COSTS: $ 9,379,175
TOTAL CHARGRS FOR THIS INVOICE: $ 13,961.75
OUTSTANDING ACCOUNTS RECEIVABLE: $ .00

TOTAL AMOUNT DUE THIS MATTER: $ 13,961.75

ComEmpSSomn==oN




F.E.l4 63-2783536

LAW OFFICES

ROSE, SUNDSTROM & BENTLEY, LLP

P.0. BOX 1587
TALLAHASSEE, FLORIDA 32302-1567

{850} 877-5556

OTILITIES, INC

ATTN:

JOHN STOVER

2335 SANDERS RD APRIL 14,
KORTHBROOK, IL 60062 INVOICE #
; FILE # 30057-00148

PAGE -

PLEASE R|

WHEN R

1

2co8
37457

ER TO INVOICE NUMBE
K VOICH MBER

Tl

3/11/08

3/17/08

3/18/08

3/18/708

1/19/08

if2o/o08

3/20/08
3/21/08

3/24/08

3/25/08

MATTER: LAKE UTLIITY SERVICESR, IKNC
2007 RATE CASE

DRAFT RATE CASE SYNOPSIS PURSUANT 70 FLORIDA RULE
25-22,0407; REVIEW MATERIALS NEEDED TO DRAFT
SYNOPSLS, INCLUDING: REVIEW OF PROPOSED INTERIM
AND FINAL RATES, REVIEW OF ADPLICATION FOR RATE
INCREASE AND REVIEW OF TEST YEAR LETTER.

REVIEW LAKE SAUNDERS DEP PERMIT AND RELATED
DOCUMENTS ; DRAFT LETTER TO THE CLERK OF THE PSC
REGARDING SUBMISSION OF THE PERMIT PURSUANT TO
RULE 25-30.440,

INITIAL REVIEW OF DEFICIENCY LETTER AND LETTER TO
MS. WEEKS REGARDING SAME

REVIEW DEFICIENCY LETTER; REVIEW MFR SCHEDULES TO
CHECK THE ACCURACY OF STAFF'S CLAIMS OF
DEFICIENCIES; REVIEW RATE SCHEDULES AND TARIFFS;
DRAFT WASTEWATER RATE TARLFF SHEET TO CORRECT
DEFICIENCY.

TELEPHONE CONFERENCE WITH MR. FLETCHER AND DRAFT
LETTER TO CLERK TO EXTEND INTERIM RATE DEADLINE
TELEPHONE CONFERENCE WITH MR. FLETCHER OF PSC WHO
TELEPHONED REGARDING CORPORATE UNDERTAKING AND
DRAFT LETTER TO MR. LUBERTOZZI REGARDING SAME;
CORRESPCNDENCE REGARDING MEETING TO DISCUSS
DEFICIENCIES

DRAFT LETTER TQ THE CLERK AND STAFF OF THE PSC IN
RESPONSE TO STAFF'S DEFICIENCY LETTER.

REVIEW AWD REVISE LETTER TO THE COMMISSION CLERX
RESDPONDING TO DEFICIENCIES_.

REVIEWH CORRESPONDENCE FROM CLIENT REGARDING
MONTHLY OPERATING REPORTS PURSUANT TO STAFF'S
DEFICIENCY LETTER; REVIEW MONTHLY OPERATING
REPORTS FOR COMPLETENESS AND RELEVANCY.

TELEPHONE CONFERENCE REGARDING RESPONSES TO
DEFICIENCIES LETTER

1.

80

.30

-840

.50

.60

.70

.40

.30

.30




LAW OFFICES

ROSE, SUNDSTROM & BENTLEY, LLP

O. BOX 1567
TAU.AHASSEE FLOR.IDA 32302-1567

F.EL# 50-2783536 850) 677, PLEASE REFER TO INV(
(850) 8776555 HER GE e CXCE NUMBER

UTILITIES, INC

Invoice #: 37497 PAGE 2

3/25/08 TELEPHONE CONFERENCE WITH CLIENT AND CONSULTANTS 1.5C
REGARDING RESFONSE TC DEFICIENCIES; REVIEW
CORRESPONDENCE FROM CLIENT REGARDING RESFONSES TO
DEFICIENCY LETTER; REVIEW PROPOSED AND FINAL
RESPONSES TO B-SCHEDULE AND E-SCHEDULE
DEFICIENCIES.

3f27/08 REVIEW CORRESPONDENCE FROM CLIENT REGARDING .30
DEFICIENCY RESPONSES 2 - 4 and 11; REVIEW
RESPONSES AND PREPARE FOR FILING.

3/28/08 REVIEW DEFICIENCY RESPONSES FROM ERIN POVICH; .70
REVIEW CORRESPONDENCE FROM CLIENT REGARDING SAME;

REVIEW AND REVISE UTILITY'S RESPONSE TQ STAFF'S

DEFICIENCIES.

3/31/08 REVIEW RESPONSES TO DEFICIENCIES AND COMPARE WITH .80
ORIGINAL MFRS; DRAFT CORRESPONDENCE TC CYNTHIA
YAPP REGARDING RESPONSES TO DEFLCIENCIES #2 - #4;
REVIEW AND REVISE THE UTILITY'S RESBONSE TO
DEFICIENCY LETTER.

! TOTAL HOURS 9.50 h/
PROFESSICNAL FEES $ 2,638.00
OUTSIDE PHOTOCOPIES 2,845.55
LONG DISTANCE CALLS 2.50
PHOTOCOPIES 3.00
TOTAL COSTS ADVANCED $ 2,851.05

TOTAL STATEMENT $ 5,489.05




LAW OFFICES

ROSE, SUNDSTROM & BENTLEY, LLP

P.0. BOX
TALLAHASSEE, FLDRDA 32302-1567
F.E.| #50.2783536

(850) §77-8555 . &.HEQSERE'SE% 'l"? INVOICE NUMBER
UTILITIES, INC
ATTM: JOHN STCVER
2335 SANDERS RD APRIL 14, 2008
NORTHBROOK, IL 80062 “INVOICE # 37497

FILE # 30057~00148

MATTER: LAKE UTLIITY SERVICES, INC
2007 RATE CASE

CURRENT INVOICE SUMMARY

SUMMARY OF CHARGES RENDFRED ON THIS INVOICE:

CURRENT FEES: $ 2,638.00
CURRENT COSTS: __s f:e?J::cjf
TOTAL CHARGES FOR THIS INVOICE: _f_?:f?:?ﬁ
CUTSTANDING ACCOUNYS RECEIVABLE: f_f?
TOTAL AMOUNT DUE THIS MATTER: § 5,489.05

csmmcz=axmzzza




LAW OFFICES

ROSE, SUNDSTROM & BENTLEY, LLP

P.Q. BOX 1567
TALLN-!AWA 3ZW2-1667
F.E 1 #59-2783536 850) 877-6555 FER TO E
0 RHATRERF nvorce NumoeR
UTILITIES, INC
ATTN: JOHN STOVER
2335 SANDERS RD MAY 12, 2008
NORTHBROCK, Il £0062 INVOICE # 37584
FILE # 30057-00148
PAGE 1
MATTER: LAKE UTLIITY SERVICES, INC
2007 RATE CASE
4/01/08 REVIEW AND REVISE RESPONSE TO DEFICIENCY LETTER .60
4/01/08 REVIEW AND REVISE RESPONSE TO STAFF'S DEPFICIENCY - 2.20

LETTER; REVIEW DEFICIENCY RESPONSES FOR
RELEVANCE; TELEPHONE CONFERENCE WITH CYNTHIA YAPD
REGARDING RESPONSES TQ DEFICIENCIES; PREPARE
LETTER IN RESPONSE TO DEFICIENCIES AND ALL
EXHIBITS FOR PILING.
4701708 DRAPT LETTER TCQ THE PSC SUBMITTING LAKE SAUNDRRS .60
PERMITTING INFORMATICON RECENTLY OBTAINED; REVIEW
DEP PERMIT BND PREPRRE FOR FILING. (NOT RELATED
TO STAFF'S DEFICIENCY LETTER.}
4/10/08 REVIEW STAPF RECOMMENDATION ON INTERIM RATES AND .50
DRAFT LETTER TO CLIENT CONCERNING SAME; REVIEW
COMMENTS FROM MS. BRAVO
4/11/08 REVIEW STAFF RECOMMENDATION ON INTERIM RATES: 3.60
REVIEW CURRENT RATE TARIFF SHEETS; DRAFT
CORPORATE UNDERTAKING FQR LUSI; DRAFT CORPORATE
UNDERTBKING FOR UTILITIES, INC. ON BEHALF OF
LUSI; DRAFT CUSTOMER NQTICE OF INTERIM RATES;
DRAFT AFFIDAVIT OF MAILING REGARDING MAILING THE
INTERIM RATE NOTICE; DRAFT NOTICE OF FILING
REGARDING SAME; REVIEW AND REVISE SYNOPSIS TO
INCLUDE STAFF'S INCREASES AND PERCENTAGES; DRAFT
CORRESPONDENCE TO KIRSTEN WEEKS AND ERIMN BOVICH
REGARDING UTILITIES, INC. GUARANTIES ON BEHALF OF
UTILITY SUBSIDIARIES.
4/14/08 TELEPHONE CONFERENCE WITH MR. WRIGHT OF PSC STAFF 1.00
WHQ TELEPHONED AND LETTER TC MS, WEEKS;
TELECONFERENCE REGARDING OPC REQUEST; REVIEW
MISCELLANEOUS CORRESPONDENCE CONCERNING SAME
4/14/08 TELEPHONE CONFERENCE WITH RICK WRIGHT AT THE PSC .20
STAFf REGARDING THE DEFINITICN OF "RATES BEFORE
FILING* FOR PURPOSES OF CUSTOMER NOTICES AND THE




LAW OFFICES

ROSE, SUNDSTROM & BENTLEY, LLP
P.0, BOX 1567
TALLAHASSEE, FLORIDA 32302-1567

F.E.L#59-2783536 850) B77-6555 PLEASE REFER TO INVOICE NUMBE
(850) WHEN REFEFITING BER

UTILITIES, INC

Invoice i: 37584 PAGE 2

CASE SYNOPSIS (WHETHER TQ USE TEST YEAR OR
CURRENT RATES) .

4/15/08 TELEPHONE CONFERENCE WITH RICK WRIGHT OF PSC .50
STAFF REGARDING REVISIONS TO INTERIM RATES AND
THE CORPORATE UNCERTAKINGS; DRAFT CORRESPONDENCE
TO CLIENT REGARDING CORPORATE UNDERTAKING
DOCUMENTS .

4/16/08 TELEPHONE CONFERENCE WITH MR. FLETCHER AND ME. .30
WRIGHT WHO TELEPHONED AND LETTER TC MR. HOY
REGARDING SAME

4/16/08 REVIEW CORRESPONDENCE FROM CLIENT AMD CONSULTENTS .30
REGARDING STAFF'S REQUEST FOR LUSI TO WAIVE THE
INTERIM RATES DEADLINE; CONFERENCE WITH MARTY
FRIECMAN REGARDING SAME.

4/17/08 TELEPHONE CONFERENCE WITH MR. HQOY WHO TELEPHONED; .60
TELEPHONE CONFERENCE WITH MR. WILLIAMS; TELEPHONE
CONFERENCE WITH MR. FLETCHER

4/18/08 REVIEW SUMMARY OF REVISED STAFF RECOMMENDATION .20
AND LETTER TO CLIENT CONCERNING SAME

4/21/08 REVIEW REVISED STAFF RECOMMENDATION AND LETTER TO 4.30
MR. HOY REGARDING SAME; TRAVEL TO TALLAHASSEE FOR
PSC AGENDA

4/22/08 PREPARE FOR AND ATTEND PSC AGENDA AND LETTER TO . 1.30

MR. HOY REGARDING OUTCOME; REVIEW AND RESPORD TO
CORRESPONDENCE FROM MR. HOY REGARDING
IMPLEMENTATION OF INTERIM RATES

4/22/08 REVIEW REVISED STAFF RECOMMENDATION FOR UFPDATED 3.B0
INTERIM RATES AND UPDATED UNDERTAKING
REQUIREMENT; REVIEW AND REVISE CORPORATE
UNDERTAKINGS FOR UTILITIES, INC. AND LAXE UTILITY
SERVICES, INC.; DRAFT CORRESPONDENCE TO JOHN HOY
REGARDING EXECUTION OF CORPORATE UNDERTAKINGS;
TELEFHONE CONFERENCE WITH JOHN HOY REGARDING
CORPORATE UNMDERTAKINGS; DRAFT CORRESPONDENCE TO
ERIN POVICH REGARDING POTENTIAL MAILING DATE FOR
CUSTOMER NOTICES; DRAFT PROPOSED CUSTOMER NOTICE
TO REFLECT COMMISSION-APPROVED INTERIM RATES;
DRAFT PROPOSED INTERIM RATE WATER TARIFFS; DRAFT
PROPOSED INTERIM RATE WASTEWATER TARIFFS;
TELEPHONE CONFERENCE WITH RICK WRIGHT OF PSC




LAW OFFKCES
ROSE, SUNDSTROM & BENTLEY, LLP
£.0. BOX 1567
TALLAHASSEE, FLORIDA 32302-1567
F.E|# 50-2753536 (850) B77-6555 PLEASE REFER TO INVOICE NUMBER

UTILITIES, INC

Invoice #: 37584 PAGE 3

STAFF REGARDING APPROVAL OF INTERIM RATE CUSTOMER
NOTICE AND TARIFF SHEETS; DRAFT CORRESPONDENCE TO
BART FLETCHER AND RICK WRIGHT OF PSC STAFF
REGARDING APPROVAIL, OF INTERIM RATE CUSTOMER
NOTICE AND TARIFF SHEETS; TELEFHONE CONFERENCE
WITH RICK WRIGHT REGARDING CCRRECTIONS AND
REVISIONS TO PROPOSED CUSTOMER NOTICE; REVISE
CUSTOMER NOTICE IN ACCORDANCE WITH RICK WRIGHT'S
SUGGESTIONS; DRAFT CORRESPONDENCE TO RICK WRIGHT
REGARDING REVISEDR CUSTOMER NOTICE; REVIEW
CORRESPONDENCE FROM JOHN HOY REGARDING EFFECTIVE
DATE OF RATES AND MAILING OF CUSTOMER NOTICE;
DRAFT CORRESPCONDENCE TO DER GRANITE REGARDING
CUSTOMER NOTICE.
4/23/08 RETURN TO CENTRAL FLORIDA 4.00
4/23 /08 REVIEW AND REVISE CUSTOMER NOTICE TO INCORPORATE 1.B80
ANTICIPATED MAILING DATE; DRAFT CORRESPONDENCE TO
DEBORAH GRANITE REGARDING INSTRUCTIONS FOR PSC
APPROVAL AND MAILING OF CUSTOMER NOTICES; DRAFT
CORRESPONDENCE TO BART FLETCHER AND RICK WRIGHT
OF THE PSC STAFF REGARDING UPDATED CUSTOMER
NOTICE AND THE TIME IT WILL TAKE THEM TO APPROVE
THE CUSTOMER NOTICE; REVIEW CORPORATE UNDERTAKING
OF LAKE UTILITY SERVICES, INC.; REVIEW GUARANTY
OF UTILITIES, INC.; PREPARE DOCUMENTS FOR FILING
WITH PSC CLERK; DRAPT LETTER TO PSC CLERK
REGARDING CORPORATE UNDERTAKINGS.
4/24/08 TELEFHOKE CONFERENCE WITH ERIN POVICH REGARDING .80
INCONSISTENCIES IN THE CUSTOMER NOTICE, PROPOSED
WATER TARIFF AND EXISTING WATER TARIFF RATE
EHEETS; REVIEW AND REVISE CUSTOMER NOTICE AND
PROPCSED WATER TARTFFS; DRAFT CORRESPONDENCE TO
BART FLETCHER REGARDING REVISED CUSTOMER NOTICE
AND PROPOSED WATER TARIFF RATE SHEETS.
4/25/03 TELEPHONE CONFERENCE WITH RICK WRIGHT OF THE FL 1.10
PSC REGARDING APPROVAIL OF CUSTOMER NOTICES AND
TARIFF SHEETS: TELEPHONE CONFERENCE WITH BRART
FLETCHER REGARDING APPROVAL OF CUSTOMER NOTICE;
DRAFT CORRESPONDERCE TO RICK WRIGHT REGARDING
APPROVAL OF CUSTOMER NOTICE; TELEPHONE CONFERENCE




LAW OFFICES

ROSE, SUNDSTROM & BENTLEY, LLP

P.Q. BOX 1567
TALLAHASSEE, FLORIDA 32302-1567
F.E.L# 592733536 BS0) 8778555 E REFER TO INVOICE NUMBER
®%0 BN RERTG

UTILITIES, INC

Invoice §: 37584 PAGE 4

WITH ERIN POVICH REGARDING APPROVAL OF CUSTOMER
NOTICE; DRAFT CORRESPONDENCE TO ERIN POVICH
REGARDING SAME; REVISE CUSTOMER NOTICE IN
ACCORDANCE WITH STAFF'S REQUESTED REVISIONS.

TOTAL HOURS 27.70 /
PROFESSIONAL FEES $ 7,809.50
CPERATOR CONFERENCE CALL ’ 21.45
FEDBERAL EXPRESS 197.20
LONG DISTANCE CALLS 1.00
QUTSIDE PHOTOCOPIES 1,298.40
TRAVEL EXPENSE 477.68
TELECOPIER 3.50
PHOTQCOPIES 466 .00
TOTAL COSTS ADVANCED $ 2,465.23

TOTAL STATEMENT $ 10,274.73
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LAW OFFICES

ROSE, SUNDSTROM & BENTLEY, LLP
P.O. BOX 1667
TALLAHASSEE, FLORIDA 32302-1567

F.EL# 50-2783536 850 -6555 REFER TO INVOICE NUMBER
ws0) 877 %LHE REMITTING

UTILITIES, INC
ATTN: JOHN STOVER
2335 SANDERS RD MAY 12, 2008

NORTHBROOK, IL 600862 INVOICE # 37584
FILE # 30057-00148

MATTER: LAKE UTLIITY SERVICES, INC
2007 RATE CASE

CURRENT INVOICE SUMMARY

SUMMARY OF CHARGES RENDERED ON THIS INVOICE:

CURRENT FEES: § 7,809.50
CURRENT COSTS: $ 2,465.23
TOTAL CHARGES FOR THIS INVOICE: $ 10,274.73
QUTSTANDING ACCOUNTS RECEIVABLE: $ .00

TOTAL AMOUNT DUE THIS MATTER: £ 10,274.73
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LAW OFFICES

ROSE, SUNDSTROM & BENTLEY, LLP

P.C. BOX 1567
TALLAHASSEE, FLORIDA 32302-1567

F.E.L# 50-2783536 (850) 877-8555 PLEASE REFER 10 INVOICE NUMBER
UTILITIES, INC
ATTN: .JOHN STOVER
2335 SANDERS RD JUNE 11, 2008
NORTHEROOK, TL, 60062 INVOICE # 317828
' FILE # 30057-00148
PAGE 1
MATTER: LAKE UTLIITY SERVICES, INC
2007 RATE CASE
5/02/08 REVIEW AND REVISE DRAFT SYNOPSIS INCORPORATING .40
STAFF'S REVISED INTERIM RATE RECOMMENDATION.
5/04/08 REVIEW SECOND DEFICIENCY LETTER AND LETTER TO MR. .30
HOY REGARDING SAME
5/05/08 DRAPT CORRESPONDENCE TO CLIENT REGARDING 1.30

DEFICIENT WASTEWATER TARIFF AND METER SIZES;
REVIEW RULE 25-30.055, F.A.C., REGARDING
WASTEWATER ERC CALCULATIONS: REVISE WASTEWATER
TARIFF SHEET IN RESPONSE TO STAFF DEFICIENRCY
LETTER; DRAFT CCRRESPONDENCE TO CLIENT REGARDING
SIZE AND NUMBER OF METERS IN THE “OVER 4 INCH"
CATEGQRY; CONFERENCE WITH MARTY FRIEDMAN
REGARDING RESPONSE TQ STAFF'S REQUEST AND
ESTABLTSHMENT OF SPECIFIC BASE PRCILITY CHARGES
FOR METERS OVER 4 INCHES.

5/06/08 REVIEW CORRESPONDENCE FROM COMMISSION REGARDING .30
APPROVED WATER AND WASTEWATER INTERIM RATZ TARIFF
SHEETS; REVIEW APPROVED WATER AND WASTEWATER
INTERIM RATE TARIFF SHEETS; DRAFT CORRESPONDENCE
TC CLIENT REGARDING APPROVED WATER AND WASTEWATER
INTERIM RATE TARIFF SHEETS.

5/06/08 REVIEW CORRESPONDENCE FROM CLIENT REGARDING ITEM 2-310
#1 IN STAFF'S SECOND DEFICIENCY LETTER; DRAFT
CORRESPONDENCE TO CLIENT REGARDING RESPONDING TO
QUESTIONS AND CONCERNS; REVIEW CORRESPONDENCE
FRCM KIRSTEN WEEKS, DEBBIE SWAIN AND MARIA BRAVO
REGARDING RESPONSE TO LITEM #2 IN STAFF'S SECOND
DEFICIENCY LETTER; REVIEW REVISED E SCHEDULES;
TELEPHONE CONFERENCE WITH DEBBIE SWAIN REGARDING
REVISED BE SCHEDULES; REVIEW AND REVISE WASTEWATER
TARIFF SHEET; REVISE DRAFT LETTER RESPONDING TO
STAFF'S SECOND PEFICIENCY LETTER; DRAFT
CORRESPONDENCE TO DEBBIE SWAIN REGARDING REVISED




LAW OFFICES

ROSE, SUNDSTROM & BENTLEY, LLP

P.O, BOX 1567
TALLAHASSEE, FLORIDA 32302-1567

F.E.1.#59-2783536 850} 877-8555 PLEAS
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UTILITIES, INC

Involce $: 37828 FAGE 2

EFER TO )
Fu? EFER TO INVOICE NUMBER

LETTER RESPONDING TQO STAFF'S SECOND DEFICIENCY
LETTER; CONFERENCE WITE MARTY FRIEDMAN REGAERDING
BAME,

5/07/08 REVIEW CORRESPONDENCE FROM DEBBIE SWAIN REGARDING
REVISIONS TO E SCHEDULES; REVIEW REVISED E
SCHEDULES; REVIEW AND REVISE LETTER RESPONDING TO
STAFF'S SECOND DEFICIENCY LETTER; PREPARE
EXHIBITS FOR FILING.

s/o7/08 REVIEW AFFIDAVIT OF MAILING OF INTERIM RATE
CUSTOMER NOTICE; DRAFT NOTICE OF FILING OF
AFFIDAVIT; PREPARE AND FILE DOCUMENTS
ELECTRONICALLY.

5/1z/08 REVIEW PSC ORDER GRANTING INTERIM RATES AND
LETTER TO MR. HOY REGARDING SAME

5/12/08 REVIEW TARIFF SHEETS, UTILITIES INC. UNDERTAKING
AND LUSI UNDERTAKING FOR CONSISTENCY WITH PSC
CRDER,

5/12/08 REVIEW CORRESPONDEMCE FROM CLIENT REGARDING
STATUS CF LUSI CUSTOMER NOTICE AND TARIFF SHEETS;
DRAFT CORRESPONDENCE TO CLIENT REGARDING SAME.

5/14/08 REVIEW APPLICATION FOR METER INSTALLATION
SUBMITTED BY CLIENT; REVIEW APPLICATION FOR WATER
SERVICE SUBMITTED BY CLIENT; DRAFT CQORRESPONDENCE
TO CLIENT REQUESTING REVISIONS TO SAMPLE CUSTOMER
BILL; DRAFT WATER TARIFF SHEETS INCLUDING
APPLICATTION FOR WATER SERVICE, APPLICATION FOR
METER INSTALLATION AND CUSTOMER BILL SAMPLE;
DRAFT WASTEWATER TARIFF SHEETS INCLUDING INDEX,
APPLICATION FOR SERVICE, APPLICATION FOR METER
INSTALLATION AND CUSTOMER BILL SaMPLE.

TOTAL HOURS

FROFESSIONAL FBES $ 2,209.00

.30

.30

.40

.20

8.400
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UTILITIES, INC

Invoice %: A7828 PAGE 3

FEDERAL EXFRESS 18.36

LONG DISTANCE CALLS 2,25

PHOTOCOPIES $5.50

TOTAL COSTS ADVANCED $ 76.11

e mmm s ———— -

TOTAL STATEMENT $ 2,285.11
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ROSE, SUNDSTROM & BENTLEY LLP

INLAHASSEEFHI“DA&BG&H%?
F.E.1#59-2783536 (850) 8776555 PLE#ﬁEE FE! T O INVOICE NUMBER

UTILITIES, INC

ATTN: JOHN STOVER

2335 SANDERS RD JUNE 11, 2008

RORTHBROOK, IL 60062 - INVOICE # 37828
FILE # 30057-00148

MATTER: LAKE UTLIITY SERVICES, INC
2007 RATE CASE

CURRENT INVOoOICE SUMMARY

SUMMARY OF CHRRGES RENDERED ON THIS IMVQICE:

CURRENT FEES: § 2,209.00
CURRENT COSTS: 5 76.11
TOTAL CHARGES FOR THIS INVOICE: 5 2,285.11
QUTSTANDING ACCOUNTS RECEIVABLE: $ .00

TOTAL AMOUNT DUE THIS MATTER: s 2,285.11
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UTILITIES, INC
ATTN: JOHN STOVER

2335 SANDERS RD JULY 11,
NORTHBROOK, IL 60062 INVOICE #

FILE # 30057-00148

PAGE

PLEASE REFER TO iNVQICE B
WHEN REMITTING NUMBER

2008

1

38187

MATTER: LAKE UTLIITY SERVICES, INC
2007 RATE CASE

6/02/08 CWM  TELEPHONE CONFERENCE WITH RICK WRIGHT AT PSC
STAFF REGARDING DATES FOR CUSTOMER MEETING AND
COMBINING THE INITIAL CUSTOMER NOTICE WITH THE
NOTICE OF CUSTOMER HEARING; REVIEW CANCELED
TARIFF SHEETS REGARDING RATES IN EFFECT PRIOR TO
FILING; REVIEW B-SCHEDULES REGARDING INCOME AND
EXPENSE INFORMATION; REVISE RATE CASE SYNOPS1S
FOR APPROVAL AND PLACEMENT AT LIBRARY AND CLIENT
OFFICE.

6/03/08 MSF TELEPHONE CONFERENCE WITH MR. WRIGHT WHO
TELEPHONED REGARDING WAIVER ANMD LETTER TO MR. HOY
REGARDING SAME; DRAFT LETTER TO MS. COLE WAIVING
8 MONTHE DEADLINE

6/03/08 CWM TELEDHONE CONFERENCE WITH BART FLETCHER OF PSC
STAFF REGARDING A ONE-WEEK EXTENSION TO ALLOW FOR
PLACING THE MATTER ON THE OCTOBER 14, 2008
AGENDA; REVIEW AND REVISE INITIAL CUSTOMER NOTICE
TO INCORPORATE UPDATED INPORMATION; REVIEW AND
REVISE RATE CASE SYNOPSIS INCORPORATING SPECIFICS
FROM UPDATED CASE SCHEDULE AND LOCATICN OF MFRS
FOR PUBLIC INSPECTION; DRAFT CORRESPONDENCE TO
RICK WRIGHT OF THE PSC STAFF REGARDING APPROVAL
OF THE NOTICE OF CUSTOMER MEETING AND RATE CASE
SYNCPSIS.

6/04/08 CWM  TELEPHONE CONFERENCE WITH RICK WRIGHT REGARDING
APPROVAL OF RATE CASY SYNOPSIS, INITIAL CUSTOMER
NOTICE, AND REQUEST FOR NOTICE OF CUSTOMER
HEARTING; REVISE RATE CASE SYNOPSIS ACCORDING TO
PSC STAFF INSTRUCTIONS; REVISE IBITIAL CUSTOMER
NOTICE RATE SHEETS ACCORDING TO PSC STAFE
INSTRUCTIONS; DRAFT PROPOSED NOTICE OF CUSTOMER
HEARING AT SAWGRASS BAY ELEMENTARY SCHOOL.

6/05/08 CWM TELEPHONE CONFERENCE WITH RICK WRIGHT OF THE PSC

.74

.80

.00

.70

302.50

203.00

226.00

275.00

742.50
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UTILITIES, INC

Invoice #:

38187 PAGE

BreNRE

FER TO INVOICE NUMBER

ITTING

6/06/08 CWM

6/09/08 CWM

6/09/08 CwWM

STAFF REGARDING REVISIONS TC RATE CASE SYNOPSIS
AND INITIAL CUSTOMER NOTICE; REVISE RATE CASE
SYNOPSIS ACCORDING TO INSTRUCTIONS; REVISE
INITIAY, CUSTOMER NOTICE ACCORDING TO
INSTRUCTIONS; REVIEW CORRESPONDENCE FROM PSC
STAFF APPROVING RATE CASE SYNOPSIS AND INITIAL
CUSTOMER NOTICE; DRAFT CORRESPONDENCE TO ERIN
POVICH REGARDING MAILING OF INITIAI CUSTCMER
WOTICE; DRAFT AFFIDAVIT OF MAILING FOR INITIAL
CUSTOMER NOTICE; DRAFT CORRESPONDENCE T PATRICK
FLYNN REGARDING MAILING OF SYNOPSIS TCO LOCAL
GOVERNMENT COFFICIALS AND PLACEMENT OF SYNOPSIS,
APPLICATION AND MFRS AT ALTAMONTE OFFICES AND
COOPER MEMORIAL LIBRARY FOR PUBLIC INSPECTION;
DRAFT CORRESPONDENCE TO JOHN HOY REGARDING
STAFF-APPROVED RATE CASE SYNOPSIS; DRAFT LETTER
TO THE LIBRARIAN OF COOPER MEMORIAL LIBRARY
REGARDING AVAILABILITY OF SYNOPSIS, APPLICATION
AND MFRS FOR PUBLIC INSPECTION; RESEARCH THE
IDENTITY OF LAKE COUNTY'S "CEO" ACCORDING TO RULE
20-25.0407(4) (B} ; DRAPT LETTER TO CINDY HALL
{LAKE COUNTY MANAGER) REGARDING THE RATE CASE

SYNOPSIS; REVIEW PREPARED NOTEBOOKS CONTAINING
APPLICATION, SYNOPSIS AND MFRS.

DRAFT CORRESPONDENCE TO AND REVIEW CORRESPOUDENCE
FROM ERIN POVICH REGARDING CONTENT AND DATE OF
MAILING OF THE INITIAL CUSTOMER NOTICE; DRAFT
CORRESPONDENCE TC AND REVIEW CORRESPONDENCE FROM
PATRICK FLYNN REGARDING THE ENTITY NOTICING LIST
AND GOVERNMENTAL, ENTITIES LOCATED WITHIN QR NEAR
SERVICE TERRITORY.

REVIEW CORRESPONDENCE FROM FRANK SEIDMAN
REGARDING RATE CASE EXPENSE AND ESTIMATES TO
COMPLETE IN RESPONSE TO STAFF'S REQUEST FOR
ADDITIONAL INFORMATION; REVIEW DOCUMENTS
SUEBMITTED BY MR. SEIDMAN.

REVIEW STAFF'S REQUEST FOR ADDITIONAL
INFORMATION; DRAFT CORRESPONDENCE TO CLIENT AND
CONSULTANTS REGARDING CONTENT OF REQUESTS AND
RESPONSIBILITY FOR RESPONDING; COORDINATE

.50

.30

.60

137.50

82.50

440.00
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6/10/08

6/11/08

6/1z2/08

6/12/08

6/12/08

6/12/08

CHM

MSF

CWM

TELEPHONE CONFERENCE WITH CLIENT AND CONSULTANT
REGARDING STAFF'S REQUEST FOR ADDITIONAL
INFORMATION; REVIEW CORRESPONDENCE FROM CLIENT
REGARDING RESPONSES TO STAFF'S REQUEST FOR
ADDITIONAL INFORMATION; REVIEW DOCUMENTS IN
SUPPORT OF RESPCONSRES; DRAFT CORRESPONDENCE TO
CLIENT REGARDING SRME; REVIEW CORRESECNDENCE FROM
MARTIA BRAVQ REGARDING RESPONSES TO STAFF'S
REQUEST FOR ADDITIONAL INFORMATION; REVIEW
DOCUMENTS I[N SUPPORT OF RESPCNSES INCLUDIKG RATE
CASE EXPENSE INVOICES AND REVISED MFR SCHEDULES
IN RESPONSE TO ITEMS 2, 3 AND 4.

REVIEW CORRBSPONDENCE FROM MARIA BRAVO REGARDING
RESPONSES TC STAFF'S REQUEST FOR ADDITIONAL
INFORMATION; REVIEW MARIA'S REVISED RESPONSES TO
ITEMS 2, 3 AND 4; REVIEW CORRESPONDENCE FROM
CLIENT REGARDING RESPONSES TO STAFF'S REQUEST;
REVIEW RESPONSES PROVIDED BY CLIENT; DRAFT LETTER
TO CLIENT AND CONSULTANTS REGARDING CONFERENCE
CALL TO IDENTIFY RESPONSIBILITY FOR RESPONSES.
REVIEW RESPONSES TC STAFF'S REQUEST FOR
ADDITIONAL INFORMATION RECEIVED FROM PATRICK
FLYNN AND MARIA BRAVO; PREPARE INITIAL DRAFT OF
LETTER RESPONDING TO STAFF'S REQUEST FOR
ADDITICNAL. INFORMATICN.

PREPARE FOR AND PARTICIPATE IN CONFERENCE CALL
REGARDING STAFF'S FIRST DATA REQUEST

TELEPHONE QONFERENCE WITH RICK WRIGHET OF THE PSC
STAFF REGRRDIRG REQUEST FOR ADDITICNAL HARD
COPIES AND COMPUTER DISCS OF ALLOCATION MANUALS;
TELEPHONE CONFERENCE WITH KIRSTEN WEEKS REGARDING
2006 ALLOCATION MANUALS; FREPARE HARD COPIES OF
ALLOCATION MANUALS REQUESTED; REQUEST ALLOCATION
MANUALS ON COMPUTER DISC FROM CLIENT.

TELEPHONE CONFERENCE WITH CLIENT AND CONSULTANTS
REGARDING RESPONSES TO STAFF'S FIRST REQUEST FOR
ADDITIONAL INFORMATION.

REVIEW RESPONSES TO STAFF'S REQUEST FOR
ACDITIONAL INFORMATION FROM MARIA BRAVO; REVIEW
DOCUMENTSE SUBMITTED IN SUPPORT OF MARIA'S

.B0

.80

.40

.70

220.00

440.00

232.00

110.00

182.50

302.50




LAW OFFICES

ROSE, SUNDSTROM & BENTLEY, LLP
P.0. BOX 1567
TALLAHASSEE, FLORIDA 323021567
F.E.L# 59-2783536 (850) 877-6566 PHEASE REFER TO INVOICE NUMBER

UTILITIES, INC

Invoice #: 38187 PAGE 4

RESPONSE; REVIEW RELEVANT MFR SECTIONS FCR
CONSISTENCY; REVIEW AND REVISE DRAFT OF LETTER
RESPONDING TQ STAFF'S REQUEST FOR ADDITIONAL
INFORMATION; REVIEW DESCRIPTION OF METHODS AND
BASES FOR PROJECTING COSTS AND INCOME; REVISE
LETTER RESPONDING TO STAFF TO INCORPORATE
RESPONSES TO ITEMS 12, 13 AND 14; PREPARE TABLES
IN DOCUMENT FOR REQUESTED MONTHLY WATER AND
WASTEWATER CONSUMPTION DATA.

€/13/08 CWM RECEIVE AND REVIEW ALLOCATION MANUALS FOR THE 3RD .20 55.00
AND 4TH QUARTER OF 2007; PREPARE COPIES FOR
SUBMISSION TO STAFF; CONFERENCE WITH MARTY
FRIEDMAN REGARDING DELIVERY OF HARD COPY AND
COMPUTER DISC ALLOCATION MANUALS,

6§/16/08 CWM  TELEPHONE CONFERENCE WITH PATRICK FLYNN REGARDING 1.20 330,00
RESPONSES TQ STAFF'S REQUEST FOR ADDITICONAL
INFORMATION; REVIEW CORRESPCHDENCE FROM PATRICK
FLYNN REGARDING SAME; REVIEW PATRICK FLYNN'S
RESPONSES TOQ ITEM NOS. 8, 9, 17, 18, AS WELL a5
DISCUSSION ON RESPONSES TO STAFF'S OTHER
REQUESTS; REVIEW AND REVISE THE UTILITY'S LETTER
RESPCNDING TO STAFF'S REQUEST FOR ADDITIOMAL
INFORMATION INCORPORATING RESPONSES.

6/17/08 CWM  REVIEW CORRESPONDENCE FROM CLIENT REGARDING .60 165.00
RESPONSES TO STAFF'S REQUEST FOR ADDITIONAL
INFORMATION; REVIEW RESPONSES TO STAFF'S REQUEST
FOR ADDITIONAL INFORMATION FROM CLIENT; REVIEW
CORRESPONDENCE FROM CLIENT REGARDING STAFF
ASSIGNED TO CUSTOMER MEETING: DRAFT
CORRESPONDENCE TO CLIENT REGARDING SAME.

6/18/08 CWM  REVIEW CORRESPONDENCE FROM MARTY FRIEDMAN .50 137.50
REGARDING RESPONSE TO ITEM NQ. 15 ON STAFF'S
REQUEST FOR ADDITIONAL INFORMATION; REVIEW AND
REVISE LETTER RESPONDING TO STAFF'S REQUEST FOR
ADDITIOMAL INFORMATION INCORPORATING SALID
RESPONSE; REVIEW RATE CASE SYNOPSIS FOR
CONFIRMATION OF CUSTOMER MEETING DATE.

6/18/08 CWM  REVIEW CORRESPONDENCE AND PERMITTING INFORMATION 1.20 330.00
BY AND BETWEEN THE S5T. JOHNS WATER MANAGEMENT
DISTRICT AND THE UTILITY IN CONNECTION WITH
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6/23/08 CWiM

6/23/08 CWM

6/26/08 Cwm

6/30/08 CHM

RESPONDING TO ITEMS 17 AND 18 IN STAFF'S REQUEST
FOR ADDITIONAL INFORMATION; REVIEW AND REVISE
DRAFT OF LETTER RESPONDING TO STAFF'S REQUEST TO
INCORPORATE SAID INFORMATION; REVIEW AND REVISE
RESPONSE TO ITEM 4 {(RE SERVICE AVAILABTILITY
CHARGES] .

REVIEW CORRESEONDENCE FROM MICHELLE ROCHOW
REGARDING RATE CASE EXPENSE AND INVQICES FROM RSB
FOR RESPONSE TO STAFF'S REQUEST FOR ADDITIONAL
INFORMATION; RESEARRCH AND REVIEW ACTUAL RATE CASE
EXPENSE AND INVOICES FOR LEGAL FE2S8 AND COSTS;
DRAFT CORRESPONDENCE TO MICHELLE ROCHOW REGARDING
RATE CASE EXPENSE AND COSTS; SUBMIT "INVOICES TO
MICHELLE ROCHOW FOR USE IN RESPONSE TO STAFF'B
REQUEST.

REVIEW AND REVISE RATE CASE SYNOPSIS ACCORDING TO
COMMENTS OF JAN KYLE OF THE FLORIDA PEC; DRAPT
CORRESPONDENCE TO JAN KYLE REGARDING RATE CASE
SYNOPSIS AND INITIAL CUSTOMER NOTICE APPROVAL AND
EELECTION OF LOCATION FOR PUBLIC DISPLAY OF RATE
CASE DOCUMENTS;

REVIEW AND REVISE SCHEDULES SUBMITTED TO CLIENT
AND LOCATION WHERE RATE CASE DOCUMENTS ARE
PUBLICLY AVAILABLE TC INCORPORATE REVISED
SCHEDULES FILED AS PART QF RESPOKSE TQO DEFICIENCY
LETTER; DRAFT LETTER TO CLIENT REGARDING UPDATING
RATE CASE BINDER; DRAFT LETTER TO LIRBRARIAN
REGARDING UPDATING RATE CASE BINDER.

REVIEW RESPONSES TO STAFF'S FIRST REQUEST FOR
ADDITIONAL INFORMATICN; REVISE LETTER RESPONDING
TGO STAFF'S REQUEST INCORPORATING ADDITIONAL
RESPONSES; DRAFT CORRESPONDENCE TO PATRICK FLYNN
REGARDING OUTSTANDING RESPONSES; DRAFT
CORRESPONDENCE To KIRSTEN WEEKS REGARDING
OUTSTANDING RESPONSES; DRAFT CORRESPONDENCE TO
ERIN FOVICH REGARDING OUTSTANDING RESPONSES.

TOTAL HOURS

.50

.50

3G

.90

20.C0 J

137.50

137.50

82,50

247.50
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UTILITIES, INC

Invoice #: 38187 PAGE 6
PROFESSIONAL FEES $ 5,522.50
MARTIN S FRIEDMAN 1.50 435.00
CHRISTIAN W MARCELLI 18.50 5,087.50
FEDERAL EXPRESS 27.43
PHOTOCOPIES 368.25
TOTAL COSTS ADVANCED $ 395.68

TOTAL STATEMENT $ 5,918.18
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UTILITIES, IKC

ATTN: JOHN STQVER

2335 SANDERS RD JULY 11, 2008

NORTHBROOK, IL 60062 N INVCICE # 38187
FILE # 39057-00148

MATTER: LAKE UTLIITY SERVICES, INC
2007 RATE CASE

CURRENKT INVOICE SUMMARY

SUMMARY OF CHARGES RENDERED ON THIS INVOICE:

CURRENT FEES: $ 5,522.50
CURRENT COSTS: $ 395.68
TOTAL CHARGES FOR THIS INVOICE: $ 5,918.18
OQUTSTANDING ACCOUNTS RECEIVABLE: $ .00

TOTAL AMOUNT DUE THIS MATTER: § 5,918.18
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ROSE, SUNDSTROM & BENTLEY, LLP

- P.D. BOX 1567
TALLAHASSEE, FLORIDA 32302-1567
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(850} 8?7. 6556 AR B 1;30 INVQICE NUMBER
UTILITIES, INC
ATTN: JOHN STOVER
2335 SANDERS RD AUGUST 12, 2008
NORTHBROOK, IL 60062 INVOICE # igazs
) FILE # 30057-00148
PAGE 1
MATTER: LAKE UTLIITY SERVICES, INC
2007 RATE CASE
7/01/08 CWM  REVIEW CORRESPONDENCE FROM MARIA BRAVO REGARDIKNG .70 192.50

7/02/08 CWM

7/03/08 CWM

7/17/08 CWM

RESPONSES TO ITEMS 1 AND ASSOCIATED EXHIBITS;
REVIEW AND REVISE RESPONSE TQ STAFF'S REQUEST FOR
ADDITIONAL INFORMATION. _ L.

REVIEW RESPCNGES AND ASSQCIATED EXHIBITS 3.50 962.50
RESPONDING TC STAFF'S REQUEST FOR ADDITIONAL
INFORMATION FROM CLIENT AND CONSULTANTS; DRAFT
CORRESPONDENCE TO CLIENT AND CONSULTANTS
REGARDING RESPECTIVE RESPONSE DRAFTS; TELEPHONE
CONFERENCE WITH KIRSTEN WEEKS REGARDING SAME;
TELEPHONE CONFERENCE WITH ERIN POVICH REGARDING
SAME; TELEPHONE CONFERENCE WITH PATRICX FLYNN
REGARDING SAME; DRAFT RESPONSE TQ STAFF'S REQUEST
FOR ADDITIONAL INFORMATION.

REVIEW AND REVISE THE UTILITY'S RESPONSE TO 3.40 $35.00
STAFF'S FIRST REQUEST FOR ADDITIONAL INFORMATION;
REVIEW DRAFT RESPONSES AND ASSOCIATED EXHIBITS
FROM CLIENT AND CONSULTANTS REGARDING SAME;
TELEPHONE CONFERENCE WITH PATRICK FLYNN REGARDING
PROPOZED RESPONSES AND ASSOCIATED EXHIBITS;
TELEPHONE CCNFERENCE WITH ERIN POVICH REGARDING
SAME; TELEPHONE CONFERENCE WITH KIRSTEN WEEKS
REGARDING SAME; DRAFT CORRESPONDENCE TO PATRICK
FLYNN, ERIN POVICH AND MARIA BRAVO REGARDING
PROPCSED RESPONSES TO STAFF'S REQUEST FOR
ADDITIONAL INFORMATION; REVIEW CORRESPONDENCE
FRCM KIRSTEN WEEKS REGARDING RESPONSES TQ STAFF'S
REQUEST; REVIEW CORRESPONDENCE FROM ERIN POVICE
AND PATRICK FLYNN REGARDING SAME; PREPARE FINAL
LDRAFT AND EXHIBITS FOR PILING WITH THE PSC CLERK.
REVIEW SUPPLEMENTAL INFORMATION RESPONDING TO .60 165.00
STAFF'S FIRST REQUEST FOR ADDITIONAL INFORMATION;
DRAFT CORRESPONDENCE TO THE COMMISSION CLERK
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ROSE, SUNDSTROM & BENTLEY, LLP
P.C. BOX 1567
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WHEN REMITTING

UTILITIES, INC

Invoice it: 38328 . PAGE 2

REGARDING THE SUPPLEMENTAIL RESPONSE; PREPARE
] DCCUMENTS AND CORRESPONDENCE FOR E-FILING.

7/21/08 MSF REVIEW STAFF'S FIRST REQUEST FOR FRODUCTION OF .30 87.00
DOCUMENTS AND LETTER TO CLIENT AND CONSULTANTS
CONCERNING SAME :

7/21/08 CWM  REVIEW STAFP'S FIRST REQUEST FOR PRODUCTION OF 1.80 495.00
DOCUMENTS; REVIEW CORRESPONDENCE FROM FRANK
SEIDMAN RESPONDING TO STAFF'S REQUEST; DRAFT
CORRESPONDENCE TQ PRANK SEIDMAN REGARDING FILING
OF DOCUMENTS AND ELECTRONIC FILES; PREPARE DISC
CONTAINING ATTACHMENTS TO THE RESPONSE TO STAFF'S
REQUEST; DRAFT PLEADING RESPONDING TO STAFF'S
FIRST REQUEST FOR PRODUCTION OF DOCUMENTS: DRAFT
NOTICE OF SERVICE REGARDING RESPONSE TQ STAFF'S
FIRST REQUEST FOR PRODUCTION OF DOCUMENTS; DRAFT
CERTIFICATE OF SERVICE REGARDING SAME; DRAFT
CORRESPONDENCE TO CLIENT, CONSULTANTS AND
ASSIGNED STAFF REGARDING FILING OF SAME.

7/22/08 CWM TELEPHONE CONFERENCE WITH BART FLETCHER AND RICK .80 220.00
WRIGHT AT THE PSC STAFF REGARDING REVISIONS TO :
THE CLIENT'S ALLOCATIONS POLICY AND THE COMPANY'S
RESPONSE TO STAFF'S FIRST REQUEST POR PRODUCTION
OF DOCUMENTS; TELEFHONE CONFERENCE WITH ERIN
POVICH REGARDING STAFF'S INQUIRIES; TELEPHONE
CONFERENCE WITH RICK WRIGHT REGARDING ALLOCATIONS
POLICY.

7/28/08 CHM TELEPHONE CONFERENCE WITH PATRICK FLYNN REGARDING .80 220.00
NCTICE OF CUSTCMER MEETING; TELEPHONE CONFERENCE
WITH ERIN POVICH REGARDING SAME; TELEPHONE
CONFERENCE WITH BART FLETCHER REGARDING LACK OF
APPROVAL PFOR NOTICE OF CUSTOMER MEETING AND
POSTPONEMENT OF CUSTOMER MEETING; DRAFT
CORRESPONDENCE TC CLIENT AND CONSULTANTS
REGARDING POSTPONEMENT OF CUSTOMER MEETING.

7/29/08 CWM REVIEW NOTICE OF INTERVENTICN FILED BY OFFICE OF .20 55.00
FUBLIC COUNSEL; DRAFT CORRESPONDENCE TO CLIENT
AND CONSULTANTS ADVISING OF PUBLIC COUNSEL'S
INTERVENTION.
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ROSE, SUNDSTROM & BENTLEY, LLP

P.0. BOX 1567
TALLAHASSEE, FLORIDA 32302-1567
F.E.1R 50 g
50-2783536 (850} 877-6555 ME%FERN? WVOICE NUMBER
UTILITIES, INC
Invoice i: 38328 PAGE 3
TOTAL HOURS 12.10 \/
PROFESSIONAL FEES 5 3,332.00
MARTIN S FRIEDMAN .30 87.00
CHRISTIAN W MARCELLI 11.80 3,245.00
OPPRATOR CONFERENCE CALL 3a1.02
FEDERAL EXPRESS 45,09
LONG DISTANCE CALLS 1.00
PHOTOCOPIES 1,106.00
TOTAL COSTS ADVANCED $ 1,183.11

TOTAL STATEMENT $ 4,515.11




LAW OFFICES
ROSE, SUNDSTROM & BENTLEY LLP

0. BOX 1567
TALLAHASS&E FLORIDA 32302-1567
F.E.|.# 59-2783536 (850) 8778555 mi&r TO INVOICE NUMBER

UTILITIES, INC

ATIN: JOHN STOVER

2335 SANDERS RD AUGUST 12, 20608

NORTHBROOK, IL 60062 INVGICE # 38328
FILE # 30057-00148

MATTER: LAKE UTLIITY SERVICES, INC
2007 RATE CASE

CURRENT INVOICE SUMMARY

SUMMARY OF CHARGES RENDERED ON THIS INVOICE:

CORRENT FEES: % 3,332.00
CURRENT COSTS: $1,183.11
TOTAL CHARGES FOR THIS INVOICE: $ 4,515.11
OUTSTANDING ACCOUNTS RECEIVABLE: § .00

TOTAL AMOUNT DUE THIS MATTER: $ 4,515.11
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ATTN: JOHN STOVER
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NORTHBRCOQK., IL 60062 INVOICE #
K FILE # 30057-00148

PAGE

1

38402

8

8/0s/08 MSF
t/12/08 MEF

B/12/08 CWM

Bf13/08 CWM

8/14/08 MSF

8/14/08 CWM

8/20/08 CWM

MATTER: DLAKE UTLIITY SERVICES, INC
2007 RATE CASE

TELEFHONE CONFERENCE WITH MR. HOY WHO TELEPHONED
TELEPHONE CONFERENCE WITH MR. PLETCHER AND MR.
WRIGHT WHO TELEFHONED

TELEPHONE CONFERENCE WITH BART FLETCHER AND RICK
WRIGHT OF THE PSC STAFF REGARDING NEW DATE FOR
POSTPONED CUSTOMER MEETING; DRAFT NOTICE OF
CUSTOMER MEETING ACCORDING TO NEW DATA; DRAFT
CORRESPONDENCE TO RICK WRIGHT OF STAFF REGRRDING
APPROVAL OF CUSTOMER NOTICE.

REVIEW CORRESPONDENCE FROM RICK WRIGHT OF THE PSC
STAFF REGARDING MNEW DATE AND LOCATION FOR
CUSTOMER MEETING; DRAFT CORRESPONDENCE TO RICK
WRIGHT REGARDING REVISED NOTICE OF CUSTOMER
MEETING; REVIEW CORRESPONDENCE FROM RICK WRIGHT
REQUESTING REVISIONS TQ NOTICE OF CUSTCMER
MEETING; REVIEW AND REVISE NOTICE QF CUSTOMER
MEETING IN ACCORDANCE WITH STAFP'S COMMENTS;
OBTAIN STAFF APPRCVAL QF NOTICE; DRAFT
CORRESPONDENCE TO CLIENT REGARDING APPROVED
ROTICE QF CUSTOMER HEARING AND DATE BY WHICH IS
MUST BE MAILED TO ALL CUSTOMERS; DRAFT AFFIDAVIT
OF MAILING REGARDING NOTICE OF CUSTOMER HEARING.
TELEPHONE CONFERENCE WITH MR. HOY AND DRAFT
LETTER TO CLERK EXTENDING DEADLINE

DRAFT CORRESPONDERCE TO BART FLETCHER QF THE PSC
RESPONDING TO QUESTIONS ABOUT AMORTIZATION CF
PROJECT PHOENIX AND SERVICE AVAILRBILITY CHARGES.
TELEPHONE CONFERENCE WITE BART FLETCHER OF PSC
STAFF REGARDING TREATMENT QF PROJECT PHOENLIX IN
TEST YEAR; DRAFT CORRESPONDENCE TO DEBBIE SWAIN
REQUESTING FURTHER INFPORMATION IN CCONNECTION WITH
BART'S REQUEST FOR TNFORMATION; REVIEW RESPONSE
FROM DEBBIE SWAIN REGARDING SAME; DRAFT RESPONSE

.20
.20

-80

.80

.30

.30

.70

58.00
58.00

220,00

220.00

87.00

82.50

1%2.50




LAW OFFICES

ROSE, SUNDSTROM & BENTLEY, LLP
P.0. BOX 1667
TALLAHASSEE, FLORIDA 32302-1667
F.ELK 502783536 (850) 877-6555 PLEASE REFER TO INVOICE NUMBER
WHEN REMITTING

UTILITIES, INC

Invoice #: 38402 PAGE 2

TO BART REGARDING ACCOUNTING FOR PROJECT PHOENIX
IN TEST YEAR.
8/21/08 MSF TELEPHONE CONFERENCE WITH MR. FLETCHER WHO 40 116.00
TELEPHONED REGARDING SERVICE AVAILABILITY; DRAFT )
LETTER TO MR. SWAIN CONCERNING SAME
8/21/08 CWM  REVIEW CORRESPONDENCE FROM RICK WRIGHT OF PSC .30 82.50
STAFF REGARDING THE MAILING OF TEE NOTICE OF
CUSTOMER MEETING; DRAFT CORRESPONDENCE TO ERIN
POVICH REGARDING SAME; DRAFT CORRESPONDENCE TO
RICK WRIGHT REGARDING ANTICIPATED MAILING DATE OF
NOTICE OF CUSTOMER MEETING.
8/25/08 CWM  REVIEW STAFF'S SECOND DATA REQUEST; DRAFT .50 137.50
CORRESPCNDENCE TO CLIENT AND COMSULTANTS
REGRRDING RESPONSE TCO DATAZ REQUEST.

8/27/08 MSF PREPARE FOR AND PARTICIPATE TELECONFERENCE 1.20 348.00
REGARDING RESPONSE TC AUDIT AND RAI
8/27/08 CWM TELEPHONE CONFERENCE WITH CLIENT AND CONSULTANTS 1.20 330.00

REGARDING RESPONSE TO STAFF'S AUDIT REFCRT;
TELEPHONE CONFEREWCE WITH BART FLETCHER OF PSC
STAFF REGARDING DEADLINE TO RESPOND TQ AUDIT
REPORT .
8/28/08 CWM REVIEW AFFIDAVIT OF MAILING OF NOTICE OF CUSTOMER .60 165.00
MEETING; DRAFT LETTER TC COMMISSION CLERK
REGARDING FILING OF AFFIDAVIT; PREPARE AND FILE
DOCUMENTS WITH PSC CLERK.
8/28/08 CWM TELEFHONE CONFERENCE WITH BART FLETCHER REGARDING -B0 220.00
EXTENSION OF DEADLINE TO RESPOND TO AUDIT REPORT;
TELEPEONE CONFERENCE WITH KIRSTEW WEEKS REGARDING
TIME NEEDED TO RESPOND TD STAFF'S AUDIT REPORT
AND WHETHER THERE ARE ANY POTENTIAL PROBLEMS WITH
STAFF'S WATER SERVICE CORPQRATION AFFILIATE AUDIT
THAT COULD IMPACT OVERALL DEADLINES; DRAFT
CORRESPONDENCE TO BART FLETCHER RESPONDING TO
QUESTIONS AND REQUESTING EXTENSICN OF DEARDLINE TO
RESPOND TO AUDIT REPORT (AND ESTIMATE OF NEW
AGENDA DATE) .
8/29/08 CWM REVIEW CORRESPONDENCE FROM CLIENT REGARDING .60 165.400
RESPONSE TC STAPF'S SECOND DATA REQUEST; REVIEW
PROPOSED DRAFT RESPONSES FROM KIRSTEN WEEKS;
DRAFT CORRESPONDENCE TO KIRSTEN WEEKS REGARDING
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ELECTRONIC VERSIONS OF ALLOCATIONS. .
8/29/08 CWM REVIEW CORRESPONDENCE FROM CLIENT REGARDING .30 82.50

EXTENSION OF DERDLINE TO RESPOND TC AUDIT REFORT;

DRAFT CORRESPONDENCE TO BART FLETCHER REGARDING

REQUEST TO EXTEND AUDIT REPCRT RESPONSE DEADLINE.

TOTAL HOURS 9.20 \/

PROFESSICNAL FEES ' $ 2,564.50
MARTIN S FRIEDMAN . 2.30 €67.00
CHRISTIAN W MARCELLI 6.90 1,897.50
LONG DISTARCE CALLS 1.00
PROTOCOPIES 3.00
TOTAL CQSTS ADVANCED £ 4.00

TOTAL STATEMENT § 2,568.50
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MATTER: LAKE UTLIITY SERVICES, INC
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CURRENT INVOICE EUMMARY

SUMMARY OF CHARGES RENDERED ON THIS INVOICE:

CURRENT FEES: $ 2,564.50
CURRENT COSTS: 5 4.00
TOTAL CHARGES FOR THIS INVOICE: $ 2,56B.50
OUTSTANDING ACCOUNTS RECEIVABLE: 5 .00

TOTAL AMOUNT DUE THIS MATTER: $ 2,568.50
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MATTER: LAKE UTLIITY SERVICES, INC
2007 RATE CASE

9/02/08 CWM TELEPHONE CONFEREMCE WITH RICK WRIGHT OF PSC .20 55.00
STAFF REGARDING REQUEST TO EXTEND DEADLINE FOR
THE UTILITY'S RESPONSE TC STAFP'S AUDIT REPORT
AND DETAJILS OF HOW SAID EXTENSION WILL AFFECT
AGENDA DATE.
8/03/08 CWM DRAFT CCRRESPONDENCE TO BART FLETCHER OF PSC .20 55.00
STAFF REGARDING STAFF'S AUDIT REPORT AND THE
DEADLINE FOR THE COMPANY'S RESPONSE.
9/05/08 CwWM TELEPHONE CCNFERENCE WITH BART FLETCHER OF THE .60 165.00
PSC REGARDING THEE DUE DATE OF THE UTILITY'S
RESPONSE TO THE AUDIT DATE AND THE WSC AFFILIATE
AUDIT; DRAFT CORRESPONDENCE TC JOHN HOY REGARDING
THE EXTENSION OF THE DEADLINE TO RESPOND TO
STAFF'S AUDIT REPORT AND STAFF'S REQUEST TO
FURTHER WAIVE THE AGENDA DEADLINE.

9/08/08 MSF TELEPHONE CONFERENCE WITH MR. HOY REGARDING .20 58.00
WAIVER OF 5 MONTH REQUIREMENT; DRAFT LETTER TO
PEC CLERK

8/08/08 CWM  REVIEW DOCUMENTS FROM RICK WRIGHT OF PSC STAFF .30 82.50

REGARDING STAFF'S SECOND DATA REQUEST; TELEPHEONE
CONFERENCE AND CORRESPONDENCE WITH KIRSTEN WEEKS
REGARDING DATA ON CD TQO BE SUBMITTED WITH
RESPONSE TO STAFF'S SECOND DATA REQUEST.
9/0%/08 CWM TELEPHONE CONFERENCE WITH RICK WRIGHT OF FS5C .60 165.00
STAFF REGARDING STAFF'S THIRD DATA REQUEST;
REVIEW STAFF'S THIRD DATA REQUEST; DRAFT
CORRESPONDENCE TQO CLIENT AND CONSULTANTS
FORWARDING STAFF'S THIRD DATA REQUEST AND
ELICITING COMMENTS. .
9/10/08 CWM REVIEW STAFP'S THIRD DATA REQUEST; REVIEW .60 165.00
CORRESFONDENCE FROM RICK WRIGHT OF PSC STAFF
REGARDING SAME; DRAFT CORRESPONDENCE TO CLIENT

AND CONSULTANTS REGARDING TIME FRAME FOR
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RESPONDING TO STAFF'S THIRD DATA REQUEST. :
9/11/08 MSF TELEPHONE CCONFERENCE WITH MS. MERCHANT OF QPC WHO 3.50 1,015.00
TELEPHONED; DRAFT LETTER TC MR. FLYNN; TRAVEL TO
CLERMONT, ATTEND CUSTCMER MEETING, CONFERENCE
WITH CLIENT AND RETURN
9/11/08 CWM TRAVEL TO AND FROM JENKINS AUDITORIUM IN 3.50 962.50
CLERMONT, FL; ATTEND CUSTOMER MEETING; REVIEW AND
REVISE NOTES OF MEETING FOR FOLLOW UP TO ISSUES
RAISED BY CUSTOMERS.
8/12/08 CWM DRAFT CORRESPONDENCE TO CLIENT AND CONSULTANTS 2.00 550.00
REGARDING RESPONSES TO STAPF'S SECCND REQUEST FOR
ADDITIONAL INFORMATION; REVIEW RESPONSES FROM
CLIENT AND CCNSULTANTS REGARDING RESDPONSES TO
STAFF'S QUERIES; TELEPHCNE CONFERENCE WITH EART
FLETCHER AND RICK WRIGHT OF PSC STAFF REGARDING
SUBMISSION OF VOLUMINOUS DOCUMENTATION; DRAFT
CCRRESPONDENCE TO RICK WRIGHT REGARDING THE
UTTLITY'S RESPONSES TO STAFEF'S REQUEST FOR
VOLUMINOUS SUPPORTING DOCUMENTATION; REVIEW
SUPPORTING DOCUMENTS AND ARRANGE FPOR REPRODUCTION
AND FILING OF SAME; DRAFT LETTER TO PSC CLERK
RESPONDING TO STAFF'S SECOND REQUEST FOR
ADDITIONAL INFORMATION AND PROVIDING SUPPORTING
DOCUMENTATION.
9/15/08 CWM DRAFT CORRESPONDENCE TO RICK WRIGHT REGBRDING 1.30 357.50
SUBMISSION OF ALTOCATION MANUALS SEPARATELY FROM
THE REST OF THE RESPONSES TO STAPF'S SECOND
REQUEST FOR ADDITIONAL INFORMATION; REVIEW
ALLOCATION MANUALS ON DISC; REVIEW AND REVISE
i RESPCNSE TO SECOND REQUEST FOR ADDITIONAL
: INFORMATION TO INCLUDE METHOD OF SUBMITTING
; ALLOCATION MANUALS; TELEPHONE CONFERENCE WITH -
BART FLETCHER AND RICK WRIGHT REGARDING THEIR
PREFERRED MEDIA FOR SUBMISSION OF ALLOCATION
MANUALS .
9/16/08 CuM REVIEW CORRESFONDENCE FROM CLIENT REGARDING .60 165.00
SUBMISSION OF JDE CAPTIME REPCRTS RESPCNSIVE TO
STAFF'S REQUEST FOR ADDITIONAL INFORMATION;
REVIEW CAPTIME REPORTS AND ARRANGE FOR
REPRODUCTION AND FILING; DRAFT LETTER TO PSC
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COMMISSION CLERK REGARDING FILING OF ALLOCATICN
MANUALS; PREPARE AND FILE DOCUMENTS WITH
COMMISSION CLERK.

9/19/08 MSF TELEPHONE CONFERENCE WITH MR. WILLIAMS WHO . .20 58.00
TELEPHONED
9/19/08 CWM REVIEW THE UTILITY'S RESPONSE AND SUPPORTING .20 55.00

DOCUMENTATION TO THE FIRST OF TwO CUSTCMERS TO
RAISE ISSUES AT THE CUSTOMER MEETING (ENGLE);
REVIEW CORRESFONDENCE FROM CLIENT REGARDING THE
UTILITY'S RESPONSE TO TEE CUSTOMER.
9/22/08 MSF REVIEW AND REVISE PROPOSED RESPONSES TO AUDIT -20 87.00
9/22/08 CWM REVIEW AND REVISE CLIENT'S DRAFT RESPONSES TO 1.89 455.00
STAFF'S AUDIT REPORT; DRAFT CORRESPONDENCE TO
KIRSTEN WEEKS, ERIN POVICH AND MICHELLE ROCHOW
REGARDING THE PROPOSED RESPONSES CONTAINED
THEREIN; TELEPHONE CONFERENCE WITH MICHELLE
ROCHOW REGARDING SUPPORTING DOCUMENTATION AND
FORMAT; DRAFT LETTER TO COMMISSION CLERK
REGARDING THE CLIENT'S RESPONSE 10 STAFF'S AUDIT
REPORT; REVIEW ATTACHMENT TC BE SUBMITTED WITH
LETTER TO CLERK; DRAFT CORRESPONDENCE TOQ CLIENT
REGARDING PROCEDURE FOR FILING ATTACHMENTS TO
RESPCNSE ON DATA DISC.
9/23/08 CWM REVIEW AND REVISE RESPONSE TO STAFF'S AUDIT .50 137.59
REPORT; PREPARE AND FILE RESPONSE AND SUPPORTING
DBOCUMENTS WITH COMMISSION CLERK.
9/25/08 CWM REVIEW CLIENT'S RESPONSES TO ISSUES RAISED AT .80 220.00
CUSTOMER MEETING; DRAFT CCRRESPONDENCE TO BART
FLETCHER OF PSC STAFF REGARDING CLIENT'S
RESPONSES; TELEPHONE CONFERENCE WITH CLIENT
REGARDING SUPPORTING DOCUMENTS FOR RESPONSES TO
CUSTOMER MEETING 1SSUES.
9/26/08 MSF TELEPHONE CCONFERENCE WITH MR. FLETCHER OF PSC WHO .60 174 .00
TELEPHONED REGARDING AFFILIATE AUDIT; REVIEW
AFFILIATE AUDIT AND LETTER TO CLIENT CONCERNING

SAME.
9/29/08 MSF REVIEW OPC INTERROGATORIES AND REQUESTS TO .30 87.00
PRODUCE AND LETTER TO CLIENT CONCERNING SAME
9/2%9/08 CuWM REVIEW DRAFT RESPONSES FROM CLIENT REGARDING 2.50 6£87.50

STAFF'S THIRD REQUEST FOR ADDITIONAL INFORMATION;
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REVIEW SUPPORTING DOCUMENTATION FOR RESPONSE;
REVIEW CORRESPONDENCE FROM CLIENT AND CONSULTANTS
REGARDING DRAFT RESPONSES; DRAFT CORRESPONDENCE
TC CLIENT REGARDING RESPONSES; REVISE AND FORMAT
LETTER TO PSC CLERK RESPONDING TO DATA REQUEST;
FREPARE AND FORMAT ALL DCOCUMENTS AND FILE WITH
PSC CLERK.

S/30/08 CwM REVIEW CLIENT'S DRAFT RESPONSE TO WSC AFFILIATE .40 110.00
AUDIT REPCRT; REVIEW SUPPORTING DOCUMENTATION;
TELEPHONE CCNPERENCE WITH KIRSTEN WEEKS REGARDING
DETAIL OF RESPONSES; DRAFT LETTER TO PSC CLERK
REGARDING RESPONSE TO WSC AFFILIATE AUDIT REPORT.

TOTAL HOURS 21.2¢

PROFESSIONAL FEES $ 5,906 .50

MARTIN S PRIEDMAN 5.10 1,479.00

CHRISTIAN W MARCELLI 16.10 4,427.50
LONG DISTANCE CALLS 1.00
FEDERAYI, EXPRESS 109.16
TRAVEL EXPENSE 2587.18
QUTSIDE PHOTOCOPIES 1,912.5%0
PHOTOCOPIES 152,50
TOTAL COSTS ADVANCED 5 2,432. 74

TOTAL STATEMENT $ 8,339.24
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MATTER: LAKE UTLIITY SERVICES, INC
2007 RATE CASE

CURRENT INVOICE SUMMARY

SUMMARY OF CHARGES RENDERED ON THIS INVOICE:

CURRENT FEES: § 5,906.50
CURRENT (QSTS: $ 2,432.714
TOTAL CHARGES FOR THIS INVOICE: 5 B8,339.24
OUTSTANDING ACCOUNTS RECEIVABLE: $ .00

TOTAL AMOUNT DUE THIS MATTER: 5 8,333%.24
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