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OFFICE OF AUDITING AND PERFORMANCE ANALYSIS 
AUDITOR’S REPORT 

May 20,2009 

TO: FLORIDA PUBLIC SERVICE COMMISSION 

We have performed the procedures enumerated later in this report to meet the agreed upon 
objectives set forth by the Division of Economic Regulation in its audit service request. We 
have applied these procedures to the attached schedules prepared by Gulf Power Company in 
support of its filing for Capacity Cost Recovery Clause (CCR), Docket No. 100001-EI. 

This audit was performed following general standards and field work standards found in the 
AICPA Statements on Standards for Attestation Engagements. Our report is based on agreed 
upon procedures and the report is intended only for internal Commission use. 
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OBJECTIVES AND PROCEDURES 

REVENUES 

Objective: To verify filed Capacity Cost Recovery Clause (CCR) customer revenues and KWH 
sold were properly recorded in the books of the utility. 

Procedures: CCR revenues were audited jointly with the revenue portions of the other clause 
audits of GulfPower Company. The work product is contained in Docket No. lOOOOI-EI, Audit 
control number 10-004- 1 - 1 . 

EXPENSES 

Objective: 
invoices with the final true-up filing. 

Procedures; In 
addition, audit staff reconciled the CCA-2 and CCA-3 schedules to the general ledger and 
appropriate Intercompany Interchange Contract (IIC) invoices. Audit staff also verified twelve 
months of IIC receipts, IIC purchases, and transmission expenses as per the filing. 

Objective: 'To verify that transmission revenues derived from non-separated, non-Energy Broker 
Network, wholesale energy sales are credited to the clause in compliance with FPSC Order 
PSC-08-0824-FOF-EI. 

To reconcile capacity costs and revenues as reflected in the general ledger and 

The audit staff recalculated filed true-up schedules CCA-2 and CCA-3. 

Procedures: Scheduled transmission revenues for the twelve month period ended December 3 I ,  
2009. Recalculated adjustments made to the transmission and ancillary dollars and traced 
transmission revenues to company filing and general ledger. Audit staff reviewed the filed 
transmission revenues and confirmed that they comply with FPSC Order PSC-99-2512-FOF-EI, 
issued December 22, 1999. 

TRUE-UP 

Objective: To determine if the utility true-up calculation and interest provisions for the period 
ended December 3 I ,  2009 filed with this Commission were calculated correctly. 

Procedures: Recalculated the 2009 Capacity Cost Recovery Clause true-up and interest 
schedules using FPSC approved recoverable true-up computations, interest rates, and 
jurisdictional separation factor. 
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