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Subject: RE: . 0 5 0  JUN 1 7  2013 + aoo-  iLCX6@d 

T&\ ab 1. am. 00 Raquel Tully 

From: Nancy Pruitt 

tL* 5 \ 8 2  DEPOSIT DATE 
Sent: 

To: Raquel Tully 

Monday, June 14,2010 1:20 PM 

csf This is for Docket 100224-TX 

$600 is RAF; $500 for Fine ($200 to PSC Trust Fund and $300 to General Revenue) '300 - 
$150 is penalty late charges and $30 is interest late charges 

Nancy Pruitt 
Florida Public Service Commission 
2540 Shumard Oak Boulevard 
Tallahassee, FL 32399 

850-41 3-6128 (fax) 
850-41 3-61 27 

From: Raquel Tully 
Sent: Monday, June 14, 2010 1:02 PM 
To: Nancy Pruitt 
Subjeb: 

TX994, sent in only a check in the amount of $1,280.00. Please let me know the breakdown 

6/14/20 1 0 
- 


