Page 1 of 1

|OOR/AYS
Raquel Tully e o T, < IO 00
RECETET oG :

From: Nancy Pruitt R ( Do PYI)

Sent:  Monday, June 28, 2010 1:44 PM 10 JUK29 AH 9: 10

To: Raquel Tully Q, ) s o < 8 %j .

Subject: RE: SUeH B S TUH

CLERK o B00- @;

This is for Docket No. 100245-T!. ACO- Tasx
The company has aiready paid their 2009 RAF. @-RI4-\V O
$500 is the Fine ($200 to the PSC Trust Fund and $300 to General Revenue) Yy
$205 is for P&I.
Nancy Pruitt DEROS
Florida Public Service Commission OSIT parg
2540 Shumard Qak Boulevard 052 i
Tallahassee, FL 32399 ' 2 VUM 29 x4
850-413-6127 -

850-413-6128 (fax)

From: Raquel Tully

Sent: Monday, June 28, 2010 1:39 PM
To: Nancy Pruitt

Subject:

| received a check from Devine Communications for $705.00
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