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Raquel Tully EOENENTRSC Totel © 191700
From: Nancy Pruitt Y ) Q,\Q \=\ Sle \S
Sent:  Monday, July 12, 2010 1:16 PM10 JUL |3 AM 8: 57 & D00~ Lecdvery
To: Ragquel Tully i ; 506 - N =
Subject: RE: LUi'ii‘llSStOf‘é
CLERK 1- -\
This is for Docket No. 100244-T1. "dn

$700 is for 2009 RAF, $175 is penalty, $42 is interest. $1,000 is a Fine of which $200 goes to the PSC Trust
Fund and $800 to General Revenue.

Nancy Pruitt

Florida Public Service Commission DEPOSIT DATE
2540 Shumard Oak Boulevard

Tallahassee, FL 32399 L 054 13 2680

850-413-6127
850-413-6128 (fax)

From: Raquel Tully

Sent: Monday, July 12, 2010 1:09 PM
To: Nancy Pruitt

Subject:

Before you leave can u give me the info on diaf world for the $1917.00 amount

DOCUME ST &UMPE- DATE

05734 JULi3e

1/12/2010 FPSC-COmMisSslmoLer s




