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RaquelTully 

From: Toni Earnhart QV\# JS~d~ 
Sent: Wednesday, May 30,2012 11:45 AM 

To: Raquel Tully ~ r;;t:fJ _'--[~nd 
Subject: RE: 120086-TX (TY015) Mountain Communications, LLC 

$ro~ ~lnGHi Raquel, 

TK271 is their IXC and TY015 is their CLEC. They meant TY015 as that is the company with the open s:-~- b2 
docket listed below. f2-(

DATE DEPOSITPer what they submitted, please apply it as listed below. 

JU~ 01211122 47 
120086-TX (TY015) - :IiMountain Communications, LLC N rn
2011 RAF $600.00 c... 

C") c::: 0 
Penalty $90.00 0 :z: m 
Interest $18.00 n3: I <r-3: riltT\­

;;t:J(/) ::z:,. 0Fine $500 ($200 to PSC Trust Fund and $300 to General Revenue) 
::x~ ::E I -n

0 Uz: 9-
if) 

From: Raquel Tully U1 0 
Sent: Wednesday, May 30, 2012 11:19 AM 
To: Toni Earnhart 
Subject: 

I received a check from TK 271 for $1,208.00. Please let me know the break down. 

fJ 354 4 JUN -I ~ 
5/30/2012 FPSC-CO 

http:1,208.00

