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RaquelTully 

From: Toni Earnhart RECE:lVED--FPSC 
Sent: Tuesday, August 07, 20128:53 AM 

To: Raquel Tully 12 AUG - 8 PH 3: 11 
Subject: RE: Comtech21, LLC (TX759) Docket No. 120110-TX 


HI Raquel, 


Per what they submitted, please apply it as listed below. 


Comtech21 , LLC (TX759) Docket No. 120110-TX 

Fine $500 ($200 to PSC Trust Fund and $300 to General Revenue) 

Toni Joy McCoy-Earnhart 
Regulatory Analyst 
Florida Public Service Commission 
Division of Regulatory Compliance 

DATE DEPOSIT 

AUG 09 2012 26 6 
2540 Shumard Oak Blvd. 
Tallahassee, Florida 32399-0850 
TEARNHAR@PSC,STATE.FL.US 
85014 13-6532 Direct Line 
850/413-6533 Fax Line 

From: Raquel Tully 
Sent: Tuesday, August 07, 2012 8:31 AM 
To: Toni Earnhart 
Subject: 

Received a check for $500.00 for Comtech 21, please let me know the breakdown. 

o5 4 I 0 AUG -8 ~ 

8/7/2012 FPSC- CO f 1/SSI CLERKI 
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