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REQUEST TO ESTABLISH DOCKET c... I~~ 
C) > () 
0 z rn (Please type or print. File original plus 1 copy with CLK.) ("') -·~ r-;..':;_ (..) ;;:;: 

I Docket No.: 130035""-TC 
,.,:::: - rr 

Date: 1/30/2013 ::::'~ r·t 
l:lot """' I Office Of Telecommunications/Toni Earnhart ~s 

"""" ..s. j 

1. From Division I Staff: 0 "'"lj 

::z \.8 ...,..., 

2.0PR: Toni Earnhart, TEL 0 ~.:: \D ' .) 

3.0CR: GCO 

4. Suggested Docket Title: Reguest for cancellation of PATS Certificate of Necessi~ No. 8538 b~ SAVAC, Inc. 
effective December 31, 2012. 

5. Program/Module/Submodule Assignment: B-1.F 

6. Suggested Docket Mail List. 

a. Provide NAMES/ACRONYMS, if registered company. D Provided as an Attachment 

Company Code, Parties 
if applicable: (include address, if different from MCD): Representatives (name and address): 

TH030 

b. Provide COMPLETE NAME AND ADDRESS for all others. (match representatives to companies) 

Company Code, Interested persons, if any, 
if applicable: (include address, if different from MCD): Representatives (name and address): 

7. Check one: ~ Supporting Documentation Attached D To be provided with Recommendation 

Comments: Documentation Attached 

IDM --
TEL 
CLK tJft 

PSC\CLK 01 0-C (Rev. 11/1 0) 

,, 

0 0 6 0 6 JAN 31 ~ 
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.The attached document has been issued by the Florida Public Service Commission and fil... Page 1 of 2 

Telesa 

From: lan Frye (ian_frye@yahoo.com] 

Sent: Wednesday, January 23, 2013 3:41 PM 

To: Toni Earnhart; Austin Kevin; Telesa 

Subject: Re: SAVAC, Inc.'s Florida Certification 

Hello Toni 

Savac will be canceling its PSC Certification for the State of Florida. The $100 check and the RAF form 
will be sent out this week. Thanks for your help 

Ian Frye 
SAVAC 
1-13-13. 

From: Toni Earnhart <TEarnhar@PSC.STATE.FL.US> 
To: ian_frye@yahoo.com 
Sent: Friday, January 18, 2013 1:51 PM 
Subject: SAVAC, Inc.'s Florida Certification 

Ian, 

Does SAVAC intend to voluntarily cancel its pay telephone certificate in Florida? 

I am the analyst that processes such requests for the Florida Commission and I have not 
received a cancellation request. 

I noticed the minimum RAF of $100 hasn't been paid either. 

To cancel the certificate in good standing effective 12/31/2012, the company will need to 

complete a 2012 RAF form, pay the $100 minimum by January 30th RAF and request in writing 
to be cancelled. 

Let me know your intentions. I can email you a 2012 RAF form for the company. 

Tonf Joy Earnhort, RegulatoryAm:tlyst 
Florid(J Public Service Commission 
Office of TeJecommunicarlon$ 
2540 Shurnurd Oak Btvc/. 
Tctliahossee, Fl. 32399 
Phone .85f}41~·6532 · 
Fl1J( 850-413-653:3 

From: Ian Frye [mailto:ian_frye@yahoo.com] 
Sent: Tuesday, October 09, 2012 4:03 PM 

1/24/2013 
00606 JA.N31 ~­

FPSC·COMHISSIOH CLERK 



_ . The attached document has been issued by the Florida Public Service Commission and fil... Page 2 of 2 

To: Records Clerk 
Subject: Re: FPSC E-service of Document NO. 06874-12 in Docket 120230-PU (Email ID = 325046) 

We no longer have pay phones in the state of Florida Please take me off this email list. 

Thanks Ian Frye 
SAVAC 
30 1 A Brogdon Rd 
Suwanee Ga 30024 

From: Commission Clerk <CpmmissionCierk@psc.state. fl. us> 
To: 
Sent: Tuesday, October 9, 2012 1:42PM 
Subject: FPSC E-service of Document NO. 06874-12 in Docket 120230-PU (EmaillD = 325046) 

The document dcscr,bed below has been issu~d by the florida Public Service Commissio11 and filed with the 
Otfk~' ot Commission Clerk. As a party of record at the time of issuance or, if applicable, an interested person, 
you are being provided this information electronically. 
Should you have any problems accessing this document, please contact the Office of Commission Clerk by repJy 
e-mail. Do not alter the subject line, as it is used for processing. 

DOCUMENT NO. DESCRIPTION 
06S74-12 (6 pgs.) Order Yes 

PSC-12-0534-NOR -PU 
noticing rulemaking [to repeal 
Rules 25-4.043, 25-6.004, 

I 
25-6.042, and 25-7.038, 
FAC, relating to response to 
Commission staff inquiries, 
and reference to 
Commission]; if timely 
requested, a hearing will be 
held at a time and place to be 
announced in a future notice; 
written requests for hearing 
and written comments or 
suggestions on the rules must 

I 
be received by C LK no later 
than 10/30/12. 

1/24/2013 



'rO AVOID PENALTY AND INTEREST CHARGES, THE REGULATORY ASSESSMENT FEE RETURN MUST BE FILED ON OR BEFORE 01/30/2013 
· Pay Telephone Service Provider Regulatory Assessment Fee Return 

RECEIVED·-FPSC Florida Public Service Commission 

STA TUj~ IAN 2 9 AJ1 a: 5 ::&.. (See Filing Instructions on Back of Form) 

Acltlft!~elilm ifH030-12-0-R 
-Estimated Retupl SAVAC Inc . 
=Amende€illlilil~~WON 301-A B~ogd.on Road DATE DEPOSiT 

CL Suwanee, GA 30024-2354 
PERIOD COVERED: 

JAN 2 9 2013 2 91 OI/OI/2012 r'o 12/3!12012 

~I 
~~ Please Complete Below If Official Mailing Address Has Changed 

LTNE 
NO. 

I. 

(Name of Company) (Address) 

ACCOUNT CLASSIFICATION 

Gross Operating Revenue (Florida) 

2. Gross Intrastate Revenue 

3. 

4. 

5. 

Less: Amounts Paid to Other Telecommunications Companies (lJ (see "2. Fees" on back) 

TOTAL REVENUES for Regulatory Assessment Fee Calculation (Line 2/ess Line 3) 
REGULATORY ASSESSMENT FEE DUE- (Mulliply Line 4 by O.OOJ6.lfmore than $100, 
enter amount. If less, enter $/00.) (]) 

6. Penalty for Late Payment (see "3. Failure to File by Due Date" on back) 

7. Interest for Late Payment (see "3. Failure to File by Due Date" on back) 

8. Extension Payment Fee (see "4. Extension" on back) 

9. TOTAL AMOUNT DUE (Add lines 5 through 8) 

1 o. Number of pay telephones in operation at close of period covered by this Return 

(!) Thel'e amllunt'> must be intrastate only and must be verifiable (see "2. Fees" on back). 

FOR PSC USE ONLY 

Check# '5() <0.3 
s /CY).cJO 

$ E 

06-03-001 
003001 

$--- ----- p 06-03-001 
004011 

$ 

Postmark Date /-:) ~- / 3 
I .. I fP -·--·--v;::;;--nttla so reparer ___ _f:,:2L_ .... _ .. __ 

(City/State) (Zip) 

AMOUNT 

$ 0 
0 

& .) 

$ 0 
0 
f) 

() 

0 
$ 0 

0 

(2) Regardless of the gross operating revenue of a company, a minimum annual regulatory assessment fee of $100 shall be 
imposed as provided in Section 364.336. Florida Statutes. 

I, the undersigned owner/officer of the above-named company, have read the foregoing and declare that to the best of my knowledge and belief 
the above information is a true and correct statement. I am aware that pursuant to Section 837.06, Florida Statutes, whoever knowingly makes a 
false statement in writing with the intent to mislead a public servant in the perfonnance of his official duty shall be guilty of a misdemeanor of the 

second deX ....-- , rJ A 
o ~- -- t/ r -~ ~.5 1--l.f-J ·5 

(Signa~ ompanyoifiClilt) (Title) (Date) ""' 

PSCIRAD 026 ( ~~~ 
l?nl .. ?~..a.nl,;l t1~ 

Telephone Number 67/ .. 11 J--()()!0 Fax Number,.·......_ ____ _ 

F.E.I. No. _ __::;5;....ruf_.-..J.f_5..t..-;():;....;:..(:,_:8=-B-/ _____ l_)O_,C_V_1 M_X_~_· i_~_H_.·"'_1 '_· P - f' ,-,~ ~ 

0 0 5 4 6 JAN 29 ~ 

FPSC·COMHISSION CLERK 



COMPANY IDENTIFICATION 
Printed on 01/30/2013 at 09:49:37 by TJE 

Complete Name: SAVAC, Inc. 

Mailing Name: 
Company Code: 

SAVAC, Inc. 
TH030 FEID Number: 58-1906887 

RAF ACCOUNT FOR THE PERIOD 01/01/2012 THROUGH 12/31/2012 

Reg. Date: 

Service: 

Received: 

Status: 

Amended: 

11/30/2004 

PAT - Pay Telephone 
Actual RAF Form 

Satisfied 

No 
Frozen: No 

Payment Count: 1 Payment Made to Date 
Operating Rev: $0.00 
RAF Rate: 0.0016 

Assessment Due 

RAF $100.00 

Penalty $0.00 

Interest $0.00 

Extension Fee $0.00 

Total $100.00 

Inactive Date: 

Extension: 

Comments: 
No 
No 

Interstate Rev: 

Paid 

$100.00 

$0.00 

$0.00 

$0.00 

$100.00 

$0.00 

Owe 

$0.00 

$0.00 

$0.00 

$0.00 

$0.00 

Last modification was made on Tuesday, January 29, 2013 at 9:57 AM by Valorie Moore 



Toni Earnhart 

From: Bob Casey 
Sent: 
To: 

Tuesday, January 29, 2013 3:36 PM 
Toni Earnhart 

Subject: FW: New filing in undocketed matter 

From: Filings Clerk 
Sent: Tuesday, January 29, 2013 3:22 PM 
To: Terri Fleming; carolyn Craig; Jeff Bates; Beth Salak; Bob casey; Mark Long 
Subject: New filing in undocketed matter 

DOCUMENT DESCRIPTION= AIT/Fiscal- $100 payment record from SAVAC, Inc. (TH030), for 2012 RAFs; Dep 
291 dated 1/29/13; with attached note dated 1/23/13 advising Savac will be 
canceling its certification for the State of Florida. 

DOCUMENT PATH= 
file://L:\PSC\LIBRARY\FILINGS\13\00546-13 

Document ID = 00546-13 
Document Filed 01/29/13 

The filing described above is now available in PDF format. 

To access it, click on the DOCUMENT PATH link. This will pop up a Windows Explorer window. You will see the PDF 
(Adobe Acrobat) version; you will also see other versions if they exist. Double-click on the preferred version and the 
document will open. 

If you need to cuUpaste/search in the document and find you can't, try later when the reformatted version is available. (For 
more information, see PDF Tips on the How To menu.) 

This is an automatically generated e-mail; no response/reply is necessary. 
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