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FROM: Toni J. Earnhart, Regulatory Analyst II, Office of Telecommunications 

RE: Docket No. 130022-TC; Southern Communications Systems Inc. 

Please add the attached email exchanges to the docket file. 

Also note the company paid the 2012 minimum RAF due by January 30th for a voluntary 

cancellation to process. 


Please call 413-6532, if you have any questions. 


Attachments 
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Toni Earnhart 

From: Toni Earnhart 
Sent: Friday, January 25, 2013 1:40 PM 
To: 'S.Jones1@att.net' 
Subject: FW: New filing in Docket No. 130022-TC (Southern Communications Systems Inc.) 

Importance: High 

Mr. Jones, 

The Commission received your request for voluntary pay telephone certificate cancellation effective January 1, 2013 . 

I would like to clarify that you plan to pay the minimum $100 RAF payment on or before January 30, 2013 and submit 
the 2012 RAF completed with zero revenues. 

If you submit the RAF payment by its due date (postmarked no later than January 30, 20B), the cancellation request 
can be retroactively effective December 31,2012 . 

If you keep a January 1, 2013 cancellation effective date as requested in your letter of January 14, 2013, you will also 
owe a 2013 RAF payment. 

Please confirm in a responding email that you intend to submit the $100 minimum RAF payment due for the year 2012 
along with a completed RAF form on or before January 30,2013 
and I will ask the Commission Clerk to change your cancellation effective date to December 31,2012 so you have no 
2013 RAF payment responsibilities. 

Please call or email with any questions. 

Toni Joy Earnhart, Regulatory Analyst 
Florida Public Service Commission 
Office of Telecommunications 
2540 Shumard Oak Blvd. 

Tallahassee, FL 32399 
Phone 850-413-6532 
Fax 850-413-6533 

From: Bob Casey 
Sent: Wednesday, January 23, 2013 9: 16 AM 
To: Toni Earnhart 
Subject: FW: New filing in Docket No. 130022-TC (Southern Communications Systems Inc.) 

DOCKET TITLE = Request for cancellation of PATS Certificate No. 6044 by Southern Communications 
Systems, Inc., effective January 1, 2013. 

UTILITY NAME =Southern Communications Systems Inc. 

DOCUMENT DESCRIPTION =Docket correspondence - Administrative. [ClK note: Subsequent administrative 
correspondence will be appended to this document.l ,rv . ' 1\" ).\ "' ~, I I-',r ~ 
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DOCUMENT PATH = 

Document 10 :::: 3 
Document Filed 01/22/13 

The filing described above is now available in PDF format. 

To access it, click on the PATH link. will pop up a Windows Explorer window. You will see the PDF 
you will also see other versions if they exist. Double-click on the version and the 

document will open. 

If you need to in the document and find you can't, try later when the , ...."",,,,,"',, ....,, version is available. (For 
more information, see PDF on the How menu.) 

no response/reply is necessary. This is an automatically 
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Toni Earnhart 

From: Earnhart 
January 30, 2013 11:44 AM Sent: 

To: Matilda Sanders 
Southern Communications Docket No. 130022-TC 

Matilda, 

this email, please edit date for this to December 2012. 

Docket No. 130022-TC; Request for cancellation of PATS No. 6044 by Southern Communications 
Inc., January 1, 2013. 

Thanks, 

Toni Joy Earnhart, Regulatory Analyst 
Florida Public Service Commission 
Office 0/Telecommunications 
2540 Shumard Oak Blvd. 
Tallahassee, FL 32399 
Phone 850-413-6532 
Fax 850-413-6533 
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