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DOCUMENT NO. 03838-2021
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Raquel Revells R, I“‘l =
From: Andrea Mick
Sent: Thursday, April 29, 2021 12:33 PM
To: Raquel Revells
Cc: DATE DE™DBKpy; Andrew Kunkler; Gabriella Passidomo
Subject: RE: TY178

A\ . =

MAY 03 2001 4 4 4 et #0006

Hi Raquel,

Of the $500, $200 will go to the PSC and the remaining $300 to the General Fund.

Cissy/Andrew/Gaby, Tone Communication (TY178) is one of our 1% time non-compliance violation dockets. They have
now paid their RAFs (including P&I) and non-compliance fee.

Thanks,
Andrea

From: Raquel Revells <RRevells@psc.state.fl.us>
Sent: Thursday, April 29, 2021 9:01 AM

To: Andrea Mick <AMICK@psc.state.fl.us>
Subject: TY178

Good morning, TY 178 sent in a check for $708.00 and another Check for $500.00, how would you like me to breakdown
the $500.00?





