F.E.l.# 59-2783536

Docket No. 20190168-WS
FCRU Document 1707
11/15/21 Supplemental Response to Staff 8th POD #26
LAW OFFICES

SUNDSTROM & MINDLIN, LLP

2548 BLAIRSTONE PINES DR
TALLAHASSEE, FLORIDA 32301

FIRST COAST REGIONAL UTILITY, LLC
301 CAPITAL PARTNERS, LLC

C/0 AVERY C. ROBERTS
P.0. BOX 238
LAKE BUTLER, FL 32054

(850) 877-6555 REFER TO INVOICE NUMBER
EMITTING
APRIL 3, 2019
INVOICE # 655984

PAGE

FILE # 48070-00001

2/04/19

2/04/19
2/13/19

2/13/19
2/14/19

2/18/19

2/19/19

2/20/19

2/20/19

2/21/19

FMD

KLK
WES

RCB
WES

RCB

RCB

WES

RCB

WES

MATTER: ORIGINAL CERTIFICATE FROM PSC

REVIEW PSC RULE ON ORIGINAL CERTIFICATE PROCESS
IN PREPARATION FOR MEETING ON NEW UTILITY:
INTEROFFICE MEETING WITH SUNDSTROM, KEMPER AND
BRANNAN.

ANALYSIS OF PSC CERTIFICATION PROCESS.

FOLLOW UP CONVERSATIONS WITH AVERY ROBERTS
RELATIVE TO DRAFT LETTER FOR CHEMOURS, ARRANGE
SITE VISITS, DISCUSSIONS WITH ACCOUNTANTS AND
ENGINEER, SECURE COPIES OF PRIOR RELEVANT FPSC
CERTIFICATE APPLICATIONS, BEGIN ASSEMBLING FILES,
ETC.

CONTINUE TO RESEARCH REQUIREMENTS AND
APPLICATIONS FOR ORIGINAL CERTIFICATE APPLICATION
ADDITIONAL DISCUSSIONS WITH PAUL HARDEN AND AVERY
ROBERTS, PROVIDE FPSC MINIMUM FILING REQUIREMENTS
TO BEVIN BEAUDET; CONFERENCE CALL WITH MR.
BEAUDET RELATIVE TO WHAT IS EXPECTED OF HIM IN
THIS INSTANCE, ETC.

RESEARCH MATERIALS NECESSARY FOR FILING
APPLICATION FOR ORIGINAL CERTIFICATE; DRAFT MEMO
TO CLIENT SETTING OUT NECESSARY MATERIALS
CONTINUE TO PREPARE FOR MEETINGS IN JACKSONVILLE
AND BEGIN DRAFTS OF MATERIALS NEEDED FOR ORIGINAL
CERTIFICATE

PREPARE FOR, TRAVEL TO, AND ATTEND MEETINGS IN
JACKSONVILLE WITH PAUL HARDEN AND BEVIN BEAUDET
RELATIVE TO FIRST COAST UTILITY'S FPSC
APPLICATION, DINNER MEETING, ETC.

PREPARE FOR AND TRAVEL TO JACKSONVILLE FOR
MEETINGS WITH PAUL HARDEN AND BEVIN BEAUDET
REGARDING PSC CERTIFICATE APPLICATION MATTERS.
SITE TOUR OF 301 CAPITAL PARTNERS PROJECT WITH
AVERY ROBERTS, BEVIN BEAUDET, ET AL.; NOTES TO
FILE; RETURN TO TALLAHASSEE.

.90

.40
3.50

6.50

337.50

150.00
1,312.50

600.00
562.50

1,125.00

1,125.00

2,625.00

2,625.00

2,437 .50
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LAW OFFICES

SUNDSTROM & MINDLIN, LLP

2548 BLAIRSTONE PINES DR
TALLAHASSEE, FLORIDA 32301

(850) 877-6555 PLEASE REFER TO INVOICE NUMBER
WHEN REMITTING

FIRST COAST REGIONAL UTILITY, LLC

" Invoice #:

55984 PAGE 2

2/21/19 RCB

2/27/19 WES

2/28/19 WES

2/28/19 FMD
3/06/19 RCB

3/07/19 WES

3/07/19 RCB
3/08/19 WES

3/08/19 RCB

3/11/19 RCB

TOUR THE PROPOSED SERVICE TERRITORY WITH BEVIN 6.00 2,250.00
BEAUDET, BILL SUNDSTROM AND AVERY ROBERTS; TRAVEL

BACK TO TALLAHASSEE.

CONVERSATION WITH BEVIN BEAUDET RELATIVE TO THE 1.50 562.50
SCOPE OF HIS REPORT; ADDITION OF "ART"™ IN THE

FORM OF GRAPHIC DRAWINGS, ETC.; DISCUSSION WITH

AVERY ROBERTS RELATIVE TO TIME TABLE MOVING

FORWARD; EMAIL TO BEVIN BEAUDET ATTACHING

ABSORPTION SCHEDULES AND MAPS OF THE SUBJECT

PROPERTY .

DISCUSSION WITH BEVIN BEAUDET RELATIVE TO THE 2.50 937.50
CONTENTS OF HIS REPORT; SECURE PRIOR REPORTS FROM

THE FPSC FOR EXHIBITION TO BEVIN; DISCUSSION WITH

PAUL HARDEN'S OFFICE RELATIVE TO LARGE GROUP

MEETING; CONVERSATION WITH ACCOUNTANT IN MIAMI

AND SECURE HER PROPOSAL FOR DOING THE ACCOUNTING

SERVICES ON THE PSC APPLICATION AND FORWARD SAME

TO PAUL HARDEN. :
REVIEW PSC CASES RE: RECENT ORIGINAL CERTIFICATE .90 337.50
FILINGS AND ENGINEERING REPORTS AND SIMILAR

PROCEEDINGS AND COPY DOCUMENTS FOR SUNDSTROM.

WORK ON RESEARCH FOR APPLICATION; RESEARCH LAND 3.90 1,462.50
USE DESIGNATIONS AND COMPREHENSIVE PLANS. DRAFT

PORTIONS OF APPLICATION.

DISCUSSIONS WITH ALEXANDER HARDEN RELATIVE TO 1.00 375.00
REUSE REQUIREMENTS FOR DRI IN DUVAL COUNTY;

DISCUSSIONS WITH AVERY ROBERTS IN THIS REGARD,

ETC.

WORK ON DRAFT OF APPLICATION FOR ORIGINAL 3.60 1,350.00
CERTIFICATE

CONTINUE TO WORK ON ORGANIZATIONAL ASPECTS OF THE 2.00 750.00

FILING, INCLUDING COMPREHENSIVE PLAN, REUSE

REQUIREMENTS, ETC.; MULTIPLE DISCUSSIONS WITH

ENGINEER IN PAUL HARDEN'S OFFICE IN THIS REGARD.

RESEARCH ISSUES RELATED TO APPLICATION AND ANY 3.80 1,425.00
POTENTIAL CONFLICTS WITH JEA; RESEARCH

COMPREHENSIVE PLANS FOR BAKER, NASSAU AND DUVAL

COUNTIES

RESEARCH LAND USE DESIGNATIONS AND COMP PLAN 2.00 750.00
REQUIREMENTS FOR EACH COUNTY. SEEK CONFIRMATION




F.E.l# 59-2783536

Docket No. 20190168-WS
FCRU Document 1709
11/15/21 Supplemental Response to Staff 8th POD #26

LAW OFFICES

SUNDSTROM & MINDLIN, LLP

2548 BLAIRSTONE PINES DR
TALLAHASSEE, FLORIDA 32301

(850) 877-6555 PLEASE REFER TO INVOICE NUMBER
WHEN REMITTING

FIRST COAST REGIONAL UTILITY, LLC

Invoice #:

55984 PAGE 3

3/15/19 WES

3/16/19 WES

3/18/19 WES
3/19/19 WES
3/20/19 WES

3/21/19 WES

3/22/19 WES

3/23/19 FMD

3/25/19 WES

3/25/19 FMD

3/25/19 RCB
3/26/19 WES

FROM DENISE HOWARD ON CONCLUSIONS FOR LAND USE. :
DISCUSSION WITH BEVIN BEAUDET RELATIVE TO 1.00 375.00
CONTENTS OF ENGINEERING REPQORT; DISCUSSION WITH

JARED B. JOHNSTON OF THE CLAY COUNTY UTILITY

AUTHORITY RELATIVE TO HIS WILLINGNESS TO PROVIDE

INFORMATION TO US; FOLLOW UP DISCUSSION WITH

AVERY ROBERTS.

DISCUSSION WITH AVERY ROBERTS RELATIVE TO EMAIL 1.00 375.00
FROM THE JEA; EMAIL DISCUSSION WITH MIKE BRAND

RELATIVE TO JEA SITUATION.

DISCUSSION WITH BEVIN BEAUDET RELATIVE TO SIZING .40 150.00
OF WATER AND WASTEWATER PLANTS.

CONFERENCE CALL WITH CLIENTS AND PAUL HARDEN .50 187.50
RELATIVE TO DEALING WITH THE JEA, ETC.

ADDITIONAL CONVERSATIONS WITH BEVIN BEAUDET .50 187.50

RELATIVE TO COMPLIANCE WITH JEA CONSTRUCTION
STANDARDS; STRATEGY FOR FILING WITH THE PSC.

FURTHER DISCUSSIONS WITH BEVIN BEAUDET RELATIVE .50 187.50
TO COST OF INTERCONNECT FROM JEA AND ELEMENTS OF

HIS REPORT.

CONSIDERATION OF CORPORATE STRUCTURE FOR FIRST 1.50 562.50

COAST REGIONAL UTILITIES; BRIEF DISCUSSION WITH
BOB KENNELLY IN THIS REGARD; SEND RAFTELIS RATE
STUDY TO BOB KENNELLY AND DEBBIE SWAIN.

EMAILS WITH WES RE: NEEDED CONFERENCE CALL TO .20 75.00
DISCUSS ISSUES RELATED TO ENTITY CHOICE AND

CONSIDERATIONS .

CONFERENCE CALL WITH DEBBIE SWAIN IN PREPARATION 1.50 562.50

FOR ALL HANDS CALL TO BE HELD ON TUESDAY, MARCH

26TH, RELATIVE TO ENTITY OF FIRST COAST; SECURE

RATES AND CHARGES FOR NEIGHBORING UTILITIES AND

FORWARD SAME TO MS. SWAIN.

INTEROFFICE CONFERENCE AND CONFERENCE CALL WITH 70 262.50
SWAIN RE: ISSUES TO BE DISCUSSED IN COMPANY

CONFERENCE CALL.

CONTINUE TO WORK ON APPLICATION FOR ORIGINAL 2.00 750.00
CERTIFICATE
PREPARE FOR AND PARTICIPATE IN ALL HANDS 1.50 562 .50

CONFERENCE CALL RELATIVE TO BUSINESS FORMAT FOR
FIRST COAST BE IT "C" CORPORATION, "S"
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LAW OFFICES

SUNDSTROM & MINDLIN, LLP

2548 BLAIRSTONE PINES DR
TALLAHASSEE, FLORIDA 32301

(850) 877-6555 PLEASE REFER TO INVOICE NUMBER
WHEN REMITTING

FIRST COAST REGIONAL UTILITY, LLC

Invoice #:

55984 PAGE 4

3/26/19 FMD

3/27/19 WES

CORPORATION, LLC, ETC.; CONSIDER QUESTIONS ABOUT
ULTIMATE SALE, ETC.; FOLLOW UP WITH BOB KENNELLY.

PREPARE COMMENTS AND PARTICIPATE IN CONFERENCE 1.30 487 .50
CALL RE: ENTITY CHOICE FOR UTILITY AND TAX

ISSUES.

ON INSTRUCTIONS OF CLIENT, INCORPORATE FIRST 1.00 375.00

COAST REGIONAL UTILITIES, INC.; REQUEST FROM AND
SECURE COPY OF DEVELOPMENT ORDER FOR PROPERTY IN
QUESTION FROM ALEXANDER HARDING.

3/28/19 FMD  REVIEW EMAIL FROM KINNELLY RE: RATES CALCULATION; 1.10 412.50
BEGIN PREPARATION OF MEMO RE: RATE CALCULATION
METHODOLOGY .
3/28/19 RCB CONTINUE ELABORATING ON APPLICATION ISSUES 1.50 562.50
3/29/19 RCB  REVIEW PUD ORDINANCE FOR INFORMATION RELATING TO 2.00 750.00
APPLICATION AND INCLUDE INFORMATION IN DRAFT
APPLICATION.
TOTAL HOURS 79.80
PROFESSIONAL FEES $ 29,925.00
WILLIAM E SUNDSTROM 34.90 13,087.50
F MARSHALL DETERDING 5.10 1,912.50
ROBERT C BRANNAN 39.40 14.775.00
KYLE L KEMPER 40 150.00
TRAVEL EXPENSE 831.78
FILING FEE 70.00
PROFESSIONAL SERVICES 12,705.70

TOTAL COSTS ADVANCED $ 13.607.48

t
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LAW OFFICES

SUNDSTROM & MINDLIN, LLP

2548 BLAIRSTONE PINES DR
TALLAHASSEE, FLORIDA 32301

F.E.|# 59-2783536 ' (850) 877-6555 PLEAS

FIRST COAST REGIONAL UTILITY, LLC
Invoice #: 55984 PAGE 5

TOTAL STATEMENT $ 43,532.48
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Bevin A, Beaudet, P.E., LLGC

‘babeaudet@gmail.com

Invoice

BILL TO INVOICE # 1128
William E Sundstrom PA DATE 03/30/2019
Sundstrom & Mindlin, LLP DUE DATE 04/29/2019
2548 Blairstone Pines Dr. TERMS Net 30

Tallahassee, FL 32301

Consulting 1 5,000.00 5,000:.00
Retainer

Consulting _ 10 225.00 2,250.00
Trip to Jacksonville to meet with Paul Harden and site visit to

ICl Villages - 2/19-20

Consulting 2 225.00 450.00
Meeting with subconsultants, Globaltech and Adam Galicki -

3/4

Consulting ) 2 225:00 450.00
Report preparation - 3/10-1:2

Consulting _ 3 225,00 675.00
Meeting with subconsuitants, Globaltech and Adam Galicki,

report preparation - 3/12

Consulting ’ 10 225.00 2,250.00
Report preparation - 3/22-25

Subconsultant : 1 1,700.00 1,100.00
{nvoice from Adam Galicki - 3/30

Reimbursable Expense lem 590 0.58 342.20
Mileage to and from Jacksonvilie - 2/19-20

Reimbursable Expense ltem 1 188.50 188.50
Hotel charge while in Jacksonville for meeting and site visit -

2/18-20

Bevin A. Beaudet; P.E., LLC BALANCE DUE 4 -
316 Plymouth Rd. $1 2’705‘70

West Palm Beach, FL 33405
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March 2018

INVOICE

ICl Central Development Area — Opinion of Water and Sewer Development Costs

List of performed tasks:

1. General mapping and scaling using information-from Duval County websites,

2. Find a comparable density residential pod with 300 DU an 100 AC and determine
quantities of major water/sewer utility elements (pressure pipes, hydrants, gravity
sewers, manholes, valves; services, lift stations)

3. Sketchinto the development area major. looped roads and major pressure pipes.

4. Fit the sample pod into the residential development area and locate the lift stations.

5. Size main pressure pipes and scale the pipe lengths,

6. Sketch a preliminary water main and gravity sewer layout into the commerdial
development area (PH 1 and overall).

7. Scale-and enter the quantities of major utility elements into a database.

8. Using current discounted PRCWUD Continuing Construction Costs Contract unit prices,

determine the utility construction costs for the residential area, the PH 1 commercial
area, the overall commercial area and the total cost for the Central Development Area.

Total time-spent: 11 Hours

‘Thank you,

Adam Galicki
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11/15/21 YupplévientarRes pontie tnStaikSINACLR #26
RIVERFRONT
1201 RIVERPLACE BLVD,
P JACKSONVILLE, FL 32207
DOEB% ETIR}:‘E United States of America
TELEPHONE 904-398-8800 - FAX-904-398-3170
Reservations
www.hilton.com or 1 800-HILTONS

BEAUDET, BEVIN Room Na: ‘625/NDR’

Artival Date: 21202018 2:28:06 PM
316 PLYMOUTH RD Departure Date: 2/21/2019 8:25:00 AM

Adult/Child: 10
WEST PALM BEACH FL 33405 Cashier ID: KEVINGARY
UNITED STATES OF AMERICA Room Rate: 165:58

AL

HH # 784964429 BLUE

VAT #

Folio No/Che 265855 A
Confirmation Number: 90244432
SSUBLETREEBY HILTON JACKSONVILLE RIVERFRONT 2/21/2019 8:24:00
DATE {REF NO [DESCRIPTION CHARGES ]
212012019 1060338 VALET PARKING $20.00
2/20/2019 1060338 STATE TAX-MISC $1.40
2/20/2019 1060339 ‘GUEST ROOM $165.58
212012019 1060339 STATE TAX $11.59
202012018 1060339 LOCAL TAX $9.93
2/21/2019 1060769 VS *1262 ($208.50)

“BALANCE™ $0.00

Hilton Honors(R) stays are pested within 7.2 hours of-.checkout. To chetk your-eamings or book your next stay at more than 4,000 hotels and
fesorts in 100 countries, please visit Honors.com

Thank you for choosing Doubletree! Come’ back s60h to enjoy.our warm chocolate chip cookies and relaxed hospitality. For your next ip visit us
at doubletree.com for our best available ratés!

CREDIT CARD DETAIL
APPR CODE 020036 MERCHANT [D 4445012737486
CARD NUMBER VS *1262 EXP DATE 08/19

TRANSACTION ID 1060769 TRANS TYPE Sale
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LAW OFFICES

SUNDSTROM & MINDLIN, LLP

2548 BLAIRSTONE PINES DR
TALLAHASSEE, FLORIDA 32301

F.E.Li# 59-2783536 (850) 877-6555 PLEASE REFER TO INVOICE NUMBER
WHEN REMITTING

FIRST COAST REGIONAL UTILITY, LLC
301 CAPITAL PARTNERS, LLC

C/0 AVERY C. ROBERTS MAY 8, 2019

P.0. BOX 238 ‘ INVOICE # 56073

LAKE BUTLER, FL 32054 FILE # 48070-00001
PAGE 1

MATTER: ORIGINAL CERTIFICATE FROM PSC

4/01/19 WES ~ FOLLOW UP DISCUSSION WITH BEVIN BEAUDET RELATIVE 1.00 375.00
TO THE CONTENTS OF HIS REPORT; FORWARD RECENT
DECISION IN THE MATTER OF NEAL COMMUNITIES OF SW
FLA VS THE CITY OF VENICE; DISCUSSION WITH PAUL
HARDEN RELATIVE TO "FORCED EXACTION" ISSUE AND
"DUAL RATIONALE NEXUS TEST"; ALL AS REGARDS

' UPCOMING DISCUSSION WITH THE JEA.

4/01/19 FMD  REVIEW PSC STATUTE AND RULES; PREPARE MEMO TO 3.30 1,237.50
ROBERT KENNELLY RE: PSC INITIAL RATE SETTING AND
STANDARD RATES AND COMPONENTS INCLUDING INCOME
TAX CONSIDERATIONS; FINALIZE MEMO AND SEND TO
KENNELLY.

4/02/19 RCB NUMEROUS EMAILS TO AND FROM DENISE HOWARD 3.00 1,125.00
REGARDING LEGAL DESCRIPTIONS AND MAPS OF THE
PROPOSED TERRITORY; WORK ON TEXT OF APPLICATION

4/04/19 FMD ~ REVIEW KENNELLY EMAIL AND RESPOND ON TIMING OF .60 225.00
RATE CASES AND CHANGE OF ORGANIZATIONAL STRUCTURE
AND TAXES.

4/10/19 WES ~ DISCUSSION WITH AVERY ROBERTS RE: JEA MEETING; 2.50 937.50

CONFERENCE CALL WITH PAUL HARDEN AND AVERY
ROBERTS RE: JEA; WORK WITH ENGINEER ON CONTENTS
OF HIS REPORT; ETC.

4/11/19 WES ~ DISCUSSION WITH AVERY ROBERTS RE: CHEMOURS; 2.00 760.00
CONTINUE TO WORK WITH ENGINEER ON PSC FILING
REQUIREMENTS.

4/11/19 RCB  CONFERENCES WITH MELINDA AT THE FPSC REGARDING 2.00 750.00

THE ACCEPTABLE FORMAT FOR BOTH LEGAL DESCRIPTIONS
AND MAPS OF THE PROPOSED TERRITORY; DISCUSSION
WITH DENISE HOWARD REGARDING HAVING 301'S
ENGINEER WORK DIRECTLY WITH MELINDA TO CREATE THE
MAPS AND LEGAL DESCRIPTIONS
4/15/19 RCB WORK ON DRAFT AGENDA FOR ALL HANDS MEETING ON 2.00 750.00
APRIL 18; WORK ON DRAFT OF APPLICATION WITH
DISCUSSION POINTS FOR MEETING.
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LAW OFFICES

SUNDSTROM & MINDLIN, LLP

2548 BLAIRSTONE PINES DR
TALLAHASSEE, FLORIDA 32301

(850) 877-6555 PLEASE REFER TO INVOICE NUMBER
WHEN REMITTING

FIRST COAST REGIONAL UTILITY, LLC

Invoice #:

56073 PAGE 2

4717719 WES

4/17/19 RCB

4/18/19 WES

4/18/19 RCB
4/19/19 WES

4/22/19 WES

4/23/19 RCB
4/24/19 RCB

4/25/19 RCB

CONVERSATION WITH AVERY ROBERTS RELATIVE TO 6.00 2,250.00
CHEMOURS ; DRAFT AND FORWARD EMAIL TO COUNCIL FOR
CHEMOURS; CONVERSATION WITH COUNSEL FOR

*CHEMOURS ; EMAILS TO CLIENTS RELATIVE TO RESULTS OF

THAT CONVERSATION; DRIVE TO JACKSONVILLE -AND

MEETING WITH ACCOUNTANT AND ENGINEER IN

PREPARATION FOR ALL HANDS CLIENT MEETING ON APRIL

18TH.

FINISH INITIAL DRAFT OF APPLICATION WITH BLANKS 5.50 2,062.50
AND TALKING POINTS TO BE FILLED IN AFTER MEETING

ON THE 18TH; DISCUSSIONS ABOUT MAPS AND LEGAL

DESCRIPTIONS; TRAVEL TO JACKSONVILLE FOR MEETING

ON THE 18TH; MEETING WITH FINANCIAL AND

ENGINEERING CONSULTANTS PRIOR TO MEETING.

MEETINGS IN JACKSONVILLE AT PAUL HARDEN'S OFFICE 7.50 2,812.50
WITH CLIENTS RELATIVE TO PSC FILING; NOTES TO

FILE; RETURN TO TALLAHASSEE.

ALL HANDS MEETING IN JACKSONVILLE AT PAUL 7.50 2,812.50
HARDEN'S OFFICE; TRAVEL BACK TO TALLAHASSEE.,
RESPOND TO CLIENT INQUIRIES RELATIVE TO HOW 2.00 750.00

UTILITIES ARE "PRICED", RATE FIXING, ETC.;

LENGTHY TELEPHONE CONVERSATION WITH BELINDA

FRANCE WHO CALLED SEEKING INFORMATION THAT WILL

BE HELPFUL TO HER IN HER TAX ADVICE TO FIRST

COAST, ETC.; EMAIL DISCUSSION WITH AVERY ROBERTS.

DISCUSSION WITH BOB KENNELLY RELATIVE TO 1.10 412.50
FINANCING OPTIONS FOR FIRST COAST REGIONAL;

DISCUSSION WITH BELINDA FRANCE RELATIVE TO

CORPORATE AND TAX ISSUES.

ADDITIONAL DISCUSSIONS WITH BEVIN BEAUDET .80 300.00
REGARDING SPECIFIC ISSUES FOR APPLICATION.
NUMEROUS EMAILS WITH BILL SUNDSTROM, BEVIN 2.00 750.00

BEAUDET AND DEBORAH SWAIN REGARDING DETAILS

NEEDED FOR BOTH THE ENGINEERING REPORT AND THE

FINANCIAL FEASIBILITY REPORT; MAKE MINOR CHANGES

TO APPLICATION TEXT.

REVIEW PROPOSED DRAFT OF TERRITORY MAP PREPARED 1.00 375.00
BY ETM; RECOMMEND TO DENISE HOWARD THAT ETM WORK

DIRECTLY WITH MELINDA AT THE FPSC TO MORE

EFFICIENTLY COMPLETE THE MAPS AND LEGAL
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LAW OFFICES

SUNDSTROM & MINDLIN, LLP

2548 BLAIRSTONE PINES DR
TALLAHASSEE, FLORIDA 32301

F.E.lL#59-2783536 (850) B77-6555 PLEASE REFER TO INVOICE NUMBER
WHEN REMITTING

FIRST COAST REGIONAL UTILITY, LLC

Invoice #: 56073 PAGE 3
DESCRIPTIONS.

4/26/19 RCB WORK ON EXHIBITS TO APPLICATION: CONFERENCES WITH 1.90 712.50
BEVIN BEAUDET REGARDING SPECIFICS OF SERVICE AND
INFRASTRUCTURE.

4/29/19 WES  CONVERSATION WITH CONNIE HENDERSON OF CHEMOURS 1.90 712.50

4/29/19 RCB

WHO CALLED; FORWARD MAP TO MRS. HENDERSON.

CONVERSATION WITH BELINDA FRANCE RELATIVE TO FORM

OF ORGANIZATION. DISCUSSION WITH BEVIN BEAUDET

RELATIVE TO ENGINEERING EXHIBIT. EMAIL TO

CLIENTS RE CONFERENCE CALL PRIOR TO FILING, ETC.

CONFERENCES WITH BEVIN BEAUDET, DEBORAH SWAIN AND 2.00 750.00
BILL SUNDSTROM REGARDING TERRITORY MAPS,

INCLUSION OF ADDITIONAL CHEMOURS PROPERTY IN

BAKER COUNTY, AND TIMELINES FOR ENGINEERING AND

FINANCIAL REPORTS.

4/30/19 WES ~ CONVERSATION WITH AVERY ROBERTS RE: CHEMOURS .50 187.50
PROPERTY; SCHEDULING OF GROUP CALL PRIOR TO
FILING.
TOTAL HOURS 56.10
PROFESSIONAL FEES $ 21,037.50

WILLIAM E SUNDSTROM 24.50 9,187.50

F MARSHALL DETERDING 3.90 1,462.50

ROBERT C BRANNAN 27.70 10,387.50
TRAVEL EXPENSE 1,084.97
PROFESSIONAL SERVICES 16,924.94

TOTAL COSTS ADVANCED $ 18,009.91




Docket No. 20190168-WS
FCRU Document 1718
11/15/21 Supplemental Response to Staff 8th POD #26

LAW OFFICES

SUNDSTROM & MINDLIN, LLP

2548 BLAIRSTONE PINES DR
TALLAHASSEE, FLORIDA 32301

F.E.|# 59-2783536 (850) 877-6555 PLEASE REFER TO INVOICE NUMBER
WHEN REMITTING

FIRST COAST REGIONAL UTILITY, LLC

Invoice #: 56073 PAGE 4

TOTAL STATEMENT $ 39,047.41
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CHECK R E/Q/ﬂs;ﬂprgrrfntal Response to Staff 8th POD #26

_ Date 57 {C(
Check Payable To: EQU)ﬂA B @/Mdd‘/, P é’\ LLC’ $ 8505 &5

Charge To: Client st OOCL&%—‘ Bill Client $
File No US070.0| (includes costs directly charged
' to the firm)
Date of Travel

Type of Expense \D ‘(7()&: S0 jee

Special Instructions
[0 Check if to be paid (?QM
from Trust Account Y
~/ Y Signature
Needed by

Date




Bevin A. Beaudet, P.E., LLC

babeaudet@gmail.com

Invoice

BILL TO

William E Sundstrom PA
Sundstrom & Mindlin, LLP
2548 Blairstona Pines Dr.
Tallahassee, FL. 32301

Docket No. 20190168-WS
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INVOICE # 1132
" DATE 05/04/2019
DUE DATE 06/03/2019
TERMS Net 30

ACTIVITY -

Consulting:

Preparation of First:Coast Regienal-Utililes report - 95%
complete:

Subconsultant

Globaltech Design/Builders, engineering design and costing
for First Coast-report

Subconsultant

Pam.Calzadilla, production graphic assistance:for First Coast
report :

Consulting _

Meeting In-Jacksonville with Parthers --4/18

Reimbursable Expenss ltem

Hotel charge for Jacksonville meeting - 4/18

Reimbursable Expense-ltsm

Mileage from WPB:to Jacksonville.and return - 4/17-18

Bevin A. Beaudet, P.E,, LLC
316 Plymouth Road
West Paim Beach, FL. 33405

ary

12

560

BALANCE DUE

RATE
225.00

3,000.00
450.00

225.00
23045

0.58

AMOUNT
2,700.00

3,000.00

450.00

1,800.00

230.45

324.80

$8,505.25
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. 1
Name-and-Address ' ] DEJUBITETREE L Hotel Address ]
AN W ALTRRS
BEAUDET, BEVIN 1201 RIVERPLACE BOULEVARD:
816 PLYMOUTH RD DOUBLETREE BY HILTON JACKSONVILLE ~ JACKSONVILLE, FL 32207
WEST PALM BEACH, FL 33405 . RIVERFRONT
Reservations
Ropm A16/NDR . www.doubletfree.com or
Agrival Date 04/17/19 oo
Departute Date 04/18/18 1-800-222-TREE
Confirmation # 86626914 Adult/Child 10
Room Rate, $186.00
04/18/19 PAGE 1 Rate Plan V-Lv2
Honors # ) 784964429
Alrline:
DATE ) REFERENCE DESCRIPTION AMOUNT
0411719 1114237 VALET PARKING $20.00
04/17/19 1114237 STATE TAX-MISC $1.40
04717119 1114238 | GUEST ROOM $185.00
04/17119 1114238 STATE TAX' $12.95
04/17/19 1114238 LOGAL TAX. $11.10
04/18/19 1114713 i b 7] (§230.45)
* BALANCE * $0.00

The orHine eFalio s a courtesy infarmational service, subject toPrivacy Policy and Sita Usaoe; actuat folio kept In hotel records,

‘Hilton

v . @ . . : y &
o LX R conmap CanopY” Hikkon GERIQ Do@m TarETAY ? MONO HHilton @ o Houy i

LoirEs Grand Vacatlony
}Hilton
HONORS:
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@i\s- GLOBALTECH Invoice

A DESIGN BUILD COMPANY
Invoice #:24625
Date:04/30/2019
Terms: 30DY ‘
GT Job #:192147
Client PO#:
Client Job #:

Client: Bevin A. Beaudet, PE,, LLC. ProjectName: BAB IG[-Village WTP & WWTP

316 Plymouth Rd. Project Location:First Coastal Regional Utilities

West Paim Beach FL 33405

Ainoint-"

Engineering Services for FCRU 3,000.00

Thank you for your prompt.payment! e j:.:“ . "3',6@6.‘00'

o T4,000.007

8001 Broken Sound Parkway NW, Suite 610, Boga Raton, FL. 33487 *Office: (561) 997-6433 *Fax: (561) 997-5811
Email: solutlons@globaltechdb.com  *EB0007225 *CGC1507230
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Pam Calzadilla

Timesheet
Date time # hours prhour |total

26-Mar|6:30-7:30 1| $ 50.00|$ 50.00
30-Mar(1:30-3:30 2| S 50.00 | % 100.00
12-Apr|8-9:30 15/ % 50.00 (S 75.00
13-Apr|3:30-5 1.5|$ 50005 75.00
13-Apr|6:00-6:30 0.5'S 50.00]S 25,00
14-Apr|7:30-8;30 1/ $ 50.00{$ 50.00
23-Apr|6:30-8:00 1.5{% 5000 (S 75.00

$ 450.00
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CHEC K R E/QZUSEpSmIntaI Response to Staff 8th POD #26
. . Date é ~ 7 ! g .
Check Payable To: m1 L/Qﬁ S‘mi N 4( /A\Z&SOC/ %Q s g U(_l C{ ' (QC/‘

Charge To: Client Hrst Coact Bill Client $ |
File No 4207100 (includes costs directly charged
) : to the firm)
Date of Travel ‘

Type of Expense \(‘D@‘E \.Q/(;UU}‘(Q S

Special Instructions
[0 Check if to be paid (—-A{ %
from Trust Account '/f(
7 Signature
Needed by

Date
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Milian, Swain & Associates, Inc.

Docket No. 20190168-WS

FCRU Document 1725
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Milian, Swain & Associates, Inc.

20258 W. 32™ Avenue
Miami, Florida 33145

Tel.: 305-441-0123 Fax: 305-441-0688

www. millamswain.cont

Civil Engineers - & Environmental Scientists & Engineers &

: INVOICE
William E. Sundstrom, P.A.

Sundstrom & Mindlin, LLP

Attorneys at Law

2548 Blairstone Pines Drive

Tallahassee, FL 32301

Re: First Coast Regional Utilities, LL.C
For Professional services rendered through April 26, 2019

Utility Management ér- Financial Consuitants
Invoice Date:  May 1,2019 -
Invoice Number: 43908
Page #1 Billing # 2

Hours Rate Amount
Principal .

Deborah Swain 19.00 225.00 4,275.00
Seiior Staff Accountant '

Cynthia Yapp 21.25 175.00 3,718.75
Meals and Transportation Expenses ( See Attached Report) 425.94
| |Total For Invoice # 43908  $8,419.69]

Total Amount Due: $8,419.69

Please make check payable to Milian, Swain & Associates, Inc .
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Time/Expenses by Project Report
Order Time By: Employee 1D
Order Expense By: Expense #
Status: Ready Hold Billed Never Billed -

Milian, Swain & Associates Page 1
Project: F16-01
Period: 04/01/2019 — 04/26/2019

Project  Project Name

SJ Ctrl # SJinv#
Phase/Task/Employee Employee Name Dep Staff P/E Work Date  OVT ST STATE Hours Worked  Billable Hours
F16-01 FCRU-New Certificate '
cY Cynthia Yapp FIN 007 04/05/2019 04/05/2019 N R 3.75 3.75
cY Cynthia Yapp FIN 007 04/19/2019 04/18/2019 N R . 11.25 11.25
cY Cynthia Yapp FIN 007 04/26/2019 04/26/2019 N R 6.25 6.25
DS Deborah Swain FIN 001 04/19/2019 04/19/2019 N R 17.00 17.00
[Meeting in Jacksonville including travel & preparation ' |
DS Deborah Swain FIN 001 04/26/2019 04/26/2019 N R 2.00 2.00
iReview and coordination : ]
Subtotal Task 40.25 40.25
Subtotal Phase 40.25 40.25
Total Project F16-01 © 4025 40,25

Run Date: May 1, 2018 @ 17:06:20

TIMEEXPRPT.FRX
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Milian, Swain & Associates, Inc.

EMPLOYEE EXPENSE REPORT - First Coast Kickoff Meeting April 16-17, 2019 Travel Expense

Project No. F16-01 Period Ending: 4/30/19
Employee Name: Debbie Swain Approved by:

Date Expense DESCRIPTION Total Pd. Employee Pd MSA Subtotal
Hearing Direct Expense - Travel
Lodging
4/17/19° Lodging Paid by Sundstrom - -
Meals
04/16/19, 04/19/2019 [Meals Lunches (2) no receipts 15.00 15.00 15.00
Transportation )
04/16/2019-04/17/2019|696 miles @ $0.58/mile 2019 IRS allowance 403.68 403.68
04/16/2019-04/17/2019| Tolls (turnpike) |(Transponder- receipts) 7.26 7.26 410.94
Total Travel Expense 418,68 418.68 - 425.94
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LAW OFFICES
SUNDSTROM & MINDLIN, LLP
2548 BLAIRSTONE PINES DR
TALLAHASSEE, FLORIDA 32301
F.E.I.# 59-2783536 (850) 877-6555 PLEASE REFER TO INVOICE NUMBER
WHEN REMITTING
FIRST COAST REGIONAL UTILITY, LLC
301 CAPITAL PARTNERS, LLC -
C/0 AVERY C. ROBERTS JUNE 10, 2019
P.0. BOX 238 INVOICE # 56157
LAKE BUTLER, FL 32054 FILE # 48070-00001
PAGE 1
MATTER: ORIGINAL CERTIFICATE FROM PSC
5/01/19 WES ~ TWO DISCUSSIONS WITH AVERY ROBERTS AND DENISE 2.00 750.00

5/02/19 WES

5/02/19 RCB

5/03/19 RCB
5/07/19 WES
5/07/19 RCB
5/08/19 WES

5/08/19 RCB

5/09/19 WES

5/10/19 WES

HOWARD RE: TO CHEMOURS APP; FOLLOW UP WITH BEVIN

BEAUDET; SEE AND REVIEW MESSAGE FROM PAUL HARDEN

RE: JEA.

AFTER DISCUSSION WITH AVERY ROBERTS, EMAIL TO 1.50 562.50
CHEMOURS RELATIVE TO INTENDED USE OF THEIR LAND;

DISCUSSION WITH BEVIN BEAUDET RE: SAME; EMAIL TO

DEBBIE SWAIN RE: CAPITALIZATION OF ORGANIZATIONAL

EXPENSES.

DISCUSSIONS WITH BEVIN BEAUDET AND DEBORAH SWAIN 2.60 - 975.00
REGARDING DATA NEEDED FOR THEIR WORK RELATED TO

THE APPLICATION; WORK ON REVISING THE DRAFT

APPLICATION

RECEIVE AND REVIEW MAPS FOR THE CHEMOURS PARCELS .50 187.50
TO BE ADDED TO THE APPLICATION

DISCUSSION AND ADVICE TO ENGINEERING CONSULTANTS 1.00 375.00
RELATIVE TO CERTAIN ASPECTS OF HIS REPORT.

CONFERENCE WITH BILL SUNDSTROM AND BEVIN BEAUDET 1.00 375.00
REGARDING DRAFT REPORT

CONFERENCE CALL WITH BEVIN BEAUDET, DEBBIE SWAIN, 3.50 1,312.50

AND CYNTHIA YAPP RELATIVE TO ENGINEERING AND

FINANCIAL EXHIBITS AFTER DETAILED REVIEW OF SAME;

EMAIL TO 201 CAPITAL PARTNERS RELATIVE TO

HIGHLIGHTS OF UPCOMING DRAFT REPORT AND ITEMS TO

BE MINDFUL OF; RECEIPT OF EMAIL FROM BOB KENNELLY

RELATIVE TO CORPORATE FORMATION, ETC.

CONFERENCE CALL WITH DEBORAH SWAIN, CYNTHIA YAPP, 2.00 750.00
BEVIN BEAUDET AND BILL SUNDSTROM TO DISCUSS

ENGINEERING AND FINANCIAL REPORTS

DISCUSSION WITH DEBBIE SWAIN RELATIVE TO TAX 1.00 375.00
IMPACT ON RATES; DRAFTING OF RESPONSE TO BOB

KENNELLY AND FORWARDING.

CONTINUE WORK ON FINANCING OPTIONS FOR THIS 1.00 375.00
CLIENT; DISCUSSIONS WITH BEVIN BEAUDET RELATIVE




Docket No. 20190168-WS
FCRU Document 1729
11/15/21 Supplemental Response to Staff 8th POD #26

LAW OFFICES

SUNDSTROM & MINDLIN, LLP

2548 BLAIRSTONE PINES DR
TALLAHASSEE, FLORIDA 32301

F.E.l.# 59-2783536 (850) 877-6555 PLEASE REFER TO INVOICE NUMBER
WHEN REMITTING
FIRST COAST REGIONAL UTILITY, LLC
Invoice #: 56157 : PAGE 2

TO VARIOUS ITEMS.

5/10/19 RCB  CONTINUE TO UPDATE AND REFINE DRAFT APPLICATION

5/13/19 WES  RECEIPT AND REVIEW OF SEMI-FINAL ENGINEERING AND
ACCOUNTING EXHIBITS; EMAILS TO CLIENTS CONTAINING
EXHIBITS; SCHEDULE ALL HANDS CONFERENCE CALL FOR
THURSDAY, MAY 23; CONVERSATIONS WITH AVERY
ROBERTS, AND ONE WITH DENISE HOWARD RELATIVE TO
MAPS, FINANCING AND RELATED MATTERS; RECEIPT OF
EMAIL FROM PAUL HARDEN AFFECTING TIMING OF
FILING; CONFERENCE CALL WITH DEBORAH SWAIN AND
BEVIN BEAUDET RELATIVE TO IRRIGATION WATER
ISSUES, ETC.

5/13/19 RCB CONFERENCE WITH DENISE HOWARD REGARDING SPECIAL
WARRANTY DEED; CONFIRM WITH FPSC THAT WE CAN FILE
A DRAFT DEED TO BE RECORDED AFTER BEING GRANTED
THE TERRITORY; REVIEW ENGINEERING AND FINANCIAL
DRAFT REPORTS; CONFERENCE CALL WITH DEBORAH SWAIN
AND BEVIN BEAUDET AND BILL SUNDSTROM REGARDING
IRRIGATION ISSUES

5/14/19 RCB DISCUSSIONS WITH DENISE HOWARD REGARDING MAPS;
DISCUSSION WITH BEVIN BEAUDET REGARDING MAPS
DEPICTING INITIAL LINES AND FACILITIES

5/14/19 RCB  CONTINUE TO REVIEW MATERIALS FROM BEVIN BEAUDET
AND CHEMOURS

5/15/19 WES ~ CONTINUE TO WORK ON FINANCING OPTIONS: DRAFT
LETTER FROM 301 CAPITAL PARTNERS REQUESTING
INCLUSION OF THEIR LANDS IN FIRST COAST REGIONAL
UTILITIES' FILING; DISCUSSION WITH POTENTIAL BOND
COUNSEL RELATIVE TO POSSIBLE CONDUIT ISSUES, ETC.

5/15/19 RCB WORK ON DRAFT OF APPLICATION FOR WATER AND
WASTEWATER CERTIFICATES AND INITIAL RATES; LONG
DISCUSSION OF ISSUES RELATED TO PLANT SITES

5/16/19 RCB EDIT AND FORWARD MOST RECENT VERSION OF
APPLICATION TO BILL SUNDSTROM FOR REVIEW AND
DISCUSSIONS

5/17/19 RCB CONTINUE TO EDIT AND EXPAND APPLICATION UPON
REVIEW OF DRAFT ENGINEERING AND FINANCIAL REPORTS

5/20/19 WES ~ CONVERSATION WITH ED BULLEIT AT MBS CAPITAL IN
PREPARATION FOR 301 PARTNERS MEETING; CONFERENCE
CALL WITH MIKE BRAREN, BOB KENNELLY, AVERY &

.00
.50

.60

.00

.80
.50

.80

.50

.50
.80

375.00
1,687.50

1,350.00

375.00

300.00
562.50

1,425.00

562.50

562.50
1,425.00
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LAW OFFICES

SUNDSTROM & MINDLIN, LLP

2548 BLAIRSTONE PINES DR
TALLAHASSEE, FLORIDA 32301

(850) 877-6555

FIRST COAST REGIONAL UTILITY, LLC

Invoice #:

56157 PAGE
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PLEASE REFER TO INVOICE NUMBER
MITTING

5/21/19 RCB
5/22/19 RCB

5/23/19 WES

5/23/19 WES

5/23/19 RCB

5/24/19 RCB

5/28/19 WES

5/28/19 RCB
5/29/19 WES

5/29/19 RCB

AUSTIN ROBERTS RELATIVE TO INDUSTRIAL DEVELOPMENT
REVENUE BONDS, INCLUDING CHOICE OF ISSUER,
INDICATIVE INTEREST RATES, THE PROCESS OF
“INDUCEMENT" , TIMETABLE TO CLOSE, ETC.; FOLLOW
UP DISCUSSION WITH ED BULLEIT AND SCHEDULING A
FINANCE KICKOFF MEETING FOR MONDAY, JUNE 17 IN
JACKSONVILLE.

CONTINUE TO WORK ON APPLICATION IN CONFORMANCE
WITH STATUTORY REQUIREMENTS;

NUMEROUS EMAILS AND DISCUSSIONS WITH BEVIN

- BEAUDET AND DEBORAH SWAIN REGARDING TARIFF ISSUES

AND OTHER FACILITY AND FINANCIAL MATTERS;
ADDITION OF CLIENT SERVICE REQUEST LETTERS;
REVIEW OF EDITED DRAFTS FROM DENISE HOWARD
MULTIPLE CONFERENCES WITH DEBBIE SWAIN AND BEVIN
BEAUDET RELATIVE TO ENGINEERING AND ACCOUNTING
EXHIBITS AND GENERAL PREPARATION FOR ALL HANDS
MEETING FOR MAY 23RD.

PREPARE FOR AND PARTICIPATE IN MARATHON ALL HANDS
CONFERENCE CALL; MULTIPLE FOLLOW UP DISCUSSIONS
WITH BEVIN BEAUDET, DEBORAH SWAIN, ETC.

PREPARE FOR AND PARTICIPATE IN ALL HANDS
CONFERENCE CALL; PARTICIPATE IN FOLLOW UP
CONFERENCES WITH BEVIN BEAUDET AND DEBORAH SWAIN;
REVIEW AND INCLUDE NASSAU COUNTY ORDINANCES AS
EXHIBITS TO THE APPLICATIONS

NUMEROUS EMAILS AND DISCUSSIONS REGARDING MAPS
AND ADDITIONAL PROPERTIES; RECEIPT AND REVIEW OF
FINAL DRAFT OF FINANCIAL REPORT FROM DEBORAH
SWAIN

RECEIPT OF COMMENTS ON ENGINEER'S REPORT AND
DRAFT APPLICATION; DISCUSSIONS WITH BEVIN BEAUDET
AND BOB BRANNAN RE: SAME.

CONTINUE TO REVIEW INCOMING MATERIALS AND ADJUST
EXHIBITS AND APPLICATION APPROPRIATELY.
PREPARATION FOR AND LEAD FINAL ALL HANDS
CONFERENCE CALL PRIOR TO FPSC FILING; FOLLOW uP
DISCUSSION WITH CLIENT, ETC.

REVIEW UPDATED FINANCIAL REPORT FROM DEBORAH
SWAIN; WORK ON TARIFFS WITH BRONWYN IN OUR

2.70
3.00

2.50

3.50

4.00

2.00

1.00

2.00
1.00

3.70

,012.
125,

937.

,312.

,500.

750

375.

750
375

,387

50
00

50

50

00

.00

00

.00
.00

.50
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LAW OFFICES

SUNDSTROM & MINDLIN, LLP

2548 BLAIRSTONE PINES DR
TALLAHASSEE, FLORIDA 32301

(850) 877-6555

PLEASE REFER TO INVOICE NUMBER

FIRST COAST REGIONAL UTILITY, LLC
Invoice #: 56157

WHEN REMITTING

PAGE 4

OFFICE; PREPARE FOR AND PARTICIPATE IN ALL HANDS
CONFERENCE CALL; CONTINUE TO UPDATE APPLICATION

AND EXHIBITS

5/31/19 RCB FINALIZE DRAFT OF APPLICATION BASED ON NEW 5.00
INFORMATION AND EXHIBIT MATERIALS FROM DENISE
HOWARD, BEVIN BEAUDET AND DEBORAH SWAIN.

TOTAL HOURS
PROFESSIONAL FEES

WILLIAM E SUNDSTROM
ROBERT C BRANNAN

FILING FEE
PROFESSIONAL SERVICES
TOTAL COSTS ADVANCED

TOTAL STATEMENT

69.50
$ 26,062.50
27.80 10,425.00
41.70 15,637.50
43.75
28,168.75
$ 28,212.50

$ 54,275.00

1,875.00




Bevin A. Beaudet, P.E., LLC

babeaudst@gmail.com

Involce

BILL TO

William E Sundstrom PA
Sundstrom & Mindlin, LLP
2548 Blairstone Pines Dr,
Tallahassee, FL 32301
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INVOICE # 1135
DATE 05/31/2019
DUE DATE 06/30/2019
TERMS Net 30

ACTINITY:

Consulting

Report preparation - 5/6-7
Consuiting

Team conference call - 5/8

Consulting
Review Financial Report and Application - 5/22

Consulting

Team conference call - 5/23
Consuliing

Report edit - 5/27
Consuiting

Team conference call - 5/28

Subceonsultant
Invoice from Pam Calzadilla for report production

Bevin A. Beaudet, P.E., LLC
316 Plymouth Rd. ‘ e
Woest Paim Beach, FL 33405

a1y : _ RATE CEACRIMT

2 225.00 450.00

1 225.00 225.00

2 225.00 450.00

2.50 225.00 582.50

1.50 225.00 337.50

1 225.00 2256.00

1 400.00 400.00

BALANCE DUE $2,650@0

//'/// "’ff "éj// -
f i o
.__j‘
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Pam Calzadilla Invaice for First Coast Regional Utilities Repon Production

May 2019
per
Date time # hours hour total
1S $
26-Mar | 6:30-7:30 11]50.00 50.00
$ S
30-Mar | 1:30-3:30 2 | 50.00 100.00
E
12-Apr | 8-9:30 1.5 50.00 75.00
S S
13-Apr | 3:30-5 1.5 { 50.00 75.00
$ $
13-Apr | 6:00-6:30 0.5 | 50.00 25.00
s $
14-Apr | 7:30-8:30 11 50.00 50.00
S $
23-Apr | 6:30-8:00 1.5 | 50.00 75.00
s
450,00 | PAID
S $
28-Apr | 3:00-5:00 21 50.00 100.00
$ $
30-Apr | 7:00-8:00 1] 50.00 50.00
S S
1-May | 7:00-8:00 1] 50.00 50.00
5 S
5-May | 6:30-3:00 2.51 5000 125.00
$ S
6-May | 9:00-9:30 0.5 | 50.00 25.00
‘ S s
28-May | 800-9:00 1 50.00 50.00
S

400.00
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Milinst, Swain & Assoclates, Ine.
2025 8. W 32" Avenne
Miavit; Florida 33143
F\Ee-c:\ Tel, 3054410123 Fax: 305-44140688

wieswniliamsivati com:

Civil Enginegrs: &= Envivonniental Sclentists & Engineers: % Uty Managsndent % Flaandal Consultants

Willian: Ei-Sundstrom,
Sundstrom:& Mindliny.
Attorneysat Law

INVOICE

P.A. tweice Date:  June:3;2019
LEP Invoice Number:. 43949

Page #1 Billing # 3

2548 Blairstons Pines Drive

Re: First Coast Regional Utilities, LLC
For Professionaliservices rendered through May 31, 2019

T Tows i) ___ Rate _ Amount

Principal

Deboral Swain

T R N A |

Senior Staff Agcountant |

— 1 mse0 | 1995000

0.00}

fi‘ewléﬁéufs; )

1387 |

L -

TTotalForTnvoice® 43949 | 52551873

Total Amount Dues $25,518.75.

Pieésé;,émakeé6153'{:1&2’;‘;@35&&;td{‘:MiiiiiigySwam& Assaciates; Tic..
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Time/Expenses by Project Report
OrderTime:By: Employee ID
OrderExpense By Expense #
Status: Ready Hold Billed Never Billed

Millan; Swalh & Asgociatas
Project: F16:04
 iPeriod:: DBOH2019 — 05/31/2018

Page 1

Praject  ProjectName.

PhasefTask/Employes. _ Employes Name: Dep

Staft:

Sicm#  Sdnve

PIE. WorkDale OVT  -ST'STATE  HoursWorked  Billable Hours

F16-01 FORU-New Certificate.
cY Cynihia Yapp
cy , Cynihia-Yaph

N
FIN.

aor
007

05032018 N R.

05/03/2019° 0B/03/201¢
081012019 N R

s 38.25
08/10/2018;

12.26

38.25
12.2%

Update inilal diaft sohedulas based or rovisad feasibilty raport
B5/5/2019 Conferance oall inftial draft eview /distussion:

cY
cy

N

Gyniiia Yapp
Cynihia Yapp

CEITROTS
US/24120%9.

667
007

0511772019
0512412019

22,25

R 22.25
R v4.00

24.00

W Z
Tk

8721 Confejerice gallwith-clignt:

820+ 8/24/1% Ravigtyand update final liillsh FESG Certificate.

TEN
FIN

ey ‘Cynithia Yapp
D& ‘Deboraty Swalfy

007
oo

06/3112019:
05103/2018:

oso3ote N R

17.26
0.78

17.25
075

[Review and cobrdinalion

DS Deborah Swain,

— FtN Qaf —

250

“GEA0B0 N R

|Review and cotrdinalion

o8 "~ Deborah Swain.

00t OBATRU(e OsHT2019 N R 6.25

Update dratt; commuricationwith consultant toar

ndatod 1§ include reclalnied.

DS Deborat Swain FIN

12.76

[Uadate drafl, comminication with corsullant leam:

00t  0BPAROID. OBRAI201S N

bs _Deborah Swain:

_FIN_ ot

05AT2099 0812008 N T R 2.50 2.50

[Undiate dra, Gorimuinication wilk comsiltantloar,

138.75
138.76
43875

Subtotal Task:
Sublotal Pligse:
TolakPrajactF16:01:

138.75
138.75
138,75
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LAW OFFICES

SUNDSTROM & MINDLIN, LLP

2548 BLAIRSTONE PINES DR
TALLAHASSEE, FLORIDA 32301

FE.L# 59-2783536 (850) 877-6555 PLEASE REFER TO INVOICE NUMBER
WHEN REMITTING

FIRST COAST REGIONAL UTILITY, INC
301 CAPITAL PARTNERS, LLC

C/0 AVERY C. ROBERTS : JULY 10, 2019

P.0. BOX 238 INVOICE # 56216

LAKE BUTLER, FL 32054 FILE # 48070- 00001
PAGE 1

MATTER: ORIGINAL CERTIFICATE FROM PSC

6/03/19 RCB  CONTINUE TO WORK ON GETTING APPLICATION READY TO 2.80 1,050.00
FILE; RECEIVE CORPORATE INFORMATION AND TAX ID
NUMBER FROM BOB KENNELLY; RECEIVE AND REVIEW
SUGGESTED CHANGES TO TARIFF FROM DEBORAH SWAIN

6/13/19 FMD  REVIEW MEMO, LETTER AND EMAIL RE: CDD OWNED .90 337.50
UTILITY FACILITIES; REVIEW STATUTE; INTEROFFICE
CONFERENCE RE: ABILITY TO CREATE PRIVATE UTILITY
BULK SERVICE TO CDD.

6/16/19 WES ~ TRAVEL TO JACKSONVILLE FOR MEETING WITH THE 301 6.50 2,437.50
CAPITAL PARTNERS AND ED BULLEIT RELATIVE TO BOND
FINANCING OF THE FIRST COAST REGIONAL UTILITY
SYSTEM; RETURN TO TALLAHASSEE.

6/16/19 RCB  TRAVEL TO JACKSONVILLE FOR MEETING WITH 301 6.50 2,437.50
CAPITAL PARTNERS AND ED BULLEIT REGARDING BOND
FINANCING FOR UTILITY; RETURN TO TALLAHASSEE

6/19/19 WES  EMAIL TO ED BULLEIT CONCERNING MAKEUP OF 301 10 262.50
CAPITAL PARTNERS PER HIS REQUEST.

TOTAL HOURS 17.40
PROFESSIONAL FEES $ 6,525.00
- WILLIAM E SUNDSTROM 7.20 2,700.00
F MARSHALL DETERDING : ' 90 337.50

ROBERT C BRANNAN 9.30 - 3,487.50
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LAW OFFICES

SUNDSTROM & MINDLIN, LLP

2548 BLAIRSTONE PINES DR
TALLAHASSEE, FLORIDA 32301

F.E.L# 59-2783536 (850) 877-6555 PLEASE REFER TO INVOICE NUMBER
WHEN REMITTING

FIRST COAST REGIONAL UTILITY, INC

Invoice #: 56216 " . PAGE 2
TRAVEL EXPENSE 372.20

PROFESSIONAL SERVICES - 737.50

TOTAL COSTS ADVANCED $1,109.70

TOTAL STATEMENT $7,634.70




Docket No. 20190168-WS
111 5/21Asﬁg§gﬁn§r}ft)glige§ fq%i%ﬁ?g?g@ sgtD1 ;gg
2025 8. W. 32" Avenue
Miami, Florida 33145
Tel.: 305-441-0123 Fax: 305-441-0688

www. miliamswain.com

Milian, Swain & Associates, Inc.

Civil Engineers & Environmental Scientists & Engineers = Utility Management & Financial Consultants
INVOICE

William E. Sundstrom, P.A. Invoice Date: July 5, 2019

Sundstrom & Mindlin, LLP Invoice Number: 43980

Attorneys at Law Page #1 Billing # 3

2548 Blairstone Pines Drive

Tallahassee, FL. 32301

Re: First Coast Regional Utilities, LL.C
For Professional services rendered through June 28, 2019

v Hours : Rate Amount
Principal - : _ ,
Deborah Swain 0.75 225.00 168.75
Senior Staff Accountant '
Cynthia Yapp 3.25 175.00 568.75
lTotal For Imvoice # 43980 : $737.50]
Total Amount Due: $737.50

Please make check payable to Milian, Swain & Associates, Inc .
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Time/Expenses by Project Report

Order Time By: Employee ID.
Order Expense By: Expense #

Status: Ready Hold Billed Never Billed

11/15/21 Supplemental Response to Staff 8th POD #26

Milian, Swain & Associates Page 1
Project: F16-01
Period: 06/01/2019 — 06/28/2019

Project  Project Name SJ Ctrl # SJinv#
Phase/Task/Employee Employee Name Dep Staff P/E Work Date  OVT ST STATE Hours Worked  Billable Hours
F16-01 FCRU-New Certificate
CcY Cynthia Yapp FIN 007 06/07/2019 06/07/2019 N R 2.50 2.50
lReview draft Tariffs l .
cY Cynthia Yapp FIN 007 06/21/2019 06/21/2019 N R 0.75 0.75
lUpdate Schedules for Initial FPSC Cettificate ] .
DS Deborah Swain FIN 001  06/07/2019 06/07/2018 N R 0.75 0.75
ITan‘ff review, coordinate w team |
Subtotal Task 4.00 4.00
Subtotat Phase 4.00 4.00
Total Project F16-01 4.00 4.00

Run Date:

Jul 1, 2019 @ 14:08:10

TIMEEXPRPT.FRX
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11/15/21 Supplemental Response to Staff 8th POD #26

LAW OFFICES

SUNDSTROM & MINDLIN, LLP

2548 BLAIRSTONE PINES DR
TALLAHASSEE, FLORIDA 32301

(850) 877-6555

FIRST COAST REGIONAL UTILITY, INC
301 CAPITAL PARTNERS, LLC

C/0 AVERY C. ROBERTS
P.0. BOX 238
LAKE BUTLER, FL 32054

PAGE

AUGUST 9,
INVOICE #
FILE # 48070-00001

2019
56325

1

INVOICE NUMBER

7/08/19 WES

7/08/19 RCB

7/09/19 WES

7/09/19 RCB

7/31/19 RCB

WILLIAM E SUNDSTROM 3.
ROBERT C BRANNAN 4.60

MATTER: ORIGINAL CERTIFICATE FROM PSC

DRAFT MEMO OF UNDERSTANDING BETWEEN JEA AND FIRST
COAST RELATIVE TO JEA NOT PROTESTING FIRST COAST
FPSC APPLICATION IN EXCHANGE FOR OPTION TO
PURCHASE; DISCUSSION OF SAME WITH AVERY ROBERTS;
FORWARD TO GROUP.

CONTINUE WORKING ON GETTING THE APPLICATION READY
TO FILE ONCE THE MAPS AND LEGAL DESCRIPTIONS ARE
AVAILABLE AND AN AGREEMENT IS REACHED WITH JEA
PREPARE FOR AND PARTICIPATION IN ALL HANDS
CONFERENCE CALL RELATIVE TO REVISIONS TO FIRST
COAST MEMO; SEND OUT REVISIONS.

PREPARE FOR AND PARTICIPATE IN ALL HANDS
CONFERENCE CALL REGARDING MEMORANDUM OF
UNDERSTANDING

FINALIZE ALL EXHIBITS TO APPLICATION UTILIZING
MAPS AND LEGAL DESCRIPTIONS PROVIDED BY DENISE
HOWARD .

TOTAL HOURS

1.80

2.00

1.20

.60

2.00

7.60

PROFESSIONAL FEES $ 2,850.00

1,125.00
1,725.00

675.00

750.00

450.00

225.00

750.00
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11/15/21 Supplemental Response to Staff 8th POD #26

LAW OFFICES

SUNDSTROM & MINDLIN, LLP

2548 BLAIRSTONE PINES DR
TALLAHASSEE, FLORIDA 32301

F.E.l.# 59-2783536 (850) 877-6555 PLEAS

REFER TO INVOICE NUMBER

FIRST COAST REGIONAL UTILITY, INC
Invoice #: 56325 PAGE 2

TOTAL COSTS ADVANCED $ .00

TOTAL STATEMENT $ 2.,850.00
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LAW OFFICES

SUNDSTROM & MINDLIN, LLP

2548 BLAIRSTONE PINES DR
TALLAHASSEE, FLORIDA 32301

(850) 877-6555 PLEASE REFER TO INVOICE NUMBER
WHEN REMITTING

FIRST COAST REGIONAL UTILITY, INC
301 CAPITAL PARTNERS, LLC

C/0 AVERY C. ROBERTS SEPTEMBER 10, 2019

P.0. BOX 238 INVOICE # 56388

LAKE BUTLER, FL 32054 FILE # 48070-00001
PAGE 1

8/05/19 WES

8/09/19 WES

8/09/19 RCB

8/12/19 WES

8/26/19 RCB

8/27/19 RCB
8/28/19 RCB

MATTER: ORIGINAL CERTIFICATE FROM PSC

FOLLOW UP WITH AVERY ROBERTS' QUESTIONS RELATIVE .50 187.50
TO FLORIDA POWER & LIGHT PURCHASE OF VERO BEACH

UTILITY SYSTEM; EMAIL TO AVERY ROBERTS AND GROUP.

RECEIPT OF STEVE MCINALL RESPONSE TO FIRST COAST 2.00 750.00
PROPOSED MEMO OF INTENT; PREPARE FOR AND

PARTICIPATE IN ALL HANDS CONFERENCE CALL RE:

SAME; FOLLOW UP DISCUSSION WITH DAVID HAAS OF ICI

HOMES; EMAIL TO GROUP RE: JACKSONVILLE ORDINANCE

2010-847.

PREPARE FOR AND PARTICIPATE IN CONFERENCE CALL 1.00 375.00
REGARDING JEA AND STRATEGY FOR PROCEEDING FURTHER

WITH FILING OF APPLICATION

PREPARE MEMO TO PAUL HARDEN DISSECTING .50 187.50
JACKSONVILLE ORDINANCE 2010-874 RELATIVE TO

"DEDICATION" OF WATER AND WASTEWATER FACILITIES

AT ICI VILLAGE AFTER CONFIRMING WITH DAVID HAAS

AND GENERAL COUNSEL OF ICI AS TO THE CORRECTNESS

OF OUR INTERPRETATION AND HISTORY OF THE MATTER.

DRAFT COVER LETTER FOR FPSC APPLICATION TO BE .70 262.50
FILED ON AUGUST 27; FORWARD TO BRONWYN FOR

INCLUSION IN FILING PACKAGE

COORDINATE FILING OF APPLICATION WITH BRONWYN 1.00 375.00
REVIEW EMAILS AND RESPONSE FROM JEA ON OUR FPSC .40 150.00
APPLICATION; DISCUSS WITH BILL SUNDSTROM

TOTAL HOURS 6.10
PROFESSTONAL FEES $ 2,287.50
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11/15/21 Supplemental Response to Staff 8th POD #26

LAW OFFICES

SUNDSTROM & MINDLIN, LLP

2548 BLAIRSTONE PINES DR
TALLAHASSEE, FLORIDA 32301

F.E.1.#59-2783536 (850) 877-6555 PLEASE REFER TO INVOICE NUMBER
WHEN REMITTING

FIRST COAST REGIONAL UTILITY, INC

Invoice #: 56388 PAGE 2
WILLIAM E SUNDSTROM 3.00 1,125.00
ROBERT C BRANNAN 3.10 1,162.50

FILING FEE 6,000.00

TOTAL COSTS ADVANCED $ 6,000.00

TOTAL STATEMENT $ 8,287.50
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LAW OFFICES

SUNDSTROM & MINDLIN, LLP

2548 BLAIRSTONE PINES DR
TALLAHASSEE, FLORIDA 32301

(850) 877-6555

FIRST COAST REGIONAL UTILITY, INC
301 CAPITAL PARTNERS, LLC

C/0O AVERY C. ROBERTS
P.O. BOX 238
LAKE BUTLER, FL 32054

PAGE

PLEASE REFER TO INVOICE NUMBER

WHEN REMITTING

OCTOBER 4, 2019
INVOICE #
FILE # 48070-00001
1

56431

9/09/19

9/10/19

9/12/19

9/13/19

9/16/19

9/17/19

9/18/19

9/18/19

9/20/19

9/24/19

RCB

WES

RCB

RCB

RCB

RCB

WES

RCB

RCB

WES

MATTER: ORIGINAL CERTIFICATE FROM PSC

DISCUSSIONS WITH DENISE HOWARD REGARDING PSC
REVIEW OF PROPOSED TERRITORY MAPS AND LEGAL
DESCRIPTIONS.

CONVERSATION WITH BEVIN BEAUDET RELATIVE TO
EVIDENCE THAT WOULD BE UTILIZED IN PUBLIC
HEARINGS RELATIVE TO CAPITAL REQUIREMENTS OF THE
JEA, ETC.

CONFERENCES WITH MELINDA WATTS AT THE PSC TO
ARRANGE A MEETING TO DISCUSS THE LEGAL
DESCRIPTION AND MAP DEFICIENCIES.

PREPARE FOR MONDAY MEETING WITH PSC STAFF TO
DISCUSS DEFICIENCIES IN LEGAL DESCRIPTION AND
MAPS OF THE PROPOSED SERVICE TERRITORY

CONFERENCE WITH DENISE HOWARD IN PREPARATION FOR
MEETING AT PSC; ATTEND MEETING AT PSC WITH
NUMEROUS STAFF; REPORT BACK TO DENISE ON OUTCOME
OF MEETING.

CONFERENCE CALL WITH DENISE HOWARD AND DAN AT ETM
TO GO OVER THE FORM NEEDED FOR THE MAPS AND LEGAL
DESCRIPTIONS FOR THE PSC PROPOSED SERVICE
TERRITORY.

CONFERENCE CALL WITH PARTNERS RELATIVE TO PSC
NOTICE ISSUES; FOLLOW UP EMAIL TO PARTNERS.
PREPARE FOR AND PARTICIPATE IN CONFERENCE CALL
WITH 301 CAPITAL PARTNERS TO DISCUSS THE ISSUES
RELATED TO THE LEGAL DESCRIPTIONS AND MAPS
PREPARED BY ETM; DISCUSS NOTICE ISSUES.
DISCUSSIONS WITH MELINDA WATTS AT THE PSC ABOUT
CREATING AN ABBREVIATED LEGAL DESCRIPTION FOR THE
NOTICES; DRAFT LEGAL DESCRIPTION AND REVISED
NOTICE; FILE REVISED DRAFT NOTICE WITH
ABBREVIATED LEGAL DESCRIPTION ELECTRONICALLY WITH
THE PSC.

DISCUSSION WITH AVERY ROBERTS RE: TIMETABLE.

.40

.60

.30

375.

150.

375.

562.

937.

375.

225.

375.

1,125,

112.

00

00

00

50

50

00

00

00

00

50
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LAW OFFICES

SUNDSTROM & MINDLIN, LLP

2548 BLAIRSTONE PINES DR
TALLAHASSEE, FLORIDA 32301

F.E.l# 59-2783536 (850) 877-6555 PLEASE REFER TO INVOICE NUMBER
WHEN REMITTING

FIRST COAST REGIONAL UTILITY, INC

Invoice #: 56431 PAGE 2

9/24/19 RCB CONFERENCE WITH DENISE HOWARD ON THE TIMELINE FOR .50 187.50
RECEIPT OF THE REVISED MAPS AND LEGAL
DESCRIPTIONS

9/25/19 RCB RECEIPT OF DEFICIENCY LETTER FROM MELINDA WATTS 1.30 487 .50

AT PSC; REVIEW LETTER AND FORWARD TO DENISE
HOWARD WITH DISCUSSION OF EACH OF THE POINTS
RAISED IN THE LETTER; FILE UPDATED FICTITIOUS
NAME INFORMATION AS REQUESTED BY PSC.

TOTAL HOURS 14.10
PROFESSIONAL FEES $ 5,287.50
WILLIAM E SUNDSTROM 1.30 487.50
ROBERT C BRANNAN 12.80 4,800.00
CERTIFIED COPIES 30.00
TOTAL COSTS ADVANCED $ 30.00

TOTAL STATEMENT $ 5,317.50
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FCRU Document 1746

11/15/21 Supplemental Response to Staff 8th POD #26

LAW OFFICES

SUNDSTROM & MINDLIN, LLP

2548 BLAIRSTONE PINES DR
TALLAHASSEE, FLORIDA 32301

(850) 877-6555

FIRST COAST REGIONAL UTILITY, INC
301 CAPITAL PARTNERS, LLC
C/O AVERY C. ROBERTS

P.O. BOX 238

LAKE BUTLER, FL 32054

PLEASE REFER TO INVOICE NUMBER
WHEN REMITTING

NOVEMBER 12, 2018
INVOICE # 56537
FILE # 48070-00001
PAGE 1

'10/01/19

10/04/19

10/07/19

10/09/19

10/16/19

RCB

RCB

RCB

RCB

RCB

MATTER: ORIGINAL CERTIFICATE FROM PSC

CONVERSATIONS WITH DAN WELCH AND DENISE REGARDING .60 225.00
STATUS OF MAP AND LEGAL DESCRIPTION REVISIONS FOR

PSC APPLICATION.

NUMEROUS DISCUSSIONS WITH DENISE AND OTHERS 1.50 562.50

REGARDING THE REVISED MAPS AND LEGAL

DESCRIPTIONS; CONFIRM THAT REVISIONS HAVE BEEN

FORWARDED TO ME

REVIEW REVISED MAPS PRIOR TO ETM SENDING TO PSC; 1.20 450.00
DISCUSSIONS WITH REGARD TO THE LESS AND EXCEPT

PORTIONS OF THE DESCRIPTIONS AND MAPS AS THEY

WILL BE WITHIN THE TERRITORY AND CAN BE LEFT

EXCEPT FOR THE LARGE COUNTY PIECE IN THE SOUTHERN

PORTION OF THE TERRITORY

FOLLOW UP WITH DENISE REGARDING DAN WELCH SENDING 1.30 487.50
MAPS AND LEGAL DESCRIPTION CHANGES TO MELINDA
WATTS AT PSC; DISCUSSION WITH DAN REGARDING LESS

AND EXCEPT PORTIONS OF MAPS

CONFERENCE WITH DAN WELCH REGARDING ISSUES WITH 1.20 450.00
THE MAPS AND LEGAL DESCRIPTIONS RAISED BY MELINDA
WATTS; DAN PROMISED THAT THE REVISED DOCUMENTS

WOULD BE READY ON OCTOBER 23.

TOTAL HOURS

PROFESSIONAL FEES

$ 2,175.00
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11/15/21 Supplemental Response to Staff 8th POD #26

LAW OFFICES

SUNDSTROM & MINDLIN, LLP

2548 BLAIRSTONE PINES DR
TALLAHASSEE, FLORIDA 32301

F.E.|.# 59-2783536 (850) 877-6555

FIRST COAST REGIONAL UTILITY, INC

PLEASE REFER TO INVOICE NUMBER
WHEN REMITTING

Invoice #: 56537 PAGE 2
ROBERT C BRANNAN 5.80 2,175.00
TOTAL COSTS ADVANCED .00

TOTAL STATEMENT $ 2,175.00
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LAW OFFICES

SUNDSTROM & MINDLIN, LLP

2548 BLAIRSTONE PINES DR
TALLAHASSEE, FLORIDA 32301

(850) 877-6555 PLEASE REFER TO INVOICE NUMBER
WHEN REMITTING

FIRST COAST REGIONAL UTILITY, INC
301 CAPITAL PARTNERS, LLC

C/0 AVERY C. ROBERTS DECEMBER 10, 2019
P.0O. BOX 238 INVOICE # 56606
LAKE BUTLER, FL 32054 FILE # 48070-00001
PAGE 1
MATTER: ORIGINAL CERTIFICATE FROM PSC
11/04/19 RCB NUMEROUS CONFERENCES WITH DANNY, MELINDA AND 3.60 1,350.00
AVERY REGARDING REMAINING ISSUES WITH LEGALS AND
MAPS.
11/05/19 WES CONFERENCE CALL WITH MIKE BRAREN AND AVERY .80 300.00

11/05/139 RCB

11/08/19 WES

11/08/19 RCB

11/09/19 RCB

11/10/19 WES

11/11/19 WES
11/11/19 RCB

11/12/19 RCB

11/13/19 RCB

11/25/19 RCB

ROBERTS RE: STATUS, EXPECTED NOTICE, PROCEDURE

MOVING FORWARD, ETC.

STATUS CONFERENCE CALL WITH MIKE BRAREN, AVERY 3.70 1,387.50
ROBERTS AND BILL SUNDSTROM; WORK ON NOTICES FOR

MAILING AND PUBLICATION PENDING APPROVAL OF

FILING OF MAPS AND LEGAL DESCRIPTIONS

RECEIPT OF NOTICE APPROVAL FROM THE FPSC; .80 300.00
DISCUSSION WITH AVERY ROBERTS RE: SAME.
CONTINUE TO DRAFT ALL NECESSARY AFFIDAVITS OF 3.30 1,237.50

FILING, NOTICES, AND CHANGES TO NOTICE LEGAL

DESCRIPTION SUGGESTED BY FPSC; CHECK ALL MAILING

LISTS AND PUBLICATION REQUIREMENTS AND PAPERS FOR

FILING; RECEIVE AND REVIEW NOTICE OF APPROVAL

FROM FPSC.

REVIEW OF FIRST DATA REQUEST FROM FPSC REGARDING 1.00 375.00
CALCULATIONS OF LABOR AND RATES; FORWARD REQUEST

TO BEVIN BEAUDET AND DEBORAH SWAIN FOR RESPONSES.

DRAFT MEMO TO PAUL HARDEN RELATIVE TO EXPECTED .50 187.50
FILING DATES AND RELATED MATTERS, ETC.

DISCUSSION WITH AVERY ROBERTS RELATIVE TO TIMING. .30 112.50
REVIEW AND COMMENT ON DRAFT MEMO TO PAUL HARDEN 3.00 1,125.00

REGARDING TIMING OF NOTICES AND POSSIBLE
OBJECTIONS FROM JEA; FINAL REVIEW AND PREPARATION
OF NOTICES AND PUBLICATION NOTICES AND AFFIDAVITS

REVIEW RESPONSES TO FPSC'S FIRST DATA REQUEST; .80 300.00
ELECTRONICALLY FILE RESPONSE
REVIEW AND APPROVE THE FILING OF NOTICES IN .50 187.50

PAPERS OF GENERAL CIRCULATION FOR PUBLICATION ON
NOVEMBER 25
EXECUTE AND MAIL NOTICES OF APPLICATION; FILE .80 300.00
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LAW OFFICES

SUNDSTROM & MINDLIN, LLP

2548 BLAIRSTONE PINES DR
TALLAHASSEE, FLORIDA 32301

F.E.L# 59-2783536 (850) 877-6555 PLEASE REFER TO INVOICE NUMBER
WHEN REMITTING

FIRST COAST REGIONAL UTILITY, INC

Invoice #: 56606 PAGE 2

NOTICE OF FILING WITH FPSC

TOTAL HOURS 19.10
PROFESSIONAL FEES $ 7,162.50
WILLIAM E SUNDSTROM 2.40 900.00
ROBERT C BRANNAN 16.70 6,262.50
TOTAL COSTS ADVANCED $ .00

TOTAL STATEMENT $ 7,162.50
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LAW OFFICES

SUNDSTROM & MINDLIN, LLP

2548 BLAIRSTONE PINES DR
TALLAHASSEE, FLORIDA 32301

(850) 877-6555

FIRST COAST REGIONAL UTILITY, INC
301 CAPITAL PARTNERS, LLC

C/0 AVERY C. ROBERTS
P.O. BOX 238
LAKE BUTLER, FL 32054

PAGE

PLEASE REFER TO INVOICE NUMBER

WHEN REMITTING

JANUARY 6, 2020
INVOICE #
FILE # 48070-00001

56633

1

12/05/19

12/16/19

12/18/19

12/18/19

12/23/19

12/27/19

12/30/19

RCB

RCB

WES

RCB

RCB

RCB

RCB

MATTER: ORIGINAL CERTIFICATE FROM PSC

PREPARE, TRANSMIT AND FILE AFFIDAVIT OF NOTICE
FOR PROPERTY OWNERS; CONFERENCE WITH DENISE
HOWARD TO CONFIRM ADDRESSES AND NAMES FOR
NOTICES; CONFERENCES WITH MELINDA WATTS
CONCERNING NOTICES AND AFFIDAVITS.

PREPARE AND FILE AFFIDAVIT OF PUBLICATION FOR
BAKER COUNTY NEWSPAPER

DISCUSSION WITH PAUL HARDEN RELATIVE TO JEA
TURMOIL; POSSIBLE PROTEST TO FIRST COAST

MIKE BRAREN.
REVIEW INTERLOCAL AGREEMENTS BETWEEN ST JOHNS

FIRST RIGHT OF REFUSAL AND PRICING

CORRECTIVE AFFIDAVIT FOR BAKER COUNTY NEWSPAPER
NOTICE PUBLICATION

INITIAL REVIEW OF JEA'S OBJECTIONS TO FIRST
COAST'S APPLICATION FOR CERTIFICATES.

CONTINUE TO REVIEW AND COMMENT ON JEA'S
OBJECTIONS TO FIRST COAST'S APPLICATION;
CONFERENCES WITH BILL SUNDSTROM REGARDING JEA
ARGUMENTS .

3.00 1,125.00
1.00 375.00
1.00 375.00
APPLICATION; ETC.; BRIEFING TO AVERY ROBERTS AND
1.50 562.50
COUNTY, NASSAU COUNTY AND THE JEA WITH PARTICULAR
ATTENTION TO THE SECTIONS GRANTING THE COUNTIES A
REVIEW NUMEROUS ARTICLES REGARDING JEA MANAGEMENT 1.70 637.50
PROBLEMS AND ISSUES RELATED TO SALE OF JEA; FILE
2.00 750.00
2.30 862.50
12.50

TOTAL HOURS

PROFESSIONAL FEES $ 4,687.50
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LAW OFFICES

SUNDSTROM & MINDLIN, LLP

2548 BLAIRSTONE PINES DR
TALLAHASSEE, FLORIDA 32301

PLEASE REFER TO INVOICE NUMBER

(850) 877-6555
WHEN REMITTING

FIRST COAST REGIONAL UTILITY, INC
Invoice #: 56633 PAGE 2
WILLIAM E SUNDSTROM 1.00 375.00
ROBERT C BRANNAN 11.50 4,312.50
TRAVEL EXPENSE 2,150.00
LEGAL ADVERTISEMENTS 637.47
PROFESSTONAL SERVICES 312.50
TOTAL COSTS ADVANCED $ 3,099.97

TOTAL STATEMENT
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LAW OFFICES

SUNDSTROM & MINDLIN, LLP

2548 BLAIRSTONE PINES DR
TALLAHASSEE, FLORIDA 32301

(850) 877-6555 PLEASE REFER TO INVOICE NUMBER
WHEN REMITTING

FIRST COAST REGIONAL UTILITY, INC
301 CAPITAL PARTNERS, LLC
C/O AVERY C. ROBERTS FEBRUARY 10, 2020

P.O. BOX 238

INVOICE # 56748

LAKE BUTLER, FL 32054 FILE # 48070-00001

PAGE 1

1/03/20

1/07/20

1/08/20

1/10/20

1/10/20

1/10/20

1/11/20
1/12/20

1/16/20

1/24/20

RCB

WES

RCB

WES

RCB

RCB

WES
WES

WES

WES

MATTER: ORIGINAL CERTIFICATE FROM PSC

RECEIPT AND REVIEW OF FPSC SECOND REQUEST FOR 1.00 375.00
INFORMATION; FORWARD TO TEAM FOR RESPONSE
INFORMATION.

.50 187.50

REVIEW LETTERS FROM PAUL HARDEN INFORMING JEA OF 1.50 562.50
OUR POSITION ON HOW TO TURN OVER FACILITIES TO

JEA AND SENDING OVER A COPY OF THE APPLICATION;

FILE RESPONSE TO FPSC'S SECOND REQUEST FOR

INFORMATION.

RECEIPT OF EMAIL FROM PAUL HARDEN CONTATNING 1.00 375.00
LATEST RESPONSE FROM JEA; CONFERENCE CALL WITH

AVERY ROBERTS AND MIKE BRAREN RE: SAME; BEGIN

CONSIDERING RESPONSE TO THE JEA.

BEGIN RESEARCHING AND WORKING ON RESPONSE TO JEA 3.00 1,125.00
OBJECTIONS a

REVIEW MEMO REGARDING ANNUAL REPORT FROM FPSC TO 2.00 750.00
FIRST COAST REGIONAL UTILITY; CONTINUE

RESEARCHING MATERIALS IN RESPONSE TO JEA

OBJECTIONS

CONTINUE WORKING ON RESPONSE TO JEA. .80 300.00
CONTINUE WORKING ON RESPONSE TO JEA:; DRAFT 1.50 562.50
RESPONSE; CONFERENCE CALL WITH MIKE BRAREN AND

AVERY ROBERTS RE: SAME; EMAIL EXCHANGE WITH BEVIN

BEAUDET.

PREPARE FOR AND PARTICIPATE IN ALL HANDS 1.50 562.50
CONFERENCE CALL RELATIVE TO FPSC APPLICATION AND
RESPONSE TO THE JEA: SPONSE TO THE JEA

; CONFERENCE CALL WITH AVERY ROBERTS AND
MIKE BRAREN.
DISCUSSION WITH DAVID HAAS RELATIVE TO THE 1.20 450.00
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LAW OFFICES

SUNDSTROM & MINDLIN, LLP

2548 BLAIRSTONE PINES DR
TALLAHASSEE, FLORIDA 32301

(850) 877-6555 PLEASE REFER TO INVOICE NUMBER

WHEN REMITTING

FIRST COAST REGIONAL UTILITY, INC

Invoice #:

56748 PAGE 2

"DEDICATION" LANGUAGE IN THE ICI DEVELOPMENT
ORDER; EMAIL TO PAUL HARDEN RE: SAME; COMPLETE
FIRST COAST ANNUAL REPORT; SECURE EXECUTION AND
FILE WITH FLORIDA PUBLIC SERVICE COMMISSION.

1/27/20 WES REVIEW FILE IN PREPARATION FOR MEETINGS WITH MIKE N 1.00 375.00
BRAREN AND JIM HISSAM; CALL TO PAUL HARDEN, ETC.

1/29/20 WES CONTINUE DEVELOPING ARGUMENTS IN RESPONSE TO 1.50 562.50
JEA'S PROTEST; CALL TO PAUL; HARDEN; DISCUSSION
WITH AVERY ROBERTS, ETC.

1/29/20 RCB RESEARCH MATERIALS IN PREPARATION FOR RESPONSE TO 2.30 862.50
JEA OBJECTIONS

1/30/20 WES PREPARATION FOR MEETING WITH SUE CLARK, COUNSEL 1.00 375.00
TO THE JEA.

1/31/20 WES TWO DISCUSSIONS WITH ATTORNEY SUE CLARK, COUNSEL 2.50 937.50
TO THE JEA, IN THE PSC MATTER; DISCUSSIONS WITH
AVERY ROBERTS AND PAUL HARDEN IN THIS REGARD;
EMAILS TO CLIENT KEEPING THEM INFORMED.

1/31/20 RCB REVIEW AND COMMENT ON LETTER TO JEA FROM BILL 2.50 937.50
SUNDSTROM; CONTINUE TO PREPARE FOR RESPONSE TO
JEA OBJECTIONS
TOTAL HOURS 24.80

PROFESSIONAL FEES $ 9,300.00
WILLIAM E SUNDSTROM 12.50 4,687.50

ROBERT C BRANNAN 12.30 4,612.50
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LAW OFFICES

SUNDSTROM & MINDLIN, LLP

2548 BLAIRSTONE PINES DR
TALLAHASSEE, FLORIDA 32301

F.E.L# 59-2783536 (850) 877-6555 PLEASE REFER TO INVOICE NUMBER
WHEN REMITTING

FIRST COAST REGIONAL UTILITY, INC

Invoice #: 56748 PAGE 3
PROFESSTIONAL SERVICES 1,350.00
TOTAL COSTS ADVANCED $ 1,350.00

TOTAL STATEMENT $ 10,650.00
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CHE CK R E (Y192Es$sEmental Response to Staff 8th POD #26

Date _A> 7-A0Q0

Check Payable To MI /J\CU) . \S(/‘XLT N é/t %&SOC %C $ Q QS )

Charge To: Client FJ ASE péa,sf_ Bill Client $ a SN} 0

File No 480 70.0/ (includes costs directly charged
) to the irm) -
Date of Travel

. Type of Expense Ty B 7/@L

Special Instructions

Check if to be paid | \ FP&%
. LA

from Trust Account . Solaliaes '
S o Signature

oot
Needed By aJQQ@
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11/15/21 SupPi2SotlVR32OnskverBtaft 8th POD #26
Miami, Florida 33145
Tel.: 305-441-0123 Fax: 305-441-0688

wiww. nilianiswain.com

e

LIt

Milian, Swain & Associates, Inc,

Civil Engineers @  Environmental Scientists & Engineers e Utility Management G Financial Consultants
INVOICE

William E. Sundstrom, P.A. _ Invoice Date: February 3, 2020

Sundstrom & Mindlin, LLP - , Invoice Number: 44174

Attorneys at Law , . Page #1 Billing # 5

2548 Blairstone Pines Drive ‘

Tallahassee, F1, 32301

Re: First Coast Regional Utilities, LL.C
For Professional services rendered through January 31, 2020

Hours Rate Amount
- |Principal K
Deborah Swain 1.00 225.00 o 225.00
Senior Staff Accountant h :
Cynthia Yapp 4 175.00 0.00
| Total For Invoice # 44174 - $225.00|
Total Amount Due: $225.00

Please make check payable to Milian, Swain & Associates, Iinc.
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Time/Expenses by Project Report 11/15/21 Supplemental Response to Staff 8th POD #26
Order Time By: Employee ID . Milian, Swain & Associates " Page 1
Order Expense By: Expense # Project: F16-01
Status: Ready Hold Billed Never Billed " Period: 01/01/2020 — 01/31/2020

>roject  Project Name SJ Ctrl # SdInv#

>hase/Task/Employes Employee Name Dep Staff P/E Work Date  OVT ST STATE Hours Worked  Billable Hours

£16-01 FCRU-New Certificate : :
DS Deborah Swain FIN 001 01/03/2020 01/03/2020 N R 1.00 1.00

lReview JEA protest, data request #2 response

Total Project F16-01 1.00 1.00 -

RunDate: = Feb3, 2020 @ 16:35:07 o - . i TIMEEXPRPT.FRX
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LAW OFFICES

SUNDSTROM & MINDLIN, LLP

2548 BLAIRSTONE PINES DR
TALLAHASSEE, FLORIDA 32301

F.E.L# 59-2783536 (850) 877-6555 PLEASE REFER TO INVOICE NUMBER
: WHEN REMITTING

FIRST COAST REGIONAL UTILITY, INC
301 CAPITAL PARTNERS, LLC

C/O0 AVERY C. ROBERTS MARCH S, 2020

P.O. BOX 238 INVOICE # 56817

LAKE BUTLER, FL 32054 FILE # 48070-00001
PAGE 1

MATTER: ORIGINAL CERTIFICATE FROM PSC

2/01/20 WES 2.50 937.50

REVISE DRAFT LETTER TO SUE CLARK IN THIS REGARD;

BEGIN ORGANIZING NOTES AND TRIAL NOTEBOOK.
2/02/20 WES CONTINUE TO WORK ON FIRST COAST TRIAL NOTEBOOK. 1.50 562.50
2/03/20 WES DRAFT LETTER TO TALLAHASSEE COUNSEL FOR THE JEA 4.00 1,500.00

REJECTING TERMS AND CONDITIONS AND MAKING IT

CLEAR THAT FIRST COAST IS PREPARED TO GO TO

TRIAL; DISCUSSIONS WITH BOTH AVERY ROBERTS AND

MIKE BRAREN IN THAT REGARD BEFORE SENDING.

2/03/20 RCB PREPARE FOR MEETING AT RADY LAW FIRM; EDIT AND 4.80 1,800.00
COMMENT ON LETTER TO JEA COUNSEL
2/05/20 WES BEGIN PREPARATION OF MEMO TO FILE OUTLINING 2.50 937.50

ELEMENTS OF THE CASE AND OUR METHOD OF DEALING
WITH IT; DICTATE SUMMARY OF JEA PROTEST PREPARED
IN PREPARATION FOR COUNTY'S MEETING IN
TALLAHASSEE ON FRIDAY; CIRCULATE TO CLIENTS AND
BEVIN BEAUDET.

2/05/20 RCB CONTINUE TO PREPARE FOR MEETING WITH JEA COUNSEL; 1.80 675.00
WORK ON MEMO FOR CASE IN JEA OBJECTIONS
2/06/20 WES CONTINUE TO WORK ON ROAD MAP SUMMARY; DISCUSSION 4.50 1,687.50

WITH ATTORNEY THOMAS CRAB RELATIVE TO THE DESIRE
OF THE JEA TO MEET WITH FIRST COAST ENGINEER;
CONTACT BEVIN BEAUDET IN THIS REGARD AND SECURE
HIS AVAILABILITY; COMMUNICATE BACK TO ATTORNEY AS

TO AVAILABLE DATES NEXT WEEK AND RESCHEDULE
ATTORNEY MEETING FOR THE 19TH.

2/06/20 RCB CONTINUE TO WORK WITH BILL SUNDSTROM ON STRATEGY 2.20 825.00
AND ISSUES IN JEA OBJECTION CASE;
2/07/20 WES CONTINUE TO RESEARCH OF LAW RELATIVE TO BERT 2.50 937.50

HARRIS, NOLLAN AND DOLAN; BUILD THEM INTO OUR
MEMO; AND FORWARD MEMO TO CLIENTS AS TO TRIAL
STRATEGY, ETC.
2/07/20 RCB EDIT, COMMENT AND FINALIZE SUMMARY ROAD MAP OF 1.70 637.50




F.E.L# 59-2783536
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FCRU Document 1759
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LAW OFFICES

SUNDSTROM & MINDLIN, LLP

2548 BLAIRSTONE PINES DR
TALLAHASSEE, FLORIDA 32301

(850) 877-6555 PLEASE REFER TO INVOICE NUMBER
WHEN REMITTING

FIRST COAST REGIONAL UTILITY, INC

Invoice

#:

56817 PAGE 2

2/11/20

2/11/20

2/13/20

2/14/20

2/17/20
2/17/20

2/19/20

2/20/20

2/21/20

2/26/20

WES

RCB

WES

WES

WES

RCB

WES

WES

RCB

WES

CASE AND TRIAL STRATEGY
PREPARE FOR AND PARTICIPATE IN CONFERENCE CALL 1.50 562.50
WITH PARTNERS

PREPARE FOR AND PARTICIPATE IN CONFERENCE CALL 1.30 487.50
REGARDING MOVING FORWARD IN APPLICATION PROCESS

DISCUSSION WITH BEVIN BEAUDET RELATIVE TO HIS 1.00 375.00
MEETINGS WITH JEA ON FRIDAY, FEB. 14; REVIEW BOND

BUYER ARTICLE; ETC.

DISCUSSIONS WITH BOB KENNELLY AND BEVIN BEAUDET 1.00 375.00
RELATIVE TO THEIR MEETING AT THE JEA OF EVEN

DATE; FIRST DRAFT OF HIGHLIGHTS OF THAT MEETING

AND FORWARD TO BOB AND BEVIN FOR THEIR REVIEW AND

EDITS.

PREPARE FOR MEETINGS WITH ATTORNEYS FOR THE JEA 2.50 $37.50
TO BE HELD ON WEDNESDAY, FEB. 19 IN TALLAHASSEE.

REVIEW NOTES OF ENGINEERS' MEETING; PREPARE FOR 1.50 562.50
MEETING WITH JEA COUNSEL

CONVERSATION WITH MIKE BRAREN AND AVERY ROBERTS 1.20 450.00
RELATIVE TO CANCELLATION BY THE JEA OF MEETING

WITH TALLAHASSEE ATTORNEYS AND NEXT STEPS; FOLLOW

UP DISCUSSION WITH MIKE BRAREN RELATIVE TO

AGGREGATE VALUE OF PROJECT AND RELATED MATTERS.

DISCUSSION WITH TOM CRAB RELATIVE TO RENEWAL DATE 1.50 562.50
FOR MEETING TO DISCUSS POSSIBILITY OF SETTLEMENT

BETWEEN FIRST COAST AND THE JEA; BRIEF CONFERENCE

WITH MIKE BRAREN AND AVERY ROBERTS RE: SAME;

PREPARATION OF MEMO DESCRIBING THE MARTIN DOWNS

SCENARIO AS REQUESTED BY BOB KENNELLY; AFTER

EDITS, FORWARD DRAFT TO BOB KENNELLY.

REVIEW AND COMMENT ON MEMO EXPLAINING MARTIN .60 225.00
DOWNS SALE MECHANISM

DISCUSSION WITH THOMAS CRAB, TALLAHASSEE ATTORNEY 2.00 750.00
FOR THE JEA, AND RECEIVE THIS INSTRUCTION THAT

JEA GENERAL COUNSEL DOES NOT WANT HIM MEETING OR

SPEAKING WITH FIRST COAST REPRESENTATIVES UNTIL
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LAW OFFICES

SUNDSTROM & MINDLIN, LLP

2548 BLAIRSTONE PINES DR
TALLAHASSEE, FLORIDA 32301

(850) 877-6555 PLEAS

FIRST COAST REGIONAL UTILITY, INC

Invoice #:

56817 PAGE 3

E REFER TO INVOICE NUMBER
WHEN REMITTING

2/27/20 WES

2/28/20 WES

FURTHER NOTICE; BRIEF PAUL HARDEN ON THE JEA FIRE

WALL; DISCUSSION WITH AVERY ROBERTS RE: SAME.

CREATION OF FIRST SET OF INTERROGATORIES AND 2.00
FIRST REQUEST FOR PRODUCTION OF DOCUMENTS TO THE

JEA; DISCUSSION WITH MIKE BRAREN RELATIVE TO

STATUS OF MATTER.

CONTINUE DRAFTING INTERROGATORIES AND REQUEST FOR 1.50
PRODUCTION OF DOCUMENTS TO BE DELIVERED TO THE

JEA.

TOTAL HOURS 45,60
PROFESSIONAL FEES $ 17,100.00
WILLIAM E SUNDSTROM 31.70 11,887.50
ROBERT C BRANNAN 13.%0 5,212.50
PROFESSIONAL SERVICES 3,831.89
TOTAL COSTS ADVANCED $ 3,831.89

TOTAL STATEMENT $ 20,931.89

750.00

562.50
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CHECK RE Q/Wﬁ»tgqunental Response to Staff 8th POD #26
Date 3 coL &O&O

Check Payable To \P,'@U?r) &QUC[@JL( p| E L, $ 38 3 ?j

< )
Charge To: Client F(—g‘f COC&S+ Bill Client $
File No. “N90770.0 / (includes costs directly charged
Date of Travel to the firm)
Type of Expense
Special Instructions
Check if to be paid o (W
from Trust Account : @ 3« m e ymp—
53 Sl
Needed By

Date




Bevin A, Beaudet, P.E,, LLC

babeaudei@gmail.com

BILLTO

William E Sundstrom PA
Sundstrom & Mindlin, LLP
2548 Blairstone Pines Dr.
Tallahassee, FL 32301

" Docket No. 20190168-WS
FCRU Document 1762
11/15/21 Supplemental Response to Staff 8th POD #26

INVOICE # 1151

- DATE 03/01/2020
DUE DATE 03/31/2020
TERMS Net 30

DEZCRIPTION

Consulting

Work on responses to JEA objections to FCRU PSC
application, conference calls, preparation for 2/14 meeting -
2/7-12

Consulting
Travel to Jacksonville from WPB for meeting - 2/13

Consulting
Meeting with JEA in Jacksonville, return travel - 2/14

Travel _
570 miles driven between WPB and Jacksonville

Travel
Hotel charges at Hyatt Regency Jacksonville - 2/14

Travel
Uber from Hyatt to JEA's office - 2/14

Travel Meals
Meals from 2/13 - 2/14 during travel to Jacksonville for JEA
meeting

Bevin A. Beaudet, P.E., LLC
316 Plymouth Rd.
West Palm Beach, FL. 33405

/M%/é%wv//

4.50 225.00 1,012,550

4 225,00 900.00

6 226.00 1,366.00

570 0.575 32775

1 195.17 195,17

1 11.21 11.21

1 29,26 29.26

BALANGE DUE o o @

$3,531.89
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11/15/21 Supplemental RespoH%tPrSé%f&%t{Qg\QD #26

JACKSONVILLE RIVERFRONT
225 East Coastline Drive
Jacksonvilie, FL 32202

_ Tel: 904-588-1234

NAN = \'Zl ) "N

FEGEMNCY Fax: 904-634-4554

www.jacksonville.hyatt.com

INVOICE

Bevin Beaudet Room No, 0660

316 Plymouth Rd. Arrival 2020-02-13

West Palm Beach, FL 33405 -

United States Departure 2020-02-14

Page No. 1of1

Confirmation No. 5525794301 Follo Window 1

Group Name Folio No. 29849138
Date Description Charges Credits
02-13-2020 Accomodation 149.10
02-13-2020 City Surcharge 1.49
02-13-2020 Occupancy Sales Tax 10.54
02-13-2020 Occupancy City Tax 9.04
02-13-2020 Parking Valet 25.00
02-14-2020 Visa XXXXKXXKXXX KK 1262 -195.17

Total 195.17 -195.17

Guest Signature Balance 0.00

| agree that my llability for this bill Is not waived and | agree
to be held personally liable in the event that the Indicated
person, company or association fails to pay for any part ar
the full amount of these charges,

World of Hyatt Summary -

Membership: XXXXXX790G -
Bonus Codes:

Qualifying Nights: 1

Eligible Spend: 149.10
Redemption Eligible; 46.07

Summary Invoice, please see front desk
for eligibility detalils.
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Thanks for tipping! We’ve updated your Friday morning trip receipt
T message

Uber Receipts <uber.us@uber.com> Fri, Feb 14, 2020 at 8:37 AM
To: babeaudet@gmail.com

Ubei, Total: $11.21

Fri, Feb 14, 2020

Thanks for tipping, Bevin

Thanks for tipping! We've updated
your Friday morning trip receipt

Total $11.21

You earned 18 points and 9 bonus reward points on this trip

Trip Fare $5.81
Subtotal $5.81
Tolls, Surcharges, and Fees (¥ 4 $3.40

Tip | $2.00
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Amount Charged

eces 1262 Switch , $11.21

A temporary hold of $9.21 was placed on your payment method »+++ 1262 at the start of the trip, This

is not a charge and has or will be removed. It should disappear from your bank statement shortly.
Learn More

Uber Rewards

Base points 18

2 points per eligible $ on UberX

Extra reward points 9

extra reward points with Uber Business Rewards

You rode with Lacurtis

Has passed a multi-step
~ safety screen

4.92¥ Rating

Lacurtis is known for:
Excellent Service

How was your ride?
[

R




Lave's 316
Arby's 7779

1657 Morth Hwy US 1
Ormoned Beach, FL 32174 ’
(386} 671 wuwd

L402020 12:12:49 P
R Vi L) Cashilel A étrice

1 OOUBLE ROAST BREF CoMBO , » ) 30.5¢
DBL ROAST BEEF ¢
GNION RINGS
MED 24072 JAMOCA SHAK

Suirlotal 10.5¢
Tax 0.6
Tt 1.1
Cash 12.00
Change 0.72

KRR ERERK SRR RRR K O R D
- (st Nare  KEVIN
Irder 12557

SRRRRERTOERREERTRCRCR R L ard kol

Dine In

Thank vou for visi1ihg!
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LAW OFFICES

SUNDSTROM & MINDLIN, LLP

2548 BLAIRSTONE PINES DR
TALLAHASSEE, FLORIDA 32301

(850) 877-6555

FIRST COAST REGIONAL UTILITY, INC
301 CAPITAL PARTNERS, LLC
C/O AVERY C. ROBERTS APRIL 6,

P.O. BOX 238
LAKE BUTLER, FL 32054

INVOICE #
FILE # 48070-00001

PAGE

PLEASE REFER TO INVOICE NUMBER

WHEN REMITTING

2020
56877

1

3/01/20

3/02/20

3/02/20

3/02/20

3/03/20

3/03/20

3/04/20

3/05/20

3/05/20

WES

WES

FMD

RCB

WES

KLK

RCB

WES

RCB

MATTER: ORIGINAL CERTIFICATE FROM PSC

DRAFT STATUS REPORT TO PARTNERS RELATIVE TO FPSC
APPLICATION.

COMPLETION OF FIRST ROUND OF DISCOVERY INCLUDING
INTERROGATORIES, REQUEST FOR PRODUCTION OF
DOCUMENTS, AND REQUEST FOR ADMISSIONS; ALL HANDS
CONFERENCE CALL WITH CLIENTS, PAUL HARDEN, BEVIN
BEAUDET, BOB BRANNAN AND DENISE ROBERTS AS
REGARDS MOVING FORWARD; FOLLOW UP DISCUSSION WITH
AVERY ROBERTS; SEND PROJECTED FPSC TIMETABLE TO
THE PARTNERS.

PREPARE ESTIMATED SCHEDULE FOR COMPLETION OF
CASE.

REVIEW AND COMMENT ON FIRST SET OF DISCOVERY;
PREPARE FOR AND PARTICIPATE IN ALL HANDS
CONFERENCE CALL TO DISCUSS STRATEGY AND PLANS;
REVIEW AND COMMENT ON DRAFT OF TIMELINE FOR
MOVING THROUGH THE PSC PROCESS.

ADDITIONAL POLISHING OF FIRST SETS OF DISCOVERY
AND FORWARD TO TEAM FOR REVIEW AND COMMENTS;
FOLLOW UP EMAIL DISCUSSION WITH BOB KENNELLY RE:
SAME.

ASSIST WITH FIRST REQUEST TO PRODUCE, FIRST SET
OF INTERROGATORIES, AND FIRST REQUEST FOR
ADMISSIONS.

REVIEW AND EDIT DISCOVERY FOLLOWING DISCUSSIONS
WITH PARTNERS AND RECEIVING COMMENTS; PHONE STAFF
ATTORNEY AT PSC REGARDING SETTING A HEARING ON
JEA'S OBJECTIONS; FOLLOW UP WRITTEN NOTIFICATION
OF IMPASSE AND REQUEST FOR A HEARING

FORWARD ARTICLE FROM TAMPA BAY TIMES RELATIVE TO
PARTNERSHIP BETWEEN LENNAR AND METRO HOMES FOR
10,000 UNIT PROJECT IN PASCO COUNTY; COMPLETE AND
FILE DISCOVERY ON JEA.

FINAL EDITS TO DISCOVERY AND FILE WITH PSC

.60

.80

.80

225.

3,000.

300.

1,875.

375.

562.

1,125,

300.

375.

00

00

00

00

00

50

00

00

00
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LAW OFFICES

SUNDSTROM & MINDLIN, LLP

2548 BLAIRSTONE PINES DR
TALLAHASSEE, FLORIDA 32301

(850) 877-6555 PLEASE REFER TO INVOICE NUMBER
WHEN REMITTING

FIRST COAST REGIONAL UTILITY, INC

Invoice

#:

56877 PAGE 2

3/06/20

3/11/20

3/13/20

3/16/20

3/18/20

3/19/20

3/20/20

3/20/20

3/23/20

3/23/20

3/24/20

3/24/20

3/25/20

RCB

RCB

WES

RCB

WES

WES

FMD

RCB

FMD

RCB

FMD

RCB

WES

CONTINUE DISCUSSIONS WITH PSC STAFF COUNSEL 1.50 562.50
REGARDING SETTING HEARING AND BREAKDOWN OF

NEGOTIATIONS;

WORK WITH BILL SUNDSTROM ON SETTLEMENT OFFER TO 1.20 450.00
JEA

FURTHER REVISIONS TO DRAFT LETTER TO JEA OFFERING 1.50 562.50
SETTLEMENT; DISCUSSIONS WITH BOB KENNELLY, JIM

HISSAM AND AVERY ROBERTS AND PAUL HARDEN IN THIS

REGARD; SECURE DRAFT MAP FROM JIM HISSAM; MINOR

MODIFICATIONS, ETC.

NUMEROUS CONFERENCES AND EMAILS WITH PSC STAFF 2.00 750.00
COUNSEL AND GENERAL COUNSEL REGARDING SCHEDULING

OF HEARING

STATUS CONFERENCE WITH AVERY ROBERTS AND MIKE .50 187.50
BRAREN RELATIVE TO STATUS OF PSC CASE, TIMING,

EXPECTED HEARING, HEARING LOCATION, ETC.

RECEIPT OF EMAIL FROM COUNSEL FOR THE JEA, .50 187.50
CLAIMING THAT IT IS NOT A "PARTY" TO THESE

PROCEEDINGS AND THUS IS NOT OBLIGATED TO RESPOND

TO DISCOVERY; BEGIN CRAFTING RESPONSE THERETO.

INTEROFFICE CONFERENCE RE: JEA AS NON-PARTY AND .40 150.00
DISCOVERY AND CORRESPONDENCE WITH PSC; ASSIST IN

LETTER FORMULATION.

NUMEROUS CONFERENCES WITH BILL SUNDSTROM, MARTY 2.00 750.00
AND PSC COUNSEL REGARDING JEA ALLEGATION THAT IT

IS NOT A PARTY SUBJECT TO DISCOVERY

REVIEW STAFF RESPONSE RE: JEA PARTY STATUS AND .50 187.50
DISCOVERY; INTEROFFICE CONFERENCE AND ASSIST IN

PREPARATION OF ADDITIONAL RESPONSE TO STAFF.

REVIEW JEA LETTER REGARDING NONPARTY STATUS 3.00 1,125.00
CONFERENCES WITH JEA GENERAL COUNSEL REGARDING

SAME; RESEARCH MATTER IN PREPARATION FOR RESPONSE

TO JEA MOTION TO STRIKE

REVIEW JEA MOTION; ASSIST IN PREPARATION OF 1.20 450.00
RESPONSE TO MOTION

BEGIN DRAFT OF RESPONSE TO MOTION TO STRIKE FROM 3.00 1,125.00
JEA; NUMEROUS DISCUSSIONS WITH MARTY D AND BILL

SUNDSTROM REGARDING SAME

EMAIL TO STAFF OF THE FLORIDA PUBLIC SERVICE .40 150.00
COMMISSION TRANSMITTING PRIOR OFFER TO THE JEA;
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LAW OFFICES

SUNDSTROM & MINDLIN, LLP

2548 BLAIRSTONE PINES DR
TALLAHASSEE, FLORIDA 32301

(850) 877-6555 PLEASE REFER TO INVOICE NUMBER
WHEN REMITTING

FIRST COAST REGIONAL UTILITY, INC

Invoice #:

56877 PAGE 3

STRATEGY DISCUSSION WITH PAUL HARDEN.

3/25/20 RCB FINALIZE RESPONSE TO MOTION TO STRIKE AND FILE 4.00 1,500.00
WITH PSC; DELIVER COURTESY COPY TO NONPARTY JEA'S
COUNSEL
3/31/20 RCB CONTINUE WORKING ON ISSUES RELATIVE TO MOTION TO 3.00 1,125.00
STRIKE.
TOTAL HOURS 46.40
PROFESSIONAL FEES $ 17,400.00
WILLIAM E SUNDSTROM 13.30 4,987.50
F MARSHALL DETERDING 2.90 1,087.50
ROBERT C BRANNAN 28.70 10,762.50
KYLE L KEMPER 1.50 562.50
TOTAL COSTS ADVANCED $ .00

TOTAL STATEMENT $ 17,400.00
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LAW OFFICES

SUNDSTROM & MINDLIN, LLP

2548 BLAIRSTONE PINES DR
TALLAHASSEE, FLORIDA 32301

(850) 877-6555 PLEASE REFER TO INVOICE NUMBER
WHEN REMITTING

FIRST COAST REGIONAL UTILITY, INC
301 CAPITAL PARTNERS, LLC
C/O AVERY C. ROBERTS MAY 4, 2020

P.O. BOX 238

INVOICE # 56973

LAKE BUTLER, FL 32054 FILE # 48070-00001

PAGE 1

4/01/20

4/02/20

4/02/20

4/03/20

4/04/20

4/06/20

4/06/20

4/07/20

4/07/20

4/07/20

4/09/20

4/14/20
4/15/20

WES

WES

RCB

RCB

WES

WES

RCB

WES

WES

RCB

WES

WES
WES

MATTER: ORIGINAL CERTIFICATE FROM PSC

BRIEF DISCUSSION WITH PAUL HARDEN RE: JEA .40 150.00
SITUATION.

PREPARE FOR AND PARTICIPATE IN CONFERENCE CALL 1.00 375.00
WITH THE PARTNERS RELATIVE TO MATTER STATUS,

GOING FORWARD, MOTIONS, TIMETABLE, ETC.

PREPARE FOR AND PARTICIPATE IN CONFERENCE CALL 1.00 375.00
WITH 301 PARTNERS AND BILL SUNDSTROM REGARDING

THE CURRENT STATUS AND HOW TO MOVE FORWARD

CONFERENCE WITH JENNIFER CRAWFORD REGARDING .70 262.50
CONFERENCE CALL BETWEEN THE PARTIES REGARDING

WHETHER SETTLEMENT IS POSSIBLE OR WHETHER THE

MATTER SHOULD BE SET FOR HEARING.

CONFERENCE CALL WITH AVERY ROBERTS AND MIKE .50 187.50
BRAREN RELATIVE TO FACTS SUPPORTING ARGUMENT ON

UPCOMING FPSC FIRST COAST/JEA CONFERENCE CALL.

WORK ON TALKING POINTS FOR CONFERENCE CALL WITH 1.00 375.00
THE FPSC STAFF AND THE JEA; FORWARD TOC BOB

KENNELLY FOR HIS REVIEW AND COMMENT.

WORK ON ISSUES AND PREPARE FOR CONFERENCE CALL 1.60 600.00
WITH FPSC STAFF AND JEA; EDIT AND MARKUP NOTES

FOR THE CONFERENCE WITH JEA AND PSC;

FURTHER REVISION OF TALKING POINTS; RECEIVE INPUT 1.00 375.00
FROM BEVIN BEAUDET; TURN OUT ADDITIONAL DRAFT TO

BOB KENNELLY.

FINISH UP TALKING POINTS AND DISCUSSION WITH BOB .40 150.00
KENNELLY IN THAT REGARD.

CONTINUE TO WORK ON NOTES AND ISSUES FOR JEA/FPSC 1.00 375.00
CONFERENCE

COMPLETION OF TALKING POINTS MEMO FOR UTILIZATION 1.00 375.00
IN UPCOMING CALL WITH FPSC STAFF; DISCUSSION WITH

BOB KENNELLY RE: SAME.

CONTINUE TO PREPARE FOR FPSC/JEA CONFERENCE CALL. 1.50 562.50
PREPARE FOR AND PARTICIPATE IN ALL HANDS 2.00 750.00
CONFERENCE CALL WITH THE FPSC STAFF AND JEA;
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LAW OFFICES

SUNDSTROM & MINDLIN, LLP

2548 BLAIRSTONE PINES DR
TALLAHASSEE, FLORIDA 32301

F.E.l.# 59-2783536 (850) 877-6555 PLEASE REFER TO INVOICE NUMBER
WHEN REMITTING

FIRST COAST REGIONAL UTILITY, INC

Invoice #: 56973 PAGE 2

FOLLOW UP CONFERENCE CALL WITH CLIENTS ADVISING
AS TO THE OUTCOME OF THE MEETING; DICTATE AND
SEND MEMO SUMMARIZING THE MEETING TO ALL PARTIES.
4/15/20 RCB PREPARE FOR ANT PARTICIPATE IN ALL HANDS 2.00 750.00
CONFERENCE CALL WITH FPSC STAFF AND JEA;
CONFERENCE CALL WITH BILL SUNDSTROM AND FIRST
COAST; REVIEW AND COMMENT ON MEMORANDUM DRAFTED
BY BILL SUNDSTROM RECOUNTING CONFERENCE

4/21/20 FMD INTEROFFICE CONFERENCE RE: TIMING FOR TESTIMONY .60 225.00
AND DISCOVERY; REVIEW ORDER AND SUGGEST RESPONSE.
4/21/20 RCB CONFERENCES WITH JENNIFER CRAWFORD AT THE FPSC 1.00 375.00

REGARDING FORMALLY LISTING JEA AS A PARTY OR
CANCELING THE HEARING

4/22/20 WES STRATEGY SESSION RELATIVE TO RESPONDING TO ORDER .50 187.50
ESTABLISHING PROCEDURE, ETC.
4/22/20 RCB STRATEGY SESSION REGARDING TIMEFRAMES AND 1.30 487.50

RESPONSE TO ORDER ESTABLISHING PROCEDURE;
CONFERENCES WITH JENNIFER CRAWFORD REGARDING
ORDER ESTABLISHING PROCEDURE
4/23/20 WES CONFERENCE CALL WITH BOB KENNELLY AND DENISE .50 187.50
HOWARD RELATIVE TO ORDER ESTABLISHING PROCEDURE,
WITNESS LIST, ETC.; NOTES TO FILE.
4/23/20 RCB CONFERENCE CALL WITH ROBERT KENNELLY, BILL .50 187.50
SUNDSTROM AND DENISE HOWARD REGARDING WITNESS
LISTS, TESTIMONY AND ORDER ESTABLISHING PROCEDURE

4/23/20 RCB OBTAIN BACKGROUND INFORMATION ON ROBERT KENNELLY .50 187.50
FOR USE IN DIRECT TESTIMONY
4/27/20 RCB REVIEW CERTIFICATE APPLICATION AND OTHER 2.00 750.00

INFORMATION FOR DIRECT TESTIMONY OF ROBERT
KENNELLY; INITIAL DRAFT OF TESTIMONY.
4/28/20 FMD INTEROFFICE CONFERENCE RE: TESTIMONY OF .90 337.50
WITNESSES; REVIEW BASIC TESTIMONY OF WITNESSES
AND MAKE SUGGESTIONS RE: SAME AND INTEROFFICE

CONFERENCE,
4/28/20 RCB REDRAFT DIRECT TESTIMONY OF ROBERT KENNELLY 2.00 750.00
4/29/20 RCB OBTAIN AND REVIEW NECESSARY INFORMATION FOR 2.00 750.00

DIRECT TESTIMONY AND BEGIN INITIAL DRAFTS OF
DIRECT TESTIMONY FOR BEVIN BEAUDET AND DEBORAH
SWAINE
4/30/20 RCB COMPLETE DRAFTS OF DIRECT TESTIMONY FOR ROBERT 3.70 1,387.50
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LAW OFFICES

SUNDSTROM & MINDLIN, LLP

2548 BLAIRSTONE PINES DR
TALLAHASSEE, FLORIDA 32301

F.E.L# 59-2783536 (850) 877-6555

FIRST COAST REGIONAL UTILITY, INC

Invoice #: 56973 PAGE

PLEASE REFER TO INVOICE NUMBER
WHEN REMITTING

KENNELLY, DEBORAH SWAINE AND BEVIN BEAUDET

TOTAL HOURS

PROFESSIONAL FEES

WILLIAM E SUNDSTROM 9.80
F MARSHALL DETERDING 1.50
ROBERT C BRANNAN 19.30

PROFESSIONAL SERVICES

TOTAL COSTS ADVANCED

TOTAL STATEMENT

30.60

$ 11,475.00

3,675.00
562.50
7,237.50

1,125.00

$ 1,125.00
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LAW OFFICES

SUNDSTROM & MINDLIN, LLP

2548 BLAIRSTONE PINES DR
TALLAHASSEE, FLORIDA 32301

F.E.l.# 59-2783536 (850) 877-6555 PLEASE REFER TO INVOICE NUMBER
WHEN REMITTING
FIRST COAST REGIONAL UTILITY, INC
301 CAPITAL PARTNERS, LLC
C/O AVERY C. ROBERTS JUNE 2, 2020
P.O. BOX 238 INVOICE # 57019
LAKE BUTLER, FL 32054 FILE # 48070-00001
PAGE 1

5/01/20

5/01/20

5/03/20
5/04/20

5/05/20

5/06/20

5/07/20
5/07/20
5/08/20

5/08/20

5/11/20

5/11/20

5/12/20

5/12/20

FMD

RCB

RCB
RCB

WES

RCB

FMD

RCB

WES

RCB

WES

RCB

WES

RCB

MATTER: ORIGINAL CERTIFICATE FROM PSC

" REVIEW DRAFT OF DIRECT TESTIMONY FOR CASE AND .70 262.50

MAKE EDITS; CONFERENCE RE: SAME.

WORK ON DIRECT PREFILED TESTIMONY OF ROBERT 4.00 1,500.00
KENNELLY, DEBORAH SWAIN AND BEVIN BEAUDET;

CONFERENCES WITH BOB KENNELLY REGARDING COMMENTS

TO HIS DRAFT TESTIMONY

REVIEW OF DISCOVERY REQUESTS FROM JEA 1.00 375.00
CONTINUE EDITING DIRECT PREFILED TESTIMONY AND 2.00 750.00
PREPARING EXHIBITS

BEGIN ASSEMBLING SPONSORS TO JEA DISCOVERY. 1.00 375.00
CONTINUE WORKING ON DIRECT PREFILED TESTIMONY; 3.70 1,387.50

BEGIN WORK ON GATHERING RESPONSES TO JEA'S
DISCOVERY REQUESTS

REVIEW SECOND DRAFT OF DIRECT TESTIMONY AND EDITS .70 262.50
TO SAME.

CONFERENCES WITH FPSC ATTORNEY TO DISCUSS 1.00 375.00
PROPOSED CONFERENCE BETWEEN THE PARTIES ON MAY 20

WORK ON RESPONSES TO JEA DISCOVERY. 1.50 562.50
ALL HANDS CONFERENCE CALL REGARDING JEA DISCOVERY 3.60 1,350.00

REQUESTS; WORK ON RESPONSES TO REQUESTS;

DISCUSSIONS WITH BEVIN BEAUDET

CONFERENCE CALLS WITH BEVIN BEAUDET AND DEBBIE 2.50 937.50
SWAIN RELATIVE TO REPLY TO JEA DISCOVERY;

DISCUSSION WITH DAVID HAAS RELATIVE TO ICI

VILLAGE/CITY OF JACKSONVILLE DEVELOPMENT ORDER.

PREPARE FOR AND PARTICIPATE IN CONFERENCE CALLS 4.00 1,500.00
REGARDING DISCOVERY REQUESTS BY JEA, TELEPHONIC

MEETING OF THE PARTIES AND THE FPSC, AND STRATEGY

MOVING FORWARD; CONTINUE WORKING ON DOCUMENTS TO

BE FILED WITH FPSC

CONVERSATION WITH PAUL HARDEN AND ATTORNEY T.A. .50 187.50
HAINLINE AT ROGERS TOWERS, COUNSEL TO ICI

VILLAGES, JEA COUNSEL FILING, ETC.

CONTINUE TO FINALIZE PREFILED TESTIMONY; 2.80 1,050.00
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LAW OFFICES

SUNDSTROM & MINDLIN, LLP

2548 BLAIRSTONE PINES DR
TALLAHASSEE, FLORIDA 32301

F.E.l.# 59-2783536 (850) 877-6555 PLEASE REFER TO INVOICE NUMBER
WHEN REMITTING

FIRST COAST REGIONAL UTILITY, INC

Invoice #: 57019 PAGE 2

CONFERENCE WITH FPSC STAFF ATTORNEY REGARDING
FORMAT AND EXHIBITS

5/13/20 WES PREPARE EXHIBIT AND DISCUSSION WITH DEBBIE SWAIN 1.50 562.50
AND BEVIN BEAUDET RE: SAME.

5/13/20 RCB CONTINUE WORKING ON PRODUCTION REQUESTS FROM JEA 4.00 1,500.00
AND PREFILED TESTIMONY

5/14/20 WES CONFERENCE CALL WITH AVERY AND MIKE RELATIVE TO .50 187.50
APPROACH TO JEA DUE TO CHANGE IN LEADERSHIP.

5/14/20 RCB CONTINUE WORKING WITH DENISE, DEBBY SWAIN AND 4.00 1,500.00

BEVIN ON THE EXHIBITS AND THE DISCOVERY REQUESTS;
DRAFTING AND EDITING INTERROGATORIES; FINAL
VERSION OF PREFILED TESTIMONY AND EXHIBITS
COMPLETED FOR FILING ON MAY 15
5/15/20 WES REVIEW PREFILED TESTIMONY AND SIGN OFF FOR 1.50 562.50
FILING; CONFERENCE CALL WITH DEBBIE SWAIN
RELATIVE TO HER DISCOVERY RESPONSES.

5/15/20 RCB WORK ON INTERROGATORY RESPONSES 2.50 937.50

5/18/20 WES DISCOVERY REVIEW FROM JEA DOCUMENT DUMP; 1.60 600.00

5/18/20 RCB WORK ON DISCOVERY REQUESTS FROM JEA 2.50 937.50

5/19/20 WES PREPARE FOR ALL HANDS CONFERENCE CALL BY THE FPSC 2.40 900.00
FOR MAY 20; FURTHER REVIEW OF JEA DOCUMENT DUMP.

5/19/20 RCB REVIEW RESPONSES FROM JEA TO CUR DISCOVERY 2.00 750.00
REQUESTS; CONFERENCES REGARDING SAME

5/20/20 WES PARTICIPATE IN CONFERENCE CALL WITH FPSC STAFF, 1.50 562.50
JEA, ETC; FOLLOW UP MEMO TO CLIENT RE: STATUS.

5/20/20 RCB PREPARE FOR AND PARTICIPATE IN CONFERENCE BETWEEN 3.20 1,200.00

THE PARTIES AND FPSC STAFF REGARDING STATUS OF
NEGOTIATIONS AND ISSUES OUTSTANDING; CONTINUE TO
WORK ON DRAFT INTERROGATORIES AND ADMISSIONS;
FORWARD COMPLETED FIRST DRAFTS FOR REVIEW AND
COMMENT
5/21/20 RCB DISCUSSIONS WITH DENISE HOWARD AND ROBERT 3.00 1,125.00
KENNELLY REGARDING THE DRAFT ADMISSIONS AND THE
DRAFT INTERROGATORY RESPONSES; WORK ON REQUEST
FOR PRODUCTION OF DOCUMENTS
5/25/20 RCB CONTINUE TO EDIT AND DRAFT RESPONSES TO JEA'S 3.00 1,125.00
DISCOVERY; COMPILE DOCUMENTS; FORWARD INITIAL
DRAFT TO EVERYONE FOR REVIEW AND COMMENT
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LAW OFFICES

SUNDSTROM & MINDLIN, LLP

2548 BLAIRSTONE PINES DR
TALLAHASSEE, FLORIDA 32301

(850) 877-6555 PLEASE REFER TO INVOICE NUMBER
WHEN REMITTING

FIRST COAST REGIONAL UTILITY, INC

Invoice #:

57019 PAGE 3

5/26/20

5/26/20

5/27/20

5/27/20

5/28/20

5/30/20

5/31/20

WES

RCB

WES

RCB

RCB

RCB

RCB

DISCUSSION WITH BRANNAN RELATIVE TO JEA DISCOVERY 2.00 750.00
REPLIES; CONFERENCE WITH AVERY ROBERTS RELATIVE

TO BAKER COUNTY; CONFERENCE WITH AVERY, MIKE

BRAREN AND PAUL HARDEN RELATIVE TO 301 LAND USE

AMENDMENT FILING.

REVIEW AND EDIT RESPONSES TO DISCOVERY PURSUANT 3.00 1,125.00
TO COMMENTS; CONFERENCE WITH DENISE HOWARD

REGARDING HOW TO ADDRESS CERTAIN SENSITIVE ISSUES

CONTINUE TO WORK ON DISCOVERY PRODUCTION; PREPARE 2.00 750.00
TALKING POINTS MEMO AND

CONTINUE TO WORK ON RESPONSES TO JEA'S DISCOVERY 2.00 750.00
REQUEST

WORK ON FINALIZING RESPONSES TO DISCOVERY BASED 2.60 975.00
ON COMMENTS RECEIVED FROM EVERYONE

WORK ON FINALIZING RESPONSES TO ADMISSIONS, 4.30 1,612.50
INTERROGATORIES AND REQUESTS FOR PRODUCTION FOR

FILING ON JUNE 1

FINALIZE RESPONSES TO INTERROGATORIES, ADMISSIONS 4.60 1,725.00
AND REQUESTS FOR PRODUCTION OF DOCUMENTS, ALONG

WITH DOCUMENTS TO BE PRODUCED, FOR FILING ON JUNE

1

TOTAL HOURS 82.70
PROFESSIONAL FEES $ 31,012.50
WILLIAM E SUNDSTROM 18.50 6,937.50
F MARSHALL DETERDING 1.40 525.00

ROBERT C BRANNAN 62.80 23,550.00
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LAW OFFICES

SUNDSTROM & MINDLIN, LLP

2548 BLAIRSTONE PINES DR
TALLAHASSEE, FLORIDA 32301

F.E.L# 59-2783536 (850) 877-6555 PLEASE REFER TO INVOICE NUMBER
WHEN REMITTING

FIRST COAST REGIONAL UTILITY, INC

Invoice #: 57019 PAGE 4
PROFESSIONAL SERVICES 1,800.00
TOTAL COSTS ADVANCED $ 1,800.00

TOTAL STATEMENT $ 32,812.50




Bevin A. Beaudet, P.E., LLC

babeaudet@gmail.com

B e
T

we?

BILL TO

William E Sundstrom PA
Sundstrom & Mindlin, LLP
2548 Blalrstone Pines Dr.
Tallahassee, FL 32301

DEGORPTION

Consuiting

Review and response to JEA interrogatories and document
production. Conference calls.

8evin A, Beaudst, P.E., LLC
1543 Maple St,
Bethlehem, PA 18107

Docket No. 20190168-WS
FCRU Document 1777

11/15/21 Supplemental Response to Staff 8th POD #26

INVOICE # 1154
DATE 06/01/2020
DUE DATE 07/01/2020
TERMS Net 30

Gy RYARE!

8 225.00 1,800.00

e -$.1},800.00
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LAW OFFICES

SUNDSTROM & MINDLIN, LLP

2548 BLAIRSTONE PINES DR
TALLAHASSEE, FLORIDA 32301

(850) 877-6555 PLEASE REFER TO INVOICE NUMBER
WHEN REMITTING

FIRST COAST REGIONAL UTILITY, INC
301 CAPITAL PARTNERS, LLC

C/0O AVERY C. ROBERTS JULY 6, 2020

P.O. BOX 238 INVOICE # 57064

LAKE BUTLER, FL 32054 FILE # 48070-00001
PAGE 1

6/01/20
6/01/20

6/02/20
6/02/20
6/03/20
6/04/20

6/04/20

6/05/20

6/05/20

6/09/20

6/09/20
6/10/20

6/10/20

WES
RCB

WES

RCB

RCB

WES

RCB

WES

RCB

WES

RCB
WES

FMD

MATTER: ORIGINAL CERTIFICATE FROM PSC

FINAL EDITS TO DISCOVERY BEFORE FILING. .50 187.50
WORK ON FINALIZING FILING OF DISCOVERY RESPONSES 6.00 2,250.00
TO JEA'S REQUESTS; EDIT AND MAKE COMMENTS TO

NOTICES AND OTHER DISCOVERY RESPONSES.

CONTINUE TO WORK ON DISCOVERY ISSUES. .50 187.50
BEGIN WORK ON FIRST SET OF INTERROGATORIES AND 2.00 750.00
DISCOVERY FROM THE FPSC.

DISCUSSIONS WITH BEVIN BEAUDET REGARDING HIS 1.00 375.00
RESPONSES TO DISCOVERY REQUESTS

CONVERSATION WITH BEVIN BEAUDET AND AVERY ROBERTS 1.50 562.50
RE: STATUS; SET ALL HANDS CONFERENCE CALL.

PREPARE FOR AND PARTICIPATE IN ALL HANDS 1.00 375.00
CONFERENCE CALL REGARDING THE STATUS OF THE CASE.

CONFERENCE CALL WITH PARTNERS AND PAUL HARDEN 2.20 825.00

RELATIVE TO CURRENT STATUS OF CASE, WITNESS LIST,

RECOMMENDED CONSULTANTS, ETC.; LENGTHY CONFERENCE

WITH SCOTT KELLY RELATIVE TO MATTER AND METHOD OF

PRESENTATION OF SETTLEMENT DISCUSSIONS AGAIN WITH

THE JEA.

ALL HANDS CONFERENCE CALL REGARDING STATUS OF 1.80 675.00
CASE, WITNESSES, ETC; CONFERENCE WITH BILL

SUNDSTROM REGARDING SCOTT KELLY AND SETTLEMENT

DISCUSSION WITH PAUL HARDEN RELATIVE TO MCELROY'S 2.80 1,050.00
FIRING OF JEA SENIOR LEADERSHIP; ATTEMPTING TO

SCHEDULE MEETING BETWEEN BEVIN BEAUDET, SCOTT

KELLY AND VICKIE CAVEY; FOLLOW UP DISCUSSION WITH

AVERY WHO CALLED; ADDITIONAL DISCUSSION WITH

BEVIN; RECEIPT OF NEW DISCOVERY FROM JEA AND

REVIEW OF SAME.

WORK ON RESPONSES TO JEA DISCOVERY 1.10 412.50
REVIEW LATEST DISCOVERY FROM JEA; EMAIL 1.00 375.00
DISCUSSION RE: HEAVY METAL MINING AND LAND

RECLAMATION; FOLLOW UP WITH BEVIN RE: GLOBALTECH.

LEGAL RESEARCH RE: EXEMPTION OF UTILITY; REVIEW 3.30 1,237.50
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LAW OFFICES

SUNDSTROM & MINDLIN, LLP

2548 BLAIRSTONE PINES DR
TALLAHASSEE, FLORIDA 32301

(850) 877-6555 PLEASE REFER TO INVOICE NUMBER
WHEN REMITTING

FIRST COAST REGIONAL UTILITY, INC

Invoice #:

57064 PAGE 2

6/10/20

6/10/20
6/11/20
6/12/20

6/12/20

6/13/20

6/15/20

6/15/20

6/17/20
6/18/20

6/18/20
6/22/20
6/23/20

6/23/20
6/24/20
6/25/20
6/25/20

RCB

RCB

RCB

WES

RCB

WES

WES

RCB

WES
WES

RCB
RCB
WES

RCB
RCB
WES
RCB

DOCUMENTS AND DEVELOPER APPROVAL AND CASE LAW AND

RULES AND STATUTES; EMAIL TO SUNDSTROM RE:

QUESTIONS; TELEPHONE CONFERENCE RE: SAME.

REVIEW JEA'S SECOND SET OF DISCOVERY REQUESTS; 1.00 375.00
DISCUSSIONS WITH BILL SUNDSTROM REGARDING THE

REQUESTS; DISCUSSIONS REGARDING HEAVY METAL

RECOVERY POST MINING

REVIEW AND DISCUSS FPSC'S SECOND SET OF DISCOVERY 1.60 600.00
REQUESTS; REVIEW GLOBALTECH'S QUALIFICATIONS.

REVIEW AND DISCUSS JEA'S SECOND SET OF .40 150.00
INTERROGATORIES

LENGTHY DISCUSSIONS WITH BEVIN BEAUDET RELATIVE .90 337.50
TO DISCOVERY ANSWERS, TIMING, ETC.

WORK WITH BEVIN BEAUDET AND DEBBY SWAIN REGARDING 1.50 562.50
RESPONSES TO DISCOVERY REQUESTS; EDIT AND REDRAFT

RESPONSES

FURTHER WORK WITH BEVIN BEAUDET RELATIVE TO 1.00 375.00

DISCOVERY; CONVERSATION WITH DEBBIE SWAIN RE:
SAME; EDIT BOB KENNELLY'S RESPONSE TO
INTERROGATORY NO. 35.

1.50 562.50
CALL TO SCOTT KELLY TO FORWARD CLIENT
INSTRUCTIONS.
REVIEW BEVIN BEAUDET'S DRAFT RESPONSES TO FPSC!'S 2.50 937.50
FIRST SET OF DISCOVERY REQUESTS; FINALIZE AND
FILE DIRECT TESTIMONY
CONTINUE TO WORK ON DISCOVERY REQUESTS. 1.50 562.50
CONTINUE TO WORK WITH BEVIN ON DISCOVERY 1.50 562.50
QUESTIONS AND ANSWERS.
CONTINUE TO WORK ON DISCOVERY RESPONSES 1.60 600.00
WORK ON FPSC DISCOVERY RESPONSES 2.60 975.00
CONTINUE TO WORK ON DISCOVERY; DISCUSSION WITH 1.50 562.50
SCOTT KELLY;
CONTINUE WORKING ON DISCOVERY RESPONSES 1.90 712.50
CONTINUE TO WORK ON DISCOVERY RESPONSES 2.60 975.00
CONTINUE TO WORK ON DISCOVERY. 1.50 562.50
CONTINUE TO WORK ON DISCOVERY RESPONSES AND 2.00 750.00
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LAW OFFICES

SUNDSTROM & MINDLIN, LLP

2548 BLAIRSTONE PINES DR
TALLAHASSEE, FLORIDA 32301

PLEASE REFER TO INVOICE NUMBER

(850) 877-6555 E
WHEN REMITTING

FIRST COAST REGIONAL UTILITY, INC
Invoice #: 57064 PAGE 3
CIRCULATE DRAFTS TO TEAM;
6/27/20 RCB CONTINUE TO EDIT AND INCORPORATE COMMENTS INTO 2.00 750.00
RESPONSES TO DISCOVERY REQUESTS
6/28/20 RCB WORK ON COMPILING ALL DOCUMENTATION NECESSARY FOR 3.00 1,125.00
REQUESTS TO PRODUCE
6/29/20 WES STATUS REPORT DISCUSSION WITH AVERY ROBERTS, 2.00 750.00
INCLUDING BAKER COUNTY COMP PLAN; ARRANGE ALL
HANDS CONFERENCE FOR JULY 7; FOLLOW UP DISCUSSION
WITH AVERY ROBERTS; CONVERSATION WITH BEVIN
BEAUDET RELATIVE TO DISCOVERY REQUESTS.
6/29/20 RCB WORK ON FINALIZING ALL RESPONSES AND DOCUMENTS TO 3.50 1,312.50
BE PRODUCED
6/30/20 WES REVIEW AMUC ANNUAL REPORT; EMAIL TO ALL PARTIES 2.00 750.00
RE: PREPARE FOR ALL HANDS DISCUSSION RE: BREAK
DOWN OF JEA CASE.
TOTAL HOURS 64.30
PROFESSIONAL FEES $ 24,112.50
WILLIAM E SUNDSTROM 21.90 8,212.50
F MARSHALL DETERDING 3.30 1,237.50
ROBERT C BRANNAN 39.10 14,662.50

PROFESSIONAL SERVICES

TOTAL COSTS ADVANCED

TOTAL STATEMENT

8,325.00

$ 8,325.00
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WadiNeN

Date

Date
Check Payable To QQ—V”WQT. B@C( Ldet, PE/Z—[C - $ L{m )
Charge To: Client ’H: (St COQ\ST Bill Client $
File No ‘ L.} KOO0 / (includes costs directly charged
) to the firm)
Date of Travel
Type of Expense Thyv | ’55
Special Instructions
[[] Checkif to be paid P e K% un
' from Trust Account T L ' 7 ;
7700 Signature
Needed By #5350




Bevin A. Beaudet, P.E,LLC

babeaudet@gmail.com

MY OICE
BILLTO

William E Sundstrom PA
Sundstrom & Mindlin, LLP
2548 Blairstone Pines Dr.
Tallahassee, FL 32301

DESCRIPTION

Cansuliing

Review and prepare response to interrogatories, POD's,
Coordinate with Scott Kelly and other team members.

Bevin A. Beaudet, P.E.
1643 Maple St.
Bethiehem, PA 18017

( Docket No. 20190168-WS

FCRU Document 1782

11/15/21 Supplemental Response to Staff 8th POD #26

INVOICE # 1155
DATE 07/01/2020
DUEDATE 07/31/2020

TERMS Net 30
18 225.00 4,050.00
BALANCE DUE
ALA $4,050.00
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CHECK RE Q1U1Eu@|’éﬁental Response to Staff 8th POD #26
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) S

Charge To: Client ___ . o Fl- ES7L C&@SL Bill Client $

File No ey eue) (includes costs directly charged
. ' ' to the firm)
Date of Travel

Type of Expense L IWO0 /

Special Instructions

[] Checkifto be paid o CCPWAJ///
from Trust Account R N vt

vNeede'd By :\j—/SBI?[Tj

Signature

Date
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Scott Kelly Consulting,LLC

241 OCEANWALK DRIVE SOUTH
Allantic Beach, FL 32233 US

+1 9048134349
scottkellyconsulling@gmail.com

First Coast Regional Utilities, Inc.

=1

DESCRIPTHON
Review Intetrogatories,

reports, and other filings

Phone Calls with Bevin
Beaudet and Brian Roche

€

e bl

(
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4.50

2.50

001
07/02/2020
Net 30
08/01/2020

225.00 1,012.50

225.00 562.50

$1,575.00




Docket No. 20190168-WS
FCRU Document 1785

11/15/21 Supplemental Response to Staff 8th POD #26

CAER+ d

Ag pepasaN
arnjeudrg

. : JUN020Y JSNIT, WI0X)

— ) PrdeaonpIn ]

AT

ucg .\@ w\&a\o\wd mN.T % Q\ﬂg\mxm_r\ suononIsu] reradg

Ky W@k @\ﬂu< CNMMDWQMQ asuadxy yo adAT,

. [PA®IL, JO a1e (]
(g sy Ow
wuwuwau Aposxp s1500 sapmpouy) 100408+ ‘ON 2Tt
jua q S : 3
Q0 TLCT $ O I | JZJ@QQ xx w_m% JUaYD (0], 98 xeY)
Q0 GLS .\ | $ ‘ ISS vﬁ % <\w\@3w _§\6~t\</_ O, 3[qeded }29Y)
[
TEE [ o

LSdN0dd XDAHD




Milial ‘'wain & A3sokéihés, In190168-WS
nd FECRU Document 1786

11115121 SugdéretdPrIDonsd ¥§- sth POD #26
Miami, Florida 33145

Tel.: 305-441-0123 Fax: 305-441-0688

www. miliamswain.com

Milian, Swain & Associates, Inc.

Civil Engineers @ Environmental Scientists & Engineers =4 Utility Management & Financial Consultants
INVOICE

William E. Sundstrom, P.A. Invoice Date:  June 1, 2020

Sundstrom & Mindlin, LLP Invoice Number: 44283

Attorneys at Law _ Page #1 Billing # 6

2548 Blairstone Pines Drive

Tallahassee, FL 32301

Re: First Coast Regional Utilities, LL.C
For Professional services rendered through May 29, 2020

Hours Rate Amount
Principal
Deborah Swain 7.00 225.00 1,575.00
Senior Staff Accountant
Cynthia Yapp 0.00 175.00 0.00
[Total For Iuvoice # 44283 $1,575.00|
Total Amount Due: ‘ o $1,575.00

Please make check payable to Milian, Swain & Associates, Inc .
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Order Time By:  Employee ID Milian, Swain & Associates Page 1
Order Expense By: Expense # Project: F16-01
Status: Ready Hold Billed Never Billed Period: 05/01/2020 — 05/31/2020
Project  Project Name . SJCtrl # SJinv#
PhasefTask/Employee Employee Name Dep Staff P/E Work Date  OVT ST STATE. Hours Worked  Billable Hours
F16-01 FCRU-New Certificate
DS . Deborah Swain FIN 001 05/01/2020 05/01/2020 N R . 0.50 0.50
[Preﬁled testimony : . ‘
DS Deborah Swain FIN 001 05/15/2020 05/15/2020 N R 6.25 ' 6.25
IDl'scovery, coordination conference, research for hearing ' : l
DS : Deborah Swain FIN 001 05/22/2020 05/22/2020 N . R 0.25 0.25
[Discovery, coordination communication l '
’ Subtotal Task . 7.00 7.00
Subtotal Phase 7.00 7.00
Total Project F16-01 . 7.00 7.00
Run Date: Jun 1, 2020 @ 16:07:14 TIMEEXPRPT.FRX
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CHECK REQUEST
| Date /\]*(QQ)OQ)@

Check Payable To Dﬁ;l /]@h _,SLO@JD i# mm . $ //&50@

Charge To: Client 71:7 ST Q?ﬁ Bill Client $

File No. L{—g@ N0 .6 | (includes costs directly charged
i to the firm)
Date of Travel

Type of Expense ___]- DV g 43 16

Special Instructions

Check if to be paid T }07(
] eck if to be pai SAE (< /f

from Trust Account T

T j [0l Signature
Needed By : :{—; 5 5 QLH’}

Date
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g A = j 1111528 ligseSuin desbsrre@easiaftigin POD #26

2025 S. W, 32" Avenue
Miami, Florida 33145
Tel.: 305-441-0123 Fax: 305-441-0688
www, millamswain.com

Milian, Swain & Associates, Inc,

Civll Engineers @  Environmental Scientists & Engineers @ Utility Management o Financial Consultants
INVOICE

William E. Sundstrom, P.A, Invoice Date: July 1, 2020

Sundstrom & Mindlin, LLP Invoice Number: 44316

Attorneys at Law Page #| Billing # 7

2548 Blairstone Pines Drive

Tallahassee, FL 32301

Re: First Coast Regional Utilities, LL.C
For Professional services rendered through June 26, 2020

Howr's Rate Amount
Principal
Deborah Swain 5.00 225,00 1,125.00
Senior Staff Accountant
Cyanthia Yapp 0.00 175.00 0.00
| Total For Invoice # 44316 $1,125.00|
Total Amount Due: $1,125.00

Please make check payable to Millan, Swain & Associates, Inc,
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Time/Expenses by Project Report

11/15/21 Supplemental Response to Staff 8th POD #26

Order Time By: Employee 1D Milian, Swain & Associates Page 1
Order Expense By: Expense # Project: F16-01
Status: Ready Hold Billed Never Billed Period: 06/01/2020 — 06/26/2020
Project  Project Name 8J Ctrl # Sdiavi#t
Phase/Task/Employee Employee Name Dep Staff P/E Work Date  OVT ST STATE Hours Worked  Billable Hours
F16-01 FCRU-New Certificate
bs Debaorah Swain FIN 001 06/05/2020 06/05/2020 N R 1.758 1.78
|Discovery, coordination communication |
DS Deborah Swain - FIN 001 06/12/2020 06/12/2020 N R 2.50 2.50
|Discovery, coordinalfon communication l
DS Deborah Swain FIN 001 08/19/2020 06/19/2020 N R 0.25 0.25
|Discovery, coordination communication |
DS Deborah Swain FIN 001  06/26/2020 06/26/2020 N R 0.50 0.50
|Discovery, coordination communication ]
Subtotal Task 5,00 5,00
Subtotal Phase 5.00 5,00
Total Project F16-01 5.00 5,00
Run Date:  Jul 1,2020 @ 11:02:26 TIMEEXPRPT.FRX
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LAW OFFICES

SUNDSTROM & MINDLIN, LLP

2548 BLAIRSTONE PINES DR
TALLAHASSEE, FLORIDA 32301

(850) 877-6555

FIRST COAST REGIONAL UTILITY, INC
301 CAPITAL PARTNERS, LLC

C/0O AVERY C. ROBERTS
P.O. BOX 238
LAKE BUTLER, FL 32054

PAGE

AUGUST 2,
INVOICE #
FILE # 48070-00001
1

PLEASE REFER TO INVOICE NUMBER

WHEN REMITTING

2020
57168

7/01/20
7/02/20
7/04/20

7/05/20

7/06/20

7/06/20

7/06/20

7/07/20

7/07/20

7/07/20

RCB
WES
WES

WES

WES

WES

RCB

WES

FMD

RCB

MATTER: ORIGINAL CERTIFICATE FROM PSC

CONTINUE TO WORK ON DISCOVERY RESPONSES.

REVIEW CASES ON ISSUES OF EXEMPTION.

REVIEW TESTIMONY AND EXHIBITS AS FILED BY THE
JEA; BEGIN PROCESS OF BREAKING DOWN CASE AND
PREPARING FOR ALL HANDS CONFERENCE CALL SCHEDULED
FOR TUESDAY, JULY 7TH.

CONTINUE WORKING ON FIRST COAST FILE; REVIEW
REBUTTAL TESTIMONY; CONTINUE TO PREPARE FOR ALL
HANDS CALL ON JULY 7TH.

DICTATE SUMMARIES OF THE TESTIMONY OF THE
PRINCIPAL WITNESSES OF THE JEA AND CIRCULATE TO
TEAM; BEGIN DEVELOPING MEMO OF THE PRIMARY ISSUES
AND OTHERWISE PREPARATION FOR ALL HANDS
CONFERENCE CALL TOMORROW.

CONTINUE RESEARCH RE: ISSUE OF EXEMPTION AND
DRAFT MEMO; REVIEW FOUR JEA TESTIMONIES OF
WITNESSES AND SUMMARIES OF SAME.

REVIEW DIRECT TESTIMONY OF JEA WITNESSES; BEGIN
WORKING ON REBUTTAL TESTIMONY; PREPARE FOR ALL
HANDS CONFERENCE CALL ON JULY 7; CONTINUE TO WORK
ON RESPONSES TO STAFF'S DISCOVERY REQUESTS.
PREPARATION FOR AND PARTICIPATION IN TWO HOUR
CONFERENCE CALL WITH BOB KENNELLY, DENISE HOWARD,
BEVIN BEAUDET, SCOTT KELLY AND DEBORAH SWAIN;
DRAFT NOTES TO FILE FOLLOWING CONFERENCE CALL AND
BEGIN OUTLINING MATERIALS FOR CROSS EXAMINATION
OF JEA WITNESSES; CONVERSATION WITH AVERY ROBERTS
RELATIVE TO BAKER COUNTY.

REVIEW TESTIMONY AND SUMMARIES IN PREPARATION FOR
CONFERENCE CALL; PARTICIPATE IN CONFERENCE CALL;
INTEROFFICE CONFERENCE RE: SAME.

CONTINUE TO PREPARE RESPONSES TO STAFF'S
DISCOVERY REQUESTS; WORK ON REBUTTAL TO JEA'S
DIRECT TESTIMONY; PREPARE FOR AND PARTICIPATE IN

.50

1,800.
187.
1,687.

1,312,

1,312.

1,237.

2,700.

1,875.

562.

2,625,

00
50
50

50

50

50

00

00

50

00
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LAW OFFICES

SUNDSTROM & MINDLIN, LLP

2548 BLAIRSTONE PINES DR
TALLAHASSEE, FLORIDA 32301

F.E.l# 59-2783536 (850) 877-6555 PLEASE REFER TO INVOICE NUMBER
WHEN REMITTING

FIRST COAST REGIONAL UTILITY, INC

Invoice #: 57168 PAGE 2

ALL HANDS CONFERENCE CALL.
7/08/20 WES CONTINUE TO ORGANIZE THOUGHTS AND THEMES BY 4.50 1,687.50

WITNESS IN PREPARATION FOR DEPOSITION OF JEA

WITNESSES; DEFENSE OF FIRST COAST WITNESSES AND

PREPARATION FOR FILING OF REBUTTAL TESTIMONY

WHICH IS DUE AT THE END OF THIS MONTH;

7/08/20 RCB FINALIZE RESPONSES TO STAFF'S DISCOVERY REQUESTS; 5.50 2,062.50
WORK ON REBUTTAL TESTIMONY; CONFERENCES WITH BILL
SUNDSTROM AND CONSULTANTS REGARDING REBUTTAL
TESTIMONY AND ISSUES TO BE ADDRESSED.

7/09/20 WES CONTINUE REVIEWING JEA'S CASE AND ORGANIZING 3.50 1,312.50
FILES FOR DRAFTING OF THE POSITION AND REBUTTAL

POSITIONS;

7/09/20 RCB FINAL EDITS TO RESPONSES 'S DISCOVERY 6.00 2,250.00
REQUESTS; FILING OF RESPONSES TO STAFF'S
DISCOVERY REQUESTS; CONTINUE TO WORK ON REBUTTAL
ISSUES.

7/10/20 WES DISCUSSIONS WITH AVERY ROBERTS, MIKE BRAREN, AND 2.50 937.50
BOB KENNELLY AS REGARDS THE TIMING OF THE FPSC
HEARING; CONTINUE TO ASSEMBLE INFORMATION IN
PREPARATION FOR MARATHON WEEKEND IN THE OFFICE.

7/10/20 RCB WORK WITH DEBBY SWAIN ON OUTLINE FOR REBUTTAL 4.70 1,762.50
TESTIMONY; RESEARCH ISSUES FOR ALL REBUTTAL
TESTIMONY

7/11/20 WES CONTINUE ASSEMBLING INFORMATION FOR BOB 1.00 375.00
KENNELLY'S REBUTTAL TESTIMONY.

7/12/20 WES EXPAND ON DIRECT TESTIMONY OF BOB KENNELLY; 2.00 750.00
REBUTTAL TESTIMONY FOR PAUL GANDY.

7/13/20 WES CONTINUE TO WORK ON REBUTTAL TESTIMONY FCR BOB 4.50 1,687.50

KENNELLY AND PAUL GANDY; FORWARD TESTIMONY TO
BOTH INDIVIDUALS; CONFERENCE CALL WITH AVERY
ROBERTS, MIKE BRAREN AND PAUL HARDEN RELATIVE TO
PROCEDURAL MATTERS, ETC.
7/13/20 RCB DRAFTING OF REBUTTAL TESTIMONY FOR BOB KENNELLY 5.70 2,137.50
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LAW OFFICES

SUNDSTROM & MINDLIN, LLP

2548 BLAIRSTONE PINES DR
TALLAHASSEE, FLORIDA 32301

(850) 877-6555 PLEASE REFER TO INVOICE NUMBER
WHEN REMITTING

Invoice #: 57168 PAGE 3
AND BEVIN BEAUDET; WORK ON DEBBY SWAIN'S
TESTIMONY .
7/14/20 WES CONVERSATION WITH TOM CRABB RELATIVE TO 3.50 1,312.50

7/14/20 RCB

7/15/20 WES

7/15/20 RCB

7/16/20 WES

7/16/20 RCB

7/17/20 WES

CONTINUANCE OF THE FPSC HEARING; CONTINUE TO WORK

ON PROCEDURAL MATTERS; DISCUSSION WITH DEBBIE

SWAIN; MULTIPLE EMAILS TO CLIENT.

CONTINUE TO WORK ON REBUTTAL TESTIMONY OF BOB 5.50 2,062.50
KENNELLY, BEVIN BEAUDET AND DEBBY SWAIN;

CONFERENCES WITH BILL SUNDSTROM REGARDING

PROCEDURAL MATTERS.

PREPARE ADDITIONAL REBUTTAL TESTIMONY FOR BEVIN 3.50 1,312.50
BEAUDET; CONFERENCE CALL WITH SCOTT KELLY AND

BEVIN BEAUDET RELATIVE TO INCLUSION OF

INFORMATION IN THEIR REBUTTAL TESTIMONY; RECEIPT

OF PICTURES OF THE AVE MARIA PLANT AND SECURE

LIST OF AWARDS OF AVE MARIA AND FORWARD SAME TO

ENGINEERING TEAM; DISCUSSION WITH DEBBIE SWAIN

RELATIVE TO IMPACT OF DEBT FINANCING VERSUS

EQUITY FINANCING; BRIEFING TO AVERY ROBERTS

RELATIVE TO ALL OF THE ABOVE; BRIEF DISCUSSION

WITH DENISE HOWARD RELATIVE TO MAPS.

CONFERENCE WITH DEBBY SWAIN REGARDING CHANGES TO 5.70 2,137.50
RATES DUE TO FINANCING WITH TAX EXEMPT REVENUE

BONDS; REFILE DISCOVERY THAT WAS NOT BATE

STAMPED; WORK ON TESTIMONY OF BEVIN BEAUDET;

DRAFT MOTION FOR STAY OF PROCEEDINGS

CONTINUE TO PREPARE TESTIMONY; DISCUSSIONS WITH 3.50 1,312.50
BEVIN BEAUDET RELATIVE TO COST; DISCUSSION WITH

DAVID HAAS AT ICI HOMES RELATIVE TO AFFIDAVIT OF

NON-DEDICATION, ETC.

REVIEW JEA MANAGEMENT PRESENTATION FROM DECEMBER 4.50 1,687.50
2019 FOR USE IN REBUTTAL TESTIMONY OF BEVIN

BEAUDET AND SCOTT KELLY; CONTINUE REFINING AND

DRAFTING REBUTTAL TESTIMONY

CONVERSATION WITH AVERY ROBERTS RELATIVE TO 6.50 2,437.50
FINANCING OPTIONS; CONVERSATION WITH ED BULLEIT

OF MBS CAPITAL MARKETS RELATIVE TO INDICATIVE

TERMS; ALL HANDS CONFERENCE CALL RELATIVE TO

PREPARATION OF TESTIMONY, STATUS OF CASE,

GRANTING OF EXTENSION OF HEARING DATE, ETC.;
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LAW OFFICES

SUNDSTROM & MINDLIN, LLP

2548 BLAIRSTONE PINES DR
TALLAHASSEE, FLORIDA 32301

(850) 877-6555 PLEASE REFER TO INVOICE NUMBER
WHEN REMITTING

~

FIRST COAST REGIONAL UTILITY, INC

Invoice #:

57168 PAGE 4

7/17/20

7/17/20

7/18/20

7/20/20

7/20/20

7/21/20

7/21/20

7/21/20

7/22/20

7/22/20

WES

RCB

WES

WES

RCB

WES

FMD

RCB

WES

FMD

FOLLOW UP DISCUSSIONS WITH BOB KENNELLY AND AVERY
ROBERTS;

CONTINUE TO WORK ON REBUTTAL TESTIMONY
OR PAUL GANDY, ETC.

REVIEW FIRST DRAFTS OF SEVERAL REBUTTAL 2.50 837.50
TESTIMONIES; PARTICIPATE IN CONFERENCE CALL RE:

SAME .

FINALIZE AND FILE MOTION FOR STAY OF PROCEEDINGS 6.40 2,400.00

WITH FLORIDA PUBLIC SERVICE COMMISSION; WORK ON
VARIOUS REBUTTAL TESTIMONY EXHIBITS AND TEXT; ALL
HANDS CONFERENCE CALL

REVIEW AND EDIT TESTIMONY OF PAUL GANDY, DEBBIE 3.50 1,312.50
SWAIN AND BEGIN WORKING ON TESTIMONY OF SCOTT

KELLY.

CONTINUE TO WORK ON TESTIMONY OF ROBERT KENNELLY, 6.80 2,550.00

BEVIN BEAUDET, PAUL GANDY AND SCOTT KELLY; BRIEF

CONVERSATION WITH BOB KENNELLY IN THIS REGARD;

SECURE LETTER FROM MBS CAPITAL MARKETS AS TO

INDICATIVE INTEREST RATE.

REVIEW AND EDIT REBUTTAL TESTIMONY OF PAUL GANDY; 4.80 1,800.00
REVIEW DRAFT OF TESTIMONY OF SCOTT KELLY; WORK ON

TESTIMONY OF BEVIN BEAUDET AND BOB KENNELLY

CONTINUE PREPARATION OF DIRECT TESTIMONY WITH 5.50 2,062.50
EMPHASIS ON PAUL GANDY AND SCOTT KELLY;

CONFERENCE RE: CONTINUANCE AND REBUTTAL; REVIEW 1.50 562.50
DRAFT OF KELLY TESTIMONY; PREPARE COMMENTS AND

SUGGESTIONS; INTEROFFICE CONFERENCE WITH

SUNDSTROM AND BRANNAN RE: SAME.

WORK ON REBUTTAL TESTIMONY FOR DEBBY SWAIN, BEVIN 4.80 1,800.00
BEAUDET, SCOTT KELLY AND BOB KENNELLY
CONTINUE TO WORK ON TESTIMONY, WITH EMPHASIS ON 3.50 1,312.50

SCOTT KELLY AND DEBBIE SWAIN, INCLUDING

DISCUSSIONS WITH SCOTT KELLY AND BEVIN BEAUDET.

REVIEW FIRST DRAFT OF ADDITIONAL REBUTTAL 1.60 600.00
TESTIMONIES; REVIEW SWAIN TESTIMONY; DRAFT

ADDITIONAL LANGUAGE AND SUGGEST CHANGES TO SWAIN

BY EMAIL; REVIEW BEAUDET TESTIMONY.
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LAW OFFICES

SUNDSTROM & MINDLIN, LLP

2548 BLAIRSTONE PINES DR
TALLAHASSEE, FLORIDA 32301

(850) 877-6555 PLEASE REFER TO INVOICE NUMBER
WHEN REMITTING

FIRST COAST REGIONAL UTILITY, INC

Invoice

#:

57168 PAGE 5

7/22/20
7/23/20

7/23/20

7/23/20

7/24/20

7/24/20

7/24/20

7/25/20
7/27/20

7/27/20

7/27/20

RCB
WES

FMD

RCB

WES

FMD

RCB

WES

FMD

RCB

RCB

CONTINUE WORK ON REBUTTAL TESTIMONY AND EXHIBITS 5.50 2,062.50
REVISE, REVISE AND REVISE TESTIMONY OF BEVIN 7.00 2,625.00
BEAUDET, SCOTT KELLY AND EDITS TO TESTIMONY OF

DEBBIE SWAIN; MULTIPLE CONVERSATIONS WITH BEVIN

BEAUDET AND SCOTT KELLY IN THIS REGARD; CONTINUE

TO PREPARE FOR ALL HANDS CONFERENCE CALL ON

FRIDAY.

REVIEW KENNELLY TESTIMONY; REVIEW EMAILS RE: 1.90 712.50
REVOCATION OF TERRITORY AND ABILITY TO SERVE AND

RESPOND RE: SAME; REVIEW SWAIN CHANGES AND EMAIL

AND MAKE OTHER SUGGESTIONS.

EDIT AND REVISE REBUTTAL TESTIMONY OF DEBBY 7.30 2,737.50
SWAIN, SCOTT KELLY AND BEVIN BEAUDET; REVIEW AND

DISCUSS PROPOSED EXHIBITS; PREPARE FOR ALL HANDS

CALL SCHEDULED FOR FRIDAY MORNING

HIT THE OFFICE AT 5:45 AM, FLAT OUT REVIEW AND 6.00 2,250.00
EDIT OF TESTIMONIES; PARTICIPATE IN ALL HANDS

CONFERENCE CALL RELATIVE TO GETTING TESTIMONY

READY FOR DISTRIBUTION TO THE TEAM FOR SEMI-FINAL

IN DEPTH REVIEW; CONVERSATION WITH PAUL HARDEN IN

THAT REGARD; FORWARD TESTIMONY TO FIRST COAST

TEAM FOR REVIEW AND CONSIDERATION PRIOR TO NEXT

SCHEDULED CALL FOR WEDNESDAY, JULY 29.

FINISH REVIEW OF BEAUDET TESTIMONY; MAKE 2.60 975.00
SUGGESTED CHANGES; PARTICIPATE IN CONFERENCE CALL

RE: ALL REBUTTAL TESTIMONY.

WORK ON EDITS AND REVISIONS TO REBUTTAL 6.00 2,250.00
TESTIMONY; PARTICIPATE IN ALL HANDS CONFERENCE

CALL REGARDING THE TESTIMONY; REVISE TESTIMONY

FOLLOWING CONFERENCE CALL AND CIRCULATE TO TEAM

FOR SIGN OFF EARLY NEXT WEEK.

CONTINUE TO WORK ON AND POLISH TESTIMONY; 1.00 375.00
DISCUSSION WITH PAUL HARDEN, ETC.

REVIEW LATEST OF REBUTTAL OF WITNESSES KENNELLY 2.60 975.00
AND BEAUDET; OFFER CHANGES TO BOTH.

RECEIVE AND REVIEW COMMENTS ON LATEST VERSION OF 6.50 2,437.50
REBUTTAL TESTIMONY; CONTINUE TO FINALIZE

TESTIMONY OF BEVIN BEAUDET AND EXHIBITS; REVISE

TESTIMONY CONSISTENT WITH COMMENTS

CONTINUE FINALIZING REBUTTAL TESTIMONY AND 5.00 1,875.00
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LAW OFFICES

SUNDSTROM & MINDLIN, LLP

2548 BLAIRSTONE PINES DR
TALLAHASSEE, FLORIDA 32301

(850) 877-6555 PLEASE REFER TO INVOICE NUMBER
WHEN REMITTING

FIRST COAST REGIONAL UTILITY, INC

Invoice

#:

57168 PAGE 6

7/28/20
7/29/20

7/29/20

7/29/20
7/30/20
7/30/20

7/31/20

7/31/20

RCB
WES

FMD

RCB

WES

RCB

WES

RCB

EXHIBITS; WORK WITH BEVIN BEAUDET TO FINALIZE HIS

TESTIMONY AND EXHIBITS

WORK ON FINAL EDITS TO REBUTTAL TESTIMONY 3.00 1,125.00
CONTINUE TO WORK ON SCOTT KELLY TESTIMONY; ALL 6.00 2,250.00
HANDS CONFERENCE CALL RELATIVE TO FINALIZATION OF

TESTIMONY FOR FILING; LAST REVIEW AND APPROVAL OF

TESTIMONY OF PAUL GANDY AND DEBORAH SWAIN;

MULTIPLE REVISIONS TO SCOTT KELLY AND SECURE THAT

IN FINAL FORM; RECEIVE SCOTT KELLY'S SIGN OFF FOR

FILING; DRAFT TIMETABLE PER OF DENISE HOWARD;

EMAILS TO PAUL HARDEN RELATIVE TO TIMING, ETC.

FINAL REVIEW OF REBUTTAL TESTIMONY OF SWAIN; 1.90 712.50
PARTICIPATE IN CONFERENCE CALL RE: FINALIZATION

OF REBUTTAL.

WORK WITH BOB KENNELLY TO FINALIZE AND DISCUSS 2.30 862.50
HIS REBUTTAL TESTIMONY

CONTINUE TO PREPARE FOR FILINGS; TWO DISCUSSIONS 2.30 862.50
WITH PAUL HARDEN, ETC.

WORK WITH BEVIN BEAUDET TO FINALIZE HIS TESTIMONY 3.00 1,125.00
AND EXHIBITS

FINAL REVIEW OF ALL TESTIMONY BEFORE FILING WITH 2.00 750.00
THE PSC; DISCUSSION WITH SCOTT KELLY RELATIVE TO

THE LAST REMAINING COMP PLAN ISSUE; TEXT TO PAUL

HARDEN IN THIS REGARD.

FILE ALL REBUTTAL TESTIMONY WITH FPSC AND HAVE 2.00 750.00
ALL TESTIMONY ACCEPTED; SEND COPIES TO ALL

PARTIES

TOTAL HOURS 228.20

PROFESSIONAL FEES $ 85,575.00
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LAW OFFICES

SUNDSTROM & MINDLIN, LLP

2548 BLAIRSTONE PINES DR
TALLAHASSEE, FLORIDA 32301

F.E.L# 59-2783536 (850) 877-6555 PLEASE REFER TO INVOICE NUMBER
WHEN REMITTING

FIRST COAST REGIONAL UTILITY, INC

Invoice #: 57168 PAGE 7
WILLIAM E SUNDSTROM 101.40 38,025.00
F MARSHALL DETERDING 13.60 5,100.00
ROBERT C BRANNAN 113.20 42,450.00

FEDERAL EXPRESS 163.16

PROFESSIONAL SERVICES 30,825.00

TOTAIL COSTS ADVANCED $ 30,988.16

TOTAL STATEMENT $ 116,563.16
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CHECK RE Qﬁ@’lguglerental Response to Staff 8th POD #26
| Date 7 / 35

1 [933
Check Payable To /Eﬁ\f”k /\V &QUCU}, PE | LC $ c{l(of[SGO/

. 1w
Charge To: Client T %TL Qﬁa«ml/ Bill Client $ _4 ). L1587
File No HEDr70: o] (includes costs directly charged
; to the fi
Date of Travel o the fizm)

Type of Eﬁpeﬁse aansul ﬁh{f @Qﬁ

Special Instructions

Check if to be paid “ T 77 @/

from Trust Account 6) e R ) Signature
Needed By ¥ 539 Qj

Date
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BevinA. Beaudet, P.E., LLC

babeaudet@gmail.com

INVOICE

BILLTO INVOICE # 1156
William E Sundstrom PA DATE 07/30/2020
Sundstrom & Mindlin, LLP DUEDATE 08/29/2020
2548 Blairstorie Pines Dr. TERMS Net 30

Tallahassee, FL 32301

Capsulting 3,600.00
Preparation of JEA Interrogatory Response

Cansulting o 22 225,00 4,950.00
Preparation of Rebuttal Testimony, Review of all Rebuttal

Testimony

Cansulting ‘ 5 225.00 1,125.00

Conference arid Coordination calls

1543 Maple:St.
Bethlehsm; PA 18017
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CHECK R E1@5@’1 frrglerrental Response to Staff 8th POD #26

Date _7 / 31
CheclgPayable To MC@/V\ , SLOCLU’LZ_ ‘A ssdc . [V\C ‘ $ 15, w3750
| Charge To: Client \!HAS”(/ OQCLS% Bill Client $ [5, L3756
File No. HUKO 70.0/( (includes costs directly charged
Date of Travel fo the fixm)
Type of Expense d@ﬂSw(ﬁhg/
Special Instructions

Check if to be paid @h

from Trust Account TEEARIAY -
~~~~~ Lo Signature

Needed By =
Date 453905
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Milian, Swain & Assbeiate§oucent 1801

11/15/21 SUpﬁﬁﬁg{a"'ﬁe.?QQm?‘it‘?eﬁtlalg 8th POD #26

Mianti, Flovida 33145
Tel,: 305-441-0123 Fax: 305-441-0688

i, niiliamswain.com

Milian, Swaln & Associates, Inc,

Civil Engineers @  Environmental Scientists & Engineers @ Utllity Management o Financial Consultants
INVOICE,

William E. Sundstrom, P.A. Invoice Date:  July 31, 2020

Sundstrom & Mindlin, LLP Invoice Number: 44344

Attorneys at Law Page #1 Billing # 8

2548 Blairstone Pines Drive

Tallahassee, FL 32301

Re: First Coast Regional Utilities, LL.C
For Professional services rendered through July 31, 2020

Hours Rate Amount
Principal
Deborah Swain 50.25 225,00 11,306.25
Senior Staff Accountant
Cynthia Yapp 24.75 175.00 4,331.25
Total Hours 75.00
|Total For Invoice # 44344 $15,637.50|
Total Amount Due: $15,637.50

Please make check payable to Milian, Swain & Associates, Inc
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Order Time By: Employee 1D Milian, Swain & Assoclates Page 1
Ovder Expense By: Expense # Project: F16-01
Status: Ready Hold Billed Never Billed Perfod: Q07/01/2020 — 07/31/2020

Project  Project Name SJ Ctrl # SdInv #

Phase/Task/Employee Employee Name Dep Staff PE Work Date  OVT ST STATE Hours Worked  Blllable Hours
F16-01 FCRU-New Certificate

cy Cynthia Yapp FIN 007 07/10/2020 0710/2020 N R 21,75 21.75
|Residential rate comparison |

cY Cynthla Yapp FIN 007 Q7/17/2020 07/17/2020 N R 2.25 2,25

7/14/2020: Review Swain Rebuttal testimony.

cY Cynthia Yapp FIN 007 07/24/2020 07/24/2020 N R 0.75 0.75
|Review NPV analysis l

DS Deborah Swaln FIN 001 07/03/2020 07/03/2020 N R 2,00 2.00

DS Deborah Swain FIN 001  07/10/2020 07/10/2020 N R 16.50 16.50
[Discovery, rebuttal, review prefiled JEA |

DS Deborah Swaln FIN 001 07A7/2020 07/17/12020 N R 18.00 18.00
|Discovery, rebuttal, raview, research |

DS Deborah Swaln FIN 001 07/24/2020 07/24/2020 N R 10.00 10.00
[Discovery, rebuttal, review, research |

DS Deborah Swain FIN 001  07/31/2020 07/31/2020 N R 4.75 4,75
{Rebultal, review, research ]

Subtotal Task 75.00 75.00

Subtotal Phase 75.00 75.00

Total Project F16-01 75.00 75.00

| = TETONN o TY 2N Ledd 24 NAAAN ZN AMND.0E

TIRAT IV ONOT 7 W
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C H E C K R E d/’@‘ZEngTmental Response to Staff 8th POD #26

Date _7 / 5%

Check Payable To &V,O'Hl b/u,ij CW\S(/L{h/Ij‘{ L,La $ 5/6l&c50
Charge To: Client Frst @M# Bill Client $ 5 ',5 (.50
: " File No 490'70. o/ (includes costs directly charged

' to the firm)
Date of Travel

Type of Expense Lanste H—L}bf Leo S
Special Instructions

Check if to be paid o m%f*

from Trust Account {77~ i« Lo ,

L B :J_'__@Q Q0. ’ Signature

Needed By :}1;53(7/)@

Date




Docket No. 20190168-WS
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Scott Kelly Consulting,LLC
241 OCEANWALK DRIVE SOUTH
Atlanilc Beach, FL 32233 US

+1 9048134349
seottkellyconsuiting@gmall.com

INVOICE
BILL TO INVOIGE 002
First Coast Regional Utllitles, Inc. DATE 07/31/2020
TERMS Net 30
DUE DATE 08/30/2020
DATE. o AcTvE
Consulting Rebuttal Testimony Preparation and
Research
Consulting Conference Calls with Sundstrom and 4.50 225.00 1,012.50
JEA
BALANGE DUE $5,512.50

Page 10f1




Billing Address:
SUNDSTROM FRIEDMAN FUMERO LLP

Docket No. 20190168-WS
FCRU Document 1805

Invoice Number \

[nvoiee DateP

CNRECamANaMbEPT 8th PODMEP

7-065-39877

Jul 14, 2020

2995-4609-8 10f3

Shipping Address:

voice Questions?

Inv
SUNDSTROM FRIEDMAN FUMERO LLP  Contact FedEx Revenue Services

2548 BLAIRSTONE PINES DR 2548 BLAIRSTONE PINES DR Phone: 800.622.1147
TALLAHASSEE FL 32301-5925 TALLAHASSEE FL 32301-5925 M-F7 AM to 8 PM CST
Sa 7AMto6PM CST
Internet:  fedex.com
Invoice Summary Account Summary as of Jul 14, 2020
dEx E Servi
FedEx Express Services Previous Balance 0.00
Total Charges ush $163.16
Payments 0.00
TOTAL THIS INVOICE usD $163.16 Adjustments 0.00
Other discounts may apply. New Charges 163.16
s New Account Balance $163.16
S
Detailed descriptions Of surcharges can be located at fedex.com
e ot |__IMVOiCe Number N[ Invoice Amount | _Account Number Account Balance \
E:gg:gdm"a;g‘c;fgj‘;ggg{gm . 7-065-39877 _'USD $1 63.16_ 2995-4609-8 USD $163.16

Remittance Advice

Your payment is due by Jul 29, 2020

?06539487730000163162299546096300001631620000163L620

0030356 01AB0.416 **AUTO T20 1195 32301-592548  -CO1-P30386-1

llllllllllllllllll"l”Ill“”lllll

SUNDSTROM FRIEBMAN FUMEROC LLP

2548 BLAIRSTONE PINES DR
TALLAHASSEE FL. 32301-5925

IR

52324950006115

BERICUNTR TR

prss

FedEx

AL

b et 8o e g e U

P.0. Box 660481

DALLAS TX 75266-0481

1

1195-01-00-0030356-0002-0059154




Docket No. 20190168-WS
FCRU Document 1806

Invoice Number \ [ Invoids DREPR APeG th PODb#26
7-065-39877 Jul 14, 2020 2995-4609-8 30of3

a fusl surcharge of 350% to this shipment.

+ Distance Based Pricing, Zone 2

Automation INET Sender Recipient

Tracking 1D 770809726441 Bifl Sundstrom Robert Kennely

Service Type FedEx Priority Overnight Sundstrom & Mindiin, LLP 12469 Wast State Road 100

Package Type FedEx Envelope 2548 BLAIRSTONE PINES DR LAKE BUTLERFL 32054 US

Zone 02 TALLAHASSEE FL 32301 US

Packages 1

Rated Weight N/A )

Delivered Jui 10, 2020 13:48 Transportation Charge 26.35
Svc Arsa A8 Fuel Surcharge 1.01
Signed by M.COVID DAS Extended Comm 3.60
FedEx Use 000000000/186/_ Total Charge

+ Fual Surcharge - FedEx has applied a fuel surcharge of 3.
« Distance Based Pricing, Zons 4
+ Package Delivered to Reciplent Address - Release Authorized

Automation INET Sender Recipient

Tracking ID 770910294776 Biil Sundstrom Scott Kelly

Service Type FedEx Priority Overnight Sundstrom & Mindlin, LLP 255 Evarnia Street

Package Type FedEx Envelope 2548 BLAIRSTONE PINES DR WEST PALM BEACH FL 33401 US

Zone 04 TALLAHASSEE FL 32301 US

Packages 1

Rated Waight N/A

Delivered Jui 10, 2020 11:54 Transportation Charge 38.90

Sve Area At Fuel Surcharge 1.52

Signed by see above Residantial Delivery 465

FedEx Use 000000000/208/02 Total Charge usb $45.07

Shipper Subtotal usbh $163.16

Total FedEx Express usb $163.16

1195-01-00-0030356-0001-0059153




Docket No. 20190168-WS

_ _ ECRII Dacument 1807
Invoice Number \ | Inveica BatgiendntdeeepsidNusbet st PoD #ee

7-065-39877 Jul 14,2020 2995-4609-8 20f3
FedEx Express Shipment Detail By Payor Type (Original)

¢+ Business Closed or Aduit Recipient Unavallable - Delivery Not Completed.
¢+ Distance Based Pricing, Zone 4
¢+ IstattemptJul 10, 2020 at 10:30 AM.

Automation INET Sender Recipient ——]
Tracking ID 770909652067 Bili Sundstrom Deborah Swain —
Service Type FedEx Priarity Overnight Sundstrom & Mindlin, LLP Milian, Swain & Assoc. —
Package Type FedEx Envelops 2548 BLAIRSTONE PINES DR 2015 SW 32nd Avenue foo—
Zone 04 ‘TALLAHASSEE FL 32301 US MIAMI FL. 33145 US —
Packages 1 ' =
Ratad Waight N/A —
Dslivered Jul 10, 2020 11:08 —
Svc Area Al Transportation Charge 38.90  mmm—
Signad by ASWAIN Fuel Surcharge 136 =——
FedEx Use Total Charge i usp —

+ Fuel Surcharge - FedEx has applied a fuel surcharge of 3.50% to this shipment.
¢+ Distance Based Pricing, Zone 5 .
+ Package Delivered to Recipient Address - Release Authorized

Automation INET Sender Recipient

Tracking ID 770909699216 Bill Sundstrom Bavin Beaudet

Sarvice Type FedEx Priority Overnight Sundstrom & Mindlin, LLP 1543 Maple Street

Package Type FedEx Envelope 2548 BLAIRSTONE PINES DR BETHLEHEM PA 18017 US

Zone 05 TALLAHASSEE FL 32301 US

Packages 1

Rated Weight N/A

Deliverad Jul 10, 2020 09:14 Transportation Charge 41.60
Svc Area Al Fuel Surcharge 1.62
Signed by see above Residential Delivery 4,65
FodEx Use 000000000/218/02 Total Charge usp $41.87

FedEx® Billing Online

FedEx Billing Online allows you to efficiently manage and pay your FedEx invoices online. It's free, easy and secure. FedEx
Billing Online helps you streamline your billing process. With all your FedEx shipping information available in one secure
online location, you never have to worry about misplacing a paper invoice or sifting through reams of paper to find
information for past shipments. Go to fedex.com to sign up today!

1195-01-00-0030356-0002-0059154




F.E.L# 59-2783536

Docket No. 20190168-WS
FCRU Document 1808
11/15/21 Supplemental Response to Staff 8th POD #26

LAW OFFICES

SUNDSTROM & MINDLIN, LLP

2548 BLAIRSTONE PINES DR
TALLAHASSEE, FLORIDA 32301

(850) 877-6555 PLEASE REFER TO INVOICE NUMBER
WHEN REMITTING

FIRST COAST REGIONAL UTILITY, INC
301 CAPITAL PARTNERS, LLC
C/O AVERY C. ROBERTS SEPTEMBER 1, 2020

P.O. BOX 238

INVOICE # 57195

LAKE BUTLER, FL 32054 FILE # 48070-00001

PAGE 1

8/03/20

8/06/20

8/10/20

g8/10/20

8/11/20

8/11/20

8/12/20

8/12/20

WES

RCB

WES

RCB

WES

RCB

WES

RCB

MATTER: ORIGINAL CERTIFICATE FROM PSC

PREPARE FOR AND CONFERENCE WITH TOM CRABB, ’ 4.00 1,500.00
ATTORNEY FOR THE JEA, RELATIVE TO TIMING,

POSSIBILITY OF SETTLEMENT, ETC. IN THE JEA VS

FCRU CASE; TWO CONVERSATIONS WITH BOB KENNELLY IN

THIS REGARD; DRAFTING OF MEMO TO THE PARTNERS

RELATIVE TO THE RESULTS OF MY CALL AND FORWARDING

TO THE PARTNERS AND CONSULTING TEAM; RESEARCH RE:

JEA WEBSITE RE: MAPS ABOUT SERVICE AREA;

DISCUSSION WITH SCOTT KELLY RELATIVE TO MAPS THAT

WE WILL NEED FOR HEARING.

REVIEW AND COMMENT ON DRAFTS OF MEMO REGARDING 1.00 375.00
DISCUSSIONS WITH JEA COUNSEL

BEGIN PREPARING SYNTHESIS OF THE CASE WHICH WILL 2.50 937.50
BE NEEDED IN ORDER TO TAKE DEPOSITIONS OF JEA

WITNESSES; DISCUSSION WITH BEVIN BEAUDET RE:

SAME .

NUMEROUS DISCUSSIONS WITH BEVIN BEAUDET 2.50 937.50
REGARDING ISSUES IN JEA PROTEST AND BEGIN LAYING

OUT CASE FOR HEARING AND DEPOSITIONS.

CONTINUE PREPARATION OF SYNTHESIS OF CASE AS 2.10 787.50
FILED IN PREPARATION FOR TELEPHONE MEETING ON

AUGUST 13;

CONTINUE TO WORK WITH BILL SUNDSTROM ON THE 2.50 $37.50
ISSUES IN THE CASE AND PREPARATION FOR

DEPOSITIONS, ETC

CONTINUE WORKING ON SUMMARY OF ENTIRE FIRST COAST 5.50 2,062.50
CASE; CONFERENCE CALL WITH AVERY ROBERTS AND PAUL

HARDEN RELATIVE TO THE IMPORT OF THE CITY OF

JACKSONVILLE/JEA FRANCHISE; FOLLOW UP DISCUSSIONS

WITH MIKE BRAREN AND THEREAFTER PAUL HARDEN IN

THIS REGARD; SUBSTANTIALLY FINISH FIRST DRAFT OF

SUMMARY AND PREPARATION FOR CONFERENCE CALL ON

AUGUST 13TH.

CONTINUE WORKING WITH BILL ON MEMO REGARDING THE 3.20 1,200.00




Docket No. 20190168-WS
FCRU Document 1809
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LAW OFFICES

SUNDSTROM & MINDLIN, LLP

2548 BLAIRSTONE PINES DR
TALLAHASSEE, FLORIDA 32301

F.E.I.# 59-2783536 (850) 877-6555 PLEASE REFER TO INVOICE NUMBER
WHEN REMITTING

FIRST COAST REGIONAL UTILITY, INC

Invoice #: 57195 PAGE 2

CASE; DISCUSSIONS REGARDING JEA FRANCHISE
8/13/20 WES FINALIZE MEMO RE THE STATUS OF THE CASE TO DATE; 3.00 1,125.00
TEAM CONFERENCE CALL RELATIVE AS TO NEEDED
EXHIBITS, STATUS OF CASE, PROCEDURE GOING
FORWARD, ETC.; PREPARE DRAFT LETTER TO PAUL
HARDEN RELATIVE TO THE JEA/COJ FRANCHISE ISSUE;
EDIT AND FORWARD TO MR. HARDEN.
8/13/20 RCB REVIEW AND COMMENT ON MEMO ON THE STATUS OF THE 2.30 862.50
CASE; ALL HANDS CONFERENCE CALL REGARDING
EXHIBITS, ETC; REVIEW AND COMMENT ON DRAFTS OF
LETTER TO PAUL HARDEN
8/14/20 RCB REVIEW FPSC STAFF'S THIRD SET OF INTERROGATORIES 2.00 750.00
AND REQUESTS FOR PRODUCTION OF DOCUMENTS; SEND TO
TEAM; BEGIN PUTTING TOGETHER RESPONSES
8/19/20 WES DRAFT LETTER TO PSC RELATIVE TCO NO MORE DELAYS 1.50 562.50
AND HOLDING FAST TO JANUARY HEARING; CONFERENCE
WITH AVERY ROBERTS, MIKE BRAREN AND PAUL HARDEN
RELATIVE TO CITY COUNCIL BEING LOBBIED HARD BY
THE JEA AND OUR RESPONSE THERETO; ETC.
8/19/20 RCB WORK ON LETTER WITH BILL SUNDSTROM TO PSC 2.50 937.50
REGARDING STATUS AND STICKING WITH REVISED
SCHEDULE FOLLOWING CONTINUANCE; CONFERENCES WITH
TEAM REGARDING RESPONSES TO DISCOVERY
8/20/20 WES MULTIPLE REVISIONS TO PAUL HARDEN LETTER; RECEIPT 2.00 750.00
OF CALL FROM AVERY AND MIKE; AND DISCUSSION OF
WHEN A FEE BECOMES A TAX, ETC.; BEGIN OUTLINING
INTERROGATORIES TO THE JEA.
8/20/20 FMD REVIEW SUNDSTROM INFO RE: CASES ON PSC .70 262.50
JURISDICTION AND OBTAIN AND SEND COPIES OF CASES
TO SUNDSTROM.
8/20/20 RCB WORK ON RESPONSES TO DISCOVERY; REVIEW AND 2.70 1,012.50
COMMENT ON DRAFTS OF LETTER TO PAUL HARDIN;
DISCUSSIONS REGARDING FEE AND TAX ARGUMENTS
8/24/20 WES REVISION OF JEA DISCOVERY; CONFERENCE WITH AVERY 1.80 675.00
ROBERTS AND MIKE BRAREN WHO CALLED; DRAFTING OF
REVISED LETTER TO PAUL HARDEN RELATIVE TO
JACKSONVILLE OGC CONFLICT OF INTEREST; FORWARD
LETTER TO HARDEN AND FOLLOW UP WITH AVERY
ROBERTS; DISCUSSION WITH DEAN MEAD LAW FIRM
RELATIVE TO DECLARATORY JUDGMENT/DECLARATORY




F.E.|.# 59-2783536

Docket No. 20190168-WS
FCRU Document 1810
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LAW OFFICES

SUNDSTROM & MINDLIN, LLP

2548 BLAIRSTONE PINES DR
TALLAHASSEE, FLORIDA 32301

(850) 877-6555 PLEASE REFER TO INVOICE NUMBER
WHEN REMITTING

FIRST COAST REGIONAL UTILITY, INC

Invoice #: 57185 PAGE 3
STATEMENT .
8/24/20 RCB WORK ON RESPONSES TO DISCOVERY REQUESTS; 2.80 1,050.00

8/25/20 RCB
8/26/20 RCB

8/27/20 WES

8/27/20 FMD

8/27/20 RCB
8/28/20 WES
8/28/20 FMD

8/28/20 RCB

8/31/20 WES

8/31/20 RCB

CONFERENCES WITH BEVIN BEAUDET AND DEBBY SWAIN;
REVIEW AND COMMENT ON DRAFT LETTER TO PAUL HARDIN

CONTINUE TO WORK WITH BEVIN BEAUDET AND DEBBY 3.00 1,125.00
SWAIN ON RESPONSES TO DISCOVERY REQUESTS

CONTINUE TO FINALIZE EXHIBITS AND TEXT FOR 2.70 1,012.50
RESPONSES TO STAFF'S DISCOVERY REQUESTS.

CONTINUE TO WORK ON DISCOVERY REQUESTS TO THE 2.50 937.50
JEA; ADDITIONAL LEGAL RESEARCH ON FRANCHISE FEES

AND TAX.

REVIEW DRAFT SECOND INTERROGATORIES; TELEPHONE 1.90 712.50

CONFERENCE; WORK ON SECOND REQUEST FOR PRODUCTION
OF DOCUMENTS; REVIEW FIRST REQUEST FOR PRODUCTION
OF DOCUMENTS; LEGAL RESEARCH RE: JURISDICTION
ISSUES WITH PSC AND FORWARD RESEARCH INFORMATION
TO SUNDSTROM.

EDIT AND REVISE DISCOVERY RESPONSES; CIRCULATE TO 3.00 1,125.00
TEAM FOR REVIEW.

CONTINUE TO WORK ON DISCOVERY REQUESTS. 1.50 562.50
FINALIZE SECOND REQUEST FOR PRODUCTION AND SEND 1.10 412.50

TO SUNDSTROM; REVIEW TEAM EMAILS RE: VARIOUS
JURISDICTIONAL ISSUES AND FRANCHISE FEES.

INCORPORATE TEAM'S COMMENTS AND EDITS TO 2.80 1,050.00
RESPONSES; FILE AND SERVE RESPONSES TO DISCOVERY

REQUESTS

COMPLETE AND FILE INTERROGATORIES AND REQUESTS TO 4.50 1,687.50

PRODUCE ON THE JEA RELATIVE TO PUBLIC SERVICE
TAX, FRANCHISE FEES, AND NOCATEE MATTERS;
CONFERENCE CALL WITH AVERY ROBERTS, MIKE BRAREN
AND PAUL HARDEN; )

MULTIPLE
DISCUSSIONS WITH JOHN WHARTON RE; MOTION TO
STRIKE JEA FRANCHISE; FOLLOW UP WITH BEVIN RE:
CSX RAILROAD CROSSING; FOLLOW UP WITH SCOT KELLY
RELATIVE TO PAUL MCELROY RELATIVE TO HIS COMMENTS
TO THE BOARD ABOUT THE FIRST COAST CASE.
CONFERENCES WITH JOHN WHARTON REGARDING STRATEGY 2.30 862.50
FOR STRIKING JEA'S CLAIM OF AN EXCLUSIVE
FRANCHISE; REVIEW DRAFT OF MOTION TO STRIKE;
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LAW OFFICES

SUNDSTROM & MINDLIN, LLP

2548 BLAIRSTONE PINES DR
TALLAHASSEE, FLORIDA 32301

F.E.l.# 59-2783536 (850) 877-6555

FIRST COAST REGIONAL UTILITY, INC

Invoice #: 57195 PAGE

PLEASE REFER TO INVOICE NUMBER
WHEN REMITTING

CONFERENCES REGARDING MOTION

TOTAL HOURS

PROFESSIONAL FEES

WILLIAM E SUNDSTROM 30.90
F MARSHALL DETERDING 3.70
ROBERT C BRANNAN 35.30

PROFESSIONAL SERVICES

TOTAL COSTS ADVANCED

TOTAL STATEMENT

69.90

$ 26,212.50

11,587.50

1,387.50

13,237.50

11,481.25

$ 11,481.25
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CHEZC K R E1<j5eﬂ EJ;SIeTental Response to Staff 8th POD #26

Date ?/«:{{ /QO

Check Payable To /\/W‘ SUJQJLM, Gg ASSGC/} Inc. $ f', ol 55
Charge To: Client F Q/(Q A Bill Client $ f, lo /oFl 50
File No 450 70.0 | (includes costs directly charged
' the fir
Date of Travel _ to the firm)
Type of Expense pf’é’@SSLO/’lQ/QS@V\/( co§
Special Instructions
Check if to be paid @__\
from Trust Account o A: | : Signature
Needed By A 200

Date #5383
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CHECK R ﬁ"ﬁ/ﬁ%{)gﬂ;ﬁntal Response to Staff 8th POD #26
Date Q ' 3 T QD
Check Payable To: \SOQ*H“ Aﬁlbj COQS&J%E{/ e s JO(Q;Q O\S

Charge To: Client Hst COQS’IC Bill Client $ | D&, )5
File No. Yoo 70.0/ : (includes costs directly charged
‘ to the firm)
Date of Travel

Type of Expense Inv. 003

Special Instructions

O Check if to be paid

from Trust Account - | ‘ (%{V M
Needed by #:53 & 02—3

Date




Scott Kelly Consulting,LLC

241 OCEANWALK DRIVE SOUTH
Allantic Beach, FL 32233 US

+1 8048134349
scoltkellyconsulting@gmall.com

Y

Flrst Coast Regional Utilitles, Inc.

HOTIITY

08/13/2020 Consuiting

Consulting

Docket No. 20190168-WS
FCRU Document 1814
11/15/21 Supplemental Response to Staff 8th POD #26

003
U 08/28/2020
e Net 30
CHT e 09/27/2020
DESCRIPTION 7 d
Conference Call 0.75 225.00 168.75
Calls, ressarch and review of various 4 225.00 900.00

documents

BRI U $1,068.75
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LAW OFFICES

SUNDSTROM & MINDLIN, LLP

2548 BLAIRSTONE PINES DR
TALLAHASSEE, FLORIDA 32301

F.E.L# 59-2783538 (850) 877-6555 PLEASE REFER TO INVOICE NUMBER
WHEN REMITTING

FIRST COAST REGIONAL UTILITY, INC
301 CAPITAL PARTNERS, LLC

C/O0 AVERY C. ROBERTS ‘ OCTOBER 4, 2020

P.O. BOX 238 INVOICE # 57223

LAKE BUTLER, FL 32054 FILE # 48070-00001
PAGE 1

MATTER: ORIGINAL CERTIFICATE FROM PSC

9/01/20 .WES 2.50 937.50
9/01/20 RCB 4.00 1,500.00
9/02/20 WES 1.50 562.50

DISCUSSION WITH SCOTT

KELLY RE: JEA BOARD MINUTES; FOLLOW UP WITH
COUNSEL FOR JEA RE: MOTION TO STRIKE.
9/02/20 RCB CONFERENCE CALLS WITH BEVIN BEAUDET AND SCOTT 4.00 1,500.00

KELLY REGARDING ZONING AND JEA BOARD MINUTES;

RESEARCH FRANCHISE ISSUES; COMPLETE RESEARCH ON

MASTER DEVELOPER AGREEMENT.
9/03/20 WES REVIEW FPSC DECISION IN THE MATTER OF PALM BEACH 2.20 825.00

COUNTY V8. SOUTH PALM BEACH UTILITIES; EMAIL TO

CLIENTS RELATIVE TO DEVELOPER AGREEMENT BETWEEN

301 PARTNERS AND FCRU; MULTIPLE DISCUSSIONS WITH

BEVIN BEAUDET AND SCOTT KELLY IN THAT REGARD;

REQUEST BRANNAN TO BEGIN DRAFTING DEVELOPER

AGREEMENT .

8/03/20 RCB BEGIN WORK ON MASTER DEVELOPER AGREEMENT. 3.50 1,312.50

9/04/20 WES FOLLOW UP WITH WHARTON RE: STAFF REACTION TO .50 187.50
MOTION TO STRIKE REFERENCES TO JEA FRANCHISE.

9/04/20 RCB DISCUSSION WITH JOHN WHARTON AND BILL SUNDSTROM .50 187.50
REGARDING MOTION TO STRIKE

9/08/20 WES RECEIPT AND ANALYSIS OF JEA'S MOTION FOR SUMMARY 2.50 937.50

DISPOSITION; DISCUSSION OF SAME WITH JOHN WHARTON
AND BOB BRANNAN.

5/08/20 RCB CONFERENCE WITH BILL SUNDSTROM AND JOHN WHARTON 2.30 862.50
REGARDING MOTION FOR SUMMARY DISPOSITION; REVIEW




Docket No. 20190168-WS
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LAW OFFICES

SUNDSTROM & MINDLIN, LLP

2548 BLAIRSTONE PINES DR
TALLAHASSEE, FLORIDA 32301

F.E.L# 59-2783536 (850) 877-6555 PLEASE REFER TO INVOICE NUMBER
WHEN REMITTING

FIRST COAST REGIONAL UTILITY, INC

Invoice #: 57223 PAGE 2
JEA MOTION.
9/09/20 WES 3.00 1,125.00
9/09/20 FMD REVIEW JEA MOTION FOR SUMMARY JUDGMENT. EMAIL TO 1.00 375.00
SUNDSTROM RE COMMENTS
9/09/20 RCB SEVERAL CONFERENCES WITH BILL SUNDSTROM, JOHN 2.70 1,012.50

WHARTON, BEVIN BEAUDET AND SCOTT KELLY REGARDING
SUMMARY MOTION.
9/10/20 WES ATTORNEY CONFERENCE CALL RE: RESPONSE TO JEA 4.50 1,687.50
DISPOSITIVE MOTION; BEGIN PREPARATION OF
RESPONSE; CONFERENCE WITH AVERY ROBERTS AND MIKE
BRAREN RE: SAME; BEGIN PREPARATION OF AFFIDAVIT
OF ROBERT KENNELLY.
9/10/20 FMD REVIEW VARIOUS DOCUMENTS IN PREP FOR CONF. CALL. 1.40 525.00
PARTICIPATE IN CC. REVIEW AFFIDAVIT AND
ATTACHMENTS AND COMMENT. REVIEW ADDED EMAILS
9/10/20 RCB NUMEROUS CALLS WITH COUNSEL AND CLIENTS REGARDING 3.80 1,425.00
JEA'S MOTION AND RESPONSE THERETO; WORK ON, EDIT
AND COMMENT ON DRAFT RESPONSE AND AFFIDAVIT OF
BOB KENNELLY.

9/11/20 WES 3.50 1,312.50
RECEIVE AND ANALYZE ADDITIONAL DISCOVERY
OM THE JEA; FORWARD DOCUMENTS TO CLIENTS AND
EXPERTS; COMPLETE KENNELLY AFFIDAVIT.
9/11/20 FMD REVIEW EMAIL RE TIMELINE FOR MOTION. REVIEW RULES 1.10 412.50
AND AGENDA SCHEDULE. PREPARE TIME ESTIMATE AND
CONFERENCE CALL WITH SUNDSTROM. REVIEW LATEST
DISCOVERY FROM JEA

9/11/20 RCB REVIEW AND COMMENT ON NEW DISCOVERY FROM JEA; 2.00 750.00
BEGIN RESPONSES FOR BOB KENNELLY
9/12/20 WES CONVERSATION WITH AVERY ROBERTS RE: STRATEGY; 2.50 937.50

PREPARE FIRST DRAFT OF MEMO DESCRIBING JEA ISSUE
FROM THE 30,000 FOOT LEVEL.

9/12/20 FMD REVIEW EMAILS RE PUD MODIFICATION .20 75.00
9/13/20 WES CONTINUE PREPARATION OF MEMO FOR AVERY ROBERTS, 1.00 375.00
ETC.

9/13/20 FMD REVIEW SEVERAL ADDITIONAL EMAILS RE COMP PLAN AND .40 150.00




F.E.|.# 59-2783536
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LAW OFFICES

SUNDSTROM & MINDLIN, LLP

2548 BLAIRSTONE PINES DR
TALLAHASSEE, FLORIDA 32301

(850) 877-6555 PLEASE REFER TO INVOICE NUMBER
WHEN REMITTING

FIRST COAST REGIONAL UTILITY, INC

Invoice #:

57223 PAGE 3

9/14/20 WES

9/14/20 RCB

9/15/20 WES

9/15/20 FMD

9/15/20 RCB

9/16/20 WES

9/16/20 RCB

9/17/20 WES
9/17/20 RCB
9/18/20 RCB

9/21/20 WES

9/21/20 RCB

JEA EXCLUSIVE FRANCHISE ISSUE

CONTINUE TO WORK ON RESPONSIVE TO JEA DISPOSITIVE 3.00 1,125.00
MOTION; CONVERSATION WITH BOB KENNELLY AND AVERY

ROBERTS; COMPLETE "SUMMARY DESCRIPTION OF WATER

AND WASTEWATER ISSUES" AS REQUESTED BY AVERY

ROBERTS AND FORWARD SAME, WITH ATTACHMENTS TO THE

PARTNERS.

REVIEW, EDIT AND COMMENT ON DRAFTS OF RESPONSE TO 2.00 750.00
JEA'S MOTION; REVIEW, EDIT AND COMMENT ON SUMMARY

OF WATER AND WASTEWATER ISSUES

REVIEW AND REVISE MOTION FOR PARTIAL SUMMARY 2.70 1,012.50
JUDGMENT;

BEGIN REVIEW OF MOTIONS AND DRAFT RESPONSE. 1.70 637.50
PARTICIPATE IN CONF CALL. FINISH REVIEW OF DRAFT

RESPONSE AND EMAILS . SEND COMMENTS TO WHARTON.

REVIEW MEMO FROM SUNDSTROM.

REVIEW, EDIT AND COMMENT ON DRAFT MOTION FOR 1.50 562.50
SUMMARY JUDGMENT
ALL HANDS CALL RELATIVE TO JEA'S LATEST ROUND OF 5.80 2,175.00

DISCOVERY; FOLLOW UP CALL WITH ENGINEERS RELATIVE
TO CONFIGURATION OF IRRIGATION SYSTEM,
ETAIL IRRIGATION
RATES, TWO FOLLOW CALLS WITH AVERY ROBERTS AND
ONE WITH ROBERT KENNELLY.
PREPARE FOR AND PARTICIPATE IN ALL HANDS CALL 4.00 1,500.00
REGARDING JEA'S LATEST DISCOVERY TO FCRU;
CONFERENCES WITH BEVIN BEAUDET AND SCOTT KELLY
REGARDING IRRIGATION SYSTEM AND UTILITY SET UP,
WATER USE PERMITTING, ETC.

CONFERENCE WITH BEVIN AND SCOTT RELATIVE TO 1.00 375.00
DISCOVERY REQUESTS.

CONFERENCES TO WORK WITH BEVIN BEAUDET AND SCOTT 1.00 375.00
KELLY ON JEA DISCOVERY RESPONSES.

WORK ON RESPONSES TO JEA DISCOVERY REQUESTS. 2.50 937.50
DISCUSSIONS WITH BEVIN RELATIVE TO DISCOVERY; 1.50 562.50

REVIEW SWAIN COMMENTS; FOLLOW UP WITH AVERY
ROBERTS WHO CALLED.
CONTINUE WORKING ON DISCOVERY; DISCUSSIONS WITH 1.00 375.00
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LAW OFFICES

SUNDSTROM & MINDLIN, LLP

2548 BLAIRSTONE PINES DR
TALLAHASSEE, FLORIDA 32301

F.E.l.# 59-2783536 (850) 877-6555 PLEASE REFER TO INVOICE NUMBER
WHEN REMITTING

FIRST COAST REGIONAL UTILITY, INC

Invoice #: 57223 PAGE 4

BEVIN AND SCOTT REGARDING THEIR RESPONSES.

9/22/20 WES PREPARE FOR AND PARTICIPATE IN DISCOVERY 2.50 937.50
CONFERENCE CALL; FOLLOW UP WITH CLIENTS AND
EXPERTS.

9/22/20 RCB WORK ON DISCOVERY RESPONSES; DISCUSSIONS 2.00 750.00

- REGARDING JEA FAILURE TO FOLLOW THROUGH ON
PROJECTS APPROVED, PERMITTED AND UNDERWAY.

9/23/20 RCB REVIEW JEA'S RESPONSE TO MOTION FOR PARTIAL .80 300.00
SUMMARY JUDGMENT.

9/24/20 RCB REVIEW AND COMMENT ON UPDATE LETTER TO FPSC .50 187.50

9/25/20 WES RECEIVE JEA'S MOTION TO DISMISS, ETC. FIRST COAST .60 225.00
PETITION AND CAREFULLY REVIEW SAME.

9/25/20 FMD REVIEW DISCOVERY FROM JEA RE BEAUDET TESTIMONY. .70 262.50

REVIEW CHAP 153 AND 180 FS. EMAIL TO SUNDSTROM RE
FURTHER DIRECTION

9/25/20 RCB REVIEW DRAFT RESPONSES TO JEA DISCOVERY FROM 1.00 375.00
BEVIN BEAUDET

9/26/20 WES CONFERENCE WITH WHARTON AND BRANNAN RELATIVE TO 1.00 375.00
JEA'S LATEST MOTION; BRIEF AVERY ROBERTS.

9/26/20 RCB CONFERENCE WITH BILL SUNDSTROM AND JOHN WHARTON 1.00 375.00

REGARDING RESPONSE TO JEA'S UPDATE TO THE FPSC
AND HOW TO RESPOND.

9/27/20 WES OUTLINE RESPONSE TO JEA'S LATEST MOTION; EMAIL TO 1.00 375.00
PAUL HARDEN IN THIS REGARD.

9/28/20 WES PREPARE FIRST, SECOND AND THIRD DRAFT OF REPLY TO 1.80 675.00
JEA MOTION TO DISMISS OR INDEFINITELY DELAY FIRST
COAST CASE.

9/28/20 FMD REVIEW DRAFT REPLY TO JEA ON MOTION AND JEA .60 225.00
ORIGINAL FILING.

9/28/20 RCB WORK ON RESPONSES TO JEA DISCOVERY 1.80 675.00

9/29/20 RCB WORK ON DRAFT RESPONSE TO JEA'S UPDATE TO FPSC 1.30 487.50
TOTAL HOURS 94.90

PROFESSIONAL FEES $ 35,587.50
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LAW OFFICES

SUNDSTROM & MINDLIN, LLP

2548 BLAIRSTONE PINES DR
TALLAHASSEE, FLORIDA 32301

F.E.L# 59-2783536 (850) 877-6555 PLEASE REFER TO INVOICE NUMBER
WHEN REMITTING

FIRST COAST REGIONAL UTILITY, INC

Invoice #: 57223 PAGE 5
WILLIAM E SUNDSTROM 44 .60 16,725.00
F MARSHALL DETERDING 7.10 2,662.50
ROBERT C BRANNAN 43.20 16,200.00
PROFESSIONAL SERVICES 30,465.50
TOTAL COSTS ADVANCED $ 30,465.50

TOTAL STATEMENT $ 66,053.00
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CHECK REQUEST
Date q GDZC‘ &&\W
Check Payable To b@@ A m@f{_(f / $ / (O,' LdSC 10

Charge To: Client A 7L CCK@S—/‘ ~ Bill Client $ / / O /0 P ()
File No Ll, 80 0.0 ] (includes costs directly charged
) 7 to the firm)
Date of Travel

Type of Expense N J03 20 5

Special Instructions
[[] Checkifto be paid o CE}Q{%
from Trust Account I ‘. [_ (91; &)BD =7 Signature
t‘ L ol N
Needed By ©®5 8@)

Date




Docket No. 20190168-WS

FCRU Document 1821
D E A N 11/15/21 Supplemental Response to Staff 8th POD #26
Dean, Mead, Egerton, Bloodworth, Capouano & Bozarth, P.A. 407-841-1200 Ortando
420 S, Orange Avenue, Suite 700 407-423-1831 Fax Fort Pierce
P.O. Box 2346 (ZIP 32802-2346) www.deanmead.com : Viera
Orlando, Florida 32801 Fed Tax 10# 53-2049716 Tallahassee
FIRST COAST REGIONAL UTILITIES, INC. September 23, 2020
ATTN: WILLIAM SUNDSTROM ID: 038587.074956
2548 BLAIRSTONE PINES DRIVE INVOICE # 373205
TALLAHASSEE, FL 32801 JLW

RE: JURISDICTIONAL ISSUE FOR DECLARATION

FOR PROFESSIONAL SERVICES RENDERED:

TOTAL FEES $16,628.00
ATTY CLASS HOURS RATE  AMOUNT
JLW Partner 37.10  390.00 14,469.00
HS* Other . 12,70 170.00 2,159.00

ATTY TOTALS 49.80 16,628.00

TOTAL CURRENT AMOUNT DUE $16,628.00

TOTAL AMOUNT DUE $16,628.00

THIS tINVOICE TS PAY ABLE PON R $OLHN

PLEASE RETURN THIS PAGE WITH YOUR REMITTANCE OR PAY INVOICES
ONLINE AT WWW.DEANMEAD.COM
WE ACCEPT VISA, MASTERCARD, DISCOVER, AND AMERICAN EXPRESS
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Dean, Mead, Egerton, Bloodworth, Capouano & Bozarth, P.A,

420 S. Orange Avenusg, Suite 700
P.O. Box 2348 (ZIP 32802-2346)
Orlando, Florida 32801

FIRST COAST REGIONAL UTILITIES, INC.

ATTN: WILLIAM SUNDSTROM

2548 BLAIRSTONE PINES DRIVE

TALLAHASSEE, FL 32801
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407-841-1200 Orlando
407-423-1831 Fax Fort Pierce
www.deanmead.com Viera

Fed Tax ID¥# 59-2049716

Tallahassee

September 23, 2020
ID: 038587.074956
INVOICE # 373205
JLW

RE: JURISDICTIONAL ISSUE FOR DECLARATION

FOR PROFESSIONAL SERVICE

DESCRIPTION

S RENDERED:

ITEMIZED ATTORNEY FEES

DATE ATTY

HOURS

- RATE

AMOUNT

CONTINUED REVIEW OF
DOCUMENTS AND
BACKGROUND AND .
RESEARCH REGARDING
BEST WAY TO PROCEED.

CONFERENCE CALL WITH
WES; PREPARATION FOR
SAME; CONTINUED
RESEARCH REGARDING
DIFFERENT OPTIONS FOR
SUMMARY RULING ON
JURISDICTIONAL ISSUE.

CONTINUED RESEARCH AND
CALLS WITH COCOUNSEL
REGARDING BEST WAY TO
PROCEED; BEGINNING
DRAFT OF MOTION.

FORMAT MOTION TO
STRIKE.

- SEVERAL DRAFTS OF
MOTION TO STRIKE AND
OTHER PLEADINGS
NECCESARY TO ENTER
CASE; SEVERAL CALLS AND

08/27/20 JLW

08/28/20 JLW

08/31/20 JLW

08/31/20 HS*

09/01/20 JILW

* SERVICES PROVIDED BY PARALEGAL OR LAW CLERK

3.30

2.80

4.40

0.50

3.50

350.00

390.00

390.00

170.00

390.00

1287.00

1092.00

1716.00

85.00

1365.00
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Dean, Mead, Egerton, Bloodworth, Capouano & Bozarth, P.A,
420 S, Orange Avenue, Suite 700

P.0. Box 2346 {ZIP 32802-2346)
Orlando, Florida 32801

FIRST COAST REGIONAL UTILITIES, INC,
038587.074956

September 23, 2020

Page 2

DESCRIPTION DATE
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407-841-1200
407-423-1831 Fax
www.deanmead.com
Fed Tax 1D# 59-2049716

ATTY HOURS

Orlando
Fort Pierce
Viera
Tallahassee

RATE AMOUNT

EMAILS REGARDING CASE
AND ISSUES; PREPARATION
FOR CONFERENCE CALL
AND PARTICIPATE IN
CONFERENCE CALL AND
ADDITIONAL SEARCH
REGARDING ISSUES THAT
AROSE ON CALL.

FORMAT AND FILE NOTICE 09/01/20
OF APPEARANCE; CONTINUE

TO FORMAT MOTION TO

STRIKE; FILE SAME; DRAFT

REQUEST FOR ORAL

ARGUMENT; FILE SAME.

CALL WITH JENNIFER 09/08/20
BRUBAKER AT PSC; REVIEW

FILING OF JEA; CALLS AND

EMAILS RE: SAME.;

RESEARCHING AND

DRAFTING RESPONSE.

RESEARCHING AND 09/10/20
DRAFTING RESPONSE TO

MOTION; CALLS, EMAILS,

AND REVIEW OF

DOCUMENTS RE: SAME;

PREPARATION FOR AND

PARTICIPATE IN

CONFERENCE CALL.

REVIEWING DISCOVERY 09/11/20
FROM JEA: RESEARCHING

MOTIONS AND RESPONSE;

LENGTHY CALL WITH STAFF

COUNSEL.

HS* 5.60

JLW 3.50

JLW 4.40

JLW 2.70

* SERVICES PROVIDED BY PARALEGAL OR LAW CLERK

170.00 952.00

390.00 1365.00

390.00 1716.00

390.00 1053.00




Dean, Mead, Egerton, Bloodworth, Capouano & Bozarth, P.A.

420 S. Orange Avenue, Suite 700
P.O. Box 2346 (ZIP 32802-2346)
Orlando, Florida 32801 -
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407-841-1200

407-423-1831 Fax
www.deanmead.com

Fed Tax ID# 59-2049716

FIRST COAST REGIONAL UTILITIES, INC,

038587.074956
September 23, 2020
Page 3

DESCRIPTION

DATE ATTY

HOURS

Orlando
Fort Pierce
Viera
Tallahassee

RATE AMOUNT

REVIEWING AFFIDAVIT;
CALLS AND EMAILS RE:
CASE;REVIEWING CASE
DOCUMENTS AND
BACKGROUND MATERIAL.

DRAFTING RESPONSE TO
MOTION FOR SUMMARY
JUDGMENT AND DRAFTING
MOTION FOR SUMMARY
JUDGMENT; NUMEROUS
CALLS AND EMAILS RE:
SAME.

TELEPHONE CONFERENCES
WITH COUNSEL REGARDING
RESPONSE; BEGIN TO
FORMAT SAME; COMPILE
DOCUMENTS THAT MAY
ACCOMPANY RESPONSE.

FINALIZE AND FILE MOTION
FOR SUMMARY ORDER;
RESOUND TO JEA MOTION;
CALLS AND EMAILS RE:
SAME.

CONTINUE TO FINALIZE
FORMAT RESPONSE;
GATHER DOCUMENTS TO
ACCOMPANY FILING; FILE
AND SERVE SAME.

ATTY

CLASS

09/12/20 JLW

09/14/20 JLW

09/14/20 HS*

09/15/20 JLW

09/15/20 HS*

SUBTOTAL:

HOURS

420

4.50

2.80

3.80

3.80

RATE

390.00 1638.00

390.00 1755.00

170.00 476.00

390.00 1482.00

170.00 646.00

$16,628.00

AMOUNT

JLW Partner

37.10

* SERVICES PROVIDED BY PARALEGAL OR LAW CLERK

390.00

14,469.00
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‘Dean, Mead, Egerton, Bloodworth, Capouano & Bozarth, P.A,
420 S. Orange Avenue, Suite 700

P.0. Box 2346 (ZIP 32802-2346)

Orando, Florida 32801

FIRST COAST REGIONAL UTILITIES, INC.
038587.074956
September 23, 2020
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407-841-1200 Orlando
407-423-1831 Fax Fori Plerce
www.deanmead.com Viera

Fed Tax ID# 59-2049716 Tallahassee

Page 4
ATTY CLASS HOURS RATE  AMOUNT
HS* Other 12,70 170.00 2,159.00
ATTY TOTALS 49.80 16,628.00
TOTAL CURRENT AMOUNT DUE $16,628.00
TOTAL AMOUNT DUE $16,628.00

* SERVICES PROVIDED BY PARALEGAL OR LAW CLERK
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CHECK R E/@R $pSental Response to Staff 8th POD #26
: Date __ 1O 3 OUOX )
Check Payable To: BﬂU-I HA.Bedﬁﬁd@l/plE/ LLC $ {(Q ?S A0

Charge To: Client Fi’f St OC&‘H’— Bill Client $ 9@ /)S o

. 7.0 (includes costs directly charged

File No. HROT0.0 . o e o)

Date of Travel
Type of Expense Tnv !/ /0/7
Special Instructions

[ Check if to be paid i‘L’“ I /(QNH/
from Trust Account ‘ “ s /
: 10230030 ~ Signature
HS38D

Needed by

Date




Bevin A. Beaudet, P.E,,11C

babeaudet@gmail.com

BILLTO

William E Sundstrom PA
Sundstrom & Mindlin, LLP
2548 Blairstone Pines Dr.
Tallahassee, FL 32301

SO THON

Cansulting

Research for Interrogatories, Writing Interrogatory

Responses, Conference Calls, Coordination Calls, Query
Calis

Bevin A, Beaudet, P.E., LLC BALANCE DU
1543 Maple St.

Bethlehem, PA 18017 ) . 7

Docket No. 20190168-WS
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INVOICE # 1160
DATE 09/30/2020
DUE DATE 10/30/2020
TERMS Net 30

Lo

225,00 9,675.00

$9,675.00
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CHECK R B4t EpfScFental Response to Staff 8th POD #26
Date /(-5 0D
Check Payable To: M Gan Sein s /ﬁ@c:frﬁp s I8 5.00

Charge To: Client Fjlﬁg‘f‘ 0/75(,8 T - Bill Client $ & L'L/>‘S 00 -
. . (includes costs directly charge
File No. HS070 D / } to the firm)
Date of Travel ' :
Type of Expense I hv G443 3
Special Instructions

[0 Check if to be paid _ | - (jp !
from Trust Account L _ Q /ff]L :
/O 30D Signature
Needed by ’ #5807

Date
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Milian, Swain & Assoclates, inc.

Docket No. 20190168-WS
FCRU Document 1829

11/15/Z7 Blppgental Respansks tesSial8th POD #26
2025 8. W, 32" Avenue
Miami, Florida 33145
Tel.: 3054410123 Fux: 3054410688

wiww miliamswain,.com

Civil Engineers v Environmental Scientists & Engineers o

Utility Management

Financial Consultants

INVOICE
William E, Sundstrom, P,A. Invoice Date: September 29, 2020
Sundstrom & Mindlin, LLP Invoice Number: 44423
Attorneys at Law Page #! Billing # 10
2548 Blairstone Pines Drive
Tallahassee, FL. 32301
Re: First Coast Regional Utilities, LL.C
For Professional services rendered through September 25, 2020
Howurs Raie Amount
Principal
Deborah Swain 11.00 225.00 2,475.00
Senior Staff Accountant
Cynthia Yapp 175.00 0.00
Total Hours 11.00
~_[Total For Invoice # 44423 $2,475.00]
Total Amount Due: $2,475,00

Please make check payable to Millan, Swain & Assoclates, Inc .
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44140104 Q 1 L1 +a-Qiaff. Qtkh DD HOA/
rrrrore UU’J'JIUI[TCIILGI I\CJPUIISC WotadnmoarroomTo —

Time/Expenses by Project Report
Ovder Time By: Employee ID Milian, Swain & Associates Page 1

Order Expense By: Expense ##
Status: Ready Hold Billed Never Billed

Project: F16-01
Period: 09/01/2020 — 09/25/2020

Project  Project Name sicul#  Sihw#
Phase/Task/Employee Employee Name Dep Staff P/E Work Date  OVT ST STATE IHours Worked  Billable Hours
F16-01 FCRU-New Certificate
DS Deborah Swain FIN 001  09/04/2020 09/04/2020 N R 0.25 0.25
|Discovery, coordination |
DS Deborah Swain FIN 001  09/11/2020 09/11/2020 . N R 0.75 0.75
IDiscove:y, coordination ]
DS Deborah Swain FIN 001 09/18/2020 09/18/2020 N R 7.50 7.50
[Discovely, coordinalion ]
DS Deborah Swaln FIN 001  09/25/2020 09/25/2020 N R 2.50 2.50
{~Discove:y, coordination 1
Subflotal Task 11.00 11.00
Subtotal Phase 11.00 11.00
Tolal Project F16-01 11.00 11.00

Run Date: Sep 29, 2020 @ 13:21:30

TIMEEXPRPT.FR
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Bevin A. Beaudet, P.E.,LLC

babeaudet@gmail.com

BILTO

William E Sundstrom PA
Sundstrom & Mindlin, LLP
2548 Blairstone Pines Dr.

INVOICE # 1157

DATE 08/29/2020
DUE DATE 09/28/2020

TERMS Net 30
Tallahassee, FL 32301
OIS HON gy o
Cansulfing 8 225.00 1,800.00
Conference calls, preparation and review of PSC Staff
Interrogatories

Bevin A. Beaudet, P.E,, LLC BALANCE DUE
1543 Maple St. P $ 1.,860‘00

Bethlehem, PA 18017
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%)25 S. . 32" Avenue
Miami, Florida 33145
Tel; 305-441-0123 Fax: 305-441-0688

www. millamswain.cont

Milian, Swain & Assoclates, Inc,

Civil Engineers  ©  Environmental Scientists & Engineers =] Utility Management o Financial Consultants
INVOICE

William E, Sundstrom, P.A, Invoice Date:  August 31, 2020

Sundstrom & Mindlin, LLP Invoice Number; 44374

Attorneys at Law Page #1 Billing # 9

2548 Blairstone Pines Drive

Tallahassee, FL 32301

Re: First Coast Regional Utilities, LL.C
For Professional services rendered through August 28, 2020

Hours Rate Anmount

Principal

Deborah Swain . 37.50 225.00 8,437.50
Senior Staff Accountant

Cynthia Yapp ~. - 1.00 175.00 175.00

Total Hours 38.50
| | Total For Invoice # 44374 $8,612.50
Total Amount Due: $8,612.50

Please make check payable to Milian, Swain & Associates, fnc.
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Time/Expenses by Project Report

11/15/21 Supplemental Response to Staff 8th POD #26

Order Time By: Employee ID Milian, Swain & Associates Page 1
Order Expense By: Expense # Project: F16-01
Status: Ready Hold Billed Never Billed Period: 08/07/2020 — 08/28/2020
Project  Project Name SJ Chl # Sdinv#
Phase/Task/Employee Employee Name Dep Staff P/E Work Date  OVT ST STATE Hours Worked  Billable Hours
F18-01 FCRU-New Certificate
cY Cynthia Yapp FIN 007 08/28/2020 08/28/2020 N R 1.00 1.00
Eirst Coast Discovery - Franchise Fee ]
DS Deborah Swain FIN 001  08/07/2020 08/07/2020 N R 0.25 0.25
Eoordlnation ]
DS Deborah Swain FIN 001 08/14/2020 08/14/2020 N R 31.00 31.00
Eoordinallon }
DS Debaorah Swain - FIN 001 08/21/2020 08/21/2020 N R 275 275
[D‘iscovery, coordination 1 '
DS Deborah Swain FIN 001 08/28/2020 08/28/2020 N R 3.50 3.50
Biscovery, coordination | ‘]
Subtotal Task 38.50 38.50
Subtolal Phase 38,50 38.50
Total Project F16-01 38.50 38.50

e

Run Date: Aug 31, 2020 @ 10:56:23

TIMEEXPRPT.FRX
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Check Payable ’fo BP,U"IY\ BﬁaudeJr.pr/ LT,

Docket No. 20190168-WS
FCRU Document 1834
pgle,T@ntal Response to Staff 8th POD #26

Date - /’(710 Q0D

s 1800

Charge To: Client H }’5% Con st Bill Client $
File No %L}?O 700 / (includes costs directly charged
: 7 to the firm)
Date of Travel

Type of Expense _— NV [15 :)

* Special Instructions

[ ] Checkifto be paid

from Trust Account

2000
H 53845

Needed By

Date

/

i ——

. U//Signature
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CHECK R E1€55f.2f Jyglefental Response to Staff 8th POD #26
pate __|0- NS

Check Payable To &bﬁ /%bi/ /) » (\OT&/ ﬁiﬁ? rjr?)(’ s | (Dg 150

Charge To: Client 7\’\/1 { S—’L COQ\SJL Bill Client $ / (Cg /) 5 0
File No. . Y&o70.0/) ' (includes costs directly charged
o the fir
Date of Travel to the firm) |

Type of Expense Thy 00 {7’*

Special Instructions
i id P
Check if to be pai ) //H“U/YY‘/
from Trust Account - Loy = = Sl ture
o oasaD [Sfppature
Needed By o 5388

Date




Scoft Kelly Consulting,LL.C
241 OCEANWALK DRIVE SOUTH
Allantic Beach, FL 32233 US

+1 8048134349
scotikellyconsulting@gmail.com

First Coast Regional Utilities, Inc.

AETIVTY

09/30/2020 Consulting
09/30/2020 Consulting

Conference Calls

Research

Docket No. 20190168-WS
FCRU Document 1836
11/15/21 Supplemental Response to Staff 8th POD #26

Qo4
: 10/03/2020
T Net 30
R 11/02/2020

4.50 225.00
3 225,00

1,012.50
675.00

$1,687.50
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LAW OFFICES

SUNDSTROM & MINDLIN, LLP

2548 BLAIRSTONE PINES DR
TALLAHASSEE, FLORIDA 32301

(850) 877-6555 PLEASE REFER TO INVOICE NUMBER
WHEN REMITTING

FIRST COAST REGIONAL UTILITY, INC
301 CAPITAL PARTNERS, LLC

C/0 AVERY C. ROBERTS NOVEMBER 7, 2020
P.O. BOX 238 INVOICE # 57323
LAKE BUTLER, FL 32054 FILE # 48070-00001
PAGE 1
MATTER: ORIGINAL CERTIFICATE FROM PSC
10/01/20 RCB WORK ON, EDIT AND COMMENT ON FIRST COAST'S 4.50 1,687.50

10/02/20 WES

10/02/20 RCB

10/03/20 RCB

10/04/20 WES

10/04/20 RCB

RESPONSE TO JEA'S MOTION TO STAY, ETC.;

CONFERENCE CALL WITH JOHN WHARTON AND BILL

SUNDSTROM TO DISCUSS RESPONSE AND STRATEGY GOING

FORWARD ON THIS ISSUE; CONTINUE TO WORK ON

COMPILING AND EDITING FIRST COAST'S RESPONSE TO

JEA'S THIRD INTERROGATORIES AND REQUESTS TO

PRODUCE.

PARTICIPATE IN ALL HANDS CALL RELATIVE TO JEA 3.00 1,125.00
DISCOVERY REQUESTS;

RESEARCH RE FRANCHISE FEES; SECOND CONFERENCE
CALL WITH BOB, BEVIN AND SCOTT RE NEW DISCOVERY

TO BE SERVED ON THE JEA; BRIEFING OF MIKE BRAREN.

CONTINUE TO WORK ON FINALIZING FIRST COAST 4.80 1,800.00
RESPONSE TO JEA'S THIRD INTERROGATORIES AND

REQUEST TO PRODUCE; CONFERENCES WITH BOB KENNELLY

REGARDING FINANCIAT, INFORMATION REQUESTED AND

WHETHER TO PROVIDE THE INFORMATION OR WAIT FOR

FPSC TO ISSUE A CONFIDENTIALITY ORDER; FINAL

EDITS AND FILING OF RESPONSE TO JEA'S MOTION TO

STAY ETC.

CONTINUE TO WORK ON RESPONSES TO JEA'S THIRD 3.40 1,275.00
INTERROGATORIES AND REQUESTS TO PRODUCE; RESEARCH

CASES THAT SUPPORT SOME OF BEVIN BEAUDET'S

PREVIOUS STATEMENTS AND TESTIMONY; CONFERENCES

WITH BILL SUNDSTROM REGARDING ISSUES TO BE

ADDRESSED.

RESEARCH FLORIDA CONSTITUTION AND STATUTES 1.00 375.00
RELATIVE TO BALANCED BUDGET PROVISIONS; EMAIL TO

TEAM RE RESPONSES TO JEA IN THIS REGARD.

CONTINUE TO WORK ON ISSUES WITH THE FIRST COAST 2.80 1,050.00
RESPONSES TO JEA INTERROGATORIES AND REQUESTS TO
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LAW OFFICES

SUNDSTROM & MINDLIN, LLP

2548 BLAIRSTONE PINES DR
TALLAHASSEE, FLORIDA 32301

F.E.1# 59-2783536 (850) 877-6555 PLEASE REFER TO INVOICE NUMBER
WHEN REMITTING

FIRST COAST REGIONAL UTILITY, INC

Invoice #: 57323 PAGE 2

PRODUCE; CONFERENCES WITH BILL SUNDSTROM TO
DISCUSS THE RESPONSES AND POTENTIAL ISSUES FOR
FIRST COAST'S NEXT DISCOVERY REQUESTS TO JEA.
10/05/20 RCB WORK ON FIRST COAST RESPONSES TO JEA DISCOVERY; 5.40 2,025.00
RECEIVE, REVIEW AND DISCUSS EDITS FROM TEAM
MEMBERS, EDIT RESPONSES AND INCLUDE NEW MATERIAL.

10/06/20 WES ALL HANDS CONFERENCE CALL RELATIVE TO DISCOVERY; 1.50 562.50
CONTINUE REVISIONS.
10/06/20 RCB CONTINUE WORKING ON DISCOVERY REQUESTS FROM JEA; 5.90 2,212.50

GATHER AND REVIEW DOCUMENTS AND RESPONSES FROM
TEAM AND COMPILE INTO RESPONSES; ALL HANDS
CONFERENCE CALL REGARDING DISCOVERY.

10/07/20 WES ATTORNEY STRATEGY CALL RE: NEXT STEPS AND MOTION 1.00 375.00
PRACTICE, ETC.
10/07/20 RCB CONFERENCE CALL WITH JOHN WHARTON AND BILL 4.80 1,837.50

SUNDSTROM REGARDING HOW TO MOVE FORWARD WITH
MOTIONS; CONTINUE FINALIZING RESPONSES TO JEA
DISCOVERY REQUESTS; WORK WITH BRONWYN ON
FORMATTING ISSUES ARISING FROM JEA DOCUMENTS TO
BE PRODUCED.
10/08/20 WES CONTINUE TC WORK ON DRAFT DISCOVERY. 2.20 825.00
10/08/20 RCB WORK ON FINAL EDITS AND ADDITIONS TO DISCOVERY 5.00 1,875.00
RESPONSES TO JEA; WORK ON DRAFT DISCOVERY
REQUESTS TO JEA WITH BILL SUNDSTROM
10/09/20 WES FINALIZE AND FORWARD DRAFT THIRD SET OF 1.50 562.50
INTERROGATORIES AND THIRD REQUEST TO PRODUCE TO
OUR TEAM; SCHEDULE CONFERENCE CALL FOR SATURDAY.
10/09/20 RCB FINALIZE RESPONSES TO JEA DISCOVERY REQUESTS AND 2.00 750.00
FILE WITH FPSC AND JEA, ETC; REVIEW AND COMMENT
ON FIRST COAST'S DRAFT THIRD INTERROGATORIES AND
REQUESTS TO PRODUCE TO JEA.
10/10/20 WES WORKING CONFERENCE CALL WITH BEVIN BEAUDET, SCOTT 2.00 750.00
KELLY AND BOB BRANNAN RELATIVE TO DRAFTING NEW
INTERROGATORIES AND REQUESTS TO PRODUCE TO THE
JEA; CONFERENCE WITH MIKE BRAREN AND AVERY
ROBERTS RELATIVE TO STATUS OF MATTER, ETC.
10/10/20 RCB PREPARE FOR AND PARTICIPATE IN CONFERENCE CALL 1.50 562.50
WITH BILL SUNDSTROM, BEVIN BEAUDET AND SCOTT
KELLY TO DISCUSS DRAFT INTERROGATORIES AND
REQUESTS TO PRODUCE TO JEA.
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LAW OFFICES

SUNDSTROM & MINDLIN, LLP

2548 BLAIRSTONE PINES DR
TALLAHASSEE, FL.ORIDA 32301

F.E.|# 59-2783536 (850) 877-6555 PLEASE REFER TO INVOICE NUMBER
WHEN REMITTING

FIRST COAST REGIONAL UTILITY, INC

Invoice #: 57323 PAGE 3

10/12/20 WES CONTINUE WORKING ON DISCOVERY AND FORWARD TO TEAM 3.50 1,312.50
FOR REVIEW AND REVISION.

10/12/20 RCB CONTINUE TO WORK WITH BILL SUNDSTROM ON DRAFT 5.50 2,062.50

DISCOVERY REQUESTS TO JEA; RESEARCH JEA FORMATION
AND JACKSONVILLE CITY CHARTER; BEGIN WORK ON
MOTION TO COMPEL TO JEA.

10/13/20 WES CONTINUE TO WORK ON DISCOVERY. RECEIPT AND 1.50 562.50
INCORPORATION OF COMMENTS FROM SCOTT KELLY.
10/13/20 RCB CONTINUE WORKING WITH BILL SUNDSTROM ON DRAFT 2.50 937.50

DISCOVERY TO JEA; RESEARCH ISSUES RELATIVE TO
MOTION TO COMPEL TO JEA.

10/14/20 WES CONTINUE TO WORK ON LATEST ROUND OF DISCOVERY TO 2.50 937.50
THE JEA. CONFERENCE WITH AVERY, MIKE AND PAUL.
10/14/20 RCB CONTINUE TO WORK ON DRAFT DISCOVERY WITH BILL 4.20 1,575.00

SUNDSTROM; CONFERENCES WITH SCOTT KELLY AND BEVIN
BEAUDET; CONTINUE LEGAL RESEARCH FOR MOTION TO
COMPEL TO JEA; BEGIN INITIAL DRAFT OF MOTION TO

COMPEL.
10/15/20 RCB WORK ON INITIAL DRAFT OF MOTION TO COMPEL TO JEA. 4.00 1,500.00
10/16/20 WES DISCUSSION WITH PAUL HARDEN. FINISH UP DISCOVERY 1.50 562.50
DRAFTS.
10/16/20 RCB CONTINUE TO WORK ON MOTION TO COMPEL, EDIT, 4.20 1,575.00

REVISE AND RESEARCH ISSUES; CONTINUE TO REVIEW,
EDIT AND COMMENT ON LATEST DRAFT OF DISCOVERY TO

JEA.

10/19/20 WES COMPLETE LATEST ROUND OF DISCOVERY AND PREPARE 2.00 750.00
FOR FILING; BRIEF DISCUSSION WITH AVERY ROBERTS.

10/19/20 RCB CONTINUE TO WORK ON AND FINALIZE MOTION TO COMPEL 5.60 2,100.00
AND CIRCULATE FOR COMMENTS AND DISCUSSION.

10/20/20 WES CONVERSATION WITH TOM CRABB, ATTORNEY FOR THE 1.50 562.50

JEA; FOLLOW UP DISCUSSIONS WITH MIKE BRAREN AND
AVERY ROBERTS; REVISE MOTION TO COMPEL
ACCORDINGLY.
10/20/20 RCB FINALIZE MOTION TO COMPEL AND FORWARD TO BILL 3.00 1,125.00
SUNDSTROM FOR CALL WITH TOM CRABB; REVISE MOTION
TO COMPEL TO ADDRESS ISSUES AND TENOR OF
CONFERENCE WITH TOM CRABB.
10/21/20 WES CONFERENCE CALL WITH AVERY ROBERTS, MIKE BRAREN 2.20 825.00

BRIEF REVIEW OF
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LAW OFFICES

SUNDSTROM & MINDLIN, LLP

2548 BLAIRSTONE PINES DR
TALLAHASSEE, FLORIDA 32301

F.E.l# 59-2783536 (850) 877-6555 PLEASE REFER TO INVOICE NUMBER
WHEN REMITTING

FIRST COAST REGIONAL UTILITY, INC

Invoice #: 57323 PAGE 4

JACKSONVILLE CITY CHARTER; BRIEFING TO BOB

KENNELLY .
10/21/20 RCB 2.00 750.00
10/22/20 RCB FINAL EDITS TO MOTION TO COMPEL AND FILING WITH 2.90 1,087.50
PARTIES AND FPSC.
10/26/20 WES .60 225.00
10/29/20 RCB  RECEIPT AND INITIAL REVIEW OF JEA'S RESPONSE TO 1.30 487.50
FIRST COAST MOTION TO COMPEL; PREPARE FOR
CONFERENCE CALL ON MONDAY NOVEMBER 2
TOTAL HOURS 102.90
PROFESSIONAL FEES ¢ 38,587.50
WILLIAM E SUNDSTROM 27.50 10,312.50
ROBERT C BRANNAN 75.40 28,275.00
PROFESSIONAL SERVICES 12,716.75
TOTAL COSTS ADVANCED $ 12,716.75

TOTAL STATEMENT $ 51,304.25
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CHECK R E%ﬂsﬁq furglerpental Response to Staif 8th POD #26
Date / / ‘ /) &O NG

Check Payable To $@// N 7AF R@Cﬁ/_,CbL, P(/'?/, LLC s |380.0D

Charge To: Client F—(— St CQQ.S'F Bill Client $ ’350 I
File No. L{—g ON0.0-/ (includes costs directly charged
Date of Travel to the firm)

Type of Expense Lhv ” le]

Special Instructions
Check if to be paid B f%&;%_
from Trust Account - Y — PYS——
A2 2030, gne
Needed By H S39

Date




Bevin A, Beaudet, P.E,, 11C

babeaudet@gmail.com

BILTO

William E Sundstrom PA
Sundstrom & Mindlin, LLP
2548 Blalrstone Pines Dr.
Tallahassee, FL 32301

DLBGRIPTION

Cansuliing

Reviewing and preparing PSC documents and
interrogatories, telephone calls

Docket No. 20190168-WS
FCRU Document 1842
11/15/21 Supplemental Response to Staff 8th POD #26

INVOICE # 1161
DATE 11/04/2020
DUEDATE 12/04/2020

Bevin A. Beaudet, P.E,, LLC

1543 Maple St, pa

i

Bethlehom, PA 18017 4:) s
LT et

TERMS Net 30
OTY AR DVACE IO
6 225.00 1,350.00

BALANCE DUE ‘
$1,350.00




Docket No. 20190168-WS
FCRU Document 1843

C H E C K R E 1655(31E1;§I3Tental Response to Staff 8th POD #26

- Check Payable To m ) J‘Qﬁ\/&cb/! N %@QP%%

Date

IS

$ 18£S 5

Frst Coast

Charge To: Client

Bill Client § {856 25

File No U 1.0/ (includes costs directly charged
; 7 to the fir ‘
Date of Travel © the firm)
Type of Expense BEaVa L‘rL}Ur(QL}
Special Instructions

Fola S

[] Checkiftobe paid

from Trust Account

Needed By #5320

Date

1[3:9050.

L

T Signature
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taff 8th POD #26
T1SI21 Sypplegrepia famngss i, Saf 6 POD #
Mianii, Florida 33145

=T i Tel.: 305-441-0123 Fax: 305-441-0688
Millan, Swain & Associates, Inc.

wivwsniliaiswain.com

Civil Engineers  «i  Environmental Scientists & Englneers ¢ Utility Management  « Financial Consultants
INYOICE

William E., Sundstrom, P.A. Invoice Date:  November 2, 2020

Sundstrom & Mindlin, LLP Invoice Number: 44464

Afttorneys at Law Page #1 Billing # 1

2548 Blairstone Pines Drive
Tallabassee, FL, 32301

Re: First Coast Regional Utilities, LL.C
For Professional services rendered through October 30,2020

Hours Rate Amount
Principal
Deborah Swain 8.25 225.00 1,856.25
Senior Staff Accountant
- Cynthia Yapp 175.00 0.00
Total Hours 8.25
|Total For Invoice # 44464 $1,856.25
Total Amount Due; $1,856.25

Please make check payable to Milian, Swain & Assoclates, Inc
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Time/Expenses by Project Report

Order Time By: Employee ID

FCRU Document 1845
11/15/21 Supplemental Response to Staff 8th POD #26

Millan, Swain & Associates Page 1
Order Expense By: Expense # Project: F18-01
Status: Ready Hold Billed Never Billed Period: 10/01/2020 — 10/30/2020
Project  Project Name SJ Gl # SJinvi
PhaselTask/Employee Employee Name Dep Staff P/E Work Date  OVT ST STATE Hours Worked  Billable Hours
F16-01 FCRU-New Certlficate
DS Deborah Swain FIN 001 10/02/2020 10/02/2020 N R 2.50 2.50
|-Discovery, coordination ]
DS Deborah Swain FIN 001 10/09/2020 10/09/2020 N R 4.00 4.00
|-Discovery, coordination ]
DS Deborah Swaln FIN 001  10/16/2020 10/16/2020 N R 1.28 1.25
i—Discove/y, coordination ]
DS Deborah Swain FIN 001 10/23/2020 10/23/2020 N R 0.25 0.256
|-Discovery, coordination ]
DS Deborah Swain FIN 001 10/30/2020 10/30/2020 N R 0.25 0.25
]—Dlscovefy, coordinalion ]
Subtolal Task 8.25 8.25
Sublotal Phase 8.25 8.256
Total Project F16-01 8.25 8.25

Run Date: Nov 2, 2020 @ 16:59:53

TIMEEXPRPT.FRX
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C H E C I( R E 61ﬁ1ﬁug)lefnental Response to Staff 8th POD #26
Date /O \S / Qzﬁ@

Check Payable To Scoth K@//L{ (\OFLSCL/A/S‘DQ/ L[(:— $ 33780
) J : '
Charge To: Client vr'/i ST OOC&STL Bill Client $
i:il e No L7L L0700/ (includes costs directly charged
; i to the firm) '
Date of Travel
Type of Expense
Special Instructions
Check if to be paid 4 B S W
from Trust Account /_L /; —0 0 7 " Signature

Needed By e \SBCfB

Date




Scott Kelly Consulting,LLC

241 QCEANWALK DRIVE SOUTH
Atlantic Beach, FL 32233 US

+1 9048134349
scoltkellyconsulting@gmall.com

First Coast Regional Utilities, Inc.,

ACTIVITY

Consulting

Docket No. 20190168-WS
FCRU Document 1847

WL E 005

DATE 10/31/2020

TERMS Net 30

DUE DATE 11/30/2020
DESCRIPTION oTY ELvn
Consulting services for month of 5.50 225.00 1,237.50
October

BALAMCE DUE $1,237.50

Fage 1o 1
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CHE CK R E'@QJ'BuShental Response to Staff 8th POD #26
Date / O ' @ L‘/‘&ﬁ Q@
Check Payable To: Dean Neade . s 931300

Charge To: Client IT:I\ o1 pﬁ@ﬁ— Bill Client $ 8 2 '7505
File No. 042670.0 ] (includes costs directly charged

to the firm)
Date of Travel .

Type of Expense :’jﬁ v/ 3 73 785

Special Instructions
[0 Check if to be paid o (“9%
from Trust Account - o A
T L A Signature
S (DAt &
Needed by - - ;
Date’ = 5\3 8@
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D E A N 11/15/21 Supplemental Response to Staff 8th POD #26
Dean, Mead, Egerton, Bloodworth, Capouano & Bozarth, P.A. 407-841-1200 Orlando

420 S. Orange Avenue, Sulte 700 407-423-1831 Fax Fort Pierce

P.0. Box 2346 (ZIP 32802-2346) www.deanmead.com Viera

Orlando, Florida 32801 Fed Tax ID4 59-2049716 Tallahassee

FIRST COAST REGIONAL UTILITIES, INC. October 20, 2020

ATTN: WILLIAM SUNDSTROM ID: 038587.074956

2548 BLAIRSTONE PINES DRIVE INVOICE # 373785
TALLAHASSEE, FL 32801 JLW

RE: JURISDICTIONAL ISSUE FOR DECLARATION

FOR PROFESSIONAL SERVICES RENDERED:

TOTAL FEES $8,273.00
ATTY CLASS HOURS RATE  AMOUNT
JLW Partner 19.60  390.00 7,644.00
HS* Other 370 170.00 629.00

ATTY TOTALS 23.30 8,273.00

PREVIOUS STATEMENTS OUTSTANDING

BILLED PAYMENTS BALANCE

INVOICE # 373205 September 23, 2020 16,628.00 0.00 16,628.00
TOTAL OUTSTANDING INVOICES: $16,628.00
TOTAL CURRENT AMOUNT DUE $24,901.00

THIS INVOICE [5 PAYABLE UPON RECEIPT,

PLEASE RETURN THIS PAGE WITH YOUR REMITTANCE OR PAY INVOICES
ONLINE AT WWW.DEANMEAD.COM
WE ACCEPT VISA, MASTERCARD, DISCOVER, AND AMERICAN EXPRESS
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D E A N 11/15/21 Supplemental Response to Staff 8th POD #26
Dean, Mead, Egerton, Bloodworth, Capouano & Bozarth, P.A, 407-841-1200 Orlando

420 S. Orange Avenue, Suite 700 407-423-1831 Fax Fort Pierce

P.0O. Box 2346 (ZIP 32802-2346) www.deanmead.com Viera

Orlando, Florida 32801 Fed Tax ID# 53-20497 16 Tallahassee

FIRST COAST REGIONAL UTILITIES, INC. October 20, 2020

ATTN: WILLIAM SUNDSTROM ID: 038587.074956

2548 BLAIRSTONE PINES DRIVE INVOICE # 373785
TALLAHASSEE, FL 32801 JLW

RE: JURISDICTIONAL ISSUE FOR DECLARATION

FOR PROFESSIONAL SERVICES RENDERED:

ITEMIZED ATTORNEY FEES

DESCRIPTION DATE ATTY HOURS RATE AMOUNT

REVIEW OF DISCOVERY; 09/16/20 JLW 0.90 390.00 351.00
REVIEWED PRIOR ORDERS

IN CASE RE: CRITICAL

DATES.

INITIAL FORMATTING OF 09/16/20 HS* 320 170.00 544.00
NOTICE OF RESPONSE TO

INTERROGATORIES; INITIAL

FORMATTING OF RESPONSE

TO THIRD SET OF

INTERROGATORIES 38-102;

INITIAL FORMATTING OF

RESPONSE TO SECOND

REQUEST FOR PRODUCTION

17-27.

REVIEW AND RESEARCH 09/22/20 JLW 1.50  390.00 585.00
JEA'S RESPONSE; CALLS

AND EMAILS REGARDING

SAME.

INITIAL REVIEW OF FILING 09/25/20 JLW 0.60  390.00 234.00
BY JEA;CALL WITH PSE
COUNSEL.

CONTINUED REVIEW OF 09/26/20 JLW 1.60  390.00 624.00
RESPONSE FILED
YESTERDAY AND

* SERVICES PROVIDED BY PARALEGAL OR LAW CLERK




DEAN
MEAD

Dean, Mead, Egerton, Bloodworth, Capouano & Bozarth, P.A.

420 S, Orange Avenus, Suite 700
P.O. Box 2346 (ZIP 32802-2346)
Orlando, Florida 32801

407-841-1200
407-423-1831 Fax

www.deanmead.com

Fed Tax ID# 59-20497 16

FIRST COAST REGIONAL UTILITIES, INC.

038587.074956
October 20, 2020
Page 2

DESCRIPTION

DATE ATTY

HOURS

Docket No. 20190168-WS
FCRU Document 1851
11/15/21 Supplemental Response to Staff 8th POD #26

Orlando

Fort Pierce

Viera

Tallahassee

RATE

AMOUNT

RESEARCH REGARDING
SAME; PREPARATION FOR
CONFERENCE CALL AND
CONFERENCE CALL WITH
COCOUNSEL.

REVIEWING PREFILED
TESTIMONY AND
ATTACHMENTS.

BEGINNING TO DRAFT
RESPONSE TO MOTION.

EDITING AND DRAFTING
RESPONSE TO JEA UPDATE;
EMAILS REGARDING SAME,;
CONFERENCE CALL RE:
SAME.

NUMEROUS CALLS AND
EMAILS; EDITING AND
COMPLETING RESPONSE TO
JEA'S FILING; FILE SAME.

RESEARCH RE: SANTA ROSA
CASE; EMAILS RE: SAME;

CALL REGARDING BEST
WAY TO PROCEED.

DRAFTING NOTICE OF
SUPPLEMENTAL
AUTHORITY; CALL WITH
WES.

DRAFT NOTICE OF
SUPPLEMENTAL
AUTHORITY; COMBINED
CASE REFERENCED INTO

09/27/20 JLW

09/28/20 JLW

10/01/20 JLW

10/02/20 JLW

10/05/20 JLW

10/07/20 JLW

10/08/20 JLW

10/08/20 HS*

* SERVICES PROVIDED BY PARALEGAL OR LAW CLERK

3.90

1.10

2.40

3.10

0.90

0.30

1.10

0.50

390.00

390.00

390.00

390.00

390.00

390.00

390.00

170.00

1521.00

429.00

936.00

1209.00

351.00

117.00

429.00

85.00
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Dean, Mead, Egerton, Bloodworth, Capouano & Bozarth, P.A. 407-841-1200 Orlando

420 S. Orange Avenue, Suite 700 407-423-1831 Fax Fort Pierce

P.0. Box 2346 (ZIP 32802-2346) www.deanmead.com Viera

Orlando, Florida 32801 Fed Tax 1D# 59-2049716 Tallahassee

"FIRST COAST REGIONAL UTILITIES, INC.

038587.074956
October 20, 2020
Page 3
DESCRIPTION DATE ATTY  HOURS RATE  AMOUNT
ONE DOCUMENT. o o
REVIEW AND EDIT 10/11/20 JLW 0.80  390.00 312.00
DISCOVERY
INTERACTING WITH STAFF 10/13/20 JLW 0.80  390.00 312.00
ON QUESTION RE: PUD
AMENDMENT; CALLS AND
EMAILS RE: SAME.
REVIEWING OUTSTANDING 10/14/20 JLW 0.60  390.00 234.00
DISCOVERY,
SUBTOTAL: $8,273.00

ATTY CLASS HOURS RATE AMOUNT

LW Partner 19.60  390.00 7,644.00

HS* Other 370 170.00 629,00

ATTY TOTALS 23.30 8,273.00
PREVIOUS STATEMENTS OUTSTANDING
BILLED PAYMENTS BALANCE

INVOICE# 373205 September 23, 2020 16,628.00 0.00  16,628.00

TOTAL OUTSTANDING INVOICES: $16,628.00

TOTAL CURRENT AMOUNT DUE $24,901.00

* SERVICES PROVIDED BY PARALEGAL OR LAW CLERK
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LAW OFFICES

SUNDSTROM & MINDLIN, LLP

2548 BLAIRSTONE PINES DR
TALLAHASSEE, FLORIDA 32301

(850) 877-6555

FIRST COAST REGIONAL UTILITY, INC
301 CAPITAL PARTNERS, LLC

C/0 AVERY C. ROBERTS
P.O. BOX 238
LAKE BUTLER, FL 32054

PAGE

PLEASE REFER TO INVOICE NUMBER

WHEN REMITTING

DECEMBER 6, 2020
INVOICE #
FILE # 48070-00001
1

57352

11/01/20

11/01/20

11/02/20

11/03/20

11/03/20

11/04/20

11/04/20

WES

RCB

RCB

WES

RCB

WES

RCB

MATTER: ORIGINAL CERTIFICATE FROM PSC

IMING THEREOF; CONFERENCE CALL WITH OTHER
MEMBERS OF THE LEGAL TEAM RELATIVE TO GETTING THE
PSC TO ACT ON THE VARIOUS MOTIONS NOW BEFORE IT,
ETC.

CONFERENCE WITH BILL SUNDSTROM AND JOHN WHARTON
REGARDING PSC STAFF ACTING ON MOTIONS; REVIEW OF
STAFF REPORT ON LAND USE AMENDMENT; WORK ON
DRAFTING AND EDITING FUTURE DISCOVERY REQUESTS.
PREPARE FOR AND PARTICIPATE IN CONFERENCE CALL
WITH JOHN WHARTON AND BILL SUNDSTROM REGARDING
STRATEGY FOR MOVING PSC STAFF TO RULE ON
OUTSTANDING MOTIONS.

REVISE DISCOVERY IN LIGHT OF JEA'S APPOINTMENT OF
A NEW EXECUTIVE DIRECTOR; EMAIL TO ENGINEERING
TEAM RELATIVE TO )

REVIEW STAFF REPORT ON THE LAND USE AMENDMENT
FROM BILL SUNDSTROM; CONTINUE TO WORK ON DRAFT
DISCOVERY REQUESTS.

REVISE DISCOVERY IN LIGHT OF HIRING OF NEW JEA
EXECUTIVE DIRECTOR; CONVERSATION WITH BOB BRANNAN
RELATIVE TO PREPARATION FOR CONFERENCE CALL WITH
BANKERS RELATIVE TO BOND FINANCING OF UTILITIES;
CONFERENCE WITH ED BULLEIT WHO CALLED IN THIS
REGARD; CONVERSATION WITH DEBORAH SWAIN TO
PREPARE FOR CALL.

CONTINUE TO REVIEW AND EDIT DRAFT DISCOVERY
REQUESTS TO JEA; CONFERENCE WITH BILL SUNDSTROM,
SCOTT KELLY AND JOHN WHARTON REGARDING DRAFT
DISCOVERY; CONFERENCE WITH BILL SUNDSTROM IN
PREPARATION FOR CALL ON BOND FINANCING;

1.50 562.50
RELATIVE TO THE
3.00 1,125.00
1.20 450.00
1.00 375.00
1.90 712.50
1.50 562.50
3.00 1,125.00
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LAW OFFICES

SUNDSTROM & MINDLIN, LLP

2548 BLAIRSTONE PINES DR
TALLAHASSEE, FLORIDA 32301

(850) 877-6555 PLEASE REFER TO INVOICE NUMBER
WHEN REMITTING

FIRST COAST REGIONAL UTILITY, INC

Invoice

#:

57352 PAGE 2

11/05/20

11/05/20

11/06/20

11/06/20

11/07/20

11/07/20

11/09/20

11/12/20

WES

RCB

WES

RCB

WES

RCB

RCB

RCB

CONFERENCE CALL WITH BILL SUNDSTROM DEBBY SWAIN,

ED BULLEIT REGARDING STRUCTURE AND STRATEGY FOR

BOND FINANCING OF UTILITY.

RESEARCH JACKSONVILLE PLANNING COMMISSION AGENDA; 2.00 750.00
DISCUSSION WITH THE LEGAL TEAM RELATIVE HOW TO

FORCE AN ORDER SETTING THE CASE FOR TRIAL OUT OF

THE PSC; CONFERENCE WITH ED BULLEIT AND BRETT

SEALY RELATIVE TO BOND FINANCING OF THE UTILITY;

REVIEW ENGINEER'S REPORT RELATIVE TO UTILITY COST

AND NUMBER OF UNITS IN PHASE ONE; PARTICIPATE IN

ALL HANDS CONFERENCE CALL RELATIVE TO FINANCING,

ETC.

CONFERENCE CALLS REGARDING BOND FINANCING OF 3.50 1,312.50
UTILITY; REVIEW OF PLANNING COMMISSION AGENDA;

CONFERENCE CALL WITH PSC COUNSEL TO DISCUSS

REVISED ORDER ON PROCEDURE AND DATES FOR HEARING,

ETC; CONFERENCE WITH BILL SUNDSTROM AND JOHN

WHARTON TO DISCUSS PLANNING COMMISSION STATUS.

CONFERENCE WITH PAUL HARDEN RELATIVE TO HIS 2.50 937.50
REVIEW OF PUBLIC RECORDS REQUESTS AND TIMETABLES

FOR FPSC HEARING; ARRANGE PSC STRATEGY CALL AND

ASSIGN DRAFTING OF MOTION TO JOHN WHARTON AND

COMMUNICATION WITH PSC ATTORNEY TO BOB BRANNAN.

EMAIL DISCUSSIONS WITH PSC COUNSEL TO DETERMINE 2.40 900.00
STATUS OF HEARING DATES; WORK ON EDITING DRAFT

DISCOVERY REQUESTS TO JEA.

ATTORNEY CONFERENCE CALL RELATIVE TO STATUS OF 1.50 562.50
MATTER FOLLOWING BOB'S EMAIL DISCUSSION WITH PSC

COUNSEL POSTPONING THE JANUARY HEARING DATE;

EMAIL TO CLIENT DESCRIBING THE SITUATION AND ITS

RAMIFICATIONS FOR 301 CAPITAL PARTNERS.

PREPARE FOR AND PARTICIPATE IN CONFERENCE CALL 1.50 562.50
WITH BILL SUNDSTROM AND JOHN WHARTON REGARDING

DISCUSSIONS WITH PSC COUNSEL AND POSTPONED

HEARING DATE.

REVIEW OUTSTANDING MOTIONS AND PREPARE LIST OF 3.90 1,462.50
DISPOSITIVE MOTIONS THAT COULD BE ADJUDICATED BY

PSC IN DECEMBER; PREPARE SUMMARY OF MOTIONS FOR

DISTRIBUTION TO TEAM.

PREPARE FOR AND PARTICIPATE IN CONFERENCE CALL 1.50 562.50
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LAW OFFICES

SUNDSTROM & MINDLIN, LLP

2548 BLAIRSTONE PINES DR
TALLAHASSEE, FLORIDA 32301

(850) 877-6555 PLEASE REFER TO INVOICE NUMBER
WHEN REMITTING

FIRST COAST REGIONAL UTILITY, INC

Invoice #:

57352 PAGE 3

11/13/20

11/14/20

11/14/20

11/16/20

11/17/20

11/18/20

11/19/20
11/19/20

11/20/20

11/20/20
11/21/20

11/21/20

RCB

WES

RCB

RCB

RCB

RCB

WES

RCB

WES

RCB

WES

RCB

WITH BILL SUNDSTROM AND JOHN WHARTON REGARDING

DISPOSITIVE MOTIONS TO BE HEARD BY PSC IN

DECEMBER

REVIEW, EDIT AND COMMENT ON DRAFT DISCOVERY 2.80 1,050.00
REQUESTS TO JEA; REVIEW NEW DISCOVERY REQUESTS

FROM PSC STAFF.

CAREFUL REVIEW OF DISCOVERY DRAFT DONE FIRST 2.50 837.50
COAST AND THE JEA ON FRIDAY, NOVEMBER 13;

CONFERENCE CALL WITH JOHN WHARTON AND BOB BRANNAN

IN THAT REGARD; EMAIL TO CLIENTS RELATIVE TO THE

NECESSITY OF EXPEDITIQUS RESPONSE TO STAFF

DISCOVERY; SCHEDULING OF ALL HANDS CONFERENCE

CALL, ETC.

CONFERENCE CALL WITH BILL SUNDSTROM AND JOHN 1.00 375.00
WHARTON TO DISCUSS NEW PSC DISCOVERY REQUESTS.

BEGIN DRAFTING, EDITING AND COORDINATING TEAM 3.00 1,125.00

MEMBERS TO DRAFT INITIAL RESPONSES TO PSC
DISCOVERY REQUESTS.

CONTINUE WORKING WITH TEAM MEMBERS ON DRAFTING 2.50 937.50
RESPONSES TO PSC DISCOVERY REQUESTS.
CONTINUE TO WORK WITH TEAM ON DISCOVERY 2.70 1,012.50

RESPONSES; EDIT AND REWRITE DRAFT RESPONSES;
REVISE DISCOVERY REQUESTS TO JEA BASED ON PSC
DISCOVERY REQUESTS.

WORK WITH BEVIN AND SCOTT ON RESPONSES TO STAFF 2.00 750.00
DISCOVERY.

CONTINUE TO WORK ON RESPONSES TO PSC DISCOVERY 3.50 1,312.50
REQUESTS

PREPARE FOR AND PARTICIPATE IN ALL HANDS CALL 2.50 937.50

RELATIVE TO STAFF DISCOVERY; FOLLOW UP WITH BEVIN
BEAUDET AND SCOTT KELLY.

PREPARE FOR AND PARTICIPATE IN ALL HANDS CALL ON 3.60 1,350.00
INITIAL DRAFT OF DISCOVERY REQUESTS FROM PSC.

WORK ON ANSWERS TO DISCOVERY; CONVERSATION WITH 1.30 487.50
PAUL HARDEN RE: SAME; FOLLOW UP WITH MIKE BRAREN.

EDIT, REWORK AND REDRAFT PORTIONS OF DISCOVERY 5.00 1,875.00

REQUESTS FOLLOWING ALL HANDS CONFERENCE CALL
REGARDING SAME; REVIEW CITY OF JACKSONVILLE CITY
CHARTER TO DETERMINE WHETHER IT HAS THE ABILITY
TO GRANT AN EXCLUSIVE FRANCHISE TO JEA; DRAFT




F.E.L# 59-2783636
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LAW OFFICES

SUNDSTROM & MINDLIN, LLP

2548 BLAIRSTONE PINES DR
TALLAHASSEE, FLORIDA 32301

(850) 877-6555 PLEASE REFER TO INVOICE NUMBER
WHEN REMITTING

FIRST COAST REGIONAL UTILITY, INC

Invoice #: 57352 PAGE 4

RESPONSE TO RESEARCH AND FORWARD TO BILL
SUNDSTROM.

11/23/20 WES REVIEW DRAFT REPLIES TO DISCOVERY; CONFERENCE 2.20 825.00
CALL RE: SAME; EMAIL DRAFT DISCOVERY RESPONSES TO
TEAM.

11/23/20 RCB CONTINUE TO WORK ON PSC DISCOVERY RESPONSES; 2.90 1,087.50
CONFERENCE CALL WITH BILL SUNDSTROM, JOHN WHARTON
AND SCOTT KELLY REGARDING SAME.

11/24/20 RCB REVIEW LATEST SUBMISSION FROM BEVIN BEAUDET TO 2.40 900.00
COMPLETE INITIAL DRAFT RESPONSES; REVIEW AND EDIT
TO CONFORM WITH OTHER RESPONSES.

11/25/20 RCB CONTINUE TO REVISE AND EDIT DISCOVERY RESPONSES 3.00 1,125.00
AS COMMENTS AND EDITS ARE FORWARDED FROM TEAM;
REWRITE PORTIONS OF DISCOVERY RESPONSES.

11/26/20 RCB CONTINUE TO WORK WITH TEAM MEMBERS REGARDING 3.30 1,237.50
DISCOVERY RESPONSES.

11/27/20 RCB WORK ON GETTING PSC DISCOVERY RESPONSES FINALIZED 4.00 1,500.00
AND CIRCULATED FOR ALL HANDS CALL AND
DISCUSSIONS.

11/28/20 WES CONFERENCE WITH BRANNAN AND WHARTON RELATIVE TO 2.00 750.00
FINALIZING RESPONSES TO STAFF DISCOVERY; MULTIPLE
REWRITES OF THE ANSWER.

11/28/20 RCB ALL HANDS CALL TO GO OVER LATEST VERSION OF 5.00 1,875.00
DISCOVERY RESPONSES TO PSC; PREPARE FINAL VERSION
OF RESPONSES FOLLOWING CALL.

11/30/20 WES SIGN OFF CONFERENCE CALL ON ANSWERS TO STAFF 1.10 412.50
DISCOVERY; REVIEW JEA'S ANSWERS TO STAFF,

11/30/20 RCB WORK WITH BRONWYN TO FINALIZE EXHIBITS TO PSC 3.50 1,312.50

DISCOVERY RESPONSES AND FINALIZE TEXT FOR FILING
AND SERVICE TO PARTIES; CIRCULATE AND OBTAIN
FINAL SIGN OFF PRIOR TO SERVICE; FILE AND SERVE
RESPONSES .

TOTAL HOURS 93.70

PROFESSIONAL FEES $ 35,137.50
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LAW OFFICES

SUNDSTROM & MINDLIN, LLP

2548 BLAIRSTONE PINES DR
TALLAHASSEE, FLORIDA 32301

F.E.L# 59-2783536 (850) 877-6555 PLEASE REFER TO INVOICE NUMBER
WHEN REMITTING

FIRST COAST REGIONAL UTILITY, INC

Invoice #: 57352 PAGE 5
WILLIAM E SUNDSTROM 23.60 8,850.00
ROBERT C BRANNAN 70.10 26,287.50
PROFESSIONAL SERVICES 11,673.00
SPECIAL PROJECT EXPENSE 91.41
TOTAL COSTS ADVANCED $ 11,764.41

TOTAL STATEMENT $ 46,901.91
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CHECK R E1Q156-1 funglofpental Response to Staff 8th POD #26
e 122020

Check Payable To JB&CL}’) /)’I)@C(I{ $ 3393.00
Charge To: Client Fjié F 0%97" Bill Client $ 339300
File No 4 ROT0. 4| (includes costs directly charged
‘ the fir
Date of Travel to the firm)

Type of Expense Ihir S /)5 Q4

Special Instructions
Check if to be paid R o (&(\J//L
from Trust Account ; i et = Ty
ST 5N ignature
Needed By = S3 139

Date
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D E A N 11/15/21 Supplemental Response to Staff 8th POD #26
Dean, Mead, Egerton, Bloodworth, Capouano & Bozarth, P.A, 407-841-1200 Ortlando

420 S. Orange Avenue, Suite 700 407-423-1831 Fax Forl Pierce

P.0. Box 2346 (ZIP 32802-2346) www.deanmead.com Viera

Orlando, Florida 32801 R Fed Tax ID# 59-2049716 Tallahassee

FIRST COAST REGIONAL UTILITIES, INC. November 17, 2020

ATTN: WILLIAM SUNDSTROM ID: 038587.074956

2548 BLAIRSTONE PINES DRIVE INVOICE # 375242
TALLAHASSEE, FL 32801 JLW

RE: JURISDICTIONAL ISSUE FOR DECLARATION

FOR PROFESSIONAL SERVICES RENDERED:

TOTAL FEES $3,393.00
ATTY CLASS HOURS RATE  AMOUNT
JLW Partner 8.70 350,00 3,393,00

ATTY TOTALS 8.70 3,393.00

PREVIOUS STATEMENTS OUTSTANDING

BILLED PAYMENTS BALANCE

INVOICE# 373785 October 20, 2020 8,273.00 0.00 8,273.00
TOTAL OUTSTANDING INVOICES: $8,273.00
TOTAL CURRENT AMOUNT DUE $11,666.00

THES INVOLCE 1S PAYABLE UPOM RECTEIUT.

PLEASE RETURN THIS PAGE WITH YOUR REMITTANCE OR PAY INVOICES
ONLINE AT WWW.DEANMEAD.COM
WE ACCEPT VISA, MASTERCARD, DISCOVER, AND AMERICAN EXPRESS

A Member of ALFA International - The Global Legal Network
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D A N 11/15/21 Supplemental Response to Staff 8th POD #26

E
E

Dean, Mead, Egerton, Bloodworth, Capouano & Bozarth, P.A. 407-841-1200 Orlando
420 S, Orange Avenue, Suite 700 407-423-1831 Fax Fort Pierce
P.0. Box 2346 (ZIP 32802-2346) www.deanmead.com Viera
Orlando, Florida 32801 Fed Tax IDi# 59-20497 16 Tallahassee
FIRST COAST REGIONAL UTILITIES, INC, November 17, 2020
ATTN:; WILLIAM SUNDSTROM ID: 038587.074956

2548 BLAIRSTONE PINES DRIVE INVOICE # 375242
TALLAHASSEE, FL 32801 JLW

RE: JURISDICTIONAL ISSUE FOR DECLARATION

FOR PROFESSIONAL SERVICES RENDERED:

ITEMIZED ATTORNEY FEES

DESCRIPTION DATE  ATTY  HOURS RATE  AMOUNT
REVIEW DISCOVERY AND 10/16/20 JLW 0.70  390.00 273.00
EMAILS REGARDING DRAFT.
CALL REGARDING STATUS 10/20/20 JLW 1.60 39000 624.00
AND PENDING MOTION;
REVIEW AND EDIT DRAFT
MOTION,
REVIEW JEA RESPONSE, 10/29/20 JLW 0.40  390.00 156.00
CONFERENCE CALL RE: 11/02/20 JLW 0.40  390.00 156.00
BEST WAY TO PROCEED.
CONFERENCE CALL RE : JEA.  11/02/20 JLW 0.60  390.00 234,00
REVIEWING DRAFT 11/04/20 JLW 0.50  390.00 195.00
DISCOVERY AND EMAILS
RE: SAME.
CONFERENCE CALL 11/06/20 JLW 0.60  390.00 234.00
REGARDING STATUS AND
BEST WAY TO PROCEED
AND NEED FOR MOTION TO
BE FILED; PREPARATION
FOR SAME.
REVIEW DOCUMENTS 11/07/20 JLW 1.10 39000 429.00
REGARDING BEST WAY TO

PROCEED AND IN

¥ SERVICES PROVIDED BY PARALEGAL OR LAWY CLERK
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D E A N 11/15/21 Supplemental Response to Staff 8th POD #26
Dean, Mead, Egerton, Bloodworth, Capouano & Bozarth, P.A. 407-841-1200 Orlando

420 S. Orange Avenue, Suite 700 407-423-1831 Fax Fort Pierce

P.O. Box 2346 (ZIP 32802-2346) www.deanmead.com Viera

Orlando, Florida 32801 Fed Tax ID# 59-2049716 Tallahassee

FIRST COAST REGIONAL UTILITIES, INC.
038587.074956

November 17, 2020

Page 2

DESCRIPTION DATE ATTY HOURS RATE AMOUNT

£

PREPARATION FOR
CONFERENCE CALL;
PARTICIPATE IN
CONFERENCE CALL.

REVIEWING MEMO ON 11/12/20 JLW 0.90  390.00 351.00
WHERE MOTIONS STAND
AND CONFERENCE CALL

REGARDING SAME.
REVIEW STAFF DISCOVERY 11/15/20 LW 1.90  390.00 741.00
TO JEA AND FIRST COAST;
PREPARATION FOR
CONFERENCE CALL AND
CONFERENCE CALL RE;
SAME; REVIEW
MEMORANDUM,
SUBTOTAL: $3,393.00
ATTY CLASS HOURS RATE AMOUNT
LW Partner 870  390.00 3,393.00
ATTY TOTALS 8.70 3,393.00
PREVIOUS STATEMENTS OUTSTANDING
BILLED PAYMENTS BALANCE
INVOICE# 373785 October 20, 2020 8,273.00 000  8273.00

TOTAL OUTSTANDING INVOICES: $8,273.00

TOTAL CURRENT AMOUNT DUE $11,666.00

* SERVICES PROVIDED BY PARALEGAL OR LAW CLERK
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CHECK REQUE

Check Payable To &( )N 7t ) B @/Jd et pg L

Docket No. 20190168-WS
FCRU Document 1862
u§plemental Response to Staff 8th POD #26

Date /(Q SQ}OK).O

s 399000

st (oagt

Charge To: Client Bill Client $ '
File No L} 8 O70 .0 / (includes costs directly charged
; to the firm)
Date of Travel
Type of Expense Ih yal (Q(/‘//
Special Instructions
Check if to be paid -
from Trust Account - 'L . -
152030 Signature
Needed By + 536]@ )

Date
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FCRU Document 1863
11/15/21 Supplemental Response to Staff 8th POD #26
Bevin A. Beaudet, P.E., LLC PP P

babeaudet@gmail.com

INVOICE

BLLTO INVOICE # 1164
William E Sundstrom PA DATE 12/01/2020
Sundstrom & Mindlin, LLP DUE DATE 12/31/2020
2548 Blairstone Pines Dr. TERMS Net 30

Tallahassee, FL. 32301

DESCRIPTION aTy

RATE ARICUNT
Cansulting 22 225.00 4,850.00
Conference calls, coordination calls with team membars,
write, review and edit interrogatory responses
Bevin A. Beaudet, P.E.,, LLC BALANCE DUE $ 4
1543 Maple St. 950.00

Bethlehem, PA 18017 /é”h//é“%/
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CHE CK RE (JPEgrmental Response to Statf 8th POD #26
Date / & 5 ' JD&D

Check Payable To % (/l an ,S(A)Q I h J{\U?A}SS?‘\(\/I@ f@;fm $ 0?3.//?5@

Charge To: Client ST (bast- Bill Client $
File No. 0y 670 0 / (includes costs directly charged
the fir:
Date of Travel to the firm)

Type of Expense V. L‘F 4 Lf' 9 /\/4

Special Instructions
Check if to be paid : (\9 (\ /‘
from Trust Account [dS: &D&O Signature
q
Needed By it:55 io /7

Date




Docket No. 20190168-WS
1 dBligly S & ¢4 é‘é@%’n"fe%ﬁtﬁ? ot | F?gtD1 232
2025 8. W, 32" Avenue
Miami, Florida 33145
Tel: 305-441-0123 Fax: 305-441-0688
i miliamsivain.com

Milian, Swaln & Assoclates, inc,

Civil Engineers = Environmental Scientists & Engingers C Utility Management . Financial Consultants
INVOICE

William E. Sundstrom, P.A. Invoice Date:  December 2, 2020

Sundstrom & Mindlin, LLP , Invoice Number: 44497

Attorneys at Law Page #1 Billing # 12
2548 Blaijrstone Pines Drive -
Tallahassee, FL 32301

Re: First Coast Regional Utilities, LLC
For Professional services rendered through November 27, 2020

Hours Rate Amount
Principal

Deborah Swain 9,50 225.00 2,137.50
Senior Staff Accountant

Cynthia Yapp 175.00 0.00
Engineering Technician

Adam Swain 2.00 . 90.00 180,00

Total Hours 11.50

B Total For Invoice # 44497 $2,317.50]
Total Amount Due; $2,317.50

Please make check payable to Millan, Swain & Associates, Inc .,




Docket No. 20190168-WS

Time/Expenses by Project Report

Order Time By: Employee ID
Order Expense By: Expense ft
Status: Ready Hold Billed Never Billed

FERU-Document-1866-

11/15/21 Supplemental Response to Staff 8th POD #26

Milian, Swain & Associates
Project: F16-01
Period: 11/01/2020 — 11/27/2020

Page 1

Project  Project Name

SJ Ctri # SJdinv it

Phase/Task/Employee Employee Name Dep Staff PIE Work Date  OVT ST STATE Hours Worked  Billable Hours
F16-01 FCRU-New Cerificate

ABS Adam B Swain ADM 016  11/27/2020 11/27/2020 R 2.00 2.00
[Discovery - response graphics |

DS Deborah Swain FIN 001 11/06/2020 11/06/2020 R 1.50 1.50
[-Discovery, coordination, conference call l

bS ‘Deborah Swain FIN 001 11/13/2020 11/13/2020 R 2.00 2.00
|-Discovery, coordination |

DS Deborah Swain EIN 001 11/20/2020 11/20/2020 R 3.00 3.00
[-Discove/y, coordination j

DS Deborah Swain FIN 001  11/27/2020 11/27/2020 R 3.00 3.00
[Discove:y. coordination ]

Sublotal Task 1150 11,50

Sublolal Phase 11.50 11.50

Total Project F16-01 11.50 11.50

Run Date: Dec 3, 2020 @ 15:18:05

TIMEEXPRPT.FRX
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C H E C K R E Q1W1ELSprThental Response to Staff 8th POD #26

Date /ng

Check Payable To S\CQ# %@i’—(ﬁ (\OD@LL I)j{/ LLC $ / O / Q ‘SO .

Charge To: Client 1St Co s ZL . Bill Client $
File No. Lfé?() 70 O/ (includes costs directly charged
Date of Travel to the fixm) '

Type of Expense j I y O @(O

Special Instructions

Check if to be paid - W

from Trust Account o t '
(358030 Signature

Needed By | ) ﬂ;s\} 9o 7
Date
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Scott Kelly Consulting,LLC ' 11/15/21 Supplemental Response to Stag%‘h IZ(?Q_%S
241 OCEANWALK DRIVE SOUTH '-ﬁyg 3 ”‘%ﬁ»ﬂff‘
Atfantic Beach, FL 32233 US NREeS ;
+1 9048134349

scoltkellyconsulting@gmail.com

: 006
First Coast Regional Utilities, Inc. 12/03/2020
BURS Net 30
il E 01/02/2021
ACTIMITY DESCRIPTICN - Y B
Consulting Consulting Services for month of 4,50 225.00 1,012.50
November

fopalel i Do $1,012.50

Faze ot
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CHECK RE @1ﬁ1ﬁur§>lef!ental Response to Staff 8th POD #26
Date _4 / /lp / 2

}

Check Payable To K%S Q\F $ WL q1 i

Charge To: Client l//_( ?/ff{’ QOQS—‘L “Bill Client $ Wk al <

File No. HKO70 .01 glltci\:(fl;sl;:;)sts directly charged
Date of Travel .
Type of Expense 3//0 - AL,/IO 9.99 accesS V\OLI?§|D0«’0@KS (n
. Yis ~5/10 Jadksmvilie,
: ‘ 10 {
Special Instructions 6/1 2 - %o //‘ ' /{ 6 IO"T4
g - 7o Yis P/ 074
. % ,
[]. Checkif to be paid 7l q//é @_(
from Trust Account 8//;5 - d; 10 =, Signature
0= /1>
Needed By — QS 2050

Date (05(575 , #//53,7@@




F.E.|.# 58-2783536

FIRST COAST REGIONAL UTILITY,
301 CAPITAL PARTNERS, LLC

C/O AVERY C. ROBERTS

INC

Docket No. 20190168-WS
FCRU Document 1870
11/15/21 Supplemental Response to Staff 8th POD #26

LAW OFFICES

SUNDSTROM & MINDLIN, LLP

2548 BLAIRSTONE PINES DR
TALLAHASSEE, FLORIDA 32301

(850) 877-6555 PLEASE REFER TO INVOICE NUMBER
WHEN REMITTING

JANUARY 9, 2021

P.O. BOX 238 INVOICE # 57399
LAKE BUTLER, FL 32054 FILE # 48070-00001
PAGE 1
MATTER: ORIGINAL CERTIFICATE FROM PSC
12/01/20 RCB CONTINUE TO WORK ON DISCOVERY; CONFERENCES WITH 4.00 1,500.00

BILL SUNDSTROM AND JOHN WHARTON REGARDING JEA

STAFF RESPONSES.

12/03/20 WES CONTINUE TO WORK ON DISCOVERY; 3.50 1,312.50
12/03/20 RCB CONTINUE TO WORK ON DISCOVERY REQUESTS TO JEA; 3.80 1,425.00
REVIEW COMMENTS AND EDITS; PROPOSE ADDITIONAL
ADMISSIONS AND INTERROGATORIES; CONFERENCES WITH
BILL SUNDSTROM AND JOHN WHARTON.
12/04/20 WES CONTINUE TO WORK ON DISCOVERY MATTERS, ESPECIALLY 1.50 562.50
IN LIGHT OF ACTION ON THE FLUM; ETC.
12/04/20 RCB CONTINUE WORKING ON DISCOVERY TO JEA. 2.00 750.00
12/07/20 WES FURTHER REVISIONS TO DRAFT JEA DISCOVERY; 2.50 937.50
12/07/20 RCB CONTINUE TO WORK ON FINALIZING DISCOVERY TO JEA; 3.20 1,200.00

REVIEW AND COMMENT ON LETTER FROM BAKER COUNTY;

DISCUSS STRATEGY WITH

BILL SUNDSTROM AND JOHN WHARTON.
12/08/20 WES CONFERENCE CALL WITH BEAUDET, KELLY AND BRANNAN 2.90 1,087.50
RELATIVE TO CREATION OF AN EXHIBIT SUMMARIZING
JEA PUZZLE TO SERVICE 301 CAPITAL PARTNERS LAND;
REVISION OF DRAFT DISCOVERY AND FORWARD TO CLIENT
FOR THEIR REVIEW AND CONSIDERATION; REVISION OF
DRAFT LETTER FROM BAKER COUNTY TO FCRU SUPPORTING
ITS FPSC APPLICATION; RECEIPT OF DISCOVERY FROM
THE STAFF AT THE COMMISSION AND FORWARD IT TO

DEBBIE SWAIN.

12/08/20 RCB FINAL REVISIONS TO DRAFT DISCOVERY TO JEA AND 3.70 1,387.50
FORWARD TO BILL SUNDSTROM FOR DISTRIBUTION TO

TEAM FOR COMMENTS, ETC.;

REVIEW AND COMMENT ON

DRAFT LETTER FROM BAKER COUNTY; PREPARE FOR AND
PARTICIPATE IN CONFERENCE CALL WITH BILL




F.E.L# 58-2783536

Docket No. 20190168-WS
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LAW OFFICES

SUNDSTROM & MINDLIN, LLP

2548 BLAIRSTONE PINES DR
TALLAHASSEE, FLORIDA 32301

(850) 877-6555 PLEASE REFER TO INVOICE NUMBER
WHEN REMITTING

FIRST COAST REGIONAL UTILITY, INC

Invoice #:

57389 PAGE 2

12/09/20

12/09/20

12/10/20

12/14/20

12/14/20

12/16/20

12/16/20

12/17/20

12/17/20

12/18/20
12/21/20

12/21/20

WES

RCB

RCB

WES

RCB

WES

RCB

WES

RCB

RCB
WES

RCB

SUNDSTROM, BEVIN BEAUDET AND SCOTT KELLY; RECEIVE
AND REVIEW DISCOVERY REQUESTS FROM PSC STAFF.

1.80 712.50

FINAL REVISIONS TO DRAFT DISCOVERY AND
CONVERSATION WITH R. KENNELLY THEREAFTER RELATIVE
TO PARTNER APPROVAL FOR DROPPING NEW

DISCOVERY ON THE JEA.
FINAL REVIEW OF DRAFT DISCOVERY REQUESTS TO JEA; 1.60 600.00
BEGIN WORK ON RESPONSES TO STAFF'S LATEST 1.60 600.00
DISCOVERY REQUESTS TO FIRST COAST.
REVIEW ARTICLE RELATIVE TO JEA BOARD MEETING AND 1.50 562.50

MASSIVE RATE INCREASES; FORWARD TO CLIENTS;

DISCUSSION WITH STAFF RELATIVE TO ITS INTENDED

RECOMMENDATION TO COMMISSIONERS.

WORK ON GETTING DISCOVERY REQUESTS IN FINAL FORM 2.50 937.50
AND SERVED ON JEA; REVIEW ARTICLE RELATED TO

SUBSTANTIAL CAPITAL REQUIREMENTS FOR JEA WATER

AND WASTEWATER SYSTEMS WHICH WILL REQUIRE

MATERIAL RATE INCREASES.

ATTORNEY CONFERENCE RELATIVE TO STRATEGY WITH PSC .40 150.00
STAFF, DISCOVERY, ETC.
CONTINUE TO WORK ON FINALIZING RESPONSES TO STAFF 3.70 1,387.50

DISCOVERY REQUESTS AND EXHIBITS; PARTICIPATE IN
ATTORNEY CONFERENCE CALL REGARDING STAFF
REQUESTS; FORWARD FINALIZED DRAFT RESPONSES TO
TEAM FOR REVIEW AND COMMENT.

1.30 487.50
FOLLOW UP WITH BOB KENNELLY RELATIVE TO
DISCOVERY.
RESPOND AND EDIT RESPONSES TO STAFF DISCOVERY; 2.90 1,087.50
CONFERENCE CALL WITH BOB KENNELLY AND BILL
SUNDSTROM REGARDING EDITS TO SPREADSHEET OF COSTS
TO DATE TO 301 CAPITAL PARTNERS; PREPARE
DISCOVERY FOR FILING.
FILE AND SERVE RESPONSES TO STAFF DISCOVERY 1.00 375.00
DISCUSSIONS WITH BEVIN AND AVERY RELATIVE TO SITE 1.50 562.50
PLAN, PSC EXHIBITS, AND RELATED MATTERS.
CONFERENCES WITH BILL SUNDSTROM AND BEVIN 3.00 1,125.00




F.E.1# 59-2783536

FIRST COAST REGIONAL UTILITY, INC

Invoice #:

57399

Docket No. 20190168-WS
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LAW OFFICES

SUNDSTROM & MINDLIN, LLP

2548 BLAIRSTONE PINES DR
TALLAHASSEE, FLORIDA 32301

(850) 877-6555 PLEASE REFER TO INVOICE NUMBER
WHEN REMITTING

PAGE 3

12/22/20 WES

12/22/20 RCB

12/23/20 WES

12/23/20 RCB

12/28/20 WES

12/28/20 RCB

BEAUDET; DRAFT ADMISSIONS AND INTERROGATORIES TO
JEA REGARDING CAPITAL NEEDS AND RATE INCREASES;
FORWARD TO BILL SUNDSTROM FOR DISTRIBUTION,

COMMENTS AND EDITS.

RECEIPT AND ANALYSIS OF PSC STAFF RECOMMENDATION 2.50 937.50
ON DISPOSITIVE MOTIONS; DISCUSSION OF SAME WITH
AVERY, MIKE, BOB AND SCOTT; TWO LAWYER CONFERENCE

CALLS RE: SAME, ETC.

ATTORNEY CONFERENCE CALLS REGARDING STAFF 3.00 1,125.00
RECOMMENDATIONS ON DISPOSITIVE MOTIONS; CONTINUE

TO REVISE AND EDIT DISCOVERY TO JEA

COMPLETION OF DISCOVERY AND FILE ON THE JEA; 2.00 750.00
RETRIEVE PRIOR RESEARCH MEMOS AND FORWARD JOHN

WHARTON, BOB BRANNAN AND BOB KENNELLY RE:

PREPARATION FOR ORAL ARGUMENT BEFORE THE PSC

AFTER REVIEW OF SAME.

FINALIZE ADMISSIONS AND INTERROGATORIES TO JEA 2.00 750.00
AND SERVE; PREPARE FOR CONFERENCE CALL REGARDING

ORAL ARGUMENT

CONFERENCE CALL RE: STRATEGY FOR ORAL ARGUMENT; .80 300.00
FOLLOW UP EMAIL TO PSC STAFF LAWYER.
PREPARE FOR AND PARTICIPATE IN CONFERENCE CALL 2.00 750.00

REGARDING ORAL ARGUMENT FOR DISPOSITIVE MOTIONS

ON JANUARY 5.

TOTAL HOURS

WILLIAM E SUNDSTROM
ROBERT C BRANNAN

62.30
PROFESSIONAL FEES $ 23,362.50
22.30 8,362.50
40.00 15,000.00
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LAW OFFICES

SUNDSTROM & MINDLIN, LLP

2548 BLAIRSTONE PINES DR
TALLAHASSEE, FLORIDA 32301

F.E.l.# 59-2783536 (850) 877-6555 PLEASE REFER TO INVOICE NUMBER
WHEN REMITTING

FIRST COAST REGIONAL UTILITY, INC

Invoice #: 57399 PAGE 4
TRAVEL EXPENSE 1,790.00
PROFESSIONAL SERVICES 13,5982.50
TOTAL COSTS ADVANCED $ 15,382.50

TOTAL STATEMENT $ 38,745.00
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CHECK RE (E/WZESg)pfmental Response to Staff 8th POD #26
Date / ' C? 02//

Check Payable To BQU) 4! 7QF B QQUC)C?_J\/ F{D LIC s 1800 .0

Charge To: Client Fq 51 CD@S+ Bill Client $
File No l+ O T0.0 [ : (includes costs directly charged
‘ ] . to the firm)
Date of Travel

Type of Expense _Inv || //7/()

Special Instructions

Check if to be paid (E(;(Y _{L{/
Signature

from Trust Account
CLJ____

Needed By | P \
‘ Date ' SHO/ 2
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Bevin A. Beaudet, P.E., LLC
1543 Maple Street
Bethlehem, PA 18017
- babeaudet@gmail.com 561-373-4442

January 3, 2021
William E. Sundstrom, Esq.
Sundstrom & Mindlin, LLP

2548 Blairstone Pines Drive
Tallahassee, FL 32301

RE: Beaudet December 2020 FCRU Tnvoice #1166
Consu!tilng: Conference and strategy calls, review and response to PSC staff
interrogatories. and production of documents, review and edit.of PSC filings,
coordination and phone calls with Prosser, Inc.
Total 8 hours @ $225/hour = $1800.00.

Respectfully submitted. this day of January 3, 2021

“Bevin A. Beaudet, P.E.
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14Supplepental Response to Staff 8th POD #26
U'EST

CHECK RE{Y

Date [ 96;))

Check Payable To SCO# /YCJ// 17 @f& 3(//7) /51— . LL C $ 5 (Q Q . SD

Charge To: Client F AN C&S%‘ Bill Client $ |

: . ' (includes costs directly charged
File No. HEO 0 1 o e
Date of Travel ‘

Type of Expense Th aele, 7

- Special Instructions
Check if to be paid - (%,
from Trust Account - 2 # Sienatn
g2 ignature
Needed By __ H 5%‘9\0

Date
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Scott Kelly Consulting,LLC
241 OCEANWALK DRIVE SOUTH
Allantic Beach, FL 32233 US

+1 8048134348
scoltkellyconsulting@gmaill.com

o 007
First Coast Regional Utilities, Inc, Do 01/03/2021
' Net 30
- 02/02/2021
LT D F T
12/31/2020 Consuliting Consulting Services for Month of 2.50 225.00 562.50

December

ARSI $562.50
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CHECK RF (}5@ §epReryental Response to Staff 8th POD #26

Date ) 9 @//
Check Payable To m [ Lig IO/,QS(;/BZ) a %} 7%%0 a-Ine. $ SAS (D)
Charge To: Client Hest (\ LGST ~ Bill Client $
File No. LUXD 70 0] (includes costs directly charged
to the firm)

Date of Travel
Type of Expense =nv H4528

Special Instructions

Check if to be paid _ (t@ [
s

from Trust Account r}_éLQ/) ‘ ~ 7 Signature

Needed By =
Date =+ SLW / 7
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111527 @upsipmental RespensestoSaff 8th POD #26
2025 8. W, 32" Avenue
Miami, Florida 33145
Tel.: 305-441-0123 Fax: 305-441-0688

www, milianswain.com

Milian, Swain & Associates, Inc.

Civil Engineers  /+ Environmental Scientists & Engineers b Utility Management - Financial Consultants
INVOICE

William . Sundstrom, P.A, Invoice Dale:  January 4, 202

Sundstrom & Mindlin, LLLP Invoice Number: 44528

Attorneys at Law Page #1 Billing # 13

2548 Blairstone Pines Drive
Tallahassee, F1, 32301

Re: First Coast Regional Utilities, LLC
For Professional services rendered through December 25,2020

Hours Rate Amount
Principal _
Deborah Swain 13.00 225.00 2,925.00
Senior Staff Accountant ‘
Cynthia Yapp 4.00 175.00 700.00
Engineering Technician
Adam Swain 90.00 0.00
Total Hours 17.00
Total For Invoice # 44528 $3,625.00]
Total Amount Due: $3,625.00

Please make check payable to AMillan, Swain & Associutes, Inc,
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TI7TT5/2T Supplenental RESPoONSe 10 Stalt gth POD#26

Timel/Expenses by Project Report

Order Time By: Employee ID Milian, Swain & Associates Page 1
Order Expense By: Expense # Project: F16-01
Status: Ready Hold Billed Never Billed " Perfod: 12/01/2020 — 12/25/2020
Project  Project Name SJ Clrl #t Sdinv#t
PhaselTask/Employee Empioyee Nane Dep Staff PIE Work Date  OVT ST STATE Hours Worked  Biltable Hours
F16-01 FCRU-New Cettificate :
cY Cynthia Yapp FIN 007  12/18/2020 12/18/2020 N R 12.00 12,00

12/15/2020: update project to dale cost; MFR Schedules
12/17/2020: MFR schedules

cY Cynthia Yapp FIN 007 12/25/2020 12/25/2020 N R 1.00 1.00

pS Deborah Swain FIN 001 12/04/2020 12/04/2020 N R 1.00 1.00
{Discovery, coordination : l

DS Deborah Swain FIN 001 12/11/2020 12/11/2020 N R 1.00 1.00
[Discovery, coordination » l

DS Deborah Swain FIN 0019 12/18/2020 12/18/2020 N R 1.50 1.50
[Discove:y, coordination ) I

DS Deborah Swain FIN 001  12/25/2020 12/25/2020 N R 0.50 0.50
[lgleadings, Discovery, coordinafion ‘

Sublolal Task 17.00 17.00

Sublotal Phase 17.00 17_5)

Tolal Project F16-01 17.00 17.00

Run Date: Jan 5, 2021 @ 13:05:58 TIMEEXPRPT.FRX
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11/13@figuplementdl Respoigesp Btaff 8th POD #26

2025 8. W, 32" Avenne
Miami, Florida 33145
Tel.: 305-441-0123 Fux: 305-441-0688

www milianswain.com

Civil Engineers <> - Environmental Scientists & Engincers e Utility Management - Financial Consultants
INVOICE

William E. Sundsfrom, P.A. ' Invoice Date:  January 4, 2021

Sundstrom & Mindlin, LLP [nvoice Number: 44528

Attorneys at Law Page #1 Billing # i3

2548 Blairstone Pines Drive
Tallahassee, FL 32301

Ret First Coast Regional Utilities, LLC
For Professional services rendered through December 25, 2020

Hours ‘ Rate Amount
Principal
Deborah Swain 13.00 225.00 . 2,925.00
Senior Staff Accountant
Cynthia Yapp . 4.00 175.00 700.00
Engineering Technician
Adam Swain 90.00 0.00
Total Hours 17.00
Total For Invoice # 44528 $3,625.00|
Total Amount Due: $3,625.00

Please make check payable to Miliun, Swain & Associates, Inc.
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Time/Expenses by Project Report

Order Time By: Employee ID

11/15/21 Supplemental Response to Staff 8th POD #26

Milian, Swain & Associates Page 1
Order Expense By: Expense # Project: F16-01
Status: Ready Hold Billed Never Billed Period: 12/01/2020 — 12/25/2020
Project  Project Name SJ Ctrl # SJinv#
Phase/Task/Employee Employee Name Dep Staff P/E Work Date  OVT ST STATE Hours Worked  Billable Hours
F16-01 FCRU-New Certificate
cY Cynthia Yapp FIN 007  12/18/2020 12/18/2020 N R 12.00 12.00
12/16/2020: update project to dale cost; MFR Schedules
12/17/2020: MFR schedules
cy Cynthia Yapp FIN 007  12/25/2020 12/25/2020 N R 1.00 1.00
DS Deborah Swain FIN 001  12/04/2020 12/04/2020 N R 1.00 1.00
[Discovery, coordination l
DS Deborah Swain FIN 001  12/11/2020 12/11/2020 N R 1.00 1.00
IDisbovery, coordination T
DS Deborah Swain FIN 001  12/18/2020 12/18/2020 N R 1.50 1.50
|Discove1y, coordination j
DS Deborah Swain FIN 001 12/26/2020 12/25/2020 N R 0.50 0.50
|Pleadings, Discovery, coordination ]
Subtotal Task 17.00 17.00
Subtotal Phase 17.00 17.00
Total Projecl F16-01 17.00 17.00

Run Date: Jan 5, 2021 @ 13:05:58

TIMEEXPRPT.FRX
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CHECK RE 61ﬁ1ﬁug>le[aental Response to Staff 8th POD #26
Date /3;7&0&9

Check Payable To &QD M $ /7 (DS.0D

Charge To: Client 4: .S "f" C/)QS 1= Bill Client $ /> [QO N) .0@
. - , (includes costs directly charged
File No. H4&eo70.0 ) to the fam)
Date of Travel

Type of Expense T{f\ V. 390 q D

Special Instructions
Check if to be paid S Q[\() __/_7//
from Trust Account | : 2 -
13271200 Signature

Needed By #5 39?@

Date
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D E A N 11/15/21 Supplemental Response to Staff 8th POD #26
Dean, Mead, Egerton, Bloodworth, Capouano & Bozarth, P.A, 407-841-1200 Orlando

420 S. Orange Avenue, Suite 700 407-423-1831 Fax Fort Pierce

P.O. Box 2346 (ZIP 32802-2346) www.deanmead.com Viera

Orlando, Florida 32801 Fed Tax ID# 59-20497 16 Tallahassee

FIRST COAST REGIONAL UTILITIES, INC. December 23, 2020

ATTN: WILLIAM SUNDSTROM ID: 038587.074956

2548 BLAIRSTONE PINES DRIVE INVOICE # 376973
TALLAHASSEE, FL 32801 JLW

RE: JURISDICTIONAL ISSUE FOR DECLARATION

FOR PROFESSIONAL SERVICES RENDERED:

TOTAL FEES $7,605.00
ATTY CLASS HOURS RATE  AMOUNT
JLW Partner 19.50  390.00 7,605.00

ATTY TOTALS 19.50 7,605.00

TOTAL CURRENT AMOUNT DUE $7,605.00

TOTAL AMOUNT DUE : $7,605.00

THIS INVOICE IS PAYABLE UPOQN RECEIPT,

PLEASE RETURN THIS PAGE WITH YOUR REMITTANCE OR PAY INVOICES
ONLINE AT WWW.DEANMEAD.COM
WE ACCEPT VISA, MASTERCARD, DISCOVER, AND AMERICAN EXPRESS

A Member of ALFA International - The Global Legal Network




DEAN
MEAD

Dean, Mead, Egerton, Bloodworth, Capouano & Bozarth, P.A,

420 S. Orange Avenue, Suite 700
P.0. Box 2346 {ZIP 32802-2346)
Orlando, Florida 32801

FIRST COAST REGIONAL UTILITIES, INC.
ATTN: WILLIAM SUNDSTROM
2548 BLAIRSTONE PINES DRIVE

TALLAHASSEE, FL 32801

407-841-1200
407-423-1831 Fax
www.deanmead.com
Fed Tax ID# 59-2049716

Docket No. 20190168-WS
FCRU Document 1885
11/15/21 Supplemental Response to Staff 8th POD #26

Orlando

Fort Pierce

Viera

Tallahassee

December 23, 2020

ID: 038587.074956
INVOICE # 376973

JLW

RE: JURISDICTIONAL ISSUE FOR DECLARATION

FOR PROFESSIONAL SERVICES RENDERED:

DESCRIPTION

ITEMIZED ATTORNEY FEES

DATE

ATTY

HOURS

RATE

AMOUNT

REVIEW PSC'S EMAIL
REGARDING TIMING OF
SUMMARY MOTION
DISPOSITION.

CALL REGARDING
OUTSTANDING DISCOVERY,
CURRENT STATUS, AND
COMMISSION DECISION ON
AGENDA AND PENDING
MOTIONS.

PREPARATION FOR AND
PARTICIPATE IN
CONFERENCE CALL WITH
TEAM REGARDING
DISCOVERY RESPONSES.

REVIEWING DISCOVERY
RESPONSE DRAFT;
PREPARATION FOR
CONFERENCE CALL AND
CONFERENCE CALL
REGARDING DRAFTS.
EMAILS REGARDING SAME.

EMAILS RE: CASE AND
OUTSTANDING DISCOVERY.

11/17720

11/18/20

11/20/20

11/23/20

11/24/20

LW

JLW

JLW

JLW

0.20

0.50

1.10

2.20

0.40

* SERVICES PROVIDED BY PARALEGAL OR LAW CLERK

390.00

390.00

390.00

390.00

390.00

78.00

195.00

429.00

- 858.00

156.00




DEAN

MEAD

Dean, Mead, Egerton, Bloodworth, Capouano & Bozarth, P.A.

420 S. Orange Avenue, Suite 700
P.O. Box 2346 (ZIP 32802-2346)
Orlando, Florida 32801

FIRST COAST REGIONAL UTILITIES, INC.

038587.074956
December 23, 2020
Page 2

DESCRIPTION

DATE

407-841-1200
407-423-1831 Fax
www.deanmead,com
Fed Tax ID# 59-2049716

ATTY

HOURS

Docket No. 20190168-WS
FCRU Document 1886
11/15/21 Supplemental Response to Staff 8th POD #26

Orlando

Fort Pierce

Viera

Tallahassee

RATE

AMOUNT

CONTINUING TO WORK ON
DISCOVERY RESPONSES;
REVIEW OF RELATED
DOCUMENTS AND

CALL REGARDING CASE
AND OUTSTANDING ISSUES.

CONTINUING REVIEW OF
TEAM'S DISCOVERY
RESPONSES; EMAILS RE:
SAME.

CALL REGARDING
OUTSTANDING ISSUES.

PREPARATION FOR AND
CONFERENCE CALL RE:
DRAFT OF DISCOVERY
RESPONSES, INCLUDING
MARK UP AND SUBSEQUENT
EMAILS.

FINAL CONFERENCE CALL
REGARDING DISCOVERY
AND PREPARATION FOR
SAME. CALL WITH BOB
BRANNON; REVIEW
COMMISSION PROCEDURE
ORDER AND TIMING;
PREPARATION AND
TRANSMITTAL EMAIL AND
ATTACHMENTS TO STAFF
COUNSEL; REVIEW JEA
DISCOVERY RESPONSES;
CALLS AND EMAILS RE:
SAME.

11/24/20

11/24/20

11/25/20

11/27/20

11/28/20

11/30/20

JLW

JLW

JLW

JLW

JLW

JLW

1.80

0.50

0.80

0.50

2.00

2.80

* SERVICES PROVIDED BY PARALEGAL OR LAW CLERK

390.00

390.00

390.00

390.00

390.00

390.00

702.00

195.00

312.00

195.00

780.00

1092.00
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FCRU Document 1887
D E A N 11/15/21. Supplemental Response to Staff 8th POD #26
Dean, Mead, Egerton, Bloodworth, Capouano & Bozarth, P.A, 407-841-1200 Orlando
420 S. Orange Avenue, Suite 700 407-423-1831 Fax Fort Pierce
P.0. Box 2346 (ZIP 32802-2346) www.deanmead.com Viera
Orlando, Florida 32801 Fed Tax ID# 59-20497 16 Tallahasses

FIRST COAST REGIONAL UTILITIES, INC.
038587.074956 :
December 23, 2020

Page 3

DESCRIPTION DATE ATTY

HOURS

RATE AMOUNT

REVIEW JEA RESPONSES TO 12/01/20 JLW
DISCOVERY AND COMPARE

TO PREFILED TESTIMONY;

REVIEW EMAILS ON POINT

AND PREPARATION FOR

AND PARTICIPATION IN

CONFERENCE CALL ON

POINT; REVIEW KENNELLY

REBUTTAL; REVIEW DRAFT

NEXT SET OF DISCOVERY.

REVIEW OF DISCOVERY 12/02/20 JLW
AND EDITS TO SAME.

CALL WITH TEAM RE: 12/0320  JLW
PENDING MATTERS.

PREPARATION FOR 12/04/20 JLW
CONFERENCE CALL AND

CONFERENCE CALL RE:

STATUS AND EVENTS RE:

CITY OF JACKSONVILLE

WHICH MAY AFFECT CASE

IN THE NEAR TERM.

REVIEW EDIT FURTHER 12/08/20 JLW
DISCOVERY TO JEA.

REVIEW AND EDIT DRAFT 12/09/20 LW
DISCOVERY; REVIEW NEW

DISCOVERY FROM STAFF;

REVIEW DRAFT BAKER

COUNTY LETTER; EMAILS

REGARDING SAME; EMAILS

RE: ZONING DECISION.

CALL WITH WES RE: 12/14/20 JLW
DISCOVERY. '

2.10

0.90

0.30

0.70

0.60

1.20

0.30

* SERVICES PROVIDED BY PARALEGAL OR LAW CLERK

390.00 819.00

390.00 351.00
390.00 117.00

390.00 273.00

390.00 234.00

390.00 468.00

390.00 ' 117.00
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11/15/21 Supplemental Response to Staff 8th POD #26

Dean, Mead, Egerton, Bloodworth, Capouano & Bozarth, P.A, 407-841-1200 Orlando
420 S, Orange Avenue, Suite 700 407-423-1831 Fax Fort Pierce
P.0. Box 2346 (ZIP 32802-2346) www.deanmead.com Viera
Orlando, Florida 32801 Fed Tax ID# 59-2049716 Tallahassee
FIRST COAST REGIONAL UTILITIES, INC.
038587.074956
December 23, 2020
Page 4
DESCRIPTION DATE ATTY HOTURS RATE AMOUNT
CALL AND EMAILS RE: JEA 12/15/20 JLW 0.60 390.00 234.00
AND BEST WAY TO '
PROCEED.
SUBTOTAL: $7,605.00
ATTY CLASS HOURS RATE AMOUNT
LW Partner 19.50  390.00 7,605.00
ATTY TOTALS 19.50 7,605.00
TOTAL CURRENT AMOUNT DUE $7,605.00

TOTAL AMOUNT DUE

# SERVICES PROVIDED BY PARALEGAL OR LAW CLERK

$7,605.00
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CHECK REQUEST
’ Date 12/14/20
Check Payable to: William E. Sundstrom, PA $ 1,790.00
Charge to: Client:  First Coast Bill Client:$ 1,790.00

File No. 48070.01
Date of Travel: December 10 & 11, 2020

Type of Expense:

Reimbursement of costs associated with business meeting with Avery Roberts
and Jim Hissam
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LAW OFFICES

SUNDSTROM & MINDLIN, LLP

2548 BLAIRSTONE PINES DR
TALLAHASSEE, FLORIDA 32301

F.E.l.# 58-2783536 (850) 877-6555 PLEASE REFER TO INVOICE NUMBER
WHEN REMITTING

FIRST COAST REGIONAL UTILITY, INC
301 CAPITAL PARTNERS, LLC

C/0O AVERY C. ROBERTS FEBRUARY 6, 2021

P.O. BOX 238 INVOICE # 57510

LAKE BUTLER, FL 32054 FILE # 48070-00001
PAGE 1

MATTER: ORIGINAL CERTIFICATE FROM PSC

1/03/21 RCB . DISCUSSIONS WITH BILL SUNDSTROM AND JOHN WHARTON 1.00 - 375.00
REGARDING o

PREPARE FOR ORAL ARGUMENT, INCLUDING MOCK DEBATE; 1.60 600.00
PRACTICE AND CRITIQUE OF PRESENTATION; CONFERENCE
CALL WITH BOB KENNELLY; ETC.
1/04/21 RCB PREPARE FOR AND PARTICIPATE IN PSC PREHEARING 1.30 487.50
CALL WITH BILL SUNDSTROM, BOB KENNELLY, AND JOHN
WHARTON; DISCUSS MOTION TO STRIKE, PRETRIAL
SUMMARY ORDER, AND JEA'S MOTION ON EXCLUSIVE
JURISDICTION.
1/05/21 WES BEGIN REVIEW OF THE "REPORT OF THE SPECIAL 2.20 825.00
INVESTIGATORY COMMITTEE ON JEA MATTERS" PREPARED
BY THE SMITH HULSEY & BUSEY LAW FIRM; PREPARE FOR
AND LISTEN TO FLORIDA PSC ORAL ARGUMENT BETWEEN
JEA AND FCRU; CONFERENCE CALL WITH CLIENTS
RELATIVE TO THE SUMMARY THEREOF AND WHAT THE NEXT
STEPS ARE, ETC.
1/05/21 RCB MONITOR PSC MOTION HEARING; PREPARE FOR AND 4.00 1,500.00
PARTICIPATE IN RECAP CALL WITH TEAM AND CLIENTS;
RESEARCH AND DISCUSS WITH BILL SUNDSTROM THE
ISSUE OF WHEN DISCOVERY IS DUE FROM JEA.
1/06/21 WES MEMO TO TEAM RELATIVE TO JEA'S POSITION AT ORAL 1.50 562.50
ARGUMENT AND OUR RESPONSE THERETO; DISCUSSION
WITH BEVIN RELATIVE TO EXHIBIT.
1/07/21 WES CONVERSATIONS WITH AVERY ROBERTS AND MIKE BRAREN .50 187.50
RELATIVE TO STATUS OF CASE, WHERE WE GO NEXT,
ETC.; CONVERSATION WITH SCOTT KELLY RELATIVE TO
PREPARATION OF EXHIBIT.
1/08/21 WES DISCUSSIONS WITH BEVIN BEAUDET AND SCOTT KELLY 1.00 375.00
RELATIVE TO JUST INTRODUCED LEGISLATION WHICH
WOULD PROHIBIT JEA'S DISCHARGE OF TREATED
WASTEWATER INTO THE ST. JOHNS RIVER; FOLLOW UP

1/04/21 WES
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LAW OFFICES

SUNDSTROM & MINDLIN, LLP

2548 BLAIRSTONE PINES DR
TALLAHASSEE, FLORIDA 32301

F.E.|.# 59-2783536 (850) 877-6555 PLEASE REFER TO INVOICE NUMBER
WHEN REMITTING

FIRST COAST REGIONAL UTILITY, INC

Invoice #: 57510 PAGE 2

WITH AVERY ROBERTS WHO CALLED IN THIS REGARD.
"1/12/21 RCB PREPARE FOR AND PARTICIPATE IN ATTORNEY CALL 1.00 375.00
REGARDING STATUS OF APPLICATION CASE AND HOW TO
PROCEED FROM HERE.
1/14/21 WES REVIEW JEA'S RESPONSES TO EXTENSIVE DISCOVERY 2.20 825.00
FILED BY FIRST COAST; MEMO-TO THE PARTNERS
CONTAINING A SUMMARY OF THE DISCOVERY RESPONSES
PROFFERED BY JEA AND AS TO THE NEXT STEPS IN THIS
LITIGATION; CONFERENCE WITH AVERY ROBERTS AND
MIKE BRAREN RE: SAME.
1/14/21 RCB RECEIVE AND REVIEW JEA RESPONSES TO LATEST 2.50 937.50
DISCOVERY REQUESTS; PARTICIPATE IN CONFERENCE
CALL WITH BILL SUNDSTROM AND JOHN WHARTON TO GO
OVER DISCOVERY REQUESTS.

1/15/21 WES FOLLOW UP WITH JOHN WHARTON RELATIVE TO .50 187.50
DISCOVERY; SET UP ALL HANDS CONFERENCE CALL FOR
NEXT WEEK.

1/17/21 WES PREPARE FOR MONDAY MORNING CONFERENCE CALL 1.00 375.00
INCLUDING REVIEW OF DISCOVERY, ETC.

1/18/21 WES STRATEGY CALL RELATIVE TO DEALING WITH JEA'S 1.00 375.00

FAILURE TO COMPLY WITH DISCOVERY; CORPORATE
DEPOSITIONS AND RELATED MATTERS; NOTES TO FILE
RE: SAME.
1/18/21 RCB PREPARE FOR AND PARTICIPATE IN CALL WITH BILL 2.40 900.00
SUNDSTROM AND JOHN WHARTON REGARDING HOW TO
PROCEED WITH LITIGATION AND DISCOVERY TO JEA;
BEGIN WORK ON GOING OVER ALL DISCOVERY RESPONSES
FROM JEA.
1/20/21 WES PREPARE FOR AND PARTICIPATE IN WORKING GROUP CALL 1.00 375.00
(KENNELLY, HOWARD, BEAUDET, KELLY, BRANNAN AND
WHARTON) RELATIVE TO NEXT STEPS AS REGARDS
RESPONDING TO JEA'S REFUSAL TO ANSWER DISCOVERY;
SCHEDULING OF DEPOSITIONS AND TEAM ASSIGNMENTS,
ETC.
1/21/21 RCB REVIEW AND RESEARCH JEA DISCOVERY RESPONSES FOR 3.40 1,275.00
MEMO/MOTION TO COMPEL AS TO SPECIFIC ISSUES
RAISED IN JEA OBJECTIONS TO THE FCRU CERTIFICATE
APPLICATION.
1/22/21 RCB WORK ON AND RESEARCH DISCOVERY MEMO/MOTION TO 3.00 1,125.00
COMPEL
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LAW OFFICES

SUNDSTROM & MINDLIN, LLP

2548 BLAIRSTONE PINES DR
TALLAHASSEE, FLORIDA 32301

F.E.|#59-2783536 (850) 877-6555 PLEASE REFER TO INVOICE NUMBER
WHEN REMITTING

FIRST COAST REGIONAL UTILITY, INC

Invoice #: 57510 PAGE 3

1/25/21 WES PREPARE FOR, TRAVEL.TO AND ATTEND MEETING IN 4.00 1,500.00
JACKSONVILLE WITH PAUL HARDEN, AVERY ROBERTS AND
MIKE BRAREN ON JANUARY 25TH.

1/25/21 RCB CONTINUE WORKING ON JEA DISCOVERY MEMO/MOTION TO 2.80 1,050.00
COMPEL
1/26/21 WES ATTORNEY STRATEGY CONFERENCE CALL RELATIVE TO 2.40 900.00

DEALING WITH JEA'S FAILURE TO RESPOND TO
DISCOVERY, NEXT STEPS, RAMPING UP LITIGATION
EFFORTS, ETC.; RECEIPT AND REVIEW OF BEVIN
BEAUDET'S AND SCOTT KELLY'S GRAPHIC EXHIBITS OF
THE JEA COST OF SERVICE VS ONSITE SERVICE FROM
FIRST COAST AND RESPONSE TO SAME; DRAFTING OF
EXTENSIVE MEMO TO CLIENTS RELATIVE TO THE NEXT
STEPS IN PREPARATION FOR OUR CONFERENCE CALL SET
FOR FRIDAY, JANUARY 29TH.
1/26/21 RCB PREPARE FOR AND PARTICIPATE IN ATTORNEY CALL IN 3.50 1,312.50
PREPARATION FOR ALL HANDS CALL ON FRIDAY AS TO
THE STATUS OF THE CASE, WHERE WE WANT TO GO IN
THE LITIGATION AND DISCOVERY, AND WHAT WE BELIEVE
WILL BE THE TIMING OF THE HEARING AND OTHER
MATTERS AT THE PSC; CONTINUE GOING OVER PAST JEA
DISCOVERY RESPONSES.
1/27/21 WES ATTORNEY STRATEGY CALL AND DRAFTING OF MEMORANDUM 3.00 1,125.00
TO PARTNERS AS TO THE STRATEGY GOING FORWARD.
RECEIPT OF LETTER FROM BAKER COUNTY AND REQUEST
THAT JOHN WHARTON SPEAK WITH THE PSC STAFF ABOUT
IT AND SECURE HEARING DATE, ETC; WORKING
BACKWARDS FROM THE COMMISSION CALENDAR, FIGURE
OUT HEARING DATES AND MEMO TO CLIENTS RE SAME
1/27/21 RCB PREPARE FOR AND PARTICIPATE IN ATTORNEY CALL 4.30 1,612.50
REGARDING HOW WE WILL BE HANDLING OUR TASKS IN
THE LITIGATION AND DISCOVERY MATTERS; DISCUSS THE
PROS AND CONS OF

CONTINUE WORKING
ON DISCOVERY MEMO/MOTION TO COMPEL.

1/28/21 WES REVIEW DRAFT EXHIBITS PREPARED BY BEVIN BEAUDET 1.20 450.00
AND SCOTT KELLY; EDIT PREPARED EXHIBITS AND
MEMORANDUM BACK TO MISTERS BEAUDET AND KELLY IN
THAT REGARD; FOLLOW UP DISCUSSION WITH BEVIN
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LAW OFFICES

SUNDSTROM & MINDLIN, LLP

2548 BLAIRSTONE PINES DR
TALLAHASSEE, FLORIDA 32301

(850) 877-6555 PLEASE REFER TO INVOICE NUMBER
WHEN REMITTING

FIRST COAST REGIONAL UTILITY, INC

Invoice #: 57510 PAGE 4
BEAUDET

1/28/21 RCB WORK ON DRAFTING JEA DISCOVERY MEMO/MOTION TO 3.80 1,425.00
COMPEL

1/29/21 WES PREPARATION FOR AND PARTICIPATION IN GROUP CALL 1.00 375.00
RELATIVE TO STRATEGY GOING FORWARD

1/29/21 RCB CONTINUE TO WORK ON JEA DISCOVERY MEMO/MOTION TO 3.60 1,350.00
COMPEL.

1/30/21 RCB DRAFT MEMO/MOTION TO COMPEL JEA DISCOVERY. 3.00 1,125.00

1/31/21 RCB CONTINUE WORKING ON INITIAL DRAFT OF JEA 2.70 1,012.50

DISCOVERY MEMO/MOTION TO COMPEL

TOTAL HOURS 66.40
PROFESSIONAL FEES $ 24,900.00
WILLIAM E SUNDSTROM 24.10 9,037.50
ROBERT C BRANNAN 42.30 15,862.50
TRAVEL EXPENSE 98.00
PROFESSIONAL SERVICES 16,759.50
TOTAL COSTS ADVANCED $ 16,857.50

TOTAL STATEMENT $ 41,757.50
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CHECK RE @15(31E1[§Ie1nental Response to Staff 8th POD #26
Date / ’\30 \l /

Check Payable To 2—56%:477 MQQd $ l Q:)\S? 10D

Charge To: Client 'Fl\ r5+ c@@ﬁ‘ Bill Client $
File No L| SOTO .0 / (includes costs directly charged
; to the firm)

Date of Travel

Type of Expense _ ._Tﬂlh, v 3 78053

Special Instructions
[ ] Checkifto be paid P 5 >/.’\"7{L7L/
from Trust Account I S T -
20 S / Signature
Needed By #HS L}O L-LS

Date
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Dean, Mead, Egerton, Bloodworth, Capouano & Bozarth, P.A. 407-841-1200 Otando
420 S. Orange Avenue, Suite 700 407-423-1831 Fax . Fort Pierce
P.O. Box 2346 {ZIP 32802-2346) www.deanmead.com Viera
Orlando, Florida 32801 ' Fed Tax |D# 58-2049716 Tallahassee
FIRST COAST REGIONAL UTILITIES, INC. January 25, 2021
ATTN: WILLIAM SUNDSTROM ID: 038587.074956
2548 BLAIRSTONE PINES DRIVE INVOICE # 378093
- TALLAHASSEE, FL 32801 JLW

RE: JURISDICTIONAL ISSUE FOR DECLARATION

FOR PROFESSIONAL SERVICES RENDERED:

TOTAL FEES $12,597.00
ATTY CLASS HOURS RATE  AMOUNT
JLW - Partner 3230 390.00 12,597.00

ATTY TOTALS 32.30 12,597.00

TOTAL CURRENT AMOUNT DUE $12,597.00

TOTAL AMOUNT DUE $12,597.00

THISINVOICE IS P.»\\"A BLE UPGN RECEIFT,

PLEASE RETURN THIS PAGE WITH YOUR REMITTANCE OR PAY INYOICES
ONLINE AT WWW.DEANMEAD.COM
WE ACCEPT VISA, MASTERCARD, DISCOVER, AND AMERICAN EXPRESS

A Member of ALFA International - The Global Legal Network




Dean, Mead, Egerton, Bloodworth, Capouano & Bozarth, P.A. 407-841-1200

420 S. Orange Avenue, Suite 700 407-423-1831 Fax

- P.O. Box 2346 (ZIP 32802-2346) www.deanmead.com
Orlando, Florida 32801 ‘ Fed Tax |D# 59-20497 16
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Orlando

E A N 11/15/21 Supplemental Response to Staff 8th POD #26

Fort Plerce

Viera

Tallahassee

FIRST COAST REGIONAL UTILITIES, INC. January 25, 2021
ATTN: WILLIAM SUNDSTROM ID: 038587.074956
2548 BLAIRSTONE PINES DRIVE INVOICE # 378093

TALLAHASSEE, FL 32801 JLW

RE: JURISDICTIONAL ISSUE FOR DECLARATION

FOR PROFESSIONAL SERVICES RENDERED:

ITEMIZED ATTORNEY FEES

DESCRIPTION DATE ATTY  HOURS

RATE

AMOUNT

EMAILS RE: CASE. 12/17120 JLW 0.30

EMAILS RE: CASE RE: ISSUE 12/18/20 JLW 11.00

LIST; REVIEW LIST; REVIEW
OF DISCOVERY DOCUMENTS
SERVED.

REVIEW STAFF 12/22/20 JLW 2.40
RECOMMENDATION ON
PENDING MOTION; CALLS
AND EMAILS REGARDING
SAME; REVIEW AND EDIT
DRAFT DISCOVERY;
CONFERENCE CALL
REGARDING STAFF
RECOMMENDATION AND
ORAL ARGUMENT AND
TIMING OF SANE.

REVIEW AND EDIT 12/23/20 JLW 0.50
DISCOVERY; EMAILS RE:
ORAL ARGUMENT.

REVIEWING 12127120 -JLW 4.40
MEMORANDUMS AND

BACKGROUND DATA IN

PREPARATION FOR ORAL

ARGUMENT.

* SERVICES PROVIDED BY PARALEGAL OR LAW CLERK

390.00
390.00

390.00

390.00

390.00

117.00
4290.00

936.00

195.00

1716.00




DEAN
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Dean, Mead, Egerton, Bloodworth, Capouano & Bozarth, P.A.,

420 S. Orange Avenus, Suite 700
P.O. Box 2346 (ZIP 32802-2346)
Orlando, Florida 32801

407-841-1200

407-423-1831 Fax
www.deanmead.com

Fed Tax ID# 53-2049716

FIRST COAST REGIONAL UTILITIES, INC.

038587.074956
January 25,2021
Page 2

DESCRIPTION

DATE  ATTY

HOURS

Docket No. 20190168-WS
FCRU Document 1897
11/15/21 Supplemental Response to Staff 8th POD #26

Orlando

Fort Plerce

Viera

Tallahassee

RATE

AMOUNT

PREPARATION FOR COLE
REGARDING ORAL
ARGUMENT IN REVIEW OF
DOCUMENTS; FIRST DRAFT
OF ORAL ARGUMENT PART;
PARTICIPATE IN CALL AND
CONTINUED PREPARATION.

EXCHANGED EMAILS
REGARDING DRAFT OF
BAKER COUNTY LETTER.

CONTINUED REVIEW OF
BACKGROUND DOCUMENTS
AND PREPARATION OF ALL
ARGUMENTS; CONFERENCE
CALL REGARDING SAME.

PREPARATION FOR ORAL
ARGUMENT AT THE PSC;
PRESENT ORAL ARGUMENT
AT THE PSC; TWO
CONFERENCE CALLS TO
DISCUSS AGENDA
CONFERENCE AND BEST
WAY TO PROCEED.

'CONFERENCE CALL RE:
BEST WAY TO PROCEED.

REVIEW STATUS
MEMORANDUM AND
SEVERAL EMAILS
REGARDING CASE.

12/28/20 JLW

01/03/21 JLW

01/04/21 JLW

01/05/21 JLW

01/12/21 JLW

01/15/21 JLW

SUBTOTAL:

* SERVICES PROVIDED BY PARALEGAL OR LAW CLERK

3.30

0.40

4.40

4.40

0.60

0.60

390.00

390.00

390.00

390.00

390.00

390.00

1287.00

156.00

1716.00

1716.00

234.00

234.00

$12,597.00




EAN

D
MEAD

Dean, Mead, Egerton, Bloodworth, Capouano & Bozarth, P.A,
420 S. Orange Avenue, Suite 700

P.0. Box 2346 (ZIP 32802-2346)

Orlando, Florida 32801

FIRST COAST REGIONAL UTILITIES, INC.
038587.074956
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407-841-1200 Orlando
407-423-1831 Fax Fort Pierca
www.deanmead.com Viera

Fed Tax |D# 53-2049716 Tallahassee

January 25, 2021

Page 3
ATTY CLASS HOURS RATE  AMOUNT
JLW Partner 32,30 390.00 12,597.00

ATTY TOTALS

TOTAL CURRENT AMOUNT DUE

TOTAL AMOUNT DUE

32.30 12,597.00

$12,597.00

$12,597.00

* SERVICES PROVIDED BY PARALEGAL OR LAW CLERK
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e.Tental Response to Staff 8th POD #26

Date a (Q 2—/

s 350.00

Check Payable To B@/l‘ ) A, Be&f/{dﬁ_f’/ pg/ LL(:

Fest (opsth

Charge To: Client

Bill Client § 83./S0-C1)

File No. LUROT10- O} Ein;il:({lierx;)sts directly charged
Date of Travel ’
Type of Expense I/ 110 L
Special Instructions
[[] Checkiftobe paid , ‘
from Trust Account . CJ% 0}7[/ Py
a-le [ - ignature
Needed By Suas /7

Date




Bevin A. Beaudet, P.E.,LLC

babeaudet@gmail.com

BILL TO

William E Sundstrom PA
Sundstrom & Mindlin, LLP
2548 Blairstone Pines Dr.
Tallahassee, FL 32301

Docket No. 20190168-WS
FCRU Document 1900
11/15/21 Supplemental Response to Staff 8th POD #26

INVOICE # 1174
DATE 02/01/2021
DUE DATE 03/03/2021
TERMS Net 30

Consuiting 14 225.00 3,150.00
Preparation of exhibit maps, conference calls and
coordination calls with S. Kelly, B. Sundstrom and Prosser.
Bevin A. Beaudet, P.E., LLC BALANCE DUE
evin A, Beaude $3’1 50-00

1543 Maple St.
Bethlehem, PA 18017




CHECK REQU

Check Payable To Ml' Ué‘zﬂ S{J/&/ r) é}" 7[}@%07 L ne
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Eu;glefqental Response to Staff 8th POD #26

Date Q-0 Q)

§ RSO

Charge To: Client F:? [ 5+C@Qg+

Bill Client $ LSO

(includes costs directly charged

File No.
Date of Travel to the firm)
Type of Expense NV L’ 455 e
Special Instructions
Check if to be paid CQ&?/L

from Trust Account -

Needed By

Date

Signature
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12025 8. 1, 32™ Avenue
_y Miami, Florida 33145
Tel,: 305-441-0123 Fax: 305-441-0688

www.milianswain.com

Milian, Swain & Associates, Inc,

Civil Engineers ¢+ Environmental Scientists & Engineers e Utility Management .. Financial Consultants
INVOICE

William K, Sundstrom, P.A, . Invoice Date:  February 2, 2021

Sundstrom & Mindlin, LLP Invoice Number; 44556

Attorneys at Law ) Page #1 Billing # 14

2548 Blairstone Pines Drive
Tallahassee, FL 32301

Re: First Coast Regional Utilities, LL.C
For Professional services rendered through January 29, 2021

Hours Rate - Amount
Principal
Deborah Swain 1,00 . 225.00 225.00
Senior Staff Accountant
Cynthia Yapp 175.00 0.00
Engineering Technician
Adam Swain 90.00 0.00
Total Hours 1.00
| Total For Invoice # 44556 $225.00]
Total Amount Due! $§225.00

Please make check payable to Miliun, Swain & Associates, lne .
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T o1z TSupptementat Response to-Staff 8trPOD#26

Time/Expenses hy Project Report

Order Time By: Employee 1D Milian, Swain & Associates Page 1
Order Expense By: Expense # Project: F16-01
Status:Ready Hold Billed Never Billed Period: 01/01/2021 — 01/29/2021
Project  Project Name : SJCtr # SJtnv #
Phase/Task/Employee Employee Name Dep Slaff P/E Work Date  OVT ST STATE Hours Worked  Billable Hours
F16-01 FCRU-New Certificate
DS Deborah Swain FIN 001  01/15/2021 01/15/2021 N R 0.50 0.50
|Pleadings, Discovery, coordination ]
DS Deborah Swain FIN 001  01/29/2021 01/28/2021 N R 0.50 0.50
[Coordlnal/on ]
Sublotal Task 1.00 1.00
Subtotal Phase 1.00 1.00
Total Project F16-01 1.00 1.00

Run Date: Feb 2, 2021 @ 17:07:20 TIMEEXPRPT.FRX
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CHECK REQUEST

Date ;Z (Q \l/

s NEN SO

Check Payable To Srott %QJ }j G)ﬂ% 171‘@6// LLC

Frot Condt

Bill Client $ ,78 ) SO

Charge To: Client

File No. I—k? 070D

(includes costs directly charged

Date of Travel

to the firm)

~ Type of Expense ___ ] n(/ O()EP

Special Instructions

[] Checkiftobe paid
from Trust Account

Qo]
=S lo

Needed By

Date

Stk

N .
Signature




Scoft Kelly Consulting,LLC

241 OCEANWALK DRIVE SOUTH
Atlantle Beach, FL. 32233 US

+1 9048134349
scotlkellyconsulting@gmall. com

First Coast Reglonal Utllitles, Inc.

ACTTIATY

01/31/2021 Consulting

Docket No. 20190168-WS
FCRU Document 1905

11/15/21 Supplemental Response to Staff 8th POD #26

DEZCRE T LETw

Conference Calls, Exhibit Prep and 3.50
Research

008
02/03/2021
Net 30
03/05/2021

226.00 787.50

$787.50
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CHECK REQUEST
Date 1/26/21

Check Payable to: William E. Sundstrom, PA ' $ 98.00

Charge to: Client: First Coast Regional Utility Bill Client $98.00
File No. 48070.01
Date of Travel: January 25, 2021

Type of Expense:

Portion of mileage for travel to Jacksonville for meeting with Paul Harden,
Avery Roberts and Mike Braren. 175 @.56=$98

‘_ I ;‘w g n\

Uow s
S0

# 5S40 SY
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LAW OFFICES

SUNDSTROM & MINDLIN, LLP

2548 BLAIRSTONE PINES DR
TALLAHASSEE, FLORIDA 32301

F.E.|# 59-2783536 (850) 877-6555 PLEASE REFER TO INVOICE NUMBER
WHEN REMITTING

FIRST COAST REGIONAL UTILITY, INC
301 CAPITAL PARTNERS, LLC

C/0 AVERY C. ROBERTS MARCH 6, 2021

P.O. BOX 238 INVOICE # 57567

LAKE BUTLER, FL 32054 FILE # 48070-00001
PAGE 1

MATTER: ORIGINAL CERTIFICATE FROM PSC

2/01/21 WES CONVERSATIONS WITH BEVIN BEAUDET RELATIVE TO .60 225.00
PREPARATION OF ENGINEERING EXHIBITS TIMELINE, ETC

2/01/21 RCB CONTINUE TO GO THROUGH JEA DISCOVERY FOR MOTION 1.60 600.00
TO COMPEL

2/02/21 RCB CONTINUE TO GO THROUGH ALL JEA DISCOVERY FOR 1.80 675.00
MOTION TO COMPEL

2/03/21 WES REVIEW DRAFT ENGINEERING EXHIBIT NO. 5 AND EDIT .50 187.50
SAME

2/03/21 RCB WORK ON MOTION TO COMPEL TO JEA; CONFERENCE WITH 3.20 1,200.00

BILL SUNDSTROM REGARDING ASPECTS OF JEA'S
RESPONSES; DISCUSSIONS CONCERNING OPS CONTRACT
FOR JEA AND WATER AVAILABILITY TO FCRU TREATMENT
FACILITIES

2/04/21 WES 6.00 2,250.00

2/05/21 WES ATTORNEY CONFERENCE CALL RELATIVE TO WHAT IS
NEXT; CONVERSATION WITH SCOTT KELLY RELATIVE TO
JEA'S CHIEF ENGINEER LEAVING TO WORK FOR THE CLAY
COUNTY UTILITY AUTHORITY; MINIMUM SJRWMD MINIMUM
FLOWS AND LEVELS; BILL MOVING IN THE LEGISLATURE
RELATIVE TO JEA DIRECT DISCHARGE INTO THE ST.
JOHNS RIVER; REVIEW AND EDIT ENGINEERING EXHIBITS

PREPARED BY BEAUDET, KELLY AND PROSSER;

2.50 937.50

C.; BRIEFING TO BOB KENNELLY AS TO STATUS OF
MATTER, ETC.
2/05/21 RCB WORK ON MOTION TO COMPEL; ATTORNEY CONFERENCE 4.40 1,650.00
CALL TO DISCUSS OPS CONTRACT TO JEA; REVIEW AND
COMMENT ON MAP EXHIBITS FROM BEVIN BEAUDET AND
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LAW OFFICES

SUNDSTROM & MINDLIN, LLP

2548 BLAIRSTONE PINES DR
TALLAHASSEE, FLORIDA 32301

(850) 877-6555 PLEASE REFER TO INVOICE NUMBER
WHEN REMITTING

FIRST COAST REGIONAL UTILITY, INC

Invoice

#:

57567 PAGE 2

2/06/21
2/06/21

2/07/21
2/08/21

2/08/21

2/09/21

2/09/21

2/10/21

2/10/21

2/11/21

2/11/21
2/11/21

2/13/21

WES

RCB

WES
WES

RCB

WES

RCB

WES

RCB

WES

FMD
RCB

WES

SCOTT KELLY; REVIEW AND DISCUSS DISCOVERY

REQUESTS PROPOUNDED BY PSC STAFF

BEGIN DRAFTING PROTOTYPE OPERATIONS AGREEMENT BY 1.50 562.50
AND BETWEEN FIRST COAST AND THE JEA.

CONFERENCES WITH BEVIN BEAUDET AND DEBORAH SWAIN 1.00 375.00
REGARDING STAFF DISCOVERY REQUESTS

COMPLETE FIRST DRAFT OF FIRST COAST OPS CONTRACT. 1.20 450.00
DRAFT, REVIEW AND REVISE MULTIPLE TIMES DRAFT 3.00 1,125.00
CONTRACT OPERATIONS BY AND BETWEEN THE JEA AND

FIRST COAST; FORWARD SAME TO BRANNAN AND WHARTON

FOR THEIR THOUGHTS.

WORK ON MOTION TO COMPEL FORWARD DRAFT TO TEAM 6.70 2,512.50
FOR COMMENTS AND EDITS; WORK WITH CONSULTANTS ON

DISCOVERY REQUESTS FROM STAFF; REVIEW, EDIT AND

COMMENT ON DRAFT OPS CONTRACT FOR JEA

CONTINUE WORK ON DRAFT JEA OPS CONTRACT; ATTORNEY 1.70 637.50
CONFERENCE RELATIVE TO SUGGESTED REVISIONS OF

DRAFT; DICTATE REVISIONS.

CONFERENCE WITH BILL SUNDSTROM AND JOHN WHARTON 2.70 1,012.50
REGARDING DRAFT OPS CONTRACT FOR JEA; CONFERENCES

REGARDING DRAFT MOTION TO COMPEL.

CONTINUE WORKING ON OPERATIONS AGREEMENT; TWO 2.00 750.00
ATTORNEY CONVERSATIONS IN THIS REGARD; SEND DRAFT

PROTOTYPE TO CLIENTS AND WORKING GROUP.

REVIEW AND COMMENT ON REVISED AND EDITED OPS 3.00 1,125.00
CONTRACT FOR JEA; EDIT AND REVISE DRAFT MOTION TO

COMPEL FOLLOWING DISCUSSIONS WITH BILL SUNDSTROM

JOHN WHARTON,
1.50 562.50

REVIEW AND REVISE MOTION TO COMPEL;
DISCUSSIONS WITH JOHN WHARTON AND BOB BRANNAN RE:

SAME.

REVIEW PLEADING RE DISCOVERY AND EDIT .90 337.50
FINALIZE CHANGES TO MOTION TO COMPEL AND 2.50 937.50
CIRCULATE FOR COMMENTS AND FURTHER EDITS

PREPARE FOR AND PARTICIPATE IN ATTORNEY 2.20 825.00
CONFERENCE RELATIVE TO NEXT EVENTS, TIMING OF

DEPOSITIONS, MOTION TO COMPEL PRODUCTION OF

DOCUMENTS, OPERATING AGREEMENT, ETC.; PREPARE
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LAW OFFICES

SUNDSTROM & MINDLIN, LLP

2548 BLAIRSTONE PINES DR
TALLAHASSEE, FLORIDA 32301

F.E.L# 59-2783536 (850) 877-6555 PLEASE REFER TO INVOICE NUMBER
WHEN REMITTING

FIRST COAST REGIONAL UTILITY, INC

Invoice #: 57567 PAGE 3

DETAILED MEMO TO CLIENTS; EMAIL TO CLIENTS
SUMMARIZING NEXT STEPS, PREPARATION FOR TRIAL,
ETC.
2/13/21 RCB PREPARE FOR AND PARTICIPATE IN CONFERENCE CALL 1.40 525.00
WITH BILL SUNDSTROM AND JOHN WHARTON REGARDING
SCHEDULE SENT OUT BY PSC; DISCUSS WHEN TO FILE
MOTION TO COMPEL AND PUBLIC RECORDS REQUEST.

2/14/21 WES EMAIL DISCUSSIONS WITH SCOTT KELLY AND BOB .60 225.00
BRANNAN; REVISION OF MEMO TO CLIENTS.
2/15/21 WES DISCUSSION WITH ATTORNEY FOR JEA RELATIVE TO 2.00 750.00

WITNESS DEPOSITIONS, MOTIONS TO PRODUCE, CONTRACT
OPERATIONS AGREEMENT, ETC.; CONFERENCE CALL WITH
ATTORNEY TEAM RE: SAME, ETC.

2/15/21 FMD REVIEW EMAILS AND SWAIN ATTACHMENTS; RESURFACE 6.00 2,250.00
AVAILABILITY POLICY POINT
2/15/21 RCB NUMEROUS CONFERENCES WITH TEAM MEMBERS REGARDING 4.00 1,500.00

THE MOTION TO COMPEL, DRAFT OPS CONTRACT,
DEPOSITION SCHEDULING, PROPOSED MOTION TO STRIKE
FROM TOM CRABB; WORK ON RESPONSES TO PSC STAFF
DISCOVERY REQUESTS.
2/16/21 WES PREPARE FOR AND PARTICIPATE IN CONFERENCE CALL 1.90 712.50
RELATIVE TO ENGINEERING EXHIBITS, DISCOVERY,
DEPOSITIONS, ETC.; RECEIPT OF MOTION TO COMPEL AS
FILED BY JEA; CONVERSATIONS WITH AVERY ROBERTS
AND MIKE BRAREN IN THIS REGARD; ETC.

2/16/21 FMD INNER OFFICE CONFERENCE RE JEA MATTERS AND MOTION .80 300.00
TO COMPEL; INNER OFFICE DISCUSSION RE SAME

2/16/21 RCB CONTINUE TO WORK WITH TEAM ON RESPONSES TO STAFF 2.00 750.00
DISCOVERY REQUESTS; REVIEW AND DISCUSS JEA MOTION
TO COMPEL

2/17/21 WES RECEIPT OF ADDITIONAL INTERROGATORIES FROM THE 4.00 1,500.00

PSC STAFF AND FORWARD TO GROUP; PREPARE FOR AND
PARTICIPATE IN CONFERENCE CALL WITH ATTORNEYS AND
BOB KENNELLY RE: RESPONDING TO JEA'S RECENT
MOTION TO COMPEL; BEGIN ASSEMBLING INFORMATION IN
AN EFFORT TO DRAFT RESPONSE THERETO; OUTLINE OF
DRAFT RESPONSE TO JEA'S MOTION TO COMPEL.
2/17/21 FMD INNER OFFICE CONFERENCE RE JEA MOTION TO COMPEL; .70 262.50
REVIEW PSC RULES
2/17/21 RCB CONTINUE TO WORK WITH TEAM ON STAFF DISCOVERY 3.60 1,350.00
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LAW OFFICES

SUNDSTROM & MINDLIN, LLP

2548 BLAIRSTONE PINES DR
TALLAHASSEE, FLORIDA 32301

F.E.|.# 59-2783536 (850) 877-6555 PLEASE REFER TO INVOICE NUMBER
WHEN REMITTING

FIRST COAST REGIONAL UTILITY, INC

Invoice #: 57567 PAGE 4

RESPONSES; CONFERENCES WITH BILL SUNDSTROM AND
JOHN WHARTON REGARDING DEPOSITION SCHEDULING AND
TOPICS FOR Bé DEPO; FINALIZE MOTION TO COMPEL AND
FILE WITH THE PSC
2/18/21 WES FURTHER DRAFTING AND REDRAFTING OF FIRST COAST'S 4.50 1,687.50
RESPONSE TO JEA'S MOTION TO COMPEL DISCOVERY AND
ACCOMPANYING AFFIDAVIT OF ROBERT KENNELLY;
MULTIPLE REVISIONS THERETO; DISCUSSIONS WITH
MESSRS KENNELLY, BRANNAN AND WHARTON.

2/18/21 FMD REVIEW AND EDIT DRAFT RESPONSE TO JEA MOTION TO 1.20 450.00
COMPEL AND AFFIDAVIT; REVIEW FCUC MOTION TO
COMPEL

2/18/21 RCB CONTINUE WORKING ON RESPONSES TO PSC DISCOVERY 2.30 862.50

REQUESTS; REVIEW NEW SET OF DISCOVERY REQUESTS
FROM PSC STAFF
2/19/21 WES CONTINUE WORKING ON FCRU'S RESPONSE TO JEA'S 4.50 1,687.50
MOTION TO COMPEL DISCOVERY AND AFFIDAVIT OF
ROBERT KENNELLY; CONVERSATIONS WITH AVERY ROBERTS
RELATIVE TO A SERIES A MATTERS; SEVERAL ATTORNEY
CALLS RELATIVE TO DISCOVERY, PUBLIC RECORDS
REQUESTS, WITNESS PREP, ETC.
2/19/21 RCB REVIEW AND COMMENT ON RESPONSE TO JEA MOTION TO 3.30 1,237.50
COMPEL; CONFERENCE CALL WITH TEAM TO DISCUSS
RESPONSE TO MOTION TO COMPEL; COMPLETE RESPONSES
TO STAFF DISCOVERY REQUESTS

2/20/21 WES REVIEW NOTES AND PREPARE "BULLET POINTS" FOR 1.00 375.00
SETTLEMENT DISCUSSION PURPOSES.
2/22/21 RCB WORK WITH BRONWYN FOR FINAL FORMATTING OF TARIFF 2.70 1,012.50

PAGES AND RESPONSES TO STAFF DISCOVERY FOR FILING
WITH THE COMMISSION; FINAL EDITS TO TEXT IN
RESPONSE TO COMMENTS FROM TEAM
2/23/21 WES DRAFT, REVIEW AND REVISE DISCUSSION POINTS MEMO 3.50 1,312.50
FOR USE BY AVERY AND MIKE IN UPCOMING MEETINGS;
REVIEW RESPONSE TO JEA'S MOTION TO COMPEL WITH R.
KENNELLY, J. WHARTON AND R. BRANNAN; FINALIZE
AFFIDAVIT AND ACCOMPANYING PLEADING AND PREPARE
FOR FILING; COORDINATE SETTING OF DEPOSITIONS
WITH JEA WITNESSES; BEGIN WITNESS DEPO OUTLINES,
ETC.
2/23/21 RCB FINAL SIGN OFF ON DISCOVERY RESPONSES AND FILING 2.40 900.00
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LAW OFFICES

SUNDSTROM & MINDLIN, LLP

2548 BLAIRSTONE PINES DR
TALLAHASSEE, FLORIDA 32301

(850) 877-6555 PLEASE REFER TO INVOICE NUMBER
WHEN REMITTING

FIRST COAST REGIONAL UTILITY, INC

Invoice #:

57567 PAGE 5

2/24/21 WES

2/24/21 WES

2/24/21 RCB

2/25/21 RCB

2/26/21 WES

WITH THE PSC; REVIEW AND COMMENT ON AFFIDAVIT AND

TEXT FOR RESPONSE TO JEA MOTION TO COMPEL;

CONFERENCE WITH BILL SUNDSTROM AND JOHN WHARTON

TO FINALIZE RESPONSE

REVIEW JEA RESPONSES TO FIRST COAST'S MOTION TO 1.50 562.50
COMPEL DISCOVERY; FINALIZE AND FILE FIRST COAST'S

RESPONSES TO JEA'S MOTION TO COMPEL DISCOVERY;

CONVERSATION WITH BOB KENNELLY RELATIVE TO

PROCEDURE GOING FORWARD ETC.; CONVERSATION WITH

AVERY ROBERTS RELATIVE TO POSSIBLE DEAL POINTS

FURTHER REVIEW OF JEA'S LATEST PLEADINGS BEFORE 3.00 1,125.00
THE FLORIDA PUBLIC SERVICE COMMISSION, COORDINATE

DEPOSITION DATES; RECEIPT OF BRIEFING FROM AVERY

AND MIKE RELATIVE TO ONGOING ACTIVITIES; BEGIN

ASSEMBLING MEMORANDUM BACK TO AVERY AND MIKE

RELATIVE TO INSTANCES WHEREIN THE JEA HAS

INVESTED IN FACILITIES ON BEHALF OF PRIVATE

DEVELOPERS
WORK WITH TEAM ON SCHEDULING DEPOSITIONS FOR JEA 1.00 375.00
PERSONNEL
NUMEROUS DISCUSSIONS REGARDING DEPOSITION 2.80 1,050.00

SCHEDULING; REVIEW JEA RESPONSE TO MOTION TO
COMPEL; CONFERENCE WITH BILL SUNDSTROM AND JOHN
WHARTON REGARDING JEA RESPONSE.

RECEIPT AND REVIEW OF JEA'S PETITION FOR WRIT OF 5.70 2,137.50
PROHIBITION AS FILED IN THE FIRST DISTRICT COURT
OF APPEALS, MULTIPLE DISCUSSIONS WITH MIKE BRAREN
AND AVERY ROBERTS; BRIEFING OF BOB KENNELLY RE
SAME; ATTORNEY CONFERENCE RELATIVE TO HASHING THE
WHOLE THING OUT; PRODUCTION OF MEMORANDUM TO
CLIENTS EXPLAINING IN DETAIL THE STATUS OF THIS
CASE, OUR SUGGESTED COURSE OF ACTION, ETC.; DRAFT
AND REDRAFT OF MEMORANDUM NOTES FOR THE USE OF
AVERY AND MIKE RELATIVE TO EXAMPLES OF WHERE THE
JEA HAS INVESTED MONEY ON BEHALF OF THE
DEVELOPMENT COMMUNITY; DISCUSSIONS WITH SCOTT
KELLY AND BEVIN BEAUDET IN THE COURSE OF DRAFTING
THAT MEMORANDUM; FORWARDING IT ON TO SCOTT AND
BEVIN FOR THEIR REVIEW AND EDITS PRIOR TO
SUBMISSION TO AVERY AND MIKE
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LAW OFFICES

SUNDSTROM & MINDLIN, LLP

2548 BLAIRSTONE PINES DR
TALLAHASSEE, FLORIDA 32301

FIRST COAST REGIONAL UTILITY, INC

F.E.L# 59-2783536 (850) 877-6555 PLEASE REFER TO INVOICE NUMBER
WHEN REMITTING

Invoice #: 57567 PAGE 6
2/26/21 FMD REVIEW JEA PETITION TO 1ST DCA REVIEW RULES; 2.90 1,087.50
PREPARE FOR AND PARTICIPATE IN CONFERENCE CALL RE
SAME ; REVIEW PRIOR PSC CASE RE NOCATEE
UTILITIES AND PREPARE TIMELINE WITH JEA DOCUMENTS
2/26/21 RCB PREPARE FOR AND PARTICIPATE IN LAWYER CALL 1.40 525.00
REGARDING JEA PETITION FOR WRIT OF PROHIBITION
2/27/21 RCB WORK ON LATEST STAFF DISCOVERY REQUESTS 1.00 375.00
TOTAL HOQOURS 122.20
PROFESSIONAL FEES $ 45,825.00
WILLIAM E SUNDSTROM 54 .90 20,587.50
F MARSHALL DETERDING 12.50 4,687.50
ROBERT C BRANNAN 54.80 20,550.00
PROFESSIONAL SERVICES 15,167.50
TOTAL COSTS ADVANCED $ 15,167.50

TOTAL STATEMENT $ 60,992.50
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| C H E C I( R E d1i§1§uspl1nental Response to Staff 8th POD #26
Date NS CQ: \>7)

Check Payable To RQ,U inA. BQGQF}G’J‘ PP ; LLC | $ A0.00

Charge To: Client __ (ST (pasT Bill Client $_2 2500
File No LR 0 0 / (includes costs directly charged
; ' to the firm)
Date of Travel

Type of Expense Y ny ” S

Special Instructions

Check if to be paid

from Trust Account

v 3ol - | Signature
Needed BY,. :&Sq 0/

Date




Bevin A. Beaudet, P.E., LLC

babeaudet@gmail.com

BILLTO

William E Sundstrom PA
Sundstrom & Mindlin, LLP
2548 Blairstone Pines Dr.
Tallahassee, FL 32301

Docket No. 20190168-WS
FCRU Document 1914
11/15/21 Supplemental Response to Staff 8th POD #26

INVOICE # 1175
DATE 03/03/2021
DUE DATE 04/02/2021
TERMS Net 30

EER FRATIN

Constlting

Bevin A. Beaudet, P.E., LLC
1543 Maple St.

Bethlehem, PA 18017

Finalize map exhibits, coordination and conferance calls, review and
edit deliverables

10 225.00 2,250.00

BALANCE DUE
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CHECK REQU T |
Date ﬁé QJ

Check Payable To M\(J@ﬁ&mlﬂ ;f?q&fn&ﬂﬁc/ $ 37250 .

Charge To: Client Hest C/m T Bill Client $ S Q -

. ) (includes costs directly charged -
File No. 40w O) . to the firm) ‘
Date of Travel

Type of Expense T ﬁ V L#}SQ?

Special Instructions
[[] Checkif to be paid B (\_/[;(x H/
from Trust Account C e = Sienat
B_CO'Q/ . ignature
Needed By : +H SLH07

Date
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2025 8. W. 32" dvenne
: =\ Miami, Florida 33145
——— Tel.: 305-441-0123 Fax: 305-441-0688

Milian, Swain & Associates, Inc,

www.milianswain.com

Civil Englneers @ Environmental Scientists & Engineers = Utility Management = Financial Consultants
INVOICE

William E. Sundstrom, P.A. Invoice Date: March 2, 202

Sundstrom & Mindlin, LLP Invoice Numbey: 44589

Attorneys at Law Page #1 Billing # 15

2548 Blairstoune Pines Drive
Tallahassee, F1, 32301

Re; First Coast.Regionnl Utilities, LLC
For Professional services rendered through February 26, 2021

Hours Rate Amount
Principal
Deboral Swain 11.00 225.00 2,475.00
Senior Staff Accountant
Cynthia Yapp 8.50 175.00 1,487.50
Engineering Technician
Adam Swain 90.00 0.00
Total Hours 19.50
Total For Invoice # 44589 $3,962.50
Total Amount Due: $3,962.50

Please make check payable to Milian, Swain & Associates, Inc
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Time/Expenses by Project Report

11/15/21 Supplemental Response to Staff 8th POD #26

Order Time By: Employee 1D Milian, Swain & Associates Page 1
Order Expense By: Expense # Project: F16-01
Status: Ready Hold Billed Never Billed Period: 02/01/2021 — 02/2612021
Project’  Project Name SJ Ctel # Slnvi#
Phase/Tasl/Employee Employee Name Dep Staff P/E Work Dale  OVT ST STATE Hours Worked  Blilable Hours
F16-01 FCRU-New Certlificate
cY Cynthia Yapp FIN 007 02/05/2021 02/05/2021 N R 7.50 7.50
[Responses {o Slaff's 5th Interrogolories / 6th POD J
cyY Cynthia Yapp FIN 007  02/12/2021 02/12/2021 N R 0.50 0.50
Besponses to Staff's 5th Interrogolories / 6th POD ]
cY Cynthia Yapp FIN 007  02/19/2021 02/119/2021 N R 0.25 0.25
Data collection Setvice Avallability Policy
cY Cynthia Yapp FIN 007  02/26/2021 02/26/2021 N R 0.25 0.25
Dala review Exhibit H PSC 6th POD
DS Deborah Swain FIN 001 02/05/2021 02/05/2021 N R 0.50 0.50
Discovery, coordination, communication
coordination
DS Deborah Swaln FIN 001  02/12/2021 02/42/2021 N R 2.25 2.25
Discovery, coordinalion, communicalion
coordination
DS Deborah Swain FIN 001  02/19/2021 02/18/2021 N R 5.75 575
Discovery, coordination, communication
coordination
DS Deborah Swain FIN 001 02/26/2021 02/26/2021 N R 250 2.50
coordination and review
Subtotal Task 19.50 19.50
Subtolal Phase 19.50 19.50
Total Project F16-01 19.50 19.50

Run Date: Mar 2, 2021 @ 16:05:09

TIMEEXPRPT.FRX
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CHECK REQUE
Date \SCQ a—/

Check Payable To SQOH‘ ‘/k&/ Iy (VO Kl 7ina; LLC 3 } O/ Q 0
=) ), |

Charge To: Client P(‘;—F Oﬁﬁﬁ“_ | Bill Clieht'$ {O/ o 50

i . (includes costs directly charged
File No. : U000 .0] AP ,
Date of Travel -

Type of Expense Inv OO0

Special Instructions
Checlk if to be paid N (Q@H/
from Trust Account Al (or Q/f 7 Signature
>
Needed By RSO

Date
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Scoit Kelly Consuliing, LLG
241 OCEANWALK DRIVE SOUTH
Allantlc Beach, FL 32233 US

+1 9048134349
scottksllyconsulting@amail.com

P 009
First Coast Regional Utifities, Inc. . 03/02/2021
Met 30
04/01/2021
ACTITY DEGCRIPTI S ERE
02/01/2021 Consulting Consulting Services for Month of 4.50 -225.00 1,012.50
February

e ‘ $1,012.50

A ! i
PRI L
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CHECK RE Q1ﬁ1ﬁug>lerental Response to Staff 8th POD #26

Check Payable To bﬁq N m @d

Date

Charge To: Client I:I‘ St COQ)S t

File No. Lo Ho )

Date of Travel

Type of Expense Ty 38859

0 2]

s 922500 |

Bill Client $ 9225 d0

(includes costs directly charged
to the firm) :

Special Instructions

Check if to be paid
from Trust Account

Needed B PEwYY
e Date HS4o9d

oy

Signature




Docket No. 20190168-WS
FCRU Document 1921

D E A N 11/15/21 Supplemental Response to Staff 8th POD #26
Dean, Mead, Egerton, B|oodwoﬁh,l0apouano & Bozarth, P.A, 407-841-1200 Orlando

420 S, Orange Avenue, Suite 700 » 407-423-1831 Fax Fort Plerce

P.0. Box 2346 (ZIP 32802-2346) www.deanmead.com Viera

Orlando, Florida 32801 Fed Tax ID# 59-2049716 Tallahassee

FIRST COAST REGIONAL UTILITIES, INC. February 17, 2021

ATTN: WILLIAM SUNDSTROM ID: 038587.074956

2548 BLAIRSTONE PINES DRIVE INVOICE # 378892
TALLAHASSEE, FL, 32801 JLW

RE: JURISDICTIONAL ISSUE FOR DECLARATION

FOR PROFESSIONAL SERVICES RENDERED:

TOTAL FEES ‘ $9,225.00
ATTY CLASS HOURS RATE  AMOUNT
JLW Partner 20,50  450.00 9,225.00

ATTY TOTALS 20.50 9,225.00

' PREVIOUS STATEMENTS OUTSTANDING

BILLED PAYMENTS BALANCE

INVOICE # 378093 January 25, 2021 12,597.00 0.00 12,597.00
TOTAL OUTSTANDING INVOICES: $12,597.00
TOTAL CURRENT AMOUNT DUE ' $21,822.00

THIS INVOICE IS PAYABLE UPON RECEHT,

PLEASE RETURN THIS PAGE WITH YOUR REMITTANCE OR PAY INVOICES
ONLINE AT WWW . DEANMEAD.COM
WE ACCEPT VISA, MASTERCARD, DISCOYER, AND AMERICAN EXPRESS
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Dean, Mead, Egerton, Bloodworth, Capouano & Bozarth, P.A. 407-841-1200 Orlando
420 S, Orange Avenue, Suite 700 : 407-423-1831 Fax Fort Plerce
P.0. Box 2346 (ZIP 32802-2346) www.deanmead.com Viera
Orlando, Florida 32801 Fed Tax D# 59-20497 16 Tallahassee
FIRST COAST REGIONAL UTILITIES, INC. F.ebruary 17,2021
ATTN: WILLIAM SUNDSTROM ID: 038587.074956
2548 BLAIRSTONE PINES DRIVE INVOICE # 378892
TALLAHASSEE, FL. 32801 JLW

RE: JURISDICTIONAL ISSUE FOR DECLARATION
FOR PROFESSIONAL SERVICES RENDERED:

ITEMIZED ATTORNEY FEES

DESCRIPTION DATE ATTY HOURS RATE AMOUNT

CONTINUED RESEARCH AND 01/18/21 JLW 240  450.00 1080.00
REVIEW OF JEA DISCOVERY

RESPONSES; RESEARCH RE:

BEST WAY FORWARD;

PREPARATION FOR AND

PARTICIPATE IN

CONFERENCE CALL.

RESEARCH RE: LANGUAGE 01/20/21 JLW 120 450.00 540.00
OF JI'S ORDER AND EMAILS
RE: SAME.

REVIEW COMMISSION 01/25/21 JLW 110 450.00 495.00
ORDER; CALL WITH WES;

EMAILS RE: SAME AND BEST

WAY TO PROCEED.

PREPARATION FOR AND 01/126/21 JLW .10 450.00 495.00
PARTICIPATE IN STRATEGY
CALL.

TWO CALLS REGARDING 0127121 JLW 1.00  450.00 450.00
STATUS AND BEST WAY TO

PROCEED; CALL WITH

STAFF COUNSEL; REVIEW

COMMISSION SCHEDULE;

EMAILS REGARDING THE

PATH FORWARD.

# SERVICES PROVIDED BY PARALEGAL OR LAW CLERK




DEAN
MEAD

Dean, Mead, Egerton, Bloodworth, Capouano & Bozarth, P.A.

420 S. Orange Avenue, Suite 700
P.0. Box 2346 (ZIP 32802-2346)
Orlando, Florida 32801

407-841-1200

407-423-1831 Fax
www.deanmead.com

Fed Tax ID# 59-20497 16

FIRST COAST REGIONAL UTILITIES, INC.

038587.074956
February 17,2021
Page 2

DESCRIPTION

DATE ATTY

HOURS

Docket No. 20190168-WS
FCRU Document 1923
11/15/21 Supplemental Response to Staff 8th POD #26

Orlando

Fort Plerce

Viera

Tallahassee

RATE

AMOUNT

CALL WITH STAFF
COUNSEL; CALL BETWEEN
COUNSEL; EMAILS
REGARDING CASE.

CONFERENCE CALL WITH
TEAM; CALL WITH WES;
CALLS AND EMAILS
REGARDING CASE.

MALES REGARDING
INCLUSION AND DOCKET;
REVIEWING DOCKET.

NUMEROUS EMAILS
REGARDING STATUS AND
BEST WAY TO PROCEED.

DEEP DIVE INTO
JURISDICTIONAL BASIS OF
JEA'S JURISDICTION AND
EFFECT OF LANGUAGE ON
367 ON VARIOUS OPTIONS
FOR SERVICE.

CONFERENCE CALL;
RESEARCH RE:
OPERATIONAL EXEMPTION
LANGUAGE.

INITIAL REVIEW OF
OPERATIONS AGREEMENT.

CONFERENCE CALL RE:
OPERATIONS AGREEMENT
AND STATUS.

REVIEWING OPERATIONS

AGREEMENT ON EMAILS RE:

01/28/21 JLW

01/29/21 JLW

01/31/21 JLW

02/03/21 JLW

02/04/21 JLW

02/05/21 JLW

02/08/21 JLW

02/09/21 JLW

02/10/21 JLW

4 SERVICES PROVIDED BY PARALEGAL OR LAW CLERK

0.90

1.80

0.30

0.80

2.90

1.10

0.60

0.80

0.70

450.00

450.00

450.00

450.00

450.00

450.00

450.00

450.00

450,00

405.00

810.00

135.00

360.00

1305.00

495.00

270.00

360.00

315.00




DEAN

MEAD

Dean, Mead, Egerton, Bloodworth, Capouano & Bozarth, P.A,
420 S, Orange Avenue, Suite 700

P.0. Box 2346 (ZIP 32802-2346)

Ortando, Florida 32801

FIRST COAST REGIONAL UTILITIES, INC.
038587.074956
February 17, 2021

Docket No. 20190168-WS
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407-841-1200 Orlando
407-423-1831 Fax Fort Pierce
www.deanmead.com Viera

Fed Tax ID# 59-2049716 Tallahassee

A

Page 3
DESCRIPTION DATE ATTY HOURS RATE AMOUNT
SAME,; ,
REVIEW PROCEDURE ORDER 02/11/21 JLW 1.00  450.00 450.00
AND NUMEROUS EMAILS
RE: SAME. ,
DRAFTING DEPOSITION 02/14/21 JLW 0.90  450.00 405.00
DEMAND LETTER AND
PUBLIC RECORDS REQUEST.
REVIEW EMAILS RE: 02/15/21 JLW 1.90  450.00 855.00
MOTION TO STRIKE AND
DEPOSITIONS; CALL WITH
CO-COUNSEL.
SUBTOTAL: $9,225.00
ATTY CLASS HOURS RATE  AMOUNT
JLW Partner 20.50  450.00 9,225.00
ATTY TOTALS 20.50 9,225.00

PREVIOUS STATEMENTS OUTSTANDING

INVOICE# 378093 January 25, 2021

BILLED PAYMENTS BALANCE
12,597.00 0.00 12,597.00

TOTAL OUTSTANDING INVOICES: $12,597.00

TOTAL CURRENT AMOUNT DUE

$21,822.00

* SERVICES PROVIDED BY PARALEGAL OR LAW CLERK
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LAW OFFICES

SUNDSTROM & MINDLIN, LLP

2548 BLAIRSTONE PINES DR
TALLAHASSEE, FLORIDA 32301

F.E.L# 59-2783536 (850) 877-6555 PLEASE REFER TO INVOICE NUMBER
WHEN REMITTING

FIRST COAST REGIONAL UTILITY, INC
301 CAPITAL PARTNERS, LLC

C/O AVERY C. ROBERTS APRIL 10, 2021

P.O. BOX 238 INVOICE # 57625

LAKE BUTLER, FL 32054 FILE # 48070-00001
PAGE 1

MATTER: ORIGINAL CERTIFICATE FROM PSC

3/01/21 WES PARTICIPATION IN CONFERENCE CALL WITH BOB 3.60 1,350.00
KENNELLY, FIRST COAST FACT WITNESSES, AND
ATTORNEYS RELATIVE TO PREPARING FOR UPCOMING
DEPOSITIONS; FIRST COAST ZOOM CALL PRACTICE
SESSION; MULTIPLE CLIENT CALLS; REVISE AND ISSUE
PAPER ON EXAMPLES OF MATTERS WHEREIN THE JEA HAS
EXPENDED ITS FUNDS FOR THE BENEFIT OF DEVELOPERS
PER CONVERSATION WITH JEA PER AVERY AND MIKE'S
CONVERSATION WITH JEA EXECUTIVE DIRECTOR; THREE
ADDITIONAL CALLS WITH SCOTT KELLY AND TWO WITH
BEVIN BEAUDET, ALL AS REGARDS SUCH MEMO,
PREPARATION, ETC.

3/01/21 FMD REVIEW JEA PETITION; PARTICIPATE IN REVIEW OF 1.10 412.50
ZOOM PROCEDURES FOR DEPO.
3/01/21 RCB PREPARE FOR AND PARTICIPATE IN CONFERENCE CALLS 3.00 1,125.00

IN PREPARATION FOR DEPOSITIONS; PRACTICE ZOOM
CALL FOR DEPOSITIONS AND EVENTUAL COMMISSION
PROCEEDING; CALLS WITH CLIENTS, BILL SUNDSTROM
AND POTENTIAL WITNESSES.
3/02/21 WES CONVERSATION WITH AVERY ROBERTS RELATIVE TO 2.50 937.50
STATUS OF MATTER; RECEIPT OF ORDER TO SHOW CAUSE
ISSUED AGAINST FIRST COAST FROM THE FIRST
DISTRICT COURT OF APPEALS RELATIVE TO WRIT OF
PROHIBITION; ATTORNEY TEAM CONVERSATIONS RE:
SAME; BRIEFING TO AVERY ROBERTS, BOB KENNELLY;
EMAIL TO CLIENTS RELATIVE TO NEXT STEPS, ETC.
3/02/21 WES DISCUSSION WITH AVERY ROBERTS RELATIVE TO STATUS 2.30 862.50
OF MATTER AND NEXT STEPS RELATIVE TO HIS
PROCEEDING WITH JAY STOWE; RECEIPT OF ORDER FROM
THE FIRST DISTRICT COURT OF APPEALS REQUIRING
FIRST COAST TO SHOW CAUSE; CONVERSATIONS WITH
AVERY ROBERTS, BOB KENNELLY; ATTORNEY CONFERENCE
RELATIVE TO PSC STAFF'S POSITION; RECEIPT OF
COMMUNICATION FROM PSC STAFF THAT THEY WILL
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LAW OFFICES
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SUNDSTROM & MINDLIN, LLP

2548 BLAIRSTONE PINES DR
TALLAHASSEE, FLORIDA 32301

(850) 877-6555

FIRST COAST REGIONAL UTILITY, INC

Invoice #:

57625 PAGE

PLEASE REFER TO INVOICE NUMBER

WHEN REMITTING

3/02/21 FMD
3/02/21 RCB

3/03/21 WES

3/03/21 RCB

3/04/21 FMD
3/04/21 RCB

3/05/21 WES

3/05/21 RCB

3/09/21 WES

EXPECT FIRST COAST TO TAKE THE LEAD AS
"RESPONDENT"; EMAIL TO CLIENTS RELATIVE TO STATUS
OF MATTER, CANCELING OF DEPOSITIONS; EMAIL TO
PAUL HARDEN IN THIS REGARD.

REVIEW EMAILS AND FIRST DCA ORDER TO SHOW CAUSE.
RECEIPT AND REVIEW OF ORDER TOC SHOW CAUSE
REGARDING JEA'S PETITION FOR WRIT OF PROHIBITION;
CONFERENCE CALLS WITH BILL SUNDSTROM AND JOHN
WHARTON REGARDING SHOW CAUSE ORDER; REVIEW AND
COMMENT ON EMAIL OUTLINING NEXT STEPS IN COURT
ACTION; PERFORM RESEARCH ON WHETHER WE NEED TO
RESPOND TO PETITION OR TO SHOW CAUSE;
COMMUNICATIONS WITH PSC STAFF ATTORNEYS REGARDING
RESPONSES TO ORDER TO SHOW CAUSE.

STATUS CONFERENCE WITH AVERY ROBERTS; DRAFTING OF
MEMO OF LEGAL POINTS TO SHARE WITH JOHN WHARTON
AND BOB BRANNAN; SET UP ATTORNEY CONFERENCE RE:
OUTLINE OF REPLY TO ORDER TO SHOW CAUSE SET FOR
MARCH 9TH; GENERAL HOUSEKEEPING.

WORK WITH BILL AND JOHN ON POINTS TO BE RAISED IN
RESPONSE TO ORDER TO SHOW CAUSE; CONFERENCES WITH
BILL SUNDSTROM AND JOHN WHARTON.

REVIEW JEA BRIEF AND EMAILS RE: SAME.

FINISH UP LAST REMAINING DISCOVERY REQUESTS FROM
PSC STAFF.

PREPARATION OF MEMO TO 301 CAPITAL PARTNERS
RELATIVE TO PROVISION OF WATER AND WASTEWATER
SERVICES TO A 50 ACRE INDUSTRIAL ZONED PARCEL
OWNED AND/OR CONTROLLED BY THE PARTNERS IN NASSAU
COUNTY ABSENT JEA INTERFERENCE; PREPARATION OF A
MEMO TO 301 RELATIVE TO THE ESTIMATED TIMETABLE
GOING FORWARD CONSIDERING WRIT OF PROHIBITION AND
SHOW CAUSE ISSUED BY THE FDCA; DISCUSSION WITH
AVERY ROBERTS RE: SAME.

REVIEW AND COMMENT ON MEMO FROM BILL SUNDSTROM
REGARDING NASSAU COUNTY FRANCHISE; REVIEW AND
ANALYZE FRANCHISE AGREEMENT AND DISCUSS WITH BILL
SUNDSTROM

ATTORNEY CONFERENCE RE: REVISION OF SCHEDULE FOR
SUBMITTING RESPONSE TO FDCA ORDER TO SHOW CAUSE

.50
4.30

.30

187.50
1,612.50

750.00

750.00

112.50
937.50

562.50

975.00

375.00
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LAW OFFICES

SUNDSTROM & MINDLIN, LLP

2548 BLAIRSTONE PINES DR
TALLAHASSEE, FLORIDA 32301

F.E.L# 58-2783536 (850) 877-6555 PLEASE REFER TO INVOICE NUMBER
WHEN REMITTING

FIRST COAST REGIONAL UTILITY, INC

Invoice #: 57625 v PAGE 3

ISSUED AGAINST FIRST COAST; ORGANIZATION OF
PLEADING, ETC.
3/09/21 RCB CONFERENCE CALL WITH BILL SUNDSTROM AND JOHN 2.60 975.00
WHARTON REGARDING LOGISTICS AND ISSUES IN
RESPONSE TO SHOW CAUSE ORDER; WORK ON ISSUES FOR

RESPONSE.

3/19/21 WES REVIEW DRAFT OF BRIEF TO FIRST DISTRICT COURT OF 1.50 562.50
APPEALS; COMMENTS THEREON.

3/19/21 RCB REVIEW AND COMMENT ON INITIAL DRAFT OF RESPONSE 2.00 750.00
TO ORDER TO SHOW CAUSE.

3/20/21 WES CONTINUE TO WORK ON BRIEF AT THE FDCA. 1.30 487.50

3/20/21 RCB CONTINUE WORKING ON DRAFT RESPONSE TO SHOW CAUSE 1.00 375.00
ORDER

3/21/21 WES REVIEW JEA PETITION AGAIN RELATIVE TO REVISION OF 1.20 450.00
FIRST COAST BRIEF.

3/21/21 RCB CONTINUE WORKING ON RESPONSE TO SHOW CAUSE ORDER. 1.40 525.00

3/22/21 WES PREPARE FOR AND PARTICIPATE IN ATTORNEY 3.00 1,125.00

CONFERENCE CALL RELATIVE TO WORKING ON BRIEF TO
BE FILED WITH THE FIRST DCA; CONVERSATION WITH

3/22/21 RCB PREPARE FOR AND PARTICIPATE IN CONFERENCE CALL 2.70 1,012.50
AND WORK SESSION WITH BILL SUNDSTROM AND JOHN
WHARTON ON RESPONSE TO SHOW CAUSE ORDER;
CONFERENCES WITH BILL SUNDSTROM REGARDING NASSAU
COUNTY FRANCHISE AGREEMENT WITH JEA AND BRIEFING
ON MEETINGS BETWEEN CLIENTS AND NASSAU COUNTY
OFFICIALS. ’
3/23/21 WES PREPARATION FOR CONFERENCE WITH NASSAU COUNTY 3.50 1,312.50
ATTORNEY MIKE MULLIN, INCLUDING REVIEW OF
INTERLOCAL AGREEMENT BETWEEN JEA AND NASSAU
COUNTY; CONVERSATIONS WITH SCOTT KELLY RELATIVE
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LAW OFFICES

SUNDSTROM & MINDLIN, LLP

2548 BLAIRSTONE PINES DR
TALLAHASSEE, FLORIDA 32301

F.E.|.# 58-2783536 (850) 877-6565 PLEASE REFER TO INVOICE NUMBER
WHEN REMITTING

FIRST COAST REGIONAL UTILITY, INC

Invoice #: 57625 PAGE 4

TO JEA'S EXPANSION (OR LACK THEREOF) OF UTILITY
FACILITIES IN NASSAU COUNTY; DRAFT AND REDRAFT
TALKING POINTS; HAVE CONVERSATION WITH MIKE
MULLIN AND DRAFTING OF NOTES TO FILE FOLLOWING
THAT CONVERSATION; BRIEFING TO MIKE BRAREN AND
AVERY ROBERTS RE: SAME.
3/23/21 RCB REVIEW AND DISCUSS NASSAU COUNTY INTERLOCAL 3.50 1,312.50
AGREEMENT WITH BILL SUNDSTROM IN PREPARATION FOR
HIS CALL WITH NASSAU COUNTY ATTORNEY; REVIEW AND
COMMENT ON DRAFTS OF ITEMS TO RAISE OR DISCUSS IN
CALL; CONTINUE REVISING RESPONSE TO SHOW CAUSE
ORDER.
3/24/21 WES ATTORNEY CONFERENCE CALL RELATIVE TO ADDITIONAL 3.00 1,125.00
MODIFICATIONS TO BRIEF; SEVERAL REVISIONS TO
BRIEF; DISCUSSION WITH OUTSIDE ATTORNEY
SPECIALIZING IN APPELLATE PRACTICE.
3/24/21 RCB CONTINUE REVISING AND WORKING ON RESPONSE TO SHOW 3.00 1,125.00
CAUSE ORDER; CONFERENCE CALL REGARDING SAME WITH .
BILL SUNDSTROM AND JOHN WHARTON.
3/25/21 WES FOLLOW UP ATTORNEY MEETING RELATIVE TO CONTENTS 3.20 1,200.00
OF BRIEF; REVISE BRIEF TWO MORE TIMES AND FORWARD
TO GROUP; BRIEFING TO BOB KENNELLY AS TO. STATUS _-
OF MATTER; ’

3/25/21 FMD REVIEW RESPONSE BRIEF AND OFFER COMMENTS AND 1.30 487.50
SUGGESTIONS.
3/25/21 RCB CONTINUE WORKING ON RESPONSE TO SHOW CAUSE; 3.00 1,125.00

CONFERENCES WITH BILL SUNDSTROM AND JOHN WHARTON
REGARDING FINAL REVISIONS PRIOR TO CIRCULATING
DRAFT TO CLIENTS FOR REVIEW AND COMMENT.
3/26/21 WES FURTHER REVISIONS TO BRIEF TO FIRST DCA; ATTORNEY 2.00 750.00
CONFERENCE RELATIVE TO ADDITIONAL REVISIONS TO
BRIEF PRIOR TO FORWARDING IT TO CLIENT AS
SEMI-FINAL DOCUMENT; MAKING OF THOSE REVISIONS
AND DISTRIBUTING IT TO BOB KENNELLY AND DENISE
HOWARD.
3/26/21 RCB FINAL REVISIONS TO RESPONSE TO SHOW CAUSE AND 1.50 562.50
: DISCUSSIONS REGARDING SAME WITH BILL SUNDSTROM
AND JOHN WHARTON.
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LAW OFFICES

SUNDSTROM & MINDLIN, LLP

2548 BLAIRSTONE PINES DR
TALLAHASSEE, FLORIDA 32301

F.E.L# 59-2783536 (850) 877-6555 PLEASE REFER TO INVOICE NUMBER
WHEN REMITTING

FIRST COAST REGIONAL UTILITY, INC

Invoice #: 57625 PAGE 5

3/29/21 WES SEND FINAL EDITS TO BRIEF TO JOHN WHARTON; 1.20 450.00
DISCUSSION WITH ROBERT KENNELLY RELATIVE TO
FILING; DISCUSSION WITH AVERY ROBERTS WHO CALLED
RELATIVE TO ISSUES WITH CITY OF JACKSONVILLE.

3/31/21 WES RECEIPT AND REVIEW OF PSC STAFF'S RESPONSE TO 1.50 562.50
ORDER TO SHOW CAUSE AS FILED WITH THE FIRST DCA;
DRAFTING OF REPORT TO CLIENTS AS TO THE CONTENTS
OF THE BRIEF AND OUR TAKE ON IT.

3/31/21 FMD REVIEW PSC RESPONSIVE BRIEF TO JEA IN FIRST DCA .90 337.50
AND INTEROFFICE CONFERENCE RE: SAME.
3/31/21 RCB REVIEW AND DISCUSS PSC STAFF RESPONSE TO SHOW 2.00 750.00

CAUSE ORDER.

TOTAL HOURS 75.50
PROFESSIONAL FEES $ 28,312.50
WILLIAM E SUNDSTROM 34.30 12,862.50
F MARSHALL DETERDING 4.10 1,537.50
ROBERT C BRANNAN 37.10 13,912.50
PROFESSIONAL SERVICES 24,273.50
TOTAL COSTS ADVANCED $ 24,273.50

TOTAL STATEMENT $ 52,586.00
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CHECK RE Q1M1Eugl%ental Response to Staff 8th POD #26

Date | /\,)/Q/

Check Payable To &UYD A @QUQI(Q nl./. pE Z— LC $ QCD DD

Charge To: Client F (St CCL/QS + Bill Client $ QOO 0
File No. L‘_ 80 0.0 / (includes costs directly charged
Date of Travel to the firm)

Type of Expense Tﬁ Vv ] / 7\7

Special Instructions

[ ] Checkif to be paid . (@H_’/

from Trust Account ' 7 ;
‘ 4397 . Signature
Needed By # SY| \_}L7L

Date




Bevin A. Beaudet, P.E,1LC

babeaudet@grhail.com

BiLTO

William E Sundstrom PA
Sundstrom & Mindiin, LLP
2548 Blairstone Pines Dr.
Tallahassee, FL 32301

DESCRIPTION
Consulting

Engineering review of legal filings, Calculation of impacts on

Docket No. 20190168-WS
FCRU Document 1931

11/15/21 Supplemental Response to Staff 8th POD #26

(,';] ]' \II

FCRU based on JEA's proposed new connection fees.

Bevin A, Beaudet, P.E., LLC
1543 Maple St
Bethlehem, PA, 18107

BALANCE DUE

/f 5/&%’4 HZer

INVOICE # 1177
DATE 03/30/2021
DUEDATE 04/29/2021

TERMS Net 30
R&TE ARGCUNT
225,00 900.00
$900.00




CHECK REQUE
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Date 3 &\_( Qj

$ LS. QD

| Check Payable To b@vr? M

| Charge To: Client | ’F:l (‘S‘f_ C@QS —/_ Bill Client $ Q&& J | O
File No L.l LO70 O / _ (includes costs directly charged
) to the firm)
Date of Travel

Type of Expense L. 3 939’

Special Instructions

[[] Checkiftobe paid ‘
from Trust Account BN Y '\\\){,f

5]

Needed By

Date

o

Signature
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D E A N 11/15/21 Supplemental Response to Staff 8th POD #26
Dean, Mead, Egerton, Bloodworth, Capouano &'Bozarth, P.A, 407-841-1200 Orlando
420 S, Orange Avenue, Site 700 407-423-1831 Fax Fort Pierce
P.O. Box 2346 (ZIP 32802-2348) www.deanmead.com Vero Beach
Orlando, Florida 32801 Fed Tax {D# 69-20497 16 Viera
Tallahassee
FIRST COAST REGIONAL UTILITIES, INC. - March 23, 2021
ATTN: WILLIAM SUNDSTROM ID: 038587.074956
2548 BLAIRSTONE PINES DRIVE INVOICE # 380939
TALLAHASSEE, FL 32801 JLW

RE: JURISDICTIONAL ISSUE FOR DECLARATION

FOR PROFESSIONAL SERVICES RENDERED:

TOTAL FEES $22,811.00
ATTY CLASS HOURS RATE AMOUNT
JLW Partner 48,50  450.00 21,825.00
MH* Legal Assistant 0.50 170.00 85.00
HS* Other 530 170.00 901.00

ATTY TOTALS 54.30 22,811.00

TOTAL CURRENT AMOUNT DUE $22,811.00

TOTAL AMOUNT DUE $22,811.00

THIS INVOICE IS PAVABLE UPON RECEIPT,

PLEASE RETURN THIS PAGE WITH YOUR REMITTANCE OR PAY INVOICES
ONLINE AT WWW.DEANMEAD.COM
WE ACCEPT VISA, MASTERCARD, DISCOVER, AND AMERICAN EXPRESS
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D E A N ' 11/15/21 Supplemental Response to Staff 8th POD #26
Dean, Mead, Egerton, Bloodworth, Capouano & Bozarth, P.A. 407-841-1200 Orlando
420 S. Orange Avenue, Suite 700 407423-1831 Fax Fori Pierce
P.0. Box 2346 (ZIP 32802-2346) www.deanmead.com Vero Beach
Orlando, Florida 32801 Fed Tax |D# 59-20497 16 Viera
Tallahassee
FIRST COAST REGIONAL UTILITIES, INC. March 23, 2021
ATTN: WILLIAM SUNDSTROM ID: 038587.074956
2548 BLAIRSTONE PINES DRIVE INVOICE # 380939
TALLAHASSEE, FL 32801 JLW

RE: JURISDICTIONAL ISSUE FOR DECLARATION

FOR PROFESSIONAL SERVICES RENDERED:

ITEMIZED ATTORNEY FEES

DESCRIPTION DATE ATTY HOURS RATE AMOUNT
CONFERENCE CALL WITH 02/16/21 JLW 240  450.00 1080.00
TEAM; PREPARATION FOR
SAME; REVIEW MOTION TO
COMPEL; RESEARCH RE:
MOTION TO STRIKE
SUPPOSEDLY TO BE FILED
BY JEA.
DRAFTING CORPORATE 02/17/21 JLW 3.30  450.00 1485.00

DEPOSITION AREAS OF
INQUIRY; DRAFTING PUBLIC
RECORDS REQUEST;
NUMEROUS EMAILS RE:
CASE AND OUTSTANDING
[SSUES; SCHEDULING
DEPOSITIONS WITH
OPPOSING COUNSEL ME:
PREPARATION FOR AND
PARTICIPATE IN
CONFERENCE CALL.

CONTINUING WORK ON B6 02/18/21 JLW 220 450.00 990.00
DEPOSITION LIST; EMAIL TO

OPPOSING COUNSEL EMAILS

RE: CASE; EMAILS RE:

OUTSTANDING MOTION,;

DRAFTING PUBLIC RECORDS

* SERVICES PROVIDED BY PARALEGAL OR LAW CLERK




DEAN
MEAD

Dean, Mead, Egerton, Bloodworth, Capouano & Bozarth, P.A.

420 S, Orange Avenue, Suite 700
P.0, Box 2346 (ZIP 32802-2346)
Orlando, Florida 32801

FIRST COAST REGIONAL UTILITIES, INC.

038587.074956
March 23, 2021
Page 2

DESCRIPTION

DATE

Docket No. 20190168-WS
FCRU Document 1935

11/15/21 Supplemental Response to Staff 8th POD #26 -

407-841-1200
407-423-1831 Fax
www.deanmead.com
Fed Tax [D#59-2049716

ATTY

HOURS

Orlando
Fort Pierce
Vero Beach
Viera
Tallahassee

RATE AMOUNT

REQUEST.

DRAFT AND FILE PUBLIC
RECORDS REQUEST AND
CALLS REGARDING SAME;
EMAILS REGARDING CASE.

EMAILS AND TELEPHONE
CALLS WITH COUNSEL
REGARDING PUBLIC
RECORDS REQUEST;
FORMAT RECORDS REQUEST
LETTER; SUBMIT TO JEA.

PREPARATION FOR NEXT
WEEK'S DEPOSITION; CALLS
AND EMAILS RE: SAME AND
CASE; REVIEW DRAFT
AFFIDAVIT; REVIEWING
DISCOVERY OF CRITICAL
EVENTS IN CASE.

PREPARATION FOR
DEPOSITION; PREPARING
NOTICE OF DEPOSITION;
CALL WITH WES;
NUMEROUS EMAILS
REGARDING CASE.

MEETING WITH J. WHARTON
REGARDING DEPOSITIONS;
DRAFT NOTICE OF VIDEO
DEPOSITION;
COMMUNICATION WITH

" COURT REPORTER
REGARDING SAME; FILE
SAME INTO PUBLIC SERVICE
COMMISSION; SERVE ALL

02/1921

02/19/21

02/23/21

02/24/21

02/24/21

JLW

HS*

JLW

JLW

HS*

1.80 -

0.80

2.90

0.70

2.60

* SERVICES PROVIDED BY PARALEGAL OR LAW CLERK

450.00 810.00

170.00 136.00

450.00 1305.00

450.00 315.00

170.00 442.00




AN

Dean, Mead, Egerton, Bloodworth, Capouano & Bozarth, P.A.
420 S, Orange-Avenue, Suite 700

P.0. Box 2346 (ZIP 32802-2346)
Orlando, Florida 32801

FIRST COAST REGIONAL UTILITIES, INC,
038587.074956

March 23, 2021

Page 3

DESCRIPTION DATE

ATTY

Docket No. 20190168-WS
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407-841-1200 Orlando
407-423-1831 Fax Fort Pierce
www.deanmead.com Vero Beach
Fed Tax |D# 59-2049716 Viera
Tallahassee

HOURS RATE AMOUNT

COUNSEL WITH SAME;
REVIEW OF DOCKET FOR
DEPONENTS TESTIMONY
AND EXHIBITS; COMPILE
SAME; PREPARE
DEPOSITION NOTEBOOKS
FOR DEPONENTS.

COMP LIE OUTSTANDING
DISCOVERY DOCUMENTS
AND PROVIDE TO OPPOSING
COUNSEL.

REVIEW RESPONSE TO
MOTION TO COMPEL;
PREPARATION FOR AND
CALL WITH LEGAL TEAM,;
REVIEW AND RESEARCH
PETITION FILED BY JEA AT
DCA; CALL WITH STAFF
COUNSEL; NUMEROUS
EMAILS AND CALLS RE:
SAME.

RESEARCHING AND
REVIEWING
EXTRAORDINARY WRIT
REQUESTED FROM DCA BY
DEA; PREPARATION FOR
CONFERENCE CALL AND
PARTICIPATE IN
CONFERENCE CALLS;
NUMEROUS CALLS AND
EMAILS REGARDING
OUTSTANDING MATTERS
INCLUDING
COMMUNICATIONS WITH

02/24/21

02/25/21

02/26/21

HS* 0.40  170.00 68.00

JLW 4.40  450.00 1980.00

JLW - 5.60 450.00 2520.00

* SERVICES PROVIDED BY PARALEGAL OR LAW CLERK




DEAN
NEAD

Dean, Mead, Egerton, Bloodworth, Capouano & Bozarth, P.A.

420 8. Orange Avenue, Suite 700
P.0. Box 2346 (ZIP 32802-2346)
Orlando, Florida 32801

Docket No. 20190168-WS
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11/15/21 Supplemental Response to Staff 8th POD #26

407-841-1200

407-423-1831 Fax
www.deanmead.com

Fed Tax ID# 68-2049716

FIRST COAST REGIONAL UTILITIES, INC.

038587.074956
March 23, 2021
Page 4

DESCRIPTION

DATE ATTY

HOURS

Orlando
Fort Pierce
Vero Beach
Viera
Tallahassee

RATE AMOUNT

PSE STAFF.

RECEIPT AND REVIEW OF
ACKNOWLEDGMENT OF
NEW CASE FROM DISTRICT
COURT OF APPEAL.

PREPARATION FOR
DEPOSITIONSAND

-TOMORROW'S CONFERENCE
CALL.

PREP CALL FOR
DEPOSITIONS;PREP FOR
DEPOS;EMAILS RE:CASE.

CONTINUED PREPARATION
FOR DEPOSITIONS; REVIEW
OF DCA'S WORD AND
RESEARCH RE: SAME,
NUMEROUS CALLS
INCLUDING CALL WITH
STAFF COUNSEL RE: SAME,
SEVERAL EMAILS RE: SAME.

RESEARCH RESPONSES TO
SHOW CAUSE ORDERS
PERTAINING TO WRITS OF
PROHIBITION.

NUMEROUS EMAILS
RE:CASE; RESEARCH RE:JEA
FILING.

SEVERAL CALLS AND
EMAILS AND REVIEW OF
DOCUMENTS AND
RESEARCH RE: CASE AT
DCA.

02/26/21 HS*

02/28/21 JLW

03/01/21 JLW

03/02/21 JLW

03/02/21 MH*

- 03/03/21 LW

03/04/21 JLW

¢ SERVICES PROVIDED BY PARALEGAL OR LAW CLERK

0.40

2.40

3.40

5.50

0.50

2.70

3.10

170.00 68.00

450.00 1080.00

450,00 1530.00

450.00 2475.00

170.00 85.00

450.00 1215.00

450.00 1395.00
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Dean, Mead, Egerton, Bloodworth, Capouano & Bozarth, P.A, 407-841-1200 Orando

420 S, Orange Avenue, Suite 700 407-423-1831 Fax Fort Pierce

P.O. Box 2346 (ZIP 32802-2346) www.deanmead.com Vero Beach

Orlando, Florida 32801 Fed Tax 1D# 59-2049716 Viera

Tallahassee

FIRST COAST REGIONAL UTILITIES, INC.
038587.074956

March 23, 2021

Page 5

DESCRIPTION DATE ATTY HOURS RATE AMOUNT

FORMAT INITIAL RESPONSE 03/05/21 HS* 0.60 170.00 102.00
TO COURT'S ORDER TO
SHOW CAUSE.

OUTLINING POINTS FOR 03/07/21 JLW 0.00  450.00 .00
DISTRICT COURT.

DRAFTING SECTION OF 03/09/21 JLW 2.10  450.00 945.00
BRIEF; PREPARATION FOR

AND PARTICIPATE IN

CONFERENCE CALL RE:

CASE. ’

CONTINUED REVIEW AND 03/10/21 JLW 1.90  450.00 855.00
RESEARCH AND DRAFTING

OF RESPONSE IN APPELLATE

COURT; EMAILS RE: CASE

AND CONTACT WITH JEA RE:

PUBLIC RECORDS.

CONTINUING DRAFT OF 03/11/21 JLW 120 450.00 540.00
APPELLATE COURT
RESPONSE.

COMMUNICATIONS AND 03/11/21 HS* 0.50 170.00 85.00
EMAILS WITH COUNSEL

REGARDING PUBLIC

RECORDS REQUEST;

TELEPHONE CALL WITHD.

WOOD AT JEA REGARDING

SAME.

RESEARCHING AND 03/13/21 JLW 2.90  450.00 1305.00
DRAFTING RESPONSE. :

SUBTOTAL: $22,811.00

* SERVICES PROVIDED BY PARALEGAL OR LAW CLERK
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Dean, Mead, Egerton, Bloodworth, Capouano & Bozarth, P.A. 407-841-1200 Orlando
420 S. Orange Avenue, Suite 700 407423-1831 Fax Fort Pierce
P.0. Box 2346 (2P 32802-2346) www.deanmead.com Vero Beach
Orlando, Florida 32801 Fed Tax |D# 59-2049716 Viera
Tallahassee

FIRST COAST REGIONAL UTILITIES, INC.

038587.074956
March 23, 2021
Page 6

ATTY CLASS HOURS RATE  AMOUNT

JILW Partner 48.50 450,00 21,825.00

MH* Legal Assistant 0.50  170.00 85.00

HS* Other 530 170.00 901.00

' "ATTY TOTALS 54.30 22,811.00

TOTAL CURRENT AMOUNT DUE $22,811.00
TOTAL AMOUNT DUE $22,811.00

+ SERVICES PROVIDED BY PARALEGAL OR LAW CLERK
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M-J2)

Date
Check Payable To m Uap /\Llﬁ/\ ’?éﬂgdm@{fs:/;ﬁ(‘ $ QS.00
Charge To: Client H ﬁ§+ COQS+ Bill Client $ LS o0
File No. L{&O 0] (includes costs directly charged
to the firm)
Date of Travel
Type of Expense _IhV 4 LMQS/
Special Instructions
Check if to be paid : (b& —
from Trust Account N3 - G/%]L Sionatre
2 SH ST i

Needed By

Date




Docket No. 20190168-WS
FCRU Document 1941

11/15/21 Supplemental Response to Staff 8th POD #26
Milian, Swain & Associates, Inc.

2025 S. W, 32" Avenue
Miami, Florida 33145
Tel.: 305-441-0123 Fux: 305-441-0688

www.milianswain.com

Miltan, Swain & Associates, Inc,

Civ'il Engineers =+ Environmental Scientists & Engineers & Utllity Management » Financlal Consultants
INVOICE

William E. Sundstrom, P.A. Invoice Date:  March 31, 2021

Suudstrom & Mindlin, LLP Invoice Number: 44631

Attorneys at Law Page #1 Billing # - 16

2548 Blairstone Pines Drive
Tallahassee, FL 32301

Re: First Coast Regional Utilities, LL.C
For Professional services rendered through March 26, 2021

Hours Rate Amount
Principal
Deborah Swain 1.00 225.00 225.00
Senior Staff Accountant
Cynthia Yapp 175.00 0.00
Engineering Technician
Adam Swain 90.00 ) 0.00
Total Hours 1.00
Total For Invoice # 44631 $225.00]
Total Ainount Due: $225.00

Please make check payable to Milian, Swain & Associates, Inc
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Time/Expenses by Project Report

44/46/04 O Qula DA U
T TOrZ= 10 =9

1 ol P oY /4
TPPICTICTIEAT NTSPUTTSTToU-Stalir ottt - Oo7T

Ovder Time By: Employee ID Milian, Swain & Assoclates Page 1
Order Expense By: Expense # Project: F16-01
Status: Ready Hold Billed Never Billed Period: 03/01/2021 — 03/26/2021
Project  Project Name SJ Ctrl # SJinv it
Phase/Task/iEmployee Employee Name Dep Staft P/E Work Date  OVT ST STATE Hours Worked  Billable Hours.
F16-01 FCRU-New Certlficate
DS Deborah Swaln FIN 001 03/12/2021 03/12/20621 N R 0.25 0.25
[coordinalion & communicalion 1
DS Deborah Swain FIN 001  03/9/2021 03/19/202%1 N R 0.78 0.75
[goordinalion & communicalion, review SAC ]
Sublotal Task 1.00 1.00
Subtotal Phase 1.00 1.00
- Total Project F16-01 1.00 1.00

Run Date:  Mar 31, 2021 @ 10:44:36

TIMEEXPRPT.FRX
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CHECK REQUEST

Date l\"’ ,aﬂ)

s 33750

Check Payable To \qO(TH‘ /1(0“ Df 00 RS /7’7‘337/ M

=

First Gaast

Bill Client § 290 190

Charge To: Client

' (includes costs directly charged
File No. HROTO O] (includes o
Date of Travel -
Type of Expense ol 0 ]

Special Instructions

Check if tobe paid B ﬁg(})/)[/ .
from Trust Account /\; ) 7 ' Signature
H=
Needed By SHI83

Date




Jonit Kelly Consuliing,LLC
241 OCEANWALK DRIVE SOUTH
Atiantlc Beach, FL 32233 US

+1 9048134349
scottkellyconsulting@gmall.com

First Coast Reglonal Utlities, Inc.

BEVIETY

08/28/2021 Consulting

LHZDO R T

General Advice and Rasearch

Docket No. 20190168-WS
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010
03/29/2021
Net 30

A 04/28/2021

1.50 225.00

4,
gt
e

2
BT AE
B

R

337.50

$337.50
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LAW OFFICES

SUNDSTROM & MINDLIN, LLP

2548 BLAIRSTONE PINES DR
TALLAHASSEE, FLORIDA 32301

(850) 877-6555 PLEASE REFER TO INVOICE NUMBER
WHEN REMITTING

FIRST COAST REGIONAL UTILITY, INC
301 CAPITAL PARTNERS, LLC

P.O. BOX 238
LAKE BUTLER,

C/0 AVERY C. ROBERTS MAY 8, 2021
INVOICE # 57746
FL 32054 FILE # 48070-00001

PAGE 1

4/01/21"

4/05/21

4/07/21

4/08/21

4/08/21

4/11/21

4/12/21

4/12/21

4/19/21

4/20/21

4/30/21

WES

RCB

RCB

WES

RCB

RCB

WES

RCB

RCB

RCB

WES

MATTER: ORIGINAL CERTIFICATE FROM PSC

1.50 562.50

FOLLOW UP DISCUSSION WITH AVERY ROBER
REREAD BRIEFS IN PREPARATION FOR FURTHER
DISCUSSIONS WITH COUNTY ATTORNEY.
CONFERENCE WITH BILL SUNDSTROM AND JOHN WHARTON .60 225.00
REGARDING MEETING BETWEEN MIKE BRAREN AND
EXECUTIVE DIRECTOR OF JEA/

1.00 375.00

CONFERENCE CALL WITH BEVIN BEAUDET, SCOTT KELLY .50 187.50
AND BOB BRANNAN RELATIVE TO JEA'S INCREASED COST

OF INTERCONNECT, WITHOUT PROVISION FOR REUSE VS

ONSITE COSTS OF CONSTRUCTION, ETC.

CONFERENCE WITH BILL SUNDSTROM, BEVIN BEAUDET AND .50 187.50
SCOTT KELLY REGARDING JEA'S INCREASED COST

ATTERNATIVE WITHOUT REUSE

CONFERENCES WITH SCOTT KELLY, BEVIN BEAUDET AND 1.00 375.00
BILL SUNDSTROM REGARDING UPDATING EXHIBITS TO

REFLECT STOWE'S LATEST TAKE IT OR LEAVE IT OFFER

FOLLOW UP WITH JOHN WHARTON RELATIVE TO PUBLIC 1.00 375.00
RECORDS REQUEST; EMAILS TO BEVIN BEAUDET AND

SCOTT KELLY RELATIVE TO UPDATING COST METRICS

BETWEEN 301 PARTNERS GETTING SERVICE FROM FIRST

COAST VS JEA.

DISCUSSIONS REGARDING STATUS OF PUBLIC RECORDS .80 300.00
REQUEST AND WHAT WE EXPECT TO RECEIVE THIS WEEK.

RESEARCH JACKSONVILLE COMPREHENSIVE PLAN RELATIVE 3.00 1,125.00
TO JEA'S ABILITY OR INABILITY TO SERVE THE 301

PROPERTY

CONTINUE WORKING ON MEMORANDUM REGARDING JEA'S 2.50 $37.50

OFFER TO SERVE THE 301 PROPERTY AND COMPREHENSIVE
PLAN PROHIBITIONS.
SECOND REVIEW OF JEA'S REPLY BRIEF AS FILED WITH 2.00 750.00
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LAW OFFICES

SUNDSTROM & MINDLIN, LLP

2548 BLAIRSTONE PINES DR
TALLAHASSEE, FLORIDA 32301

(850) 877-6555 W_ﬁé\ﬁE REFER TO INVOICE NUMBER

F.E.L# 59-2783536
REMITTING

FIRST COAST REGIONAL UTILITY, INC

Invoice #: 57746 PAGE 2

FDCA; ATTORNEY CONFERENCE CALL RE: SAME; EMAIL TO
CLIENTS AND EXPERTS ATTACHING REPLY BRIEF AND
REQUEST FOR ORAL ARGUMENT INCLUDING OUR INITIAL
ANALYSIS THEREOF.

TOTAL HOURS 14.40
PROFESSIONAL FEES $ 5,400.00
WILLIAM E SUNDSTROM 5.00 1,875.00
9.40 3,525.00

ROBERT C BRANNAN

PROFESSIONAL SERVICES 15,494.50

TOTAL COSTS ADVANCED $ 15,494.50

TOTAL STATEMENT $ 20,894.50
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CHECK RE 61iff1ﬁu§fﬁlﬁmental Response to Staff 8th POD #26
Date \C) - g ‘D /

Check Payable To D@ A\ m@«q& $ ’ LU—-ngCD

Charge To: Client :F\ faxn Cﬁa ST Bill Client $ \LAY\J(& 200
File No Weo 700 [ (includes costs directly charged
' fir
Date of Travel to the firm)

Type of Expense LD/ 38 [QL}D

Special Instructions

Check if to be paid } K%%

from Trust Account . r |
LS8l

Needed By s j;LSL]L W’)

Signature




Docket No. 20190168-WS
FCRU Document 1948

D E A N 11/15/21 Supplemental Response to Staff 8th POD #26
Dean, Mead, Egerton, Bloodworth, Capouano & Bozarth, P.A. 407-841-1200 Orlando
420 S. Orange Avenue, Suite 700 407-423-1831 Fax Fort Pierce
P.0. Box 2346 (ZIP 32802-2346) www.deanmead.com Vero Beach
Orlando, Florida 32801 Fed Tax ID# 59-2049716 Viera
‘ Tallahassee
FIRST COAST REGIONAL UTILITIES, INC, April 20, 2021
ATTN: WILLIAM SUNDSTROM ID: 038587.074956
2548 BLAIRSTONE PINES DRIVE INVOICE # 381940
TALLAHASSEE, FL 32801 LW

RE: JURISDICTIONAL ISSUE FOR DECLARATION

FOR PROFESSIONAL SERVICES RENDERED:

TOTAL FEES $14,482.00
ATTY CLASS HOURS RATE AMOUNT
JLW Partner 25.50 450.00 11,475.00
MSF Of Counsel ‘ 0.30 _390.00 117.00
HS* Other 17.00  170.00 2,890,00

ATTY TOTALS 42.80 14,482.00

PREVIOUS STATEMENTS OUTSTANDING

BILLED PAYMENTS BALANCE

INVOICE# 380939 March 23, 2021 22,811.00 0.00  22,811.00
TOTAL OUTSTANDING INVOICES: $22,811.00
TOTAL CURRENT AMOUNT DUE $37,293.00

THISINVOICE [S PAVABLE UPON RECRIPT,

PLEASE RETURN THIS PAGE WITH YOUR REMITTANCE OR PAY INVOICES
ONLINE AT WWW.DEANMEAD.COM
WE ACCEPT VISA, MASTERCARD, DISCOVER, AND AMERICAN EXPRESS




Dean, Mead, Egerton, Bloodworth, Capouano & Bozarth, P.A.

420 S. Orange Avenue, Suits 700
P.0. Box 2346 (ZIP 32802-2346)
Orlando, Florida 32801

FIRST COAST REGIONAL UTILITIES, INC.

ATTN: WILLIAM SUNDSTROM

2548 BLAIRSTONE PINES DRIVE

TALLAHASSEE, FL 32801

Docket No. 20190168-WS
FCRU Document 1949

11/15/21 Supplemental Response to Staff 8th POD #26

407-841-1200 Orlando
407-423-1831 Fax Fort Pierce
www.deanmead.com Vero Beach
Fed Tax 1D# 59-2049716 Viera

Tallahassee

April 20,2021

ID: 038587.074956
INVOICE # 381940
LW

RE: JURISDICTIONAL ISSUE FOR DECLARATION

FOR PROFESSIONAL SERVICES RENDERED:

ITEMIZED ATTORNEY FEES

DESCRIPTION

DATE

ATTY

HOURS RATE AMOUNT

STAYING RESPONSE;
REVIEWING JEA
BACKGROUND MATERIALS.

COMMUNICATION WITH
COUNSEL REGARDING
APPEAL; FORMAT INITIAL
DRAFT OF THE APPEAL.

CONTINUED FORMATTING
THE BRIEF WITH TABLE OF
CONTENTS; CITATION OF
AUTHORITIES; AND
FORMATTING.

CONTINUING TO DRAFT
AND REVIEW OF
DOCUMENTS.

CONTINUE TO REVISED AND
FORMAT RESPONSE;
UPDATE TABLE OF
CONTENTS AND
AUTHORITIES.

COMPLETE AND CIRCULATE
FIRST DRAFT.

COMMUNICATION WITH

03/16/21

03/17/21

03/17/21

03/18/21

- 03/18/21

03/19/21

03/19/21

JLW

HS*

HS*

JLW

HS*

JLW

HS*

4.50 . 450.00 2025.00

0.80  170.00 136.00

240 170.00 408.00

270 450.00 1215.00

2.40  170.00 408.00

330 450.00 1485.00

220  170.00 374.00

* SERVICES PROVIDED BY PARALEGAL OR LAW CLERK




DEAN
MEAD

Dean, Mead, Egerton, Bloodworth, Capouano & Bozarth, P.A.

420 S. Orange Avenue, Suite 700
P.O. Box 2346 (ZIP 32802-2346)
Orlando, Florida 32801

Docket No. 20190168-WS
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407-841-1200
407-423-1831 Fax

www.deanmead.com

Fed Tax ID# 59-2049716

FIRST COAST REGIONAL UTILITIES, INC.

038587.074956
April 20, 2021
. Page 2

DESCRIPTION

DATE ATTY

HOURS

Orfando
Fort Pierce
Vero Beach
Viera
Tallahassee

RATE AMOUNT

COUNSEL REGARDING
RESPONSE; CONTINUE TO
REVISE AND FORMAT SAME
TO GET INTO FINAL FORM.

CONFERENCE CALL WITH
COCOUNSEL RE: FIRST
DRAFT.

LOCATED CASE NUMBER AT
COURTS OF APPEAL;
COMMUNICATION WITH
COUNSEL REGARDING
RESPONSE; CONTINUED
FORMATTING RESPONSE.

MARK UP AND EDIT LATEST
VERSION; PREPARATION
FOR AND PARTICIPATE IN
CONFERENCE CALL RE:
RECENT EVENTS AND
DRAFT."

CONFERENCE CALL AND
WORKING ON EDITS OF
RESPONSE.

REVIEW JEA PETITION FOR

03/22/21 JLW

03/22/21 HS*

03/24/21 JLW

03/25/21 LW

03/25/21 MSEF

WRITE OF PROHIBITION AND

DRAFT RESPONSE BRIEF
AND COMMENT;

PREPARATION FOR
HEARING; CONFERENCE
CALL WITH LEGAL

03/26/21 JLW

DISCUSSION AND STRATEGY

SESSION; REVIEWING AND
FINALIZING EXHIBITS;
GENERAL PREPARATION

* SERVICES PROVIDED BY PARALEGAL OR LAW CLERK

1.60

1.20

1.40

0.70

0.30

3.90

450.00 720.00

170.00 204.00

450.00 630.00

450.00 315.00

390.00 117.00

450.00 1755.00




DEAN
MEAD

Dean, Mead, Egerton, Bloodworth, Capouano & Bozarth, P.A.

420 S, Orange Avenue, Suite 700
P.0. Box 2346 (ZIP 32802-2346)
Orlando, Florida 32801

407-841-1200

407-423-1831 Fax
www.deanmead,com

Fed Tax {D# 59-20497 16

FIRST COAST REGIONAL UTILITIES, INC.

038587.074956
April 20, 2021
Page 3

DESCRIPTION

DATE ATTY

HOURS

Docket No. 20190168-WS
, FCRU Document 1951
11/15/21 Supplemental Response to Staff 8th POD #26

Orlando

Fort Pierce
Vero Beach

Viera

Tallahassee

RATE

AMOUNT

FOR HEARING.

CONTINUED TO REVIEW
AND FORMAT RESPONSE,
UPDATE CITATIONS
REGARDING SAME.

FINALIZING BRIEF; CALLS
AND EMAILS RE: SAME.

CONTINUE TO REVISE AND
FORMAT RESPONSE.

FINALIZING BRIEF.

COMMUNICATIONS WITH
COUNSEL REGARDING
FINAL FORMAT AND FILING
OF THE RESPONSE;
CONTINUED REVIEWING
AND REVISING SAME.

REVIEW PSC BRIEF;
FINALIZE AND FILE FCRU
BRIEF.

FINAL FORMATTING TO
RESPONSE; FILED AND
SERVED SAME INTO THE
DISTRICT COURT OF
APPEAL.

CALLS AND EMAILS RE:
PUBLIC RECORDS; EMAILS
RE: CASE.,

REVIEW MEMORANDUM
AND EMAILS REGARDING -
STATUS AND BEST WAY TO
PROCEED.

03/26/21 HS*

03/29/21 JLW

03/29/21 HS*

03/30/21
- 03/30/21

JLW
HS*

03/31/21 JILW

03/31/21 HS*

04/02/21 JLW

04/07/21 JLW

* SERVICES PROVIDED BY PARALEGAL OR LAW CLERK

2.50

1.10

2.10

0.50
1.80

0.80

0.50

0.60

0.80

170.00

450.00

170.00

450.00
170.00

450.00

170.00

450.00

450.00

425.00

495.00
357.00

225.00
306.00

360.00

85.00

270.00

360.00
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FCRU Document 1952
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Dean, Mead, Egerton, Bloodworth, Capouano & Bozarth, P.A, 407-841-1200 Orlando
420 S, Orange Avenue, Suite 700 407-423-1831 Fax Fort Pierce
P.0. Box 2346 (ZIP 32802-2346) www.deanmead.com Vero Beach
Orlando, Florida 32801 Fed Tax |D# 59-20497 16 Viera

Tallahassee

FIRST COAST REGIONAL UTILITIES, INC.
038587.074956

April 20, 2021

Page 4

DESCRIPTION DATE ATTY HOURS RATE AMOUNT

EMAILS RE: CASE AND 04/11/21 JLW 0.70  450.00 315.00
UPDATED COST FIGURES.

CALLS AND EMAILS 04/12/21 JLW 1.80 . 450.00 810.00
FOLLOWING UP ON BEST

WAY TO PROCEED, STATUS

OF NEW JEA FIGURES, AND

PUBLIC RECORDS REQUEST.

NUMEROUS EMAILS WITH 04/12/21 HS* 0.50  170.00 85.00
COUNSEL REGARDING

STATUS OF PUBLIC

RECORDS REQUEST; EMAILS

WITH D. WOOD JEA'S

RECORDS COMPLIANCE

COORDINATOR REGARDING

STATUS OF RECORDS

REQUEST.

DOING ALL THINGS 04/1421 - JLW 1.10  450.00 495.00
NECESSARY TO BRING IN

PUBLIC RECORDS; CHECK

- APPELLATE COURT

SCHEDULING; CALLS WITH

WES.

ESTABLISHED SHARE FILE 04/14/21 HS* 0.60  170.00 102.00
TO HOLD DOCUMENTS

PRODUCED VIA PUBLIC

RECORDS REQUEST;

PAYMENT TO JEA

REGARDING SAME. -

SUBTOTAL: $14,482.00

ATTY CLASS HOURS RATE  AMOUNT
JLW Partner 25.50  450.00 11,475.00

* SERVICES PROVIDED BY PARALEGAL OR LAW CLERK
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Dean, Mead, Egerton, Bloodworth, Capouano & Bozarth, P.A. 407-841-1200 Orlando
420 S, Orange Avenue, Suite 700 407-423-1831 Fax Fort Pierce
P.0. Box 2346 (ZIP 32802-2346) www.deanmead.com Vero Beach
Orlando, Florida 32801 Fed Tax |D# 53-2049716 Viera
Tallahassee
FIRST COAST REGIONAL UTILITIES, INC.
038587.074956
April 20, 2021
Page 5
ATTY CLASS HOURS RATE  AMOUNT
MSF Of Counsel 0.30  390.00 117.00
HS* Other 17.00 170.00 2,890.00
ATTY TOTALS 42.80 14,482.00

PREVIOUS STATEMENTS OUTSTANDING

INVOICE # 380939 March 23, 2021

TOTAL OUTSTANDING INVOICES:

TOTAL CURRENT AMOUNT DUE

BILLED PAYMENTS BALANCE

22,811.00

* SERVICES PROVIDED BY PARALEGAL OR LAW CLERK

0.00  22,811.00

$22,811.00

$37,293.00
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CHECK REQUE
Date 58@

Check Payable To m 1 (l[éﬂ gLﬁl‘ﬂ #m,j%a $ L"SDOD

Charge To: Client /H ST 0/:&%+ Bill Client $ L}SOC@
File No. LW 700/ (includes costs directly charged
Date of Travel to the firm)

Type of Expense oV 44 d L7L

Special Instructions
Check if to be paid o (\Q\/H/

from Trust Account . = B R :
=. Signature

Needed By - wﬂ:ﬁs\ﬂ%’
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TS SHPRISTINIA RESBANTRLC Fie Bth POD #26
2025 S, 1. 32" Avenne
Miaii, Florida 33145
Tel.: 305-441-0123 Fax: 305-441-0688

www.milianswain.com

Milian, Swain & Associates, Inc,

Civil Engineers = Environmental Scientlsts & Engineers [ Utllity Management - Financial Consultants
INVOICE

William E, Sundstrom, P.A. Invoice Date: May 5,2021

Sundstrom & Mindlin, LLP Invoice Number: 44674

Attorneys at Law Page #1 Billing # 17

2548 Blairstone Pines Drive
Tallahassee, FL 32301

Re: Tirst Coast Regional Utilities, LL.C
For Professional services rendered through April 30 2021

Hours Rate Amount
Principal ‘
Deborah Swain 2.00 225.00 450.00
Senior Staff Accountant
Cynthia Yapp 175.00 0.00
Engineering Technician
Adam Swain 90.00 0.00
Total Hours 4 2,00
[Total For Invoice # 44674 $450.00]
Total Amount Due; S450.00

Please make check payable to Miltan, Swain & Assoclates, Inc,
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Time/Expenses by Project Report
Order Time By: Employee D

Mitian, Swain & Associates Page 1
Order Expense By: Expense # Project: F16-01
Status: Ready Hold Billed Never Billed Period: 04/01/2029 — 04/30/2021
Project  Project Name SJCul# Sdinv #
Phase/Task/Employee Employee Name Dep Slaff P/E Work Date  OVT ST STATE Hours Worked  Billable Hours
F16-01 FCRU-New Certificate
DS Deborah Swain FIN 001 04/02/2021 04/02/2021 N R 1.00 1.00
lcoordinalion & communicalion ]
DS Deborah Swain FIN 001 04/09/2021 04/09/2021 N R 0.25 0.25
[Eeview and communication ]
DS Deborah Swaln FIN 001  04/16/2021 04/16/2021 N R 0.25 0.25
DS Deborah Swain FIN 001  04/30/2021 04/30/2021 N R 0.50 0.50
Subtolal Task 200 2.00
Sublotal Phase 2.00 2.00
Total Project F16-01 2.00 2.00

Run Date: May 5, 2021 @ 10:33:06 TIMEEXPRPT.FRX
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CHECK REQUEST
Date 58&’)

Check Payable To % %@’ [5{ UQDSW@C/ ) LLC | $ Sk SO

Charge To: Client E (STL C@C&S-{\ Bill Client $ 6(9 Q @
File No. Lh?o /)O e, / (includes costs directly charged
Date of Travel to the firm)

Type of Expense —Thvol)

Special Instructions

Check if to be paid . W

tA t | ’
from Trust Accoun S .0 &/} ‘ Signature

Needed By -+ SU(@O j
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Scot Helly Consulting,LLC 1@4&%&%pplemental Response to Staff 8th POD #26

A

%
241 OGEANV/ALK DRIVE SOUTH
AR O

Alandle Beach, FL 32233 US
1 9048134048
scoltkelycensuling@gmad.com

O on
Firs{ Coast Reglonal Utifiiss, \nc. bt 04/28/2021
PR Net 30
w3 05/28/2021 |
e SRR TIN g ot RS N
04/29/2021 Consuifing General Services 2,50 225.00 562.50

SLUAGCE FT $562.50
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LAW OFFICES

SUNDSTROM & MINDLIN, LLP

2548 BLAIRSTONE PINES DR
TALLAHASSEE, FLORIDA 32301

F.E.|.# 59-2783536 (850) 877-6555 PLEASE REFER TO INVOICE NUMBER
WHEN REMITTING

FIRST COAST REGIONAL UTILITY, INC
301 CAPITAL PARTNERS, LLC

C/0 AVERY C. ROBERTS JUNE 5, 2021

P.O. BOX 238 INVOICE # 57782

LAKE BUTLER, FL 32054 FILE # 48070-00001
PAGE 1

MATTER: ORIGINAL CERTIFICATE FROM PSC

'5/04/21 WES 1.50 562.50
5/04/21 RCB .80 300.00
5/13/21 WES 1.20 450.00
5/13/21 RCB .80 300.00
5/19/21 WES 4,00 1,500.00
5/20/21 WES 4.00 1,500.00
5/20/21 RCB 1.00 375.00
5/21/21 WES 1.10 412.50
5/24/21 WES DISCUSSION WITH BEVIN RELATIVE TO UPDATING HIS 1.10 412,50

COST EXHIBITS; EDIT FIRST DRAFT THEREOF, ETC.;
STRATEGY DISCUSSION WITH JOHN WHARTON RE PUBLIC
REQUEST AND PROCEDURE GOING FORWARD.
5/26/21 WES DISCUSSION WITH BOB KENNELLY AND FOLLOW UP 1.20 450.00
DISCUSSION WITH AVERY ROBERTS RELATIVE TO
POTENTIAL EXPANSION OF FCRU SERVICE AREA; REVIEW
AND APPROVE MODIFIED COST EXHIBIT FCRU V JEA AS
PREPARED BY BEVIN BEAUDET.
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LAW OFFICES

SUNDSTROM & MINDLIN, LLP

2548 BLAIRSTONE PINES DR
TALLAHASSEE, FLORIDA 32301

F.E.l# 59-2783536 (850) 877-6555 PLEASE REFER TO INVOICE NUMBER
WHEN REMITTING

FIRST COAST REGIONAL UTILITY, INC

Invoice #: 57782 PAGE 2

5/26/21 RCB REVIEW AND COMMENT ON CHANGES TO BEVIN BEAUDET 1.00 375.00
AND SCOTT KELLY'S MODIFIED COST ESTIMATES FOR JEA
PROPOSALS; DISCUSSION ON HOW TO GET REVISED
EXHIBITS INTO THE RECORD.

5/28/21 WES DISCUSSION WITH AVERY ROBERTS RELATIVE TO FUTURE 1.00 375.00

- OPPORTUNITY;
TURNING
UP THE HEAT RE: PRR TO JEA.
TOTAL HOURS 18.70
PROFESSIONAL FEES $ 7,012.50
WILLIAM E SUNDSTROM 15.10 5,662.50
ROBERT C BRANNAN 3.60 1,350.00
TRAVEL EXPENSE 741.95
PROFESSIONAL SERVICES 5,331.08
TOTAL COSTS ADVANCED $ 6,073.03

TOTAL STATEMENT $ 13,085.53
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CHEC K R E 1d1ﬁ1ﬁu§>lefaental Response to Staff 8th POD #26
Date g : S . Q,)

Check Payable To BQW l) 7A.F B e&uc}é/@[; , LLC, $ ( Q@CD

Charge To: Client Ficst @W ' Bill Client $ { g oD
File No U' e O70.0 ] (includes costs directly charged
; to the firm)
Date of Travel

Type ofExpens‘e'_‘ Iﬂ\/ 18

Special Instructions
Check if to be paid ey (E%G;Q,{/
from Trust Account B R N
k b ___D,_ . Signature
Needed By %L)%;Q /7

Date
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11/15/21 Supplemental Response to Staff 8th POD #26
Bevin A, Beaudet, P.E.,11C

babeaudet@gmail.com

BILTO

William E Sundstrom PA
Sundstrom & Mindlin, LLP
2548 Blalrstone Pines Dr.
Tallahassee, FLL 32301

INVOICE # 1178
DATE 06/02/2021
DUEDATE 07/02/2021
TERMS Net 30

DESCRIFTION QTY RATE AR INT

Cansulfing

April Consulting - Strategy and update phone calis. Review
of legal dellverables.

Censulling

May Consulting - Revise hearing exhibits, cost impacts on
301 Partners based on revised JEA options presented and
proposed connection fees.

6 225.00 1,350.00

Bevin A. Beaudet, P.E,, LLC BALANCE DUE

; $1,800.00
543 Maple St.

Bethlehem, PA 18107 %&W% W
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Date (0 5 ) Q‘
Check Payable To J\ic‘a h m&OLL $ 5 ]5 /7 33

CHECK REW

Charge To: Client Fleet CO&S"IL Bill Client $ 31373 3
File No thgo .00 ) (includes costs directly charged
' ’ to the firm)
Date of Travel

Type of Expense 1TV 38386

Special Instructions
[ ] Checkiftobe paid ‘ P T aY
- o . \_/;. .
from Trust Account | LQ 5 Q_ )_._.-H 7 Signature

Needed By #5 U,—ZQQJ

Date
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D

E
MEAD

Dean, Mead, Egerton, Bloodworth, Capouano & Bozarth, P.A, 407-841-1200 Otlando
420 S. Orange Avenus, Suite 700 407-423-1831 Fax Fort Pierce
P.0. Box 2346 (ZIP 32802-2346) www.deanmead.com Vero Beach
Orlando, Florida 32801 Fed Tax |D# 59-2049716 Viera

' Tallahassee
FIRST COAST REGIONAL UTILITIES, INC. May 19, 2021
ATTN: WILLIAM SUNDSTROM ID: 038587.074956
2548 BLAIRSTONE PINES DRIVE INVOICE # 383463
TALLAHASSEE, FL 32801 JLW

RE: JURISDICTIONAL ISSUE FOR DECLARATION

FOR PROFESSIONAL SERVICES RENDERED:

TOTAL FEES $2,719.00
ATTY CLASS HOURS RATE  AMOUNT
JLW Partner 540 450.00 2,430.00
HS* Other 1,70  170.00 289.00

ATTY TOTALS 7.10 2,719.00

TOTAL EXPENSES $418.33

313M1.33

PREVIOUS STATEMENTS OUTSTANDING

BILLED PAYMENTS BALANCE

INVOICE# 381940 April 20, 2021 14,482.00 0.00  14,482.00
TOTAL OUTSTANDING INVOICES: $14,482.00
TOTAL CURRENT AMOUNT DUE $17,619.33

THIS INVOICE 1S PAVABLE UPOH RECEIPT.

* PLEASE RETURN THIS PAGE WITH YOUR REMITTANCE OR PAY INVOICES
ONLINE AT WWW.DEANMEAD.COM
WE ACCEPT VISA, MASTERCARD, DISCOVER, AND AMERICAN EXPRESS




DEAN

MEAD

Dean, Mead, Egerton, Bloodworth, Capouano & Bozarth, P.A.

420 S. Orange Avenue, Suite 700
P.O. Box 2346 (ZIP 32802-2346)
Orlando, Florida 32801

FIRST COAST REGIONAL UTILITIES, INC.

ATTN: WILLIAM SUNDSTROM

2548 BLAIRSTONE PINES DRIVE

TALLAHASSEE, FL 32801

Docket No. 20190168-WS
FCRU Document 1965

11/15/21 Supplemental Response to Staff 8th POD #26

407-841-1200 Orlando
407-423-1831 Fax Fort Pierce
- www.deanmead.com Vero Beach
Fed Tax ID# 59-20497 16 Viera
Tallahassee
May 19, 2021
[D: 038587.074956
INVOICE # 383463
JLW

RE: JURISDICTIONAL ISSUE FOR DECLARATION

FOR PROFESSIONAL SERVICES RENDERED:

ITEMIZED ATTORNEY FEES

DESCRIPTION

DATE

ATTY

HOURS RATE AMOUNT

REVIEW THE JEA WEBSITE
FOR UPDATED PUBLIC
RECORDS REQUEST
DOCUMENTS; EMAIL TO
COUNSEL REGARDING
SAME.

CALL WITH WES RE:
STATUS.

INITIAL CURSORY REVIEW
OF JEA FILING.

REVIEW AND RESEARCH
JEA'S REPLY AT APPELLATE
COURT, PREPARATION FOR
AND PARTICIPATE IN
CONFERENCE CALL
REGARDING SAME.

CALL WITH WES RE:
PENDING MATTERS AND
SCHEDULING.

CALL RE: PUBLIC RECORDS
REQUEST, STATUS, AND
BEST WAY TO PROCEED.

CALLS AND EMAILS WITH

04/26/21

04/27/21
04/29/21

04/30/21

05/04/21

05/05/21

05/07/21

HS*

JLW
JLW

JLW

JLW
- JLW

JLW

0.40  170.00 68.00

030  450.00 135.00
0.80  450.00 360.00

2.10  450.00 945.00

030 450.00 13500
030 450.00 135.00

0.90  450.00 405.00

* SERVICES PROVIDED BY PARALEGAL OR LAW CLERK
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Dean, Mead, Egerton, Bloodworth, Capouano & Bozarth, P.A. 407-841-1200 Orlando
420 S, Orange Avenue, Suite 700 407-423-1831 Fax Fort Pierce
P.O. Box 2346 (ZIP 32802-2346) www.deanmead.com - Vero Beach
Orlando, Florida 32801 Fed Tax ID# 53-20497 16 Viera
Tallahasses
FIRST COAST REGIONAL UTILITIES, INC.
038587.074956
May 19, 2021
Page 2
DESCRIPTION DATE ATTY HOURS RATE AMOUNT
WBS; SEND EMAIL RE: -
PUBLIC RECORDS TO JEA.
CALL WITH WES RE: PUBLIC 05/12/21 ILW 0.70  450.00 315.00
RECORDS REQUEST; DRAFT
AND SEND FOLLOW UP
LETTER; EXCHANGE CALLS
WITH JEA.
DRAFT LETTER TO JEA 05/12/21 HS* 0.50 170.00 85.00
REGARDING OBTAINING
PUBLIC RECORDS REQUEST.
RECEIPT AND REVIEW OF 05/14/21 HS* 0.80 170.00 136.00
DOCUMENTS PROVIDED TO
THE PUBLIC RECEORDS
REQUEST TO DATE.
SUBTOTAL.: $2,719.00

ATTY CLASS HOURS RATE AMOUNT

JLW Partner 540  450.00 2,430.00

HS* Other 1.70  170.00 289.00

ATTY TOTALS 7.10 2,719.00
ITEMIZED EXPENSES

DESCRIPTION AMOUNT
MISCELLANEOUS (]NCLUDE EXPLANATION OF COST) - - 418.33

VISA/MASTERCARD JEA PARTIAL PAYMENT FOR PUBLIC

RECORDS REQUEST

SUBTOTAL:

* SERVICES PROVIDED BY PARALEGAL OR LAW CLERK

$418.33
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D E A N ‘ 11/15/21 Supplemental Response to Staff 8th POD #26
Dean, Mead, Egerton, Bloodworth, Capouano & Bozarth, P.A. 407-841-1200 Orlando
420 S, Orange Avenue, Suite 700 407-423-1831 Fax Fort Pierce
P.0. Box 2346 (ZIP 32802-2346) www.deanmead.com Vero Beach
Orlando, Florida 32801 Fed Tax ID# 59-2049716 Viera

Tallahassee

FIRST COAST REGIONAL UTILITIES, INC.

038587.074956
May 19, 2021
Page 3
PREVIOUS STATEMENTS OUTSTANDING
BILLED PAYMENTS BALANCE

INVOICE # 381940 April 20,2021 14,482.00 0.00 14,482.00

| TOTAL OUTSTANDING INVOICES: $14,482.00
TOTAL CURRENT AMOUNT DUE $17,619.33

* SERVICES PROVIDED BY PARALEGAL OR LAW CLERK
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11/15/21 Su@lyeir‘nental Response to Staff 8th POD #26

CHECK REQUE

Check Payable To m I Ua D,g o) n 45 A &SOC}@ES:U/\&

Date éQ 5\3«}

§ 39305

Charge To: Client H 5+ 00 ast Bill Client $ 5. 5
File No W¥O70.0 J (includes costs divectly charged
; . to the firm)
Date of Travel _
Type of Expense _nv QLr/?OCI:/
Special Instructions
[[] Checkif to be paid ‘ (& )
from Trust Account ¢ = .O_”C;L -
o 5-Q) Signature
Needed By H 5(7@\3 o

Date
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11/1818H 8 fpmsiEhtd HSSBBHELTo RIS 8th POD #26

2025 8. W, 32" Avenue
Miani, Florida 33145
Tel,: 305-441-0123 Fax: 305-441-0688

www.milianswain,com

Civil Engineers <+ Environmental Sclentists & Engineers Utility Management . Financial Consultants
INVOICE
William E, Sundstrom, P.A. Invoice Dale: June 2, 2021
Sundstrom & Mindlin, LLP Invoice Number: 44709
Attorneys at Law Page #1 Billing # 18
2548 Blairstone Pines Drive
Tallahassee, FL 32301
Re: First Coast Regional Utilities, LLC
For Professional services rendered through ivMay 28 2021
Hours Rate Amount
Principal
Deborah Swain 1.75 225,00 393.75
Senior Staff Accountant
Cynthia Yapp 175.00 0.00
Engineering Technician
Adam Swain 90.00 0.00
Total Hours 1.75
Total For Invoice # 44709 $393.75)
Total Amount Due: $393.74

Please make check payable (o Millan, Swain & Associates, Inc .
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TimelExpenses by Project Report
Order Time By: Employee ID
Order Expense By: Expense #

11/15/21 Supplemental Response to Staff 8th POD #26

Milian, Swain & Associates Page 1

Project: F16-01

Status: Ready Hold Billed Never Billed Period: 05/01/2021 — 05/28/2021
Project  Project Name SJ Ctrl tt Sd Inv #
Phase/Task/Employee Employee Name Dep Staff PIE Work Dale  OVT ST STATE Hours Worked  8illable Hours
F16-01 FCRU-New Certiflcate
DS Deborah Swain FIN 001 . 05/28/2021 05/28/2021 N R 1.75 o 1.75
Tolal Project F16-01 1.75 1.75
Run Date: Jun 2, 2021 @ 10:46:32 TIMEEXPRPT.FRX
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11/15/21 Supplemental Response to Staff 8th POD #26

LAW OFFICES

SUNDSTROM & MINDLIN, LLP

2548 BLAIRSTONE PINES DR
TALLAHASSEE, FLORIDA 32301

F.E.l.# 59-2783536 (850) 877-6555 PLEASE REFER TO INVOICE NUMBER
WHEN REMITTING

FIRST COAST REGIONAL UTILITY, INC
301 CAPITAL PARTNERS, LLC

C/0 AVERY C. ROBERTS JULY 10, 2021

P.O. BOX 238 INVOICE # 57840

LAKE BUTLER, FL 32054 FILE # 48070-00001
PAGE 1

MATTER: ORIGINAL CERTIFICATE FROM PSC

6/17/21 WES ~DISCUSSION WITH BOB, MIKE, AVERY AND AUSTEN 1.50 562.50
RELATIVE TO FURTHER EXPANSION OF SERVICE AREA;
OPTIONS IN THAT REGARD, ETC.; REVIEW JAX PLANNING
COUNCIL AGENDA RE: 301 LAND USE AMENDMENT; FOLLOW
UP DISCUSSION WITH AVERY.

6/18/21 WES RECEIPT OF AMENDED ORDER FROM FIRST DCA; LAWYER .40 150.00
ISCUSSION RE: SAME; FORWARD TO CLIENTS.
6/21/21 WES VERY SCENARIOS RELATIVE TO DEALING 2.20 825.00

WITH THE FIRST COAST/JEA CASE GOING FORWARD,
INCLUDING BIFURCATING OUT THE NASSAU AND BAKER
COUNTY PORTIONS AND SEEKING PARTIAL SUMMARY
JUDGMENT THEREON; AWAITING CITY OF JAX AND/OR
FDCA DECISIONS, ETC.; DISCUSSION WITH AVERY
ROBERTS RE: SAME.

6/21/21 RCB CONFERENCE CALL TO DISCUSS HOW TO MOVE THE 1.70 637.50
PROCEEDINGS FORWARD AND OTHER STRATEGIES.
6/22/21 WES FOLLOW UP DISCUSSIONS WITH BOB KENNELLY RE: THE 1.00 375.00

RESULTS OF WAR GAMES, RECOMMENDATIONS FOR COURSE
OF ACTION GOING FORWARD, ETC.; FOLLOW UP JOHN
; I, RECORDS REQUEST.

6/29/21 WES .60 225.00
6/29/21 RCB .50 187.50
TOTAL HOURS 7.90

PROFESSIONAL FEES $ 2,962.50
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11/15/21 Supplemental Response to Staff 8th POD #26

LAW OFFICES

SUNDSTROM & MINDLIN, LLP

2548 BLAIRSTONE PINES DR
TALLAHASSEE, FLORIDA 32301

F.E.|.# 59-2783536 (850) 877-6555 PLEASE REFER TO INVOICE NUMBER
WHEN REMITTING

FIRST COAST REGIONAL UTILITY, INC

Invoice #: 57840 PAGE 2
WILLIAM E SUNDSTROM 5.70 2,137.50
ROBERT C BRANNAN 2.20 825.00
PROFESSIONAL SERVICES 7,070.00
TOTAL COSTS ADVANCED $ 7,070.00

TOTAL STATEMENT $ 10,032.50
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11/15/21 Supplemental Response to Staff 8th POD #26

LAW OFFICES

SUNDSTROM & MINDLIN, LLP

2548 BLAIRSTONE PINES DR
TALLAHASSEE, FLORIDA 32301

F.E.|l.# 59-2783536 (850) 877-6555 PLEASE REFER TO INVOICE NUMBER
WHEN REMITTING

FIRST COAST REGIONAL UTILITY, INC
301 CAPITAL PARTNERS, LLC

C/O AVERY C. ROBERTS AUGUST 7, 2021

P.O. BOX 238 INVOICE # 57928

LAKE BUTLER, FL 32054 FILE # 48070-00001
PAGE 1

MATTER: ORIGINAL CERTIFICATE FROM PSC

"7/02/21 WES REVIEW JEA PRELIMINARY OFFICIAL STATEMENT .70 262.50
RELATIVE TO 2021 WATER AND SEWER REVENUE BOND
ISSUE; NOTES TO FILE.

7/19/21 WES CONFERENCE WIT VERY WHO CALLED RELATIVE TO 1.20 450.00

7/20/21 WES PREPARATION CALL WITH WHARTON AND BRANNAN 1.70 637.50
RELATIVE TO ORAL ARGUMENT AT FDCA; BRIEFING TO
BOB KENNELLY RELATIVE TO STATUS OF MATTER ON
SEVERAL FRONTS; EMAIL TO PARTNERS PREPARING THEM
FOR ORAL ARGUMENT CONTAINING LINK TO VIEW IT.

7/20/21 RCB PREPARE FOR AND PARTICIPATE IN PREPARATORY 1.00 375.00
ATTORNEY CONFERENCE REGARDING ISSUES FOR ORAL
ARGUMENT .

7/21/21 WES REVIEW VIDEO OF CITY OF JAX LAND USE AND ZONING .50 187.50
MEETING RE: 301 AMENDMENT; NOTES TO FILE THEREON.

7/22/21 WES CONTINUE TO WORK WITH JOHN WHARTON ON PREPARATION 1.00 375.00
OF ORAL ARGUMENT.

7/23/21 WES ADDITIONAL PREPARATION WITH JOHN WHARTON. .50 187.50

7/23/21 RCB PREPARE FOR AND PARTICIPATE IN ATTORNEY .70 262.50
CONFERENCE CALL IN PREPARATION FOR ORAL ARGUMENT.

7/28/21 RCB MONITOR ORAL ARGUMENT; CONFERENCES WITH CLIENTS, 3.00 1,125.00

JOHN WHARTON AND BILL SUNDSTROM ON IMPRESSIONS OF
ARGUMENT AND ISSUES RAISED.

TOTAL HOURS 10.30

PROFESSIONAL FEES $ 3,862.50
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11/15/21 Supplemental Response to Staff 8th POD #26

LAW OFFICES

SUNDSTROM & MINDLIN, LLP

2548 BLAIRSTONE PINES DR
TALLAHASSEE, FLORIDA 32301

F.E.1L# 59-2783536 (850) 877-6555 PLEASE REFER TO INVOICE NUMBER
WHEN REMITTING

FIRST COAST REGIONAL UTILITY, INC

Invoice #: 57929 PAGE 2
WILLIAM E SUNDSTROM 5.60 2,100.00
ROBERT C BRANNAN 4.70 1,762.50
PROFESSIONAL SERVICES 6,397.00
TOTAL COSTS ADVANCED $ 6,397.00

TOTAL STATEMENT $ 10,259.50
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Ej@leiqental Response to Staff 8th POD #26

Date gq\l} |

CHECK REQY

Check Payable To 5‘9()\”\’ A, me\hpg LLC $ [[Q5.00

Charge To: Client ﬁ (S_Jr COQS ‘l‘ Bill Client $ l 1 &5 00
File No Uyo0 1020 ) (includes costs directly charged
Date of Travel to the firm)

Type of Expense TNV | I(? O

Special Instructions

Check if to be paid )

from Trust Account | ,_8 /\LQA_ -

Needed By "H’SL\’@B

Date

Signature
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11/15/21 Supplemental Response to Staff 8th POD #26
Bevin A, Boaudet, P.E,, 1 LC

babeaudet@gmall.com

RUV4

imnn 205 b [
ful 1
Eil‘“ﬂ[( ~§Lj'

BILLTO INVOICE # 1180
William E Sundstrom PA DATE 08/02/2021
Sundstrom & Mindlin, LLP 4 DUEDATE 09/01/2021
2548 Blairstone Pines Dr. TERMS Net 30
Tallahassee, FL. 32301

DESCRIPTION

QTy RATE AR
Censulfing 5 225,00 1,125,00
Review JEA produced documents and discuss thern with
WES and SDK

Bevin A. Beaudet, P.E,, LLC BALANCE DUE $1 125.00
-> .

1543 Maple St,
Bethishem, PA 10187 o9 i g; bl
Va /0({// Pl
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ﬁ1ﬁug>lefa§ntal Response to Staff 8th POD #26
‘Date 8 ‘ Q ‘ Q:L)
Check Payable To b@@ﬂ W\QQ d ' o $ SN

CHECK REQ

. Charge To: Client _ ’T:N:S_*\ C%{\ Bill Client $ 534 OD

File No i ¥0 70O / (includes costs directly charged
' to the fir
Date of Travel o the firm)

Type of Expense I Ny 3@0 Q\S ,

Special Instructions
Check if to be paid : ' fc% (\70\/%
from Trust Account o - /7 Q / Ny Signature

Needed By =5 L{\S | /7

Date
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D E A N 11/15/21 Supplemental Response to Staff 8th POD #26
Dean, Mead, Egerton, Bloodworth, Capouano & Bozarth, P.A, 40)7-841-1200 .. Orlando
420 S, Orange Avenue, Suite 700 407-423-1831 Fax Fort Pierce
P.0. Box 2346 (2IP 32802-2346) . www.deanmead,com Vero Beach
Orlando, Florida 32801 Fed Tax ID# 59-20497 16 Viera
Tallahassee
FIRST COAST REGIONAL UTILITIES, INC. July 31, 2021
ATTN: WILLIAM SUNDSTROM ID: 038587.074956
2548 BLAIRSTONE PINES DRIVE INVOICE # 387231
TALLAHASSEE, FL 32801 JLW

RE: JURISDICTIONAL ISSUE FOR DECLARATION

FOR PROFESSIONAL SERVICES RENDERED:

TOTAL FEES $5,272.00
TOTAL CURRENT INVOICE AMOUNT DUE $5,272.00
ATTY CLASS HOURS RATE  AMOUNT
JLW Partner 11,30 450.00 5,085.00
HS* Other 1.10  170.00 187.00

ATTY TOTALS 12.40 5,272.00

PREVIOUS STATEMENTS OUTSTANDING

BILLED PAYMENTS BALANCE

INVOICE# 385714 June 29,2021 5,945.00 0.00 5,945.00
TOTAL PREVIOUS OUTSTANDING INVOICES DUE $5,945.00
TOTAL BALANCE DUE $11,217.00

THISINVOICE IS PAVABLE UPOR RECEIPT.

PLEASE RETURN THIS PAGE WITH YOUR REMITTANCE OR PAY INVOICES
ONLINE AT WWW.DEANMEAD,COM
WE ACCEPT VISA, MASTERCARD, DISCOVER, AND AMERICAN EXPRESS

......................................................................................................

A Member of ALFA International - The Global Legal Network
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FCRU Document 1979

A N 11/15/21 Supplemental Response to Staff 8th POD #26

Dean, Mead, Egerton, Bloodworth, Capouano & Bozarth, P.A, 407-841-1200 Orlandb

420 S, Orange Avenue, Suite 700 407-423-1831 Fax Forl Pierce

P.0. Box 2346 (ZIP 32802-2346) www.deanmead.com ' Vero Beach

Orlando, Florida 32801 Fed Tax ID# 59-2049716 Viera
Tallahassee

FIRST COAST REGIONAL UTILITIES, INC, July 31, 2021

ATTN: WILLIAM SUNDSTROM ID: 038587.074956

2548 BLAIRSTONE PINES DRIVE INVOICE # 387231

TALLAHASSEE, FL 32801 JLW

RE: JURISDICTIONAL ISSUE FOR DECLARATION

FOR PROFESSIONAL SERVICES RENDERED:

ITEMIZED ATTORNEY FEES

DESCRIPTION DATE ATTY HOURS RATE

AMOUNT

STRATEGY CALL 06/21/21 LW 2.80  450.00
REGARDING BEST WAY TO '
PROCEED; NUMEROUS

EMAILS REGARDING CASE

AND PUBLIC DOCUMENTS;

CALL WITH PSC STAFF

COUNSEL; REVIEW JEA INFO

AND POSSIBLE EXHIBIT

RE:SAME; REVIEW COUNTY

FILING AT PSC.

REVIEW VARIOUS EMAILS 06/22/21 JLW 0.60  450.00
AND DOCUMENTS RE:CASE. .

REVIEW EMAILS AND 06/25/21 JLW 0.90  450.00
INFORMATION RE: RATE

COMPARISON WITH JEA;

REVIEW SWAIN EXHIBITS.

REVIEW OF THE SHARE FILE; 06/28/21 HS* 0.50 170.00
SET UP THE SHARE FILE FOR
CO-COUNSEL TO ACCESS.

ORGANIZING SHARE FILE 06/30/21 JLW 0.70  450.00
AND DOCUMENTS; EMAILS
RE: SAME.

ADD INDIVIDUALS TO THE 07/01/21 HS* 0.40  170.00

* SERVICES PROVIDED BY PARALEGAL OR LAW CLERK

© 1260.00

270.00

405.00

85.00

315.00

68.00




Dean, Mead, Egerton, Bloodworth, Capouanc & Bozarth, P.A.

420 S, Orange Avenue, Suite 700
P.0. Box 2346 (ZIP 32802-2346)
Orlando, Florida 32801

FIRST COAST REGIONAL UTILITIES, INC.

038587.074956
July 31, 2021
Page 2

DESCRIPTION

DATE

407-841-1200
407423-1831 Fax
www,deanmead.com
Fed Tax |D#f 53-2049716

ATTY

HOURS

Docket No. 20190168-WS
FCRU Document 1980
11/15/21 Supplemental Response to Staff 8th POD #26

Orlando

Forl Pierce
Vero Beach

Viera

Tallahassee

RATE

AMOUNT

- SHAREFILE; EXECUTION OF
EMAIL REGARDING SAME.

REVIEW COURT-ORDER;
CALL WITH STAFF
COUNSEL.

CALL WITH WES RE: STATUS
AND BEST WAY TO
PROCEED.

REVIEWING
DOCUMENTATION AND
RESEARCH IN PREPARATION
FOR ORAL ARGUMENT.

REVIEW OF PUBLIC
RECORDS REQUEST LINK
FOR ANY'NEW DOCUMENTS
‘THAT HAVE BEEN
UPLOADED.

REVIEWING NEWLY
UPLOADED JEA
DOCUMENTS.

LENGTHY CALL WITH
COMMISSION STAFF
COUNSEL; EMAILS RE:
SCHEDULING AND
STRATEGY DISCUSSIONS.

07/02/21

07/07/21

07/08/21

07/13/21

07/14/21

07/15/21

SUBTOTAL:

TOTAL CURRENT INVOICE DUE

ATTY CLASS

JLW

JLW

JLW

HS*

JLW

JLW

HOURS

0.70

0.30

3.10

0.20

1.30

0.90

RATE

450.00
450.00

450.00

170.00

450.00

450.00

AMOUNT

JLW Partner

11.30

450.00

* SERVICES PROVIDED BY PARALEGAL OR LAW CLERK

5,085.00

315.00

135.00

1395.00

34.00

585.00

405.00

$5,272.00

$5,272.00
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D E A N 11/15/21 Supplemental Response to Staff 8th POD #26
Dean, Mead, Egerton, Bloodworth, Capouano & Bozarth, P.A, . 407-841-1200 . Orlando
420 S. Orange Avenue, Suite 700 " 407-423-1831 Fax “Fort Pierce ‘
P.0. Box 2346 (ZIP 32802-2346) www.deanmead.com Vero Beach
Orlando, Florida 32801 Fed Tax ID# 53-2049716 Viera
Tallahassee

FIRST COAST REGIONAL UTILITIES, INC.

038587.074956
July 31, 2021
Page 3
ATTY CLASS HOURS RATE  AMOUNT
HS* Other 1,10 170.00 187.00
ATTY TOTALS . 12.40 5,272.00
PREVIOUS STATEMENTS OUTSTANDING
BILLED PAYMENTS BALANCE
INVOICE # 385714 June 29, 2021 5,945.00 0.00 5,945.00
TOTAL PREVIOUS OUTSTANDING INVOICES DUE $5,945.00
TOTAL BALANCE DUE $11,217.00

* SERVICES PROVIDED BY PARALEGAL OR LAW CLERK
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11/15/21 Supplemental Response to Staff 8th POD #26

LAW OFFICES

SUNDSTROM & MINDLIN, LLP

2548 BLAIRSTONE PINES DR
TALLAHASSEE, FLORIDA 32301

F.E.1# 58-2783536 (850) 877-6555 PLEASE REFER TO INVOICE NUMBER
WHEN REMITTING

FIRST COAST REGIONAL UTILITY, INC

301 CAPITAL PARTNERS, LLC

C/O AVERY C. ROBERTS SEPTEMBER 11, 2021

P.O. BOX 238 INVOICE # 57976

LAKE BUTLER, FL 32054 FILE # 48070-00001

PAGE 1

8/03/21 WES

8/18/21 WES

8/26/21 WES

8/27/21 WES

MATTER: ORIGINAL CERTIFICATE FROM PSC

RESEARCH AND REVIEW FLORIDA RULES OF APPELLATE .80 300.00
PROCEDURE RELATIVE TO LIFTING STAY ORDERS;

CONVERSATION WITH JOHN WHARTON RE: SAME.

SEVERAL DISCUSSIONS WITH AVERY ROBERTS RELATIVE 1.20 450.00
TO FCRU TIMING, FINANCING OF CAPITAL PROJECTS,

ETC.; FOLLOW UP WITH SCOTT

KEL RELATIV. MONITORING JEA CONNECTION

CHARGE INCREASE.

1.00 375.00
1.80 675.00
TOTAL HOURS 4,80

PROFESSIONAL FEES $ 1,800.00
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11/15/21 Supplemental Response to Staff 8th POD #26

LLAW OFFICES

SUNDSTROM & MINDLIN, LLP

2548 BLAIRSTONE PINES DR
TALLAHASSEE, FLORIDA 32301

F.E.L# 59-2783536 (850) 877-6555 PLEASE REFER TO INVOICE NUMBER
WHEN REMITTING

FIRST COAST REGIONAL UTILITY, INC

Invoice #: 57976 PAGE 2
WILLIAM E SUNDSTROM 4,80 1,800.00
PROFESSIONAL SERVICES 9,731.00
TOTAL COSTS ADVANCED $ 9,731.00

TOTAL STATEMENT $ 11,531.00
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11/15/21 Su;)§Ie,in‘ental Response to Staff 8th POD #26

CHECK REQUE
Date g@JQ}

Check Payable To bf’@h. MCZ , $ 5319

Charge To: Client E (S‘IL’ (\mng‘ Bill Client $ 553 -
. File No ' L_H?O7O O (includes costs directly charged
; ) ? to the firm)
Date of Travel '

Type of Expénse —nVv ngg D

Special Instructions

Check if to be paid o0 (3?&7@7[/

from Trust Account 8‘ 3% 2 7 Signature
Needed By ~+F S\%:D\'{O

Date




DEAN

MEAD

Dean, Mead, Egerton, Bloodworth, Capouano & Bozarth, P.A.
420 S, Orange Avenue, Suite 700

P.0. Box 2346 (ZIP 32802-2346)

Orlando, Florida 32801

FIRST COAST REGIONAL UTILITIES, INC.
ATTN: WILLIAM SUNDSTROM

2548 BLAIRSTONE PINES DRIVE
TALLAHASSEE, FL 32801

Docket No. 20190168-WS
FCRU Document 1985

11/15/21 Supplemental Response to Staff 8th POD #26

407-841-1200 Orlando
407-423-1831 Fax

www.deanmead.com
Fed Tax (D# 59-20497 16 Viera

Fort Pierce
Vero Beach

Tallahassee

August 17,2021
1D: 038587.074956
INVOICE # 387515
JLW

RE: JURISDICTIONAL ISSUE FOR DECLARATION

FOR PROFESSIONAL SERVICES RENDERED:

ITEMIZED ATTORNEY FEES

DESCRIPTION DATE ATTY

HOURS RATE AMOUNT

READING ALL CASE LAW,
REVIEWING BRIEFS AND
FILINGS; REVIEWING JEA
AND PSC FILINGS AT
LITIGATION LEVEL;
RESEARCH RE: LACK OF
ALTERNATIVE REMEDIES;
EDITING OUTLINE AND
DRAFTING WORDS FOR
ORAL ARGUMENT.,

CONFERENCE CALL RE:
ORAL ARGUMENT AND
ANOTHER DRAFT OUTLINE
OF SAME.

FINALIZE MOVING JEA
RECORDS FROM PUBLIC
RECORDS REQUEST LINK TO
OUR SHARE FILE LINK.

CONTINUED PREPARATION
FOR ORAL ARGUMENT.

REVIEWING ALL CASE LAW;
LENGTHY CONVERSATION
WITH THE PSC COUNSEL;
CALLS AND EMAILS RE:

07/19/21 JLW

07/20/21 JLW

07/21/21 HS*

07/26/21 JLW

07/27/21 JLW

3.10 450.00 1395.00

1.90  450.00 855.00

1.60  170.00 272.00

2.30  450.00 1035.00

510  450.00 2295.00

* SERVICES PROVIDED BY PARALEGAL OR LAW CLERK
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D E A N 11/15/21 Supplemental Response to Staff 8th POD #26

MEAD

Dean, Mead, Egerton, Bloodworth, Capouano & Bozarth, P.A, 407-841-1200

420 S. Orange Avenue, Suite 700 407-423-1831 Fax

P.0. Box 2346 (ZIP 32802-2346) www.deanmead.com
Orlando, Florida 32801 Fed Tax ID# 58-2049716

FIRST COAST REGIONAL UTILITIES, INC.
038587.074956

August 17,2021

Page 2

DESCRIPTION DATE ATTY HOURS

Orlando
Fort Pierce
Vero Beach
Viera
Tallahassee

RATE AMOUNT

ARGUMENT; FINALIZE
NOTEBOOK POINTS
NECESSARY TO BE READY
TO BE DISCUSSED.

FINAL PREPARATION FOR 0!7/28/21 JLW 3.90
ORAL ARGUMENT AND

ATTEND OR ARGUMENT;

MEETING WITH

COMMISSION STAFF

AFTERWARDS; CALLS AND

EMAILS RE: SAME; ATTEND

DEBRIEF CALL.

REVIEW E-MAIL 07/29/21 HS* 1.20
PRODUCTION THAT ARE

CUMBERSOME; EXTRACT

INTO NUMEROUS

INDIVIDUAL FOLDERS;

UPDATE SHARE FILE WITH

SAME.,

RESEARCH ISSUES RELATED 08/03/21 JLW 0.80
TO STAY AND BOND; CALL

WITH WES ; REVIEW

SWAIN'S EMAIL RE: CIAC.

RESEARCH TIMING ISSUES 08/09/21 JLW 0.80
AT DCA AND EMAIL RE:
SAME.

SUBTOTAL:

ATTY CLASS HOURS RATE

450.00 1755.00

170.00 204.00

450.00 360.00

450.00 360.00

$8,531.00

AMOUNT

JLW Partner 17.90 450.00
HS* Other 2.80 170.00

8,055.00
476.00

ATTY TOTALS 20.70

* SERVICES PROV[i)ED BY PARALEGAL OR LAW CLERK

8,531.00




Docket No. 20190168-WS
FCRU Document 1987

D E A N 11/15/21 Supplemental Response to Staff 8th POD #26
Dean, Mead, Egerton, Bloodworth, Capouano & Bozarth, P.A, 407-841-1200 Orlando
420 S, Orange Avenue, Suite 700 407-423-1831 Fax Fort Pierce
P.O. Box 2346 (ZIP 32802-2346} www.deanmead.com Vero Beach
Orlando, Florida 32801 Fed Tax [D# 59-2049716 Viera
Tallahassee
FIRST COAST REGIONAL UTILITIES, INC.
038587.074956
August 17, 2021
Page 3
ITEMIZED EXPENSES
DESCRIPTION AMOUNT
{CR-27252} - 8/11/2021 - STAFF LABOR FOR PUBLIC
286.00
RECORDS REQUEST
SUBTOTAL: $286.00
PREVIOUS STATEMENTS OUTSTANDING
BILLED PAYMENTS BALANCE
INVOICE # 387231 July 31, 2021 5,272.00 0.00 5,272.00

TOTAL OUTSTANDING INVOICES: $5,272.00

TOTAL CURRENT AMOUNT DUE $14,089.00

* SERVICES PROVIDED BY PARALEGAL OR LAW CLERK
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CHECK REQUEST
Date Q‘QQ}

Check Payable To M{ /‘LCU? &L{‘Dcﬁ /A;Sg(ﬂd,/,:}:\{*ﬁ. $ ) Q@m

Charge To: Client —Fil ‘J’STL Cﬁﬁ% + B Bi]ll (zih'ent $ dtua%/ )hﬁfg
: (includes costs directly charge
File No. WEo©.0 / to the firm)
Date of Travel

Type of Expense \[‘h \/ q L\'&O\B

Special Instructions
Check if to be paid T o (7\)0 ( ) f
from Trust Account qLY Q,) = e Signature

Needed By FSUIS D

Date
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11/15/21 Supplemental Response to Staff 8th POD #26
Milian, Swain & Associales, fne,

2025 8. W. 32" dvenue
Miami, Florida 33145
Tel.: 305-441-0123 Fax: 305-4471-0688

www.milianswain,com

Milian, Swain & Associates, Inc,

Civil Engineers Environmental Scientists & Engineers Utility Management Financial Consudiants
INVOICE

William E, Sundstrom, P.A. Invoice Date:  September 2, 2021

Sundstrom & Mindlin, LLP Invoice Number: 44803

Attorneys at Law Page #1 Billing # 20

2548 Blairstone Pines Drive
Tallahassee, FL 32301

Re: First Coast Regional Utilities, LLC
For Professional services rendered through August 27, 2021

Hours Rate Amount
Principal
Deborah Swain 1.25 225.00 281.25
Senior Staff’ Accountant
Cynthia Yapp 5.25 175.00 918.75
Engineering Technician
Adam Swain 90.00 0.00
Total Hours 6.50
| | Total For Invoice # 44803 $1,200.00|
Total Amount Due: $1,200.00

Please make check payable to Millan, Swain & Associates, Inc.,
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Time/Expenses by Project Report

Order Tlime By: Employee [D Milian, Swain & Associates Page 1
Order Expense By: Expense ## Project: F16-01
Status: Ready Hold Billed Never Billed Perfod: 08/01/2021 — 08/27/2021
Project  Project Name SJCul# SJ Inv it
Phase/Task/Employee Employee Name Dep Staff P/E Work Dale  OVT ST STATE Hours Worked  Billable Hours
116-01 FCRU-New Certificate
cYy Cynthia Yapp FIN 007  08/27/2021 08/27/2021 N R 5.25 5.25
DS Deborah Swain FIN 001  08/20/2021 08/20/2021 N R 0.25 0.25
DS Deborah Swain FIN 001  08/27/2021 08/27/2021 N R 1.00 1.00
[Updale JEA v FCU schedule
Sublotal Task 6.50 6.50
Subtotal Phase 6.50 6.50
Total Project F16-01 6.50 6.50

Run Date: Sep 2, 2021 @ 156:43:10 TIMEEXPRPT.FRX




F.E.L# 58-2783536

Docket No. 20190168-WS
FCRU Document 1991
11/15/21 Supplemental Response to Staff 8th POD #26

LAW OFFICES

SUNDSTROM & MINDLIN, LLP

2548 BLAIRSTONE PINES DR
TALLAHASSEE, FLORIDA 32301

(850) 877-6555 PLEASE REFER TO INVOICE NUMBER
WHEN REMITTING

FIRST COAST REGIONAL UTILITY, INC
301 CAPITAL PARTNERS, LLC

C/O AVERY C. ROBERTS OCTOBER 9, 2021
P.0. BOX 238 INVOICE # 58071
LAKE BUTLER, FL 32054 FILE # 48070-00001
PAGE 1
MATTER: ORIGINAL CERTIFICATE FROM PSC
9/05/21 FMD REVIEW EMAILS RE: OPC INVOLVEMENT IN CASE AND .30 112.50
REASONS THEREFOR AND RESPOND WITH THOUGHTS RE:
SAME.
9/21/21 WES DISCUSSION WITH AVERY AND AUSTEN WHO CALLED 1.50 562.50
RELATIVE TO FINANCING OPTIONS FOR FCRU; FOLLOW UP
WITH JOHN WHARTON RELATIVE TO COURT OF APPEALS
STATUS.
9/21/21 RCB PREPARE FOR AND PARTICIPATE IN CONFERENCE WITH 1.00 375.00
BILL SUNDSTROM AND JOHN WHARTON REGARDING STATUS
OF COURT OF APPEALS CASE.
9/22/21 WES 1.30 487.50
9/22/21 RCB  REVIEW ORDER FROM THE COURT OF APPEALS THAT 1.20 450.00
DENIED JEA'S PETITION FOR WRIT OF PROHIBITION;
CONFERENCE WITH BILL SUNDSTROM REGARDING SAME
9/23/21 WES MEMO TO FILE OUTLINING ISSUES TO BE RESOLVED, .80 300.00
TIMING, ETC. GOING FORWARD.
9/24/21 WES CONFERENCE CALL WITH BOB BRANNAN AND JOHN WHARTON .70 262.50
RELATIVE TO NEXT STEPS, OPTIONS AVAILABLE TO 301,
ETC.
9/24/21 RCB PREPARE FOR AND PARTICIPATE IN CONFERENCE CALL 2.00 750.00
WITH BILL SUNDSTROM AND JOHN WHARTON REGARDING
HOW TO MOVE FORWARD, OPTIONS FOR MOVING THE CASE
ALONG EXPEDITIOUSLY; RESEARCH THE STATUS OF ALL
OUTSTANDING DISCOVERY AND BEGIN MEMO TO FILE
REGARDING SAME.
9/25/21 WES .20 75.00
9/26/21 WES DRAFT AND SEND MEMO TO CLIENTS RELATIVE TO JEA'S .50 187.50
PROBABLE COURSE OF ACTION FOLLOWING LOSS AT FDCA,
TIMETABLE GOING FORWARD, ETC.
9/29/21 WES LENGTHY CONFERENCE CALL WITH ENGINEERS RELATIVE 2.00 750.00
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LAW OFFICES

SUNDSTROM & MINDLIN, LLP

2548 BLAIRSTONE PINES DR
TALLAHASSEE, FLORIDA 32301

F.E.L# 59-2783536 (850) 877-6555 PLEASE REFER TO INVOICE NUMBER
WHEN REMITTING

FIRST COAST REGIONAL UTILITY, INC

Invoice #: 58071 PAGE 2

TO RESTARTING PSC CASE, THEMES, ETC.; FORWARD
NASSAU GROWTH INFORMATION TO AVERY AND MIKE.
9/29/21 RCB OBTAIN DOCUMENTS NECESSARY FOR STAFF'S 2.60 875.00
OUTSTANDING DISCOVERY OF DOCUMENTS REQUEST; BEGIN
DRAFT OF STAFF'S OUTSTANDING INTERROGATORY
REQUEST; PREPARE FOR AND PARTICIPATE IN
CONFERENCE CALL WITH BEVIN, SCOTT AND BILL
SUNDSTROM REGARDING POTENTIAL ISSUES THAT HAVE
DEVELOPED SINCE THE FILING OF THE APPLICATION AND
STRATEGY FOR GETTING THEM INTO THE RECORD.
9/30/21 WES STRATEGY SESSION WITH PROPERTY RIGHTS LAWYER .80 300.00
RELATIVE TO 301 JUDICIAL REMEDIES AGAINST JEA.

TOTAL HOURS 14.90
PROFESSIONAL FEES $ 5,587.50
WILLIAM E SUNDSTROM 7.80 2,925.00
F MARSHALL DETERDING .30 112.50
ROBERT C BRANNAN ' 6.80 2,550.00
PROFESSIONAL SERVICES 3,376.25
TOTAL COSTS ADVANCED $ 3,376.25

TOTAL STATEMENT $ 8,963.75
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CHECK REQUEST

Check Payable To BQO‘(D Bﬁﬂd@% p F . LLC

Date } D ‘(?bl/

s 1S D

Hst CoasT

Charge To: Client

Bill Client $ HQS () |

of op (includes costs directly charged
File No. 4 8070 O | fo the firm)
- Date of Travel

Type of Expense R \VE \ \g /
Special Instructions

Check if to be paid R LA (—Q Cjﬁ’

from Trust Account 7~ L1 -t .

_ f[Q_z(;_@'l — Signature

Needed By 54343

Date
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Bevin A. Beaudet, P.E,LLC

babeaudet@gmail.com

N OICT

Bill TO

Willlam E Sundstrom PA
Sundstrom & Mindlin, LLP
2548 Blairstone Pines Dr.

m

INVOICE # 1181
DATE 10/05/2021
DUEDATE 11/04/2021

TERMS Net 30

Tallahassee, FL 32301

BESCHEIPTION G1Y RATE fatel
Cansulling 5 225,00 1,125.00
Gear Up for PSC Hearing. Work with Sundstrom and Kelly to

strategize, develop data needs and outline for JEA

depositions and hearing questions.
Bevin A. Beaudel, P.E,, LLC P BALANGE DUE $L 125.00
1543 Maple St. e /

Belhlshem, PA 18017 y 2{/ -
o 1 A GG Pl
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CHECK REQUEST

DeanMead

Check Payable To

Date q 25 Q/
. 195.00

Bill Client $ L} C{S 00

First Coast

Charge To: Client

File No. L OO O [ Eini\;%is;;)sts directly cha.rged
Date of Travel ;
Type of Expense v 38911
Special Instructions
Check if to be paid ) N (@%_H
from Trust Account Pt U R ' Sienature
I O N= NV tend
Needed By 43RS

Date
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Dean, Mead, Egerton, Bloodworth, Capouano & Bozarth, P.A, 407-841-1200 Orlando
420 S, Orange Avenue, Suite 700 407-423-1831 Fax Fort Pierce
P.0. Box 2346 (ZIP 32802-2346) www.deanmead.com Vero Beach
Orlando, Florida 32801 Fed Tax ID# 59-20497 18 Viera
Tallahassee
FIRST COAST REGIONAL UTILITIES, INC. September 23, 2021
ATTN: WILLIAM SUNDSTROM ID: 038587.074956
2548 BLAIRSTONE PINES DRIVE INVOICE # 389111
TALLAHASSEE, FL 32801 JLW

RE: JURISDICTIONAL ISSUE FOR DECLARATION

FOR PROFESSIONAL SERVICES RENDERED:

TOTAL FEES $495.00
ATTY : CLASS HOURS RATE  AMOUNT
JLW Partner 1,10 450.00 495.00

ATTY TOTALS - 1.10 495.00

PREVIOUS STATEMENTS OUTSTANDING

BILLED PAYMENTS BALANCE

INVOICE# 387515 August 17, 2021 8,817.00 0.00 8,817.00
TOTAL OUTSTANDING INVOICES: . $8,817.00
TOTAL CURRENT AMOUNT DUE $9,312.00

THES INVOICE 1S PAYABLE UPON RECEIPY.

PLEASE RETURN THIS PAGE WITH YOUR REMITTANCE OR PAY INVOICES
ONLINE AT WWW.,DEANMEAD.COM
WE ACCEPT VISA, MASTERCARD, DISCOVER, AND AMERICAN EXPRESS

...........................

A Member of ALFA Internatlonal - The Global Legal Network
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Dean, Mead, Egerton, Bloodworth, Capouano & Bozarth, P.A, 407-841-1200 Orlando
420 S, Orange Avenue, Suite 700 407-423-1831 Fax Fort Pierce
P.0. Box 2346 (ZIP 32802-2346) www.deanmead.com Vero Beach
Orlando, Florida 32804 _ Fed Tax ID# 53-2049716 Viera
Tallahassee
FIRST COAST REGIONAL UTILITIES, INC. September 23, 2021
ATTN: WILLIAM SUNDSTROM ID: 038587.074956
2548 BLAIRSTONE PINES DRIVE INVOICE # 389111

TALLAHASSEE, FL 32801 JLW

RE: JURISDICTIONAL ISSUE FOR DECLARATION

FOR PROFESSIONAL SERVICES RENDERED:

ITEMIZED ATTORNEY FEES
DESCRIPTION DATE ATTY HOURS RATE AMOUNT
REVIEW EMAILS RE: 08/23/21 JLW 0.60  450.00 270.00
UPDATED SCHEDULE AND
DRAFT UPDATED
SCHEDULE.
EMAILS RE: OPC 09/05/21 JLW 0.50  450.00 225.00
CORRESPONDENCE IN THE '
PSC DOCKET AND POSSIBLE
BASIS AND CONSEQUENCES.
SUBTOTAL: $495.00 .
ATTY CLASS HOURS RATE  AMOUNT
JLW Partner 1,10  450.00 495.00
ATTY TOTALS 1.10 495.00

PREVIOUS STATEMENTS OUTSTANDING

BILLED PAYMENTS BALANCE
INVOICE # 387515 August 17,2021 8,817.00 0.00 8,817.00

TOTAL OUTSTANDING INVOICES: ‘ $8,817.00

TOTAL CURRENT AMOUNT DUE $9,312.00

+ SERVICES PROVIDED BY PARALEGAL OR LAW CLERK
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CHECK REQUEST
Date /OQQJ

ChecPayable To | Y1 [jan, Stdein & Assoe Te s 11565

Charge To; Client _ T {51 Const Bill Client $ | 1900 A5

includes costs directly charged

File No. 48070 .M (inc
Yat - to the firm) ,

Date of Travel

Type of Expense Y. S0005

Special Instructions
Checkiftobepaid .= [0 "7) (‘%H_F
: | SR T b
from Trust Account Lo JO g/&} B 7 ] Signature

Needed By jﬂ;\sqag f)

Date
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Milian, Swain & Associates, Inc,
Milian, Swain & Associates, inc.
2025 SW 32 Avenue
Suite 110
Miami, FL 33145

Sundstrom & Mindlin, LLP Invoice number 50005
William Sundstrom P.A, . Date 09/28/2021
2548 Blairstone Pines Drive

Tallahassee, FL 32301 Project FCRU-New Certificale

For professional services through September 29, 2021

First Coast Regional Utilities LLC - Initial Rates & Charges

Professional Services

Billed
Hours Rate Amount
Cynthia Yapp 6.50 175.00 1,137.50
Deborah Swain 2.75 225.00 618,75
invoice total 1,756.25
Aging Summary

Invoice Number Invoice Date Outstanding Current Over 30 Over 60 Over 90 Over 120

50005 09/29/2021 1,766.25 1,756.25

Total 1,766.26 1,756.26 0.00 0.00 0.00 0.00




FCRU-New Certificate
Professlonal Services
‘ Date Range from: 8/31/2021 to 9/24/2021
Employee/Activity
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Total Billed
Cynthia Yapp 3.00
Project Labor 3.00

Date Total Biiled
9/1712024 1.75
Review / Compare JEA BOD 9/47/21 proposed service 9/21/2021 1.26

charges lo First Coasl proposed service charges.

Deborah Swain 2,78
Project Labor 2,75

Date Total Billed
Service Avallabilily chart 9/15/2021 0.25
Review board meeling package 9/17/2021 1.00
Review JEA meeling impact on charges 9/20/2021 1,00
Review addilional JEA rale changes 8/24/2021 0.50

Total

5,758
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