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Attorneys at Law ,
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WavnNE L. SCHIEFELBEIN

June 28, 1996

HAND DELIVERY

Ms. Blanca S. Bayo, Director
Division of Records and Reporting
Florida Public Service Commission
2540 Shumard Oak Blvd.
Tallahassee, FL 32399-1850

RE: Docket No.
Application by PALM COAST UTILITY CORPORATION

for a rate increase in Flagler County, Florida

Dear Ms. Bayo:

Enclosed at Staff’s request and pursuant to a telephone conversation with Mr. Scott Edmonds

for filing in the above docket are an original and fifteen copies of Exhibit (FS-13A), which
supercedes Exhibit FS-13 of Frank Seidman’s Rebuttal Testimony, along with our Certificate of
Service.

FS-13A provides more detail for projected rate case expense for Management and Regulatory
Consultants, Inc., and Guastella Associates, Inc., and updates actual vs. estimate for those two firms

V4 and the Gatlin, Woods & Carlson.

5} Please acknowledge receipt of the foregoing by stamping the enclosed extra copy of this letter

.4 andreturning same to my attention. Thank you for your assistance.
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BEFORE THE FLORIDA PUBLIC SERVICE COMMISSION

In re: Application for rate increase in ) Docket No. 951056-WS

Flagler County by PALM COAST )

UTILITY CORPORATION ) Filed: June 28, 1996
CERTIFICATE OF SERVICE

I HEREBY CERTIFY that a true and correct copy of Palm Coast Utility Corporation’s
Exhibit FS-13A of Frank Seidman’s Rebuttal Testimony has been furnished by hand delivery to Mr.
Scott Edmonds, Esquire, Division of Legal Services, Florida Public Service Commission, 2540
Shumard Oak Blvd., Tallahassee, Florida 32399-0850, Mr. Stephen C. Reilly, Associate Public
Counsel, Office of Public Counsel, 111 W. Madison Street, Room 812, Claude Pepper Building,
Tallahassee, Florida 32399-1400, and to Mr. Richard D. Melson, Esquire, Hopping Green Sams &
Smith, 123 South Calhoun Street, Tallahassee, Florida 32314, and by Federal Express to Mr. Albert
J. Hadeed, County Attorney, 4 Ocean Vista Lane, The Hammock, Palm Coast, Florida 32137, on
this 28th day of June, 1996.

Respectfully submitted,

I<fat ryn G/W Eowdery
Gatlin, Woods & Carlson -
1709-D Mahan Drive
Tallahassee, Florida 32308
(904) 877-7191
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Attorneys for
PALM COAST UTILITY CORPORATION



Docket No. 951056-WS

ORIGINAL
FILE Lopy

Exhibit (FS-13A)

UPDATED RATE CASE EXPENSE
(Actual and Projected)
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PALM COAST UTILITY CORPORATION
UPDATED RATE CASE EXPENSE
(Actual and Projected)

Actual Estimate to

Complete
Firm/Consultant Fees Costs Fees Costs Totals
M & R Consultants 61,391! 2,161 5,015 400 $68,967
Guastella Associates 93,7922 5,928 12,640% - 112,360
~ Gatlin, Woods & Carlson 124,734 8,334 35,520 7,925 176,513
Southern Appraisal 4,026 250 2,275 6,551

PCUC Direct Costs’
Filing Fee 9,000 9,000
Printing (MFRs, Notices) 10,053 2,000 12,053
Newspaper - Hearing 800 200 1,000
Postage 5,000 4,000 9,000
Interim Rate Bond Premium 2,436 2,436
(Nonrefundable)

283,943 43,962 $55,450 14,525 $397.880

* Includes costs

Actual through 6/25/96
Actual through 6/25/96
Actual through 6/26/96
Actual through 6/14/96
Actual through 6/21/96

Ww e W N



GUASTELLA & ASSOCIATES

Actual/Billed
6/95 through 5/31/96

By. A oF 95
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UTILITY MANAGEMENT ¢ VALUATION RATECONSULMNI‘ --o °.t b et

PO.BOX 371, 88 MAIN STREET
PEAPACK, NEW JERSEY 07977

P - « o ° TEL: (9085 234.1717

e ¢ o & ¢ o & o

T e e e FAX: (908) 234-2787
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Mr. Brian Bilinski August 1, 1995

Palm Coast Utility Corporation
2 Utility Drive
Palm Coast, FL 32137

Period Ended: 7/31/95

Work in progress on rate filing and participation in used and useful
workshop.

Total Hours 36.75
Staff Charges:
Hourly
Rate Hours Amount
Principal I 190 36.50 $ 6,935.00
Associate 155 0.00 0.00
Principal II 135 0.00 0.00
Engineer 95 0.00 0.00
Financial/Acctng 95 0.00 0.00
Analyst 75 0.00 0.00
Technician 60 0.00 0.00
Administrative 38 0.25 9.50
$ 6,944.50
Expenses: J. Guastella Travel -
) June 19-20 to Palm Coast Air Fare ~ n/c
Auto 108.61
Room 76.62
July 11-12 to Tallahassee Air Fare 1,008.00
Room 130.90
Limo 154.50
July 18-19 to Palm Coast Air Fare 696.00
Room 129.44
Auto 57.10
Limo 154.50

- —— o — e =
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B. 395

MASSACHUSETTS OFFICE: 210 WINTER STREET, SUITE 101, WEYMOUTH, MA 02188 TEL: (617) 333-2828 FAX: (617) 337-5133
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GUASTELLA ASSOCIATES, Wi+

UTILITY M/\NAGI‘:MF,N'i’ * VALUATION * RATE CONSULTANTS 2 . « a1n
e eTe o e sl PO. BOX 371, 88 MAIN STREET
° .5 5" . .- B PEAPACK, NEW JERSEY 07977
.')> ;1) ". L > TEL: (908) 234-1717
FAX:(908) 234-2787
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Mr. Brian Bilinski : . : September 1, 1995

Palm Coast Utility Corporation
2 Utility Drive
Palm Coast, FL 32137

Period Ended:r 8/31/95
1 L

Work in progress on rate filing - review data, preliminary work on
used and useful, meeting with Company.

Total Hours 16.75
Staff Charges:
Hourly
Rate Hours Amount
Principal I 190 16.50 $ 3,135.00
Associate 155 0.00 0.00
Principal II 135 0.00 0.00
Engineer 95 0.00 0.00
Financial/Acctng 95 0.00 0.00
Analyst 75 0.00 0.00
Technician 60 0.00 0.00
Administrative 38 0.25 9.50
$ 3,144.50
Expenses: J. Guastella Travel e
8/22-23 to Palm Coast Air Fare > 786.00
Auto 51.76
Room 135.32
Limo 154 .50

//qg é; ~—/€>C? -~ D0 — /f(’cgcgz)
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MASSACHUSETTS OFFICE: 210 WINTER STREET, SUITE 101, WEYMOUTI, MA 02188 TEL: (617) 335-2828 FAX: (617) 337-5133
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GUASTELLA ASSOCIATES, inc

UTILITY MANAGEMENT © VALUATION * RATE COMNSULTANTS
.o e« o -

.
. 0. BOX 371, B4 MAIN STREET
* PEAPACK, NEW JERSEY 07977
. L d TEL: (908) 2341717
FAX: (908) 234-2787

Mr. Brian Bilinski . «+ * (QOctober 2, 1995
Palm Coast Utility Corporation

2 Utility Drive

Palm Coast, FL 32137

Period Ended: 9/30/95

Work in progress on rate case - used & useful studies and related
meeting.

Total Hours 144.25
Staff Charges:
Hourly
Rate Hours Amount
Principal I 190 79.00 $ 15,010.00
Associate 155 0.00 0.00
Principal II 135 / 0.00 0.00
Engineer 95" 65.00 6,175.00
Financial/Acctng 95 0.00 0.00.
Analyst 75 0.00 0.00
Technician 60 0.00 0.00
Administrative 38/ 0.25 9.50
$ 21,194.50
Expenses: J. Guastella Travel T %
} 9/18-19 Air Fare < 596.00//
Auto 72.76
Room 129.44;7/
Limo 154.50.
J.M. Guastella Travel 540 m. € $.30 162.00

$ 22,309.20 W

o T F%. €; O£ CE;

MASSACHUSETTS OFFICE: 210 WINTER STREET, SUITE 101, WEYMOUTH, MA 02188 TEL: (617) 335-2828 FAX: (617) 337-5153
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UTILITY MANAGRMENT © VALUATION * RATE CONSULTANTS
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Mr. Brian Bilinski

Palm Coast Utility Corp
-2 Utility Drive '
Palm Coast, FL 32137

November 1,
oration

Period Ended:

Work in progress on rate case - used & useful studies
- . °

. .
ese @

-qual'QSHts

] .. 137.50
. Staff GRanges:** -,
L e e e Hourly
Lo, ST Rate Hours
: Pringipal I 1907 50.50
o .sse+pssociate 155 0.00
Principal II 135 0.00
*¢**‘Engineer 95 80.00
Financial/Acctng 95 0.00
Analyst 75 0.00
Technician 60 _ 0.00
Administrative 38 7.00
Expenses: J. Guastella Travel
10/18-19 Air Fare
Auto
Room
Limo

Federal Express/UPS
FAX transmissions 72 pp. € $1l/ea.

" P

., < ** PO.BOX 371,88 MAIN STREET
. ., ‘PEAPACK, NEW JERSEY 07977
TEL: (908) 234-1717
FAX: (90R) 234.2787

-

1995

10/31/95

.

9,595.00
0.00
0.00

7,600.00
0.00

. 0.00
0.00
266.00

17,461.00

586.00
76.43
129.44
74.75
45.25
72.00

18,444.87 |

y,
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MASSACHUSETTS OFFICE: 210 WiNTER STREET, SUITE 101, WEYMOUTH, MA 02188 TEL: (617) 335-2828 FAX: (617) 337-5133
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UTILITY MANAGEMENT * VALUATION * RATE CONSULTANTS

PO. BOX 371, 88 MAIN STREET
PEAPACK, NEW JERSEY 07977
TEL: (508) 234-1717
FAX: (908) 234-2787

Mr. Brian.qilinski : December 1, 1995
Palm Coast ‘Utility.Corporation .

*Z2 Utility Drive****

‘Paim Cogst’. FL%32137

B Period Ended: 11/30/95

Work in_ggggress on rate case - used & useful studies.

Total Hours 50.50
Staff Charges:
Hourly
Rate Hours Amount
Principal I 190// 21.50 $ 4,085.00 —
Associate 155 0.00 0.00
Principal II 135 0.00 1 0.00
Engineer 95/ 24.00 - 2,280.00
Financial/Acctng 95 0.00 0.00
Analyst 75 0.00 0.00
Technician 60 0.00 v 0.00//
Administrative 38 ./ 5.00 190.00
| -$ 6,555.00 4
Expenses: Federal Express _ h 13.00
FAX transmissions 88 pp. € $1l/ea. 88.00

MASSACHUSETTS OFFICE: 210 WINTER STREET, SUITE 101, WEYMOUTH, MA 02188 TEL: (617) 335-2828 FAX: (617) 337-5153
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UTILITY MANAGEMENT * VALUATION * RATE CQ&ISULTAQTS..:
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Mr. Brian Bilinski
Palm Coast Utility Corporation
2 Utility Drive

Palm Coast, FL 32137

'YX KN
L
o0
[ X N X
L] .
o8 dae

Work in progress on rate case - used & useful studies.

Total Hours 31.50
Staff Charges:
Hourly
Rate
Principal I 190
Associate 155
Principal II 135
Engineer 95
Financial/Acctng 95
Analyst 75
Technician 60
Administrative 38

Expenses: Federal Express & UPS

(XXX X]

January 2, 1996

Period Ended:

PO. BOX 37¢, 88 MAIN STREET
PEAPACK, NEW JERSEY 07977
TEL: (908) 234-1717
FAX:(908) 234-2787

12/31/95

$ 285.00
0.00

0.00
2,755.00
0.00

0.00

0.00

38.00

Py. 9o 95

MASSACHUSETTS OFFICE: 210 WINTER STREET, SUITE 101, WEYMOUTH, MA 02188 TEL: (617) 335-2828 FAX: (617) 337-5133



GUASTELLA ASSOCIATES, we

UTILITY MANAG[EMENf * VALUATION * RATE CONSUITANTS

PO. BOX 371, 88 MAIN STREET
PEAPACK, NEW JERSEY 07977
TEL: (908) 234-1717
FAX: (908) 234-2787

Mr. Brian Bilinski February 1, 1996
Palm Coast Utility Corporation

" 2 Utility Drive N ' '

Palm Coast, FL 32137

Period Ended: 1/31/96

Work in progress on rate case - used & useful studies.

Total Hours 26.00
Staff Charges:
/Egeg/'ﬂourly
(onf 7 Rate Hours Amount
Principal I (T2 195~ 1.00 $ 9s-o0 (72
Associate 150 0.00 0.00 .
Principal II {35 40" 0.50 3000 67>
Engineer 757 200 24.00 2,400.00 A2g0.
Financial/Acctng 100 0.00 0.00
Analyst 80 0.00 0.00
Technician 65 0.00 0.00
Administrative 38~ 0.50 19.00
=5 2,684~06
~ ASTE ST
s/

‘Pﬁ,ﬂ oL G5

MASSACHUSETTS OFFICE: 210 WINTER STREET, SUITE 101, WEYMOUTH, MA 02188 TEL: (617) 335-2828 FAX: (617) 337-5313%
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UTILITY MANAGEMENT * VALUATION ¢ RATE CONSULTANTS
P.O. BOX 371, 88 MAIN STREET
PEAPACK, NEW JERSEY 07977
TEL: (908) 2341717
FAX: (Q08) 234.2787

Mr. Brian Bilinski . May 1, 1996
Palm Coast_ Utility Corporation

2 Utility Crive

Palm Coast, FL 32137

4o
\

Period Ended: 4/30/96

Work in progress -.review and respond to data requests, related

discussions.

Total Hours 16.50

Staff Charges:

Hourly
Rate Hours Amount

Principal I ( 90 —195— 3.00 $ 58500 S 7/
Associate 150 0.00 0.00
Principal II ( 35 140~ 0.50 7000 € 7-5¢
Engineer c;f'-—i—&ﬂ’ 10.00 1,000.00—¢¢C. ¢
Financial/Acctng 100 0.00 0.00
Analyst 80 0.00 0.00
Technician 65 0.00 0.00
Administrative 38~ 3.00 114.00 —

Expenses: UPS

J7R17.50

MASSACHUSETTS OFFICE: 210 WINTER STREET. SUITE 101, WEYMOUTH, MA 02188 TEL: (617) 335-2828 FAX: (G17) 337-5155

By. loof 95



L~

OTELLA ASSOCIATES, INC.

LETY MANAGEMENT © VALUATION * RATE CONSULTANTS

P.O. BOX 371, 88 MAIN STREET
PEAPACK, NEW JERSEY 07977
TEL: (908) 234-1717
FAX: (508) 234-2787

Mr. Brian Bilinski June 3, 1996
Palm Coast Utility Corporation
2 Utility Drive

Palm Coast, FL 32137

Period Ended: 5/31/96

Rate case work in progress - review audit report, interrogatories,
testimony, pre-hearing issues and preliminary preparation of responses
and rebuttal.

Total Hours 36.50
Staff Charges:
Hourly
Rate Hours Amount
Principal I 190 /// 31.50 5,985.00
Associate 145 0.00 0.00
Principal II 135 0.50 67.50
Engineer 95 3.00 285.00
Financial/Acctng 95 0.00 0.00
Technician 60 0.00 0.00
Administrative 38 1.50 57.00
6,394.50
Expenses: Telephone : 18.21
FAX 6.00 /
$ 6,418.71 8!

SRk 98

MASSACHUSETTS OFFICE: 210 WINTER STREET, SUITE 101, WEYMOUTH, MA 02188 TEL: (617) 335-2828 FAX: (617) 337-3133




GUASTELLA ASSOCIATES, INC.

Actual/Unbilled, and
Estimate to Complete

Pg. 12 of 945



GUASTELLA ASSOCIATES, INC. TEL No. 2012342787 Jun 26,96 15:24 P.02

GUASTELLA ASSOCIATES, wc

UTILITY MANAGEMENT ¢ VALUATION * RATE CONSULTANTS

P.O. BOX 371, 88 MAIN STREET
PEAPACK, NEW JERSEX 07977
TEL: (908) 234-171)

VAX. (M) I34-2TKT

MMAR F BI

Fro e 1l to Co o
Actual Projected
Hours Hours
Review pre-filed testimony of JFG 67.0
Dunes, OPC and FPSC; prepare - Adm. 22.5

rebuttal material and testimony,
related conferences and meetings.

Review Inter. and Doc. Req. of JFG 29.5 JFG 2.0
Dunes, OPC and FPSC; prepare and

review responses; review motions

to compel and responses, pre-

.hearing orders and issues

Prepare for and attend deposition, JFG 19.5 JFG 4.0
review transcripts of depositions Tech. 3.0

of PCUC, OPC, Staff and Dunes;

review and prepare late-filed

responses to deposition requests

Prepare for and attend hearings, JFG 55.0
assist in preparation of briefs Adm. 5.0
Summary*
Billings through May 31 $ 74,957.53
Actual charges through June 25 24,762.89
Projected to completion 12 .

'$112,360.42

*Includes time and out-of-pocket expenses

MASSACHUSETTS OFFICE: 210 WINTER STRSET, SUITE 101, WEYMOUTH, MA 02106 TEL: (617) 113-2828 PAX: (617) 33 /-31%5

-

v,
Pg. 13 of 2




MANAGEMENT & REGULATORY CONSULTANTS, INC.
Expenses

Actual/Billed
4/24/95 through 5/29/96

Frank Seidman hourly rate - $85.00

Ry 14 o 95
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. P Bax, 13427
Tallahassee, FL 32317-3427
, Phone or Fax (904) 942-4339
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Manc'ge‘ment:&ﬁié'guldlory' Consultants, Inc.

. )
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¢ o o
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MR. JAMES PERRY -+ ~+ "«
PALM COAST UTILITY CORP.
2 UTILITY DRIVE

PAIM COAST, FL 32137 . . 07/05/95
. . : 10023.00
/s

[ XY
csaae
LAY

3

CONSULTING - RE 1995 RATE CASE

04/24/95

05/01/95

06/19/95

EXPENSES
05/31/95
05/31/95
05/31/95
05/31/45
05/31/95

PREVIOQOUS BALANCE $ 00.00
HOURS

FS CONSULTING —~ REVIEW LAST RATE CASE
AND PREPARE ANALYSIS FOR MAY 4 MEETING
WITH GATLIN & PCUC. 8.00 680.00

FS CONSULTING - PREPARE FOR MEETING; MEET
WITH GATLIN & PCUC TO CONSIDER 1995

RATE CASE. 2.50 212.50
FS CONSULTING - MEET WITH PCUC STAFF &
CONSULTANTS RE BACKGROUND, ORGANIZATION
& SCHEDULING FOR RATE FILING; INITIAL
ON-SITE PLANT INSPECTION. 10.00 850.00
FOR CURRENT SERVICES RENDERED . 20.50 $1742.50
MILEAGE 215 MILES €@ $.30/MILE 64.50
CAR RENTAL 45.63
‘GAS FOR RENTAL CAR - 13.83
LODGING - 86.11
MEALS < _28.29
TOTAL EXPENSES $238.36
BALANCE DUE $ 1980.86

%“/5 o+45
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P.O.Box 13427 . . .- {?)‘“ ,A-
Tallahassee, FL 32317-3427
Phone or Fax (904) 942-4339 . .--

-
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Management & Régt]i‘c‘:tory'cb'ﬁsuliénls‘, inc.

........

MR. JAMES PERRY D S
PALM COAST UTILITY CORP. R
2 UTILITY DRIVE

PALM COAST, FL 32137 08/14/95
S : 10023.00

CONSULTING - RE 1995 RATE CASE | ' A T

PREVIOUS BALANCE $ 1980.86
HOURS

07/03/95 FS CONSULTING - REVIEW ANNUAL REPORT,
CPR, G/L, PREVIOUS O&M U/U. 16.00 1360.00

07/17/95 FS CONSULTING - INTERVIEW PCUC PERSONNEL,
PREPARE NOTES; MEET WITH PCUC STAFF, .
COUNSEL, CONSULTANT RE RATE CASE STATUS. 23.50 -1997.50

07/24/95 FS CONSULTING - REVIEW OP. DEPT. EXPENSES
FOR 1994,95; DRAFT ANALYSIS NARRATIVE
AND SCHEDULES. 15.00 1275.00

07/31/95 FS CONSULTING - REVIEW OP. DEPT. EXPENSES
FOR 1994,95; DRAFT ANALYSIS NARRATIVE

AND SCHEDULES. 2.00 - 170.00
FOR CURRENT SERVICES RENDERED 56.50 $4802.50
EXPENSES

07/31/95 MILEAGE 460 MILES € $.30/MILE ‘ 138.00
07/31/45 LODGING e 129.44
07/31/95 MEALS - 32.78
: TOTAL EXPENSES ~ $300.22

PAYMENTS AND CREDITS FOR EXPENSES
08/01/95 PAYMENT -1980.86
BALANCE DUE $ 5102.72

/86 - (0o - T O - RC oo
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P.O. Box 13427 @ . °
Tallahassee, FL 32317-3427
Phone or Fax (904) 942-4339
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Management & Reguiatoty-Consuitants, Inc.
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MR. JAMES PERRY :.

PALM COAST UTILITY CORF. *.* *.° °.
2 UTILITY DRIVE

PALM COAST, FL 32137

st e

.

CONSULTING - RE 1995 RATE CASE

PREVIOUS BALANCE

08/07/95 FS CONSULTING - DRAFT O&M U/U
NARRATIVE & SCHEDULES.

08/14/95 FS CONSULTING - DRAFT O&M U/U
NARRATIVE & SCHEDULES. SEND
DRAFT TO BILINSKI FOR COMMENTS.

08/21/95 FS CONSULTING - MEET WITH PCUC STAFF,
COUNSEL, CONSULTANT RE CASE STATUS:
ASSIST WITH TEST YEAR APPROVAL LETTER;?
REVIEW S. ZONE IMPROVEMENTS CORRES.;
REVIEW MFR REQUIREMENTS FOR PROJ TY;
DISCUSS COMMENTS ON O&M REPORT.

08/29/95 FS <CONSULTING - INCORPORATE COMMENTS
ON DRAFT REPORT & SCHEDULES.
FOR CURRENT SERVICES RENDERED

EXPENSES
08/21/95 MILEAGE; COMP. W/GATLIN
08/31/95 LODGING
08/31/95 MEALS

TOTAL EXPENSES

PAYMENTS AND CREDITS FOR EXPENSES
~==/—--/95 PAYMENT

BALANCE DUE

09/05/95
10023.00
-
" $ 5 .72
HOURS

10.00 850.00
16.00 1360.00
16.25 1381.25
2.00 170.00

44.25 $3761.25

- 00.00
< 88.56
_22.91
$111.47
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PD. Box 13437 - -
Tallahassee, FL 32317-3427
Phone or Fax (804) 942-4339 -+
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Managemerif & ‘Reguiatory Consultants, Inc.
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MR. JAMES PERRY s
PALM COAST UTILITY CORP"
2 UTILITY DRIVE

PALM COAST, FL 32137

CONSULTING - RE 1995 RATE CASE

09/18/95

09/25/95

EXPENSES
09/30/95
09/30/95
09/30/95
09/30/95

PAYMENTS
09/07/95
10/03/95

PREVIOUS BALANCE

FS CONSULTING - MEET WITH STAFF RE
INPUT FOR MFRS; OBTAIN DATA;
MEET WITH STAFF, COUNSEL,
CONSULTANT RE CASE STATUS; PREPARE
MFR Y“"A" SCHEDULES.
Lgs/

FS PREPARE MFR "A" SCHEDULES.
FOR CURRENT SERVICES RENDERED

FEDERAL EXPRESS, JUL & AUG
MILEAGE 460 MILES @ $.30/MILE
LODGING
MEALS ‘ '
TOTAL EXPENSES

AND CREDITS FOR EXPENSES
PAYMENT
PAYMENT

BALANCE DUE

10/16/95
10023.00

/7

$ 8975.44

A

HOURS

34.50 2932.50

21.00 1785.00
55.50 $4717.50 —

21.75~
138.00~
88.56/
_10.71.7
$259.02

-5102.72
-3872.72

$ 4976.52

17

?3. 1§ of 95



P.O. Box 13427

Tallahassee, FL 32317-3427
Phone or Fax (904) 877-0673

Management & Regulatory Consultants, Inc.

MR. JAMES PERRY

PALM COAST UTILITY CORP.
2 UTILITY DRIVE

PALM COAST, FL 32137

CONSULTING — RE 1995 RATE CASE

10/02/95

10/08/95

oo b4

10416495

10423495

10/30/95

evseves
. L]

EXPENSES
10/31/95
10/31/95
10/31/95

PAYMENTS
11/13/95

PREVIOUS BALANCE

FS CONSULTING - PREPARE MFR
"AY, “BY and "EY" Schedules

FS CONSULTING - MEET WITH PCUC;
. « PREPARE Y“A" -~ WE" gchedules
&S+« CONSULTING - PREPARE MFR
ceces MAY -~ VEY Schedules

. -

%S"CONSULTING —~ PREPARE MFR

« o ltpn _ wpn gchedules

FS CONSULTING - PREPARE MFR "A"
SCHEDULES; DRAFT TESTIMONY

"Ell

’
; >
FOR CURRENT SERVICES RENDERE% 3

MILEAGE 460 MILES @ $.30/MILE
LODGING
MEALS

TOTAL EXPENSES

AND CREDITS FOR EXPENSES
PAYMENT

BALANCE DUE

11/16/95

10023.00
$ 4976.52

HOURS

18.00 1530.00
36.50 3102.50
30.00 2550.00
25.00 2125.00
12.00  1020.00

121.50 $10327.50 0

138.00~

213.64 —

61.21
< $412.85

$10740.35 ¢

Q.19 o£95



o @
P.O. Box 13427

Tallahassee, FL 32317-3427
Phone or Fax (904) 877-0673

Management & Regulatory Consultants, Inc.

MR. JAMES PERRY

PALM COAST UTILITY CORP.
2 UTILITY DRIVE

PALM COAST, FL 32137

Q

CONSUYLTING - RE 1995 RATE CASE

KX PP\EVIOUS BAT.ANCE

se o9
.

.

11797795 FS..C ONSULTING - PREPARE MFR SCHEDULES &
_+*,SAC EVALUATION
11/06,95 FS CONSULTING - MEET WITH PCUC RE MFRs;
- SAC APPLICATION; CONTINUE WITH PREP
S of "A" — WF" SCHEDULES

11/13/95 FS CONSULTING - FINALIZE MFRs, SAC
SCHEDULES, TESTIMONY; MEET W/GATLIN

11/27/95 FS CONSULTING - FINALIZE MFRs, SAC
SCHEDULES, TESTIMONY
FOR CURRENT SERVICES RENDERED

EXPENSES
11/30/95 FEDERAL EXPRESS, SEPT.
11/30/95 MILEAGE 472 MILES @ $.30/MILE
11/30/95 LODGING
11/30/95 MEALS

TOTAL EXPENSES

PAYMENTS AND CREDITS FOR EXPENSES
12/04/95 PAYMENT

BALANCE DUE

12/08/95
10023.00
$10740.35
HOURS
26.25 2231.25
63.25 5376.25
15.00 1275.00
17.00 1445.00

121.50 $10327.50"

19.25
141.60
294.30
—50.92

$506.07

¥4

-10740.35

$10833.57y

<E%. 20 OPCEF
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MR. JAMES PERRY .
PALM COAST UTILITY CORP.’s "o %
2 UTILITY DRIVE

PALM COAST, FL 32137 02/12/96
10023.00
CONSULTING - RE 1995 RATE CASE ' oy,
4
PREVIOUS BALANCE $10833.57
HOURS

01/15/96 FS CONSULTING - PREPARE MFR SCHEDULES
RE DEFICIENCY LETTER 14.00 1190.00

01/22/96 FS CONSULTING - MEET WITH PCS STAFF RE
DEFICIENCY LETTER; CONTINUE WITH PREP
OF SCHEDULES RE LETTER 10.00 850.00

01/29/96 FS CONSULTING - DRAFT DEFICIENCY LETTER?
PREPARE BAL. SHEET RECONCILIATION &
DEF. TAX WORKSHEETS. 9.00 765.00
FOR CURRENT SERVICES RENDERED 33.00 $ 2805.00

PAYMENTS AND CREDITS FOR EXPENSES
01/03/96 PAYMENT -10833.57

BALANCE DUE $ 2805.00

?.al oF B




P.O. Box 13427
Tallahassee, FL 32317-3427
Phone or Fax (904) 877-0673

Management & Regulatory Consultants, Inc.

MR. JAMES PERRY : P
PALM COAST UTILITY CORP.

2 UTILITY DRIVE

PALM COAST, FL 32137 03/05/96

10023.00

CONSULTING - RE 1995 RATE CASE

02/01/96 FS

02/05/96 FS

02/12/96 FS

02/19/96 FS

PAYMENTS AND CREDITS FOR EXPENSES
03/05/96 PAYMENT

PREVIOUS BALANCE $ 2805.00
HOURS

CONSULTING - PREPARE MFR SCHEDULES
RE DEFICIENCY LETTER 4.00 340.00

CONSULTING - MEET WITH GATLIN; TEL.
CONF. W/BILINSKI; CONTINUE WITH PREP

OF SCHEDULES RE LETTER 12.00 1020.00

CONSULTING - TEL. CONF. W/STAFF; DELIVER

DEFICIENCY RESPONSE: MEET W/MONIZ 1.00 85.00

CONSULTING - PREPARE WORKPAPERS FOR :

bPSC AUDIT 6.00 510.00
FOR CURRENT SERVICES RENDERED 23.00 $ 1955.00

BALANCE DUE

.92 of W5



P.O. Box 13427
Tallahassee, FL 32317-3427
Phona or Fax (804) 877-06873

Management & Reguliafory Consullants, Inc.

MR. JAMES PERRY
PALM COAST UTILITY CORP.
2 UTILITY DRIVE

[ S R R R B PRI . B S

Tt on TALM COAST, FL 32137 ggéég/gg

CONSULTING -~ RE 1995 RATE CASE

PREVIQUS BALANCE HOURS $ 4760.00
03/25;’96 FS CONSULTING -~ REVIEW STAFF AUDIT
: REQUESTS:; CROSS CHECK _INFQ PROVIDED. 3.00 _255.00
FOR CURRENT SERVICES RENDERED 3.00 § 255.00
PAYMENTS AND CREDITS FOR EXPENSES
03/11/96 PAYMENT -~ 2805.00
03/25/96 PAYMENT - 1955.,00
BALANCE DUE $ 255.00
Post-it™ brand fax trarsmittal memo 7671 tofpagess |
Toe A~ g From ~
Co. p_ f ' C i _Ihkk-..g
- - \..(_/ Q B | o. m*'a_/
<pt. Phone
Fax &
Fax# - —1
9. 33 £95
G-Qh THU 15:23 JE4ETTOETS FP.a1



P.O. Box 13427
Tallahassee, FL 32317-3427
Phone or Fax (904) 877-0673
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04/01/96

<
<ce

04/08/96

04/15/96
04/22/96

04/29/96

PAYMENTS
04/30/96

1AY~ S9-96 THI

Management & Regulatory Consultants, Inc.

MR. JAMES PERRY
PALM COAST UTILITY CORP.

2

UTILITY DRIVE

PALM COAST, FL 32137

FS

FS

FS

FS

CONSULTING, .~ RE 1995 RATE CASE

" PREVIOUS BALANCE
, CONSULTING - REVIEW OPC DISCOVERY
‘REQUESTS; TELEPHONE CONFERENCES WITH

PCUC & LEGAL; PREPARE INITIAL COMMENTS.

CONSULTING - ASSIST WITH RESPONSES TO
OPC DISCOVERY REQUESTS; PREPARE
DISKETTES FOR OPC.

CONSULTING - REVIEW OPC SECOND SET OF
DISCOVERY REQUESTS; ASSIST WITH
RESPONSES; TELEPHONE CONFERENCES

WITH PCUC & LEGAL.

CONSULTING =~ ASSIST WITH RESPONSES
TO OPC DISCOVERY; COMPILE & INDEX
BACKGROUND & SUPPORT FOR TESTIMONY
& MFRS.

CONSULTING - ASSIST WITH RESPONSES
TO OPC DISCOVERY; COMPILE & INDEX
BACKGROUND & SUPPORT FOR TESTIMONY

& MFRS.
FOR CURRENT SERVICES RENDERED

AND CREDITS FOR EXPENSES
PAYMENT

BALANCE DUE

1S«2% AQRAAOCTTALTT

"

Moy (
05/07/96
10023.00

$ 255.00

HOURS

4.00 340.00
5.00 425.00
12.00 1020.00
13.00 1105.00
8.00 680.00
42.00 $ 3570.00

- 00.00

$ 3825.00
By .24 £ 95



P O. Box 13427
Tallahassee, FL 32317-3427
Phone or Fax (904) 877-0873

Management & Regulatory Consultants, Inc.

MR. JAMES PERRY
PALM COAST UTILITY CORP.
2 UTILXTY DRIVE

PAIM COAST, FL 32137 06/12/96
10023.,00

CONSULTING - RE 1995 RATE CASE

PREVIOUS BALANCE $ 3825.00
HOURS
05/01/96 FS CONSULTING - COMPILE & INDEX
DOCUMENT SUPPORT FOR TESTIMONY. 9.00 765,00

05/06/96 FS CONSULTING - ASSIST WITH RESPONSES TO
OPC DISCOVERY REQUESTS. 20.00 1700.00

05/13/96 FS CONSULTING - ASSIST WITH RESPONSE TO
OPC DISCOVERY REQUESTS AND RESPONSE
TO STAFF AUDIT INCLUDING REVIEW OF
WORKP2APERS. 20.00 1700.00

05/20/96 FS CONSULTING - CONFERENCE CALL RE
IS3UES RAISED BY AUDIT REPORT
AND INTERVENOR TESTIMONY. 1.00 85.00

05/27/96 FS CONSULTING - REVIEW INTERVENOR &
STAFF TESTIMONY; RESEARCH ISSUES
FROM LAST CASE RAISED BY OPC; FIRST
DRAFT OF REBUTTAL; RELATED MEETINGS
& TELEPHONE CONFERENCES, 25.50 2167.50
FOR CURRENT SERVICES RENDERED 75.50 $ 6417.50

PAYMENTS AND CREDITS FOR EXPENSES
05/29/96 PAYMENT - 3825.00

L |

BALANCE DUE $ 6417.50

?5.;54 W&



MANAGEMENT & REGULATORY CONSULTANTS, INC.
Expenses

Actual 6/1/96 through 6/25/96
not yet billed

Pg. 26 of 95



JUN-26-96 WED 11:5S2 M & R CONSULTARNTS 98487 TRETIS P.O2

MANAGEMENT & REGULATORY CONSULTANTS, INC.
JUNE CHARGES A8 OF JUNE 25, 1996

MR. JAMES PERRY
PALM COAST UTILITY CORP.
2 UTILITY DRIVE

PALM COAST, FL 32137
10023.00

CONSULTING - RE 1995 RATE CASE
PREVIOUS BALANCE R

06/01/96 FS CONSULTING - FIRST DRAFT OF
REBUTTAL; ASSIST WITH RESPONSE TO
DISCOVERY REQUESTS, PREPARATION OF
ISSUES, PREPARATION FOR DEPOSITION

‘ OF WITNESSES; RELATED MEETINGS &

| TELEPHONE CONFERENCES; MEETING AT

| _ PCUC TO REVIEW REBUTTAL TESTIMONY. 36.00 3060.00

06/10/96 FS CONSULTING - REVISE DRAFT OF
REBUTTAL; ASSIST WITH RESPONSE TO
DISCOVERY REQUESTS, PREPARATION OF
POSITIONS ON STAFF & INTERVENOR
ISSUES; PREPARATION FOR DEPOSITION
OF WITNESSES; ATTEND DEPOSITIONS OF
BIDDY & DISMUKES; RELATED MEETINGS
& TELEPHONE CONFERENCES. 40.00 3400.00

06/17/96 FS CONSULTING - ASSIST WITH PREPARATION
OF POSITIONS ON ISSUES:; ATTEND PRE-
HEARING CONFERENCE; PREPARE FOR AND
ATTEND DEPOSITIONS OF GUESTELLA & AMAYA;
PREPARE FOR AND ATTEND MY DEPOSITION;

ASSIST WITH RESPONSE TO DISCOVERY
REQUESTS. 43.00 3655.00

06/24/96 FS CONSULTING - READ MY DEPOSITION
TRANSCRIPT FOR CORRECTIONS; PREPARE
LATE FILE DEPOSITION EXHINITS;
PREPARE FOR HEARING. 7.00 595.00

FOR CURRENT SERVICES RENDERED 126.00 $10710.00

EXPENSES
06/07/96 MILEAGE 470 MILES € .30/MILE 141,00
06/07/96 LODGING AND MEALS (APPROX.) 191.63

BALANCE DUE $11042.63

T»@.afzmc‘?S



MANAGEMENT & REGULATORY CONSULTANTS, INC.

Estimate to Complete

B. 23 oF 95



JUN-26-96 WED 11:53 M & R CONSULTANTS 390487 T7TO6ET3S P.93

MAMAGEMENT & REGULATORY CONSULTANTS, INC.

PALM COAST UTILITY CORPORATION
RATE APPLICATION — DOCKET NO. 951056—-WS
SUMMARY OF COST TO DATE AND PROJECTED COST TO COMPLETE

Actual Charges Billed Through May 30, 1996 52,509.24
|Unbilled Charges through June 25, 1996 11,042.63
TOTAL CHARGES TO DATE (6/12/96) 63,551.87
Projected Additional Services Hours
E. Prepare for and present testimony and participate in hearings. 32| 2,720.00
F. Assist with post hearing brief. 27| 2,295.00
G, Out of pocket expenses — 400.00
ESTIMATED REMAINING CHARGES FOR SERVICES 59| 5,4156.00
REVISED TOTAL COST 68,968.87

As of 6/26/98

7. aqu%'



GATLIN, WOODS & CARLSON
Legal Expenses

_ Actual/Billed
3/21/95 through 6/25/96

Pg. 30 of 95



5. bentreuin Gat s, LA

Y7/9G Client TLedger Card PACE 1
alm Coast Utility Corporation Type: Utility company
RATE CASE, DKT. §951056-WS Standard: Show W.I.P. on Bills
Case Number: 841 Monthly
2 Utility Drive Trust Balance: None
Matter rate: $175.00
Interest on past due: None
Palm Coast FI, 32137 Atty: B. Kenneth Gatlin
Phone
Current
Date Description Amount Entries
03/21/95 WLS $150/hr .75 Hours $112.50
Archived Telephone conference with T. Trace, J.
Perry (.25); research (.5).
03/22/95 WLS $150/hr .70 Hours $105.00
Archived Conference with BKG (.2); research (.5).
03/24/95 WLS $150/hr .20 Hours $30.00
Archived Telephone conference with J. Perry.
03/28/95 WLS $150/hr 2.25 Hours $337.50
Archived Draft letter to J. Perry regarding test
year (.75); Research (1.25); Telephone
Archived conference with J. Perry (.25).
03/29/95 WLS $150/hr 1.00 Hours $150.00
Brchived Edit and finalize letter to J. Perry
(.3); Research (.5); Telephone
Archived conference with J. Perry (.2)
04/06/95 WLS $150/hr .20 Hours $30.00
Archived Telephone conference with J. Perry.
“04/18/95 BKG $175/hr 5.00 Hours $875.00
Archived ' Conference with T. Trace and J. Perry at
Palm Coast.
04/19/95 BKG $175/hr .50 Hours $87.50
Archived Conference with Wayne Schiefelbein.
04/19/95 WLS $150/hr .90 Hours £135.00
Archived Research regarding rate case processing
times, test years (.7); Telephone
Archived conference with B. Bilinski (.2).
04/19/95 Flat Chg $147.79
Archived Costs advanced B. Kenneth Gatlin, travel
reimbursement, 4/18 conference.
04/19/95 BKG $175/hr .60 Hours $105.00
Archived Review valuation study.
04/20/95 WLS $150/hr 1.50 Hours $225.00
Archived Prepare memos to T. Trace and J. Perry
(.5); prepare outline for test year
Archived request (.5); Telephone conferences with
B. Bilinski, F. Seidman (.5). L
04/21/95 WLS $150/ht:: 1.75 Hours $262.50
Archived Research prior PCUC Rate Case Orders.
04/24/95 WLS $150/hr .75 Hours $§112.50
Archived Research prior PCUC rate case orders.

’%.5\59‘?5



Client Ledger Carvd

6/17/96 PAGE 2
Tlient: Palm Coast Utility Corparation 841
RE: RATE CASE, DKT. #951056-WS

Current
Date Description Amount Entries

1J5/01/95 WLS Rate: N/A Hrs: N/A -5247.50
Archived Received payment PCUC ck. #39269
15/02/95 WLS $150/hr .50 Hours $§75.00
Archived Review memo from F. Seidman.
25/03/95 WLS $150/hr 1.75 Hours $262.50
Archived Legal research (1.25); Telephone

conferences with F. Seidman (.5).
05/03/95 BKG $175/hr .50 Hours $87.50
Archived Research
05/04/95 WLS $150/hr 3.50 Hours $525.00
Archived Conference with T. Trace, J. Perry, BKG,

F. Seidman at Gatlin, Woods, Carlson &
Archived Cowdery.
05/04/95 BKG $175/hr 3.50 Hours $612.50
Archived Conference with T. Trace, J. Perry, F.

Seidman, W. Schiefelbein at Gatlin,
Archived Woods, Carlson & Cowdery.
05/05/95 WLS $150/hr .30 Hours $45.00
Archived Research
05/09/95 WLS $150/hr 2.30 Hours $345.00
Archived Conference with F. Seidman at Gatlin,
' Woods, Carlson & Cowdery (.5); prepare
Archived letter to T. Trace (.5); Telephone

conference with B. Bilinski (.2);
Archived research (1.10).
05/10/95 WLS $150/hr .40 Hours $60.00
Brchived Telephone conferences with J. Perry.
05/15/95 WLS $150/hr 1.25 Hours $187.50
Archived Research (.75); Review memo/draft test

year letter from client (.3); Telephone
Archived conference with J. Perry(.2)
05/17/95 WLS $150/hr 1.20 Hours $180.00
Archived Prepare letter to T. Trace (.3);

research (.9).
05/18/95 WLS $150/hr 1.00 Hours $150.00
Archived Telephone conference with B. Bilinski

(.25); research (.75).
05/19/95 WLS $150/hr .20 Hours $30.00
Archived Telephone conference with J. Perry (.1);

finalize letter to T. Trace (.1).
05/22/95 WLS Rate: N/A Hrs: N/A -$2,467.79
Archived Received payment PCUC ck. #39528
05/23/95 BKG $175/hr .20 Hours $§35.00
Archived Telephone conference with T. Trace.

B. 3o of 95



6/17/96

Client:
RE:

Palm Coast
RATE CASE,

Utility Corporation

DKT. #951056-WS

05/24/95
Archived

06/09/95
Archived

06/19/95
Archived

06/19/95
Archived

06/21/95
Archived

07/11/95
Archived

07/14/95
Archived

07/17/95
Archived

07/17/95
,Archived

07/18/95
Archived

07/19/95
Archived

07/24/95
Archived

07/24/95
Archived

08/07/95
BRrchived

08/16/95
Archived

08/16/95
Archived

WLS

WLS

WLS

WLS

WLS

BKG

BKG

BKG

BKG

BKG

BKG

WLS

BKG

BKG

Current
Entries

Description Amount
$150/hr .50 Hours §75.00
Research (.3); prepare memo to B.

Bilinski (.2).

$150/hr .30 Hours $45.00
Telephone conferences with J. Perry, B.

Bilinski.

Rate: N/A Hrs: N/A -$2,670.00
Received payment PCUC ck. #39906

$150/hr .25 Hours $37.50
Telephone conference with N. Oliver.

$150/hr .25 Hours $37.50
Telephone conferences with F. Seidman,

B. Bilinski.

$175/hr .50 Hours $87.50
Telephone conference with T. Trace.

$150/hr .30 Hours $45.00
Research regarding used and useful.

§175/hr .20 Hours $35.00
Telephone conference with J. Perry.

$§175/hr 1.10 Hours $§192.50
Review documents; research.

$175/hr 1.90 Hours $332.50
Review rate case documents and previous

PSC orders.

$175/hr 5.10 Hours $892.50
Conference at Palm Coast on 7/19/95 with

company officials and consultants.

Rate: N/A Hrs: N/A -$120.00
Received payment PCUC ck. $#40420

Flat Chg $172.38
Costs advanced B. Kenneth Gatlin, travel
reimbursement, Palm Coast 7/18-19/95.

Rate: N/A Hrs: N/A -$1,757.38
Received payment PCUC ck. #40580

$§150/hr .20 Hours §30.00
Telephone conference with B. Bilinski.

$175/hr .30 Hours $52.50
Telephone conference with F. Seidman.

§175/hr .80 Hours $140.00

08/17/95
"Archived

Review used and useful.
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G/17796 Client Ledger Card
Client: Palm Coast Utility Corporation
RE: RATE CASE, DKT. §951056-WS
Date Descripltion Amount
08/18/95 BKG  $175/hr 1.80 Hours $315.00
Archived Telephone conference with T. Trace (.2);
review used and useful report (1.6).
08/21/95 BKG $175/hr 2.50 Hours $437.50
Archived Telephone conference with Frank Seidman
(.3); review documents; research (2.2).
08/22/95 BKG $175/hr 2.10 Hours $367.50
Archived Research and drafting cf test year
letter.
08/23/95 BKG $175/hr 10.00 Hours $1,750.00
Archived Conference at Palm Coast with
consultants and company officials
Archived regarding rate case.
08/24/95 BKG $175/hr .30 Hours $52.50
Archived Telephone conference with T. Trace.
08/24/95 BKG $175/hr .50 Hours $87.50
Archived Review and memorandum written regarding
test year letter.
08/24/95 Flat Chg $281.79
Archived Costs advanced B. Kenneth Gatlin, travel
reimbursement, 8/22-23/95, Palm Coast,
Archived conferences.
08/31/95 BKG $175/hr 4,50 Hours $787.50
Archived Conference at Palm Coast with company
officials.
08/31/95 WLS $150/hr 1.60 Hours $240.00
Archived Research regarding test year and
jurisdictional matters.
09/01/95 BKG $175/hr 1.10 Hours $192.50
Archived Telephone conference with T. Trace (.1);
research regarding PSC jurisdiction (1).
09/01/95 BKG $175/hr .20 Hours $35.00
Archived Telephone conference with T. Trace.
09/01/95 BKG $175/hr .20 Hours $35.00
Archived Test year letter written.
09/01/95 WLS $150/hr 1.25 Hours $187.50
Archived Review documents (.2); Research at PSC
(.7); Telephone conference with J.Perry
Archived (.1); Memo written to T. Trace (.25)
09/05/95 WLS $150/hr 1.25 Hours $187.50
Archived Research /review documents at PSC.
09/07/95 WLS $150/hr 1.20 Hours $180.00
Archived Telephone conferences with J. Perry, M. '
Willis, Division of Records and
Archived Reporting, F. Seidman (.8); review
. documents (.4).
09/07/95 Flat Chg = $136.36
Archived Costs advanced B. Kenneth Gatlin, travel

I O e T Y A NPT I B A § RN R TUN

reimbursement, conferences Palm Coast

Current
Entries
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Current
Entries

G/LT7/96G Client Ledger Card
Client: Palm Coast Utility Corporation
RIE: RATE CASE, DKT. #951056-WS
Date NDescription Amount

Archived 8/30-31/95.
09/08/95 WLS $150/hr .50 Hours $75.00
Archived Telephone conferences with B. Bilinski,

M. Willis.
09/11/95 BKG $175/hr 2.90 Hours $507.50
Archived Research regarding county - PSC

jurisdiction.
09/14/95 WLS $150/hr .50 Hours $75.00
Archived Telephone conferences with B. Bilinski, :

‘ BKG, Division of Records and Reporting

Archived (.4); review and transmit pending CASR

(.1).
09/19/95 WLS $150/hr .20 Hours $30.00
Brchived Telephone conference with B. Bilinski.
09/19/95 BKG $175/hr 10.00 Hours $1,750.00
Archived Conference at Palm Coast with company

officials and consultants.
09/20/95 WLS $150/hr .30 Hours $45.00
Archived Telephone conferences with F. Seidman,

J. Perry.
09/21/95 Flat Chg $270.12
Archived Costs advanced B. Kenneth Gatlin, travel

reimbursement, conferences at Palm
ARrchived Coast, 9/18-19/95.
09/21/95 WLS $150/hr .10 Hours §15.00
Archived Telephone conference with J. Perry.
09/22/95 Flat Chg $13.50
Archived Costs advanced Florida Overnight,

express package.
09/25/95 WLS $150/hr 2.40 Houtrs $360.00
Archived Telephone conference with J. Perry

(.25); research (1.4); prepare memos to
Archived J. Perry (.75).
09/26/95 WLS $150/hr 1.00 Hours $150.00
Archived Telephone conference with J. Perry (.4);

prepare memos to J. Perry (.6).
10/02/95 WLS $150/hr .30 Hours $45.00
Archived Telephone conference with B. Bilinski.
10/02/95 BKG Rate: N/A Hrs: N/A ~-$3,514.29
Archived Received payment Palm Coast ck. #41277
10/03/95 BKG $175/hr .30 Hours $52.50
Archived Telephone conference with T. Trace. -
10/06/95 BKG §$175/hr .70 Hours $122.50
Archived Review Used and Useful Analysis. :
10/16/95 “BKG Rate: N/A Hrs: N/RA -65,122.48
Archived Received payment Palm Coast ck. #41434
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Client Ledger Card

6/17/96
Client: Palm Coast Utility Corporation
RE: RATE CASE, DKT. #951056-WS

Current
Entries

10/18/95
Archived

10/19/95
Archived

Archived
10/20/95
Archived

10/23/95
Archived

10/27/95
Archived

Archived
10/30/95
Brchived

11/02/95
Archived

11/02/95
Archived

11/02/95
Archived

11/03/95
Archived

11/03/95
Archived

11/07/95
Archived

Archived
11/08/95
Archived

11/09/95
Archived

11/13/95%
Archived

Archived
11/14/95
Archived

WLS

WLS

BRKG

WLS

WLS

BKG

WLS

BKG

BKG

BKG

BKG

$150/hr .80 Hours
Telephone conference with J.
research (.6).

$150/hr 2.80 Hours
Telephone conferences with M. Willis, F.
Seidman (.6); Prepare and transmit first
draft of application(2.2)

$150/hr .50 Hours

Tel ephone conferences with B. Bilinski,
F. Seidman.

$175/hr .20 Hours

Telephone conference with T. Trace.

Perry (.2);

$§150/hr 1.25 Hours

Review draft used and useful study (1):;
Tel ephone conference with B. Bilinski
(.25).

$150/hr .50 Hours

Finalize memo to B. Bilinski.

$175/hr .20 Hours
Telephone conference with Frank Seidman.

$175/hr 1.20 Hours

Review and draft rate application
documents.

$150/hr 1.20 Hours

Draft Notice of Application (.4); draft
synopsis (.8).

$175/hr 2.50 Hours

Conference with F. Seidman; review rate
case exhibits and testimony.

$150/hr .20 Hours

Edit draft Notice.

$175/hr 9.20 Hours :
Conference at Palm Coast with Company
Officials regarding rate case testimony
and exhibits.

$175/hr .20 Hours

Telephone conference with Frank Seidman.

$175/hr .20 Hours ‘
Telephone conference with T. Trace.

Flat Chg
Costs advanced B. Kenneth Gatlin, travel

reimbursement, conferences, Palm Coast,
11/6-11/7/95

$§175/hr 1.50 Hours
Conference with F._. Seidman;
documents.

review

$1,610

$120.00

$420.00

$75.00
$35.00

$187.50

$75.00

$35.00
$210.00
$180.00
$437.50

$30

.00

.00

$35.00
$§35.00

$247.58

$262.50

’123.3((,0(395
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Client Ledger Card

6/17/96
Client: Palm Conast Utility Corporation 841
RE: RATE CASE, DKT. #9510576-WS

Current
Date Description Amount Entries

12/07/95 BKG $17%/hr 3.10 Hours $£542.50
Archived Research and drafting of rate case

documents.
12/07/95 WLS $150/hr .40 Hours $60.00
Archived Telephone conferences with B. Bilinski,

F. Seidman.
12/08/95 BKG $175/hr 1.30 Hours §227.50
Archived Research and drafting of rate case :
: ‘ application. :
12/11/95 BKG Rate: N/A Hrs: N/A -$4,600.08
Archived Received payment PCUC ck. #42096
12/11/95 BKG $175/hr .60 Hours $105.00
Archived Research and draft documents.
12/14/95 BKG $175/hr .50 Hours , $87.50
Archived Telephone conference with T. Trace.
12/14/95 BKG $175/hr .30 Hours $52.50
Archived Research and letter written.
12/14/95 BKG $175/hr .30 Hours $52.50
Archived Letter written
12/15/95 BKG $175/hr .80 Hours $140.00
Archived Review letter (.3); draft documents

(.5).
12/15/95 WLS $150/hr .40 Hours $60.00
Archived Review draft correspondence (.2);

Telephone conference with B. Bilinski
Archived (.2).
12/18/95 WLS $150/hr .50 Hours $75.00
Archived Research
12/18/95 BKG $175/hr .70 Hours $122.50
Archived Telephone conference with T. Trace (.3);

Letter written (.2); draft documents
Archived (.2).
12/18/95 BKG $175/hr 1.10 Hours $§192.50
Archived Review rate case documents regarding

possible witness.
12/22/95 BKG $175/hr 2.60 Hours £455.00
Archived Review rate case application.
12/26/95 BKG $175/hr .70 Hours $122.50
Archived Conference with F. Seidman regarding T

: rate case. application:

12/27/95 WLS $150/hr 2.10 Hours $315.00
Archived Draft Synopsis, Customer Notice and memo

to J. Perry(l.9); Telephone conferences
Archived with B. Bilinski(.2)
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6/17/96

Client Ledger Card

Client:
RE:

Palin Coaat
RATE CASHE,

Utility Corporatian

DI, #951056-WS

12/27/95
Archived

12/28/95
Archived

12/29/95
Archived

01/04/96
Archived

01/05/96
Archived

01/05/96
Archived

01/08/96
Archived

01/10/96
Archived

01/10/96
Archived

Archived
01/11/96
Archived

Archived
01/16/96
Archived

01/18/96
Archived

01/18/96
Archived

01/22/96
Archived

01/23/96
Archived

Archived

WLS

WLS

BKG

BKG

BKG

WLS

BKG

WLS

WLS

BKG

BKG

WLS

BKG

WLS

Current
Entries

Description Amount
$175/hr 3.20 Hours $560.00
Review and prepare the rate case

application for filing.

$150/hr 1.00 Hours $150.00
Proof and edit draft synopsis; research.

$150/hr .50 Hours §75.00
Proof and edit draft Synopsis and Notice

(.3); Prepare memo to J. Perry (.2). :
$175/hr .50 Hours $87.50
Review rate case documents (.3);

Telephone conference with T. Trace (.2).

Rate: N/A Hrs: N/A -$2,937.50
Received payment PCUC ck. #42427

$175/hr .20 Hours $35.00
Telephone conference with T. Trace.

$150/hr .50 Hours . $75.00
Telephone conference with B. Bilinski

(.2); research (.3).

$175/hr .20 Hours $35.00
Telephone conference with T. Trace. ‘
$150/hr .75 Hours $112.50
Telephone conferences with B. Bilinski

(.5); edit draft synopsis and notice

(.25).

$150/hr 1.00 Hours $150.00
Prepare memo to B. Bilinski (.25); proof

and edit draft synopsis and notice and
correspondence (.75).

$175/hr .30 Hours $52.50
Review PSC deficiency letter.

$175/hr .20 Hours $35.00
Telephone conference with J. Perry

regarding PSC deficiency letter.

$150/hr .20 Hours $30.00
Telephone conference with J. Perry.

$175/hr .20 Hours $35.00
Tel ephone conference with F. Seidman.

$150/hr .70 Hours $105.00
Telephone conferences with N. Oliver, o
Division of Records and Reporting, R.

Jaeger.

$150/hr .60 Hours $90.00

01/24/96
Archived

WLS

Telephone conferences with Division of
Consumer Affairs, N. Oliver.
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/17796 Client Ledger Card PAGE 10
Client: Palm Coast Utility Corporation 841
RE: RATE CASE, DKT. #951056-WS

Current
Date Descaription Amount Entries

0l/25/96 510 items $.20 /Item $§102.00
Avchived Photocopy documents
01/25/96 BKG $175/hr .30 Hours $52.50
Archived Telephone conference with T. Trace.
01/26/96 BKG $175/hr .40 Hours §70.00
Archived Tel ephone conference with T. Trace.
01/26/96 BKG $175/hr .60 Hours $105.00
Archived Research and drafting of letter.
01/26/96 WLS $150/hr .25 Hours $37.50
Archived Telephone conferences with Division of

Consumer Affairs; with N. Oliver.
01/29/96 BKG $175/hr 2.10 Hours $367.50
Archived Research and drafting of letter

regarding rate case issues.
01/29/96 BKG $175/hr .40 Hours $£70.00
Archived Telephone conference with T. Trace.
01/30/96 BKG $175/hr .70 Hours $§122.50
Archived Research and letter written regarding

rate case issues.
02/01/96 WLS $150/hr .80 Hours $120.00
"Archived Telephone conference with Division of :

Consumer Affairs (.2); review and
Archived transmit customer correspondence (.3):

Telephone conference with N. Oliver
Archived (.3).
02/06/96 WLS $150/hr .20 Hours $£30.00
Archived Prepare memo to N. Oliver.
02/07/96 BKG $175/hr .20 Hours $35.00
Archived Telephone conference with T. Trace.
02/07/96 BKG §175/hr .40 Hours $70.00
Archived Conference with Frank Seidman regarding

rate case MFR's.
02/07/96 BKG $175/hr 1.70 Hours $297.50
Archived Review rate case MFR supplement. :
02/07/96 WLS $150/hr .40 Hours : $60.00
Archived Telephone conference with J. Perry (.2);

prepare memo to N. Oliver (.2). i
02/08/96 BKG $175/hr 2.50 Hours $437.50
Archived Review"MFR documents (2); Letter written : :

(.3); Telephone conference with F.
Archived Seidman (.2).
02/09/96 BKG $175/hr .30 Hours $52.50
Archived ~ Conference with F..Seidman.
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6/17/96

Tlient :
RE

32/12/96
Archived

12/12/96
Airchived

12/13/96
Archived

Archived

32/21/96
Archived

12/21/96
Archived

)2/21/96
Archived

Archived
22/21/96
Archived

)2/22/96
Archived

12/22/96
Archived

D2/23/96
Archived

12/23/96
Archived

02/23/96
Archived

Archived

02/26/96
Archived

02/27/96
Archived

02/28/96
Archived

03/04/96
Archived

Paln

RATE CASE,

BRG

WLS

BKG

BKG

WLS

BKG

BKG

WLS

WLS

WLS

WLS

WLS

[EC R RO TN NS U 1 S U T O A O Y RS R & W
Client Ledger Card

Utility Corporation
$#951056-WS

Coast
PRT .

$150/hr .30 Hours
Edit draft synopsis (.2);
to B. Bilinski (.1).
Rate: N/A Hrs: N/A
Received payment PCUC ck. #42915

prepare memo

$150/hr .50 Hours

Telephone conference with B. Bilinski
(.2); prepare letter to C. Hill,
proposed synopsis and customer notice
(.3).

$175/hr .20 Hours

Telephone conference with T. Trace.

$175/hr .20 Hours £35
Telephone conference with M. Willis.

'$150/hr .30 Hours

Telephone conference with B. Bilinski
(.1); review Audit Document Reguest
(.2).

$175/hr .30 Hours

Telephone conference with T. Trace.

$175/hr .30 Hours ‘
Telephone conference with M. Walla, T.
Trace.

$150/hr .25 Hours
Telephone conferences with J.
Seidman.

Flat Chg

Costs advanced Florida Overnight,
express package.

Flat Chg
Costs advanced Mail Boxes,

shipping brochures.

Flat Chg

Costs advanced Leslie D. Veal,
reimbursement for customer
correspondence from Public Service
Commission.

$150/hr .20 Hours

Telephone conference with B. Bilinski.

Perry, F.

Etc..,

$150/hr .50 Hours

Telephone conferences with T. Trace, B.
Bilinski- (.3); research (.2).

$150/hr .20 Hours

Prepare memo to N. Oliver.

575
30

$150/hr .75 Hours $112

Tel ephone conferences with R. Jaeger, B.
Bilinski (.5); edit draft Customer

$35.

$45.

$52.
$§52.
$37.
$13.
$21.

$4.

$30.

.00

00

.00

00

50

50

50

50

63

30

0o

.00

.00

.50

Current
Entries
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6/17/96 Client Ledger Carvd PAGE 12
Client: Palm Coast Utility Corporation 841
RE: RATE CASE, DKT. §951056-WS

Current
Date Description Amount Entries

Brchived Notice and Synopsis (.25)
03/05/96 BKG $175/hr .20 Hours $35.00
Archived Telephone conference with J. Perry.
03/05/96 WLS $150/hr .50 Hours $75.00
Brchived Telephone conferences with B. Bilinski,

R. Jaeger.
03/06/96 BKG $175/hr .20 Hours $35.00
Archived ‘ Telephone conference with T. Trace. :
03/06/96 WLS $150/hr .50 Hours $75.00
Archived Finalize, file and serve Staff-Approved

Synopsis (.3); Telephone conference with
Archived B. Bilinski(.2)
03/08/96 BKG $175/hr .30 Hours -$52.50
Archived Telephone conference with T. Trace.
03/08/96 BKG $175/hr 1.20 Hours $210.00
Archived Review Staff Recommendation.
03/11/96 BKG Rate: N/A Hrs: N/A -$2,291.93 .
Archived Received payment PCUC ck. #43306
03/11/96 WLS $150/hr 1.50 Hours $225.00
Archived Telephone conferences with J. Perry, N.

Oliver, F. Seidman, R. Jaeger (.8);
Archived Research and finalize memo to B.

Bilinski (.2); file Staff-approved
Archived Notice of Application (.1); review

letter from R. Jaeger (.2); review memo
Archived from N. Oliver (.2). :
03/12/96 BKG $175/hr .20 Hours $35.00
Archived Telephone conference with T. Trace

regarding interim rates.
03/12/96 WLS $150/hr 3.70 Hours $§555.00
Archived Telephone conferences with B. Salak, B.

Bilinski, F. Seidman, J. Perry (l); edit
Archived Customer Letter (.25) ; Review memo from

F. Seidman (.25); Prepare and file
Archived Suggestion of Error (2); Research (.2).
03/14/96 WLS §$150/hr 2.50 Hours $375.00
Archived Telephone conferences with R. Jaeger, B.

Rilinski, F. Seidman, J. Perry (.8);
Archived research (1.5); review Audit Document

Request (.2).
03/18/96 BKG §$175/hr .20 Hours £35.00
Archived Telephone conference with T. Trace.
03/18/96 WLS $150/hr 1.50 Hours $225.00
Archived Telephone conferences with Division of

Records and Reporting, R. Jaeger (.4);
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6/17/96 Client Ledger Card PAGE 13
Client: Palm Coast Utility Corporation 841
RE: RATE CASE, DKT. #951056-WS

Current
Date Description Amount Entries
Archived conference with R. Jaeger at PSC (.1);
Telephone conference with J. Perry (.2);
Archived review correspondence (.3); research
(.5).
03/19/96 BKG $175/hr .30 Hours $52.50
Archived Telephone conference with T. Trace.
03/19/96 WLS $150/hr 3.75 Hours $562.50
Archived . Review letter from J. Perry and
documents (1); prepare letter (.5);
Archived Attend Agenda Conference (2); Telephone
conferences with B. Bilinski (.25).
03/20/96 BKG $175/hr .60 Hours $105.00
Archived Tel ephone conference with John
Guastella.
03/20/96 WLS $150/hr 2.40 Hours : $360.00
Archived Prepare memo to J. Small (.2); Telephone
conferences with R. Jaeg er, J. Perry,
Archived B. Bilinski, N. Oliver (.9); review
surety bond order form and sample surety
Archived bond (.6); research (.7).
03/21/96 WLS $150/hr 1.70 Hours $255.00
Archived Review correspondence (.2); Telephone :
conferences with T. Trace, J. Perry, N.
Archived Oliver, B. Bilinski, B. DeMello (1);
draft interim rate notice (.5).
03/22/96 WLS $150/hr 1.00 Hours $150.00
Archived Telephone conference with B. Bilinski
(.2); file interim tariff sheets (.2):
Archived edit interim rate notice (.2); Telephone
conference with R. Jaeger (.1); draft
Archived letter to R. Jaeger (.2); Research (.1
03/25/96 BKG $175/hr .20 Hours $35.00
Archived Telephone conference with T. Trace.
03/25/96 WLS $150/hr 1.80 Hours $270.00
Archived Tel ephone conference with B. Bilinski
(.2);: research (1); review audit
Archived document requests (.4); edit draft
Notice of Interim Rates (.2).
03/25/96 Flat Chg $7.43
Archived Postage
03/25/96 685 items $.20 /1item $137.00
Archived Photocopy documents
03/25/96 Flat Chg $13.50
Archived Costs advanced Florida Overnight,
express package
03/26/96 WLS $150/hr 2.10 Hours $315.00
Archived Review audit document request (.2); !

research (.5); review documents (.6);

.43 of 5



Lol EPCENE B S )

.o ot Jit, b
Client

6/17/96 Ledger Card PAGE 14
Client: Palm Coast Utility Corpovation 841
RE: RATE CASE, DKT. #951056-WS

Current
Date Description Amount Entries

Archived Telephone conferences with B. Bilinski,

J. Perry (.6); draft affidavit (.2).
03/27/96 WLS $150/hr 2.70 Hours $405.00
Archived Telephone conferences with R. Dodrill,

B. Rilinski, R. Jaeger, N. QOliver (.8);
Archived Prepare memo to R. Dodrill (.8); edit

and transmit affidavit of Notice (.2);
Archived review document (.2); review audit

_ document request (.2); draft memo to R.

Brchived Dodrill (.5).
03/28/96 WLS $150/hr 1.80 Hours $270.00
Archived Telephone conference with N. Oliver

(.2); finalize memo to R. Dodrill (.9);
BArchived Letter written to T. Trace (.7).
03/29/96 WLS $150/hr .20 Hours £30.00
Archived Telephone conference with N. Oliver.
03/29/96 BKG $175/hr .30 Hours $§52.50
Archived Telephone conference with T. Trace.
03/29/96 BKG $175/hr .50 Hours $87.50
Archived Review Public Counsel Interrogatories

and Request for Production of Documents.
04/01/96 WLS $150/hr 1.10 Hours $165.00
Archived Telephone conferences with B. Bilinski

(.3); Research (.3); Review & transmit
Archived Public Counsel's Notice of Intervention,

First Set of Interrogatories, First
Archived Requests for Production of Documents,

and Motion regarding additional
Archived interrogatories (.5).
04/02/96 WLS $150/hr 2.60 Hours $390.00
Archived Review documents (.5); Research (1.5);

Telephone conferences with B. Bilinski,
Archived J. Perry, F. Seidman (.5); Review memo

from F. Seidman (.1).
04/03/96 WLS $150/hr 1.00 Hours $150.00
Archived Telephone conferences with B. Bilinski,

J. Perry (.3); review and edit draft
Archived bond (.5); research (.2).
04/03/96 BKG $175/hr .20 Hours $35.00
Archived Telephone conference with T. Trace.
04/05/96 WLS $150/hr 2.20 Hours $330.00
Archived Telephone conferences with J. Perry, R.

Jaeger (.3); review memo from J. Perry -
Archived (.2); draft response to Public Counsel

regarding additional interrogatories
Archived (1); review correspondence (.2);

research (.5).
04/08/96 ‘WLS $150/hr 2.30 Hours $345.00
Archived Telephone conference with J. Perry (.2):

finalize Response to OPC Request to
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G/17/96 Client Ledger Card PAGE 15
Client: Palm Coast Utility Corporation 841
RE: RATE CASE, DKT. #951056-WS

Current
Date Description Amount Entries

Archived Increase Number of Interrogatories (.2);

research (1.5); Telephone conference
Archived with B. Bilinski, D. Scholbohm (.4)
04/08/96 BKG S$175/hr .30 Hours $§52.50
Archived Telephone conference with T. Trace.
04/08/96 BKG $175/hr .20 Hours $35.00
Archived Telephone conference with T. Trace.
04/09/96 WLS $150/hr 4.50 Hours $675.00
Archived Research (4); Telephone conferences with

J. Perry, F. Seidman (.5).
04/10/96 WLS $§150/hr 4.60 Hours $690.00
Archived Review and file Bond (.2) and Affidavit

of Notice of Application (.2); Research
Archived (3.7); Telephone conferences with

Division of Records & Reporting, R.
Archived Jaeger, B. Bilinski (.5).
04/10/96 BKG $175/hr .40 Hours $§70.00
Archived Telephone conference with T. Trace.
04/11/96 WLS $150/hr 3.00 Hours $450.00
Archived Prepare memo to B. Bilinski (.5);

research (2.5).
04/12/96 WLS $150/hr 4.70 Hours $§705.00
Archived Telephone conferences with R. Jaeger, F.

Seidman, Division of Records and
Archived Reporting, B. Bilinski (.8); research

(3.2); review interim rate order (.7).
04/12/96 BKG $175/hr .30 Hours £52.50
Archived Telephone conference with T. Trace.
04/12/96 Flat Chg $1.80
Archived Costs advanced Florida Public Service

Commission, copy of Order.
04/15/96 WLS $150/hr 2.40 Hours $360.00
Archived Review documents (.5); research (1.3);

prepare memo to B. Bilinski (.2);
Archived Telephone conferences with B. Bilinski,

R. Jaeger (.4). '
04/15/96 BKG $175/hr 2.30 Hours . $402.50
Archived Review Public Counsel discovery (1.8);

Letter written (.5).
04/17/96 BKG $175/hr .30 Hours $52.50
Archived Telephone conference with Kirby Critton.
04/17/96 BKG $175/hr-. .40 Hours $§70.00
Archived Telephone conference with T. Trace.
04/17/96 Flat Chg $15.00
Archived -~ Costs advanced Jane Faurot, Court B

Reporter, transcript of 3/19/96 PSC
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G/L7/96 Client Ledger Cavd PAGE 16
Client: Palm Coasl Utility Corporation 841
RFE RATF CASE, DKT. f951056-WS

Current
Date Description Amount Entries

Archived Agenda Conference.
04/17/96 WLS $150/hr .90 Hours $135.00
Archived Telephone conferences with B. Bilinski,

R. Jaeger (.3); research (.6).
04/18/96 BKG $175/hr .50 Hours $87.50
Archived Research regarding Public Counsel

discovery.
04/18/96 BKG $175/hr .30 Hours $52.50
Archived Telephone conference with K. Chitton

regarding Public Counsel discovery.
04/18/96 BKG $175/hr 1.10 Hours $192.50
Archived Research regarding Public Counsel

discovery.
04/18/96 WLS $150/hr .75 Hours $§112.50
Archived Telephone conferences with B. Bilinski,

A. Hadeed, F. Seidman, R. Jaeger.
04/22/96 WLS $150/hr 1.40 Hours . $210.00
Archived Telephone conference with R. Jaeger

(.1); review Approved Interim Rate
Archived Tariffs (.2); research (.9); prepare

memo to B. Bilinski (.2).
04/22/96 BKG Rate: N/A Hrs: N/A -$4,127.93
Archived Received payment PCUC ck. #43865
04/22/96 KWC $140/hr 1.00 Hours $140.00
Archived Conference with BKG/WLS regarding

discovery issues.
04/23/96 WLS $150/hr .80 Hours $120.00
Archived Telephone conferences with B. Bilinski,

J. Perry (.2); research (.6).
04/23/96 KWC $140/hr 4.00 Hours $560.00
Archived Review and provide comments regarding

First Set of Interrogatories from OPC
Archived and First Request for Production from

OPC (1.0); research law (3.0).
04/23/96 KWC $140/hr 2.25 Hours. $315.00
Archived Telephone conference with F. Seidman

regarding PCUC Responses to OPC First
Archived Set of Interrogatories and First Set of

Request for Production of Documents
Archived (.25); research and draft objections to

First Set of Interrogatories (2.0).
04/23/96 KWC $140/hr 1.00 Hours $140.00
Archived Research law and prepare PCUC's Motion

for Protective Order (.75); Telephone
Archived conference with client regarding .

Responses to First Set of
Archived Interrogatories and First Set of Request

for Production of Documents (.25).
04/23/96 KWC $140/hr .75 Hours $105.00
Archived -~ Telephone conference with PCUC J. \

Perry/WLS (.10); Legal research
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6/17/96 Client Ledger Card PAGE 17
Client: Palm Coast Ultility Corporation 841
RE: RATE CASE, DKT. #951056-WS

Current
Date Description ARmount Entries

Archived regarding discovery responses (.65).
04/24/96 KWC $140/hr 2.50 Hours $350.00
Archived Research and preparation of Objection to

1st Set of Interrogatories (2.0);
Archived Telephone conference with client PCUC

Bilinski (.25); Telephone conference
Archived with consultant Guastella Associates

(.25).
04/24/96 KWC $140/hr 2.00 Hours - $280.00
Archived Research regarding Temporary Protectlve

Order and objections to OPC 1lst Regquest
Brchived for Production.
04/25/96 519 items $§.20 /Item $103.80
Archived Photocopy documents
04/25/96 WLS $150/hr 1.25 Hours $187.50
Brchived Telephone conferences with J. Perry, B.

RBilinski (.3); review, edit and file
Archived interim notice (.25); review

correspondence (.5); Telephone
Archived conference with V. Bragg (.2).
04/25/96 KWC $140/hr 7.00 Hours $980.00
Archived Research and prepare objections to and

Motion for Temporary Protective Order
Archived regarding OPC 1lst Request for Production

of Documents.
04/25/96 KWC $140/hr .50 Hours $70.00
Archived Telephone conferences with client

(Bilinski) regarding OPC's First Sets of
Archived Interrogatories and Request for

Production of Documents (.25). Telephone
Archived conference with Arthur Anderson

(consultant) and WLS regarding external
Archived audit (.25).
04/26/96 BKG $175/hr 3.50 Hours $612.50
Archived Review Public Counsel Discovery (1.5);

drafting of documents (2).
04/26/96 KWC $140/hr 1.80 Hours $252.00
Archived Research regarding responses and

objections to OPC's 1lst Set of Request
Archived for Production and PCUC's Motion for

Temporary Protective Order.
04/26/96 KWC $140/hr 4.20 Hours $588.00
Archived Telephone conference with consultant F.

Seidman (.20); Review final draft
Archived responses to OPC's 1lst sets of

Interrogatories and Request for
Archived Production (.75); Research (2.75);

Conference with BKG regarding same
Archived (.25); Memo written to client (.25).
04/29/96 BKG $175/hr .30 Hours §52.50
Archived Telephone conference with T. Trace.
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Client Ledger Card

$157.

$30

$805.

$175.

$262

$30

$1,281.

$175.

$140.

$3

$§245.

50

.00

00

00

.50

.00

00

00

00

.20

00

Current
Entries

Client: Palm Coast Utility Corporation
RF.: RATE CASE, DKT. #951056-WS
Date NDescription

04/29/96 BKG $175/hr .90 Hours

Archived Review Public Counsel Discovery.

04/29/96 WLS $150/hr .20 Hours

Archived Research

04/29/96 KWC $140/hr 5.75 Hours

Brchived Research and preparation of responses
(objections) to Request for Production

Archived of Documents (lst set OPC) (3.75);
research and preparation of draft Motion

Archived for Protective Order (2.0).

04/29/96 KWC $140/hr 1.25 Hours

Archived Conference with BKG regarding discovery
(.1); Telephone conferences with client

Archived PCUC regarding responses to lst sets of
interrogatories and request for

Archived production (.75); Telephone conference
with consultant Seidman regarding same

Archived (.25); Telephone conference with
Guastella (.15).

04/30/96 BKG $175/hr 1.50 Hours

Archived Review Public Counsel Discovery.

04/30/96 WLS $150/hr .20 Hours

‘Archived Research

04/30/96 XKWC $140/hr 9.15 Hours

Archived Conference with BKG regarding discovery
(.1); Telephone conferences with client

Archived PCUC regarding responses to lst sets of
interrogatories and requests for

Archived production (.65); Research and
Preparation of draft Motion for

Archived Protective Order and Temporary
Protective Order (8.4).

04/30/96 KWC $140/hr 1.25 Hours

Archived Conference with BKG regarding discovery
(.1); Telephone conference with S.

Archived Reilly. regarding same (.15); Telephone
conference with J. Guastella regarding

Archived same (.25); Telephone conferences with
F. Seidman (.25); Review documents (.5).

04/30/96 KWC $140/hr 1.00 Hours

Archived Finalize Responses to OPC lst sets of
interrogatories and Request for

Archived Production. .

04/30/96 Flat Chg

Archived Costs advanced Florida Public Service
Commission, copies of Motions.

05/01/96 BKG $175/hr 1.40 Hours

Archived Review Public Counsel Interrogatories.
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6/17/96 Client Ledger Card PAGE 19
Client: Palm Coeoast Utility Corporation 841
RE: RATE CASE, DKT. #951056-WS

Current
Date Description Amount Entries
05/01/96 KWC $140/hr 2.75 Hours $385.00
Archived Research regarding objection to
Discovery Requests (1.5); Prepare Motion
Archived for temporary protective & protective
orders (1.0); Telephone conference with
Archived Bilinski regarding discovery (.25).
05/01/96 KWC $140/hr 1.00 Hours $140.00
Archived Telephone conference with Arthur
o Anderson regarding confidentiality of
Archived Audit workpapers (.15); Research and
Prepare Request for Confidential
Archived Classification (.5); Conference with BKG
regarding discovery (.1); finalize and
Archived file Responses to 1lst set of of
Interrogatories and Requests for
Archived Production, Motion for Temporary
Protective Order and Protective Order
Archived (.25).
05/01/96 KWC $140/hr 1.75 Hours $245.00
Archived Review and research regarding OPC's 2nd
Set of Interrogatories and 2nd set of
Archived Requests for Production.
05/01/96 Flat Chg - $30.50
Archived Costs advanced Florida Overnight,
express packages
05/02/96 BKG $175/hr .20 Hours $35.00
Archived Telephone conference with T. Trace.
05/02/96 KWC $140/hr 2.60 Hours $364.00
Archived Research regarding Responses to 2nd set
of Requests for Production (2.); Receipt
Archived and review Procedural Order (.4);
Telephone conferences with S. Reilly
Archived (.1), with Jaber regarding Extension of
Time (.1).
05/02/96 KWC $140/hr 2.00 Hours $280.00
Archived Research and prepare Motion for
Extension of Time in Which to File
Archived Objections and Notice of Intent to file
Protective Order.
05/03/96 BKG $175/hr 2.10 Hours $367.50
Archived Review Public Counsel Discovery.
05/03/96 WLS $150/hr .20 Hours $30.00
Archived Research .
05/03/96 XWC $140/hrt .90 Hours $126.00
Archived Telephone conferences with client PCUC
(Bilinski) (.5); Telephone conferences
Archived with OPC Reilly regarding Motion for

Extension of Time (.1 + .l1); Telephone
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/17796 Client TlLedger Card PAGE 20
Client: Palm Coast Utility Corporation 841
RE: RATE CASE, DEKT. #951056-WS

Current
Date Description Amount Entries
Archived conference with consultant Arthur
Anderson regarding audit workpapers
Archived (.2).
05/03/96 EKWC $140/hr 2.65 Hours $371.00
Archived Review confidential audit workpapers
(.5); conference with BKG/WLS regarding
Archived filings (.25); Telephone conference with
PSC Counsel Ralph Jaeger (.1); finalize
Archived - and file Motion for Extension .of Time
and Notice (1.8).
05/03/96 KWC $140/hr 2.25 Hours $315.00
Archived Prepare draft Request for Confidential
Classification of Audit Workpapers
Archived (.75); research (1.5).
05/06/96 KWC $140/hr 2.95 Hours $413.00
Archived Conference with BKG regarding discovery
(.1); Telephone conferences with client
Archived regarding discovery responses, audit
report (.5); Telephone conferences with
Archived PSC staff attorney regarding Motion for
Extension of Time (.1) and Audit Report
Archived (.1); Prepare Motion for Protective
Order (2.15).
05/06/96 KWC $140/hr 3.50 Hours $490.00
Archived Conference with BKG regarding
discovery/audit report (.5); Prepare
Archived memo to client regarding objections to
OPC 2nd set of discovery (3.0).
05/06/96 KWC $140/hr .30 Hours $42.00
Archived Prepare memo to client regarding audit
workpapers.
05/06/96 BKG $175/hr .20 Hours $35.00
Archived Telephone conference with D. V.
05/06/96 BKG $175/hr 1.70 Hours $297.50
Archived Review rate case documents.
05/07/96 XKWC $140/hr 5.20 Hours $728.00
Archived Conference with BKG regarding discovery
(.1); Prepare draft Motion for Extension
Archived of Time to File Response to Audit Report
(.9); Research and Preparation of Motion
Archived for Protective Order (4); Telephone
conference with Steve Reilly (.1);
Archived Telephone conference with Scott Edmonds
(.1). T
05/07/96 KWC $140/hr-- 1.00 Hours $140.00
Archived Conference with BKG, Frank Seidman
regarding audit report (.5); telephone
Archived conference call with BKG, Frank Seidman,

Bilinski regarding same (.5).
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6/17/96 Client Ledger Card PAGE 21
Client: Palm Coaatl Utility Corpoaration 841
RE: RATE CASE, DKT. #951056-WS

Current
Date Description Amount Entries
05/07/96 WLS $150/hr .25 Hours §37.50
Archived Review documents.
05/07/96 BKG $175/hr 1.20 Hours $210.00
Archived Review audit documents (.6); conference
with F. Seidman (.6).
05/07/96 BKG $175/hr .20 Hours $35.00
Archived Telephone conference with T. Trace.
05/08/96 WLS $150/hr .75 Hours $112.50
Archived Research ; review documents.
05/08/96 BKG $175/hr 1.60 Hours $280.00
Archived Review Public Counsel Interrogatories.
05/08/96 BKG $175/hr 1.80 Hours $315.00
Archived Review PSC Audit Report (.8); research
(1).
05/08/96 KWC $140/hr 4.35 Hours $609.00
Archived Receipt and review PCUC draft responses
to OPC 2nd Request for Production (.5);
Archived prepare draft Motion for Protective
Order (2nd set discovery) (3.85).
05/08/96 KWC $140/hr .60 Hours $84.00
Brchived Prepare draft letter Scott Edmonds
regarding response to audit report
Archived (.25); Telephone conference with Brian
Bilinski regarding discovery responses
Archived (.1); Preparation of memo (.25).
05/09/96 WLS $150/hr 2.25 Hours . $337.50
Archived Telephone conferences with B. Bilinski,
S. Edmonds (.5); Research (1.25); Review
Archived documents (.4); prepare and transmit
Affidavit (.1).
05/09/96 BKG $175/hr .20 Hours $35.00
Archived Telephone conference with B. Bilinski
regarding Public Counsel Discovery.
05/09/96 BKG $175/hr 1.60 Hours §280.00
Archived Review Public Counsel Discovery.
05/09/96 Flat Chg $13.20
Archived Costs advanced Wayne L. Schiefelbein,
reimbursement for copy of testimony from
Archived Florida Public Service Commission.
05/09/96 KWC $140/hr 5.50 Hours §770.00
Archived Prepare draft Motion for Protective T
Order on OPC 2nd set-of Discovery (5);
Archived review PCUC Responses to 2nd set of
Interrogatories and Request for
Archived Production (.5).
05/09/96 -KWC $140/hr 1.75 Hours $§245.00
Archived Telephone conferences with client

regarding responses (.5); conferences
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K. Kenneth Gatfin, P.A.
/17796 Client Ledger Card PAGE 22
Client: Palm Coast Utility Corporation 841

RF: RATE CASE, DKT. {951056-WS

Telephone conferences with F. Seidman,

Current
Date Description Amount Entries
Archived with BKG regarding responses (.5);
Telephone conference with Consultant
Archived (.25); preparation of objection language
(.5).
05/09/96 KWC $140/hr .25 Hours $35.00
Archived Review Citizens Response to PCUC Motion
for Temporary Protective Order and
Archived Protective Order.
"05/10/96 BKG $175/hr .30 Hours $52.50
Archived Telephone conference with T. Trace.
05/10/96 BKG $175/hr 2.50 Hours $437.50
Archived Review Public Counsel discovery
documents (l1); research (1.5).
05/10/96 KWC $140/hr 5.10 Hours $714.00
Archived Research law (2.6); Telephone conference
with Bilinski (PCUC) regarding discovery
Archived responses (.5); Conference with BKG
regarding discovery responses (.5);
Archived Prepare Motion for Protective Order
(1.5).
05/13/96 BKG Rate: N/A Hrs: N/A -$10,348.10
Archived Received payment PCUC ck. #44222
05/13/96 WLS $150/hr 3.50 Hours : $525.00
Archived Review , file and serve responses to OPC ‘
2nd Set of Interrogatories and 2nd Set
Archived of Document Requests (.25); Review and .
file Affidavits and Notice of Interim
Archived Rates (.3) Research (.75); Telephone
conferences with S. Edmonds, B.
Archived Bilinski, F. Seidman (.75); Conference
with F. Seidman at Gatlin, Woods &
Archived Carlson (.5); Prepare motion for
expedited response to interrogatory
Archived (.5); Prepare letter to S. Edmonds (.2);
review documents (.25).
05/13/96 KWC §140/hr 6.50 Hours $910.00
Archived Research and Preparation of Motion for
Protective Order on 2nd Set of OPC
Archived Discovery (6.2); Telephone conference
with OPC Reilly regarding Extension of
Archived Time (.l1); Telephone conference with
Reilly regarding Responses (.1);
Archived Telephone conference with consultant
Seidman regarding Discovery (.1).
05/14/96 KWC $140/ht" 4.80 Hours $672.00
Archived Research and preparation of PCUC's
Second Motion for Protective Order.
05/14/96 WLS $150/hr 5.50 Hours $825.00
Archived - Research (3.75); Review documents (1)
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6/17/96 Client Ledger Card PAGE 23
Client: Palm Coast Utility Carporation 841
RE: RATR CASE, DKT. #951056-WS

Current
Date Description Amount Entries

Archived B. Rilinski (.5); Conference with F.

Seidman at Gatlin, Woods & Carlson
Archived (.25).
05/15/96 WLS $150/hr 2.40 Hours $360.00
Archived Review memo from J. Guastella (.2);

research (1.7); Telephone conferences
Archived with J. Perry, F. Seidman, Division of

: Records & Reporting (.5).

05/15/96 BKG $175/hr .30 Hours §52.50
Archived Telephone conference with T. Trace.
05/15/96 BKG $175/hr .80 Hours $140.00
Archived Research regarding Dunes discovery.
05/15/96 BKG $175/hr .50 Hours $87.50
Archived Telephone conference with John Guastella

regarding audit report.
05/15/96 BKG $175/hr 1.70 Hours $297.50
Archived Review Public Counsel discovery (.7);

research (1).
05/15/96 KWC $140/hr 3.50 Hours £490.00
Archived Conference with BKG regarding discovery

(.1); prepare PCUC's Second Motion for
Archived Protective Order (3); Telephone

conferences with PCUC regarding same
Archived (.4).
05/16/96 Flat Chg $7.40
ARrchived Costs advanced Leslie D. Veal,

reimbursement for copies from Florida
Archived Public Service Commission.
05/16/96 Flat Chg $13.50
Archived Costs advanced Florida Overnight,

express package.
05/16/96 WLS $150/hr 5.60 Hours $840.00
Archived Research (3.6); review revised draft

audit response (1); Conference with F.
Archived Seidman at Gatlin, Woods & Carlson

‘ (.25); review customer correspondence

Archived (.25); prepare memos to N. Oliver, B.

Bilinski, J. Perry (.5).
05/16/96 BKG $175/hr 1.80 Hours $315.00
Archived Review Public Counsel discovery.
05/16/96 BKG $175/hr .30 Hours $52.50
Archived Telephone conference with T. Trace.
05/16/96 BKG $175/hr- .20 Hours $35.00
Archived ‘Telephone conference with B. Bilinski.
05/16/96 KWC $140/hr 2.00 Hours $280.00
Archived Research and preparation of PCUC's §

Response to Motion to Compel.
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6/17/96 Client Ledger Card PAGE 24
Client: Palm Coast Utility Corporation 841
RE: RATE CASE, DKT. #951056-WS

Current
Date Description Amount Entries

05/16/96 KWC $140/hr 4.60 Hours $644.00
Archived Conference with BKG regarding discovery

(.1); Preparation of PCUC's Second
Archived Motion for Protective Order (3.75);

Telephone conferences with PCUC
Archived regarding discovery motions (.4);

Telephone conference with OPC regarding
Archived discovery (.1); read OPC Motion to

_ Compel (.25). ’

05/17/96 BKG $175/hr 3.30 Hours $577.50
Archived Review Public Counsel Discovery.
05/17/96 KWC $140/hr 6.30 Hours $882.00
Archived Conference with BKG regarding discovery

(.1):; Research and Preparation of PCUC's
Archived Response to Motion to Compel (5.75):

Telephone conference with PCUC (.1):
Archived Telephone conference with OPC Reilly

regarding discovery (.1); Telephone
Archived conference with Land Sales (.25).
05/20/96 WLS $150/hr 3.60 Hours $540.00
Archived Review letter from C. Spano (.5):

Research (2.1); Telephone conferences
Archived with J. Perry, S. Edmonds, B. Bilinski

(.5); Prepare letter to B. Bayo (.1):
‘Archived prepare letter to S. Edmonds and

proposed Notice of Hearing (.2); review
Archived draft letter from B. Bilinski (.2).
05/20/96 BKG $175/hr .20 Hours $35.00
Archived Telephone conference with J. Perry

regarding Public Counsel Discovery.
05/20/96 BKG $8175/hr .80 Hours §140.00
Archived Review Public Counsel Discovery.
05/21/96 WLS $150/hr 4.00 Hours -$600.00
Archived Review revisions to draft response to

audit report (.5); research (2); review
Archived documents (.75); Telephone conferences

with B. Bilinski, J. Perry, S. Reilly,
Archived S. Edmonds (.75).
05/21/96 KWC $140/hr 6.10 Hours $854.00
Archived Conference with BKG (.1); Preparation of

PCUC's Response to Motion to Compel
Archived (5.5); Telephone conferences with client

(.25); read OPC's 3rd Set of Interroga-
Archived tories & Request for Production (.25).
05/21/96 BKG $175/hr .20 Hours $35.00
Archived Telephone conference with J. Perry

regarding rate case.
05/21/96 BKG $175/hr .30 Hours $52.50
Archived Telephone conference with John Guastella H

regarding Dunes Rebuttal.
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G/17/96 Client Ledger Card PAGE 25
Client: Palm Caast Utility Corporation 841
RE: RATE CASE, DKT. #951056-WS

Current
Date Description Amount Entries

05/21/96 BKG  $175/hr 1.90 Hours $332.50
Avrchived Review Public Counsel Discovery.
05/21/96 BKG $175/hr 1.50 Hours $262.50
Archived Review Dunes Rebuttal.
05/22/96 KWC $140/hr 1.75 Hours $245.00
Archived Conference with BKG (.1); Preparation of

and file PCUC's Response to Motion to
Archived Compel (1.4); Telephone conferences with

client regarding 3rd Set of Interroga-
Archived tories & Requests for Production (.25).
05/22/96 BKG $175/hr .30 Hours $52.50
Archived Telephone conference with T. Trace.
05/22/96 BKG $175/hr 2.10 Hours $367.50
Archived Review Public Counsel testimony and

exhibits.
05/22/96 WLS $150/hr 5.80 Hours : $870.00
Archived Telephone conferences with B. Bilinski,

J. Perry, S. Edmonds, F. Seidman (.7);
Archived Prepare letter to S. Reilly (.3); edit

draft response to audit report (1.3);
Archived research (3.1); prepare memo to J. Perry

(.2); review memo from S. Edmonds (.2).
05/23/96 KWC $140/hr .10 Hours $14.00
Archived Telephone conference with Bilinski

regarding OPC's 3rd interrogatories and
Archived request for production.
05/23/96 KWC $140/hr 1.00 Houts $140.00
Archived Telephone conference call regarding rate

case due dates and scheduling.
05/23/96 BKG $175/hr .20 Hours $35.00
Archived Telephone conference with Brian

Bilinski.
05/23/96 BKG $175/hr .50 Hours $87.50
Archived Review response to Staff Audit Report.
05/23/96 BKG $175/hr .60 Hours $105.00
Archived Telephone conference with PCUC and

witnesses.
05/23/96 BKG $175/hr 1.80 Hours $315.00
Archived Research regarding Dunes testimony (1);

preparation for deposition (.8).
05/23/96 RKG $175/hr .70 Hours $§122.50
Archived Review PSC Staff Discovery. s
05/23/96 WLS $150/hr 6.30 Hours $945.00
Archived Telephone conferences with R. Adams, S.

‘Reilly, B. Bilinski, J. Perry, C. Spano,
Archived R. Melson (1.4); review documents (1.8);

Research (2.9); Prepare Notice of
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lient:

DA RATIE

rchived
5/24/96
rchived

5/24/96
rchived

5/24/96
rchived

5/24/96
rchived

5/24/96
rchived

5/24/96
rchived

rchived

rchived

6/17/96

tlirent Ledger Card PAGHE 26
Palmm Coast ULility Corporation 811
ChnSE, DET. #951056-ws
Current
Desceription Amount Entries
Deposition (.2).
Flai Chy §22.43
Postage
Flat Chg $434.80
Photocopy documents 2174 pages @ $.20
each.
BKG $175/hr .20 Hours $35.00
Telephone conference with T. Trace.
BKG $175/hr 2.30 Hours $402.50
Review Dunes documents in preparation
for depositions and Hearing.
BKG $175/hr 3.40 Hours $595.00
Review Public Counsel Interrogatories;
preparation for depositions and hearing.
WLS $150/hr 5.50 Hours $825.00
Telephone conferences with J. Guastella,
R. Melson, S. Reilly (.5); edit response
to audit report (.75); Review audit
workpapers (1); Research (1. 8); Prepare
memos to B. Bilinski, F. Seidman, J.
Perry, C. Spano (.75); Review letter
from C. Spano (.5); Prepare Notice of
Depo (.2). in preparation of rate case
exhibit (.75); review correspondence
(.5).
BKG Rate: N/A Hrs: N/A -$30,718.03 -$30,718.03
Received payment PCUC ck. #44702
Hourly Rates
B. Kemeth Gatlin S175.00
Wayre L. Schiefelbein 150.00
Kathryn G.W. Cowdery 140.00




Please Make Check Payable to B. Kenneth Gatlin, P.A.

35/28/96

)5/28/96

)5/28/96

05/29/96

05/29/96

05/29/96

GaTLIN, WooDs & CARLSON

Altorneys at Law
a partnership including a professional association

1709 1 Mahan Drive
Tallahasseo. Florida 32308
(904) 877-7191

Palm Coast Utility Corporation
2 Utility Drive

Palm Coast, FL 32137

RE: RATE CASE, DKT. #951056 - WS

June 26,

Legal Services Rendered 5/26/96- 6/25/96

Telephone conferences with S. Edmonds,
F. Seidman, J. Perry (.5); Conference
with F. Seidman at GWC (.4); Review
documents (3.4); finalize and file
response to audit report (.5); prepare
memo to J. Perry et al (.2); begin
preparation of prehearing statement (1).

WLS

BKG Research regarding rebuttal testimony.

Read and Preparation of response to
OPC's 2nd Motion to Compel (2.25);
Telephone conference with client (.25);
Prepare Objection to Interrogatory No.
73 (1); research (1).

KWC

Telephone conferences with S. Reilly, S.
Edmonds, R. Melson, J. Perry, F. Seidman
(1.25); Conference with F. Seidman at
GWC (.2); Research (2); Review documents
(.5); finalize and transmit first draft
of prehearing statement (.6); prepare
notice of deposition (.2). begin
preparation for depositions (.75).

WLS

Telephone conference with J. Perry and
T. Trace.

BKG

BKG Review Public Counsel ‘discovery.

B. Kenneth Gatlin, P.A.

6.00 hr
$§150/hr

4.50 hr
$175/hr

4.50 hr
$140/hr

5.50 hr
§150/hr

.40 hr
$175/hr

.40 hr
$175/hr

ID#59-2540412

$900

$787.

$630.

$825.

§70.

$70

‘f%.537<&ﬁ 95

1996

.00

50

00

00

00

.00



5/29/96

5/29/96

5/30/96

'5/30/96

'5/30/96

15/30/96

15/30/96

15/30/96

15/30/96

GATLIN, WooDs & CARLSON

Attorneys at Law

a partnership including a professional association
1709-1 Mahan Drive
Tallahassee, Florida 32308
(904) 877-7191

Palm Coast Utility Corporation
2 Utility Drive

Palm Coast, FL

RE: RATE CASE, DKT.

BKG

KWC

WLS

BKG

BKG

BKG

BKG

BKG

32137

#951056 - WS

Review rebuttal testimony.

Research and Preparation of Response to
Motion to Compel (3.6); Telephone
conferences with PCUC B. Bilinski (.25,
.25, .25); conference with BKG regarding
Dunes discovery (.25).

Telephone conferences with S. Edmonds,
B. BRilinski, R. Melson, S. Reilly, J.
Perry (1); prepare memos to S. Reilly
(.5); prepare notices of deposition
(.4); Conference with F. Seidman at GWC
(.3); review draft Dunes discovery
responses (.5); research (1.6).

Telephone conference with S. Reilly.
Telephone conference with D. Schlobohm.

Conference with F. Seidman regarding
rebuttal testimony.

Telephone conference with S. Reilly
regarding discovery.

Telephone conference with T. Trace.

Research and Preparation of PCUC's
Response to OPC's 2nd Motion to Compel

" YV mmemmnbhh Mablan P A

June 26, 1996
Page 2
.70 hr $122.50
$175/hr
4.60 hr $644.00
$140/hr
4.30 hr $645.00
$150/hr
.20 hr $35.00
$175/hr
.20 hr $35.00
$175/hr
.90 hr $157.50
$175/hr
.20 hr $35.00
$175/hr
.30 hr §52.50
$175/hr
5.90 hr $826.00
$140/hr
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5/31/96

5/31/96

5/31/96

'5/31/96

15/31/96

16/01/96

GaTLIN, WooDs & CARLSON

Attornevs at Law

a partnership including a professional association

17090 Mahan Drive
Tallohassee, Florida 32308
(904 877-7191

Palm Coast Utility Corporation
2 Utility Drive

Palm Coast, FL

RE: RATE CASE, DKT.

BKG

BKG

KWC

KWC

WLS

BKG

32137

#951056 - Ws

(5.15); Telephone conference with
Bilinski regarding staff interrogatories
(.5); Telephone conference with PSC
Counsel regarding same (.25).

Review Public Counsel discovery
regarding on-site inspection.

Preparation for Hearing.

conference with Scott Edmonds
discovery (.25); Preparation
Response to OPC's 2nd Motion
(1.5); Telephone conferences
regarding discovery (.5).

Telephone
regarding
of PCUC's
to Compel
with PCUC

Preparation of Objection/Request for
Clarification of Staffs' First Set of
Interrogatories and Request for
Production of Documents (.3); Prepare
Supplemental Responses for
Interrogatories 45,47, Request for
Production of Documents 36 (.5).

Telephone conferences with 8. Edmonds,
R. Melson, S. Reilly, D. Schlobohm, J.
Perry, B. Bilinski, F. Seidman (1.25);
Review correspondence (.25); research

(1.8); Conference with F. Seidman at GWC

(.5); Review memo from S. Reilly (.2);
edit draft prehearing statement (1).

Preparation for Hearing.

June 26, 1996

Page 3

.40 hr $70.00
$175/hr

4.10 hr $717.50
$175/hr

2.25 hr $315.00
$140/hr

.80 hr $112.00
$140/hr

5.00 hr $750.00
$150/hr

1.20 hr $210.00
$175/hr
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16/02/96

16/03/96

16/03/96

)6/03/96

)6/03/96

)6/03/96

)6/03/96

)6/03/96

GATLIN, WooDps & CARLSON

Attorneys at Law

a partnership including a professional association

1709 D Malun Drive
Tallahassee, Florida 32308
(904) 8777191

Palm Coast Utility Corporation
2 Utility Drive

Palm Coast, FL

32137

RE: RATE CASE, DKT. #951056 - WS

BKG

WLS

BKG

BKG

BKG

Preparation for Hearing.

Telephone conferences with S. Reilly, F.
Seidman, D. Schlobohm, B. Reyes (1.2);
finalize and file prehearing statement
(1); review documents (.25); Prepare
memo to B. Bilinski (.1); review
correspondence (.25); edit draft
rebuttal testimony (1). prepare for
depositions (.4).

Review Public¢c Counsel Discovery.
Review Staff Discovery.
Preparation for Hearing.

Research and Preparation of PCUC's
Objections and Reguest for Clarification
of Staffs' First Sets of Interrogatories
and Request for Production (2);
Telephone conferences with PCUC
regarding same (.25).

Preparation of PCUC's Response to OPC's
2nd Motion to Compel (3); Prepare
Request for Oral Argument regarding same
(.25).

‘

Research and preparation of PCUC's
Objections to OPC's 4th Set of

50 .

June 26, 1996

Page 4

1.40 hr $245,00
$175/hr

4.20 hr $630,00
$150/hr

1.20 hr $210.00
$175/hr

.50 hr $87.50
$175/hr

4.10 hr $717.

$175/hr

2.25 hr $315.00
$140/hr

3.25 hr $455.00
$140/hr

1.10 hr $154.00
$140/hr
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16/04/96

)6/04/96

)6/04/96

)6/05/96

)6/05/96

)6/05/96

GaTUIN, WooDs & CARLSON

Attorneys at Law

a partnership including a professional association

1709 1) Mahan Drive
Tallohassee, Florida 32308
(904) 877-7191

Palm Coast Utility Corporation
2 Utility Drive

Palm Coast, FL

32137

RE: RATE CASE, DKT. #951056 - WS

WLS

BKG

KwC

BKG

KWC

WLS

Interrogatories and Request for
Production of Documents.

Telephone conferences with R. Melson, D.
Schlobohm, B. Bilinski, B. Reyes (.8);
edit, finalize and file staff approved
Notice of Hearing (.3); edit draft
rebuttal testimony (1.5); prepare memo
to B. Bilinski (.2); Conference with F.
Seidman at GWC (.3); prepare for
depositions (3.4).

Review exhibits and rebuttal testimony;
preparation for Hearing.

Research interrogatory/law (2.5);
Preparation of PCUC's Objections to
OPC's 4th Sets of Interrogatories and
Requests for Production (3); Telephone
conference with PCUC regarding same
(.25).

Review documents; preparation for
witness conference.

Research and Preparation of PCUC's
Objections to OPC's 4th Sets of
Interrogatories and Requests for
Production of Documents (4.25);
(.7); Preparation of Notice of
Appearance (.25); Telephone conferences
with PCUC regarding discovery (.5).

Perry., R.
B. Reyes,

Telephone conferences ‘with J.
Adams, D. Schlobohm, C. Spano,

research

June 26, 1996

Page 5

6.50 hr $975.00
$150/hr

3.80 hr $665.00
§175/hr

5.75 hr $805.00
$140/hr

3.60 hr $630.00
$175/hr

5.70 hr $798.00
$140/hr

$5.50 hr $825.00
$150/hr

Py. bl oF 95



6/06/96

6/06/96

6/06/96

6/07/96

6/07/96

6/07/96

GATLIN, WooDs & CARLSON

Attornevs al Law
a partnership including a professional association

1709 D Mahan Drive
Tallahassee. Florida 32308
(904) 877-7191

Palm Coast Utility Corporation
2 Utility Drive

Palm Coast, FL 32137

RE: RATE CASE, DKT. #951056 - WS

B. Bilinski (1.1); proof draft rebuttal
(.5); research (1.7); prepare for
depositions (2); review memo from
Seidman (.2).

Conference at Palm Coast with witnesses;
preparation for rebuttal.

BKG

Preparation for depositions (5.75);
Telephone conferences with R. Melson
(.25).

WLS

Telephone conferences with PCUC
regarding discovery (.l); prepare
Objection to OPC's 4th Set of Discovery

(.7).

Conference at Palm Coast with rate case
witnesses.

KWC

BKG

Telephone conferences with S. Edmonds,
S. Reilly, B. Brammer, R. Melson (1.2);
review fax from BKG (.4); Telephone
conference with BKG (.2); prepare Notice
of Deposition (.2); Preparation for &
attendance at deposition of R. Dodrill
(5.4).

WLS

Telephone conference with Scott Edmonds
regarding discovery responses (.25);
Telephone conference with PCUC regarding
discovery (.25); finalize and file
Objections to Staff's 4th Set of
Discovery (.25); File supplemental
answers to OPC Interrogatories 45 and 47

(.6).

June 26, 1996

Page 6

9.50 hr $1,662.50
$175/hr

6.00 hr $900.00
$150/hr

.80 hr $112.00
$140/hr

9.40 hr $1,645.00
§175/hr

7.40 hr $1,110.00
$150/hr

1.35 hr $189.00

$140/hr '

q%a_(pg\ of 95



6/08/96

6/09/96

6/10/96

6/10/96

6/10/96

6/10/96

6/10/96

6/10/96

GaTLIN, Wo0oDs & CARLSON

Attorneys at Law

a partnership including a professional association

1709 D Mahan Drive
Tallahassee, Florida 32308
(904) 877-7191

Palm Coast Utility Corporation
2 Utility Drive

Palm Coast, FL

RE: RATE CASE, DKT.

WLS

WLS

BKG

BKG

WLS

KWC

BKG

32137

#951056 - WS

Preparation for deposition.

(.25);

Preparation for deposition
at office of

Conference with F. Seidman
F. Seidman (1.75).

Review rate case discovery.
Review rate case rebuttal.

Attend deposition of T. Biddy (1.6);
prepare Notice of Deposition (.2);
attend preprehearing conference (2.6);
Telephone conferences with J. Perry, B.
Bilinski, D. Scholbohm, N. Davis, F.
Seidman, C. Spano {(1.5); draft memos to
B. Bilinski, S. Edmonds, C. Spano (1.1);
prepare for deposition (2).

Telephone conferences with PCUC Bilinski
regarding discovery (.25); Telephone
conference with J. Guastella regarding
discovery (.25); finalize and file
Supplemental Response to OPC Request for
Production No. 36 (.25).

Finalize and file Response to Dunes
Interrogatories (.35); Prepare rate case
expenses Staff Interrogatory Response

(.7).

Telephone conference with Frank Seidman
regarding rebuttal.

June 26, 1996
Page 7
2.00 hr $300.00
$150/hr
2.00 hr $300.00
$150/hr
.40 hr $70.00
$175/hr
.60 hr $105.00
$175/hr
9.00 hr §1,350.00
$150/hr
.75 hr $105.00
$140/hr
1.05 hr $147.00
$140/hr
.40 hr $§70.00
$175/hr

Z)
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5/10/96

5/10/96

5/11/96

5/11/96

5/11/96

53/11/96

3/11/96

GaTuiN, WooDs & CARLSON

Attormeys at Law

a partnership inchuding a professional association

17091 Mahan Drive
Tallahassee, Florida 32308
(900 877-7191

Palm Coast Utility Corporation
2 Utility Drive

Palm Coast, FL

RE:

BKG

BKG

WLS

KWC

KWC

BKG

32137

RATE CASE, DKT. #951056 - WS

Research and drafting of memo regarding
deposition.

Telephone conference with T. Trace.

Attend deposition of K. Dismukes (1.7);
finalize memos to B. Bilinski, S.
Edmonds, C. Spano (.5); Conference with
F. Seidman at PsC (.5); Telephone
conference with J. Johnston (.2);
prepare for deposition (4.1); assist in
preparation of rate case exhibit (.75):
review correspondence (.5).

Review draft response to OPC 3rd set of
Interrogatories; Telephone conference
with PCUC (.8); finalize, file response
to Dunes Request for Production, review
documents (1.2).

Research (1.5); Conference and Telephone
conferences with consultant Seidman
regarding rate case issues/rebuttal
(.7); Telephone conference with PCUC
Perry regarding same (.25); Telephone
conference with PCUC regarding discovery

(.2).

Preparation of and review Staff
Discovery Responses.

Conferéﬁée with John Guastella.

June 26, 19386

Page 8

.20 hr $35.00
$175/hr

.20 hr $35.00
$§175/hr

8.25 hr $1,237.50
$150/hr

2.00 hr $280.00
$140/hr

2.65 hr $371.00
$140/hr

.80 hr $112.00
$140/hr

.80 hr $140.00
$175/hr

PB' b of 95



6/12/96

6/12/96

6/13/96

6/13/96

6/13/96

6/13/96

6/13/96

GATLIN, WooDs & CARLSON

Attorneys at Law

a partnership including a professional association

17091 Mahan Drive
Tallahassee. Florida 32308
904y 877-7191

Palm Coast Utility Corporation
2 Utility Drive

Palm Coast, FL

RE: RATE CASE, DKT.

WLS

KWC

BKG

BKG

BKG

WLS

32137

#951056 - WS

Attend onsite plant facilities tour in
Palm Coast with D. Schlobohm, S. Reilly,
A. Milian, J. Collins (4.05);
Preparation for & attendance at
deposition of G. Sapp in Bunnell (3.4);
pre and post deposition conferences with
C. Spano in Bunnell (.8); conferences
with PCUC officials (2); telephone
conference with F. Seidman (.2).

‘Review rebuttal regarding CIAC issue and

research regarding same (3.4); Prepare
Estimate to Complete (.8); Review
discovery responses (.7); Telephone
conference with S. Edmonds (.1);
Telephone conference with Bilinski (.1).

Research , Review draft rebuttal (3);
final Preparation for filing of PCUC
Response to Staff 2nd Request for
Production (.5); Telephone conference
with B. Bilinski regarding discovery
(.25).

Conference with F. Seidman and K.
Cowdery and review of testimony.

Telephone conference with T. Trace.

Research and review rebuttal testimony.

Telephone conferences with R. Melson, B.
Bilinski, S. Edmonds (.8); prepare

June

10.45 hr

$150/hr

5.10 hr
$140/hr

3.75 hr
$140/hr

2.80 hr
$175/hr

.20 hr
$175/hr

2.30 hr
$175/hr

6.10 hr
$150/hr

‘F%, 5 ok 95

26,
Page

$1,567.

$714.

$525

$490

$35

$402.

$915

1396

9

50

ao

.00

.00

.00

50

.00



6/14/96

6/14/96

6/14/96

6/14/96

6/16/96

6/17/96

GATLIN. WooDs & CARLSON

Attorneys at Law

a partnership including a professional association

1709-D Mahan Drive
Tallahassee, Florida 32308
(904) 877-7191

Palm Coast Utility Corporation
2 Utility Drive

Palm Coast, FL

32137

RE: RATE CASE, DKT. #951056 - WS

WLS

BKG

KWC

KWC

WLS

BKG

Notice of Cancellation of Deposition
(.2); Conference with F. Seidman at GWC
(.2); assist on rate case expense
exhibit (.2); proof and edit draft

rebuttal testimony/review correspondence

from C. Spano (4.4); review documents

(.3).

Telephone conferences with F. Seidman,
J. Perry, R. Melson, C. Spano, B. Reyes
(2.2); research/review documents (.5);
proof and edit draft rebuttal (1.6);
prepare memo to C. Spano (.2); review
correspondence from C. Spano (.4);
review and transmit Notices of
Deposition (.2); preparation for
deposition (.3).

Conference with F. Seidman regarding
rebuttal testimony.

Review and file Response to Staff's 1lst
Request for Production and review
Response to Staff's 1lst Set of
Interrogatories.

Telephone conferences with Guastella,
Perry, Seidman regarding discovery
responses and rebuttal testimony (1)
review draft responses to OPC's 3rd
document request (1.5).

Proof and edit draft rebuttal testimony.

Review rebuttal testimony.

June 26, 1996

5.40 hr
$150/hr

2.20 hr
$175/hr

3.00 hr
$140/hr

2.50 hr
$140/hr

2.00 hr
$150/hr

2.10 hr
$§175/hr

Page 10

$810.00

$385.00

$420.00

$350.00

$300.00

$367.50

Fé, QQ,GQ‘QES



6/17/96

6/17/96

6/17/96

6/17/96

5/17/96

5/17/96

5/17/96

GATLIN, Wo0oDs & CARLSON

Aftornevs al Law

a partnership including a professional association

17091 Mahan Drive
Tallahassee. Florida 32308

(904) 877-7191

Palm Coast Utility Corporation
2 Utility Drive

Palm Coast, FL

32137

RE: RATE CASE, DKT. $951056 - WS

BKG

BKG

KWC

KWC

BKG

BKG

WLS

Telephone conference with J. Guastello.

Telephone conference with T. Trace.

Review and file Responses to OPC's 3rd
sets of discovery (1.75); Telephone
conferences with client and consultants
regarding same (.25); review and
Telephone conferences with client,
consultant, PSC legal regarding
responses to Staff Interrogatories (.5).

Receipt and review Citizen's 3rd Motion
to Compel (.1), Intervenor County's Memo
in Support of Citizens' Motion to Compel
(.1), Flagler County Petition to
Intervene (.2).

Telephone conference with T. Trace.

Telephone conference with J. Perry.

Telephone conferences with J. Perry, J.
Guastella, D. Schlobohm, C. Spano, G.
Su, F. Seidman, B. Bilinski (2.6);
finalize and file rebuttal testimony and
exhibits of C. Spano with PsC (1.5);
Review letter from C. Spano (.2);
Research (.25); Review draft draft
prehearing order and prepare for

June

.30 hr
$175/hr

.30 hr
§175/hr

2.50 hr
$140/hr

.40 hr
$140/hr

.30 hr
$175/hr

.20 hr
$175/hr

$.80 hr
$150/hr

26, 1996
Page 11

$52.50

$52.50

$350.00

$56.00

$52.50

$35.00

$870.00

B. 7 of 95



16/18/96

16/18/96

)6/18/96

)6/18/96

16/18/96

16/19/96

JU INTLLILSZS Ll "L s owaay,

GATLIN, Wo0oDs & CARLSON

Attornevs at Law

a partnership including a professional association

17091 Mahan Drive
Tallahassee, Florida 32308
(904) 877-7191

Palm Coast Utility Corporation
2 Utility Drive

Palm Coast, FL

32137

RE: RATE CASE, DKT. #951056 - WS

BKG

WLS

KWC

WLS

prehearing conference (l1); conference
with F. Seidman at GWC (.25).

Review Issues.

Prepare for Prehearing Conference (3.5);
prepare for deposition (.75); Telephone
conferences with J. Perry, D. Schlobohm,
J. Guastella (.75); Conference with F.
Seidman at GWC (.5).

Telephone conference with PSC Scott
Edmonds regarding discovery (.2):;
Telephone conference with Seidman
regarding discovery (.1l); Prepare
Response to Citizen's Third Motion to
Compel (2.5).

Prepare Response to County's Memo in
Support of OPC's Motion to Compel
Production of Option Agreement.

Preparation for filing the Response to
Staffs lst Set of Interrogatories (.1);
Telephone conference with PCUC regarding
same (.l); Telephone conference with
Seidman regarding same (.1l).

Prepare for depositions (1); prepare for
prehearing conference {(2); attend
deposition of G. Moyer at Hopping firm
and conference with R. Melson (1.3):
Telephone conference with F. Seidman

(.2).

June

1.00 hr
$175/hr

5.50 hr
$150/hr

2.80 hr
$140/hr

2.20 hr
$140/hr

.30 hr
$140/hr

4.50 hr
$150/hr

26, 1996

Page 12

$175.00

$825.00

$392.00

$308.00

$42.00

$675.00

By. b8 of 95



'6/19/96

6/19/96

6/19/96

6/19/96

6/19/96

6/19/96

6/20/96

6/20/96

GaTLIN, Wo0oDs & CARLSON

Attorneys at Lau

a partnership including a professional association

17091 Mahan Drive
Tallshassee, Plorida 32308
(904) 877-7191

Palm Coast Utility Corporation
2 Utility Drive

Palm Coast, FL

RE: RATE CASE,

BKG

BKG

BKG

KWcC

KWC

KWC

WLS

32137

DKT. #951056 - WS

Telephone conference with T. Trace.
Review Dunes exhibits.
Preparation for Hearing.

Prepare rate case expense exhibit (1.5);
Telephone conferences with client
regarding same (.25); Review, final
preparation for filing of Response to
Staffs 2nd interrogatories (1).

Review response to Staff's 1lst set of
interrogatories (2a, 41, 42c, 45) (1);
Prepare for Prehearing Conference (6.8);
Telephone conference with Seidman
regarding same (.25).

Telephone conference with Guastella
regarding Prehearing Conference (.25);
with Perry regarding same (.25);
Telephone conferences with PSC Edmonds
regarding Discovery Orders (.3).

Preparation for & attendance at
Prehearing Conference (3.5); attend
deposition of J. Guastella at GWC (5);
post deposition conference with F.
Seidman-and J. Guastella at GWC (.5);
prepare for depositions (.5).

Review and file response to Staff's 1lst
Interrogatories (2a, 41, 42c, 45) (.25);

June 26, 1996
Page 13
.20 hr $35.00
$175/hr
1.10 hr $192.50
$175/hr
2.10 hr $367.50
$175/hr
2.75 hr $385.00
$140/hr
8.05 hr £€1,127.00
$140/hr
.80 hr $112.00
$140/hr
9.50 hr $1,425.00
$150/hr
1.75 hr $245.00
$140/hr

B
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6/20/96

6/20/96

6/21/96

6/21/96

6/21/96

6/21/96

6/21/96

6/21/96

GATLIN, Wo0Ds & CARLSON

Altorneys at Law

a partnership including a professional association

1709-1D Mahar Drive
Tallahassce, Horida 32308
(904) 877-7191

Palm Coast Utility Corporation
2 Utility Drive

Palm Coast, FL

RE: RATE CASE, DKT.

KWC

BKG

WLS

BKG

BKG

BKG

32137

$951056 - WS

Prepare rate case exhibit (1.5).

Prepare Response to OPC's 3rd Motion to
Compel (3.9); Preparation for &
attendance at Prehearing (4.25); Prepare
list of orders for administrative notice

(1.75).

Review documents in preparation for
hearing.

Conferences with F. Seidman at PSC and
at GWC (.6); Preparation for &
attendance at deposition of K. BAmaya
(1.5); Telephone conferences with R.
Melson, B. Brammer, F. Seidman (.5);
Preparation for & attendance at
deposition of F. Seidman (1.5); Prepare
memo to B. Bilinski (.2); Prepare memo
to A. Hadeed (.1).

Telephone conference with J. Perry.
Review exhibits.
Telephone conference with J. Perry.

Prepare rate case expense exhibit (2.6);
Prepare list of orders to be officially
noticed (.5); Prepare -and file Response
to OPC's 3rd Motion to Compel (1.4).

Review Discovery Order (.25); Prepare
memo to client regarding same (1.1);

June 26, 1996
Page 14
3.90 hr $1,386.00
$140/hr
3.70 hr $647.50
$175/hr
4.40 hr $660.00
$150/hr
.20 hr $35.00
$175/hr
3.10 hr $542.50
$175/hr
.20 hr §35.00
$175/hr
4.50 hr $630.00
$140/hr
2.10 hr $294.00
$140/hr

-
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GATLIN, Wo0oDs & CARLSON

Attorneys at Law
a partnership including a professional association

17091 Mahan Drive
Tallahassee, Florida 32308
901 877-7191

Palm Coast Utility Corporation June 26, 1996
2 Utility Drive Page 15
Palm Coast, FL 32137
RE: RATE CASE, DKT. #951056 - WS
Telephone conferences with client (.25);
conference with Seidman regarding same
(.5).
'6/23/96 WLS Preparation for hearing. 3.50 hr $525.00
$150/hr
'6/24/96 WLS Attend deposition of C. Spano in Palm 6.75 hr $1,012.50
Coast (l1); pre and post deposition $150/hr
conferences with C. Spanoc, J. Perry, B.
Bilinski (3.25); preparation for hearing
(2.5).
16/24/96 BKG Telephone conference with J. Perry. .20 hr $35.00
$175/hr
'6/24/96 BKG Review Dunes discovery. 1.30 hr $227.50
$175/hr
'6/24/96 BKG Telephone conference with R. Melson. .20 hr $35.00
$175/hr
'16/24/96 BKG Telephone conference with F. Seidman. .30 hr $52.50
- $175/hr
'6/24/96 BKG Telephone conference with F. Seidman. .20 hr $35.00
$175/hr
'16/24/96 BKG Telephone conference with S. Edmonds. .20 hr $35.00
$175/hr
'6/24/96 BKG Telephone conference with J. Perry. .20 hr $35.00
. . $175/hr
i6/24/96 BKG Review documents in preparation for 2.40 hr $420.00
hearing. $175/hr

'%.'7‘ of 95



6/24/96

6/24/96

6/25/96

6/25/96

6/25/96

6/25/96

6/10/96

Palm Coast Utility Corporation June 26, 1996
2 Utility Drive Page 16
Palm Coast, FL 32137
RE: RATE CASE, DKT. #951056 - WS
KWC Finalize and file rate case expense 2.85 hr $399.00
exhibit (.25); Prepare memo to J. $140/hr
Guastella regarding same (.25); Prepare
documents for hearing (2.1); Telephone
conferences with Edmonds (.25).
KWC Read discovery orders and Prepare memo 1.10 hr $154.00
to client. $140/hr
WLS Preparation for hearing (3); Prepare 5.00 hr $750.00
memo to C. Spano and review memo from C. $150/hr
Spano (.4); Review and serve late filed
exhibits (.6); Prepare memos to F.
Seidman, J. Guastella (.2); Telephone
conferences with B. Bilinski, F.
Seidman, S. Edmonds (.8).
KWC Prepare memo to client regarding 1.60 hr $224.00
discovery order (l1); Telephone $140/hr
conferences with PCUC regarding
discovery (.2); research (.3); Telephone
conference with Scott Edmonds regarding
discovery (.1l).
KWC Prepare for Hearing (2.3); assist in 3.50 hr $490.00
Discovery responses (1.2). $140/hr
BKG Telephone conference with J. Perry. .30 hr $52.50
$§175/hr
Total Legal Services. 324.70 hr 549,565.50
--- Costs Advanced ---
Costs advanced B. Kenneth Gatlin, travel $399.86
reimbursement, Palm Coast, conferences Flat Chg

R

GATLIN, WooDs & CARLSON

Attornevs at Law
a partnership including a professional association

1709 D Mahan Drive
Tallahassee, Florida 32308
(904) 877-7191

6/5-6/7/96.
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GATLIN, WooDs & CARLSON

Attornevs at Law
a partnership including a professional association

1709 1D Mahan Drive
Tallohassee, Florida 32308
904y 877-7191

Palm Coast Utility Corporation June 26, 1996
2 Utility Drive Page 17
Palm Coast, FL 32137

RE: RATE CASE, DKT. #951056 - WS

6/10/96 Costs advanced Conference-Call USA, $231.96
5/23/96, WLS, Perry, Spano $93.48; Flat Chg
5/23/96, BKG, Perry, Guastella, Seidman
$138.48.

6/10/96 Costs advanced Florida Overnight, $37.29
express packages. Flat Chg

6/14/96 Costs advanced Leslie D. Veal, $4.00
reimbursement for copies of customer Flat Chg

correspondence from PSC.

6/14/96 Costs advanced Wayne L. Schiefelbein, $231.42
travel reimbursement, Palm Coast and Flat Chg
Bunnell, on site plant visit and Sapp
deposition.

6/14/96 Costs advanced Kathryn G. W. Cowdery, $5.00
reimbursement for costs of copies at FSU Flat Chg
law library.

6/17/96 Costs advanced Federal Express, express $154.50
packages Flat Chg

6/17/96 Costs advanced Jane Faurot, Court $538.80
Reporter, Dodrill deposition 6/7/96. Flat Chg

6/17/96 Costs advanced Accurate Stenotype $330.50
Reporters, Inc., Biddy deposition, Flat Chg
6/10/96.

6/18/96 Costs advanced Accurate Stenotype $300.40

Reporters, Inc., deposition of Kimberly Flat Chg
Dismukes, 6/14/96.
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16/18/96

'6/18/96

'6/24/96

i6/25/96

\6/25/96

GATLIN, Wo0oDs & CARLSON

Attorneys at Law
a partnership including a professional associca

1709-D Mahan Drive
Tallahassee, Florida 32308
(904) 877-7191

Palm Coast Utility Corporation June
2 Utility Drive
Palm Coast, FL 32137

RE: RATE CASE, DKT. #951056 - WS

Postage (5/26/96 - 6/18/96)
Flat Chg

Photocopy documents 10,980 pages @ $.20 s
each. Includes deposition transcripts Flat Chg
715, miscellaneous documents and notices

1450, staff's direct testimonies 741,

Response to Audit Report 462, Prehear-

ing Statements 286, PCUC's Responses to

Public Counsel's 2nd Motion to Compel

and Request for Oral Argument 420, PCUC
Objections to PC 4th Set of

Interrogatories and POD 1617, Rebuttal &

exhibits of Spano 3591, FS-12 504,

Guastella & Seidman rebuttal & exhibit

966, PCUC's Response to Staff's 1lst set

of Interrogatories 228. (5/26 thru 6/18)

Costs advanced Narup, Vouvakis &
Associates, deposition of Guy Sapp, Flat Chg

6/12/96.

Photocopy documents 2792 pages @ $.20.

PCUC responses to Staff's 1lst Set of Flat Chg
Interrogatories 143; PCUC's list of

Orders for PSC recognition 47; PCUC's

memorandum in Oppesition to Public

Counsel's 3rd Motion to Compel 346;

Exhibit FS-13, 2089; deposition

transcripts 49; miscellaneous memos,

notices, certificates of service 118.
(copies~6/18/96 - 6/25/96)

Postage (6/19/96 - 6/25/96)
Flat Chg

Ry . T4

26, 1996
Page 18

$31.25

2,196.00

$422.80

$558.40

$15.04

of 15



16/25/96

16/25/96
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GATLIN, WooDs & CARLSON

Atlorneys at [aw
a partnership including a professional association

1709 Mahan Drive
Tallahassee, Florida 32308
904y 877-7191

Palm Coast Utility Corporation

June 26, 1996

2 Utility Drive Page 19
Palm Coast, FL 32137
RE: RATE CASE, DKT. #951056 - WS
Costs advanced Wayne L. Schiefelbein, $241.34
travel reimbursement, Palm Coast, Flat Chg
6/23-24/96.
Costs advanced Accurate Stenotype $420.60
Reporters, Inc., Moyers deposition 6/19, Flat Chg
$199.35; Amaya deposition 6/21, $221.25
Total Costs Advanced $6,119.16
Current fees and costs: $55,684.66
TOTAL AMOUNT DUE THIS STATEMENT $55,684.66
Attorney Information
Billed Hours Billed Fees
B. Kenneth Gatlin 77.20 $13,510.00
Kathryn W. Cowdery 106.95 $14,973.00
Wayne L Schiefelbein 140.55 $21,082.50

?5.75 of 95
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Palm Coast Utility Corvporation Type: Utility company

RATE CASE, DKT. #9510566 - WS Standard: Show W.I.P. on Bills
Case Numbey: 906 Monthly
2 Utility Drive Trust Ralance: None
Mattey rate: $175.00
Interest on past due: None
Palm Coast Fl. 321327 Atty: B. Kenneth Gatlin
Phone:
Current
Date Description Amount Entries
Y6/26/96  WLS  $150/hr 6 .30 Hours $945 .00 $945 .00
In Process Prepare for hearing (3.5); Telephone

conferences with B. Bilinski, F.
Seidman, J. Perry, C. Spano, S. Edmonds
(1.4); Review and serve late filed
cdeposition exhibit (.5); Review and
transmit deposition errata sheet (.2);
Review drafts of late filed deposition
exhibit (.5); Prepare memos to R. Melson
and S. Reilly (.2).

Y6/26/96  KWC  $140/hr 1.70 Hours $238.00 $1,183.00
[n Process Read 6/25/96 discovery order and Prepare

memo toc client regarding same ( .6);

Conference with BKG regarding same (.5);

Telephone conference with client

regarding same ( .5); Telephone

conference with S. Edmonds regarding

same (.1).

)6/26/96 KWC  $140/hr 3.40 Hours $476 .00 $1,659.00
‘n Process Telephone conference with Edmonds

regarding rate case expense exhibit

additional information (.1); Telephone

conference with Seidman regarding same

(.1); Telephone conference with

Guastella regarding same (.25); Prepare

updated exhibit (2.95).

Y6/26/96 KWC  $140/hr 1.40 Hours $196 .00 $1,855.00
‘n Process Research regarding POD 36 Exhibit C

(.2); Telephone conference with PSC

Rendell {(.1); Telephone conference with

Edmonds (.2); Prepare for hearing (.7);

research (.2).

6/26/96 BKG $175/hr .60 Hours $105.00 $1,960.00
‘n Process Telephone conference with J. Perry and
Brian Bilinski.

6/26/96 BKG $175/hr .50 Hours $87 .50 $2,047 .50
n Process Review discovery.

6/26/96 BKG  $175/hr 4 .10 Hours $717 .50 $2,765 .00
‘n Process Review documents in preparation for
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GATLIN, WOODS & CARLSON
Legal Expenses

Estimate to Complete
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PALM COAST UTILITY CORPORATION
Application for a rate increase in Flagler County

Docket No. 951056-WS

Estimate to Complete 6/27/96 - review of final order

Legal Fees

June, 1996 (beginning 6/27/96)

Discovery review, file, discovery
responses; consult with client and
with consultants; research; review
and produce late-filed deposition
exhibits)

Review Prehearing Order, consult with
client

Prepare for Hearing (6/27-6/30)

July, 1996

Prepare for and attend Hearing (7/1-2/96)
Read transcript and Prepare and File Brief
Auqust, 1996

No significant activity

September, 1996

Read Staff Recommendation, consult with
client

October, 1996

Attend/monitor PSC Agenda Conference,
consult with client

Read Final Order, consult with client

TOTAL FEE ESTIMATE TO COMPLETE

HOURS

20.0

50.0

50.0
80.0

222.0

AMOUNT!

$ 3,200.

$ 320.

$ 8,000.

$ 8,000.
$12,800.

$ 1,600.

00

00

00

00
00

.00

00

$ 800.

$35,520.

o reflect hourly rate differences between lawyers,
average rate of $160/hr. is used for estimated purposes.

00

00

an
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PALM COAST UTILITY CORPORATION
Application for a rate increase in Flagler County
Docket No. 951056-WS

Estimate to Complete 6/27/96 - review of final order

COSTS

1996 (beqinning 6/27/96)

Court Reporters/Transcripts of depositions $ 1,500.00
of Spano, Guastella, and Seidman and
Prehearing Conference
Hearing Travel Expenses (hotel/meals/ 600.00
mileage 6/29 and 6/30)
Photocopies/Printing 500.00
Mailing 125.00
June Total $ 2,725.00
1996
Court Reporter/Transcript of Hearing $ 2,800.00
Hearing Travel Expenses (hotel/meals/mileage) 600.00
Photocopies/Printing 1,000.00
Mailing 300.00
July Total $ 4,700.00
August, 1996
No significant activity 0
September, 1996
Photocopies $ 50.00
Mailing 50.00
Court Reporter/Transcript of Agenda 300.00
September Total $ 400.00
October, 1996
Photocopies $ 50.00
Mailing 50.00
October Total S 100.00
TOTAL COST ESTIMATE TO COMPLETE $ 7,925.00



SOUTHERN APPRAISAL CORPORATION
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s SOUTHERN APPRAISAL CORPORATION Charles D. Spano. Jr., MAT

Appraisers - Consultants - Realtors® PRESIDENT
State-Certified General R. E. Appraiser

- Certificate No. 0001159
800 S. Nova Road, Suite M ’ P. 0. Box 3687
Ormond Beach, Florida 32174 Ormond Beach. Florida 32175

Phone (504)672-4533 . P. 0. Box 5297

FAX  (904)672-9214 : Ormond Beach, Florida 32175

Internet: sac@notry.com

HW http / /v . nOtry .com/sac.htm

fj: May 17, 1995
P et INVOICE #96-5127pag

Mr,~chhard~Adams
. DaLm-anst Utility Corporation
‘e, 2 Utiltty Drive
. Palm Coast, ?L 32137

€ o
and 4

Re: -Comments on Audit Review of our original Appraisal Report of

Spray Field Site Proposed Expansion, Palm Coast, FL dated
December 5, 1990 with a wvaluation date of October 29, 1990.

Professional services rendered in accordance
with your request. $250

TOTAL AMOUNT DUE:  $250

INVOICES UNPAID AFTER 30 DAYS
SUBJECT TO FINANCE CHARGE OF 1%
MONTELY ON UNPAID BALANCE.
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Jun 17,96 9:19 No .00l P .02

Keue

N APPRAISAL CORPORATION Charles D. l!)i(pano, Jr., MAI
praisers - Consultents - Realtors® PRESIOF Y
s State-Certificd Geners) R. E. Appraiscr

Certificate Ho. 0001159

//
,/////// 800 5. Nova Road. Sufte M P. 0. Box 3687
Ormond Beach. Florida 32174 Ormond Beach, fFlorida 32175
Phone (904)672-4533 P. 0. Box 5297
Ormond Beach, Florida 32175

FAX  (904)672-9214
internet: sacBnotry.com
HHN: http://w.notry . com/sac . hium

June 14, 19396

INVOICE #36-5127a

Mr. Richard Adams

Palm Coast Utility Corporation
2 Utility Drive

Palm Coast, FL 32137

Additional research relating to ouxr original Appraisal
Report of Spray Field Site Proposed Expansion, Palm Coast,
Florida dated December §, 1990 with a valuation date of

October 29, 1990.

Re:

Professional services rendered in

accordance with your request.

Charles D. Spano Jr., MAI 23.25 hours @ $125 = $2,806
Peter A, Gagne 14.00 hours @ $80 = 51,120

TOTAL AMOUNT DUE: $4,026

INVOICES UNPAID AFTER 30 DAYS
SUBJECT TO FINRNCE CHARGE OF 1%
MONTHLY ON UNPAID BALANCE.

Anticipated cost to complete assignment to include:

Review of Sappe deposgition for cross examination

June 24 Deposition - Spano
Hearing before PSC in Palm Coast

Estimated hours:

Charles D. Spano Jr., MAI 15 hours @ $125
Peter A. Gagne S hours @ $80

$1,875
$_400

nu

TOTAL:  §2,275
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PALM COAST UTILITY CORPORATION

DRAW CHECK

TO THE ORDER QF, * NAME

CHECK REQUEST

/01/ '/5/ o

Floncosd AP Blrc CeHcfce” @h/ff/&,

0.. L4

“"*RE"T.;ZS_VO S mA

O OFEL Bl

. ST 7\/%.&&/4 HACS e sure O 2 covE 32385
.« e T :::... ACCOUNTING CODE
3 e e «AMOUNT o4 ACCT | :xw ‘ - | cosT o REASON FOR R.EOUEST
Glodo 412 /oobza pog | Frern 6 FEET —AATES
‘ ~Opor
L1 | Ziocdl - .

T A:""’Mv )
~-:’Sféw~&:’z«;wu:>m~» g




NEWS-JOURNAL CORPORATION

P. O. BOX 2831

FL 32120-2831
904-252-1511

DAYTONA BEACH

ADVERTISING INVOICE

06/18/96
PALM COAST UTILITY
2 UTILITY DR

PALM COAST FL 32137-7366

TERMS: DUE UPON RECEIPT

PUB DATE INVOICE NO. DESCRIPTION

NJ 06/16/96 02098101 PUBLIC NOTICE

ACCOUNT NUMBER
071550

PLEASE RETURN COPY
WITHE YOUR PAYMENT.

24.00IN 33.35 800.40

TOTAL 800.40

1%3,%\510 U5



Note:
Re :MFR

volumnes

(¥ e 40680 RO ‘“

Y Cooat Uity

{DENT
| pae: 1A~ D
Phone:
Re-Order No.: _A IA I .
500 Mason Avenue
Daytona Beach, Florida 32117 Purchase Order No:
Telephane 904-252-7351
f. .~ o FAX 9042540657 \
s ge .} . Price  Total
1“:/.6(9’(5 Description “ 17 Each Amount -
) ] . ° . B o
edort Thgeps * AOOC

e fopzt “{abs

T

ppoet Vext

; =

20 L30T /Y000

*UOjEI €0 3 seTvee Charge Q-.arges:
s COD or net 10 Sy,
€ guudis Bueyer agrees o
| wneys fee i buyert arcourx Tax
omey kor cofecon
- Freight
> .
- Deposits:

Tocat: AHFE= 2/ 0.0

[ s WY

P@, ST of 95
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fb’* ‘//_:f_".

- -

— Pt T

,, 40871 XITO 5

TRl Cost obilily

INDEPENDENT ; .
- Dare: lf; ‘2 ?-C} > . =
fhone: =
=
500 Avere Re-Order No.: 22511 = itioned the Florida
Daytona Beach, Floda 32117 purchase Orvder No: = nformation is pro-
Telephone 904-252-735! = :
P R 4 N T M a FAX 9042540657 —_
b4
. Price Total -
- Description A
o Fach 0: iry for us to apply
1%003 Rode Tncrecse Leltre i rY of the state. Our
12000 f}.v:_ofdpps sapital investment
- : 2 during 1988.
|
. =
Dl A &2 e #edim = | we served 7,900
A to invest an addi-
P/ ' = npliance with the
- ;
e The major addi-
-/00~ -+ 00 S .
/5% / qubd //7762 g y million, and has
1\4\4\ reased the treat-
.- ]( (\{' \ v%\ | It wastewater dis-
‘;(4 «
P doe s ae sk 03 sk e Charges: ,:) jA1— I\ | vestment w:s fc:r
of V% per meonth. Terwns COD o et Jumping and col-
pomarmemmn e e /2226 P
7 wmed over I An aaomey kor coleovon.
Freight: -
\C-Wﬂz:o:waw . ~
anvry. Retrtn to Orice .
Depasits: , .
Pt Home Orfice - ally these invest-
Gdld: Accouneng - Totak: ;? 24?‘2@
Signalure: )
e et wmtte e e v U WS HILIUUCU [ VUL tate Ddse dna ine rate ot return we can earn

will be decided by the FPSC in a process called a rate case. This process will take approx-
imately one year to complete. The FPSC staff will conduct a thorough analysis of our water
and wastewater systems, the prudency of the investments, our operational effectiveness
and service rendering efficiency. They will then make recommendations to the FPSC
Commissioners who have been appointed by the Governor and who will then decide what

(over)

A Subnidiary ol ITT Corpoention 2 Utility Drive. Palin Coust. Florida 32137 < 904/445-3311 « FAX 904/445-1880
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| Invoice No. '. 4 2 3 8 2
“ A Ceest u+xj.+\]/

INDEPENDENT

Date: 3‘22 ~Q(é

Phone:
Re-Order No.: a7gl ‘
500 Mason Avenue

Daytona Beach, Florida 32117 Purchase Order No: / 7 2/ 3
. Telephone 904-252-7351 ;-
P R« ~ T 1 N a FAX904-254-0657

Note . oy Description Eoen Ammant
Re: Cusfomer - 400 Notice  Lekees 1&37 %
Motic 72003 Fio £nvelopes
(9,000 YAl porEss
DeldTe 52 Sor Mal (.{3
/31b =00 - 0000 A2
e remormecsss  Crarges_____ |83 )=
By acceptance of these goods buyer agrees (o Tax: /2'7. %

pay a reasonabie Attomeys fee if buyer's account
is tumed over 10 an attomey for coflecon.

T S T Freight:
4 o oY e White: Customer
Canary: Return to Office .
Fink: Home Office Deposits:
Goid: Accounting /W
Total: :
Signature:

B.A of 5



Re: Customer
Motice

{ new custo m6r5>

Invoice No.

42625

Dl Ces © {4/47/

INDEPENDENT

Date; Z—/~§- - ?&’
Phone:

Re-Order No.: ,2 S 7 25

Purchase Order No:

500 Mason Avenue

Daytona Beach, Florida 32117
Telephone 904-252-7351

P R 1 N T 1 N a FAX904-254-0657

. Price Total
Qty. Description Each Amount
“ ) A=y
[0 Sttt ShALet e,
|| ,/077 opo0. L0 AdD
v
Ay g A /ﬂd(e)f%é

SR

T it

ARy
4

Past cue accounts are SLDJECT 1o A service charge
of 1%% per month. Terrms COD or net 10 gavs.
By acceptance of these goods Duyer agrees (0
pay a reasonabie Attorneys fee ¥ buyer’s accourk
is tumed over to an attomney for cosecnon.

White: Customer
Canary: Return o Office
Pink: Horme Office
Gotd: Accounung

Charges: / /0& =
Tax: % / A r;{)

Freight:

Deposits:

FEELD [ 2/

Total:

o / —

Fy. 9o oF-915



// . (I‘ Invoice No. 45 1 1 4 (
Ez;ah!LﬁZﬁDSf LJ%&“%y
| Rlo -|00-0000- KA

Date: \;(;‘ / “4(0
Phone:

Re-Order No.: 2721 ‘
500 Mason Avenue

Daytona Beach, Florica 32117 Purchase Order No:

INDEPENDENT

Telephone 904-252-7351 - —
P R 1 N T 1 N g FAX904254-0657 / 7C &5
Qty. Description 2;’::: AL":::“

N 1_ (BPNDce L 7 Fave ]
olTe -
Qe/" Iv\fer(’\’\
Tincrews<
o Her Lfoettees - 0 Lxes 2/ 300
v = Y foxes @dxo 1 E@Ao

2eld To R-2 ﬂm%:ﬂgf

AL’

bR

e

ol

&=
Past due accounts are subyecT to a service charge Charges: /@7
of 1%% per morxh. Terms COO or net 10 days. -
By acceptance of these goods buyer agrees to Tax: /27?7
Py a reasonable Aomeys fee ¥ buyer’s accourt g
is tumed over to an adomey for cotlection.
Freight
White: Customer
Canary: Retun to Office T
Pink: Home Office Deposits:
G ssoreng /255y
- Total: ]

Signature: /y\é‘; . , é/ O,QL\-\

R.al ot 19




Nlote

Al e e
o Mot <

N
@ Q\

onT ?‘fco(\!x\j

. L,
e o [ on
G2
e AIEU
Qt Descriot - .M?‘Ngrice Totat
Y- escrigtion ) = zch Amount
JA000| Notice LeHeqs | | V7 ok
|
1
T'; ’{) Con ’f ‘s,'r'i,’l:’fu

Total
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PALM COAST UTILITY CORPORATION B AAK P

CHECK REQUEST

3-26-7¢

DATE:

DRAW CHECK d S P/)ﬂ‘m C(\err—

.70 THE ORDER OF: NAME :
. - ]
STREET Q“”\Cé' § 6

cITY STATE 2IP CODE

ACCOUNTING CODE
AMOUN U
OUNT scct | BR | o | cos

Aa’m‘vﬁé pOS"‘«{L S AR »’r\c,,A,Q
186 16T ke 20 Rt Thcrwea S Trs

REASON FOR REQUEST

/’Z oo bbg TOTAL AMOUNT OF CHECK
y4

APPROVEDBY:. Z é//""? : | : % 013 O-F' 95

[ —
./ CHECK REQUIRED BY: - ‘ e




CHECK REQUEST

DRAW CHECK - .0+
NAME

' VENDOR

U Z 00

BATCH
¢ R O o) 4

AAK

DATE: _ 6’/“-%4' "

/// § .%4,75744 cr
Peon 1 L
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- 1
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}£7A~/271 | {ilo,: z:j%’
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£l
«AQQ

-
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[ A
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PAGR 1

ROLLINS HUDIG H AL LOF NEW YORK

BOND PREMIUM REPORT PRINCIPAL: ITT COMMUNITY DEVELOPMENT CORPORATION
FOR PBRIOD;; ADDRESS: ATTN: DALERE PEDERSEN

PRODUCER: ROLLINS HUDIG HALL OF NEW YORK

TWO WORLD TRADE CENTER, NEW YORK, NY 10048
APR 1996 EXECUTIVE OFFICE (212) 441-2421
PALM COAST , FL 32051 ACCOUNT #:
ACCOUNT #: 318120
ITRM EXPIRATION BOND BOND
NUMBER . DATE AMOUNT DESCRIPTION PREMIUM OBLIGEE BTATE RENEWAL
1. K04332106-00502 04/04/97 796,200 RATE REFUNDING BOND ~NEW) 2,436 FLORIDA PUBLIC SERVICE COMMISS FL res AROSRED W’)\{ Pitown hop ‘i“‘ik\

AMANRARAARA DRINCIPAL TOTAL ARARARAAAR
PREMIUM: $2,436

i

SL4° Sb ot

Check should be mailed tot E\W\ Cmi)+ U{' \‘LS QOLED '

Ma. Debra A. Deming, AVP

Rollins Rudig Hall of New York

Two World Trade Center, 103rd. Floor
New York, NY 10048 '




