JAMES S. ALVES

BRIAN H. BIBEAU
RICHARD S. BRIGHTMAN
KEVIN B. COVINGTON
PETER C. CUNNINGHAM
RALPH A. DeMEO
RANDOLPH M, GIDDINGS
WILLIAM H., GREEN
WADE L, HOPPING
GARY K, HUNTER, JR.
JONATHAN T. JOHNSON
ROBERT A. MANNING
FRANK E. MATTHEWS
RICHARD D. MELSON
ANGELA R. MORRISON

HoprPING GREEN SAMS & SMITH
PROFESSIONAL ASSOCIATION

ATTORNEYS AND COUNSELORS
123 SOUTH CALHOUN STREET
POST OFFICE BOX 65286
TALLAHASSEE, FLORIDA 32314
(850) 222-7500
FAX (850) 224-855|
FAX (850) 425-3415

Writer's Direct Dial No.
(850) 425-2313

ORIGINAL

GARY V., PERKO
MICHAEL P, PETROVICH
DAVID L. POWELL
WILLIAM D, PRESTON
CAROLYN S. RAEPPLE
DOUGLAS S. ROBERTS
GARY P. SAMS

TIMOTHY G. SCHOENWALDER

ROBERT P. SMITH
DAN R, STENGLE
CHERYL G. STUART
W. STEVE SYKES

T. KENT WETHERELL, I:

OF CouNsEL
ELIZABETH C. BOWMAN

GABRIEL E. NIETO
1
L

ERIC 7. OLSEN

June 11, 1999 ¥
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Ms. Blanca S. Bayd o =
Director, Records & Reporting Ty
Florida Public Service Commission = gj
2540 Shumard Oak Boulevard T Q;

Tallahassee, FL 32399-0850 =
w O

Re: Mid-County Services, Inc. - Docket No. 971065-SU

\

Dear Ms. Bayb: ’ -

Enclosed for filing, on behalf of Mid-County Sérvices,
Inc., are the original and fifteen copies of its Raﬂ\MCagg"‘“«;_~

Expense Exhibit (CJWé).
If you have any questions regarding this filing,

/| TA7EN

please call.
Very truly yours,

Aithana Fees

Richard D. Melso

RDM/clp
Enclosures

AFA | cc: Ms. Brubaker

APP T Mr. Wenz
CAF _ Mr. Rasmussen
CMU Mr. Seidman
CTR _____
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CERTIFICATE OF SERVICE

I HEREBY CERTIFY that a copy of the foregoing was furnished

to the following by hand delivery this 11th day of June, 1999,

Jennifer Brubaker

Division of Legal Services
Florida Public Service Commission
Room 370

2540 Shumard Oak Boulevard
Tallahassee, FL 32399-0850

Steve Burgess

Office of Public Counsel
111 W. Madison Street
Tallahassee, F1 32399-1400

=2 [

Attorney



Mid-County Services, Inc.
Docket No. 971065-SU

ORIGINAL

EXHIBIT
(CJIW6)
Docket No. 971065-SU

RATE CASE EXPENSE
1) 2 3 @ &)
ACTUAL ESTIMATED TOTAL
Per Additional Costs to Final
Description PAA Order Costs to Date Final Order Cost
Filing Fee $ 3500 $ - $ - $ 3,500
Legal 11,135 14,280 15,000 40,415
Postage, Printing 6,806 - - 6,806
Travel - - 1,500 1,500
MFR Preparation & Filing 28,765 - - 28,765
Expert Witnesses - 4,180 8,035 12,215
Discovery, Testimony, & Hearing - 15,258 5,040 20,298
Total Current Case $ 50,206 $ 33718 $ 29575 $ 113,499
Unamortized Prior Rate Case 44,753 - - 44,753
Total Rate Case Exp. to Be Amort. $ 94,959 $ 33,718 $ 29,575 $ 158,252
Annual Amortization - REVISED $ 23740 $ 8430 $  73%4 $ 39,563
Annual Amortization Per MFRs 31,241 - - 31,241
Adjustment $ (7,501) 3 8,430 $ 7,394 3 8,322
DOCUMENT %2R -DATE



HorrING GREEN SAMS & SMITH
PROFESSIONAL ASSOCIATION

ATTORNEYS AND COUNSELORS

et

—_

STATEMENT

May 19, 1999
e e ST e 6

Billed through 04/30/99

W PP

Bill number ,' UTIL 00104- 103 RDM

T fhints

et BRS

Utilities, Inc.
c¢/o Ms. PhilAnn Scully

2335 Sanders Road K ,”& e o
Northbrook, IL 60062 N T N W R SRS Y R >

!33‘*" wiwm,“.}‘ 'gw‘,ffu:ll‘ P
Lake Utilities Limited Proceeding " R

¥

P s ey -
B £ Maery 3 (A s A e, SR A

FOR PROFESSIONAL SERVICES RENDERED

04/06/99 RDM Confer with Wenz re preparation of tariffs for
filing next week.

04/12/99 RDM Voice mail to Wenz re tariff sheets.

04/13/99 RDM Prepare customer notice of rate decrease and
e-mail to client for approval; voice-mail to Wenz
re status of tariff filing.

04/14/99 RDM Finalize materials for filing of tariff sheets
and customer notice.

Richard D. Melson .50 hrs 215 /hr

.10
.00

.30

hrs

hrs

hrs

Total fees for this matter S

DISBURSEMENTS

Copying Charges
Long Distance
Postage
Facsimiles
Mileage

PSC Copies

Total disbursements for this matter S
Mid-County 1996 Test Year Rate Case

FOR PROFESSIONAL SERVICES RENDERED

04/01/99 RDM Review prefiled testimony of Biddy and Larkin.

POST OFFICE BOX 6526 0 TALLAHASSEE, FLORIDA 32314 0 (850! 222-7500
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HorPrPiING GREEN SAMS & SMITH
PROFESSIONAL ASSOCIATION

ATTORNEYS AND COUNSELORS

STATEMENT e

Utilities, Inc.
Bill number UTIL-00104-103 RDM

04/06/99 RDM Telephone call with Wenz re OPC’s testimony and
need for 1998 sales and customer information to
proceed with settlement discussions; attempt to
contact Seidman re schedule for rebuttal. .10 hrs

04/12/99 RDM Voice mail to Wenz re customer/revenue
information for settlement negotiations. .00 hrs

04/20/99 RDM Review docket file; confer with Merchant re ,
possible settlement. ' .10 hrs

04/21/99 RDM Telephone call from Rasmussen re status of case;
review of staff prefiled testimony; prepare
outline of parties positions and settlement
values; confer with Seidman re schedule for
rebutal preparation; e-mail to Wenz. 3.90 hrs

04/22/99 RDM Confer with Wenz re status of case, rebuttal and
settlement; telephone call to Seidman re starting

rebuttal preparation. .20 hrs
04/26/95 RDM Teléphone call from Wenz; provide copy of OPC

data request. .00 hrs
04/29/99 RDM Telephone call from Burgess re potential

depositions of staff witnesses and re settlement

posture of case. ‘ .20 hrs
04/30/99 RDM Telephone conference with Wenz.

, .20 hrs

Richard D. Melson ' . 5.60 hrs 215 /hr 1,204.00

Total fees for this matter $ 1,204.00
DISBURSEMENTS

Copying Charges 137.75

Long Distance 4.47

Facsimiles 5.00

Federal Express 34.00

Mileage 5.76

Total disbursements for this matter S 186.98
BILLING SUMMARY

Richard D. Melson 6.10 hrs 215 /hr 1,311.50

TOTAL FEES $ 1,311.50

POST OFFICE BOX 6526 00 TALLAHASSEE, FLORIDA 32314 0 (850) 222-7500
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HorPrPING GREEN SAMS & SMITH
PROFESSIONAL ASSOCIATION

ATTORNEYS AND COUNSELORS

STATEMENT PAGE 3
Utilities, Inc.
Bill number UTIL-00104-103 RDM
TOTAL DISBURSEMENTS $ 332.28
TOTAL CHARGES FOR THIS BILL $ 1,643.78

POST OFFICE BOX 6526 [] TALLAHASSEE, FLORIDA 32314 0 (850) 222-7500



P.O. Box 13427
Tallahassee, FL 32317-3427
Phone or Fax (850) 877-0673
www.pixels.net/m&r e-mail: frankden@ieee.org

Management & Regulatory Consultants, Inc.

MS. PHILANN SCULLY
UTILITIES, INC.

2335 SANDERS ROAD
NORTHBROOK, ILL 60062

CONSULTING - MID-COUNTY SERVICES, INC.

04/26/99

EXPENSES
04/27/99
04/27/99
04/28/98

PAYMENTS
04/22/99

PREVIOUS BALANCE

DOCKET NO. 971065=-SU
FS CONSULTING - TRAVEL T/F PINELLAS CO.;
TOUR PLANT; MEET W/UTILITY PERSONNEL;
COMMENCE DRAFT OF REBUTTAL TESTIMONY.
FOR CURRENT SERVICES RENDERED

LODGING

MEALS (B, L,D)

MILEAGE 311 MILES @ $.35/MI
TOTAL EXPENSES

AND CREDITS FOR EXPENSES

BALANCE DUE

O }

o e d e =
AR A NS,

RO

ST TN
705/17 /99w
“ .OO//{’(’(":”;
\\MMWM—-«-’_._“.M- e .

$ 760.00
HOURS
14.00 1330.00

14.00 $1330.00

TN
L~ §7567.62 .

i -
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HorrPiING GREEN SAMS & SMITH
PROFESSIONAL ASSOCIATION

ATTORNEYS AND COUNSELORS

Utilities,

c/o Ms.

STATEMENT

ch 19, 1999..° o

e i e = . e
’ [ -

ar

Billed through 02/28/99

e e A ey

ey,

Bill number © UTIL-00101-130' RDM

it

Inc. P ,;f~
PhilAnn Scully e, e VIR E I

2335 Sanders Road R AR - - }
Northbrook, IL 60062 R Tt LN S _

Lake Utilities Limited Proceeding

~—— S e o

FOR PROFESSIONAL SERVICES RENDERED oo,
sprer = .

02/01/99

02/03/99

02/04/99

02/08/99

02/09/99

02/10/99

RDM

numbers to utility sources; review document
production request from OPC; prepare for
settlement meeting; telephone conference with
Wenz re settlement parameters; settlement meeting
at PSC; debriefing with Wenz. ' 4.90 hrs

Review Larkin testimony and attempt to verifyj,/&S ~4¥f%__j‘i

e

Telephone call from Merchant re issue regarding
advances for construction; telephone call to Wenz ,
re same; leave voice mail for Merchant. .7 .20 hrs

Preliminary review of motion to dismiss;
telephone call from Vaccaro re same. .30 hrs

Confer with client re strategy for responding to
discovery request; telephone call from Jaber re
scheduling of agenda on motion to dismiss;
telephone call to Vaccaro re status of staff
testimony and potential settlement calculations;
prepare objection to OPC’s discovery request;

file and serve same. 1.50 hrs

Review staff’s prefiled testimony; confer with
Vaccaro re ambiguities in testimony; leave
voice-mail for Wenz; e-mail to Wenz with analysis
of testimony and need to continue to discuss

settlement strategy. 2.40 hrs

Research re standard for motions to dismiss;

prepare draft response to OPC’s motion to dismiss

and forward to client for review; confer with

Erin Nichols re getting Wenz sign-off on response

to motion to dismiss and re response to staff

audit report; telephone call to Vaccaro re

possible extension of time; confer with Willis re

staff’s review of 1997; telephone conference with

Erin re various filing issues; finalize and file

response to motion to dismiss. 4.60 hrs

POST OFFICE BOX 6526 O TALLAHASSEE. FLORIDA 32314 0 (850) 222-7500



Horpring GREEN SAMS & SMITH
PROFESSIONAL ASSOCIATION

ATTORNEYS AND COUNSELORS

500§

STATEMENT

Utilities,

Bill number

02/11/99

02/12/99

02/15/99

02/16/99

02/17/99

02/18/99

02/19/99

02/22/99

02/23/899

RDM

RDM

RDM

Inc.

UTIL-00101-130 RDM

Attempt to contact Wenz (still ill); telephone
call to McLean re extension of time; telephone
call to Vaccaro re same; telephone conference
with Willis re remaining settlement
possibilities; report to Rasmussen on status of
case and staff’s positions; prepare and file
request for extension of time; review materials
re staff audit report.

Telephone call from Shreve re data status and
settlement; telephone call from Vaccaro re status
of extension of time order; prepare draft
prehearing statement and e-mail to client for
comment.

Telephone conference with Wenz re status of case;
finalize and file prehearing statement.

Attend PSC agenda conference and present argument
on motion to dismiss; settlement conversations
with Shreve and Vaccaro; report to client.

Prepare notice and obtain staff approval; attempt
to contact Willis; confer with Vaccaro re staff
settlement position; telephone conference with
Shreve; confer with Rasmussen re notice;
voice-mail report to Wenz; confer with Wenz;
settlement discussions with Shreve and Vaccaro.

Confer with Shreve; confer with Wenz; telephone
calls from Vaccaro; prepare draft settlement
agreement; telephone call to McLean.

Confer with Wenz re settlement agreement and
deposition availability; revise draft agreement;
forward same to Shreve; attempt to contact Shreve
re Monday meeting; telephone call from McLean re
additional depositions; notify Wenz re same.

Telephone conference with Vaccaro to report on
status of negotiations with OPC; meeting with
Shreve re possible settlement; report to Wenz and
memo re settlement discussions and current

options.

Telephone call from Vandiver; prepare transmittal
letter and forward customer list to Vandiver;
telephone call from Wenz re settlement; telephone
call to McLean/Shreve; report to Wenz; telephone
call from Rasmussen re settlement status; prepare
draft notice of voluntary dismissal; meet with
Shreve; telephone calls with Wenz; prepare
revised settlement language; telephone call from

Vaccaro. -

POST OFFICE BOX 6526 O TALLAHASSEE, FLORIDA 32314 0 (880} 222-7500

PAGE

.80

.80

.60

3.40

hrs

hrs

hrs

hrs

hrs

hrs

hrs

hrs

hrs
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Horppring GREEN SAMS & SMITH
PROFESSIONAL ASSOCIATION

ATTORNEYS AND COUNSELORS

STATEMENT
PAGE

Utilities, Inc.

Bill number
02/24/99 RDM

02/25/99 RDM

DISBURSEMENTS

UTIL-00101-130 RDM

Finalize settlement agreement language; confer

with Wenz; settlement meeting with Shreve;

prepare alternative versions of agreement based

on Shreve’s best and final offer; confer with

Wenz re final sticking points; telephone call

from Vaccaro re settlement status; confer with

Wenz to get final sign-off; communicate same to

Shreve and Vaccaro. 4.90

Report to Rasmussen re settlement; confer with

Vaccaro re cancellation of hearing and timetable

for PSC approval of settlement; telephone call

from Shreve re language in agreement. .40

Richard D. Melson 37.80 hrs 215 /hr 8,127.

Total fees for this matter S 8,127.

Copying Charges
Long Distance
Facsimiles
Mileage

Total disbursements for this matter ' S 252.

Mid-County 1996 Test Year Rate Case

FOR PROFESSIONAL SERVICES RENDERED

02/02/99 RDM
02/05/99 RDM

02/08/99 RDM

Telephone debriefing with Wenz. .20

Review Wenz draft testimony; prepare outline of
additional questions and answers required;

outline required exhibits; telephone call to Wenz

re coordination of additional drafting; telephone

call from Seidman; review Wenz second draft and

suggest additional refinements; additional-

conference with Wenz. 4.90

Review Seidman final testimony; review Wenz

testimony and exhibits and provide final

comments; prepare pro forma testimony for

Rasmussen to sponsor engineering exhibits; review
additional documents responsive to OPC’'s request

no. 29; prepare response and notice of service;

finalize and file three pieces of direct

testimony and discovery response. 2.40

POST OFFICE BOX 6526 0O TALLAHASSEE, FLORIDA 32314 0 (8501 222-7500

3

hrs

hrs

hrs

hrs
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HopriINg GREEN SaMs & SMITH
PROFESSIONAL ASSOCIATION

ATTORNEYS AND COUNSELORS

STATEMENT G

Utilities, Inc.

Bill number

02/11/99 RDM

02/19/99 RDM

02/22/99 RDM

02/23/995 RDM

DISBURSEMENTS

UTIL-00101-130 RDM

Confer with Rasmussen re OPC’s discovery
requests; conference call with Burgess to review
requests and agree on response date. .40

Prepare response and notice of service of

response to OPC’s 5th request for production;

telephone call from Burgess re 6th request being

served today. .40

File response to OPC’s 5th PODs; confer with
Rasmussen re response tO 6th PODs re construction

and operating permits. .30

Finalize and serve response to OPC’s 6th POD;
telephone call from Burgess re re-inspection of

tax returns. .40
Richard D. Melson 9.00 hrs 215 /hr 1,935.
Total fees for this matter $ 1,935.
Copying Charges 554,
Long Distance 3.
Postage : 6
Facsimiles ' . 34.
Federal Express : ' 9.
Mileage 25.
Total disbursements for this matter $ 634.

BILLING SUMMARY

Richard D. Melson : 46.80 hrs 215 /hr 10,062.
TOTAL FEES éié:ééé:
TOTAL DISBURSEMENTS $ 886.
TOTAL CHARGES FOR THIS BILL éié:éié:

POST OFFICE BOX 6526 O TALLAHASSEE, FLORIDA 32314 0 (850) 222-7500

hrs

hrs

hrs
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Hopring GREEN SAMS & SMITH
PROFESSIONAL ASSOCIATION l'
ATTORNEYS AND COUNSELORS

STATEMENT

Aprll 16, 1999f

—-N.,_..,U.“.,, i 1A

Billad through 03/3;/99

- ”“\.
Bill number ~ UTIL 00104 102 RDM -
Utilities, Inc. ' : _ ‘
c/o Ms. PhilAnn Scully RSO TNV AR R booga
2335 Sanders Road VAR
Northbrook, IL 60062 : R T —
R GRS T A R : REG TR
NG i,

Lake Utilities Limited Proceeding e s e
FOR PROFESSIONAL SERVICES RENDERED

03/01/99 RDM Telephone call from Vaccaro; confer with
Rasmussen re publlcatlon of notice of
cancellation; confer with Wenz re PSC issue on
binding future commissions; obtain prior orders
approving similar settlements. .70 hrs

03/02/99 RDM Telephone call from Merchant re interpretation of
settlement agreement; confer with Vaccaro re
status of staff recommendation. .50 hrs

03/03/99 RDM Telephone call from Vaccaro re uniform meter
connection and miscellaneous charges; confer with

Shreve and Wenz re same. .30 hrs
03/11/99 RDM Review staff recommendation, first PAA order and

settlement re AFPI charges. .40 hrs
03/12/99 RDM Review staff recommendation and prior orders re

AFPI; telephone call (voice mail) to Wenz. .20 hrs
03/16/99 RDM Attend PSC agenda conference re approval of

settlement; report to Wenz re same. 1.20 hrs

Richard D. Melson 3.30 hrs 215 /hr 709.50

Total fees for this matter $ 709.50
D I SBURS EMENTS e e “"“‘.":',‘,':.'.......‘...‘N\

Copying Charges oL L. 32.25

Long Distance ‘:ﬁ ; 5 A8 S 3.98

Postage . =T - 19.35

POST OFFICE BOX 6526 O TALLAHASSEE, FLORIDA 32314 0 (8301 222-7800



HoprriNG GREEN SamMs & SMITH
PROFESSICNAL ASSOCIATION

ATTORNEYS AND COUNSELORS

Utilities, Inc.

Bill number

Mid-County 1996 Test Year Rate Case

FOR PROFESSIONAL SERVICES RENDERED

03/02/99 RDM

03/03/99 RDM

03/04/99 RDM

03/08/99 RDM

03/10/99 RDM

03/15/99 RDM

03/24/95 RDM

03/25/99 RDM

DISBURSEMENTS

BILLING SUMMARY

STATEMENT SReE—
UTIL-00104-102 RDM

Facsimiles T 1.00
Mileage 20.80
Total disbursements for this matter $ 77.38
Telephone call from Burgess re possible site
inspection; telephone conference with Ramussen re
same. .40 hrs
Telephone call from Burgess re engineering site
inspection.
, .10 hrs
Conversations with Rasmussen and Burgess re
proposed site inspections. .20 hrs
Telephone call from Burgess; telephone call from
Rasmussen. .20 hrs
Various telephones conferences with Rasmussen and
Burgess re OPC site inspection. .40 hrs
Telephone call to Wenz and Rasmussen re AFPI;
telephone call to Vaccaro. o .20 hrs
Telephone conference with Rasmussen re OPC’s site
visit and re prefiled testimony. .30 hrs
Prepare transmittal and apology letter for refund
reports; e-mails to Wenz re open issues. .60 hrs
Richard D. Melson 2.40 hrs 215 /hr 516.00
Total fees for this matter $ 516.00
Copying Charges 10.00
Long Distance 5.65
Facsimiles 3.00
Total disbursements for this matter S 18.65
Richard D. Melson ' 5.70 hrs 215 /hr 1,225.50
TOTAL FEES $ 1,225.50

PCST OFFICE BOX 6526 O TALLAHASSEE, FLORIDA 32314 0 (850) 222-7500



HorppiNg GREEN SAMS & SMITH
PROFESSIONAL ASSOCIATION

ATTORNEYS AND COUNSELORS

= STATEMENT R
Utilities, Inc.
Bill number UTIL-00104-102 RDM
TOTAL DISBURSEMENTS : $ 96.03
TOTAL CHARGES FOR THIS BILL $ 1,321.53

POST OFFICE BOX 6526 0 TALLAHASSEE, FLORIDA 32314 0(850) 222-7500



P.Q. Box 13427
Tallahassee, FL 32317-3427
Phone or Fax (850) 877-0673
www.pixels.net/ma&r e-mail: frankden@ieee.org

Management & Regulatory Consultants, inc.

MS. PHILANN SCULLY e
UTILITIES, INC. -
2335 SANDERS ROAD

5009

NCRTHBROOK, ILL 60062 O3£20/9.9/ B ',""'"‘
20021'00: TR

CONSULTING -~ MID-COUNTY SERVICES, INC.

PREVIOUS BALANCE $ 2090.00
‘ HOURS
DOCKET NO. 971065-SU
02/01/99 FS CONSULTING - TELEPHONE
CONFERENCES W/MELSON, RASMUSSEN;
TEST IMPUTATION: REVISE
TESTIMONY; RESEARCH LAST CASE
STAFF POSITIONS. 8.00 760.00
FOR CURRENT SERVICES RENDERED 8.00 $ 760.00
PAYMENTS AND CREDITS FOR EXPENSES
02/22/99 - 2090.00
BALANCE DUE ' T $ 760. oo
| (Z Z/

HRCoLaT= [iv32

e 4

T e s s s s



w A [ Invoice No: ~ 7-611-86530
g:}( Invoice Date: Feb 27,1999
Federa, aprass ﬁ;ggusn; L\qug;ber: 0606-2634-0
Reference Detail
Picked up: Feb 22, 1999 Payor: Shipper Reference: MID COUNTY R/C
o Distance Based Pricing, Region 5
Airbifl 809513204703 Sender Recigient
Service Type  FedEx Priority Overnight CWENZ RICHARD MELSON ESQ
Package Type  FedEx Box UTILITIES INC HOPPING GREEN SAMS & SMITH
Region 5 2335 SANDERS RD 123 SOUTH CALHOUN ST
Pieces 1 NORTHBROOK iL 60062-6196 US TALLAHASSEE FL 32314-0000 US
Weight 201bs
Delivered Feb 23,1999 09:35 .
Service Transportation Charge 19.05
Area Code AA Total Transportation Charges Usos 19.05
Signed by S.OLSTEAD
Reference Detail Subtotal Usbs$ 19.05

FedEx Internal Use: 005427772/02964/_/_




HorriNg GREEN SAMS & SMITH
PROFESSIONAL ASSOCIATION

ATTORNEYS AND COUNSELORS

STATEMENT

Utilities,

c/o Ms.

February 12, 1999"”

—_—

e e T

Bllled through 01/31/99

o s,

Bill number UTIL OOlOl 128 RDM

Y e

Inc.
PhilAnn Scully

2335 Sanders Road
Northbrook,

IL 60062 . - Ly

Lake Utilities Limited Proceeding

FOR PROFESSIONAL SERVICES RENDERED

01/04/99
01/08/99

01/12/99

01/14/99
01/19/99

01/20/99

01/22/99

01/26/99

01/27/99

01/28/99

RDM
RDM

RDM

RDM

RDM

Supervise filing of testimony.

Telephone call from Vaccaro re utility prefiled
testimony and other procedural matters.

Telephone call from Shreve re prospects for
further settlement negotiations; brain-strorm re
possible settlement approaches.

Organize files.

Telephone conversation with Shreve re possible
gsettlement.

Confer with Vaccaro re notice of hearing, OPC
public records request for audit papers, and
ongoing settlement discussions.

Telephone call from Wenz and telephone call to
Shreve re scheduling settlement meeting.

Telephone call from Wenz re scope of data request
and need to reschedule meeting; contact Shreve to

reschedule meeting; further conversations with
Shreve re possible settlement.

Telephone call to Shreve re non-receipt of OPC

testimony; telephone call from Vaccaro re overdue

interim rate reports; telephone call to Wenz re
same and re Shreve’s desire to meet this week on
LUSI settlement.

Confer with Shreve.

POST OFFICE BOX 6526 O TALLAHASSEE, FLORIDA 32314 0O (850) 222-7500

.00 hrs

.30 hrs

.40 hrs

.40 hrs

.20 hrs

.30 hrs

.20 hrs

.30 hrs

.40 hrs

.10 hrs



HoprrPiING GREEN SAMSs & SMITH
PROFESSIONAL ASSOCIATION

ATTORNEYS AND COUNSELORS

4209

STATEMENT

Utilities,

Bill number

01/29/99

DISBURSEMENTS

RDM

Inc.

UTIL-00101-128 RDM

Telephone conversations with Shreve, Wenz, and
Vaccaro re scheduling of settlement meetings;
confer with Wenz re approach to discussions;
forward updated interim rate reports to Wenz.

Richard D. Melson 3.20 hrs 215 /hr

Total fees for this matter

Copying Charges
Long Distance
Facsimiles

Total disbursements for this matter

Mid-County 1996 Test Year Rate Case

FOR PROFESSIONAL SERVICES RENDERED

01/05/99

01/06/99

01/11/99
01/14/99

01/15/99

01/19/99

RDM

Confer with Wenz re response to remaining
document production request and re scope of
upcoming testimony.

Review Florida Cities and Southern States court
decisions; confer with counsel for utilities re
status of cases on remand; memo to Wenz re
implications for Mid-County case and upcoming
testimony.

Telephone call to Wenz re upcoming testimony for
rate case; call Seidman to check on availability

and dates.

Telephone call from Burgess re discovery issues;
confer re possibility of meaningful settlement
discussions; organize files.

Attempt to reach Wenz re preparation of
testimony.

Telephone conference with Wenz re issues and
preparation of testimony; telephone call to
Seidman re used and useful testimony; meet with
Seidman to discuss used and useful issues and
history of Mid-County cases; confer with Shreve
re possible settlement meeting.

POST OFFICE BOX 6526 O TALLAHASSEE, FLORIDA 32314 0 (850) 222-7500

PAGE

.30

.30

.80

.00

hrs

hrs

hrs

hrs

hrs

hrs

hrs



HorrPING GREEN SaMS & SMITH
PROFESSIONAL ASSOCIATION

ATTORNEYS AND COUNSELORS

4207

STATEMENT

Utilities,

Bill number

01/20/99

01/21/99

01/25/99%

01/26/99

01/27/99

01/28/99

01/29/99

DISBURSEMENTS

RDM

RDM

RDM

Inc.

UTIL-00101-128 RDM

Telephone call from Burgess re OPC decision to
hold further discovery in abeyance; discuss
issues in case and basis for possible settlement.

Telephone conference with Gatlin re Florida
Cities used and useful issue; borrow case file
and provide to Seidman for review; meet with
Seidman re used and useful issue.

Finalize meeting arrangements with Shreve; report
to Wenz; review additional information requests
from Shreve and forward same to client; telephone
call from Shreve.

Telephone call from Seidman re scope of
testimony; telephone call to Rasmussen re
possible sponsorship of engineering MFRs and
limited testimony to provide factual support for
Seidman.

Telephone call from Seidman re Mid-County
testimony; review draft testimony and outline
comments and possible ‘additional areas of
questions/answers.

Telephone call from Wenz re scope of testimony
issues and possible extension of time to file;
obtain agreed extension from Burgess; telephone
call to Brubaker re extension; prepare and file
extension request; telephone call to Seidman to
provide comments on first draft; review
additional materials from Seidman.

Meet with Seidman and provide additional comments
on draft testimony.

Total fees for this matter

Copying Charges
Long Distance
Postage
Facsimiles
Mileage

Total disbursements for this matter

POST OFFICE BOX 6526 0 TALLAHASSEE, FLORIDA 32314 0 (850) 222-7500

PAGE

.50

.90

.30

.30

.90

.20

‘Richard D. Melson 9.40 hrs 215 /hr 2,021.

hrs

hrs

hrs

hrs

hrs

hrs



/709

HorriNg GREEN SAMS & SMITH
PROFESSIONAL ASSOCIATION

ATTORNEYS AND COUNSELORS

STATEMENT PAGE 2
Utilities, Inc.
Bill number UTIL-00101-128 RDM
BILLING SUMMARY
Richard D. Melson 12.60 hrs 215 /hr 2,709.00
TOTAL FEES $ 2,709.00
TOTAL DISBURSEMENTS S 296.17
TOTAL CHARGES FOR THIS BILL @ S 3,005.17

POST OFFICE BOX 6526 O TALLAHASSEE, FLORIDA 32314 O (850) 222-7500



2637

Tallahassee, FL 32317-3427 e
Phone or Fax (850) 877-0673 h
www.pixels.net/m&r e-mail: frankden@ieee.org

Management & Regulatory Consultants, Inc.

MS. PHILANN SCULLY
UTILITIES, INC.
2335 SANDERS ROAD

NORTHBROOK, ILL 60062 ..02/08/99
20021<00 T~ L

CONSULTING - MID-COUNTY SERVICES, INC.

PREVIOUS BALANCE | $  00.00
HOURS
DOCKET NO. 971065-SU
01/18/99 FS CONSULTING - MEET W/MELSON;
REVIEW RATE CASE DOCUMENTS;
TELEPHONE ; CONFERENCE W/RASMUSSEN;

REVIEW FCWS REMAND CASE. 6.00 570.00
01/25/99 FS CONSULTING - REVIEW PSC FILES ON PRIOR
MID-COUNTY CASES; COMMENCE DRAFTING
OF TESTIMONY & EXHIBITS; TELEPHONE
CONFERENCES W/MELSON & DEP. 16.00 1520.00
FOR CURRENT SERVICES RENDERED 22.00 $2090.00
PAYMENTS AND CREDITS FOR EXPENSES
02/08/99 - 0.00
BALANCE DUE :z 72090.00 ™

P e
e e \
e R o {ow
- “,
8
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o
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Horring GrREeN SamMs & SMiTH ,
PROFESSIONAL ASSOCIATION R,

ATTORNEYS AND COUNSELORS

=10 |

STATEMENT

January 15, 1939
Billed through 12/31/98

Bill number _UTIL-00101-126 RDM

et et g
T e e e vt et s 8+

Utilities, Inc.

c¢/o Ms. PhilAnn Scully
2335 Sanders Road P P
Northbrook, IL 60062 SR ©o

Lake Utilities Limited Proceeding
FOR PROFESSIONAL SERVICES RENDERED

12/01/98 RDM Confer with Wenz re preparation for settlement
conference with Shreve and re hearing strategy

issues.

12/07/98 RDM Telephone call from Shreve’s office re customer
and usage data requested for settlement meeting;
relay request to Wenz; confer with Wenz re
settlement issues and scenarios.

12/08/98 RDM Review prior orders in preparation for settlement
meeting with Shreve; meet with Wenz; furnish
customer and sales information to Burgess.

12/09/98 RDM Prepare for meeting with Shreve, including
analyze basis for discrepancy in refund
percentage calculations, summarize rate history,
strategy conference with Wenz, telephone
conversations with Burgess; attend settlement
meeting at Shreve’s office; post-meeting
conference with Wenz.

12/18/98 RDM Confer with Wenz re preparation of testimony;
advise Vaccaro of failure of negotiations.

12/21/98 RDM Review orders in current and prior dockets;
review previous company testimony; review
settlement materials; prepare detailed outline of
direct testimony for Wenz and forward same to
Wenz for completion and comment; telephone call
with Rasmussen re status of projects and possible
need for updated testimony.

12/22/98 RDM Telephone conference with Wenz; revise testimony
to reflect used and useful approach; locate and
edit proposed exhibits; prepare draft testimony
for Rasmussen.

POST OFFICE BOX 6526 O TALLAHASSEE, FLORIDA 32314 D (850) 222-.7500

.30 hrs

.60 hrs

3.90 hrs

5.30 hrs

.30 hrs

6.40 hrs



Hoprring GREEN SamMs & SMITH
PROFESSIONAL ASSOCIATION

ATTORNEYS AND COUNSELQORS

STATEMENT
PAGE 2

Utilities, Inc.
Bill number UTIL-00101-126 RDM X

12/23/98 RDM Confer with Wenz re final revisions to direct
testimony. .20 hrs

12/30/98 RDM Confer with Rasmussen; finalize exhibits and
testimony for filing; prepare transmittal

letter. .80 hrs

Richard D. Melson 19.70 hrs 215 /hr 4,235.50

Total fees for this matter $ 4,235.56
DISBURSEMENTS |

Copying Charges 15.75

Long Distance 54.09

Postage 3.53

Facsimiles 45.00

Mileage 4.48

Total disbursements for this matter S 122.85
Mid-County 1996 Test Year Rate Case
FOR PROFESSIONAL SERVICES RENDERED
12/01/98 RDM Review pending PODs with Wenz and identify '

objectionable regquests. .70 hrs
12/02/98 RDM Draft objections to PODs; confer with client re

draft; finalize and file objections. 1.90 hrs
12/07/98 RDM Telephone call from Burgess re upcoming responses

to document production requests. .10 hrs
12/23/98 RDM Review Wenz proposed responses to document

production requests; confer with Wenz re

intention to meld draft responses to provide more

detailed objections where applicable; follow-up

on undelivered FedEx package; telephone call to

Howe (in Burgess'’ absence) to obtain extension

until Monday to produce documents. .60 hrs
12/28/98 RDM Revise response to document production request to

merge Wenz comments; review documents to be

produced; prepare notice of service; file and

serve document production. 1.80 hrs

Richard D. Melson 5.10 hrs 215 /hr 1,096.50

POST OFFICE BOX 6526 0 TALLAHMASSEE. FLORIDA 32314 0 (850) 222-7500



Hoppring GrREEN SaMs & SMITH
PROFESSIONAL ASSOCIATION

ATTORNEYS AND COUNSELORS

STATEMENT
PAGE
Utilities, Inc.
Bill number UTIL-00101-126 RDM
Total fees for this matter $ 1,086.
DISBURSEMENTS
Copying Charges 3%4.
Long Distance 2.
Postage 1.
Facsimiles 10.
Mileage 5.
Total disbursements for this matter S 413,
BILLING SUMMARY
Richard D. Melson 24.80 hrs 215 /hr 5,332.
TOTAL FEES S 5,332.
TOTAL DISBURSEMENTS $ 536.
TOTAL CHARGES FOR THIS BILL S 5,868.

POST OFFICE BOX 6526 O TALLAHASSEE, FLORIDA 32314 O (850) 222-7500



'wEx Internal Use: 035820438/02984/ /IC N .
.
357

cked up: Dec 23, 1998 * Payor: Shipper Referance: MID-COUNTY R/C

» RECIPIENT NOT iN/BUSINESS CLOSED
» Istattempt Oac 24, 1988 5t 03:56 PM.
» Distance Based Pricing, Region 5

irbill 807381175558 Sender Recipient

Service Type  FedEx Priority Overnight CWANZ RICHARD MELSON

Paclfaga Type FedEx Box UTILITIESINC HOPPING GREEN SAMS & SMITH

Rggmn 5 2335 SANDERS RD 123 SQUTH CALHOUN STREET

Pieces i NORTHBROOK !L 60062-6196 US ' TALLAHASSEE FL 32314-0000 US -

Weight 401bs

Delivered Dec 28, 1998 09:29 .

S Transportation Charges 2245
Arsa Code AA Total Transportation Charges usts 22.45

Signed by B.FENSKE Y .

Refsrenca Detail Subtotal usDs$ 70.70

FodEx Internal Use: 035813173/02884/_/08

oy
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«Kinko’s

Page 1 of 1
ae new way to office: -~

SR e LT RO POTTIR sl

Customer Administrative Services ® P.0O. Box 672085 = Dallas, TX 75267-2085

UTILITIES INC Representtive Karen Kahn

ATTN: ACCOUNTS PAYABLE Telephone 1-800-488-3705
2335 SANDERS RD Extension 3977
NORTHBROOK IL 60062 Accountsumber - 0000205290

I)(m’O’é’/O 179 8

*Invoice No. ,

‘Reference / P.O. No.  Amount

$1,395.32

» R "~ ‘Authorized User -
05/21/98,N§E§30000§139/) UTILITIES INC

S e O N e s

BRENT LAWRENCE

e e ————

Jo e | B
A oga - i BT
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* Past Due Analysis Important Message Current  §1,395.32
!
[ In response to customer requests, credits on your account will —
30 Days $0.00 now be designated with a "CR" after the dollar amount. Past D -
Kinko's appreciates all suggestions given to better serve you. If ast Due > $0.00
60 Days $0.00 you have any questions or comments, please contact your .
Customer Service Representative listed above. Thank you. — e
90 Days+ $0.00 TbmlDu<”'$1,395.32 P
i
@ 50720 recycled content Please see reverse side for important information about your Kinko's account. hitp:/Avww kinkos.com
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INVOICE
Official Bi1l of Sale

[}
kinko’s s B
Please Reference Invoice # Below

The new way to office: TWOICEH 36330000870

Receipt # : 150164 Reg: 3A Page: 1
. Customer #: 0000205290 0000
I’Icmeremitpaymenllo: Customer : UTILITIES INC
Auth. User: UTILITIES INC
. ' Reference :
Kl:nl.(() S C.ustonlc'r BRENT LAWRENCE
Administrative Setvices
Date: 05/21/98 10:56 AM Co-Worker: 19
P.O. Box 672085 Qty Price Disc. Amount

Dallas, TX 75267-2085 F§ D/5 F1 Prc Special Price

vt A 144200 0.08 0.00 1153.60 T
Questions? Please call FS Add! Features Machine Stapling
o - . 1580e Q.02 0.00 31.60 T
1 800 488 3705 AUX OTHER INSERTING
15808 0.10 0.00 158.00 T

Extension: 3977
Karen Kahn

=

SUBTOTAL 1343.20
TAX 52.12
TOTAL 1395.32

SIGNATURE ON FILE

Thank you for choosing Kinko’s
Your Branch Office
I Kirko’s - The copy center (847) 205-2540

fonz . 299 SKOKIE BLVD
Signature / Name Area NORTLBROOK IL 60062

Signature clectronically reproduced.

lectronically Reproduced
Copy of Original

Visit the Kinko's Web Site at
http://www.kinkos.com

+Z )3
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Hoprrping GREEN SAaAMS & SMITH
PROFESSIONAL ASSOCIATION

ATTORNEYS AND COUNSELORS

STATEMENT —
. October 19, 1998
NP os
Billed through O9/30{9§»
Bill number U'I‘IL 00101- 116 RDM
Utilities, Inc. - T
c/o Ms. PhilAnn Scully
2335 Sanders Road
Northbrook, IL 60062
Lake Utilities Limited Proceeding
FOR PROFESSIONAL SERVICES RENDERED
09/02/98 RDM Conference with Shreve. .20 hrs
09/04/98 RDM Telephone call from Shreve; attempt to contact
Willis; confer with Wenz; confer with Shreve re
possible settlement; report to Wenz. i .50 hrs
09/11/98 RDM Review staff recommendation; forward same to
client. .40 hrs
09/14/98 RDM Telephone call from Shreve to discuss staff
recommendation. .20 hrs
09/15/98 RDM Telephone call from Vaccaro re OPC request for
deferral; telephone call from Shreve re same;
telephone conference with Rasmussen re staff
recommendation. .80 hrs
09/17/98 RDM Telephone call from Vaccaro re deferral and other
issues; confer with Wenz re prior order
requirement to file rate case. .40 hrs
09/23/98 RDM Telephone conference with Seidman re status of
S case; .10 hrs
Richard D. Melson 2.60 hrs 215 /hr 559.00
Total fees for this matter S 559.00
DISBURSEMENTS
Copying Charges 7.50
36.52

Long Distance . ‘
ong Dis anceijbf aygf§@¥§1“¢J§gl7 - Zju.ﬁi/f

POST OFFICE BOX 6526 O TALLAHASSEE, FLORIDA 32314 O (850) 222-7500 R



HopPriNg GREEN SAMsS & SMITH
PROFESSIONAL ASSOCIATION

ATTORNEYS AND COUNSELORS

915870

STATEMENT
PAGE 2
Utilities, Inc.
Bill number UTIL-00101-116 RDM
Facsimiles " 47.00
Mileage 4.48
Total disbursements for this matter $ 95.50
Mid-County 1996 Test Year Rate Case
FOR PROFESSIONAL SERVICES RENDERED
09/09/98 RDM Telephone call from Burgess re additional
document discovery. .20 hrs
09/10/98 RDM Telephone call from Burgess re additional
document discovery .20 hrs
09/14/98 RDM Telephone call from Burgess to clarify additional
document request. .20 hrs
09/15/98 RDM Telephone call from Burgess. .10 hrs
09/17/98 RDM Confer with Wenz re OPC discovery request. .10 hrs
09/23/98 RDM Review order granting change in schedule; memo to
Wenz re updated schedule and re discovery
matters. .20 hrs
Richard D. Melson _ 1.00 hrs 215 /hr 215.00
Total fees for this matter $ 215.00
DISBURSEMENTS
Copying Charges 75
Long Distance 77
- Total disbursements for this matter $ 1.52"
BILLING SUMMARY
Richard D. Melson 3.60 hrs 215 /hr 774.00
TOTAL FEES $ 774.00
TOTAL DISBURSEMENTS $ 97.02
$ 871.02

TOTAL CHARGES FOR THIS BILL Q§&J

POST OFFICE BOX 6526 O TALLARASSEE, FLORIDA 323!4 a (850} 222-7500



HoprpriNg GREEN SaAMsS & SMITH
PROFESSIONAL ASSOCIATION

ATTORNEYS AND COUNSELORS
STATEMENT

ot o, . Iy

e o _ . , FEPHEE . =
June 24, 1998° . e

e
\W_.«A—"‘ =

i1 through/os/s 1/98 "

Bill number UTIL- OOiOl 106 RDM ™7
Utilities, Inc. »yfm»’”“ ~. Ve
c/o Ms. PhilAnn Scully rs )7/in.;:.nj";}'7.fﬁ i\' e
2335 Sanders Road O e T, o j
Northbrook, IL €00s82 ‘ I T S
- O v([/ /‘!‘. . ’4" {. il N AT
Lake Utilities Limited Proceeding ~E“\\\\ B

FOR PROFESSIONAL SERVICES RENDERED

05/01/98 RDM Telephone call from Rasmussen re PSC action on
offer of settlement.

05/04/98 RDM Telephone calls from Girtman and Seidman re AFPI
issue in current rate case; review letter from
staff re AFPI tariff and forward to Kramer;
telephone call from Rasmussen re status of
tariff.

.30 hrs

05/11/98 RDM Review and file revised tariff sheets; telephone
call from Vaccaro re status of order and customer
notice; confer with Girtman and Seidman re status

of AFPI. .90 hrs

05/12/98 RDM Meet with Vaccaro re status of order and notice
and re AFPI tariff; confer with Kramer re notice. .30 hrs

05/13/98 RDM Telephone call to Rendell re AFPI tariffs;
telephone call from Vaccaro re notice; confer

with Kramer re same. .30 hrs

05/18/98 RDM Review draft notice; confer with Vaccaro. and
Merchant re same; forward to Kramer; review
order; telephone call to Kramer re same; forward

to Kramer. .70 hrs

05/19/98 RDM Confer with Vaccaro re notice. .10 hrs

05/21/98 RDM Telephone call from Beck re OPC’s problem with
PAA order; telephone call from Vaccaro re same;
contact Kramer re status of notice; telephone
conference with Davis re renoticing requirement;
confer with Kramer and Davis re same. .80 hrs

POST OFFICE BOX 6526 0 TALLAHASSEE, FLORIDA 32314 0 (850) 222-7500



TEo2|

HopriINg GREEN SaAMs & SMITH
PROFESSIONAL ASSOCIATION

ATTORNEYS AND COUNSELORS

STATEMENT
PAGE 2

Utilities, Inc.
Bill number UTIL-00101-106 RDM
05/22/98 RDM Telephone conferences with Vaccaro re mailing of

amended order; telephone calls from Shreve and

Talbot. .50 hrs
05/26/98 RDM Review approved AFPI tariffs; telephone to

Rasmussen re effective date; forward tariffs to

client. .20 hrs
05/28/98 RDM Letter re mailing of amendatory order. .20 hrs

Richard D. Melson 4.50 hrs 215 /hr 967.

Total fees for this matter

DISBURSEMENTS
Copying Charges %T;ZK 1 70.25
Long Distance ,77¢Z I 26.98
\9’\ 1.97

Postage
Facsimiles ZZZ: _
Federal Express L° 18.55

Mileage 060"0 \ 12.48

Total disbursements for this matter

Mid-County 1996 Test Year Rate Case
FOR PROFESSIONAL SERVICES RENDERED
05/01/98 RDM Revise protest per comments from Kramer. .20 hrs

05/11/98 RDM Telephone call from Kramer re protest and
possible settlement discussions. .10 hrs

05/13/98 RDM Telephone call to Brubaker re desire to schedule
settlement conference; telephone calls with

Brubaker and Kramer re schedule. .20 hrs
05/14/98 RDM Coordinate settlement meeting arrangements with

Brubaker and Kramer. .10 hrs
05/15/98 RDM Telephone call to Vaccaro re status of notice

drafting. .10 hrs
05/26/98 RDM Review order on procedure; telephone call to

Kramer re same. .20 hrs

05/28/98 RDM Confer with Kramer re strategy for meeting with
staff; settlement meeting with staff and OPC;
confer with Kramer re materials to be prepared
for submission to staff; confer with Brubaker re
motion for extension of time for direct
testimony. 3.20 hrs

POST OFFICE BOX 6526 O TALLAHASSEE, FLORIDA 32314 0 (850) 222-7500



58071

HorprPiNg GREEN SAMS & SMITH
PROFESSIONAL ASSOCIATION

ATTORNEYS AND COUNSELORS

STATEMENT
PAGE 3
Utilities, Inc.
Bill number UTIL-00101-106 RDM
05/29/98 RDM Confer with Brubaker; prepare and file request
for extensicon of time. .30 hrs

Richard D. Melson 4.40 hrs 215 /hr

Total fees for this matter

DISBURSEMENTS Q%
Copying Charges 7 / ng 55.50
Long Distance /;Vz o, 6.54
Postage ? S 1.10
Facsimiles t§7 ob 10.00
Mileage g/ ;
[}
0%
Total disbursements for this matter
'BILLING SUMMARY
Richard D. Melson 8.90 hrs 215 /hr 1,913.50
TOTAL FEES $ 1,913.50
TOTAL DISBURSEMENTS S 215.53
TOTAL CHARGES FOR THIS BILL : S 2,129.03

POST OFFICE BOX 6526 0 TALLAHASSEE, FLORIDA 32314 0 (850) 222-7500



51505

Hopring GREEN SAMS & SMITH
PROFESSIONAL ASSOCIATION

ATTORNEYS AND COUNSELORS

STATEMENT

o

July 14 14 1998

,,,,,,,,,

[ e,

Billed through 06/30/98

A P '\\
Bill number vUTIL OOlOl 107 RDM S
" e, ,.-u-**"‘" ’ N
Utilities, Inc. P I e T
c/o Ms. PhilAnn Scully 4 L7 B
2335 Sanders Road \\mmwmy/f””" _____
Northbrook, IL 60062 o e
r"w I T 9 2‘?0
Mid-County Services, Inc. Rate Case fﬁff-’uﬁ\ “ ‘b g
f.’ 040}“)/‘,&}, \l'}, iy LT
DISBURSEMENTS / . T U
: - s e S G2
Copying Charges L oLl e
Long Distance P e o
Facsimiles S

Total disbursements for this matter

Lake Utilities Limited Proceeding

FOR PROFESSIONAL SERVICES RENDERED Fe

06/22/98 RDM Telephone call from Seidman; review AFPI order
for potential impact on rate case; confer with
Kramer re strategy in light of OPC protest;
attempt to contact Shreve; review discovery from
OPC and forward same to client. 1.10 hrs

06/23/98 RDM Telephone conference with Vaccaro re procedural
status of case in light of OPC protest; attempt
to contact Shreve; confer with McLean re OPC
protest and prospects for settlement. .80 hrs

06/24/98 RDM Attempt to contact Shreve. .10 hrs
06/25/98 RDM Telephone conference with Shreve re possible

settlement; report to Kramer re same; additional
conversatlon with Shreve re utility position on

rate structure issues. 1.10 hrs
06/26/98 RDM Telephone call from Shreve re possible joint

motion for deferral of LUSI rebuttal testimony. .10 hrs
06/30/98 RDM Telephone calls with Vaccaro, Shreve and Kramer

re schedule. .20 hrs

Richard D. Melson 3.40 hrs 215 /hr 731.00

POST OFFICE BOX 6526 0 TALLAHASSEE, FLORIDA 32314 0 (850) 222-7500



HorrPING GREEN SAMs & SMITH
PROFESSIONAL ASSOCIATION

ATTORNEYS AND COUNSELORS

Utilities, Inc.

Bill number

DISBURSEMENTS

PMC082495
-
MENTS

Mid-County 1899

FOR PROFESSIONAL SERVICES RENDERED

06/02/98 RDM

06/03/98 RDM

06/04/98 RDM

06/22/98 RDM

06/23/98 RDM

STATEMENT
PAGE
UTIL-00101-107 RDM
Total fees for this matter S 731.
1e
Y
: é %?) - ,\\0
Copying Charges : 4 2! 2.
Long Distance “4Mf- GO 25
Postage L s ,C
Mileage / O%( 8.

////”’———\\\\gotal disbursements for this matter $ 36,

Lake Placid 19‘4 TY Rate Case

F\

Long Distance T 1.16
Facsimiles \\\\\\\\\\\\\\\ 6.00
Total disbursements for this matter $ \Z;ii//
6 Test Year Rate Case

Review spreadsheets re possible settlement;

confer with Kramer; organize files. 1.40 hrs
Review revised spreadsheets; confer with Kramer

re negotiating strategy; analyze PAA rate relief

vs. requested relief. .80 hrs
Prepare and file request for extension of time;

confer with Kramer re further adjustments to

settlement proposal; prepare letter to Willis

outlining terms of potential settlement;

telephone conference with Brubaker; telephone

conference with Willis; review settlement outline

with Kramer; revise and file same. 2.30 hrs
Confer with Kramer re status of conversations

with Willis re possible settlement; review OPC

notice of intervention. .20 hrs
Attempt to contact Brubaker; confer with Burgess

(OPC) re pending efforts to settle case. .50 hrs

POST OFFICE BOX 6526 0 TALLAHASSEE, FLORIDA 32314 0 (850) 222-7500



HorrPING GREEN SAMS & SMITH
PROFESSIONAL ASSOCIATION

ATTORNEYS AND COUNSELORS

STATEMENT

Utilities, Inc.

Bill number
06/24/98 RDM

06/25/98 RDM

06/26/98 RDM

06/29/98 RDM

06/30/98 RDM

DISBURSEMENTS

UTIL-00101-107 RDM

Review case schedule and confer with Brubaker re
further settlement meeting involving staff and
OPC.

Telephone conference with Brubaker re settlement
meeting; confer with Kramer; review case
schedule for possible extensions; telephone
conference with Burgess re possible stipulated
schedule; review decision in Florida Water for
impact on issues in rate case.

Review schedule for possible movement of
testimony dates; confer with Burgess; conference
with Burgess and Brubaker re schedule and
possible 1st quarter hearing dates.

Review message from Brubaker re available hearing

dates; telephone conference with Burgess; advise
Kramer by voice mail.

Telephone calls with Brubaker, Kramer and Burgess

re schedule.

Richard D. Melson 7.40 hrs 215 /hr

Total fees for this matter

o1 .90
4<E>.; ['b >
Copying Charges 5777~

BILLING SUMMARY

Long Distance &
Postage 774 qﬂ,V\
Facsimiles C#qg"
1 )
Mileage O%®
Total disbursements for this matter
Richard D. Melson 10.80 hrs 215 /hr

TOTAL FEES
TOTAL DISBURSEMENTS
TOTAL CHARGES FOR THIS BILL

POST OFFICE BOX 6526 0 TALLAHASSEE, FLORIDA 32314 0 (850) 222-75C0

.30 hrs

.90 hrs

.50 hrs

.30 hrs

.20 hrs

2,322.00

$ 2,322.00

$ 135.72

$ 2,457.72




HorrPiNg GrREeEN SAMS & SMITH
PRCFESSIONAL ASSOCIATION

ATTORNEYS AND COUNSELORS e

STATEMENT

August 14, 1998
Billed Ehréugh 07/31/98

Bill number ~UTIL-00101-111 RDM
e ST e e e T i v e
Utilities,; Inc. i N T
¢/o Ms. PhilAnn Scully R O B = T
2335 Sanders Road R A RaAt "
Northbrook, IL 60062 ’ P o P TN
" RS RSV N T
Mid-County Services, Inc. T B et e
Balance forward as of bill number 107 dated 07/14/98 $ 4,579.59
Payments received since last bill (last payment 08/06/98) S 4,579.59
Net balance forward $ .00
DISBURSEMENTS
Postage 1.28
Total disbursements for this matter $ 1.28
Lake Utilities Limited Proceeding
FOR PROFESSIONAL SERVICES RENDERED
07/01/98 RDM Coordinate delay in testimony filing date; letter
to Vaccaro re same. .60 hrs
07/10/98 RDM Finalize and file response to OPC’s first PODs;
telephone call from Vaccaro re forthcoming
revised order on procedure. .50 hrs
07/13/98 RDM Review PSC resgponse to OPC interrogatories and
forward same to Kramer. .10 hrs
07/21/98 RDM Telephone call from Vaccaro re pre-prehearing;
telephone call to Shreve re status of settlement
negotiations. .20 hrs
07/22/98 RDM Meet with Kramer to discuss status of case and
PSC staff discovery responses to OPC; telephone
call from McLean re utility discovery responses;
provide additional copy to McLean. .20 hrs
,‘ ‘;? »fr - ! ‘:}
'\‘ AAAAAAA
Sy .
B ~ “.')

POST OFFICE BOX 6526 O TALLAHASSEE, FLORIDA 32314 0 (850) 222-7500



HoprrPineg GREEN SaMs & SMITH
PROFESSIONAL ASSOCIATION

ATTORNEYS AND COUNSELORS

93710

STATEMENT

Utilities, Inc.

Bill number
07/27/98 RDM
07/28/98 RDM

07/30/98 RDM

07/31/98 RDM

DISBURSEMENTS

Mid-County 1996 Test Year Rate Case

UTIL-00101-111 RDM

Telephone call from Shreve re settlement meeting.

Review settlement proposal and outline possible
non-uniform rate alternatives; telephone call to
Vaccaro re rate analysis; luncheon meeting with
Shreve re posgible settlement; report to Kramer
re same.

Review notice requirements and calendar relevant
dates.

Telephone call from Shreve re settlement and

questions re reveunes, gallons, and bill numbers.

Richard D. Melson 3.80 hrs 215 /hr

Total fees for this matter

Copying Charges
Long Distance
Postage
Facsimiles
Mileage

Total disbursements for this matter

FOR PROFESSIONAL SERVICES RENDERED

07/01/98 RDM

07/07/98 RDM

07/08/98 RDM

07/09/98 RDM

07/10/98 RDM

Coordinate delay in case schedule to permit
negotiations for settlement; prepare and file
consented motion for continuance.

Telephone conversations re scheduling settlement
negotiations with Burgess and Brubaker.

Telephone call from Burgess re attempting to

scheudle Mid-County settlement meeting; telephone

call to Brubaker re same.

Telephone conversation with Kramer to review
document production requests; attempt to contact
Burgess.

Finalize settlement meeting arrangements;
conference with Burgess re scope of discovery;
agree to defer reponses pending discussion at

- settlement meeting; report to Kramer re OPC

desire for allocation manual; receive and review
OPC's 3rd PODs and forward to client.

POST OFFICE BOX 6526 O TALLAHASSEE. FLORIDA 32314 0 (850) 222-7500

PAGE
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.10

.10
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.60
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hrs

hrs

hrs



91370

HoprpiNg GREEN SaMs & SMITH
PROFESSIONAL ASSOCIATION

ATTORNEYS AND COUNSELORS

STATEMENT

Utilities, Inc.

Bill number
07/14/98 RDM

07/15/98 RDM
07/16/98 RDM

07/22/98 RDM

DISBURSEMENTS

BILLING SUMMARY

PAGE 3
UTIL-00101-111 RDM

Telephone call from Brubaker re schedule and
upcoming procedural order; telephone call from
Kramer re OPC’s third discovery requests. . .20 hrs
Telephone call from Kramer re case schedule and
upcoming settlement meeting. .10 hrs
Review order establishing procedure and schedule
and forward same to client. .10 hrs
Review file and prepare comparison of revenue
figures and issues list; meet with Kramer to
review PODs and prepare for settlement meeting;
attend settlement meeting with staff and OPC;
meet with OPC to describe allocation study and
negotiate scope of responses to document
production requests. 6.20 hrs
Richard D. Melson 9.30 hrs 215 /hr 1,999.50
Total fees for this matter ' $ 1,999.50
Copying Charges 10.75
Long Distance I\ 6.60
Postage (5§%~: / 4.56
Facsimiles \ 4W?j7 17.00
Total disbursements for this matter @Z $ 38.91
Richard D. Melson 13.10 hrs 215 /hr 2,816.50
TOTAL FEES $ 2,816.50
TOTAL DISBURSEMENTS $ 73.63
TOTAL CHARGES FOR THIS BILL $ 2,890.13
TOTAL BALANCE NOW DUE $ 2,890.13

POST OFFICE BOX 6526 0 TALLAHASSEE, FLORIDA 32314 0 (850) 222-75C0



T4039

Horpring GREEN Sams & SMWH
PROFESSIONAL ASSOCIATION .

ATTORNEYS AND COUNSELORS
STATEMENT

\ September 15, 1998

Bllled through 08/31/98

L e i,

Bill number UTIL 00101 114 RDM
Utilities, Inc. - e | )
c¢/o Ms. PhilAnn Scully f”/e\w SRR S e T
2335 Sanders Road VA Tilee Dot coe
Northbrook, IL 60062 D S S I e
- “-'_ ' A L ) ST Thaed g ‘ : fhy 'J_!
Lake Utilities Limited Proceeci:_ng“"= e ”Wr o “ﬂe
( =y o b
N S A T4 .1 \
FOR PROFESSIONAL SERVICES RENDERED ~ é§ S ;
[ I,

08/03/98 RDM Telephone call from Shreve; telephone call to
Kramer re OPC’'s requested information. .20 hrs

08/04/98 RDM Telephone call from Beck to follow-up on Shreve
data request; telephone call to Kramer re same;
review data and forward to Beck. .30 hrs

08/06/98 RDM Attempt to contract Shreve and Beck; confer with

Kramer. .10 hrs

08/10/98 RDM Telephone call from Shreve with data request;
obtain answer from Kramer and provide to Shreve;
review testimony for rebuttal purposes; confer
with Seidman re preparation of rebuttal. 1.20 hrs

08/11/98 RDM Review and outline prefiled testimony; review
staff response to OPC PODs; confer with Kramer re
required rebuttal; telephone conference with
Seidman re rebuttal telephone call to Shreve re
status of settlement; conference call with OPC
and client re additional OPC data requests;
confer with Vaccaro re customer notice; telephone
call to Rasmussen re publication of notice. 3.90 hrs

08/12/98 RDM Telephone conference with Shreve; settlement
conference with Shreve and Kramer; review Seidman
draft rebuttal testimony and provide comments;
confer with Kramer re testimony; confer with
Rasmussen re required rebuttal. 2.20 hrs

08/13/98 RDM Review, finalize and file rebuttal testimony of
Seidman and Rasmussen; confer with Shreve and
Vaccaro re extension to file Kramer testimony;
obtain annual report reviews from Vaccaro;
provide materials to Kramer and prellmlnary
discussion re same; prepare fee estimate for

updated testimony. 4.20 hrs

POST OFFICE BOX 6526 O TALLAHASSEE, FLORIDA 32314 0 (850) 222-750C0



Hoprring GREEN SAaMs & SMITH
PROFESSIONAL ASSOCIATION

ATTORNEYS AND COUNSELORS

G903

STATEMENT

Utilities,

Bill number

08/14/98

08/17/98

08/18/98

08/20/98

08/21/98

08/24/98

08/25/98

08/26/98
08/26/98

08/27/98

RDM

RDM

Inc.

UTIL-00101-114 RDM

Review prefiled testimony of OPC and staff;
review and provide comments on draft of Kramer
rebuttal; review Kramer exhibits and provide
comments; finalize estimate of cost to complete
case; confer with Vaccaro re pre-prehearing
conference.

Review draft prehearing order and prepare revised
positions; review Merchant and Larkin rebuttal
testimony; conference with Kramer and Wenz;
attend pre-prehearing conference; post-conference
discussions with Kramer re required information
and re finalization of rebuttal testimony.

Review Kramer draft rebuttal testimony; telephone
conference with Kramer re same; review exhibits;
finalize and file testimony and exhibits

Telephone call from Shreve; telephone call to
Wenz and Kramer.

Telephone conversations with Kramer and Shreve;
review schedules and confer with Kramer and Wenz
re same; settlement meeting with Shreve and
client (by conference call); confer with Wenz and

Kramer.

Telephone call from Vaccaro; review schedules
from Kramer; provide current leverage formula to
Kramer; review capital structure schedule;
provide updated information to Shreve.

Review capital structure schedule; forward
materials to Shreve and Vaccaro; telephone
conversations with Vaccaro; confer with Kramer.

Telephone calls with Kramer and Vaccaro; attempt
to reach Shreve or Gatlin;

Conference with Wenz and Kramer; settlement
meeting with OPC and staff.

Debrief Wenz re Wednesday meeting and open staff
questions; conference with Wenz re strategy for
today’s meeting; prepare notice of withdrawal of
settlement and protest; research re effect of
withdrawal of protest; attend settlement meeting
with PSC and OPC; file notice of withdrawal;
debriefing with Wenz and confer re notice issues.

POST OFFICE BOX 6526 O TALLAHASSEE, FLORIDA 32314 0 (850) 222-7500
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F4039

HorriNg GREEN SAMS & SMITH
PROFESSIONAL ASSOCIATION

ATTORNEYS AND COUNSELORS

STATEMENT
PAGE 3
Utilities, Inc. .
Bill number UTIL-00101-114 RDM
08/28/98 RDM Confer with Rasmussen re published notice;
telephone call to Vaccaro re prehearing
conference schedule and scope. : .30 hrs

08/31/98 RDM Prepare for prehearing conference; attend
prehearing conference; confer with Rasmussen re
noticing cancellation of hearing; memo to client
re results of prehearing conference; voice mail
to Wenz re further settlement negotiations. 2.60 hrs

Richard D. Melson 33.20 hrs 215 /hrx 138.00

Total fees for this matter

DISBURSEMENTS @YJ

Copying Charges
Long Distance
Facsimiles
Mileage

Total disbursements for this matter
Mid-County 1996 Test Year Rate Case
FOR PROFESSIONAL SERVICES RENDERED
08/04/98 RDM Telephone call from Burgess re request to
commence production of documents; telephone
conference with Kramer re same. .20 hrs

08/07/98 RDM Confer with Kramer re response to OPC PODs;
telephone conference with Burgess re same. .30 hrs

08/12/98 RDM Review document production materials from client;
draft letter to Burgess re same. .50 hrs

08/19/98 RDM Review additional documents produced; telephone
conversation with Burgess; prepare transmittal
and forward documents to OPC and staff. .30 hrs

08/21/98 RDM Telephone call from Brubaker re status of OPC
settlement negotiations. .10 hrs

08/28/98 RDM Conferences with Burgess and Brubaker re delay in

prefiling schedule; prepare and file motion re

same. .50 hrs

Richard D. Melson 1.90 hrs 215 /hr 408.50

POST OFFICE BOX 6526 O TALLAHASSEE, FLORIDA 32314 0 (850) 222-7500



T4 637

Hoprring GREEN SAMS & SMITH
PROFESSIONAL ASSOCIATION

ATTORNEYS AND COUNSELORS

STATEMENT

Utilities, Inc.

Bill number

DISBURSEMENTS

BILLING SUMMAR

UTIL-00101-114 RDM

Total fees for this matter

Copying Charges
Long Distance
Postage
Facsimiles
Federal Express
Mileage

Total disbursements for this matter

Y
Richard D. Melson 35.10 hrs 215 /hr 7,546.50
TOTAL FEES $ 7,546.50
TOTAL DISBURSEMENTS $ 662.11
TOTAL CHARGES FOR THIS BILL $82086l

POST OFFICE BOX 6526 O TALLAHASSEE, FLORIDA 323140 (850)222-7500



V152

Hopring GREEN SAMS & SMITH
PROFESSIONAL ASSOCIATION

ATTORNEYS AND COUNSELORS
STATEMENT

November 13, 1998

e S

Billed through 10/31/98

Bill number UTIL-00101-119 RDM .. L e
. T e oo
Utilities, Inc. - : SRR : :
c/o Ms. PhilAnn Scully R Aol :
2335 Sanders Road D . - LJCCZ.Z§5

NorthbrOOk, IL 60062 { Iy e I Sar 1 .

Lake Utilities Limited Proceeding : R

FOR PROFESSIONAL SERVICES RENDERED | ¢ LY e
10/05/98 RDM Telephone call from Burgess re agenda; telephone Mo s
call from Vaccaro re Shreve request for deferral; R
telephone call to Burgess re same. .60 hrs
Richard D. Melson .60 hrs 215 /hr 129.00
Total fees for this matter $ 129.00
DISBURSEMENTS p
Long Distance 39
Total disbursements for this matter $ .39
Mid-County 1996 Test Year Rate Case
FOR PROFESSIONAL SERVICES RENDERED
10/05/98 RDM Telephone conferences with Wenz and Burgess re
. document discovery. .20 hrs
10/06/98 RDM Confer with Brubaker re status of case and
possible further extension of prehearing
schedule. .10 hrs
10/08/98 RDM Telephone call from Wenz re prehearing schedule;
prepare revised schedule; obtain agreement from
OPC; confer with staff re proposed stipulated
motion; prepare and file same. .70 hrs
10/15/98 RDM Telephone call from Burgess re review of tax
returns and re inspection/copying of audit
workpapers in Illinois. .20 hrs

POST OFFICE BOX 6526 O TALLAHASSEE, FLORIDA 32314 O (850) 222-7500



77932

HorppriNg GREEN SaMs & SMITH
PROFESSIONAL ASSOCIATION

ATTORNEYS AND COUNSELORS

STATEMENT
PAGE 2
Utilities, Inc.
Bill number UTIL-00101-119 RDM
10/20/98 RDM Provide tax return to OPC for review; confer with
Hale and Smith. .20 hrs
10/21/98 RDM Follow-up re pending discovery reguests. .10 hrs
10/22/98 RDM Confer with Wenz re discovery requests; telephone
call to Burgess re same and re OPC interview of
E4d Fuchs. .30 hrs
Richard D. Melson 1.80 hrs 215 /hr 387.00
Total fees for this matter $ 387.00
DISBURSEMENTS
Copying Charges .50
Long Distance 3.48
Postage 1.65
Facsimiles 10.00
Total disbursements for this matter S 15.63
BILLING SUMMARY
Richard D. Melson 2.40 hrs 215 /hr 516.00
TOTAL FEES S 516.00
TOTAL DISBURSEMENTS S 16.02
TOTAL CHARGES FOR THIS BILL $ 532.02

POST OFFICE BOX 6526 O TALLAHASSEE, FLORIDA 32314 0(850) 222-7500



Hoprring GREEN SAMS & SMITH

PROFESSIONAL ASSOCIATION
ATTORNEYS AND COUNSELORS

STATEMENT

Utilities,

c/o0 Ms.

Inc.
PhilAnn Scully

2335 Sanders Road
Northbrook, IL 60062

Lake Utilities Limited Proceeding

Bill number

—

~

vbecember 11 1998...

o ANy i e o e R h\w—-“\~

Billed through’ 1 11/30/98/

.m—-fv*’"
T,

ke o
B AT et e T I O

-,
—ereras
N sty ag e

FOR PROFESSIONAL SERVICES RENDERED

11/03/98

11/06/98

11/09/98

11/10/98
11/17/98
11/18/98
11/20/98
11/24/98

11/30/98

RDM

UTIL OOlOl 121 RDM

.........

Prepare for and attend PSC agenda conference re

LUSI notice of withdrawal;
further settlement negotiations; confer with
staff re issues for upcoming case; report to

Wenz.

Telephone conference with Wenz re settlement
meetings with OPC; attempt to contact Shreve.

Telephone call from Vaccaro re case schedule;

attempt to contact Shreve re settlement meeting

dates.

Telephone conference with Shreve

settlement conference schedule.

(at NARUC) re

Confer with Shreve re schédule for settlement

meeting.

Telephone call to Shreve’s office re settlement
meeting schedule.

confer with Shreve re

Arrange meeting time with Shreve; advise Wenz by
voice mail.

Telephone conferences with Wenz and Shreve re
settlement meeting schedule.

Attempt to contact Shreve re settlement meeting
arrangements.

Richard D. Melson

Total fees for this matter

POST OFFICE BOX 6526 O TALLAHASSEE, FLORIDA 32314 O (850) 222-7500

4.50 hrs

215 /hr

.20

.20

.00

.00

.00

.10

.20

hrs

hrs

hrs
hrs
hrs
hrs
hrs

hrs



HoprpriNg GREEN SAMS & SMITH
PROFESSIONAL ASSOCIATION

ATTORNEYS AND COUNSELORS

STATEMENT SAGE 3
Utilities, Inc.
Bill number UTIL-00101-121 RDM
DISBURSEMENTS
Copying Charges 1.00
Long Distance 8.14
Total disbursements for this matter S 9.14

Mid-County 1996 Test Year Rate Case
FOR PROFESSIONAL SERVICES RENDERED
11/02/98 RDM Confer with Wenz; prepare for agenda conference. 1.20 hrs

11/06/98 RDM Attend meeting between OPC staff and PSC staff re
staff’s used and useful analysis and

recommendations. 2.30 hrs
11/20/98 RDM Telephone call from Burgess re resumed document

discovery; advise Wenz by voice mail. .10 hrs
11/23/98 RDM Review discovery letter from Burgess. .30 hrs

11/25/98 RDM Review OPC’s renewed document production request;
review notes from informal discovery meeting;
prepare memo to Wenz re status of current

requests. . 1.80 hrs
Richard D. Melson 5.70 hrs 215 /hr 1,225.50
Total fees for this matter . $ 1,225.50
DISBURSEMENTS
Copying Charges 5.25
Long Distance 3.87
Facsimiles 17.00
Total disbursements for this matter S 26.12

BILLING SUMMARY
Richard D. Melson 10.20 hrs 215 /hr 2,193.00

TOTAL FEES : $ 2,193.00

POST OFFICE BOX 6526 0 TALLAHASSEE, FLORIDA 32314 0 (850) 222-7500



HorriNng GREEN SAMS & SMITH
PROFESSIONAL ASSOCIATION

ATTORNEYS AND COUNSELORS

Utilities,
Bill number

STATEMENT ==

Inc.

UTIL-00101-121 RDM

TOTAL DISBURSEMENTS
TOTAL CHARGES FOR THIS BILL

POST OFFICE BOX 6526 O TALLAHASSEE, FLORIDA 32314 Q (850) 222-7500

PAGE 3
$ 35.26
$ 2,228.25



72258

Invoice No: 4-632-62890
i Invoice Date: Sep 02, 1998
s n Account Number: 0606-2634-0
Federal Express Page 45 of 47
Reference Detail ..
Picked up: Aug 11, 1898 Payor: Shipper Reference: 088-MIDCOUNTY-RC EXP
s Distance Based Pricing, Region 5
Airbil 804656526456 Sender Recipient
Service Type  FedEx Standard Overnight MARK KRAMER RICK MELSON
Package Type  FedEx Box UTILITIESINC HOPPING GREEN SAMS & SMITH
Region 5 2335 SANDERS RD 123 SCALHOUN
Pieces 1 NORTHBROOK IL 60062-6196 US TALLAHASSEE FL 32301 US
Weight 10.0 Ibs
Delivered Aug 12,1398 09:28 Transportation Charges 31.85
Service
Area Code AA Total Transportation Charges Usps 31.85
Signed by J.GREGORY
Refersnce Detail Subtotal usns$ 31.85

FedEx Intemal Use: 022420143/02092/ /_




_ 7 4.,40’?‘
Invoice No: 4-632-62890

i invoice Date: Sep 02, 1998
St N Account Number:  0606-2634-0
Federal Express Page 46 of 47
Reference Detail )
Picked up: Aug 18, 1988 Payor: Shipper Reference: 088-RC EXP
o Distance Based Pricing, Region 5
e FedEx has audited this airbill for correct pieces, weight, and service. Any changes made are reflected in the invoice amount.
Airbill 804658526261 Sender Recipient
Service Type  FedEx Standard Overnight JUSTINE ISBANER RICK MELSON
Package Type  Customer Packaging UTILITIES INC HOPPING GREEN SAMS & SMITH
Region 5 2335 SANDERSRD 123 S CALHOUN STREET
Pieces 1 NORTHBROCK iL 60062-6136 US TALLAHASSEEFL 32301 US
Weight 300 lbs .
Defivered Aug 18, 1398 09:41 Transportation Charges 54.15
Service
AreaCode  AA Total Transportation Charges usps 54.15
Signed by ARICHBOURG
Reference Detail Subtotal Usps$ 54.15

FadEx Internal Use: 023300462/02082/ /_



g UTILITIES, INC.
;,» -

~

Name: Mark Kramer
Date

7/18/98
7/22/98
7/22/98
7/22/98
7/21/98
7/18/98
7/18/98
7/18/98
7/26/98
7/26/98
7/26/98
7/27/98
7/26/98
7/26/98
7/26/98
7/29/98
7/29/98
7/29/98
7/29/98
7/29/98

Totals

Signature: % < %/ '71/ 22/55

OL5 - O6H 9 -
055 - 0170 18725 " 23,79

Meals Other Paid To

411.50 Delta Airlines
226.48 Budget Rental Car
108.90 Marriott Courtyard

10.45 Hartsfield Bistro - Lunch
3.69 Dixie - Gas
3.07 TCBY - Dinner

1.40 1L Toll Authority - 4 tolls
——__6.50  Car Expense (20 mi X .325)
88.28 Marriott Courtyard
77.27 Budget
55.24 Kinko's - (Hand outs)
4.73 NO Airport - Lunch

Frém: 6/13/98 %o: 7/29/98

Descrintion of E Activity. P Involved

Airline tickets for trip to Florida to discuss
Mid-County Rate Case

Trip to Louisiana related to customer concerns
regarding rates and meeting with Commission
personnel on Cost of Service case.

3.00 Lk Pontchartrain Causeway tolls

13,00 Car Expense {40 mi X .325)
~~772.20 IL Toll Authority - 6 tolls
1.40 IL Toll Authority - 4 tolls
14.00 Miller Parking Garage

IL Company hearings with Justine

3.05 Burger King
24.15 Corner Bakery - lunch
13.00 Car Expense (40 mi X .325)
4545 1,025.86 $ ( /@Dmnd Total

> e

550 20 0
O21 = 1T 19717 "™ 20, I
025 - O S Gugry% 5 o 7 ) o
-Cl‘ ;_ ) ()* ]]_t" /7(~(_,~1,,4,_
0755 - 00 JBG?oéxd%zJ T
O - GG D970 i) ENETE "//

G 49 o ‘
V87717 19547 [ ()

Code

088-0645-187-17
088-0645-187-17
088-0645-187-17
088-0645-187-17
088-0645-187-17
088-0645-187-17
088-0645-187-17
088-0645-187-17
038-0770-187-30
038-0770-187-30
038-0770-187-30
038-0770-187-30
038-0770-187-30
038-0770-187-30
038-0770-187-30
031-0099-187-17
031-0099-187-17
031-0099-187-17
031-0099-187-17
031-0099-187-17

O

f 0+ L



HopriNncg GREEN SAaMS & SMITH
PROFESSIONAL ASSOCIATION

ATTORNEYS AND COUNSELORS

STATEMENT

Utilities, Inc. e

c¢/o Ms. PhilAnn Scully IR \ N

2335 Sanders Road T e d s i

Northbrook, IL 60062 ’ i ' s e 15
.\\ J"; ’ e e ? &

Lake Utilities Limited Proceeding ™ w—.._ . oo

May 21, 1998

Billed through 04/30/98
UTIL-00101-104.RDM

N ———— A s e

Bill number

FOR PROFESSIONAL SERVICES RENDERED

04/02/98

04/06/98

04/07/98

04/08/98

04/09/98

04/20/98

04/21/98

RDM

RDM

Confer with Kramer re staff position on required
filing of AFPI tariff and strategic
considerations regarding f£iling; followup with
Rasmussen re identification of homeowners
asssociations and representatives.

Conference call with Wenz and Kramer re legal
options for dealing with request to file AFPI
tariffs prior to issuance of final order.

Review AFPI tariffs; call to Kramer re same;
advise Vaccaro of upcoming filing; call to Kramer
re Vaccaro report on Austin concern about delay
in filing; confer with Rasmussen; provide HOA
information to Shreve.

Prepare transmittal letter and file AFPI tariff
sheets; telephone call to Shreve re status of
settlement meetings with his clients; telephone
call to Rasmussen re AFPI filing; telephone call
to Vaccaro re same.

Review recent PSC order re non-finality of a
protested PAA order.

Telephone call to Vaccaro re status of AFPI
tariff sheets; telephone call from Wenz re status

of case.

Telephone call from Vaccaro re effectiveness of
AFPI tariffs; telephone call to Rasmussen re
same; telephone call from Vaccaro re needed
waiver of time limits; prepare waiver letter;
confer with Kramer re same and re potential
settlement discussions with staff; telephone call
from Vaccaro re staff concern with limitation
language in AFPI tariff; report to Kramer re

same.

POST OFFICE BOX 6526 O TALLAHASSEE, FLORIDA 32314 O (850) 222-7500
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§E5

Hoprring GREEN SAMS & SMITH
PROFESSIONAL ASSOCIATION

ATTORNEYS AND COUNSELORS

STATEMENT
PAGE 2
Utilities, Inc.
Bill number UTIL-00101-104 RDM
04/22/98 RDM Meet with Shreve re possible settlement; report ’
to Kramer re same; confer with Vaccaro re same. .90 hrs
04/28/98 RDM Prepare for and attend agenda conference re
adoption of offer of settlement; report to client
re same. 2.30 hrs
04/29/98 RDM Conferences with Kramer and Vaccaro re format of
notice and order mailed to customers. .20 hrs
Richard D. Melson 6.60 hrs 215 /hr 1,419.00
Total fees for this matter $ 1,419.00
DISBURSEMENTS
Copying Charges 13.75
Long Distance 13.55
Postage 1.97
Facsimiles 2.00
Mileage 4.16
Total disbursements for this matter S 35.43
Mid-County 1996 Test Year Rate Case
FOR PROFESSIONAL SERVICES RENDERED
04/02/98 RDM Telephone call from Brubaker re staff’s desire to
postpone settlement meeting until after PAA order
is issued and protested; confer with Kramer re
same. .20 hrs
04/20/98 RDM Begin review of PAA order and memo to client re
deadlines for protest; telephone call from Wenz. .40 hrs
04/21/98 RDM Telephone call from Rasmussen re Mid-County PAA
' order and status of protest decision; review PAA
order. 1.40 hrs
04/22/98 RDM Confer with Kramer re potential issues for
protest of PAA order. .30 hrs
04/24/98 RDM Confer with Kramer re issues for protest of PAA
order. .20 hrs
04/30/98 RDM Prepare protest of PAA and forward to client for
comments. 1.30 hrs
Richard D. Melson 3.80 hrs 215 /hr 817.00

POST OFFICE BOX 6526 O TALLAHASSEE., FLORIDA 32314 O (850) 222-7500



§55 1,4

Horring GREEN SAaMSsS & SMITH
PROFESSIONAL ASSOCIATION

ATTORNEYS AND COUNSELORS

STATEMENT
PAGE 3
Utilities, Inc.
Bill number UTIL-00101-104 RDM
Total fees for this matter S 817.00
DISBURSEMENTS
Copying Charges 65.75
Long Distance 21.87
Appearance Fee 172.50
Facsimiles 53.00
Federal Express 23.50
Mileage 2.88
Total disbursements for this matter S 339.50
BILLING SUMMARY
Richard D. Melson 10.40 hrs 215 /hr 2,236.00
TOTAL FEES $ 2,236.00
TOTAL DISBURSEMENTS S 374.93
TOTAL CHARGES FOR THIS BILL $ 2,610.93

POST OFFICE BOX 6526 O TALLAHASSEE, FLORIDA 32314 0 (850) 222-7500



55095

Horring GREEN SAMs & SMITH
PROFESSIONAL ASSOCIATICN

ATTORNEYS AND COUNSELORS

STATEMENT

April 13, 1998

Billed through 03/31/98 T
Bill number ::QEEELBEEEE;EEEQRDM \/-/'_:
Utilities,'$§c. ; ) \v_ ~
gé?SMgénggighﬁgagbUl*y - //?b‘gifiijifi/)
Northbrook, IL 60062 . \~—a~j;“~\‘

06 -0 - (k-0 3104
[ ps€ - oS 18777 3017 ¢ ;s

03/12/98 RDM Confer with Shreve re status of possible

Lake Utilities Limited Proceeding

FOR PROFESSIONAL SERVICES RENDERED

settlement. .30 hrs
03/16/98 RDM Telephone call from Vaccaro re refiling of

settlement recommendation. . .20 hrs
03/20/98 RDM Confer with Kramer re status of case. .20 hrs
03/23/98 RDM Telephone conference with Vaccaro re Chairman’s

request for deferral; confer with Shreve re .

deferral and possible settlement; confer with’

Vaccaro and Willis re conversations with Shreve;

agree to two agenda deferral. .60 hrs
03/25/98 RDM Report to Rasmussen re deferral of recommendation

on settlement and need to identify homeowners’

associations for Shreve. - .20 hrs
03/26/98 RDM Telephone call from Vaccaro re staff position on

finality of AFPI portions of PAA order; voice _

mail message to Kramer re same. .30 hrs

Richard D. Melson 1.80 hrs 215 /hr 387.00

Total fees for this matter $ 387.00
DISBURSEMENTS

Long Distance 1.54

PSC Copies 2.50

. o A T
Total disbursements for this matter?777" ‘o $ 4.04
. -
Mid-County 1996 Test Year Rate Case aF &O,\% b
.ot }7’/ 0
o8d .

POST OFFICE BOX 6526 0 TALLAHASSEE, FLORIDA 32314 0 (850) 222-7500



HorprPing GREEN SAMsS & SMITH
PROFESSIONAL ASSOCIATION

ATTORNEYS AND COUNSELORS

% 3095

STATEMENT
Utilities, Inc. PAGE 2
Bill number UTIL-00101-103 RDM
FOR PROFESSIONAL SERVICES RENDERED
03/05/98 RDM Telephone call from Brubaker re possible deferral
to consider implications of rulemaking order;
review rulemaking order and confer with Stuart re
same; confer with Garcia re same; telephone
conference with Rasmussen re plant capacity
issue; telephcone call to Brubaker/Jaber re
potential deferral. 1.80 hrs
03/06/98 RDM Confer with Kramer re staff recommendation and
request for extension of time; prepare and file
letter granting extension of time. .70 hrs
03/16/98 RDM Review revised staff recommendation. .60 hrs
03/20/98 RDM Review staff recommendation; confer with Kramer
re issues to raise at agenda conference. .90 hrs
03/23/98 RDM Confer with Willis re staff recommendation and re
concern regarding mismatch of allocation and rate
structure. .40 hrs
03/24/98 RDM Prepare for agenda conference re Mid-County PAA
recommendation, including review of prior
Mid-County rate case file; attend agenda and
present company’s position on used and useful,
allocation, and margin reserve/CIAC issues; .
report to Kramer re results of agenda. " 6.10 hrs
03/25/98 RDM Confer with Brubaker re arranging a settlement
meeting; report to Rasmussen re agenda conference
results. .60 hrs
Richard D. Melson 11.10 hrs 215 /hr 2,386.50
Total fees for this matter $ 2,386.50
DISBURSEMENTS
Copying Charges 550.75
Long Distance 37.70
Postage 3.96
Facsimiles 20.00
Federal Express 18.55
Total disbursements for this matter j?% S 630.96
BILLING SUMMARY L, 7;4:.4
2 ol. ke
-1\
JRTSa
L ouLkS |
0%v

POST OFFICE BOX 6526 O TALLAHASSEE, FLORIDA 32314 0 (850) 222-7500



¥ 3095

HoprriINg GREEN SAMS & SMITH
PRQOFESSIONAL ASSOCIATION

ATTORNEYS AND COUNSELORS

STATEMENT
Utilities, Inc. PAGE 3
Bill number UTIL-00101-103 RDM
Richard D. Melson 12.90 hrs 215 /hr 2,773.50
TOTAL FEES $ 2,773.50
TOTAL DISBURSEMENTS S 635.00
TOTAL CHARGES FOR THIS BILL $ 3,408.50

POST OFFICE BOX 6526 O TALLAHASSEE, FLORIDA 32314 0 (850) 222-7500



Horring GREEN Sams & SMHH,/”

PROFESSIONAL ASSOCIATION Do -
ATTORNEYS AND COUNSELORS \j B
STATEMENT = :
. S e

et N
o ~

.mMarch 1z, 1938

Billed through 02/28/98 N
Bill number UTIL 00101 1og RDM
w-«’
Utilities, Inc. . T -
c/o Ms. PhilAnn Scully EA o _
2335 Sanders Road Ok oL - YT S
Northbrook, IL 60062 5 DT T S
‘\ i\ ,‘I\’, \v"r L] - — g r v /’) -

Lake Utilities Limited Proceeding \j)})% IR B W | § . i
FOR PROFESSIONAL SERVICES RENDERED T e - -
02/02/98 RDM Review staff letter re AFPI and confer with

Kramer re same. .40 hrs
02/09/98 RDM Telephone conference with Vaccaro re status of

case and case schedule. .20 hrs
02/23/98 RDM Confer with Vaccaro re status of recommendation

and re staff’s conversation with Shreve. .20 hrs

Richard D. Melson .80 hrs 215 /hr 172.00

Total fees for this matter S 172.00
DISBURSEMENTS

Long Distance 26.19

Facsimiles 2.00

Total disbursements for this matter S 28.19
Mid-County 1996 Test Year Rate Case
FOR PROFESSIONAL SERVICES RENDERED
02/02/98 RDM Review staff data request and confer with Garcia

re same. .30 hrs
02/05/98 CGS Conference with Garcia; conference with Brubaker. .40 hrs
02/09/98 RDM Review and file response to staff’s 3rd data

.50 hrs

request.

POST OFFICE BOX 6526 O TALLAHASSEE, FLORIDA 32314 O (850) 222-7500



HoprrPING GREEN SAMS & SMITH )
PROFESSIONAL ASSOCIATION

ATTORNEYS AND COUNSELORS

STATEMENT

Utilities, Inc. v PAGE 2
Bill number UTIL-00101-102 RDM o
02/12/98 RDM Telephone call from Davis re need for updatéd

rate case expense estimate; direct Davis to

supplemental material previously filed; confer

with Garcia re need for update. .50 hrs
02/19/98 RDM Telephone call from Brubaker re fee estimate;

confer with Garcia; prepare updated estimate of

legal expenses through PAA process. ' .50 hrs
02/20/98 RDM Review and file rate case expense update

materials. .30 hrs
02/23/98 RDM Telephone call from Barry Davis re rate case

expense materials; refer call to Garcia. ' .20 hrs

Richard D. Melson 2.30 hrs 215 /hr 494.50

Cheryl Stuart .40 hrs 200 /hr 80.00

Total fees for this matter $ 574.50
DISBURSEMENTS .

Copying Charges 123.25

Long Distance 19.78

Postage 1.33

Facsimiles 98.00

Federal Express 35.25

Mileage : 3.84

Total disbursements for this matter S 281.45
BILLING SUMMARY

Richard D. Melson 3.10 hrs 215 /hr 666.50

Cheryl Stuart .40 hrs 200 /hr 80.00

TOTAL FEES $ 746.50

TOTAL DISBURSEMENTS $ 305.64

TOTAL CHARGES FOR THIS BILL $ 1,056.14

0l 0%h- Dewo 13717 A00.17
235,95

0es - OLES - 197 - 17

POST OFFICE BOX 6526 O TALLAHASSEE, FLORIDA 32314 0 (850) 222-7500
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Fed | - Fa73g9

. UTILITIES_INC F .
BILL TO UTILITIES INCoh REFERENCE ACTIVITY SUMMARY FAGE 1602504,3
NORTHBROOK, IL 60062 INVOICE NO. 4-447-07792 ACCOUNT NO. 0606-263G~
TRACKING MNOS |- SENDER'S MAME RECIPIEMT INFQRMATION AND PACKAGES o -
REFEREMCE -“AND ADDRESS PROGF OF :DELIVERY § WEIGHT | ~SERVICES cHarGES | oy NELeo
800954835058 [BRENT LAWRENCE EAXIER COOPER 1/ NA|PRIORLIY LIR 11.50
" UTILITIES INC D5 A MERIDIAN OME CORP FLIGHT READ 5
REGION 4 2335 SAMDERS RD 4601 J EISEMHOWER AVE
N RS RAATION | HEROOR T 0062 A R ERE 0 10,98 10550 M
04509623 209 [SHIPPED 02/13/93 SIGMNED: M.CURTIS ’ L 11.50
4388382191 |MR_FRANK GARCIA MR RICK MELSON 1/  1{PRIORITY PAK 18.55
UTILITIES INC Gv \N\% HOPPING GREEN SAMS 2 SMITH N
-1 REGION_5 2335 SANDERS RD \ 123 S CALHOUN ST
NG REFERENCE INORTHBROOK, IL  50062|TALLAHASSEE, FL 22314 AA P
/ INFGRHATION DELIVERED 02/20/98 10:06 i
052076382956 |SHIPPED 02/19/93 SIGMED: C.MATHEWS 18.55
801024463516% [KEN DEAVER JIM CAMARIEN 1/ 2|PRIORITY PAK 21.15
KACE INC 4 UTILIFER INC <
REGION 5 319 0LD BAILZYS RD ~ 2235 SHADEUS RD
NG REFERENCE |BLUFFTON, SC 29910 |NGRTHERQOK IL 60062 Al
INFORMATION |DELIVERED 02/264/98710:02
055133332956 |DROP_OFF_02/23/98 STGNED: M.PARRISH 21.15
CONTINUED NEXT PAGE
CUESTICNS? CALL QUR CUSTCMER ACCCUNT SERVICES. 800-522-1147, 7AM - APM (CST) MOMDAY - FRIDAY.
TO ENSURE PRCPER CRECIT PLZASE RETURN THE REMITTANCE ADVICE (1ST PAGE OF THIS INVCICE) WITH YCUR PAYMENT.
MAIL TO: FEDERAL EXPRESS CCRP, P0O.BOX 1140, MEMPHIS, TN 38101 - 1140.
i |
£
;\»L'.'?‘)’ 2
BILL TO: UTILITIES INC REFERENCE ACTIVITY SUMMARY PAGE__ 17 OF 3
2335 SANDERS RD DATE ~ 03/04/5:
NORTHBROOK , IL 60062 INVOICE NO. 4-447-07792 ACCOUNT NO. 0606-2634-
TRACKING:NOS “NA S RECIPIENT *INFORMATION: i [-PACKAGES: Ut ema s f e NET )
¢“Ré%ERENCEr; AR “io PROOF "OF:DELIVERY 1% | & WEIGHT. |- SERVICES . |7iCHARGES ™| cpiRGES
03258470032% |[KELLLE BAVER NOS COMMUNICATIGONS 17 3|2DAY PAK 10.25
80325 OPTICAL TECHNOLOGY GRQUP INC
REGION 8 6701 DEMOCRACY BLVD STE 805 4330 BQULDER HWY
NG REFERENCE {BETHESDA, MDD 20817 |LAS_VEGAS, NV 89121 Al
INFORMATIOM DELIVERED 02/12/98 09:11
044230966116 |SHIPPED 02/11/98 SIGNED: R.DEMATTO 10.25
11 .
o ot o
do W et /N
I - boed : )
' - e 4
_)ﬁPad\ Haay o bl %HAL
| oy |
B AL
REFERENCE SUBTOTAL 91.70 [CONTINUED NEXT PAGE

CUESTIONS? CALL OUR CUSTOMER ACCOUNT SERVICES, 800-622-1147, 7AM - 6PM (CST) MONDAY - FRIDAY.
TO ENSURE PROPER CREDIT PLEASE RETURN THE REMITTANCE ADVICE (1ST PAGE OF THIS INVOICE) WITH YOUR PAYMENT.
MAIL TO; FEDERAL EXPRESS CORR, PO. BOX 1140, MEMPHIS, TN 38101 - 1140,

UTILITIES INC REFERENCE ACTIVITY SUHMARY €
2335 SANDERS 8
NORTHBROO o
mp P
£ E s P ‘& WELIGHT: Te s
0 9 R STEPHEN -1/ NA ORITY LIR 11.75
1 CHESTER V RESS CORR 10.00
REGION 5 ER 83CHESNUT
PA DEP SEWAG K, IL PAOLI
E_PLAN_STONE DELIVERED 02/05/98
03700330 220 [SHIPPED 02/04/98 SIGNED: C.BAIN 21.75
\(\ .
W o
REFEREMCE SUBTOTAL 21.75 [CONTINUED MEXT PAGE
BR Ay, n .
B . gé.?fm}g:n.; BOOGI2- 11T TAM L GPALICSTY MONDAY - FRIDAY
M0 W AOVICE (1ST PAGE OF THS INVOICE: WITH YOUR' PAYMENT

w
S MEMPHIS, TN 38101 . 1140




k]
T1ES_INC : REFERENCE ACTIVITY SUMMARY PAGE 2 0F 14
SANDERS RD DATE 01/07/98
BROOK IL 60062 INVOICE NO. 4-389-78778 ACCOUNT NO. 0606-2634-0
SENDER'S NAME RECIPIENT INFORMATION AND - | PACKAGES NET
AND ADDBRESS - PROOF OF DELIVERY & WETIGAT | SERVICES CHARGES CHARGES'W
WK P _GARCIA GONNA CATON T/ 1 |PRIGRITY PAK 1Z.50
LR rTes ING 2] TLLINOIS COMMERCE COMMISSION
RE 5335 SANDERS RD 537 € CAPITOL AVE
£ FORTHBROOK IL 60062|SPRINGFIELD IL 62706 AA
NG - DELIVERED: 01/02/98 10:30 -
b SHIPPED 12/31/97 SIGNED: D.KELLY 15.50
RAMK_P _GARCIA . RICHARD D NELSON 1/ MNA|PRIORITY LTR 11.75
go DRANELTESMING.  g2x AL HGFPING GREEN SAMS & SMITH
REGION 5 5335 SANDERS RD 123 5 CALHGUN 3T
K6 REFERENCE [NORTHBROOK, IL 60062|TALLAHASSEE FL 32314 AA -
~ "INFORHMATION DECIVERED:01,/02/98 09722
obD05125 220 |SHIPPED 12/31/97 SIGNED: C.RAPPLE 11.75
REFERENCE SUBTOTAL 80.00 [CONTINUED NEXT PAGE

QUESTIONS? CALL OUR CUSTOMER ACCOUNT SERVICES. 8C0-622-1147. 7AM - 3PM (CST) MONDAY - FRIDAY.
TO ENSURE PRCPER CREDIT PLEASE RETURN THE REMITTANCE ADVICE (1ST PAGE CF THIS INVOICE) WITH YOUR PAYMENT.
MAIL TO: FEDERAL EXPRESS CORP, PO. BOX 1140, MEMPHIS, TN 28101 - 1140,

e T AL P g o ere s s




JAMES S. ALVES

BRIAN H. BIBEAU
KATHLEEN BLIZZARD
ELIZABETH C. BOWMAN
RICHARD S. BRIGHTMAN
PETER C. CUNNINGHAM
RALPH A, DEMEQ
THOMAS M. DEROSE
WILLIAM H. GREEN
WADE L. MOPPING
FRANK E. MATTHEWS
RICHARD D. MELSON
ANGELA R. MORRISON
GARY V. PERKO
MICHAEL P, PETROVICH
DAVID L. POWELL
WILLIAM D. PRESTON
CAROLYN S. RAEPPLE
DOUGLAS S, ROBERTS
GARY P. SAMS

ROBERT P. SMITH
CHERYL G. STUART

Hoppring GREEN SaMs & SMITH
PROFESSIONAL ASSOCIATION

ATTORNEYS AND COUNSELORS
123 SOUTH CALHOUN STREET
POST OFFICE BOX 8528
TALLAHASSEE. FLORIDA 32314
(850) 222-7500
FAX (830) 224-8551

FAX (85Q) 425-3415

January 15, 1998

Y

KEVIN 8. COVINGTON
RANDOLPH M. GIDDINGS
KIMBERLY A. GRIPPA
GARY K. HUNTER, JR,
JONATHAN T. JOHNSON
ROBERT A. MANNING
W. STEVE SYKES
T. KENT WETHERELL, I}

3
OF CouNseL
W. ROBERT FOKES

Ms. PhilAnn Scully
Utilities, Inc.

2335 Sanders Road
Northbrook, IL 60062

Dear PhilAnn:

Enclosed is our statement for professional services
rendered and expenses incurred on behalf of Utilities, Inc.
through December 1997.

If you have any questions about the enclosed statement,
please give me a call.

Very truly yours,
Richard D. Melson

RDM/clp
Enclosure

S&478.1



HopriNg GREEN SAMS & SMITH
PROFESSIONAL ASSOCIATION

ATTORNEYS AND COUNSELORS

STATEMENT

January 15, 1598 |
Billed through 12/31/97 g
Bill number _UTIL-00101-093 RDM

Utilities, Inc.

c/o Ms. PhilAnn Scully

2335 Sanders Road I
Northbrook, IL 60062 e R ot

Lake Utilities Limited Proceeding -

PN o . Lo
b . I T [ R

7
VA

FOR PROFESSIONAL SERVICES RENDERED

12/02/97 RDM

12/11/97 RDM

12/15/97 RDM
12/16/97 RDM

12/17/97 RDM

12/19/97 RDM

DISBURSEMENTS

Telephone call from Shreve re rescheduled
meeting; report to Kramer and Rasmussen re same.

Review and comment on customer notice; prepare
transmittals for notice, undertakings and tariff
sheets; confer with Garcia re same.

Multiple telephone conferences with Shreve,

Vaccaro and Willis re upcoming agenda and
possible rate case settlement; review documents

and prepare for agenda conference.

Attend agenda; negotiate with Shreve re possible
settlement; report to client; negotiate with
Shreve and staff for deferral; obtain deferral of

agenda item.

Confer with Kramer and Seidman re status of case
and settlement negotiations.

Telephone call from Vaccaro; prepare letter
waiving 8 and 12 month clocks; confer with Kramer
re same; finalize and file letter.

Richard D. Melson 5.90 hrs 215 /hr

Total fees for this matter

Copying Charges
Long Distance

POST OFFICE BOX 6526 O TALLAHASSEE, FLORIDA 32314 0O (850) 222-7300

.20

.90

.10

.00

.30

.40

1,268.

T

hrs

hrs

hrs

hrs

hrs



T

Horring GREEN SaMs & SMITH
PROFESSIONAL ASSOCIATION

ATTORNEYS AND COUNSELORS

STATEMENT

Utilities, Inc.
Bill number UTIL-00101-093 RDM tzz

Facsimiles ' )
Mileage Cﬂa 7W¢ 5.76

Total disbursements for this matter Q§\’ S 25.86

Mid-County 1996 Test Year Rate Case OU}D
FOR PROFESSIONAL SERVICES RENDERED O%a

12/01/97 RDM Telephone conference with Rasmussen re notice to
developers. .20 hrs
12/02/97 RDM Attend PSC agenda on interim rates; report to
client re same; confer with Rasmussen re
developer notice and re Fuchs questions; confer
with Garcia re tariffs and notice. .90 hrs

12/15/97 RDM Review and file interim tariff sheets and interim
rate notice; review corporate undertakings and
confer with Garcia re required corrections;
telephone call from Brubaker re revised form of
customer meeting notice; adapt notice to
Mid-County and confer with Garcia re same. 1.10 hrs

12/16/97 RDM Review draft customer meeting notice; provide to
Brubaker for staff review; confer with Brubaker
re combined mailing of interim rate and customer

meeting notices. .30 hrs

12/18/97 RDM Confer with Brubaker re status of notices. .20 hrs

12/19/97 RDM Confer with staff re notices; forward required
changes to Garcia; confer with Garcia. .30 hrs

12/22/97 RDM Review final interim and customer notices; confer
with Garcia re same; follow-up with PSC staff re
approval date of tariff sheets; telephone Garcia

re same. .40 hrs

12/23/97 RDM Telephone conference with Garcia re affidavits;
telephone call to Brubaker re schedule for filing
affidavits; review interim rate order and forward

to Garcia. .30 hrs

12/29/97 RDM Telephone call to Brubaker re status of tariff

sheets. .10 hrs

12/30/97 RDM Telephone call from Brubaker re notice; prepare
amended notice; memo to Garcia re same; TCT
Rasmussen re mailing labels for amended notice. .90 hrs

Richard D. Melson ' 4.70 hrs 215 /hr 1,010.50

POST OFFICE BOX 6526 O TALLAHASSEE, FLORIDA 32314 0 (850) 222-7500
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Hoprring GREEN SAMS & SMITH
PROFESSIONAL ASSOCIATICN

ATTORNEYS AND COUNSELORS

STATEMENT
Utilities, Inc. PAGE 3
Bill number UTIL-00101-093 RDM
Total fees for this matter S l,oiO.SO
DISBURSEMENTS
Copying Charges _ 102.25
Long Distance 26.65
Postage : 1.88
Facsimiles - 67.00
Federal Express LT 46.00
074 ANY
Total disbursements for this matter kS’Y% S 243.78
19 o 22
BILLING SUMMARY O‘a?"o |, 2557
Richard D. Melson 10.60 hrs 215 /hr 2,279.00
TOTAL FEES $ 2,279.00
TOTAL DISBURSEMENTS $ 269.64
TOTAL CHARGES FOR THIS BILL $ 2,548.64

POST OFFICE BOX 6526 0 TALLAHASSEE, FLORIDA 32314 0 (850) 222-7500
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—FLORIDA PUBLIC SERVICE COMMISSION

2540 Shumard Oak Blvd. # Tallahassee, Florida 32399-0850

-

Date: 1-26-98
— — 4 +
Date Paid This number must appear on
e . Pendine all checks or correspondence
Utilities, Incorporated Amount Paid _Pending regarding this invoice.
Attn: Mr. Frank Garcia Check 4
2335 Sanders Road
Northbrook. IL 60062-6196 L) Check L] Cash
PSC Signature
Please make checks payable to: FLORIDA PUBLIC SERVICE COMMISSION
QUANTITY DESCRIPTION PRICE AMOUNT
11/09-21/1997
Hillary Y. Kemp 1988.73
PER DIEM w300 s 390.CC
MEALS 262 O 03 $__ 232 <C
LODGING 263 ¢ 04 s /b>/8 45
MILEAGE B 05 S /1,48
AIRFARE 62 ¢ 06 §__ 230 <
RENT-A-CAR 26 o7 $
MISCELLANEOUS B3 O 09 s___ 49,95
TOTAL s /98575 ‘
o5 & o H HKemy i ﬁ Z7é o
~Tge gLis 19T |
PSC/RAR-8 Rev. 11/94 T—;)*TA_L ~]_ 2.8«8‘ —73/\

Utilities, Incor orated
Attn: Mr. Frank garcia
2335 Sanders Road
Northbrook, IL 60062-6196

EHS:mc.arre. -
Attachment(s)
C: Miss Martha Coggins




FEUY

Public Serbice Commission

of Florida State
-M-E-M-0-R-A-N-D-U-M- =

DATE: January 13, 1998
TO: RECORDS SECTION, DIVISION OF RECORDS OF AND E;;QR%ING

FRéM: EVELYN H. SEWELL. CHIEF OF FISCAL SERVICES;%V’
RE: INVOICING FOR REIMBURSABLE TRAVEL EXPENSES

Reimbursable travel expenses were incurred by the Commission employee(s) listed
below, and the related travel voucher(s) and receipt(s) are attached:

DATE OF TRAVEL EMPLOYEE
11/09-21/1997 Hillary Y. Kem

Elbert E. Phi]?ips
Charleston J. Winston

Please invoice the following entity, and include the date(s) of travel:

Utilities, Incorporated

Attn: Mr. Frank Garcia

2335 Sanders Road . R
Northbrook, IL  60062-6196 : Il

" EHS:mc.arre. -
Attachment(s)
c: Miss Martha Coggins

arre.adm (F-9)



FLORIDA PUBLIC SERVICE COMMISSION  T#7/(

2540 Shumard Oak Blvd. # Tallahassee, Florida 32399-0850

Date:_l___z_é_j_g_S__.__ _ :. - u’
// Utilities. Incorporated Date Paid This number must appear on
‘ Attn: Mr. Frank Garcia Paid Pending all checks or correspondence
2335 Sanders Road Amount Pai regarding this invoice.
Northbrook, IL 60062-6196 Check #
[J Check [ Cash
PSC Signature
' Please make checks payable to: FLORIDA PUBLIC SERVICE COMMISSION
QUANTITY DESCRIPTION PRICE AMOUNT
11/09-21/1997
Elbert E. Phillips 2612.64

PER DIEM 28Q L 02 Dol
MEALS 2282 O 03 $_ 2R35O0
LODGING 2862 & 04 $/42/ 5. 48
MILEAGE 6RO 05 $ ;95.&52

RE 8 < 06 §_275.e
Q?JQA-CAR 26X ?_ 07 $ & /b, %:7
MISCELLANEQUS 28R O 09 s__2/.%/
TOTAL $.26/2 67 9\74 7777 pZa

08 s phi)lios o 7 e
| 05 o6 co¥ £ Phil C St ET 5
PSC/RAR-8 Rev. 1194 TOTAL 5612, 64
TN e

e ——— e+ e e - o

Utilities, Incorporated
Attn: Mr. Frank Garcia
2335 Sanders Road
Northbrook, IL 60062-6196

EHS:mc.arre. -
Attachment(s)
c: Miss Martha Coggins

arre.adm (F-9)
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Public Serbice Commission

of Florida State
-M-E-M-0-R-A-N-D-U-M-

DATE: January 13, 1998

T0: RECORDS SECTION, DIVISION OF RECORDS OF AND REP TING
FROM:  EVELYN H. SEWELL, CHIEF OF FISCAL SERVICES}%&%?QR

RE: INVOICING FOR REIMBURSABLE TRAVEL EXPENSES

Reimbursable travel expenses were incurred by the Commission employee(s) listed
below, and the related travel voucher(s) and receipt(s) are attached:

DATE OF TRAVEL EMPLOYEE
11/08-21/1997 Hillary Y. Kem

Elbert E. Phi]?ips
Charleston J. Winston

Please invoice the following entity, and include the date(s) of travel:

Utilities, Incorporated
Attn: Mr. Frank Garcia
2335 Sanders Road
Northbrook, IL 60062-6196

EHS:mc.arre. -
Attachment(s)
c: Miss Martha Coggins

arre . adm (F-9)



FLORIDA PUBLIC SERVICE COMMISSION %Cz/%

2540 Shumard Qak Blvd. & Tallahassee, Florida 32399-0850

Date: Ji‘iﬁ_s__

—

Utilities, Incorporated
Attn: Mr. Frank Garcia
2335 Sanders Road
Northbrook, IL 60062-6196

Date Paid

Amount Paid _Pending

Check #

—

4 4
This number must appear on
all checks or correspondence
regarding this invoice.

O] Check [ Cash

PSC Signature

Please make checks payable to: FLORIDA PUBLIC SERVICE COMMISSION

QUANTITY DESCRIPTION PRICE AMOUNT
11/09-21/1997
Charleston J. Winston 1970.38
PER DIEM %Q & 02 s Aoeh
MEALS BRY 03 $__ KR35 .cC
LODGING 262 <, 04 $_/3/%.6%
MILEAGE 263 ¢ 05 $ /49
AIRFARE 28R & 06 §___ 34, TC 55 -
RENT-A-CAR %_ _ 07 s R
MISCELLANEOUS %62 < 09 s .08 S ee-C "
(970,38 vl e
7 L . « - d
o5 oG cof . coinsten //4‘?’ ~—
PSC/RAR-8 Rev. [1/94 TOTAI:. 1970.38
S merm e ey Wit by, WG BN TUML LIS TYaLe Vo) Ul LitdveE T "m"_“"_"_‘
Utilities, Incorporated

Attn: Mr. Frank Garcia

2335 Sanders Road

Northbrook, IL 60062-6196

EHS:mc.arre. -

Attachment(s)

C: Miss Martha Coggins

arre.acm (F-9)
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Public Service Commission

of Florida State --
-M-E-M-0O-R-A-N-D-U-M-

DATE:  January 13, 1998

TO: RECORDS SECTION, DIVISION OF RECORDS OF AND REP TING
FROM:  EVELYN H. SEWELL. CHIEF OF FISCAL SERVICES;%?%?QR

RE: INVOICING FOR REIMBURSABLE TRAVEL EXPENSES

Reimbursable travel expenses were incurred by the Commission employee(s) 1isted
below, and the related travel voucher(s) and receipt(s) are attached:

DATE OF TRAVEL EMPLOYEE
11/09-21/1997 Hillary Y. Kemp

Elbert E. Phillips
Charleston J. Winston "

Please invoice the following entity, and include the date(s) of travel:

Utilities, Incorporated
Attn: Mr. Frank Garcia
2335 Sanders Road
Northbrook, IL 60062-6196

EHS:mc.arre. -
Attachment(s)
C: Miss Martha Coggins

arre.adm (F-9)
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HOTEL & SUITES

38724 U.S. 19 North
Tarpon Springs. Florida 34689
Phone (813) 934-5781
Fax (813) 934-1755

Room
{ Name & Address
Arrive Date e
Dept. Date o
DUNN , HIKE et
FL 300538511729 Foon Pa
' A t R
1116 PARKSIDE DR Gz
Mkt/Seg -
ORMOND BCH , FL 32174
Fullg: @sem?  Gapm o
OWNED BY MENNA BROTHERS INC, AND OPERATED BY MENNA BROTHERS INC. UNDEF
LICENSE FROM HOLIDAY INNS, INC.
The management is not responsible for any valuables not secured in safety deposit boxt
provided at the front office. | agree that my liability for the charges is not waived and agree
be held personally liable in the event that the indicated person, company or association fails
pay for any part of the full amount of such charges.
X
SIGNATURE
'};‘bA%E |CODE| REFERENCE | .ID |~ DESCRIPTION | ~CHARGE - | 'PAYMENT | - " BALANCE. . ' .
0113 i 337 [ 19044728823 2.23% Rl
0113 (10113000 |PCW | ROOM RATE B8.20% R
0113 110113001 |PCK | STATE SALES TAIX 5,174 il
0113 8120113002 (PCH | COUNTY TAX 3.533 408
0114 4920114000 |PCK | LONB DIST ADJ i ~g.254
HETOTALEE 87,598
4 d"fl;" U'.S‘
. /72/(«(— - [ N >
AT W G
(g AT PR L
- (« ,/) \\ /
- N
H
)/v,




1714798
$'1/14/98
/16798

due:after 15.c
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Horprping GrREEN SaAaMs & SMITH
PROFESSIONAL ASSOCIATION

ATTORNEYS AND COUNSELORS

ELIZABETH C. BOWMAN

WILLIAM H., GREEN

RICHARD D. MELSON
DAVID L., POWELL

JAMES S, ALVES GARY K. HUNTER, JR.
BRIAN H. BIBEAZURD 123 SOUTH CALMOUN STREET JONATHAN T. JOHNSON
KATHLEEN BLIZZA
POST OFFICE BOX 6526 ROBERT A. MANNING

ANGELA R, MORRISON
RICHARD 5. BRIGHTMAN TALLAHASSEE, FLORIDA 32314 GARY V. PERKO
PETER C. CUNNINGHAM KAREN M, PETERSON
RALPH sA. DEMEO e (904) 222-7500 . ’ MICHAEL P, PETROVICH
THOMAS M, DERO v T I R. SCOTT RUTH

X . .
i FAX (904) 224-855| N W. STEVE SYKES
WADE L. HOPPIN R T. KENT WETHERELL, It
FRANK E. MATTHEWS v FAX (904) 425-3415 :_ J .
W OF CouNstL
W. ROBERT FCOKES

WILLIAM D, PRESTON
CAROLYN S. RAEFPLE

DOUGLAS S, ROBERTS February 19, 1998
GARY P. SAMS

ROBERT P, SMITH

CHERYL G. STUART

Ms. PhilAnn Scully
Utilities, Inc.

2335 Sanders Road
Northbrook, IL 60062

Dear PhilAnn:

Enclosed is an amended statement for professional
services rendered and expenses incurred on behalf of
Utilities, Inc. through January 1998. Please disregard the
previous statement.

If you have any questions about the enclosed amended
statement, please give me a call.

Very truly yours,
Richard D. Melson

RDM/clp
Enclosure

cc: Frank Garcia

$6475.1
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Hopring GrREEN SAMS & SMITH
PROFESSIONAL ASSQOCIATION

ATTORNEYS AND COUNSELORS

STATEMENT

AMENDED

et e

February 19, 1998

et e an e e iy e a1

Billed through 01/31/98 BRI —
Bill number UTIL-00101- 097 ‘RDM . \t S
Utilities, Inc. , — S

c¢/o Ms. PhilAnn Scully - ‘,j S P I B [¢: ;“; A
‘ ‘ ; R A O I

2335 Sanders Road S L )
Northbrock, IL 60062 C/Z
’”“”“’ LTy - ,
1:411 ;' \’j:-—'\kg
Lake Utilities Limited Proceeding "'””“““~~w~m*huwﬁwmwmwmwmwmmm ..................
Balance forward as of bill number 096 dated 02/13/98 $ 2,548.64

FOR PROFESSIONAL SERVICES RENDERED

01/21/98 RDM Confer with Shreve re status of customer meetings

re settlement; confer with Kramer re same. .50 hrs
01/27/98 RDM Attempt to contact Shreve; report to Vaccaro re

status of settlement negotiations. .20 hrs
01/28/98 RDM Confer with Shreve re status of settlement. .20 hrs
01/29/98 RDM Confer with Shreve re status of settlement;“

report to Kramer and Wenz re same. ﬂ .70 hrs

Richard D. Melson 1.60 hrs 215 /hr 344.00

Total fees for this matter $ 344.00
DISBURSEMENTS

Copying Charges 1.25

Long Distance 5.94

Facsimiles 6.00

Total disbursements for this matter $ 13.19
Mid-County 1996 Test Year Rate Case
FOR PROFESSIONAL SERVICES RENDERED

.20 hrs

01/05/98 RDM Review and file affidavit of notice.

POST OFFICE BOX 6526 0 TALLAHASSEE, FLORIDA 32314 0 (850) 222-7500



HoprriNe GREEN SAMS & SMITH
PROFESSIONAL ASSOCIATION

ATTORNEYS AND COUNSELORS

F9192

STATEMENT

Utilities,

Bill number

01/07/98

01/08/98

01/09/98

01/12/98
01/14/98
01/20/98
01/21/98
01/23/98

01/23/98
01/26/98
01/28/98

01/28/98
01/29/98

RDM

RDM

CGS

CGS

CGS
CGS

Inc.

UTIL-00101-097 RDM

Confer'with Brubaker re status of audit report;
meet with Willis and Merchant re customer
meeting; telephone conference with Garcia.

Follow-up with Brubaker re status of audit
report; telephone call to Rasmussen re upcoming
customer meeting and staff plan for meetings with
developers/customer groups.

Obtain and forward copy of audit report to

client; confer with Garcia re response to audit
report; telephone call from staff re gquestions
from HOA President; confer with Rasmussen re
same.

Confer with Rasmussen re audit report and
customer meeting; conference call with Willis re

customer meeting.

Confer with Rasmussen re results of customer
meeting; obtain data request from staff and
forward to Garcia.

Telephone call from Brubaker re informal
deposition of Garcia; review billing information
to prepare updated rate case expense estimate.

Confer with Garcia and Kramer re allocation
study; coordinate arrangements for informal
deposition.

Review response to staff audit report; confer
with Garcia; prepare memo re fee estimate; revise

and file audit report response.

Conference with Melson regarding cost allocation
study and staff questions.

Conference with Garcia; prepare for and attend
informal discovery session.

Review responses to staff data requests; file
response to second data request; confer with
Garcia re revised response to first data reguest.

Call to Garcia regarding data requests.

Conference with Merchant; conference with Garcia.

5.40 hrs

Richard D. Melson
3.40 hrs

Cheryl Stuart

POST OFFICE BOX 6526 00 TALLAHASSEE, FLORIDA 32314 0 (850) 222-7500

215 /hr
200 /hr

PAGE

.90

.60

.80

.40

.40

.30

.30

.80

.20

.50

.70

.20
.50

1,161.
680.

hrs

hrs

hrs
hrs
hrs
hrs
hrs

hrs
hrs
hrs
hrs

hrs

hrs

00
00
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HoprrPing GREEN SAMsS & SMITH

PROFESSIONAL ASSOCIATION
ATTORNEYS AND COUNSELORS

Inc.

Utilities,
Bill number

DISBURSEMENTS

BILLING SUMMARY

STATEMENT
PAGE 3
UTIL-00101-087 RDM
Total fees for this matter $ 1,841.00
Copying Charges 445.30
Long Distance 47.44
Postage 1.65
Facsimiles 83.00
Federal Express 81.00
Mileage 10.03
Total disbursements for this matter S 668.42
Richard D. Melson 7.00 hrs 215 /hr 1,505.00
Cheryl Stuart 3.40 hrs 200 /hr '6€80.00
TOTAL FEES S 2,185.00
TOTAL DISBURSEMENTS S 681l.61
TOTAL CHARGES FOR THIS BILL $ 2,866.61
NET BALANCE FORWARD $ 2,548.64 ’?Q
TOTAL BALANCE NOW DUE $ 5,415.25
o>
6 .
QO
2 wt
ey 7% 6’061“
e /A b 72
=5
- ,O&F‘U A \7)
o vz
GRS
3 C
0%*

POST OFFICE BOX 6526 0 TALLAHASSEE, FLORIDA 32314 0 (850) 222-7500



