
Florida Public Service Commission 
2540 Shumard Oak Blvd 
Tallahassee, FL 32399 

This is to inform you that John's Payphone Service is offtcially closed and will not be renewing its license 
for the year 2000. The two pay phones that were installed were removed during July of 1999 and not 
installed in another location, but were disposed of. The attached return will be my last Please forwartl 
this announcement to the respective departments . 

Thank You, 

~m 1~~(J>Vt
John Kinnecom 

\ 29 East Wentworth Street, 

Englewood, FI, 34223 

5539 
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TO AVOID PENALTY AND INTEREST CHARGES. THE REGU~RY ASSESSMENT FEE RETURN MUST BE FI.LED ON OR IlE~ 01/3112000 

Pay Telephone SeI .:e Provider Regulatory Asses_ .ent Fee Return 
1" 	 ,- .. 

FOR PSC 1,E Q.NLYFlorida Public Service ¢?hlmr~sf~~, f~ L 
Checkil ~5STATUS: (Sec FUing Instructions on )ll'</<, pT,l'rrrnl'. .. .. uLJ / 

oD.rJl)$ 	 0603002J.. Actual Return TG223 
003001Estimated Return John's Payphone Service 99 DEC 22 Ml 8: EO $ 	 P 

___ Amended Return 0603002129 East Wentworth Street MAll HOfHJI 004011 
Englewood FL•• 34223-304 .. t --- T-- '-- • $ 	 I 

o~~ '~l J~! cPERIOD COVERED: 
Posunark Date I,) -;;0 - 910110111999 TO Df·- 11 {", r·, '; (~, -, ! 

_ \ .1 /.; .' 	:....... ',) 
 Jnilials of Preparer ht112/3111999 
Please Complete Below If Official Mailing Address Has Changed 

(Name of Company) 	 (Address) (City/State) (Zip) 

LINE 
NO. ACCOUNT CLASSIFICATION AMOUNT 

1. 	 Gross Operating Revenue (Florida) $ 115.'-0 

2. 	 Gross Intrastate Revenue IJ 5~<Oc) 

3. 	 LESS: Amounts Paid to Other Telecommunications Companies* ( ---0- ) 
(see "2. Fees" on back) 

4. 	 TOTAL REVENUES for Regulatory Assessment Fee Calculation $ IlS. GO 
(Line 2 less Line 3) 

5. 	 Regulatory Assessment Fee Due - (Multiply Line 4 by 0.0015) 

6. 	 Penalty for Late Payment (see "3. Failure to File by Due Date" on back) 

7. 	 Interest for Late Payment (see "3. Failure to File by Due Date" on back) 

50. 00
8. 	 TOTAL AMOUNT DUE $~c-r 

/'y7 ~ 
~.~o 

AS PROVIDED IN SECTION 364.336 FLORIDA STATUTES, THE MINIMUM ANNUAL FEE IS $50 


THIS FORM MUST BE COMPLETED AND RETURNED REGARDLESS OF THE AMOUNT OF REVENUES REPORTED 


9. 	 Number of pay telephones in operation at close of period covered 

63-271631JOHN M. KlNNECOM 
184 	 885PH. 941-475-8898 


129 EAST WENTWORTH STREET 

ENGLEWOOD, FL 34223-3041 Dat~ ~o) ,qqq 


'G 

'"' ~~ CO~OO----'4n"\-,LN",-",-,',--"", 	

~(jY"'l $ 50o)<.<!l:x, 

'-"-'---'------.:...=-=--L:...~---________Dollars 

NationsBank 
, 	 NaLionsBank, N.A. 

Florida 

best of my knowledge and belief the above 
:ingly makes a fal se statement in writing with 
iecond degree. 

___ ~L 20)994 
(D~le) 

l~~ax Number ( 

? I 




From: 
Sent: 
To: 
Subject: 

Paula lsler 
Tuesday, December 28,1999 8:Ol AM 
Kay Flynn 
RE: TG223 -John's Payphone Service 

It is OK to open the docket to cancel. 

- - - - -  Original Message----- 
From: Kay Flynn 
Sent: Tuesday, December 28, 1999 7:53 AM 
To: Paula Isler 
Subject: TG223 - John's Payphone Service 

Should we open a docket on this provider's request to cancel? Kay 
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Kav Flvnn 

From: 
Sent: 
To : 
Subject: 

Jackie Edwards 
Tuesday, December 28,1999 1 1 :22 AM 
Kay Flynn 
Proposed Changes To Form 991 462-EU-00004 

Docket Number 991462-EU - Form Number 991462-EU-00004 

Petition for determination of need for an electrical power plant in 
Okeechobee County by Okeechobee Generating Company, L.L.C. 

Change In Appointment Information - Prehearing Conference - Day 1 of a 1 
day appointment - 03/01/2000 - 2:OO PM to 5:OO PM - Tallahassee - Room 
152 - Involving Jacobs - 
Change in date - FROM: 03/01/2000 TO: 03/03/2000 - 

To obtain a copy of form 991462-EU-00004: 

1. Access the Commissioner Calendar System 
by clicking the START button, followed by 
Network Menus, followed by PSC Applications, 
followed by Commissioner Calendar System. 

2. When the calendar appears, click the File menu option 

3. Choose the Print My CCS Forms option. 

If you have any questions regarding this e-mail please contact Jackie 
Edwards at 413-6008. 

at the top of the screen. 
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