State of Florida

Public Serbice Commission

CAPITAL CIRCLE OFFICE CENTER o 2540 SHUMARD OAK BOULEVARD
TALLAHASSEE, FLORIDA 32399-0850

-M-E-M-O-R-A-N-D-U-M-

RE

DATE: FEBRUARY 3, 2000

TO: DIRECTOR,

(

2

DIVISION OF RECORDS AND REPORTING L(B,gyé)'z

\

FROM: DIVISION OF COMMUNICATIONS (GILCHRIST)Y 7/ @
DIVISION OF LEGAL SERVICES (KEATING) y/i

O

RE: REQUESTS FOR CANCELLATION OF PAY TELEPHONE CERTIFICATES

AGENDA: 02/15/00

- CONSENT AGENDA - INTERESTED

PARTICIPATE

SPECIAL INSTRUCTIONS: NONE

PERSONS MAY

Please place the following Requests for Cancellation of Pay

Telephone Certificates on the consent agenda for approval.

DOCKET COMPANY NAME CERT. Eff. Date

NO. NO.

992027-TC Stephen K. Wright d/b/a 7050 12/28/99
Telestar Payphones

000027-TC American Public Telephone 5058 11/20/99
Company, South, Inc.

000066-TC Charles Kaufman 4667 12/22/99

000067-TC Coinphone Plus 6080 12/31/99
Communications, Inc.

000068-TC Swire Brickell Three Inc. 6054 12/31/99

000069-TC Lamp Post Lounge, Inc. 5600 12/31/99

000070-TC Dr. Henry N. Merritt, Jr., 1432 12/31/99
P.A.

000073-TC Swire Brickell One Inc. 5023 12/31/99

991822-TC High Point Communications, 2084 08/23/99

Inc.

DOCUMENT NUMBER-DATE

01523 FeB-38

FPSC-RECGRDS/REPORTING



DOCKET NOS. 99202i:TC, 000027-TC, 000066-TC, 660067—TC, 000068~
TC, 000069-TC, 000070-TC, 000073-TC, 991822-TC, 000103-TC,
000106-TC

DATE: FEBRUARY 3, 2000

10. 000103-TC Shayne E. Ryan 6089 12/31/99

11. 000106-TC Judy C. Lozano 5080 09/30/99

Pursuant to Section 364.356, Florida Statutes, certificate holders
must pay a minimum annual Regulatory Assessment Fee (RAF)of $50 if
the certificate was active during any portion of the calendar year.
Neither the cancellation of its certificate nor the failure to
receive a RAF Return for 1999 shall relieve an entity from its
obligation to pay the RAF for 1999.



Kay Flynn

From: Paula Isler

Sent: Wednesday, December 29, 1999 8:48 AM
To: Kay Flynn

Subject: RE: TG552 - Telestar Payphones

It is OK to open the docket for cancellation for this company.

————— Original Message-----

From: Kay Flynn

Sent: Tuesday, December 28, 1999 5:35 PM
To: Paula Isler

Subject: TG552 - Telestar Payphones

We received a request to cancel along with this PATS provider's RAF
payment. Should we open a docket?

Kay



TO AVOID PENALTY AND INTEREST CHARGES, THE REGULAT™ARY ASSESSMENT FEE RETURN MUST BE FILED ON OR BEFQRE 01/31/2000

Pay Telephone Ser\ .e Provider Regulatory Asses: 2nt Fee Return

Florida Public Serv1ce COmrmssnon FOR F3C USE ONLY
STATUS: (Sec Filing lnsfruch(ms on hack oI‘ Fonn) Checki ‘5_7
EEOYILE '\""F \)";;".1‘ g
" Actual Return TG552 ' § S0P 0603002
—— Boimated Rewrn | Tejesiar Payphones 9 UEC 28 ) g 35 5 P
6700 S.W. 82nd Avenue AlL RO 060828‘1)?
Newberry, FL, 32669- 7164 M= ROGH g :
PERIOD COVERED: NATE
07/06/1999 TO ‘ i posemrt owe 2 J0) /17
12'/31/1999 ;‘)‘ 2 . r": QN 1000 Initials of Preparer 7”76
Please Complete Below If Official Mailing Address Has Changed
(Name of Company) (Address) (City/State) (Zip)
LINE |
NO. ACCOUNT CLASSIFICATION AMOUNT
. . s~
1. Gross Operating Revenue (Florida) $§ 56, d
2. Gross Intrastate Revenue ' | [ 47 o
3. LESS: Amounts Paid to Other Telecommunications Companies* (Y433, 39 )
(see "2. Fees" on back)
4. TOTAL REVENUES for Regulatory Assessment Fee Calculation $ 4y, &
(Line 2 less Line 3) :
5, Regulatory Assessment Fee Due - (Multiply Line 4 by 0.0015) 724
6. Penalty for Late Payment (see "3. Failure to File by Due Date" on back) O
7. Interest for Late Payment (see "3. Failure to File by Due Date" on back) O
8. TOTAL AMOUNT DUE 4\@/ $ 50 &
/
07 ot
AS PROVIDED IN SECTION 364.336 FLORIDA STATUTES, THE MINIMUM ANNUAL FEE IS $50
THIS FORM MUST BE COMPLETED AND RETURNED REGARDLESS OF THE AMOUNT OF REVENUES REPORTED
9. Number of pay telephones in operation at close of period covered O

by this Return

*  These amounts must be intrastate only and must be verifiable.

I, the undersigned owner/officer of the above-named company, have read the foregoing and declare that to the best of my knowledge and belief the above
information is a true and correct statement. I am aware that pursuant to Section 837.06. Florida Statutes, whoever knowingly makes a false statement in writing with
the intent to mislead a public servant in the performance of his official duty shall be guilty of a misdemeanor of the second degree.

/Qﬁ:j« k k,\)nu# pfl) 7&(\’}— . {3~ 30- 59

(Signatre of Ceinpany Official) (Title) (Date)

Sf"o,,t. e ko) qlf}_ Telephone Number (2§73 )403-1097Fax Number (15 X ) M2 - LDY
(Preparer 6f Form - Please’Print Name)

F.E.I. No.

PSC/CMU-26 (Rev.11/11/99)





