ORIGINAL

Linda Williams

To: Paula Isler
Subject: RE: 000163-TC; Harold J. Baggett d/b/a Baggett Industries

Ok, will do. Thanks.

————— Original Message-----

From: Paula Isler

Sent: Thursday, April 27, 2000 11:12 AM

To: Linda Williams

Subject: 000163-TC; Harold J. Baggett d/b/a Baggett Industries

Hi Linda, I was getting ready to write this recommendation and found
that the company has paid the 1999 RAF. Therefore, please change the
docket title to:

Request for cancellation of Pay Telephone Certificate No. 5144 by

Harold J. Baggett d/b/a Baggett Industries, Effective 12/31/99.

Thanks.
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