REQUEST TO ESTABLISH DOCKET

(PLEASE TYPE)

Date__ November 1, 2000 Docket No. DO/{DS (a "TC

1. Division Name/Staff Name _ Competitive Services/Isler

2. OPR__ Competitive Services/Isler

3. OCR__ Legal Services

4. aested Docket Title Cancellation by Florida Public Service Commission of Pay Telephone Certificate
1899 '

No. «Bab-Igsued to Albert T. Stotl for Viclation of Rule 25-4.0161, F.A.C., Regulatory Assessment Fees;

Telecommunications Companies

5. Suggested Docket Mailing List (attach separate sheet if necessary)
A. Provide NAMES ONLY for regulated companies or ACRONYMS ONLY regulated industries,
as shown in Rule 25-22.104, F.A.C.
B. Provide COMPLETE name and address for all others. (Match representatives to clients.)

1. Parties and their representatives (if any)

Albert T. Stoll

2. Interested Persons and their representatives (if any)

6. Check one:
XX_ Documentation is attached.

Documentation will be provided with recommendation.

1 :\PSC\RAR\WP\ESTDKT.
PSC/RAR 10 (Revised 01/96)
DOCUMENT NUMRER -DATE

IS4 Nov-1 8

FPSC-RECORDS/REPORTING
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COMPANY IDENTIFICATION

Printed on 11/01/2000 at 0B:56:43 by PJI

Complete Name: Albert T. Stoll

Mailing Name: Albert T. Stoll
Company Code: TD757 FEID Number:

MATLING INFORMATION

Attention:

Address Line 1l: 6365 Casa Bella Lane

Address Line 2:

city: Boca Raton State: FL Zip Code: 233433-5436
E-mail Address: ALSTOLL@AQL.COM

Web Address:

Liaison 1: Albert T. Stoll Liaison 2:
Title: ' Owner Title:
Phone: (561) 750-1467 Phone:
Fax 1: (561) 750-1467 Fax 2:

COMPANY IDENTIFICATION
Printed on 11/01/2000 at 08:56:52 by PJI

Complete Name: Albert T. Stell

Mailing Name: Albert T. Stoll
Company Code: TD757 FEID Number:

COMPANY INFORMATION

Addresa Line l: 6365 Casa Bella Lane

Addresas Line 2:

City: Boca Raton State: FL Zip Code: 33433-5436
Reg. Date: 02/17/1988 Inactive Date:

Transfered To:

Trans. From:

Certificate 1: 1899 Certificate 2:
Corporate Type: Not Available
Service 1: PAT - Pay Telephcne

Service 2:

Service 3:

Service 4:

Class (WAW):

Phone Count: 19

County 1: County 2:
County 3: County 4:




- MaryAnn Kelley

From: MaryAnn Kelley

Sent: Thursday, September 14, 2000 7:57 AM
To: Paula Isler

Subject: FW. Address

I e-mailed this company because the letter regarding underpaid minimum
fee due that I sent was returned. His company code is TD757. Here was
his response. I guess he needs to be cancelled. I checked all his
prior returns to see if he indicated on them that he was no longer in
business and could find nothing stating this. I am inner-officing a
copy of the letter that I sent and the envelope to you. Let me know if
you need anything else.

Thanks...Mary Ann

————— Original Message-——--

From: ALSTOLL@acl.com [mailto:ALSTOLLEacl.com]
Sent: Wednesday, September 13, 2000 7:01 PM

Ta: MKelley@psc.state.fl.us
Subject: Re: Address

dear sir;
i have not been in the business for over a year or two.

i am no longer doing business,........... i am no longer providing any
services

thank you

albert stoll




-'MaryAnn Kelley

From: MalgAnn Kelley

Sent: Wednesday, September 13, 2000 1:12 PM
To: ‘alstoll@aol.com'

Subject: Address

Mr. Stoll:

I need to get an updated address for your telecommunications company,
Albert T. Stoll (TD757). Please e-mail me back with this information.
My e-mail address is mkelley@psc.state.fl.us

Thanks.
Mary Ann Kelley

Professional Accountant
Public Service Commission
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NOTICE OF REGULATORY ASSESSMENT FEE ADJUSTMENT
FLORIDA PUBLIC SERVICE COMMISSION, 2540 SHUMARD OAK BOULEVARD
TALLAHASSEE, FLORIDA 32399-0850
ADDITIONAL AMOUNT DUE
NAME OF UTILITY: Mr. Albert T. Stoll TD757
~ Albert T. Stoll
ADDRESS OF UTILITY: 6365 Casa Bella_Lane

Boca Raton, FL 33433-5436

It i5 necessary to adjust your Regulatory Assessment Fee Return covering the period
January 1 . 1999  through December 31 ., 1999 because

Ehe Gross Operating Revenues do not agree with the amounts reported in the Annual
eport.

there is an error in the computation:

X Underpaid Minimum Requlatory Assessment Fee

Total Revenue for 1999: 1993 RAF - Paid $ 14.50
Shoutld Have Paid $ 50.00

$ Minimum Fee Balance Due $ 35.50
Penalty Due $ 0.00

Interest Due $ 0.00

TOTAL AMOUNT DUE $ 35 .50

To avoid additional interest charges, please submit payment to address below, along
with this document, within two weeks of the date below. :

If you have any questions, please contact Mari)izzjgfiiey at (850) 413-6267.
Auqust 21, 2000 : 2Z/2/1Z/fi’/zza:;/igglﬁzzgézéa

(Date) (Evelyn H. SghelV Chief &
Bureau of Fiscal Services)

Florida Public Service Commission
2540 Shumard Oak Boulevard
Tallahassee, FL 32399-0850

ATTN: Fiscal Services

PSC/ADM 14 (08/97) (F-2)C:\WINDOWS\PROFILES\MKELLEY\DUELETTE .MAK
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TO AVOID PENALTY AND INTEREST CHARGES, THE REGULATORY ASSESSMENT FEE RETURN MUST BE FILED ON OR BEFORE 01/31/2000

Pay Telephone Service Provider Regulatory Assessment Fee Return

Florida Pub ¢( ,Se‘nvlcel Cdmmission FOR PSC USE ONLY
STATUS: o m@% ot w1 Checkt. . O3S
7 5O 002

Estimated Return
Albert T. Stoll $ P
A
mended Retum 6365 Casa Bella Lane MAlL ROOM e

Boca Raton, @:p§3ﬁ3—5436 o $ 1

PERIOD COVERED: =S DATE
Postmark Date / 97 (’704 5?

01/01/1999 TO g T N
12/31/1999 D 2’ L LT DES P Ph Initials of Preparer =27

3

Piease Complete Below If Official Malling Address Has Ch

(Name of Company) (Address) (City/State)

ACCOUNT CLASSIFICATION

Gross Operating Revenue (Florida)

Gross Intrastate Revenue

LESS: Amounts Paid to Other Telecommunications Companies*
(see "2. Fees" on back)

TOTAL REVENUES for Regulatory Assessment Fee Calculation
(Line 2 less Line 3)

Regulatory Assessment Fee Due — (Multiply Line 4 by 0.0015)

Penalty for Late Payment (see "3. Failure to File by Due Date” on back)
Interest for Late Payment (see "3. Failure to File by Due Date" on back)
TOTAL AMOUNT DUE |

AS PROVIDED IN SECTION 364.336 FLORIDA STATUTES, THE MINIMUM ANNUAL FEE IS $50
THIS FORM MUST BE COMPLETED AND RETURNED REGARDLESS OF THE AMOUNT OF REVENUES REPORTED

o

Number of pay telephones in operation at close of period covered
by this Return

*  These amounts must be intrastate only and must be verifiable,

I, the unders:gned owner/officer of the above-named company, have read the foregoimg and declare that to the best of my knowledge and belief the above
1 am aware that pursusnt to Section 837.06, Florida Statutes, whoever knowingly makes a false statement in writing with

information is a trug_and t statement.
the intent (WWWM official duty shall be guilty of a misdemeanor of the second degree.

/4 lgnaturt of Company Official) {Title)
—f f 77 O{/ Telephone Number ( ) Fax Number (

TPrepareﬁ Form - Please Print Name)

F.E.l. No.

PSC/CMU-26 (Rev.11/11/99)
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RAF ACCOUNT

Printed on 11/01/2000 at 09:01:21 by PJI

Albert T. Stoll (TD757)

Period Covered:01/01/1999-12/31/1999 Actual Return: Yes Operating Revenue: $7,000.00
Service: PAT Received RAF Form: Yes Interstate Revenue: $0.00
Due Date: 01/31/20C0 Payment Plan: No Net RAF Due: $50.00
Postmark Date: 12/20/1999 Extensjion: No Refund Issued: $0.00
Satisfied: No RAF Rate: 0.0015 Fine Paid: $0.00
DESCRIPTION AMOUNT DUE AMOUNT PAID AMOUNT OWED
RAF $50.00 $14.50 535.50
Penalty $0.00 $0.00 50.00
Interast 50.00 $0.00 $0.00
Extension Fee 50.00 $0.00 50.00
Additional Payment $0.00 $0.00 50.00
Total $50.00 5$14.50 $35.50
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