

HANIFY & KING PROFESSIONAL CORPORATION COUNSELLORS AT LAW

JAMES COYNE KING JOHN D. HANIFY HAROLD B. MURPHY DAVID LEE EVANS DANIEL J. LYNE TIMOTHY P. ONELL TERENCE P. MCCOURT JEFREY J. UTTON MICHAEL R. PERRY ROBERT E. RICHARDS, JR. CHARLES R. BENNETT, JR. KATHLEEN E. CROSS BARBARA W. PFIRRMAN GERARD P. RICHER THOMAS P. HARNISON ANDREW G. LIZOTTE D. ETHAN JEFFERY

CAF CMP

COM

CTR ECR LEG OPC

PAI

RGC

SER

KAREN A. WHITLEY DAVID C. KRAVITZ KATHLEEN R. CRUICKSHANK KENNETH E. STEINFIELD DANIEL J. DWYER ALEX M. RODOLAKIS TODD A. NEWMAN SHARON H. PATTON MATTHEW T. CONNOLLY DAVID C. JOHNSON JAMES J. MOYNIHAN ANDREW D. KANG MATTHEW J. GINSBURG CHRISTINE M. ANTONELLI C. NATHAN DEE HEATHER J. ZUBKE

ONE FEDERAL STREET BOSTON, MASSACHUSETTS 02110-2007 TELEPHONE (617) 423-0400 TELEFAX (617) 423-0498



December 20, 2001

BY HAND

Clerk's Office United States Bankruptcy Court Thomas P. O'Neill Federal Building 10 Causeway Street Boston, MA 02222-1074

Re: Essential.com, Inc. Chapter 11 Case No. 01-15339-WCH

Dear Sir or Madam:

AMR:sas

Enclosure

Dare 12/28/01

319018

Enclosed for filing in the above referenced case please find the following document:

- 1. Supplemental Fee Application To First Application For Compensation And Reimbursement of Expenses By Harold B. Murphy and Hanify & King Professional Corporation; and
- 2. Certificate of Service.

Kindly file this document and return a time-stamped copy to the awaiting messenger. Thank you in advance for your assistance.

ery truly yours. 101

C. Nathan Dee

DOCUMENT NUMBER-DATE

16046 DEC 26 a

FPSC-COMMISSION CLERK

UNITED STATES BANKRUPTCY COURT DISTRICT OF MASSACHUSETTS EASTERN DIVISION

In re:

ESSENTIAL.COM, INC.,

Debtor.

Chapter 11 Case No. 01-15339-WCH

SUPPLEMENTAL FEE APPLICATION TO FIRST APPLICATION FOR COMPENSATION AND REIMBURSEMENT OF EXPENSES BY HAROLD B. MURPHY AND HANIFY & KING PROFESSIONAL CORPORATION

To the Honorable William C. Hillman, Chief United States Bankruptcy Judge:

Pursuant to 11 U.S.C. §§ 328, 330 and 331, Fed. R. Bankr. P. 2016 and MLBR 2016-1, Hanify & King Professional Corporation ("H&K"), counsel to the debtor and debtor-inpossession, Essential.com, Inc. ("Debtor"), respectfully submits this Supplemental Fee Application ("Supplemental Fee Application") to the First Application for Compensation and Reimbursement of Expenses in connection with the above-referenced proceeding. By this Supplemental Fee Application, H&K seeks an award of its actual fees of \$9,240.00 and actual expenses of \$9,544.00 for the period from December 3, 2001 through December 19, 2001 ("Supplemental Application Period")¹. In support of this Application, H&K states as follows:

1. On June 29, 2001 (the "Petition Date"), the Debtor filed a voluntary petition for relief under chapter 11 of the Bankruptcy Code ("Code") in this Court. The Debtor continues to operate as a debtor-in-possession pursuant to Sections 1107 and 1108 of the Code.

¹ Although every effort has been made to include all fees and expenses for the Application Period in this Supplemental Fee Application, some fees and expenses may not have be included and H&K expressly reserves the right to make further application for fees and services not included herein or requests for payment to the Plan Trustee as provided for in the Plan.

2. On July 10, 2001, the Debtor filed an application to employ H&K as its counsel. On July 19, 2001, the Court entered an Order approving the Debtor's retention of H&K. A copy of the Court's Order authorizing H&K's continued employment is attached as an exhibit to the First Fee Application. H&K received a retainer of \$50,000 from the Debtor for its services in this case.

3. On December 11, 2001, H&K filed it First Fee Application requesting an Order approving the sum of \$193,396.50 on account of services rendered and \$26,842.05 on account of expenses incurred for the period between June 8, 2001 through November 31, 2001.

SUPPLEMENTAL FEE APPLICATION BY H&K

4. In accordance with the Court's order establishing, among other things, the hearing ("Confirmation Hearing") on confirmation of the Joint Plan of Liquidation ("Plan"), H&K has filed this Supplemental Fee Application.

A. ACTUAL FEES AND EXPENSES FOR DECEMBER 3 THROUGH DECEMBER 19, 2001

5. A detailed summary of the services rendered by H&K as counsel to the Debtor during the Supplemental Application Period is attached as Exhibit A. In general, these services related to:

- Responding to administrative claims issues regarding various contracts and leases between the Debtor and third parties;
- B. Responding to inquires from State Attorney Generals and Public Utilities
 Commissions regarding the sale of the Debtor's Customer Base and its impact on
 the Debtor's Telecommunications Licenses and other Regulatory Concerns;
- C. Attending to issues with respect to the service of the Plan and Disclosure Statement
- D. Negotiating an settlement agreement ("Settlement Agreement") between the
 Debtor and United Systems Access, Inc. regarding certain disputes between the
 parties related to the acquisition of the Customer Base. H&K also dedicated

-2-

efforts to draft and file a Motion to Approve the Settlement Agreement which was filed and served on December 14, 2001; and

E. Preparation of the First Fee Application.

6. During the period covered by the Supplemental Fee Application, H&K has expended a total of 47.20 hours in this matter for total requested compensation of \$9,240.00 at its customary and usual hourly rates. The compensation sought by H&K reflects an average hourly rate of approximately \$195.76 per hour.

7. In accordance with MLBR 2016-1(a), a statement containing the full names, initials, rates and total amount of services provided by each attorney or paraprofessional who provided services in this matter is incorporated as part of Exhibit B. A biographical description of each H&K attorney who provided services is attached as an exhibit to the First Fee Application.

8. During the Application Period, H&K has incurred actual expenses totaling \$9,544.00. These expenses are almost entirely related to the copying and service on all creditors of the Debtor and parties entitled to notice the following (a) the Plan and Disclosure Statement and (b) the Settlement Agreement and Motion for Approval. A summary of the expenses incurred for which reimbursement is herein sought is attached as Exhibit C. Reimbursement for expenses and all other disbursements in this case is sought in accordance with MLBR 2016-1 and <u>In re Bank of New England</u>, 134 B.R. 450 (Bankr. D. Mass. 1991).

B. ANTICIPATED FEES AND EXPENSES THROUGH CONFIRMATION

9. By this Supplemental Fee Application, H&K also seeks an award of its anticipated fees and expenses through confirmation of the Plan up to the amount of \$5,000.

-3-

10. H&K submits that the compensation for the services and reimbursement of expenses both actual and anticipated incurred in this matter is reasonable based on (i) the time and labor required, (ii) the complexity of the legal questions presented, (iii) the skill required to perform the legal services, (iv) the customary compensation in this District, (v) the experience and ability of the attorneys providing services and (vi) the results achieved.

11. A hearing on confirmation of the Plan is scheduled for December 21, 2001. The Plan provides that the Effective Date is the first business day after which the Confirmation Order becomes a Final Order. Under the Plan, after the Effective Date, a Plan Trustee will assume control of the Debtor's estate. H&K requests authority to deliver an invoice for payment to the Plan Trustee for its services and, provided that such invoice does not exceed \$5,000, the Plan Trustee be authorized to pay such invoice without the requirement of further Court approval.

WHEREFORE, Hanify & King Professional Corporation respectfully moves this Court for an Order:

(i) Approving payment to H&K in actual fees of \$9,240.00 and actual expenses of
 \$9,544.00 for the period from December 3, 2001 through December 19; 2001;

(ii) Authorizing and Compelling the Debtor to pay H&K such amounts;

(iii) Authorizing the Plan Trustee under the Plan to pay H&K's fees through the
 Effective Date of the Plan without further approval of the Court provided that
 such fees do not exceed \$5,000; and

-4-

(iv) Providing such other and further relief as is just and appropriate.

Hanify & King, P.C,

Harold B. Murphy (BB0# 363610) Alex M. Rodolakis (BBO#567781) C. Nathan Dee (BBO#646261) HANIFY & KING Professional Corporation One Federal Street Boston, MA 02110 (617) 423-0400 Telefax: (617) 556-8985

.

-- - -----

Dated: December 20, 2001

320363

EXHIBIT A

Essential

ť

-

Re: General Advice

Services:

Date	Atty	Description	Hours
12/03/01	MAS	Obtained updated docket sheet	.10
12/03/01	MAS	Prepared list with biographies of attorneys and paralegals who have worked on this case	1.90
12/03/01	AMR	Attention to settlement w/ USA; revise same; e-mail to client	.80
12/03/01	AMR	Telephone call w/ L. Connolly re: customer complaint; telephone call w/ B. Habbard re: same	.30
12/03/01	AMR	Attention to service of plan & disclosure draft affidavit of service for same	.40
12/03/01	AMR	Telephone call w/ N. Rasati re: Exodus Communications and rejection of contract; draft letter re: same	. 40
12/04/01	AMR	Attention to D&O policy and consideration of policy tail	.10
12/04/01	AMR	Atttention to review of fee application & edit & comments to C. Nathan Dee	1.00
12/04/01	AMR	Attention to e-mail from USA; respond to same	.20
12/04/01	AMR	Telephone call w/ B. Bailey re: Araya lease; review files, telephone call w/ B. Pallone re: same; conference w/ C. Nathan Dee re: same; review UCC filings	1.00
12/04/01	AMR	Telephone call w/ B. Pallone re: Verizon issues	.10
12/04/01	AMR	Telephone call w/ D. Swanson re: software issues	.10
12/04/01	AMR	Attention to USA settlement; reviews to agreement; telephone call w/ K. Hawa re: same	.70
12/05/01	AMR	Attention to revised USA agreement; review same; telephone call w/ K. Hawa re: same; follow up call w/ K. Hawa	.70
12/06/01	AMR	Telephone call w/ B. Pallone re: USA agreement; telephone call w/ D. Swanson re: same	.40

Essential (General Advice) Page 2

Services:

4

Date	Atty	Description	Hours	
12/06/01	AMR	Telephone call w/ B. Pallone re:	.20	
12/00/01		winddown issues		
12/06/01	AMR	Attention to ballots; conference w/ M. Casperson re: same	.10	
12/06/01	AMR	Attention to fee application; review & edit same	2.10	
12/06/01	AMR	Telephone call w/ R. Silver re: stock holder issues	.10	
12/06/01	AMR	Draft letter to B. Lemansky re: Araya lease; assemble attachments	.30	
12/06/01	AMR	Telephone call w/ E. Cratzwell re: administrative claim; telephone call w/ Guardian Storage re: claim	.20	
12/07/01	AMR	Telephone call w/ D. Lassman re: Smart Energy administrative claim; memo to client re: same; telephone call w/ B. Pallone re: same	.30	
12/07/01	AMR	Attention to review of fee application, further edits to same	1.30	
12/07/01	AMR	Attention to e-mails w/ K. Hawa; respond to same; telephone call w/ B. Pallone re: same	.60	
12/08/01	CND	Attention to P.V.C. issue; review six letters to various commissions	.90	
12/08/01	AMR	Attention to fee application; further reviews & edits to same	1.40	
12/09/01	CND	Review and revise narrative per AMR comments; review exhibits re: categories of time and revise same	8.00	
12/09/01	CND	Review and revise exhibits	.30	
12/10/01		Review draft narrative of Fee Application	1.10	
12/10/01	CND	Revise Essential Fee Application narrative per AMR comments	1.20	
12/10/01	CND	Revise Essential Fee Application narative per AMR comments	.90	
12/10/01	CND	Review categories re: sale, auction, miscellaneous, employees re: calculations	3.00	
12/10/01	MAS	Obtained updated docket sheet	.10	
12/10/01		Telephone call w/ B. Pallone re: Araya lease	.10	
12/10/01	AMR	Telephone call w/ A. Mattera re: Smart	.10	
12/10/01	AMR	Energy claim Attention to fee applicaiton; revise same; conference w/ C. nathan Dee re: same; finalize same	2.10	

ę.

Essential (General Advice) Page 3

Services:

. •

4

•

Date	Atty	Description	Hours
2/11/01	CND	Review category amounts; review Fee	4.00
		Application; prepare for filing;	
		attention to final review of Fee	
		Application, exhibits	
2/11/01	AMR	Attention to inquiry by creditor	.10
2/11/01	AMR	Finalization of fee application; service issues	.40
2/11/01	AMR	Attention to motion to approve	.20
,		settlement agreement w/ USA; conference	
		w/ J. Moynihan re: same	
2/12/01	AMR	Atteniotn to hearing notice re: Pallone	.10
•		claim, telephone call w/ C. Dale re:	
2/12/01	AMR	same Telephone call w/ C. Jalbert re: fees;	.20
5/ <u>+ 2</u> / V 1	LTUK	telephone call w/ A. Mattera re: same	.20
2/12/01	AMR	Telephone call w/ M. Day of Mass	.30
3/12/01	1 34 41 (Telecom Commission re: customer	.50
		complaint, revise letter to FCC re: same	
2/12/01	AMR	Atteniton to settlement w/ USA;	.30
,		telephone call w/ A. Mattera re: same;	
		conference w/ J. Moynihan re: same	
2/13/01	AMR	Telephone call w/ J. Gross re: payment	.10
, ,	-	of adiminstrtive fee	
2/13/01	AMR	Attention to settlement agreement w/	1.70
		USA; revise motion for approval of	
		same; conference w/ J. Moynihan re:	
		same; draft review to same	
2/13/01	AMR	Attention to confirmation issues;	.10
		conference w/ C. Nathan Dee re:	
		affidavit in support of confirmation	
2/14/01	AMR	Attention to motion to approve USA	1.30
		settlement; reviews to same; telephone	
		call w/ K. Hawa re: same (multiple)	
2/14/01	AMR	Atteniton to miscellaneous payments;	.20
		e-mail to D. Swanson re: same	
2/14/01	AMR	Telephone call w/ H. Nerick re:	.10
		customer complaint	
2/14/01	AMR	Telephone call w/ A. Mattera re:	.10
		employment agreement	
2/14/01	AMR	Attention to hearing on fee	.10
		application; telephone call w/ C. Foret	
		re: same	
2/17/01	AMR	Attention to confirmation issues;	.10
		prepare affidavit of voting	
2/17/01	AMR	Telephone call w/ C. Kallaher re:	.10
		status and ballot	

~

Essential (General Advice) Page 2

Services:

۶.

ς.

Date	Atty	Description	Hours
12/17/01	AMR	Attention to confirmation issues; review objection to plan by Pallone	.30
12/18/01	CND	Prepare Pallone Affidavit in Support of Plan Confirmation	1.30
12/18/01	CND	Attention to New York phone account; review amounts paid; attention to Notice and payment issues	.60
12/19/01	CND	Prepare Ballot on Plan voting; review Plan and Disclosure Statement re: same	1.60
12/19/01	CND	Review Objection by B. Pallone to Joint Plan; and associated pleadings	.40
12/19/01	CND	Revise Report of Ballot on Plan Voting and Affidavit of B. Pallone; attention to Notice and service issues	.90

Total Services

9,240.00

-

· _

Attorney		Hours	Rate	Amount
ALEX M. RODOLAKIS		20.90	240.00	5,016.00
CRAIG NATHAN DEE MARY ANN SAMSON	*	24.20 2.10	165.00 110.00	3,993.00 231.00

EXHIBIT B

.

SUPPLEMENTAL APPLICATION PERIOD FOR ATTORNEYS AND PARALEGALS

•

Attorney	Hours	Rate	Amount
ALEX M. RODOLAKIS (AMR) C. NATHAN DEE (CND	20.90 24.20	240.00 165.00	\$5,016.00 \$3,993.00
Paralegai	Hours	Rate	Amount
MARY ANN F. SAMSON (MAS)	2.10	110.00	\$231.00
TOTALS:	47.20	195.76	\$9,240.00

.

EXHIBIT C

During the period subject to the Supplemental Fee Application, H&K has incurred the following expenses in connection with the Debtor's proceedings:

Category		Amount
Duplicating (In-House) Westlaw Research Telephone Postage Courier/Federal Express		\$ 8,147.10 37.21 3.06 1,261.32 58.39
Telecopier		37.00
	TOTAL	\$9,544.08

A. <u>Duplicating (In-House)</u>

H&K requests reimbursement in the amount of \$8,147.10, representing in-house copying charges at a rate of 15¢ per page as provided for in Appendix 2 of the MLBR.

B. <u>Westlaw Research</u>

H&K requests reimbursement in the amount of \$37.21 related to Westlaw charges actually paid by H&K in connection with the Debtor's proceedings. H&K and the legal community in general consider such legal research tools to be effective and efficient research tool.

C. <u>Telephone</u>

H&K requests reimbursement in the amount of \$3.06 for long-distance telephone charges actually paid by H&K. H&K's request does not include any base telephone charges incurred by H&K.

D. <u>Postage</u>

H&K requests reimbursement in the amount of \$1,261.32, representing postage actually paid by H&K in connection with correspondence and service of pleadings.

E. <u>Courier Service/Federal Express</u>

H&K requests reimbursement in the amount of \$58.39 related to courier and Federal Express service charges actually paid by H&K in connection with the Debtor's proceedings. H&K sought during the Debtor's proceedings to deliver correspondence and serve pleadings by first-class mail. In some situations, however, H&K found it necessary to deliver correspondence or pleadings by hand or by Federal Express.

F. <u>Telecopier</u>

H&K requests reimbursement in the amount of \$37.00, representing telecopier charges incurred in connection with the Debtor's proceedings. H&K does not charge any long-distance expenses with respect to telecopies nor does it charge for incoming telecopies. H&K charges \$.50 for each outgoing page transmission.

H. PACER Charges

H&K requests reimbursement in the amount of \$33.16 related to charges actually paid by H&K in access the PACER electronic court docket related to the Debtor's proceedings.

320362

UNITED STATES BANKRUPTCY COURT DISTRICT OF MASSACHUSETTS EASTERN DIVISION

In re:

ESSENTIAL.COM, INC.

Debtor.

Chapter 11 Case No. 01-15339-WCH

CERTIFICATE OF SERVICE

I, C. Nathan Dee, hereby certify that on December 20, 2001, I served a copy of

the Supplemental Fee Application To First Application For Compensation And

Reimbursement of Expenses By Harold B. Murphy and Hanify & King Professional

Corporation via first class mail, postage prepaid, to the parties listed on the attached list.

C. Nathan Dee HANTFY & KING Professional Corporation One Federal Street Boston, MA 02110 (617) 423-0400

Dated: December 20, 2001 316720

ESSENTIAL.COM, INC. SHORT SERVICE LIST 310128

Peter Butler, Esq. Quest – Bankruptcy 220 North Fifth Street Box 5508 Bismark, ND 58506

USW

Director Interconnection Compliance 1801 California, Room 2410 Denver, CO 80202

Executive Secretary Minnesota Public Utilities Commission 121 Seventh Place East, Suite 350 St. Paul, MN 55101-2147

Douglas L. Smart, President & CEO MDI, Inc. d/b/a NorthWay Internet 11 Hodges Street North Andover, MA 01895

Verizon Tracey George Bankruptcy Department 185 Franklin Street, Room 903 Boston, MA 02110

Tom Connor, President 500 A Abbott Drive Bromall, PA 19008 Office of the United States Trustee Federal Building, Room 1184 10 Causeway Street Boston, MA 02222

<u>م</u>ر م

> Don Mason Director – Oregon Regulatory 421 SW Oak Street, #8S9 Portland, OR 97204

U S WEST Law Department Attn: General Counsel, Interconnection 1801 California Street, 51st Street Denver, CO 80202

COMDISCO, INC. 6111 North River Road Rosemont, IL 60018 Attn: Venture Group

SBC Contract Administration Attn: Notices Manager 311 S. Akard, 9th Floor Dallas, TX 75202-5398

Vicki Harry Account Executive AT&T Corp. 300 Atrium Drive, Room 3W079 Somerset, NJ 08873

Lucent Technologies Inc. 100 Burtt Road Andover, MA 01810 Dennis A. Clarke Cummings Properties LLC 200 West Cummings Park Woburn, MA 01803

Finard & Company LLC P.O. Box 845391 Boston, MA 02284-5394

Debbie Howard Contract Administrator Exodus Communications, Inc. 2831 Mission College Blvd. Santa Clara, CA 95054-1838

Share Group, Inc. 99 Dover Street Somerville, MA 02144

Linda Monico NYSEG Solutions, Inc. 2 Court Street Binghamton, NY 13901

Shell Energy 1221 Lamar St., Suite 1000 Houston, TX 77010

EarthLink Network, Inc. 3100 New York Drive Pasadena, CA 91107 Burlington Woods Office Trust No. 1 C/o Finard & Company, LLC One Burlington Woods Drive Burlington, MA 01803

Christine Jagde, Esq. Raniero D'Aversa Jr., Esq. Mayer, Brown & Platt 1675 Broadway New York, NY 10019

New England Copy Specialists Inc. 39 Sixth Road Woburn, MA 01888

August Fromuth AGF Direct Gas Sales & Servicing, Inc. 1000 Elm Street, 12th Floor Manchester, NH 03101

Mr. Michael Fusco ServicEdge Partners, Inc. 62 Second Avenue Burlington, MA 01803

•

Bernie Bilski, President WeatherWise USA Inc. One North Shore Center Pittsburgh, PA 15212

Julie S. Mantis EarthLink Networks, Inc. 3100 New York Drive Pasadena, CA 91107 Mr. Raymond E. Disch, President Power Works, L.L.C. 160 West State Street Trenton, NJ 08608

Gerald N. Rhodes, President Exelon Energy 2600 Monroe Blvd. Norristown, PA 19403

Mr. David Cuthbert Nexus EnergyGuide, Inc. 16 Laurel Avenue, Suite 100 Wellesley Hills, MA 02481

Charles Dale, III, Esq. Alex Mattera, Esq. Gadsby Hannah LLP 225 Franklin Street Boston, MA 02110

Valerie F. Finneran Suburban Propane, L.P. 240 Route 10 West Whippany, NJ 07981

Mr. Dave Manly EnergyUSA 500 Myles Standish Boulevard Taunton, MA 02780-1028

Mr. Rick Kohl Preferred Energy Services, Inc. 151 Bernal Road, Suite 1 San Jose, CA 95119 Linkshare Corporation 215 Park Avenue South, Eight Floor New York, NY 10003

Linda G. Applestein Director, Marketing Exelon Energy 2600 Monroe Blvd. Norristown, PA 19403

John Butler, Jr. Esq. Scadden Arps, et al. 333 West Wacker Drive Chicago, IL 60606 (Counsel to Comdisco)

Petroleum Heat & Power 385 University Ave Westwood, MA 02090

Michael DeBerdine III Rhodes Energy Corporation 1300 Loop Road Lancaster, PA 17601

Mr. John Sutherland KeySpan Energy Services, Inc. 14-04 111 Street College Point, NY 11356

Ms. Linda D. Ratchford Conectiv 252 Chapman Road P.O. Box 6066 Newark, DE 19714 Consolidated Edison Company of New York, Inc. 4 Irving Place, 9th Floor New York, NY 10017 Attn: Section Manager

PECO Energy Company 2301 Market Street Philadelphia, PA 19103 Attn: Carlo L. Ciabattoni Supplier Administration Group, N4-4

Mr. James P. Townsend Townsend Oil Company, Inc. 3 Oak Street Beverly Farms, MA 01915

Mr. J. Leonard Bicknell Alvin Hollis & Company, Inc. 1 Hollis Street So. Weymouth, MA 02190

Storage Networks, Inc. Rep: Kara Sims, Esq. 225 Wyman Street Waltham, MA 02154

Info Directions, Inc. Rep: Susan Sharp 833 Phillips Rd. Victory, NY 14564

Hon. Debra Renner Secretary to the Commission New York State Public Service Commission Three Empire State Plaza Albany, NY 12223 Mantiss, an Extant Company (Extant, Inc.) Suite 2450 200 North LaSalle Chicago, IL 60601 Attn: President

PJM Interconnection, LLC 955 Jefferson Avenue Valley Forge Corporate Center Norristown, PA 19403

Energy Services Group, LLC 33 Riverside Drive, Suite 100 Pembroke, MA 02359

Mr. William G. O'Brien AllEnergy Marketing Company, LLC 95 Sawyer Road Waltham, MA 02453

Smart Energy, Inc. Rep: Anna Blumkin, Esq. 300 Unicorn Park Woburn, MA 01801

Mary L. Cottrell Executive Secretary Massachusetts Dept. of Telecommunications & Energy One South Station Boston, MA 02110

James J. McNulty, Secretary Pennsylvania Public Utility Commission B-20 North Office Building Harrisburg, PA 17120 Felecia L. Greer Executive Secretary Public Service Commission of the State of Maryland 6 St. Paul Street Baltimore, MD 21202

Ms. Karen Nickerson, Secretary The Public Service Commission of Delaware 861 Silver Lake Boulevard Cannon Building, Suite 100 Dover, DE 19904

Commonwealth of Massachusetts Division of Employment & Training Attn: Chief Counsel Hurley Building-Government Center Boston, MA 02114

Massachusetts Department of Revenue P.O. Box 7046 Boston, MA 02204

Internal Revenue Service James Spinale, MS 20800 JFK Federal Building P.O. Box 9112 Boston, MA 02203

TMNG P.O. Box 911376 Dallas, TX 75391-1376

Jonathan M. Feigenbaum, Esq. Phillips & Angley One Bowdoin Square Boston, MA 02114 Frances L. Smith, Secretary New Jersey Board of Public Utilities Two Gateway Center Newark, NJ 07102

Jesse P. Clay, Jr., Commission Secretary Public Service Commission of the District of Columbia 717 14th Street Washington, D.C. 20005

Office of the Attorney General Commonwealth of Massachusetts Consumer Protection Division One Ashburton Place Boston, MA 02108

TCN Leigh Tucker 20 University Road Cambridge, MA 02138

Qwest Communication Services Wholesale Services P.O. box 36481 Louisville, KY 40233-6481

¥:

Paul Reiss Essex Communications, Inc., 543 Main Street, New Rochelle, NY 10801

Kevin T. Lamb, Esq. Testa Hurwitz & Thibeault, LLP 125 High Street Boston, MA 02110 Pamela S. Kogut, Esq Glenn Kaplan, Esq Office of Attorney General Consumer Protection and AntiTrust Division One Ashburton Place Boston, MA 02108

Francis Morrissey, Esq. Hutchins, Wheeler Dittmar 101 Federal Street Boston, 02110

Connecticut Department of Public Utility Control Ten Franklin Square, New Britain, CT 06051

Exodus Communications, Inc. Dept CH 10729 Palatine, IL 60055-0729

Linkshare Corporation 215 Park Avenue South – 8th Floor New York, NY 10003

ComDisco, Inc. Attn: Carrie Loepke 6111 North River Road Rosemont, IL 60018

BlanketMail.com, Inc. 200 E. Buffalo Street Suite 301 Ithaca, NY 14850 InfoDirections, Inc. 833 Phillips Road Victor, NY 14564

Verizon P.O. Box 4833 Trenton, NJ 08650-4833 (acct# VERNJ12Y)

Smartenery 300 Unicom Park Drive Woburn, MA 01801

Storage Networks 100 Fifth Avenue Waltham, MA 02451

Globe Tech, Inc. 76 Northestern Blvd. Suite 30B Nashua, NH 03062

Verisign 1600 Bridge Parkway Suite 201 Redwood City, CA 94065

Steven D. Pohl, Esq. Brown, Rudnick, Freed & Gesmer, P.C. One Financial Center Boston, MA 02111 Counsel to Zone Kana Communications, Inc. Dept. CH 10825 Palatine, IL 60055-0825

Securities and Exchange Commission Boston District Office 73 Tremont Street – Suite 600 Boston, MA 02108

William Baldiga Attorney for Simplexity, Inc. Brown, Rudnick, Freed & Gesmer One Financial Center Boston, MA 02111

Darrel S. Laddin, Esq. Felton E. Parrish, Esq. Arnall Golden & Gregory, LLP 2800 One Atlantic Center 1201 W. Peachtree Street Atlanta, GA 30309-3450

Richard Stubbs EVulkan, Inc. 17 Massasoit Street Northampton, MA 01060

Jeffrey A. Kitaeff 565 Turnpike N. Andover, MA 01845

Public Utilities Commission 100 N. Union Street, Suite 850 Montgomery, Alabama 36104 Securities & Exchange Commission 450 Fifth Street, N.W. Washington, DC 20549

U.S. Attorney U.S. Court House – Suite 9200 One Court House Way Boston, MA 02210

John C. LaLiberte Kenneth D. Small Sherin & Logden, LLP 100 Summer Street Boston, MA 02110

Federal Communications Commission Office of the General Counsel Jane E. Mago 445 12th St. S.W. Washington, DC 20554

John S. Rodman 180 Canal Street, Suite 400 Boston, MA 02114

Christine Jagde Edward A. Davis Mayer, Brown & Platt 1675 Broadway New York, NY 10019 Counsel to Broadview

Colorado Public Utilities Commission 1580 Logan Street, Office Level 2 Denver, CO 80203

Florida Public Service Commission 2540 Shumard Oak Blvd Tallahassee, FL 32399-0850

Rhode Island Division of Public Utilities 89 Jefferson BLvd Warwick, Rhode Island 02888

Darrel S. Laddin, Esq. Counsel to Verizon Arnall, Golden & Greegory, LLP 2800 One Atlantic Center 1201 W. Peachtree Street Atlanta, GA 30309-3450

Office of Attorney General Alabama State House 11 South Union Street, Third Floor Montgomery, AL 36130

Office of Attorney General The Capitol Tallahassee, FIA 32399-1050

Office of Attorney General MS Attorney General's Office P.O. Box 220 Jackson, MS 39205 Kentucky Public Service Commission P.O Box 615 211 Sower Blvd Frankfort, Kentucky 40602-0615

Shelley L. Forrest, Esq. Missouri Department of Revenue General Counsel's Office 301 W. High Street, Room 670 PO Box 475 Jefferson City, MO 65105-0475

Tennessee Regulatory Authority 460 James Robertson Parkway Nashville, TN 37243-0505

Vermont Department of Public Service 112 State Street, Draw 20 Montepelier, VT

Office of Attorney General 1525 Sherman Street, 7th Floor Denver, CO 80203

÷.,

Office of the Attorney General 1024 Capital Center Drive Frankfort, KY 40601

Office of Attorney General New York, The Capitol Albany, NY 1222400341 Department of the Attorney General 150 South Main Street Providence, Rhode Island 02903

Office of Attorney General 425 5th Ave Nashville, TN 37243

James Cornblatt, Esq. Servisense.com, Inc. 180 Wells Avenue Newton, MA 02459

Shell Energy 1221 Lamar Street, Suite 1000 Houston, TX 77010

Pennsylvania Attorney General 16th Floor, Strawberry Square Harrisburg, PA 17120

Department of Consumer and Regulatory Affairs 941 North Capitol Street, NE Washington, DC 20002

Office of the Attorney General Carvel State Office Building 820 N. French Street Wilmington, DE 19801 Office of Attorney General Rembert Dennis Building 1000 Assembly Street, Room 501 Columbia, SC 29211

Utah State Attorney General Administration Office 160 East 300 South, 6th Fl Heber Wells Building, Salt Lake City, UT 84114

John S. Rodman, Esq 180 Canal Street Suite 400 Boston, MA 02114

NY Telecommunications and Energy 120 Broadway New York, New York 10271

Office of the Attorney General P.O. Box 080 Trenton, NJ 08625-0080

Office of Attorney General 200 St. Paul Place Baltimore, MD 21202

Assistant Attorney General Office of The Attorney General Bankruptcy and Collection Division P.O. Box 20207 Nashville, TN 37202-0207 PacBell/SNET Attn: Notices Manager 311 S. Allad, 9th Floor Dallas, TX 75202-5398

Mr. Rick Kohl Preferred Energy Service, Inc. 151 Bernal Road, Suite 1 San Jose, CA 95119

RCN/Case Save 105 Carnegin Center Princeton, NJ

Ameritech 240 North Meridian Street Indianopolis, IN 46204

Evan Smiley, Esq. Albert, Weilard, and Golden 650 Town Center Drive Costa Mesa, Ca 92626 .

Internet Connect Tom O'Connor President 500 Abbott Drive Broomill, PA 19008

Bell South Corporate Headquarters 1155 Peachtree St., NE Atlanta, GA 30309-3610 Rhoads Energy Corporation 1300 Loop Road Lancaster, PA 17601

AT&T Wiereless 15 East Midland Avenue Paramus, NJ 07652

American Voice Mail, Inc. Mark Gordon, President 2310 S. Sepulueda Blvd. Los Angeles, CA 90064

Omnipoint Communications Services, LLC 16 Wing Drive Cedor Knolls, NJ 07297 ·

.

Metrocall, Inc. 6677 Richmond Highway Alexandria, VA 22306

Ziplink, LLC 900 Chelmsford Street Lowell, MA 01851

Amerigas Legal Department 460 North Gulph Road King of Prussia, PA 19406 Basil Pallone Essential.com, Inc. 112 Thunder Road Sudbury, MA 01776

David J. Reier, Esq. Schnader Harrison Goldstein & Manello 265 Franklin Street Boston, MA 02110 (counsel: Comdisco, Inc.)

Jonathan Koch 7 E. 8th Street – Apt 6A New York, NY 10028

James Gross, Esq. Klieman Lyons Schindler 21 Custom House Boston, MA 02110

Lawrence M. Schwab, Esq. Thomas M. Gaa, Esq. Bialson, Bergen & Schwab 2600 El Camino Real – Suite 300 Palo Alto, CA 94306 (counsel: Exodus Communications, Inc.) Dana Frix Kemal Hawa O'Melveny & Myers, LLP 1650 Tysons Boulevard, Suite 1150 McLean, Virginia 22102

David J. Reier Schnader Harrison Goldstein & Manello 265 Franklin Street Boston, MA 02110

Gina Baker Hantel Attorney for commissioner of Revenue Legal Services-27th Floor 312 8th Avenue North Nashville, TN 37243

Thomas T. Roubidoux, Esq. Kutak Rock LLP 1650 Farnam Street Omaha, NE 68102 (counsel: The Management Network Group, Inc.)

Donald R. Lassman, Esq. P.O. Box 920385 Needham, MA 02492 (counsel: SmartEnergy, Inc.)