
REQUEST TO ESTABLISH DOCKET 
(Please me) 

Date March 11,2002 Docket No.  

2. OPR 

3. OCR 

T.Williams 

5. Suggested Docket Mailing List (attach separate sheet if necessary) 

A. Provide NAMES OR ACRONYMS ONLY if a regulated company. 

B. Provide COMPLETE NAME AND ADDRESS for all others. (Match representatives to companies.) 

1. Parties and their representatives (if any): 

4. Suggested Docket Title: 

2. Interested persons and their representatives (if any): 

Request for cancellation of PATS Certificate N o  7859 by Larry Penuzza, effective 
1213 1/01 

6. Check one: 

xx Documentation is attached. 
- 

Documentation will be provided with recommendation. 



Mr. Tom Williams 
Public Service Commission 
2540 Shumard Oak Blvd 
Tallahassee, FL 32339-0850 

Dear Mr. Williams: 

Pursuant to our conversation earlier today regarding the dissolution date of B&L's 
operations, the actual cessation of all pay phone services were December 3 1,200 1. 

Thank you for your inquiry and assistance in this matter. 

Very truly yours, 
-? 

17041 SE 65th Street 
Morriston, FL 32668-45 10 

(352) 528-2167 



March 1,2002 

Blanca S. Bay0 
Public Service Commission 
2540 Shumard Oak Blvd 
Tallahassee, FL 32399-0850 

REF. Master Commission Directory of Regulated Utilities 

Dear Ms. Bayo: 

Reference your correspondence of Feb. 26,2002. This serves to notify you that as of 
February 28,2002 our public payphones vending operations were discontinued in its 
entirety. Since our operations lasted for only a part of the year I wondered if there would 
be a partial rebate for the abbreviated year. It would be gratefilly welcome at this 
particular time. 

Thank you for your consideration and assistance. 

17091 SE 65* St. 
Morriston, FL 32668-45 10 
(352) 528-2167 



Paula lsler 

From: 
Sent: 
To: 
Subject: 

Paula lsler 
Tuesday, March 05,2002 1 :39 PM 
Linda Williams 
RE: TG843 

Both companies owe the 2002 RAF. If they did not provide a date certain of 
when the 2002 RAF would be paid, then I need to contact them (meaning a docket 
should not be opened at this time). 

- - - - -  Original Message----- 
From: Linda Williams 
Sent: Tuesday, March 05, 2002 12:46 PM 
To: Paula Isler 
Subject: TG843 

We received copy of letter from GCL/McLean to CMI with deposit information on 
it for 2001 RAFs with P & I. Across the letter is the word CANCEL. Do you 
want me to open a docket to cancel? 

We also, have a letter from Larry Perruzza (TG820) notifying us that as of 
2/28/02 operations were discontinued. Are they paid up? 
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. COMPANY IDENTIFICATION 
Printed on 03/05/2002 at 13:39:30 by PJI 

Complete Name: Larry Perruzza 

Mailing Name: Larry Perruzza 
Company Code: TG820 FEID Number: 

MAILING INFORMATION 

Attention: 
Address Line 1:17091 S.E. 65th Street 
Address Line 2: 
City : Morri s ton State: FL Zip Code: 32668-4510 

E-mail Address: eveshadaaol 
Web Address: 

Liaison 1:Larry M. Perruzza Liaison 2: 
Title: Owner Title: 
Phone : (352) 528-2167 Phone : 
E-mail : E-mail : 

Fax 1: 

County,: 

Fax 2: 

COMPANY INFORMATION 

Address Line 1:17091 S . E .  65th Street 
Address Line 2: 
City: Morris ton State: FL Zip Code: 32668-4510 
Reg. Date: 07/23/2001 Inactive Date: 
Transfered To: 
Trans. From: 
Certificate 1: 7859 Certificate 2: 
Corporate Type: 
Service 1: PAT - Pay Telephone 
Service 2: 
Service 3: 
Service 4: 
Class (WAW): 
Phone Count: 
County 1: 
County 3: 
Bankruptcy: No 

County 2: 
County 4: 

RELATED DOCKETS 

010778-TC Closed Application for certificate to provide pay telephone service by 
Larry Perruzza. 
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' COMPANY IDENTIFICATION 

RAF 

Penalty 

Interest 

Extension Fee 

Total 

Printed on 03/05/2002 at 13:39:56 by PJI 

$50.00 $50.00 $0.00 

$0.00 $0.00 $0.00 

$0.00 $0.00 $0.00 

$0.00 $0.00 $0.00 

$50.00 $50 .oo $0.00 

Complete Name: Larry Perruzza 

Mailing Name: Larry Perruzza 
Company Code: TG820 FEID Number: 

RAF ACCOUNT FOR THE PERIOD 01/01/2001 THROUGH 12/31/2001 

Reg. Date: 07/23/2001 Inactive Date: 
Service: PAT - Pay Telephone 
Received : Actual RAF Form 
Status : Satisfied 
Amended : No Extension: No 
Frozen: No Comments : No 
Payment Count: 1 Payment Made to Date 
Operating Rev: $-97.00 Interstate Rev: 
RAF Rate: 0.0015 Net RAF Due: 

$0.00 
$50.00 

I Assessment I Due I Paid I Owe I 
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