
From: 
Sent: 
To: 
Subject: 

Paula lsler 
Thursday, February 06,2003 252 PM 
Ruth Nettles 
RE: TSl821Charter Communications 

Yes. Effective 12/31/02. 

-----Original Message----- 
From: Ruth Nettles 
Sent: Thursday, February 06, 2003 2:13 PM 
To: Paula Isler 
Subject: TS182/Charter Communications 

This RAF payment was for $50 dollars; attached is a letter advising operations ceased in 
Flo r ida  on 4/1/02. Please let me know if we can process cancellation request, thanks. 
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